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National Research Cooncl fosters scientific advances

Tne year 19 79.1980 ffs a lime of hieh produCtwlity in scien ii f c and industrial research

for the Nationd Research Council of Canadla, according to the Council's 19 79.8 Repor

of the president. During the year contÎftifg PriOrity Was given to industrially-orfented

research and develOpmtent, ta energy research and developmfent and to technology trans-

fer and assistance to the industrkd sector, says the report, excerpts front whlch foilow:

A signific3flt rnilestOfle for Canadian final stages of completion.... The delay iii

science was the official inauguration schedule does not affect the over-al

of the Canada-Fraflce»Hawaii telescOPe schedule for the Space Shuttie which

(CFHT) on Mauna Kea in Hawaii on Sep- itself has had delays and the first Shuttie

tember 28, 1979. Located at one of the flight is now tentatively schediuled for

best observing sites ini the world, this tele- late 1980 or early 1981. Unfortunately,

scope provides Canadian astronoliiers for the delay in the completion of the RMS

the first turne with acceSS to a rnajor has. resulted in an increase of the total

optical telescope with the nMost up-to-date project cost from $ 100,083 million to

instrumentation. Accordirig to the Tri- $118,1 86 million.

pariteAgrenent between the National

Reparch Counci (C)le Centre na- Marine research

tional de la recherche scientifique (CNRS) Two major proetwihhdbe 
p

of France and the University of Hlawaii, proved ini 1978, were reviewed last surn-

the design and construifon of the tele-

scope was the joint respoflsibiliy of NRC

andCNR -Wth the University of Hawai

anod CNRSthe site and local services. Can-

ada and France wil each have 42.5 per

cent of the observing time of the tele-

scope, with 15 per cent aiiocated to the

University of Hawaii, wliich wfll contri-

bute the saine percentage to the on going

operational cOsts. b

)toduy..
agher becamne the first Can-
lalned to an ambassadotiai
ed Ambassador to Israel.
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mer as part of the government's compre-
hensive review of all government pro-
grams. These were the Arctic Vessel and
Marine Research Institute to be establish-
ed in St. John's, Newfoundland, and the
Industrial Materials Research Institute to
be located at Boucherville, Quebec. Fol-
lowing the review, approval of both pro-
jects at their original cost estimates was
confirmed in September, 1979. Engineer-
ing and architectural planning for the
Arctic Vessel and Marine Research
Institute is well under way with start of
construction planned for April 1981.
Completion of the ice tank facilities is
scheduled for April 1983, with the re-
mainder of the installations to be com-
pleted the following year. The Industrial
Materials Research Institute is also in the
engineering and architectural planning
stage. A 35-acre site in an industrial park
adjoining the Trans-Canada Highway at
Boucherville, Quebec, has been procured
for the laboratory. Start of construction
is scheduled for early 1981 with comple-
tion expected in 1983. Temporary
quarters for the institute's staff now being
recruited are being provided at Longueuil
and in St. Henri, a district of Montreal....

Fire research
Fires in Canadian buildings cost around
one-quarter of a billion dollars each year,
not counting social costs. The expense of
providing lire protection roughly equals
this amount. Designing the fire protection
of buildings involves many considerations
and because an actual fire is the only true
measure of effectiveness, safety judgments
are largely qualitative. The tasks of asses-
sing fire hazard to life and property and
planning effective fire safety systems are
further complicated by changes in build-
ing materials and components, in the pat-
terns of use of buildings, and in architec-
ture, particularly increasing building
height, size and complexity. Current
major concerns are the hazards presented
by smoke movement in high buildings,
the fire and smoke hazards associated
with plastics and evaluation of systems
for ensuring life safety when fires occur.

Because of these complexities, theore-
tical and laboratory studies on fire safety
must often be complemented by experi-
ments in realistic, though controlled, fire
situations that simulate real life condi-

November 1980. Located near Ottawa,
the station will comprise an experimental
high-rise building, a "burn hall", and a
small ancillary building housing support
services.

The ten-storey tower contains, in a min-
imum plan area, the structural features
and mechanical systems needed to repro-
duce smoke movement patterns found in
high-rise buildings during fires. It is de-
signed as an experimental tool to endure
without damage the many controlled fires
that will be conducted during the course
of a major research program. The purpose
of this work is to produce design data for
smoke movement control measures refer-
enced by the National Building Code of
Canada....

International activities
The National Research Council is respons-
ible for Canadian representation in several
international scientific and technical
organizations through national commit-
tees that reflect Canadian interests in al-
most every discipline, with members
drawn from industry, government and
universities.

NRC is the Canadian member for the
International Council of Scientific Unions
(ICSU) and for 16 of the 18 constituent
unions, for six of the scientific commit-
tees and four of the ICSU scientific asso-
ciates: the International Federation for
Documentation, the Pacific Science Asso-
ciation, the International Union of
Quaternary Research and the Interna-
tional Federation for Automatic Control.

Since last year, NRC has represented
the Canadian scientific community in the
International Union of Physiological
Sciences, the International Union of Phar-
macology and the International Mathe-
matical Union, succeeding the Medical
Research Council of Canada and the Can-
adian Mathematical Society in this role.

In the field of engineering, NRC is the
Canadian adhering member to eight inter-
national associations and shares with the
Canadian Engineering Societies' Commit-
tee in the activities of the World Federa-
tion of Engineering Organizations (WFEO)
and the Pan American Federation of En-
gineering Societies (UPADI).

In addition, this year, following the
disbandment of the Associate Committee
on Heat Transfer, NRC has authorized

Transfer Conferences and the Interna-
tional Centre for Heat and Mass Transfer.

Last summer, NRC hosted the general
assemblies and international meetings of
two ICSU members: the International
Astronomical Union, which met in Mont-
real in August 1979 and the International
Biochemical Union which met in Toronto
in July 1979.

These events benefited from the en-
thusiastic co-operation of the Canadian
Astronomical Society and the Canadian
Biochemical Society.

On January 1, 1980, the co-operation
agreement between NRC and the Centre
national de la recherche scientifique de
France was renewed automatically, as
provided by clause 14 of the March 1971
agreement.

Increasing contact between Chinese and
Canadian research institutions has been
reflected in the number of Chinese visitors
to NRC laboratories and in the number of
NRC scientists and engineers visiting
China, often at the request of Chinese
authorities. In response to a request from
the Department of External Affairs and
in concert with the Council of Ministers
of Education of Canada, which manages a
program that allows scholars from the
People's Republic of China to corne to
Canadian universities, laboratories and re-
search centres, NRC has accepted the re-
sponsibility of finding accommodation
for Chinese scholars in federal government
laboratories and industry, as the need will
arise.

Canada/Saudi Arabia agreement
Under a co-operative agreement between
NRC and the Saudi Arabian Centre
for Science and Technology, an NRC
astronomer has designed instrumentation
to test the quality of "seeing" in Saudi
Arabia. Instrumentation is currently being
manufactured to test four sites in the
Kingdom simultaneously. These sites have
been selected on the basis of an initial
reconnaissance mission by a team from
NRC's Dominion Astrophysical Obser-
vatory near Victoria, British Columbia.

The year 1979-80 saw the signing of

an agreement between Canada (represent-
ed by NRC and Environment Canada's
Atmospheric Environment Service) and
the U.S.A. for co-operation in research
on weather modification.

NRC scientists and engineers partici-
pated as members of official Canadian
delegations to the United Nations Con-

(Continued on P. 8)
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Brazil Minister of External Affairs meets with Canadian officiais

Brazil's Minister of External Affairs
Ramiro Saraiva Guerreiro met with
Secretary of State for External Affairs
Mark MacCuigan and other federal
Cabinet ministers during his officiai
visît to Canada from September 29 to
October 1.

During their meeting in Ottawa, the
two External Affairs Ministers agreed
that relations between the two countries
should continue to expanil in ail areas,
especially in regard to political and cul-
tural matters as well as in the economic
field. Dr. MacCuigan and Mr. Saraiva
Guerreiro also exchanged views on the
world situation, particularly on North-
South issues and on questions relating to
their common region.

During his visit, Minister Saraiva Guer-
reiro paid a courtesy cail on Prime
Mînister Pierre Trudeau, and met with the
Minister of Agriculture Eugene Whelan,
Minister of Industry, Trade and Com-
merce Herbert Gray, Secretary of State.
and Minister of Communications Francis
Fox and Minister of State (Finance)
Pierre Bussiéres.

Minister Saraiva Guerreiro also visited
Montreal where he met with Quebec's
Minister of Economic Development Ber-
nard Landry and addressed a joint lun-
cheon meeting sponsored by the Canada-
Brazil Chamber of Commerce, the Can-
adian Association for Latin America and
the Caribbean, and the Canadian Instîtute
of International Affairs.

Dr. MacGuigan and Mr. Saraiva Guer-
reiro expressed satisfaction at the success-
fui third meeting of the Canada-Brazil
Joint Economic Committee which took
Place in Ottawa in June, and the success-
fui meetings of the sub-groups on agricul-
ture and industrial co-operation. They
noted that these meetings had identified a
number of areas for co-operation in the
trade, industrial and agricultural fields
and they agreed that officiais of the two
govemments should continue to develop
even further relations in these areas.

Cultural exehanges
The two Ministers agreed that greater
effort on both sides should be devoted to
the implementation of the Canada-Brazil
cultural agreement in order to increase
cultural and information exchamiges be-
tween the two countries. They reviewed
the possibilities of exchange and co-

operation in the area of the cinema andl
noted with satisfaction, the preliminaiy
contacts already under way between the
"Embrafilme" and the National Film
Board to establish a regular program of
co-operation with empliasis in documen-
tary and animated films.

Ramiro Saraîva Guerre iro

Dr. MacGuigan and Mr. Saraiva Guer-
reiro agreed that bilateral co-operation in
science and technology is an important
element of social and economic develop-
ment. They agreed that officiais of the
two govemnments should examine ways of
enhancing this co-operation, including the
possibility of negotiating an agreement or
establishing other mechanisms to consoli-
date bilateral scientific and technological
co-operation.

The Ministers exdhanged views on
energy, in particular the role that renew-
able sources can play in providing liquid
fuel. Both countries have large forest re-
serves which could be used for the pro-
duction of energy. Dr. MacGuigan and
Mr. Saraiva Guerreiro agreed that colla-
boration in the developmnent of technolo-
gies for exploitîng new and renewable
energy sources would be of mutual bene-
fit, andi they supported the exchange of
technical delegations as a first step in
strengthening contacts between Brazil
and Canada in this area.

The two Ministers also referred to on-
going negotiations on a bilateral agree-
ment to avoid double taxation and agreed
that those negotiations should be con-
cluded as soon as possible.

Mediating rote foreseen

Canada is destined to play a Ieading role
in restructuring world relations, Secretary
of State for External Affairs Mark Mac-
Guigan told delegates of the twelfth.
international conference on international
relations held in Quebec City, Septem-
ber 25-27.

Canadian, American and Frenchi ex-
perts met at the invitation of Laval Uni-
versity's centre of international relations
to discuss international problems sucli as
East-West relations, military co-operation
between Europe and the United States,
Soviet intervention in Afghianistan and
recycling petro-dollars.

In is address to the conference, Dr.
MacGuigan said that Canada would be
able to contribute best to the world
economy and security during the next ten
years in the area of energy in which its
expertise and technology is recognized.

Canada intends to strengthen its
network of bilateral relations to attempt
to bring together East and West, North
and South, and to serve as an interme-
diary between these parties, the Minister
said.

Dr. MacGuigan added that Canada
would be more determined and more
active in promoting its interests in these
areas.

Development agency assîsts tech-
nology transfer

The Canadian International Developmnent
Agency (CIDA) will contribute $1 million
to Technonet-Asia, an international cor-
poration assisting smail industry in South-
east Asia with technical advice. This is the
first timne that CIDA lias entered into this
type of agreement.

Tedlinonet-Asia, based ini Singapore,
was established by the International De-
velopment Research Centre (IDRC) ini
1973 to provide technical advice appro-

ber countries aware of opl
potential joint-venture rela
the Canadian public sector.
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Canada cails for changes at UN

The United Nations General Assembly
must break away from the patternls of the
past, adapt to change and improve its col-
lective machinery, Secretary of State for
External Affairs Mark MacGuigan said in
an address to the thirty-fifth regular
session of the Assembly in New York,
September 22.

Dr. MacGuigan said that world events
indicate there is a need to abandon pre-
vailing metliods and to resolve conflicts
tlirougli collectively-developed machinery
rather than by reverting to force. The
United Nations needs to "break away
from old patterns of approach and
attitude", hie said.

With reference to the North-South
dialogue, the Mînister said that the UN
must "recognize its global responsibilities
but resist the notion that every problem
must have a global, generalized solution".
There are issues, hie said, such as the Law
of the Sea, where bloc-to-bloc negotia-
tions would be less useful.

Law of the Sea
A complicated array of different country
groupings arranged to correspond to dif-
fering economic, political and even geo-
graphic interests have wrestled with long-
standing questions of principle and tradi-
tions regarding the Law of the Sea, said
Dr. MacGuigan. "This method lias enabled
them to draft, in effect, a new constitu-

Secretary of State for External Affairs
Mark MacGuigan (le ft) meets with Chinese
Vice Premier and Foreign Mitiister Huang
Hua while at thte United Nations.

tion for two-thirds of the world's surface
in the more pragmatîc, realistic, and 1
believe productive way, which a pluralistic
approacli can afford," hie said.

However, it is necessary for parties
interested in the Law of the Sea treaty to
corne to some consensus on the vital
question of seabed mining, the Minister
added. Dr. MacGuigan said that the treaty
mîglit be compromised if the "interests of
the land-based mineral producers, includ-
ing Canada and many developing coun-
tries are ignored or overridden by tlie
desire of some states to secure unrestricted
access to the mineral riches of the seabed".
The problern could only be compounded,
lie said, "by states stepp'ing outside of tlie
intemnationally agreed framework to play
tlie game by their own set of rules".

In order to bridge the gap between
producing and consumning countries and
find a common basis of agreement on this
issue, Canada lias joined a number of de-
veloping countries in initiating an inde-
pendent UN study to determine the

impact of the seabed production formula
proposed by the major mineral-consuming
states. Dr. MacCuigan said that hie hoped
the study would encourage a "fresh look"
at the question.

Disarmament
The Canadian government attaches special
significance to disarmament, the Minister
told the Assernbly. He said lie regretted
the "lack of specific and ratified agree-
ments on further measures of arms con-
trols and disarmamnent". Canada is coin-
mitted to "breaking the pattern of mad-
ness which spiralling rearmament repre-
sents", said Dr. MacGuigan.

Canada's recently-appointed special
ambassador for disannament will be
working during the current UN session to
restrain and cut back the competition in
strategic nuclear weapons, lie said. As a
first step, Dr. MacGuigan said the Can-
adian government would vigorously pur-
sue the cessation of the production of
fissionable material for nuclear weapons.

Unique wool treatment sparks world interest

A Canadian company witli federal gov-
errnent assistance lias irnproved the anti-
slirinking process used by wool manufac-
turers.

Wool provides a unique warmth and
comfort which cotton and linen fabrics
do not have, but its special properties also
cause wool fabrics to mat and shrink,
particularly in clothing that is laundered
repeatedly. Aithougli Kroy Unslirinkable
Wools Limited lias had a shrink-proofing
process which lias been used continuously
in Canada for over 30 years (and to a
lesser extent i the United States for ap-
proximately the saine lengtli of timne), the
company liad been aware that the treat-
ment was not completely uniform - some
of the fibres seemed to be treated satis-
factorily, while others were not.

The presence of these two differently
treated wool fibres restricted the use of
the process and the washabiity dlaims
that could be made, particularly in 100
percent wool garments. It was evident
that in order to expand the use of the
process, especially outside Canada, refine-
ments were necessary.

Kroy's Vice-President and ýGeneraI
Manager Norman Cruickshank, brouglit
lis problein to the National Researdch
Council's Industrîal Researchi Assistance
Program. Under the terms of an IRAP

agreement, NRC provides financial assist-
ance by paying the salaries of the company
research staff working- on approved pro-
jects. The company pays for A other
aspects of the research costs and retains
all tities and riglits to the results of the
jointly-funded researchi. The Kroy project
was approved in September 1966 and
work, which began two montlis later, was
to continue for the next seven years with
IRAP fmnancial support.

Uneven wetting a problemn
During the study it becarne apparent that
the basic problem was one of uneven wet-
ting of the wool fibres by the treatment
liquors. Up to this time, the wool was
treated in a long horizontal bath, fed with
a cold acidified sodium hypochlorite solu-
tion containing wetting agents, where it
was subjected to numerous squeeze roils
and mechanical agitators which were de-
signed to promnote uniformi wetting of the
fibres with liquor.

The individual wool fibres had to be
exposed to a solution containing a certain
concentration of clilorine, at a specific
pH, for a certain length of time.

During the course of the project, it
was determined that in order to obtain
uniformn treatment the air within and sur-
rounding the wool fibres had to be first



Volume 8, No. 40 
October 22, 1980

removed, and that, in production, if
instead of using a long shallow horizontal
bath the wool were passed through a deep
vertical bath thîs miglit be accomplislied.
Using this metliod, the research team was
able to obtain an evenly treated wool.
This technique, combined with an eartier
discovery consisting in the use of a simple
solution of dlilorine in water instead of
acidified sodium hypoclilorite for the ne-
cessary clilorination of the wool, pro-
vided the basis for the new process.

Equipment developedl
The final step was the development of
equîpment to execute the process satis-
factorily on a production basis. The result

IKroy -s versatile macflzne is compact ana
simple to operate: it processes faster and
cheaper than conventional machines.

is a new deep immersion machine design-
ed and built by Kroy. Its outstanding
characteristic is the uniformity of the
processed material - the key to success-
ful treatment, with a minimum amnount
of dliemical damage to the wool fibre.
The machine can replace the first two
stages of the conventional five-stage oper-
ation necessary for the process for attain-
ing full machine washability. Principal
fmnancial savings are in lower chemnical
and labour costs and the unit takes up
less floor space than equipment currently
in use.

International interest
The first commercial prototype machine
was installed in Kroy's Toronto plant
where it las performed with complete
satisfaction. Last year, licences were
signed up anid machines installed in the

United States and Australia, and this
year, it is expected that machines will be
sold to wool combers in England, Swit-
zerland and Italy. Strong interest has also
been shown in many other countries in-
cluding New Zealand, South Africa, Ger-
many, France and Japan (the Japanese
are the largest wool users per capita in the
world). Kroy has also entered into an
agreement with the International Wool
Secretariat (IWS), funded by the world's
wool growers, and a machine lias been in-
stalled at their Technical Centre in Ilkley,
England, to further develop its use
throughout the world. Kroy and the IWS
are co-operating in the installation of
machines and in supplying technical ser-
vice and qualîty control back-up.

(Article by Joan Powers Rickerd in
Science Dimension 1980/3.)

GoId coin wins share of market

Canada's gold maple leaf coin lias been on
the market for one year and lias won a
secure position in the world's bullion coin
markets with sales of nearly two million
coins since September 1979.

Yvon Gariepy, master of the Royal
Canadian Mint, said the maple leaf "lias
won an important share of the world
bullion coin trade in its first year, a re-
spectable accomplishment in view of the
fact that it is a newcomer in competition
with well-established, widely known
coins".

Europeans have been the major buyers
of the Canadian coins, accounting for 50
per cent of total sales, wiitl sales in the
United States coming in at 36 per cent
and Canadian sales at 14 per cent.

Although gold markets, after a fast
start last October, have been only mode-
rately active in the period from the 1980
first quarter until recently, Mr. Gariepy
said that investors have continued to pur-
chase the gold maple leaf coin in sub-
stantial quantities.

"Now that the market appears to be
warming up again, we would hope for an
even higher level of sales in the next few
months," he said.

The Mint continues to broaden its dis-
tribution system, particularly in the
United States where, unlike Europe, a
highly complex retail system, exists. A
network of more than 1,200 coin and
bulion dealers lias been established and
dealer listings are now tagged onto maple
leaf advertising in the major United

States markets.
The maple leaf program called for a

maximum of five million coins to be
minted and sold during a three-year
period with a possible extension to be
determined by the federal government,
following an evaluation of the resuits.

Veterans Affairs minister dies

Daniel MacDonald, the Minister of
Veterans Affairs, died in hospital of heart
failure, October 1.

Mr. MacDonald, 62, was born in Both-
well, Prince Edward Island and was a
farmer and war veteran who lost an armi
and a leg as a sergeant in the Canadian
Army in which hie served from 1940 to
1945.

He represented the riding of 1 st Kings
in the P.E.I. Legislature from 1962 to
1972, from 1966 onward as Minister of
Agriculture and Forestry. Then hie made
the switch to federal politics and cap-
tured the Cardigan seat in the House of
Communs.

He was appointed to the Veterans Af-
fairs portfolio that year and field the post
until 1979, when lie lost his seat in the May
fede rai election. He regained his seat in the
election this past February and was again
namned to the Veterans Affairs portfolio.

Prime Minister Trudeau, who leamed
of the death wh.ile in a cabinet meeting,
expressed his sorrow at losmng a colleague
whom he described as "a great human
being".

Mr. MacDonald is survived by is wife,
four sons anid three daughiters.

October 22, 1980Volume 8, No. 40



Stamps depict Inuit spirits

"Inuit spirits" is the theme of a set of
four new commemorative stamps released
by Canada Post, September 25.

"The spirituality of a people is often
the foundation for its way of life," said
Postmaster-General André Ouellet. "This
is especiaily true of the Inuit people living
in Canada's northland. To the Inuit, spiri-
tual force is present in each phenomenon
of nature, not just in living creatures."

Canada 17

The Inuit spirit stamps, designed by
Reinhard Derreth of Vancouver, feature
prints an d sculptures by Inuit artists.* On
the 17-cent stamps, the sculpture Sedna,
a woman believed to bie living on the sea
bottom and controlling the supply of sea
animals, is by artist Ashoona Kiawak; the
print Return of the Sun representing
animal species greeting the sun in a spirit
of festivity is by Kenojouak. On the 35-
cent stamps, the reproduction of the
sculpture Bîrd Spirit, a bird with a human
face indicating the presence of a spirit in

the animal, is the work of Doris Hagiolok;
the prine Shaman, the intermediar bie-
tween Inuit and the spirit world, is by
Simnon Tookoome.

Tis set of stamps conipletes a four-year
series on the Inuit, with previous sets on

themes of hunting, shelter and comniunity
life, for a total of 16 staxnps. The series is

presented in a heritage stamp collection
entitled, Sfnging Songs to the Spi rit

Search for oïl in Say of Fundy

Two Canadian.o11 companies have launch-
ed a $ 1-million search for oil and gas in
the Bay of Fundy.

Irving Oil Limited and Chevron Stand-
ard (Canada) Limited, working with
Axford and Associates Limited of Nova
Scotia, announced that the 45-metre (l150-
foot) exploration ship Western Narrows
started seismic testing recently in water
between Digby Neck and the isthmus that
connects Nova Scotia and New Brunswick.

Arthur Irving of Saint John, New
Brunswick, chairman and president of
Irving 011, said past exploration off Nova
Scotia has indicated geological formation
under the Bay of Fundy may hold oil and
gas.

Jerry Henderson, executive vice pre-

sident of Chevron Standard, said hie is

cautiously optimidstic about the chance of
finding oil in the bay.

The survey work is expected to take
about a month but it will take several
months more to analyze ail the data.

Drought aid provided

Agriculture Minister Eugene Whelan re-
cently announced a program which will
provide up to $13 .4 mrillion to help live-
stock producers deal with the effects of
this year's drought.

The programn complements a $41-mil-

lion federal comnmitmerlt to a herd main-

tenance assistance program announced in

July by Mr. Whelan and Senator Hazen
Argue, Wheat Board Minister. The herd
maintenance assistance programn ensures
that basic breeding herds are not sold off
because of feed shortages.

The new programi has four parts:
a straw feed procurement programn

which will pay drought-area. producers
$10 a ton for purchased straw to an
amount equivalent to one ton a cow in
the basic breeding herd. It is estimated
that straw purchased under this part of
the program will cost the federal govern-
ment $6 million;

.a straw ammoniation program iniwhich

producers will be paid $ 10 a ton for the

treatmnent, which renders straw as palat-
able, digestible and nutritious as good-
quality hay. The $10 payment represents
about half the cost of the treatment. It is

expected that the cost to the federal gov-
erniment will be $2 million;

. a green-feed-for-silage procurement
program, which will pay $ 10 a ton for
purchased silage to a maximum of two
tons a beef or dairy cow and one-haîf ton
a ewe. It is estimated that this part of the
programi will cost the federal goveroment
$ 5 million; and
. a nutritional advice and management
program will begin, at a cost of $1 50,000,
to help producers who will be forced to
feed their livestock unfamiliar or lower
than normal-quality feeds. This part of
the program wiil involve preparation of
bookiets, regional meetings and direct
consultation with Agriculture Canada
experts.

Canadians help Chinese mine gold

A teami of Canadian mining experts has
retumed from China after completing
the first phase of a major engineering
services contract with the Chinese govemn-
ment.

The contract requires Wright Engineers
Limited of Vancouver to carry out a
feasibility study for a gold mine ini Shan-
dong Province in which there are two
operating gold mines and which has a
long history of gold mining.

A group of Chinese mining engineers
have travelled to Canada as part of the
project teamn to provide background data
during the various phases of the study.

In addition to assessing the currently
available data and information on the
mine site, Wright Engineers Limited is
expected to evaluate the requirements for

further data, the methodology for collect-
ing thre information, and based on tis
information (and Chinese approval to
proceed) to plan the design and operating
procedures of thre mine and other facili-
ties required to extract gold from thre ore
body.

While the size of plant required will
not be determined until ail thre data is
assembled and analyzed, it is expected
to be in thre 1,000-2,000 ton-a-day sîze.

To date, aJ.nost 80 test holes have
been drilled at thre site and assay work
and assessment of resuits are underway.

In addition to the mine and mill,
Wright Engineers Limited is expected to
provide material handling advice and de-
sign, thre latest in pollution control equip-
ment, an assessment of thre use of sea
water for treating thre ore, as well as mine
drainage and water supply and treatment.

(Canada Commerce, June/July 1980)
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Neu/is of the arts
Theatre used to report police story

Two Quebec City reporters have turned
to theatre in an attempt to "report" a
story from a different perspective.

Guy Dubé of the daily Le Soleil and
Frank Fontaine of CFTM-TV, both cover-
ing police and court beats, had thouglit
separately for some time about how to
get around the limitations of daily
journalism.

"I was thinking of a novel and Frank
wanted to write a play," says Mr. Dubé.
"He finally persuaded me."

Their play, L Enquête (7he Inquest),
opened at the Bois de Coulonge summer
theatre.

The action unfolds around a coroner's
inquest into the death of a young man
found hanged in police ceils. It recalis a
recent Quebec City case that gained
notoriety, but the authors emphasize that
the Play is fictional.

Mr. Dubé had no theatre experience,
but Mr. Fontaine is a graduate of
London's Royal Academny of Dramatic
Arts. Dubé is happy that Fontaine con-
vinced hlmn to collaborate on a play.

"It's the ideal medium," he says.
"There are many dimensions you can't
get into a novel."

The two men wrote their first draft ini
three days with great enjoyment, Mr.
Dubé recails.

"We wrote what we thought, with the
pleasure that cornes from the freedom to
make things up. We let everything out."

The two men, while continuing to
work as journalists, are already consider-
ing other subjects for other plays.

Book designer honoured

Daniel Fowler of Amherst Island 1810-
1894, a book designed by Peter Domn,
director of graphic design at Queen's Uni-
versity in Kingston, Ontario, has been
chosen as one of the best North American
books of 1979 by the American Institute
of Graphic Arts (AIGA) in New York.

Dorn's design was one of 100 books
selected from over 800 entries fromn
both the United States and Canada. Ib
was part of the AIGA show which me-
cently opened ini New York. No award
for best-of-show was given, but ail de-
signers whose work was chosen for
exhibition received Certificates of Ex-
cellence fmomn the AIGA.

Canadian art tours Europe

The Art Gallery of Ontario has sent a
show of works by major contemporary
Canadian artists on tour in Europe during
1980-81. The exhibition Ten Canadian
Artists in the 1970s was previewed at
the gallery from September 6 through
October 19, before it began a tour of art
centres in Denmark, Germany, Luxem-
bourg and Belgium.

Fifty-seven works produced or con-
ceived in the 1970s by lain Baxter/N.E.
THING CO., Jack Bush, Peterson Ewen,
Murray Favro, Garry Neill Kennedy, Ron
Martin, Guido Molinari, David Rabino-
witch, Royden Rabinowitch and Michael
Snow comprise the exhibition.

The gallery's chief curator Roald
Nasgaard, organized the exhibit to arouse
broader awareness of the achievemnents of
Canadian artists. Dr. Nasgaard said he
chose to present a group show, composed
of individuals, which was large enough to,
indicate the variety and richness of artistic
production in Canada, but small enougli
to include a substantial body, of work by
each artist.

National uaiiery ot canacia, anai uanacta
Council Art Bank and fromn the artists
themnselves. Somie works have been pro-
duced especially for the exhibition> such
as drawings by David and Royden Rabino-
witch. and a new sumrmary piece by Garry.

Kennedy.
Some of the artists shown are already

known to European viewers. "The exhibi-
tion opens with Jack Bush," says Dr.
Nasgaard, "whose inclusion was of special
interest to European participants. Despite
his death in 1977, he has continued to be
a central figure in Canadian art and one
of the rare Canadian artists to gain a
major international reputation. The
unique achievement of Montreal painting
is represented by the most recent work of
Guido Molinari. Michael Snow and lain
Baxter are also artists who made signiîfi-
cant and international impact before the
1970s and who continue bo ýproduce
original and innovative art."

Art purchase programn planned

A major program designed to foster the
purchase of art and exhibitions will begin
early next year in Ontario.

The programn, entitled Future Tradi-
tions: Ontario '81, will have a budget of
$ 162,500, to which the Alîstate Founda-
tion has pledged $95 ,000 and Wintario
has given $67,500.

The main aims of the project are to
present throughout the province major
works by leading Ontario artists, and to
offer Ontario public galleries an opportu-
nity to acquire the major works of these
artists.

Art Gallery of Hamilton director Glen
Cumming, who omganized Future
Traditions in co-operation with eighb
Ontario gallery curators and the Toronto
firm of Art and Communications Coun-
selors, said that works on canvas and
paper by 25 Ontario artists will be ex-
hibited. The show will open in Hamilton
in January 1981, then tour Ontario for
the next two years.

members will choose the works to ho
shown.

Future Traditions will be shown at
galleries in Oshawa, London, Windsor,
Stratford, Kitchener, Kingston, St. Cathe-
rines, Sudbury and Toronto, at no cost to
participating galleries.
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Scientific advances (Cont'dfromP. 2)

ference on Science and Technology for
Development, the United Nations Scien-
tific Committee on the Effeets of Atomnic
Radiation and the UNESCO International
Co-ordinating Council for Man and the
Biosphere.

At the request of the Secretary of
State for External Affairs, the President
of NRC headed the Canadian delegation
to the Scientîfie Forum held in Hamburg,
Germany, to enhance co-operation be-
tween the scientific communities of
Eastern Europe and the West, and at the
meeting in Moscow of the Mixed
Commission for Canada's General Ex-
changes Agreement with the Soviet
Union, NRC's Vice-President (Extemnal
Relations) chaired the Canadian scientifie
sub-committee.

NRC continues to co-operate with
other countries in International Energy
Agency research and development pro-
jects in the fields of renewable energy,
conservation and nuclear fusion. During
the current year, co-operative projects
were initiated in forest biomass energy,
advanced heat pumps, and central solar
heating plants with seasonal storage. The
number of projects in which NRC is in-
olved now totals 14.

As in the past, members of NRC staff
continue to serve on interdepartmental
committees concerned with policy
towards scientific and teclinical co-opera-
tion with other countries, such as
Germany, China and Japan, and with the
scientific and environruental activities of
intergovernimental organizations such as
the Organization for Economic Co-opera-
tion and Development (OECD), the
North Atlantic Treaty Organization
(NATO) and the United Nations and its
associated organizations....
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News briefs $4.7-milion (U.S.) financing agreement
to support the sale of a flight simulator

Prince Phiiîp recently attended the by CAE Electronics Limited of Montreal
twenty-first triennial conference of to Singapore. The loan, to Singapore
the British Commonwealth Ex-Services Airlines Limited (SIA) supports the $5.5-
League held in Ottawa. During his three- million (U.S.) sale of an A-300 Airbus
day visît, the Prince, who holds the office simulator unit, including on-site installa-
of grand president of the league, officiat- tion, calibration, support services and
ed at the meeting and laid a wreath at the spare parts. The simulator will be installed
foot of Canada's war memorial in honour at the airline's new training centre at the
of the Commonwealth's dead. The league Changî Airport. In addition to its own
ties together veterans' organizations from use, the simulator will be used to train
47 countries, acting as a post office for pilots from other Southeast Asian airlines.
them and helping needy veterans, their The Melbourne University Press in
widows and children. There are about Australia recently published the prison
800,000 Canadian veterans, of whom journal of the exiled Canadian patriote
40,000 ail past the age of 80 are sur- François-Maurice Lepailleur. TIhe book
vivors from the First World War. entitled, Land of a Thousand Sorrows,

Indian and Northern Affairs Minister recounts the exile of Lepailleur, who was
John Munro recently returned from a one of the popular leaders of the Can-
five-day visit to Denark and Greenland. adian rebellion of 1838. Exiled from
Mr. Munro was accompanied by Peter Itti- Lower Canada and sentenced to two
nuar, member of Parliament for Nunatsiaq, years in an Australian prison, Lepailleur
Northwest Territories and by Deputy Min- kept a journal fromn the date hie learned
ister for Northem Affairs Paul Tellier and of fris exile until hie was reunited with his
his Assistant Deputy Minister Neil Faulk- family over five years later. The journal
ner. During the visit, the Canadian delega- provides new and detailed information of
tion met with Jonathan Motzfelt, Premier life in the convict settlements - the daily
of Greenland and Jorgen Peder Hansen, routine, the corruption of the prison
the Danish Minister for Greenland. They authorities, the brutality of the police,
also met with members of the Greenlandic the hate inspîred by collaborators and the
Home Rule Cabinet and the Legislative loneliness of exile.
Assembly to dîscuss the Arctic Pilot Pro- The Alberta government has collected
ject and the recent Inuit Circumpolar more than $620 million in bonus pay-
Conference. ments for petroleum and natural gas

Vietnamese groups from across Canada rights in the first half of the year. In 1979
have formed a national organization to the industry paid a record $996 million
co-ordinate efforts to help immigrants for the full year in bonuses for oîl and gas
and refugees adjust to life in Canada and leases and licences.
to preserve their culture. The Canadian The Royal Bank of Canada is expand-
Federation of Vietnamese Associations ing its present corporate banking activi-
held its founding convention in Ottawa ties in West Germany into the consumer
recently with delegates from eight groups finance area. Through an existing West
across Canada attending. The federation German subsidiary, Burgardt and Notte-
hopes to have 20 member groups within a bohm Bank AG, it has bought an interest
year. in Bankhaus Bohl of Freudenstadt, which

A consortium of five Ontario comn- operates in the area of consumer finance.
panies has won an $80-million contract Dr. Solbert Permnutt of Johns Hopkins
for the final planning and design of a University in Baltimore, Maryland has
$2.86-million university complex in been named the 1980 recipient of McGill
Jeddah, Saudia Arabia. The five Ontario University's Louis and Artur Lucian
companies in Campus-Consortium Con- Award for research into circulatory di-
sultants Limited, the group which won sease. The $40,000 prize is awarded an-
the bid, are: Webb, Zerafa, Menkes, nually by the university for the best pub-
Housden; Mechanical Consultants western lished research on circulatory problems.
Limited;Quinn, Dressel Associates; Arthur Dr. Permutt was selected for his work on
Erickson Associates Limited and Project the physiology of pulmonary circulation.
Planning Associates Limited. Dr. Permutt is serving as a consultant to

The Export Development Corporation the cardiovascular division of McGill's
(EDC) announced the conclusion of a Faculty of Medicine until December 15.


