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Local Happenings
Lent begins thin year on Wednes­

day, February 26th.
■Mrs. Florence Kelly has returned

■ after visiting friends in St. Cathar­
ines and Toronto. >

Thamesville council made a grant 
of $12 to the editor of the local pap- 
■er for publishing the minutes of last 
year’s meetings of the council.

“LOOK”—Friday and Saturday 
specials—'Any article in our Hard­
ware Window for only 98c. A real 
bargain.—J. R. McCormick.
One chimney belches smoke and 

grime
And cinder showers to boot,
And other chimneys see the crime j 
And promptly follow soot.

See our 5—and 10—cent counter! 
Many useful household articles 
gathered together and marked down 
to clearing out price».—See them the 
first time you’re in.—P. Dodds & 
Son.

If carried at next month’s session 
of the legislative, the gasoline tax 
will be two cents per gallon in On­
tario. This will amount to about two 
million dollars annually, which will 
be used exclusively on provincial 
roads. Truck licenses will also be 
"raised from $14 to $20.

Men’s heavy cottonade lined smocks 
best value in Canada $2.76, worth 
$3.60 and $3.76. Clearing at $2.75 a 
garment.—Swift’s.

“Fish” specials for Friday and 
Saturday—White Fish 17c lb., Sal- 
-mon 15c lib., Herring 10c lb., Haddie 
15c lb., Fillets 17c.—J. R. McCor­
mick.

In this issue will be found an­
nouncement of a number of special 
sales by our merchants. People will 
find it advantageous to buy now, and 
trade rightfully belongs to those en­
ergetic enough to be soliciting pat­
ronage by systematic advertising.

Dr. Hill told the Health Week 
audience in Sarnia last week that 
colds were unnecessary. This is 
pleasing news in view of the word 
from Toronto that handkerchiefs will 
retail at $5.00 each. That looks like 
paying for it through the nose.

The preacher who can preach to 
please every hearer, the school teach 
er who can instruct to please every 
parent, the dressmaker who can 
please every patron, the merchant 
who can please every buyer, and the 
editor who can please all his sub­
scribers, are all dead and carrying 
harps.

Big reductions in Men’s, and Boys 
Sweaters, $5.00 sweaters for $3,50.

I —Swift’s.
The winner of the competition 

! conducted by “Canadian Bookman”
| for reviews of “Elaine at the Gates” 
i "Was won by Mrs. Kate T. Connolly 
1 of Watford, Ont. The review opens 
[with this succinct sentence: “This is
■ a novel with the Spirit of Happiness 
[always leading and almost always 
{eluding the heroine, Elaine—at least 
I until the last chapter, when the 
[leader hopes it has finally come with 
jin her grasp." This is followed by a 
[well-written epitome of the novel

-a recognition of the art of the 
[author but with a protest against 
[certain ultra-frank discussions 
[■“which in the minds of the conserva­
tive, the book could well do with­
out.” In the completition for reviews 
of “A Passage to India" the first 
prize review by Kate T. Connolly of 
"Vatford, Ont., follows,, as does the 

•st prize review by Miss Mae Thomp 
Bon, of South Vancouver, in the 
juvenile competition for reviews of 

1^‘Those Who Walk in the Wild.”
The Fellowship Bible Class met at 

{the home of Mr. and Mrs- S. Harper 
: on Thursday evening, Jan. 22nd, at 
{eight o’clock. In the absence of the 

president, Rev. S. J. Thompson took 
the chair. The meeting opened with 
singing and prayer. After the read­
ing of the minutes the secretary 
gave a report of the number of visits 
made on the siok and the flowers 
sent during the month. Three new 
names, Misses Lovell, Dunlop and 
Temple, were added to the class roll.

Mr. Fowler read a selection en­
titled “A Cottage Home" and it was 
heartily applauded. Rev. S. J. Thomp 
son gave an interesting talk on 
■“Brotherhood.” Dr. Hicks followed 
with a short talk on the financial 
aspect of the work of the Sunday 
School. Rev. S. Quinn closed the 
meeting with prayer. A vote of 
thanks was tendered Mr. and Mrs. 
Harper and after refreshment» were 
served the meeting adjourned. Col­
lection $2.10.

Thamesville proposes to build a 
new skating rink if sufficient funds 
are subscribed.

$200 FREE TO YOU! Scrambled 
Comics. Latest in Features; Fun for 
children and grown-ups, in Sunday’s 
Detroit Times. Order Now.

Only a few pair of our big $1.60 
value overalls left; get a pair of 
these while we have your size.— 
Swifts.
There will be a celebration of Holy 

Communion in Trinity Church next 
Sunday at 11 a.m. Services a» usual 
in the evening.

The regular meeting of Trinity 
Church Guild and W. A. will be held 
at the home of Mrs. G. N. Howden, 
on Thursday, Feb. 5th, at 3 o’clock.

“Three Famous Conversions” will 
be the subject next Sunday evening 
at the Methodist church. Do not miss 
this sermon.

Notices sent out by the post office 
department call public attention to 
the advisability of placing the send­
er’s name and address on the upper 
left hand corner of all mail matter 
posted in Canada.

The craze spreads and spreads 
until now, as a great poet almost 
put it:—There is no home, however 
watched and tended, but knows 
what’s in the air; there is no house­
hold ‘howsoe’er defended, but has one 
puzzle victim there.

Harwich and Raleigh townships in 
Kent County have abolished statute 
labor and appointed road superin­
tendents to act under the new sys­
tem of road maintenance. In both 
cases, Ex-Reeves were selected; in 
Harwich, Angus McMillan, at a sal­
ary of $6.00 for each day devoted 
to this work, while Raleigh tp. voted 
James Wellwood an annual salary 
of $1200.

It may be of some interest to 
swine feeder» to know that at the 
Ontario Agricultural College the 
following mineral mixture for hogs 
is used and giving good satisfaction :
4 bushels charcoal or hardwood ash­
es, 8 pounds salt, 2 quarts air slack­
ed line, 1 pound sulphur, 10 pounds 
bone meal. This preparation is kept 
in a suitable box in each pen where 
it may be taken by the swine at will.

One Ottawa citizen got a nice sur­
prise during the festival season of 
late December. He bought a box of 
chocolates in an Ottawa store, but 
on opening it found, not chocolates, 
but $867 in cash—the total day’s re­
ceipts of the store. And the store 
got a real surprise when the buyer 
returned the money, for there would 
have been no clue to the person who 
had been sold the ‘box of chocolates.’ 
The store cashier had placed the re­
ceipts in an empty chocolate box, and 
confused it with other boxes.

The quarterly communion services 
will be held in the Methodist church­
es at Watford and Zion next Sunday 
morning at 11 a.m. at Watford, and 
2.30 p.m. at Zion. Every member 
expected to be present. "

The Y. P. L. of the Methodist 
church will have a program of great 
interest next Monday evening, when 
another of the lectures illustrated 
with splendid colored pictures will 
be given by the pastor. Silver collec­
tion for expenses; balance to go to 
the missionary fund of the League. 
The subject will be “With a Mission­
ary in West China.”

A Special meeting of the Young 
People’s Society of Christian En­
deavour, of the Congregational 
church, will be held this Thursday 
evening at 7.30 p.m. when Mr. H.

; Carson Mateer, of Toronto, General 
Secretary of the Ontario Christian 
Endeavour Union; and Mr. Alfred E. 
Garwood of London, president of the 
London and District Christian En­
deavour Union, will be present as 
special speakers.

A special Young People’s service 
will be held in the Congregational 
Church on Sunday evening at 7 p.m., 
when the newly elected officers of 
the Young People’s Society of Christ 
ian Endeavour will be publicly instal 
led into their offices. The pastor, Rev 
T. DeCourcy Rayner, will be in 
charge, and, as Sunday is the inter­
national “Christian Endeavour Day” 
he will speak on the topic “Endeav­
ouring to Be a Christian”; a mess­
age for old and young. The Sacra­
ment of the Lord’s Supper will fol­
low this service, and all members of 
the church are urged to be present. 
The pastor will also preach at the 
morning service at 11 a.m.

Friday and Saturday—last days of 
our Big January Money Saving Sale 
special prices in Men’s and Boys’ 
Suits and Overcoats.—Swift’s.

Jos. Hackett, Enniskillen 
Warden of Lambton

Chairmen of Committees Chosen

Joseph Hackett, reeve of Ennis­
killen township, was elected warden 
of Lambton for 1925 by the county 
council at the initial meeting of the 
January session Tuesday afternoon.

The choice was made on the sec­
ond ballot in caucus. When the first 
vote was taken reeve Edward Armi- 
tage of Sombra, one of the four 
aspirants for the highest office in the 
gift of the county was low man and 
his name was dropped from the vot­
ing on the second ballot.

When the councillors had wielded 
their pencils for the second time 
reeve W. G. Connolly, chairman of 
the caucus, announced that Reeve 
Hackett was the winner. Although 
no figures were announced his elect­
ion on the second ballot indicated 
that he had received thevotes of more 
than half of the councillors as in­
timation that such a rule would pre­
vail was made before the ballots 
were distributed.

After selecting their presiding 
officer the council heard a few brief 
addresses, named a striking commit­
tee to select the standing committees 
for the year and then adjourned.

Chairmen of Committees
The Chairmen of the several stand 

ing Committees were chosen at the 
Wednesday session as follows:

Roads and Bridges—Thomas Bum 
ley, Plympton.

Public Buildings—John Barron, 
Euphemia.

Finance—T.J. Sproule, Oil Springs
Printing—B. J. Muma, Warwick.
Educational— Mason Spearman, 

Thedford.
Equalization—W.W. Miller, Moore
Legislative—Rolbt. Hair, Forest;
House of Refuge—Fred C. East­

man, Arkona.
Advisory Board—Jno. McDonald, 

Dawn.
High School Settlement—W. G. 

Connolly,-Watford.
The members of County Council 

were guests of the officials of the 
Dominion Alloy Steel Corporation 
on a tour of inspection of their new 
plant at the close of the Wednesday 
session and were later entertained at 
a banquet in the Chamber of Com­
merce.

IN FAVORED AREA TO SEE 
ECLIPSE

While Cloud» Prevailed Nearly
Everywhere There Was a Perfect 

Slcy Here

The people of this section of the 
country were surely favoured last 
Saturday morning when a cloudless 
sky permitted a perfect view of the 
eclipse of the sun while in practically 
the whole track of total eclipse the 
clouds forbade altogether a view of 
what was taking place.

Nearly all our citizens were busy 
with smoked glass from the time the 
moon first began to show itself on 
the sun at about eight o’clock until 
it had cleared away again about ten.

Though the eclipse, here was not 
called total it was so nearly so that 
only a tiny edge of the sun was left, 
and the magnificence of the spec­
tacle was complete. The darkness 
during the few minutes of total ec­
lipse resembled moonlight.

WARWICK
“LOOK" Friday and Saturday 

special—Any article in our Hard­
ware window for only 98c. A real 
bargain.—J. R. McCormick.

The first regular meeting of Maple 
Leaf Community Club was held in S. 
S. No. 11 school house on Friday 
evening last. An appropriate program 
was put on for the evening including 
an impromptu debate “Resolved that 
Newspapers do as much harm as 
good”. The decision was given in 
favor of the negative side. Next 
meeting will be held on Friday 
evening, Jan. 30th. Everybody wel­
come.

Stole Turkey Gobbler
(Sarnia Canadian Observer)

At a county police court session 
here Saturday afternoon, William : 
Claypole, 17, of Warwick township,! 
elekted summary trial and pleaded 
guilty to a charge of stealing a tur-1 
key gobbler, the property of Elwood 
Jones, a resident of the same neigh­
borhood in Warwick. On the recom­
mendation of county crown attorney 
F. W. Willson, magistrate C. S. 
Woodrow suspended sentence con­
ditioned upon the payment of $15 
for the value of the turkey and court 
costs of $20. A recognizance was al­
so taken for the youth’s future good 
■behavior. His father could ascribe 
no motive for the theft. He said that 
his son had been working for him on 
the farm since he left school and al­
though he received no stated wage 
he was given money from time to 
time. The magistrate counselled the 
youth that before contemplating any 
offences in the future if he did net 
think of himself or hia father to at 
least think of his mother, who suffer­
ed for his deeds.

BROOKE
Service will be held in St. James’ 

Church next Sunday at three o’clock 
in the afternoon.

“Fish” specials for Friday and 
Saturday—White Fish 17c lb.,. Sal­
mon 16c lb., Herring 10c lb., Haddie 
15c, Fillets 17c.—J. R. McCormick,

Successful Carnival

About 75 Splendid Costumes 
Viewed by Large Attendance

The Masquerade Carnival in Wat­
ford Arena on Monday evening was 
well attended and about seventy-five 
skaters appeared in costume. The 
judges experienced considerable 
difficulty in selecting the prizewin­
ners, the final result being as follows | 

Men’s Costume (National)—W. 
Thomspon.

Men’s Costume, fancy—Buster 
Rogers, ldt; Bob. McCormick, 2nd.

Boys’ Costume, 16 years and un- 
defc—Donald Tait list; Bljmer Mc­
Intosh 2nd; Geo. Tait 3rd.

Boys’ Costume, 12 years and un­
der—Alex. McLaren 1st, Ken Ray­
ner 2nd.

Ladies’ Costume (National)—Amy 
Luckiham 1st; Mildred Fulcher 2nd.

Ladies’ Costume, fancy—Beatrice 
Cook 1st, Edna McIntosh 2nd.

Girls’ Costume, 16 years and over 
—iMaxine Rogers 1st, Verlie Wil­
liamson 2nd.

Girls Costume, under 16 years— 
Margaret Webb 1st, Edith Weight 
2nd, Mary Connolly 3rd.

Girls’ Costume. 12 years and un­
der—Catharie Howden 1st, (Twins) 
Patty Millar and Helen Nixon 2nd, 
Helen Callahan 3rd.

Youngest Girl in Costume—Louise 
McCormick, 5 years.

Youngest Boy in Costume—Clare 
McIntosh 1st, 8 years; Grant Earley 

, 2nd, 8 years.
RACES

Men’s race, open—Jack Kinnell. 
Boys, 16 years and under—Buster 

Rogers.
Boys, 12 years and under—Jack 

Caley.
Girls, 12 years and under—Patty 

Millar 1st, Doris Howden 2nd.
1 skate and 1 shoe race—Roy 

Cooke 1st, M. McIntosh 2nd.
Girls’ Race, open—Bertha Durstan

Watford business men donated the 
following prizes:—I. Cantelon, box 
chocolates; T. W. Col'lister, $1.00 
savings account in Bank of Mont­
real: F. A. Pritchett, $1.00 cash; C.
A. Class, pair ear rings; P. J. Dodds 
pair slippers, piece fancy china and 
ash tray; H. W. Nixon, $1.00 sav­
ings account in Standard Bank; E. 
D. Swift, silk tie and pair gloves;
B. F. Cook, bottle perfume and box 
chocolates; J. B. Cowan, box choc­
olates; E.A. Brown, skating sweater, 
J. R. McCormick, flashlight; Alex. 
Elliot, pair bedroom slippers, 1 lb. 
tea, and cup and saucer; J. C. Tre- 
nouth $1.00 cash; A. Rumford, pair 
rubbers; J. W. MoConkey, tie and 
belt Chain; J. Coupland, 2 pair 
straps; Ray Morningstar, auto tube;

J. Menzies, pipe, pouch and tob­
acco; J. W. McLaren, large boz of 
chocolates and bottle perfume; J. Me 
Kereher, hockey stick; R. Williamson 
for girl and boy, free trip to Chat­
ham Sugar Refinery; Dr. McGilli- 
cuddy $1.00; J. F. Elliot 25c; Roche 
House $1.00; Dr. Sawers $1.00; S. 
Stapleford & Son $1.00; John Doar 
50c; Geo. Shirley 50c; F. W. Rogers 
$1.00.

As it was found unnecessary to 
appeal to several other business men 
these will be called on for prizes 
next month when it is proposed to 
stage another masquerade. ,

The Wyoming Band found it im­
possible to get through the roads, 
but no doubt weather conditions will 
make their appearance possible later 
in the season.

Vestry Meetings

Trinity Church, Watford

The Annual Vestry Meeting of 
Trinity church was held on Monday 
evening, Jan. 19th, in the school 
room of the church. All department» 
of the various church activities were 
found to be in a healthy condition. 
The following officers were elected 
for the ensuing year;—

Select Vestry:—John D. Carroll, 
Richard Williamson, F. W. Rogers, 
C. W. Howden, J. B. Cowan, P. J. 
Dodds, C. A. Class, W. L. Millar.

Sidesmen;—P. J. Dodds, Reg. 
Brown, Earll Dobbin, C. A. Class, 
E. D. Swift.

Auditors:—A. G. Brown, C. W. 
Howden.

Vestry Clerk:—W. H. Shrapnell.
Rector’s Warden:—E. A. Brown.
People’s Warden:—Dr. G. N. How­

den.
Delegate to Synod:—Dr. Jas. New­

ell.
Substitute:—A. G. Brown.

St. James’ Church, Brooke

Sidesmen:—Messrs. Walter Kelly,
A. E. Sutton, James K. Kelly, Alex 
Kelly, James Searson and Thomas 
Woods.

Select Vestry:—Messrs. Thomas 
Woods, Walter Kelly, A. E. Sutton, 
Russell Powell, Elmer Moffatt, Jas. 
Searson, Alex Kelly, Robert Edgar,
B. A. Richardson, Thomas Searson, 
Wm. Greer, John Gilliland, Chester 
Coristine.

Vestry Clerk:—A. E. Sutton. 
Rector’s Warden:—R. J. Lucas. 
People’s Warden:—Dan. Kelly.
Lay Delegate to Synod':—Thomas 

Woods; substitute, Wm. Greer.

Christ Church, Sutorville.

Rector’s Warden :—Thos. H. Lucas
People’s Warden:—John Saunders.
Sidesmen:—David Lucas, Ed Kidd,' 

A. Copeland, Reg. Thorne, Sanford 
Lucas.

Lay Delegate to Synod:—Howard 
Shirley; substitute, A. Copeland.

Vestry Clerk .Melvin Kelly.

St. Mary’s Church, Warwick.

Rector’s Warden :—Morris Smith.
People’s Warden:—N. Herbert.
Vestry Clerk:—O. Tanner.
Sidesmen :—Messrs. O. Tanner,

Robinson H. Hawkins, E. Archer.
Delegate to Synod:—J. H. Robin­

son and A. Archer.
Supt. of S. S:—E. Herbert.
■Organist:—Miss D. Wordsworth.

St. Paul’s Church, Wisbeach

Rector’s Warden—G. Hawlcn jr.
People’s. Warden—Andres' lies.
Vestry Clerk—E. Will''™3-
‘Sidesmen—Messrs. t»eo. Ues and 

Roy Willoughby.
Delegates to the Synod—G. Haw- 

ken sr., and AsAel Bryson.
Auditors—A- Bryson and Keith 

Howden.

Board of Education
Minutes of a Regular meeting of 

the Board of Education held in the 
Library Board Room on Monday 26 
day of January, 1925, at 8 p.m.

Present—-W. E. Fitzgerald, chair­
man; Dr. Howden, Wm. Harper, Jno. 
McKercher, E. D. Swift, Dr. McGill- 
icuddy, A. D. Elliott and F. Lovell, 
also Principal Cameron.

The minutes of the last regular 
and special meetings were read and 
confirmed.

The Public School Principal’s re 
port for November and December, 
were read.

Howden-—McKercher, and Car 
that the Principal’s reports 
emlber and December, be $<SBlVe,l 
and filed.

Swift—McGillicudfly^and1 parried, 
that the following uccouMIkdfe'paid:

Public School :
W. D. Cameron Eat#.........$ 6.00
Robert Hall, gravel...............  16.60
National Geographic Soc... .3.50

High Sclulol :
Express ÆKt?.........................$ .45
Guide-Advocate, supplies ... 3.00
G. M- Hendry. Co., supplies ..14.94
Ditto ....................................... 15.00
Sam Janes, draying ............. 8:40
Bert Cook, supplies............. 28.95

Harper—iHowden, and Carried, 
that we adjourn.

D. Watt, Secretary,

BORN
In Watford, on January 17th, 1925, 

to Mr. and Mrs. Wm. F. Lawrence» 
a daughter, Madalene Eloise.
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h<nv Many Objet
The above picture c 

look at the picture—there 
“paddle”, “purse”, ctc\ P 
a, list of a’l the obj(5t,C5*!lP 
family join in-—see who c; 
the fifty best lists of won 
visible objects shown in tl 
best, second prize, etc.

Yoimg and Old Joi
The Mail and Empire 

another puzzle game in wl 
pate—from the tiniest chib 
grandfi»; her. No object > 
the poorest eyesight can sc 
skill. Your ability to fun 
mines the prize you win. 
tills evening, gather all til 
family’ together; grvo eacl 
and sheet of paper—and s 
most “P-Words”. You v 
find how large a list of 
with a few minutes’ stud 
and try it—-Then, send in ; 
the big prizes.

Observe The
1. Any man, woman or chiJ 

«ml is not a résidant of Toro 
ti.e employ of The Mail and 
of an employe’s family, may

2. All answers mast lie a 
1925, and addressed <? . C. 
Manager, Mail «4*1. Empire.

3. All lists of liam-c-A should 
of the paper only, and numb 
*, etc. Write your full name 
per right hand corner. If y< 
thing else, use a separate shi

4'. Only such words as app 
tionary will be counted. Do 
Where the plural is used, 1 
counted, and vice versa.

6. Words of the same sp< 
once, even though used to dei 
or a»ticies, or parts of ob 
obj^et or article can be nam<

6. Do not use lijphenntcd 
any words formed by the com 
complete words, where each 
object.

7. The answer having the 
reel list of names of visibl 
shown lr. the picture that be 
will be awarded First Prize, 
handwriting have no bearing

8. Any number of people m 
Ing the Puzzle, but only one ■ 
any one household; nor wit 
more than one cf any group 
been working together.

9. In the event of a tie ft 
foil amount of such prize V 
tied participant.

10. Subscriptions (both ne’ 
In atlvur^ce at $5.00 per yeui 
^ti.P-0 per year delivered by 1 
will be accepted. However, 
91,000 Bonus Rewards, at lei 
must bo sent In.

11. A new subscriber is at 
«receiving The Mail and Empl

12. All answers will receiv 
Regardless of whether or no 
Mail and Empire is sent in.

13. All new subscriptions 
fled by the Puzzle Manager, 
subscriptions as new will poi 
of such subscriptions as qua! 
Bonus Rewards.

14. Three prominent Ton 
•connection with The Mail t 
looted to act as judges to 
participants by pending in tl 
the decision of the judges a

15. The judges will meet 
announcement of the Prize 
of words will be published in 
quickly thereafter as possible 
EXTRA LARGE PICTURE Ï

REQUI

Subscription Rates-- 
by Mail $5.00 Per Ye

Rural Route J.
Subscribers J,

> *
C. A. Montgomery, rr

Punie Manager,
1 Dept, 1. *
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Member of Canadian Weekly 
Newspapers Association.

W. C. Aylesworth, Publisher. 
Average Circul*tion for yeer ending
December 31, 1923......... 1 CCC
(Covering East Lambton ) I )OvO 

ADVERTISING * i TF.S 
Display ada, set. transient. z*c inch. 
Display, yearly own tract -wt. 18c In. 
Display Ada., ail iflate 18c men 
Special Position. . Be per inch extra. 
Tleetrical Advt'g wit n r> >,der or cut

............................ . 3 Sc per inch
Business Locals, Fruit page 10c per 

Une; Inside page? tic per line. 
Classified Ada, One Cent per word 

each insertion. Minimum 25c.
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“Squibographs”

An increase in the price of coffee 
is indicated. This may be followed 
toy expansion of the holes in dough­
nuts.

t t t t
The Hamilton man who lost $300 

in a crap game is convinced that 
Lady Luck and Santa Clans are both 
myths.

t t t t
The assurance of scientists that 

there is no imminent danger of an­
other ice age excites slight interest 
in White River.

t t t 1-
Speaking of the conservation of 

timber, what has become of the old- 
time lumber wagons? They are about 
as obsolete in cities as hacks.

t t t t
A Paris pawnbroker is said to be 

planing the largest garage in Eur­
ope. He announces his intention to 
advance loans on used motor cars.

t t t t
Government control of the game of 

baseball is advocated across the 
border. Pitchers would be delighted 
if they could control the ball.

t t t t
Intercollegiate crossword puzzle 

contests promise to become as popu­
lar as football matches. Both games 
call for a knowledge of “horizon- 
tab” and “verticals.”

t t t t
A witness in a bank investigation 

case in Toronto occupied the stand 
for eight days. He must have re­
sembled an interrogation point 
when he was released.

t t t t
A Harvard professor predicts that 

mankind will be toothless in about 
forty thousand years. This will 
give the toothpick factories ample 
time to dispose of their stocks.

t t t t
The recently-elected woman Gov­

ernor of Wyoming has assumed her 
duties as chief executive of the state. 
Political opponents are advised to 

the tail of her skirt.
t t t

to a Japanese health 
made from 

It
and a

at-

would

The crossword pnzzle is one game 
that is “on the square.”

t t t t
A Kansas editor complains that 

the clause in the Constitution guar­
anteeing every man the right to the 
pursuit of happiness is interpreted 
by many men to mean chasing after 
bootleggers.

t t t t
It may be nice for the Martians 

to get up in the morning but they 
are much more comfortable in their 
beds. The temperature at dawn of 
the earth’s nearest neighbor is said 
to be 140 degrees below z ero. 

t f t t
Ontario plans providing additional 

sanctuaries for fur-bearing animals. 
This will be welcome news to the 
wild wolves of Algoma who when 
they sallied forth in the morning 
never knew where their hides would 
harg at night.

+ t t t
To obtain a “close up” of the solar 

eclipse, observers are arranging to 
view the phenomenon from the decks 
of airships. In the distant future 
enterprising promoters may be sell­
ing “ring /ide" seats to witness the 
spectacle.

t t t 4
A Montreal dealer guarantees his 

eggs to be a certain number of hours 
old. The price is graded according 
to freshness. After they have been
held a few weeks the eggs are
strong enough to announce their own 
age.

North Bay boasts of having the 
champion lightweight alderman in 
the Dominion. The civic midget is 
3 feet in height and weighs fifty-two 
pounds. He is naturally opposed to 
proportionate representation.

t t t t
It is estimated that each person 

in this country eats an average of a 
peels of onions a year. Apart from 
its nutritive value, the pungent veg­
etable is highly emotional. It has 
been known to bring tears to the 
•yes of strong men and weak women.

t t t t
• Zk-New York department store has 
îî ,le4 a moving picture show on 
ne top 600r Mothers can park the 

7 u"8stert in the theatre while they
,sho»Ping. Father can work crossword puzx\«,_

_ . t V f t
interf»«.aSS'?if °f le”t> year does not 
interfere with marrying and ^ving in
marriage. The custom w ^ 
long established to be afte^d by 
^divisible by four or anyVJ

_ , t t t t
.... kecP himself in good physical 

condition the lord mayor of London, 
whose duties require him to attend 
numerous banquets, takes frequent 
long walks. He regulates his mileage 
toy the number of courses on the 
menu.

DOMINION BUREAU OF 
STATISTICS

The Dominion Bureau of Statis­
tics is releasing today the first vol­
ume of the final report on the Cen­
sus of 1921. The main results of the 
Census have been given out in a 
series of some thirty bulletins, each 
dealing with specific aspects of popu­
lation and agriculture. The volume, 
however, contains the final detailed 
figures by local units, showing (1) 
the numbers sex and geographical 
distribution of the population, (2) 
the racial origins, and (3) the re­
ligions. The volume also contains the 
administrative report on the taking 
of the Census.

According to the British North 
America Act 1867, the taking of a 
Census is one of twenty eight speci­
fic subjects exclusively assigned to 
the Dominion as distinguished from 
Provincial authority. The first Cen­
sus Act was passed by the Parlia­
ment of Canada in 1870 and the 
first Census of the Dominion of Can­
ada was taken in 1871. Altogether 
six decennial Censuses of Canada 
have been taken since the formation 
of the Dominion.

Census taking dates from a very 
early period. Moses numbered the 
children of Israel in the fifteenth 
century, B.C. But investigations of a 
similar nature were known many 
centuries earlier; in Babylonia about 
3800 B. C., in China about 3000 B. 
C. and in Egypt about 2200 B. C. A 
Census taken by King David in 
1017 B C. achieved an evil notoriety 
in history from the Divine wrath 
which it is recorded as having pro­
voked and which was cited for many 
generations in Europe in warning 
against the spirit of inquiry. As 
late as 1753 the taking of a Census 
was condemned on religious grounds 
in the British House of Commons, 
when more than one member looked 
upon the proposal as ominous and 
feared lest some public misfortune 
should follow the numbering. The 
Romans were assiduous census;-tak­
ers both under the Republic and the 
Empire and in later years the 
Breviary of Charlemage in A. D. 808 
and the; Domesday Book of William 
the Conqueror (A. D. 1086) are 
celebrated mediaeval censuses. Later, 
for several centuries, the idea of 
census taking disappeared from Eur­
ope.

This report, however, brings to 
notice that the credit for taking the 
first census as known in modern 
times belongs to Canada. The year 
was 1666, and the census was one of 
the Colony of New France, as Can­
ada was then called. This census was 
a systematic record of each individu­
al by name, taken at a fixed date, 
showing sex, occupation, conjugal 
and family condition. The records of 
it are carefully preserved in the 
Archives of Paris, a transcript of 
which may be seen in Ottawa. When 
it is recalled that in Europe the first 
censuses date only from the eight­
eenth century, notably those of 
Prussia (1719) and Sweden (1748 
and France and England (1801), the 
achievement of the primitive St. 
Lawrence colony in instituting what 
is today one of the principal instrum­
ents of government in every civilized 
community calls for more than pass­
ing appreciation.

From 1666 to 1763, when the 
^tonch regime ended, no fewer than 

censuses were taken in New Can­
ada, nor was this census taking lim­
ited to what is now the Province of 
Quebec as in the latter years of this

period seven similar censuses were 
taken of Nova Scotia, six of New­
foundland and one of Prince Edward 
Island.

Under British occupation there 
were censuses of Canada in 1766, 
1784 and 1790. From 1817 onwards 
census taking in Canada has been 
more or less frequent, but is was 
only with the formation of the Dom­
inion of Canada that they were taken 
at a stated period for the Dominion 
as a whole.

As above stated, the main figures 
of the 1921 Census have already 
been made available to the public but 
the following may be noted: the 
total population of Canada in 1371 
was 3, 689, 257; fifty years after­
wards in 1921 it was 8,788,483 an 
increase of 138.22 p. c, In the last 
decade the increase was 21.95 per 
cent, while in the first decade follow­
ing Confederation it was 17.23 ner 
sen*, in the second 11.76 per cent., 
in the third 11.13 per cent., and in 
he fourth 34.17 per cent.
It is also interesting to note that 

in 1871 Ontario possessed nearly 44 
per cent of the population of Canada 
and Quebec a little better than 32 
per cent., while in 1921 Ontario poss­
esses 33.38 per cent, and Quebec 
26.87 per cent, of the total popula­
tion. The relative position of the 
Maritime Provinces as regards popu­
lation in 1871 and 1921 is strikingly 
illustrated by the fact that at the 
date of Confederation they had 20.8 
per cent of the total population as 
against 11.4 per cent in 1921. Of 
course, the explanation lies in the 
growth of the Prairie Provinces. In 
1871 out of a total population of 3,- 
689,257 only 18,000 or . 42 per cent, 
dwelt in the Middle West; in 1901 
they possessed slightly more than 3 
per cent, of the total population, 
while in 1921 they had more than 22 
per cent.

The growth of urban population in 
Canada is forcibly illustrated by the 
fact that in 1921 there were 109 
cities and towns in Canada with a 
population of 5,000 and over, as 
against 87 in 1911, 57 in 1901, 45 
in 181, 34 in 1881 and 21 in 1871. In 
1’891 the population living in urban 
centres made up 31.8 per cent of the 
total population ; in 1901 it had 
climbed to 37.5 per cent; in 1911 to 
45.4 per cent and 1921 to 49.5 per 
cent.’ From 1891 to 1921 the rural 
population showed a gain of 34 per 
cent, as against a gain of 183 per 
cent in the urban population in the 
30 years.

In 1871 Montreal, within the area 
comprised within its present limits, 
had a population of about 115,000 as 
against 618,506 in 1921 and Toronto, 
similarly considered, grew in the 
fifty years from 59, 000 to 521, 893. 
Winnipeg, which scarcely found a 
place on the map in 1871 with 241 
persons, in 1921 had 179,087, Among 
the outstanding features may be 
noted the Vancouver and Calgary 
were first noted in the 1891 Census, 
while Edmonton, Regina and Saska­
toon did not find a place in the Cen­
sus previous to 1901. These are now 
large and thriving centres of popu­
lation, trade and industry.

The effects of immigration on the 
ethnic composition of the population 
is illustrated by the fact that in 
1881,-59 per cent, of the population 
was of English, Irish or Scottish ori­
gin, 31 per cent of French origin 
(nearly all native born), and 2% per 
cent Indian, leaving only about 8% 
per cent of the population as be­
longing to other races, while in 1911 
or thirty years later, the proportion 
was as follows: British races 54 per 
cent, French 28% per cent, Indians 
less than 1 % per cent, and all other 
races nearly 16 per cent. In 192: 
the proportion was British races 55 
per cent, French 27.9, Indians 1% 
per cent, leaving all other races with 
15.43 per cent of the total popula­
tion.

The section dealing with the class­
ification of the population according 
to religious beliefs enables persons 
who are interested in such a classifi­
cation to ascertain with the fullest 
detail the relative strength of the 
various denominations by counties, 
townships or cities. Of the total popu­
lation in 1901, the chruch of Eng­
land claimed 12.69 per cent ; Bapt­
ists 5.92 per cent; Lutherans 1.72 
per cent; Methodists 17.07 percent; 
Presbyterians 16.68 per cent; Roman 
Catholics 41.61 per cent; while in 
1921, twenty years later, the per 
cent, proportions were: Church of 
England 16.02 per cent; Lutherans 
3.28 per cent; Methodists 13.18 per 
cent; Presbyterians 16.03 per cent, i 
and Roman Catholic 38.50 per cent. 
The Jews, which numbered 16,401 or 
less than one-third of one per cent of 
the population in 1901, had 125,190 
adherents in 1921 or 1.42 per cent, 
of the total population

What We Have 
to Offer

MO ONE chartered Bank in Canada 
1 ' has anything greater to offer the 
business community than its contem­
poraries unless it be in the character 
of the service it renders. During the 
half-century of its life, the Standard 
Bank has developed a distinct in­
dividuality through the kind of ser­
vice maintained in its daily trans­
actions. The commercial aspect of 
this individuality is found in the 
many unique services for which the 
Standard Bank is peculiarly equip­
ped.

THE

STANDARD BANK
OF CANADA 
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Printing
witd a *Punc6

PRINTING must have a “wallop” to it to gain a favor­
able impression these days. It must be quality 

through and through—the sort that commands attention 
at all times.
We know printing—for that’s our business—and it’s 
your business to get the best at the lowest possible 
prices, consistent With such quality.
We should get together.

V)6e Çuide-Jïdvocate
WATFORD, ONT.

Phone 11
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Proved safe by millions and prescribed by physicians for

Headache Colds

Blenheim Public and Continutaion 
school pupils wilP receive one hour’s 
vocal training each week, it being 
decided by the Board of Education 
to give the scheme one month’s 
trial.

Pain

Toothache

Neuritis

Neuralgia

Lumbago

Rheumatism

• Accept only “Bayer” package 
which contains proven directions.
Handy “Bayer” boxes of 12 tablets. 
Also bottles of 24 and 100—Druggists.
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Buw iilsKiy Objects in This Picture Start With the letter “P” ?
The above picture contains a number of objects beginning with the letter “P”. Just take a good 

look at the picture—there arc all sorts of things that begin with the letter “P”—“puppy”, “pumpkin”, 
“paddle”, “purse”, etcy Nothing is hidden; you don't have to turn the picture upside down. Make 
a. list of all the obj(5c:is•W^TTk' picture the names of which begin with the letter “P”. Have the whole 
family join in—see who can find the most. Doiv’t miss any. Fifty cash prizes will be awarded for 
the fifty best lists of words submitted. The answer having the largest and nearest correct list of 
visible objects shown in the picture starting with the letter “P” will be awarded first prize; second 
best, second prize, etc.

Young and Old Join in the Fun
The Mail and Empire announces to-day 

another puzzle game in which all can partici­
pate—from the tiniest child to grandfather and 
$prandn>a«her. No object is so small but that 
the poorest eyesight can see it. It is a test of 
skill. Your ability to find “P” words deter­
mines the prize you win. Right after supper 
tills evening, gather ail the members of your 
family’ together; gTv;> each of them a pencil 
and sheet of paper—and see who can find the 
most “P-Words”. You will be surprised to 
find how large a list of words you can get 
with a few minutes’ study. Sit down NOW 
and try it—Then, send in your list and try for 
the big prizes.

Observe These Rules
1. Anv man, woman or child who lives in Canada, 

and is not a resident of Toronto, and who Is not in 
ti.e employ of The Mail and Empire, or a member 
of an employe’s family, may submit an answer.

2. All answers must be mailed by February 7t-î, 
1025, and addressed t{* C. A. Montgomery, Fazzlo 
Manager, Mail a4*1. Empire.

3. All lists of iianvôs should be wriUqn on one side
of the paper only, and numbered conscvw-'/ely 1, 2, 
8, etc. Write your full name and address In the up­
per right hand corner. If you desire to write any­
thing else, use a separate sheet. ,

4. Only such words as appear in the English Dic­
tionary will be counted. Do not use obsolete words. 
Where the plural is used, the singular cannot be 
counted, and vice versa.

6. Words of the same spelling can be used only 
once, even though used to designate different objects 
cr a» tides, or parts of objects or articles. An 
objeet or article can be named only once.

6. Do not use hyphenated or compound words, or 
auiy words formed by the combination of two or more 
complete words, where each word in itself is an
**"7^ The answer having the largest and nearest cor­
rect list of names of visible objects and articles 
shown In the picture that begin with the letter *‘P 
pill be awarded First Prize, etc. Neatness, style or 
handwriting have no bearing upon deciding the win-

8. Any number of people may co-operate in answer­
ing the Puzzle, but only one prize will be awarded to 
any one household; nor will pr’wes be awarded to 
*norc than one of any group where two or more have 
been working together.

0. In the event of a tie for any prize offered, t.ie 
foil amount cf such prize will be awarded to each 
tied participant. , ,x , ,

10. Subscriptions (both new and renewal), payable 
in advur^ce at $5.00 per year by mail in 'Canada, or 
3<MM) per ye.tr delivered by carrier boy in Hamilton, 
will be accepted. However, in qualifying for. the 
$1,000 Bonus Rewards, at least one new subscription 
must be sent in.

11. A new subscriber is anyone who has net been 
«receiving The Mail and Empire since January 18th.

12. All answers will receive the same consideration 
regardless of whether or not a subscription to The 
Mail and Empire Is sent In.

13. All new subscriptions will be carefully veri­
fied by the Puzzle Manager. Candidates marking old 
•ubseriplions as new will positively forfeit the credit 
of such subscriptions as qualifying for the Maximum 
Bonus Rewards.

14. Three prominent Toronto citizens, having no 
-connection with The Mail and Empire, will be se­
lected to act as judges to decide the winners, and 
partic ipants by pendihg in their lists agree to accept 
the decision of the judges as final and conclusive.

15. The judges will meet on February 18th, and 
announcement of the Prize Winners and correct list 
of words will be published in The Mail and Empire as 
quickly thereafter as possible.
EXTRA LARGE PICTURE PUZZLE SENT- FREE ON 

REQUEST.

Winning Answers will receive the fifty cash 
prizes according to the table below :

Prize if No Prize if One Prize if Two 
Subscriptions Subscription Subscriptions 

euro sent. Is sent. are sent.

/lst Prize . . $35 $500 fSLOOo)
12nd Prize...i 35 500 1,000
3rd Prize. . 35 500 U.000 J

4 th Prize.... 25 250 500
5 th Prize.... 20 150 300
6th Prize.... 15 100 200
7th Prize . . . 10 75 150
8th Prize... 8 50 100
9th Prize.... 6 30 60

10th Prize. . 5 <s >: 50
11th Prize .. 4 40
12th Prize 3 30
13th to 20ih
Prizes inclusive 2 10 20
21st to 50th
Prizes inclusive 1.50 7.50 15

In the event of a tie for any prize offered, the 
full amount of such prize will be paid to each tied 
participant. /

Rural Route 
Subscribers

YOU CAN WIN $1,000
There Arc Three $1,000 Prizes
Tile “P-Word” Picture Puzzle Game is a campaign to in­

crease the popularity of The Mail and Empire. It costs noth­
ing to take part and you do not have to send in a single sub­
scription to win a prize. If your list of “P-Words” is award­
ed FIRST. SECOND OR THIRD Prize by the judges you 
will win $35; but if you- would like to get more than $35 wo 
make the following special offer whereby you can win bjgger 
caçh prizes by sending in ONE or TWO subscriptions to The 
Mail and Empire.

HERE’S HOW : If your answer to the “P-Word” Picture 
Puzzle wins FIRST, SECOND OR THIRD Prize, apd you 
have sent in one yearly subscription to The Mail and Empire 
at $5.00 by mail in Canada, or $6.00 delivered by carrier boy in 
Hamilton, you will receive $500. instead of $35; fourth prize, 
$250; fifth prize, $150, and so forth. (See second column of 
figures in prize list.)

Or, if your answer wins FIRST, SECOND or THIRD 
Prize, and you have sent in two yearly subscriptions to The 
Mail and Empire (one new and one renewal or two new sub­
scriptions), you will receive $1,000 in place of $35; fourth prize, 
$500 ; fifth prize. $300, and so forth. (See third column of 
figures In prize list.)

How is that for a liberal offer? But, LOOK, there are three 
$1,000 prizes. Therefore, if you stand FIRST, SECOND or 
THIRD, and have sent in two yearly subscriptions at $5.00 a 
year each by mail or $6.00 delivered by carrier boy in Hamil­
ton (one new and one renewal or two new), you will win $1.000. 
It takes but two yearly subscriptions at $5.00 a year each (one 
new and one renewal or two new) to ouallfy for the big $1,000 
rewards. Absolutely, that Is the maximum. You can do this with 
little effort. Your own subscription can count. We can also take 
subscriptions to start at any future date. Just mark on your 
order when you want the paper to start and we will not com­
mence delivery until you say.

Subscription Rates--Payable in advance. THE MAIL and EMPIRE <■ ny where ir.Canada 
by Mail $5.00 Per Year. Delivered by Carrier Boy in Hamilton orLo idon, $6 Per Year

This offer applies to Rural Route patrons, as well as subscribers living in cities 
and towns. If you are already receiving The Mall and Empire, your subscription 
will be extended from its present expiration. Send in a yearly subscription at 
$6.00 and qualify for the big prizes.

THE MAIL AND EMPIRE ""SB*

THE FOLLOWING IS A PARTIAL 
LIST OF PRIZE WINNERS IN 

OUR RECENT CONTESTS

Mrs. Angus Campbell, Forest, $1,000;

Mrs. J. Doyle, Marmora, Ont, $1,000

Mrb. Thos. Pattimore, Athens, $1,000

Mrs. (Rev.) T. A. Isler, Williams­
burg, Ont., $500;

Mrs. Emma Moore, Chesley, $500;

Clarence L. Merrick, Alliston, $300;

Miss Grace Webb, Granton,Ont.$250

Mrs. Herb. Rumstead, Meaford, $160

Mrs. Wm. Yates, Sarnia, Ont., $100;

C. H. Cascaden, Oil City, Ont., $60;

David Watson, Cayuga, Ont., $60;

Miss Daisy M. Rupert, Kingsville,$50

Mrs. A. E. Sims, Sarnia, Ont., $30;

'Miss. M. MeGillawee, Gadshill, $20;
Mrs. Francis Graves, Dresden, $15;

Miss D MacDonald, Sarnia, Ont.,$15;

Mrs. R. S. Morphy, Walkerville, $15;

G. H. Berkeley, St. Catharines, $15;

B. G. Coutts, St. Catharines, $15.

We Have Actually Given Away a 
Total of over Seven Thousand 

Dollars in Prizes

MAIL & EMPIRE
TORONTO, ONTARIO

pital and 
House.
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Beekeeping

District Fair Dates Set 
at Annual Meeting

<1 A. Montgomery, 
Puzzle Manager,

; Dept, 1,

The annual meeting of the West­
ern district fairs association was held 
in the agriculture office, Petrolia, on 
Thursday afternoon with a large at­
tendance present. Representatives 
were : Watford, J. F. Elliot and J. R. 
McCormick; Petrolia, W. A. Wilson,
D. Duncan, W. W. McRae, Andrew 
Elliott; Wilkesport, Messrs. Grant 
and Nottlay; Sarnia, C. A. McArth­
ur and G. Wenino; Brigden, Messrs. 
Edwards and Manley; Forest, Messrs. 
Bailey and Brant; Wyoming, Mr. 
Smith; Florence, Messrs. Davis and 
Childs; Thedford, Messrs. Jennings 
and Tedbal; Alvinston, Messrs. Gil­
roy and Oke; Sarnia reserve, Messrs. 
Nahmabim and George.

A committee made up of Messrs.
Gilroy, Davis, Grant McArthur and 
Jennings presented a report regard­
ing dates as follows:—

Strathroy........... iSept. 14, 15, 16.
Wilkesport...................... Sept. 17.
WATFiORD...............Sept. 17, 18.
Petrolia...................Sept. 21, 22.
Sarnia..................Sept. 23, 24, 25.
Thedford................Sept. 28, 29.
Brigden.....................Sept. 28, 29.
Sarnia Reserve.... Sept. 29, 30.
Wyoming........... Sept. 30, Oct. 1.
Florence. ........................Get. 1, 2.
Forest................................Oct. 5, 6.
Alvir.stbn. ............... Oct. 6, 7, 8.
Recommendations were made that 

Glencoe’s date be Sept. 24.
The auditors, W. A. WUson and 

■Leslie W. Oke presented a report 
showing treasury balance of $25.42. 
Mayor Drummond of Petrolia ad­
dressed the group and entended to 

I them a splendid civic welcome. He 
cordially invited the delegates to 
visit the Charlotte Eleanor Engle- 
harte hospital. President W. A. 
Brock ably responded and dwelt at 
length on the work which the provin­
cial fairs association was doing for 
the various fairs through out the pro­
vince. He referred to financial im­
provements gained by the association 
for country fairs.

Elect Officers.
The election of officers followed 

with the past year’s officials being 
all given an unanimous return to 
their respective positions. They are, 
president, Brock, Petrolia; 1st vice 
president, H. A. Gilroy, Alvinston ; 
2nd vice-president, K. A. Saunders, 
Sarnia; secretary, W. J. Weed, Al­
vinston. President Brock was re­
appointed delegate to the provincial 
fairs association convention.

Jos. Armstrong, ex-M. P„ con­
gratulated the members of the 
association on the advancement they 
had given the cause. Considerable 
discussion ensued regarding the rais­
ing of the fees to the association of 
all fairs with the exception of Strath­
roy, Sarnia and Petrolia. An added 
rate of $2 was struck. Vice-Pres. 
Gilroy spoke at length on the head 
of co-operation of various fair

■ boards in regard to exhibitors, gate
! charges, prize lists, etc. ;

The representatives from Sarnia f 
| invited the members uf the district 

association to meet in their, city next
■ year to hold the annual meeting. Les- 
1 lie W. Oke, M.L.A., made a motion 
! that the Petrolia fair board be thank- 
I ed for its hospitality during the day,
including-the invitation to the hbs-

( Experimental Farms Note.)
The winter months afford the bee­

keeping an excellent opportunity of 
increasing his knowledge of bees and 
bee management through reading. 
There are, at the present time, so 
many good books and Journals de­
voted entirely to beekeeping, the be- 

i/ter is often at a loss to know which 
oose. Mr. G. B. G'ooderham, Do- 

Apiarist. recommend": "ne of 
the following for general reading:—■ 
“The Honey Bee,” by Langstroth 
and Dadant; “Beekeeping,” by Dr. 
Phillips, xy “Productive Beekeeping,” 
'by Frank C. Pellett. In addition to 
one of these, every beekeeper should 
have a copy of the “A. B. C. & X. Y. 
Z. of Beekeeping,” which is the best 
Reference book obtainable as it deals 
with practically every phase of bee­
keeping and has, in addition, special 
articles for beginners. These books 
can be purchased from any dealer in 
bee supplies.

It is also advisable that the be- 
giner subscribe to at least one good 
journal, any one of the following can 
b e recommended.: “The Beekeeper,” 
published at Peterboro, Ont., price 
$1 per,year; “The Western Gardener 
and Beekeeper,” Winnipeg, Man., 
price $1 per year; “The American 
Bee Journal,” Hamilton, Ill., U.S.A., 
price $1.50; “Gleanings in Bee Cul­
ture,” Medina, Ohio, U.:S.A., price 
$ 1.1'5 ; ad for the French reader 
“(L’Abeille,” Casier Postal 176, 
Quebec, P. Q., price $1.

The beginner is also advised to ob­
tain the following Dominion Exper­
imental Farms bulletins and circu­
lars :—

Bulletin No. 33 “Bees and’ How to 
keep Them.”

Bulletin No. 22 “Wintering Bees 
in Canada.”

Circular No. 105 “Bee Diseases.”
Circular No. 52 “Facts About 

Honey.”
Circular No. 18 “Beekeeping in 

Canada.”
These may be had free upon ap­

plication to either the Publications 
Branch, Department of Agriculture, 
or the Bee Division, Central Experi­
mental Farm, Ottawa.

Girlhood Dangers

Can Be Avoided by Keeping the 
B.ood Rich and Pure.

The anaemia of young girls may 
be inherited, or it may be caused by 
bad air, unsuitable food, hasty and 
irregular eating, insufficient out-door 
exercise and not enough rest and 
sleep. It comes on gradually, begin­
ning with languor, indisposition to 
exertion and a feeling of fatigue. 
Later comes palpitation of the heart 
and headaches. In the majority of 
cases constipation is present, 
the complexion takes on a gveenisA- 
ycllow pallor. The treatment is elite 
easy and simple. Dr. Williams’ Pink 
Pills are just the tonic tc remedy 
this wretched state of health. They 
act directly upon the Wood, and as 
it becomes rich and pure, strength 
and activity returns, the glow of 
health -comes to the cheeks, and soon 
the trouble wilt disappear and good 
health follow. Miss Pearl Parks, R.R. 
No. 1, Rea boro, Ont., has proved the 
value of this medicine, and her 
statement will point the way to 
health to all other weak girls. She 
says :—“I was very ill with anaemia.
T could not sleep at night; my ap­
petite was poor, my face and lips 
were very pale and my eyes dull.
I got so weak that I could not go up­
stairs without resting. I took dizzy 
and fainting spells, had no ambition 
whatever, and did not care to go 
about. I was in this condition for 
nearly a year. I had treatment from 
two doctors; but did not rcgainX my 
strength, so my mother, who was 
very uneasy about me, decided I 
should try Dr. Williams’ Pink 
After using the pills for a 
felt somewhat better, and 
taking them until I had used 
dozen boxes, when I was 
and strong. I can
mend Dr. Williams’ PinkfPltM ior me 
treatment of any suffering from, 
anaemia.” :

You can get these pills from any 
medicine dealer, or by mail at 50c. 
a box from the Dr. Williams’ Medi­
cine Co., Brockvilie, Ont.

A Real Asthma Relief. Dr. J. D.
Kellogg’s Asthma Remedy has never 
been advertised by extravagant 
statements. Its claims arc conserva­
tive indeed, when judged by the ben­
efits which it performs. Expect re­
lief and permanent benefits when you 
buy this remedy and you will not 
have cause for disappointment. It 
gives permanent relief in many cases 
where other so called remedies have 
utterly failed. m

Use the “Went Ada” to buy or seQ
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NOTICE Valuable Farm For Sale ■■ . .... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . y a œ aa iisiim
IN order that the public may not be 
" misled by Connolly & Townes* 
statements in last week’» issue I wish 
to state the following:—

Last November when we were 
quarantined we found it impossible 
to secure anyone to carry on our 
milk business. Very few people in 
an# around town being able to look 
after and milk a large number of 
cows.

It was suggested to me that we 
aak Mr. Connelly to take over our 
milk business while we were in quar­
antine. He reluctantly agreed to try 
it.

On seeing Mr. Connolly’s reluct­
ance, and fearing that any compet­
itor would not endeavor to give our 
customers the high standard of ser­
vice we have constantly strived for, 
we decided it would be better to sell 
outright, rather than allow a compet­
itor to serve our customers for a 
short time and perhaps secure them 
for himself.

•I told Mr. Connolly I did not want 
to leave my customers without any 
milk and without notice which would 
not seem fair to them. He immedi­
ately made an offer to buy four cows 
leaving me with ten cows, milk cool­
er, delivery horse, etc. I was not to 
start again in 1924.

The first paper I signed presented 
at the present time gives it a very 
different meaning than that for 
which it was intended. On this occas­
ion Mr. Connolly said he was afraid 
that a humfoer of my customers 
might take their milk from Mr. Peas- 
lee or Mr. Caldwell and I should sign 
that paper to show my customers 
that I wished them to let Connolly

100 ACRES—PRICE $7,000

West half lot 28, concession 6, S.E. . 
R., Township of Warwick, Lambton ] 
County. This fine farm is nicely sit-1 
uated on the 4th line east, three 
miles from the town of Watford, one 
half mile from school house and 
Grace English church is situated on 
the farm. The soil is excellent for 
mixed farming, there is good water 
at the house, and a never failing 
spring well in the pasture fields, 
making it a very desirable stock 
farm. There is also a good bush, 
principally beech and maple trees. 
One bank barn with good under­
ground stables for cattle, one hay 
barn with horse stables, also large 
open shed, hen house, and garage, 
six-roomed house, also summer kit­
chen.

For further information, apply to 
Sam Rurchill, Watford R. R. No. 4., 
or Mrs. Suvina Dunkeld, 1861 Yonge 
St., Toronto.

Executors of estate of the late 
Jacob Cline. )16-4t

m Swift's January Money
January Sale of 

Overalls
CORSETS 

40
OVERCOATS

IS

MORTGAGE SALE
OF

VALUABLE FARM PROPERTIES

Under the powers contained in 
mortgage there will be offered for 
sale by public auction at the Roche 
House, in the Village of Watford, on 
Saturday, the 14th day of Febru­
ary, at two o’clock in the afternoon 
the following properties namely:

The West Half of Lot Twenty- 
four in the Thirteenth Concession of

& Towriss supply them (while I was I the Township of Brooke, 100 acres 
not in the business). I more or less. On this property there

Mr. Connolly has shown and used I is a good frame house, a good large 
this paper to my disadvantage, which bank bam, a good drive shed and
he should not have done.

We wish to correct their statement 
that we agreed not to start in the 
milk business again. We agreed not 
to start again in the year 1924 as 
above stated and we kept our word.

Don’t you think that if it was true 
that we had agreed not to start 
again that Connolly & Towriss would 
have had us sign papers to that effect 
before giving us the check?

Unless Connolly & Towriss lost a 
large number of our customers they 
should have taken in the $100.00 
paid us in a little over, two weeks 
from our route alone.

It is not true that we were in 
possession of a check for the total 
amount at any time. Connolly & 
Towriss still owe us about twelve 
dollars.

Many of our former customers re­
alizing the true state of affairs last 
fall have been kind enough to allow 
us to supply them with all or part 
of their milk.

We would be pleased to have you 
come and see our stables and system 
of handling milk at any time regard­
less of who supplies you. You have 
a right to know if your milk has been 
handled in the cleanest possible way.

M. E. BUCHNER

ffl

NINE PAIR—SIZE 44 
EIGHT PAIR—SIZE 42 
TEN PAIR—SIZE 40 

TWELVE PAIR—SIZE 38 
FOURTEEN PAIR—SIZE 36 

ELEVEN PAIR—SIZE 34 
Pair» in all Black, B»ue »nd

«.J.'ir.$i.6o
2 months from today these will cost 
you $2.25 and $2.50. Come while 
the stock lasts. Phone size and they 
will be laid aside for you.

PAIRS 
OF

CROMPTON’S
CORSETS

64

Last year’s models, 
good stock in the 

following sizes 
22 to 29

10 Overcoats at a 
big saving.

Snappy Models
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: Clifford Welch, a young A
■radio fan, bas aspirations to 

i broadcaster and is now i 
iis sending station.

‘Onion juice rubbed into 1 
teeps away all pests,” decl 
reekly journal. It should c 
,e valuable to anyone in se 

quiet holiday.

The Strathearn Herald gi 
__ one: “Retriever dog fo: 
take excellent watch and 

,-Jttst be one of |those dog- 
[that sailors talk about.

Exactly half price 
$2.00 CORSETS

$1.00

SIZES 36, 37, 38, 39 and 40—
3 Size* 36, 3 Size* 37, 2 Sizes 38, 

2 Sizes 40

Swift’s January 
Money Saving Sale

Look at the price Tickets, take It Off »

-+ —-
$30.00 Coats for $20.00

a
Hundreds of January Bargains. Come now the Sale will soon be over, b

B

SWIFT, SONS CO. a
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OBSERVATIONS
Picked Up at Random 

Main Street
Along

hen house. The farm is well watered 
and has about 6 acres of fall wheat 
thereon.

The North Half of Lot Twenty- 
six in the Eleventh Concession of the 
Township of Brooke, 100 acres more 
or less. On this property there is a 
brick house, and large frame barn 
on blocks. The lands are good level 
land, no waste.

TERMS OF SALE:—Ten per cent, 
down and balance without interest 
in two weeks thereafter. The pro­
perties will be put up separately and 
will each be subject to a reserved 
bid.

For further particulars apply to 
J. F. ELLIOT, Auctioneer.

COWAN, COWAN A GRAY
Vendor’s Solicitors. 

Jan. 17, 1825. 3t

Our cup of winter is full and our 
snow shovel overfloweth.

■And where do the flies go when 
it’s 10 below zero?

Did you see the Eclipse? No? 
Then you should have stayed in Wat­
ford!

Attempting to light a cigar while 
returning from town in his cutter, 
Robert Richards, 52, prominent far­
mer of Perth, accidently set fire to 
a can of oil and was enveloped in 
flames. He is in hospital here in a 
critical condition.

The plain spoken man calls a spade 
a spade. We hesitate, however, to re­
peat what he will soon be calling a 
lawn- mower during spring opera­
tions.

Is your subscription paid in ad­
vance for 1925?

KS6StXXXX306a63tX36363tXXSeS636î6XXXX3(X36363tXSX363(36S63tyS3(XXX3t3636StXSX30l,

EXECUTOR’S NOTICE
In the matter of the Estate of 

Mary E. Wiley, late of the Village 
of Warwick, in the County of 
Lairibton, Widow, deceased.

NOTICE is hereby given, pursuant 
to

rANT COLUMN.
One per word each insertion, 

id of Thanks 60c,

tes, in case, on 
en my home

LOST—Pair 
Sunday evening, b 
end Methodist Church'; Will finder 
please leave at Guide Office or not­
ify Sid Smith, Warwick St.

WANTED

WANTED—'Plain sewing to be 
done at home. Apply Mrs. S. Fulcher 
John St. j30-2t

WANTED—One large or two small 
rooms for office in business section. 
Apply Box 1, Guide-Advocate.

FOR SALE

And now the clever scientists in­
form us that we shall see a similar 
total eclipse in Western Ontario
in 2144 A. D., on October 26th at ' 
34 minutes and 16 seconds after 12 i 
noon. An easy way of remembering 
this would be to tie a string on your 
finger until that date.

FOR SALE—Cutter in good con­
dition. Apply T. McCausland, Town.

the Revised Statutes of Ontario 
(1914), Chapter 121, Section 66, 
and amending Acts, that all persons 
having claims against the estate Of 
the said Mary E. Wiley, late of the 
Village of Warwick, in the County 
of Lambton, deceased, who died on 
or about the 30th day of October, 
A. D. 1924, are required to send by 
post, prepaid, or to deliver on or be­
fore the 16th day of February, A. D. 
1926, to the undersigned Solicitors 
for John McCubbin, Executor of the 
Will of the said deceased, their 
names, addresses, and descriptions, 
and a full statement of particulars 
of their claims and the nature of the 
securities, if any, held by them.

And notice is hereby given that on 
and after the said 16th day of Feb­
ruary, A. D. 1925, the said Executor 
will proceed to distribute the assets 
of the Estate among the parties en­
titled thereto, having regard only to 
the claims of which he shall then 
have had notice.

A. W. BIXEL,
Solicitor for Executor. 

Dated this 21st day Jan. A.D. 1925.
j23-3t

Watford merchants might well \ 
have advertised last week, “Shop in 
Watford Saturday morning and see 
the Eclipse.” Although the advance 
press agents—the astronomers— j
gave London the prefference and in­
tended us to be encluded, we found 
ourselves in great grand stand seats, 
viewing the coming and going, 
darkness, shadows, totality and all, 
with a perfectly cloudless sky; while 
London, Long Corners and all east­
ern centers were excluded by the 
weatherman’s clouds.

BARGAINS
MANY Have Benefited By Our 5-10-15-25c Counter 

DON’T YOU MISS IT

MITTS
GEN. HORSEHIDE MITTS

STOVES
$2.40

$2.00

■Don’t lose the smoked glasses you 
used during the eclipse—keep ’em 
handy. If the new styles are what 
they say they are, we’ll eed them to 
get to church on Easter morning.

Regular 
Per pair.
Regular 
per pair........
Regular $1.85
Per pair...............
Regular $1.60
Per pair...............
Regular $1.40
Per pair.............-.
MULESKIN 
Regular 75c, for
Per pair...............
Regular 65c, for 
Per pair...............

$2.00
$1.65
$1.50
$1.20
$1.10

Double Heater
Reg. $50. for.. 
Heater (wood) 
Reg. $15. for.. 
Heater, (wood

$44.00 
$12.50 

$9”only)
Reg. $12.00, for....

(Second hand) nearly

$14.00
Heater
new. Reg. $28., 
for

60c
50c

Box Stove, Regular d* Q AG 
$10.50, for. . . . M>O.VU

AXES $1.50 to $2.40
X-CUT SAWS $6.00 to $8.50

SAFETY FIRST—USE OUR SOOT DESTROYER to Clean Pipe. 
ASK ABOUT-^OUR EASY PAYMENT PLAN ON RADIOS

FOR SALE—Tops and dead tim­
ber, East % lot 16, Con. 12, Brooke. 
'—David McDonald.

FOR SALE

The Eclipse has come and gone— 
now for the next big show, the End 
of the World, which Adventist pro­
phets advise us is to be staged on 
February 6th—Next Friday.

Which reminds us—Look at your 
Label. Is your Subscription paid in 
advance for 1925? Or do you want 
us to be dunning you all over 
Heaven or H—(as the case may be) 
for your month’s subscription still 
unpaid.

P. Dodds & Son
“W A T F O RD’S BUSY STORE” 

XXXX3t%XS3tX3eX3SS636X%36XSeXX3t56StS6365656SCS6X)63t36365t3tSt5eXSeS6XX%X365t3t50616.

TOWNSHIP OF WARWICK 
By-law No. 2 For 1925

Anyway, the place where the most 
of us will go when old Terra Firme 
exits, always has the same brand of 
climate, day in and day out, and the 
sign “fair and warmer” never needs 
to be changed.

A By-law to Raise ($10,000) Ten Thousand Dollars to Aid in the 
Construction of Tile, Stone or Timber Drains.

TOR SALE— Three FreshmilkCows and calves.—E. O. Herbert,
Lot 5, Con. L; Warwick.

FOR SALE—Frame Building 14 X 
22, suitable for kitchen or garage. 
Apply to F. Parker, Sutorville, phone 
68—4. 23-3t

FOR SALR—Quantity of Hay and 
Straw for Sale, to be fed on the 
place. Apply to Roscoe Kearney, 
phone 48-14 Watford.

FOR SAiLE—House and half acre 
of land on Victoria street. Apply at 
once on the premises to Jas. For­
rest, Watford. jl6-4t

* p,r“4ucts of the
Metallic Roofing Co. Limited, Toron­
to, tried and proven for over forty 
years, also “Eastlake" Shingles__j
W. Hawes. j30-4t

FOR SALE—Phone 86 for Milk or 
Cream at anytime of the day. Any­
one desiring delivery of Milk in the 
evening, kindly advise us and we 
shall commence evening delivery 
February 1st.—Connolly & Towriss.

The Speedster.
A well-known M. P. went to a pol­

itical meeting where he was to give 
an address. The train was very slow, 
so slow in fact, that he complained 
to the conductor. But the conductor 
didn’t care for anybody on earth.

“If you don’t like the train, mister, 
you can get out and walk,” he grunt­
ed.

“1 would,” replied the M. P., but 
they, don't expect me till this train 
arrives.”

The end of the world, some say, is 
due,\

And that’s that—
Meaning, of course, for me and you 

you
Here’s your hat!

THE council of the Municipality of the Township of Warwick, pursuant 
to the provisions of The Tile Drainage Act enacts as follows :—

For all that, we are still soliciting 
advertising for next week’s issue at 
any rate, and willing to bet that, 
barring personal accident or a quick 
demise, we’ll still he receiving subs­
criptions at the same old stand on 
February 7th.

A French doctor states that the 
transfusion of sheep's blood to men 
is quite practicable. Bah!

Joe—Bill, what’s a cosmopolitan? 
Bill—Well, suppose you was a Rus­
sian Jew living in England, and mar 
ried to a Chinese woman, and

1st—That the Reeve may from time to time, subject to the provisions of 
this By-law, borrow on the credit of the corporation of the said municipal­
ity such sum not exceeding in the whole $2000.00, as may be determined 
by the council, and may in manner hereinafter provided, issue debentures 
of the said corporation in sums of $100.00 each for the amount so borrow­
ed, with coupons attached as provided in section 5 of the said Act.

:2nd—That when the council shall be of the opinion that the application of 
any person to borrow money for the purpose of constructing a tile, 
stone or timber drain, should be granted in whole or in part, the council 
may,by resolution direct the Reeve to issue debentures as aforesaid, and 
to borrow a sum not exceeding the amount applied for and may lend the 
same to the applicant on the completion of the drainage work.

A special ratç shall be imposed levied and collected over and above 
all other rates upon the land in respect of which the said money shall be 
borrowed sufficient for the payment of the principal and interest as provid­
ed by the Act.

Passed the 12th day of January, 1925.
B. F. MUMA, Reeve. N, HERBERT, CLERK

NOTICE
MUNICIPALITY OF THE TOWNSHIP OF WARWICK

TAKE notice that the above is a true copy of a by-law passed by thé 
Municipal Council of the township of Warwick on the 12th dav of 

January 1925, and all persons are required to take notice that anv one 
who desires to apply to have such By-law or any part thereof quashed muet 
serve notice of his application upon the head or Clerk of this Municipality

„„ „ ____ _______ you I witllm twenty days after the date of the last publication of this notice and
had just finished an Irish stew and ! must make his application to the High Court of Justice within one month

of said date.you was smoking a Turkish cigarette
and a nigger band outside was play- 1 o t,he 16.th,day of January 1925 and the

Hell» Of Seotliod.” then <ast publication will be — *’■- -----ing “Blue Bells of Scotland,’ 
you’d be a cosmopolitan.

on the 30th day of January 1925.

N. HERBERT, Clerk.
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I advice of a medical man to t 
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Canada desires and no New 
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Clifford Welch, a young Alvinston 
«radio Ian, has aspirations to become 
a broadcaster and is now erecting 
his sending station.

“Onion juice rubbed into the skin 
keeps away all posts,” declares a 
weekly journal. It should certainly 
be valuable to anyone in search of 

l quiet holiday.

The Strathearn Herald gives us 
one: “Retriever dog for sale; 

make excellent watch and chain.” 
Must be one of | those dog-watches 
that sailors talk about.

“Jolt your liver into action by tak­
ing horse-riding exercise," is the 
advice of a medical man to the mid­
dle-aged. Many people who cannot 
afford horses have to do their jolting j 
in Fords.

Figures furnished by S. L. Squire, 
Deputy Minister of Public Highways, | 
show that last year the provincial 
-roads in this province were used 91 j 
per cent, by automobile owners and ! 
only 9 per cent, by horse-drawn j 
vehicles. The figures go to show the j 
trend of modern civilization, with, j 
■unfortunately, the passing into al-1 
most complete oblivion of the method 
of travel used by the pioneers who 
name to this and other counties and 
blazed the trail for their successors 
•of to-day, who enjoy conveniences 
never thought of forty or fifty years 
ago.

AH Houses of Refuge will be eas­
ier to finance in the future because 
it has been made compulsory for the 
family of parents sent to the House 
of Refuge to contribute to their sup­
port, if the family are in circumstan 
ces to assist the parents. This is a 
good law and will save the county 
about a thousand dollars a year. In 
■the days of Joseph it wasn’t found 
necessary to have a law to compel 
sons to support their parents. It 
wouldn’t be necessary in so many in­
stances in this country if parents 
only knew enough to keep their prop­
erty in their own right and title un­
til they could claim a title clear to 
mangions in the skies.

Renfrew Mercury; In a bright 
little house organ issued weekly by 
the Semi-Ready Company of Mont­
real, the editor in a recent issue 
makes the statement that “a good 
energy-compelling editor of a news­
paper in any town in Canada can 
double both population and circula­
tion within three years.” Our city 
friends are always full of suggestions 
as to how this or that should be done 
in the small town, but here is a real 
live idea that every town editor in 
Canada desires and no New Year’s 
gift could possibly bring more joy to 
editorial sanctums than a plan where 
by the circulation of the paper can 
be doubled.

The T.cbo Mutual Fire Insurance 
t Co. held their annual meeting on 
• Friday with a fair attendance. The 
[■financial statement wag presented by 
I Jacob Marsh, the able secretary- 
j treasurer. Losses by fire, etc., amoun- 
i ted to $6,243.66; salaries and other 
[expenses, $1,328.03; total expend- 
1 iture, $7,570.69; receipts, $10,064.- 
|31. Balance cash on hand, $2,493.- 
[■62. Assets—Bonds, debentures and 
[ premium notes and cash on hand, 
I?249;537.86; policies in force, Dec. 
j 31, 1923, 776; policiies in force, Dec. 
[ 31, 1924, 831. The retiring directors, 
Messrs. Turnball, Ferguson and Hod­
gson, were re-elected. F. G. Hughes 

[ and S. P. Brown were re-elected aud- 
| alors. The company had one heavy 
[loss, the destruction of the large 
| barns owned by W. A. Mclnroy, with 
[insurance amounting to $4,600. The 
standing of the company is now the 
beat, w,ith a large surplus to meet los-

nTjj . JJ | ■ d
FAVORITE PURSUIT OF AMER- 

ICAN CROOKS.

4'The best little money-maker in 
Canada today is the sheep industry,” 
aid Dr. J. H. Grisdale, of Ottawa, 

deputy minister of the department of 
agriculture, in the course of an ad­
dress last week on the agricultural 

utlook for 19125. Indications are 
I that the price of wool will be higher 
lathis year than for a very long time, 

Dr_ -Grisdale state-d. The wool sup­
ply of the whole world is down. The 
supply of mutton is low. The United 
States can take all that Canada can 

\ -provide them with. Yet the total 
value of the sheep flocks in Canada 
is only about two and three-quarter 
millions—not one-quarter of what it 
easily might be. “I have never yet 
seen a flock of any size that has not 
been a money-maker,” said the 
speaker, “and my experience has 
be^n wide. The sheep industry is, 
in my opinion, the surest and most 
«tapie industry in the world today. 
From the point of view of agricul­
ture,M was Dr. Gmdale’s summary, 
“the «prospects for 1925 are brighter 
l>y far than they have been for ten 
years.”

Locating Victim, Affable Stranger
Suggests Game of Bridge, Which
Changes to Poker, When Gang
Gets Busy.

The victim rarely knows how It 
was done. He doesn’t know if the 
card sharks dealt him a cold deck 
and whether they had sand-papered 
fingers sensitive to the tiny prick­
ings at the corners of the marked 
cards. All he knows is that three 
smooth-spoken strangers swindled 
him and he hesitates to follow and 
prosecute them for fear the matter 
will get into the papers back home.

Card sharping has long been a 
favorite pursuit on trains in the 
United States. The game is worked 
in a hundred different ways, but in 
nearly every case three card sharps 
operate together. They board the 
train separately at different stations, 
sometimes many miles apart. Then 
two of the trio start out in different 
directions looking for prey. The 
weather, the game of golf, any pre­
text suffices to start conversation 
with a stranger. Card sharps are 
generally men of breezy types. On 
à Florida-bound train recently a New 
Yorker was fleeced out of $5,500 in 
cash and travellers’ cheques. All told 
he had lost $8,500. but managed to 
stop payment of a cheque for $3,000. 
The authorities state that men have 
been thus cheated out of as much as 
$25,000.

One of tfle slickest of all card 
sharps, now retired with à fortune 
of $500,000, grown from the money 
accumulated on trains and in fash­
ionable hotel, lets fall some words 
of wisdom for the ostensible benefit 
of men of the stamp he has robbed. 
“If ever you doubted the ability of a 
card shark to stack the deck without 
your knowing it in an ordinary 
game,” says he, “dispose of that 
opinion right now.

“The suckers in the game aren’t 
looking for cold decks or marked 
cards and that is just where they 
lose. They’re a gullible lot, particu­
larly if they have been drinking a lot 
and are handled properly. Besides, 
the average sucker is more or less 
used to large stakes and never has 
been up against swindlers before. 
Once up against the strong-arm 
squad on trains^^jie fights shy of 
strangers.” Z”*-

Bridge being the fashionable game, 
the affable gambler suggests it to his 
victim and if the latter demurs on 
account of there being no one to 
make up a four, the gambler remarks 
that he will “try and locate some­
one.” Usually the game does not 
start at once. The come-on man 
may delay an hour or more ere he 
turns up with a couple of chaps who 
are “willing to play a rubber or two.” 
By this time the sucker cannot back 
out with grace even if his suspicions 
have been aroused. He would feel 
like a quitter.

“So,” says the retired gambler, 
“the group assembles in the compart­
ment of one of the number, or more 
likely in the centre of the car, where 
the porter has been induced to instal 
a table. Everyone introduces him­
self. Everything looks on the level. 
The intended victim swallows the 
situation, hook, line and sinker. The 
cards produced, one of the crooks 
wants to know if it is to be stud or 
straight poker. Thereat the first 
come-on man protests that he had 
intended bridge. But it is a hundred 
to one that a man who will play 
bridge with strangers will play poker 
With them, and poker it turns out to 
be. Matches, representing ten cents 
each, dealt out as chips, do not alarm 
the prospective victim.

The playing starts. There is a 
little winning bapk and forth until 
one of the come-ons having a run 
of bad luck, jokingly asserts that he 
is going to win at least one pot or 
go broke. The victim still wins—the 
crooks see to it by downing their 
good hands. Then, when the time 
seems ripe, into the game goes the 
cold deck. The victim gets an ace 
in the hole and it pleases him. On 
the second round the victim gets 
an aceup. That makes two aces. One 
of the others gets a king showing. 
The two others drop out. With his 
good showing the victim starts bet­
ting—bets quite a pile. But the man 
with the king showing raises the bet. 
The dealer passes round the cards 
again and each player receives an 
indifferent card. The sharper bets 
more money. The sucker comes back 
at him. There ma,y be $100 in the 
pot by this time.

On the last hand the swindler gets 
an ace and the sucker a queen. But 
the sucker feels confident. Then the 
sharper makes another big bet and 
the sucker, nothing daunted, calls his 
opponent. There may be as much 
as $500 up by»now. When the money 
is in the pot, the swindler turns over 
his hole card, revealing an ace. He 
has a pair of aces with a king next 
in line. The sucker has a pair of 
aces with the queen next and he 
loses. Perhaps he goes on, perhaps 
he quits but if the card sharpers 
«cent trouble they are off the train 
at the next statin»

some oT the iui.ru»u companies 
have been so bothered with sharpers 
on their trains that they have as­
signed detectives to round up the 
gangs. One company running into 
New York put a group of such swind­
lers into jail after detectives had 
worked their way into the ring and 
actually participated in some of the 
ga >es.

America*» Leading Incubator» wnl 

Brooder» ara now being «old in your

Father Didn’t Need One.
Johnny! What do you mean by 

coming to school with ycur hair in 
that disgraceful condition9”

“No comb, mum!”
“Cân’t you use your f ather’s?”
“No hair, mum’”

wnat a Horse can Full.
Tests made recently proved that a 

pair of horses, each weighing 1,600 
pounds, could haul a load 550 pounds 
greater than themselves.

On a metal track, one of these ani­
mals, it has been shown, can draw 
one and two-thirds times as much as 
on a good asphalt surface, five times 
as much as on cobblestone paving, 
and twenty times the load it can pull 
on an ordinary mud roan.

For the usual type of farm horse, 
a cart carrying a weight of 1,600 
pounds is considered to be a fair task. 
While pulling light vehicles and un­
der saddle, records indicate that 

j horses are equal to great feats of 
strength and endurance.

A twenty-year-old beast hitched to 
a light cart is known to have travel­
led a hundred miles in less than thir­
teen and a half hours and was in 
excellent condition àt the end of its 
journey.

Proud of Him.
Wealthy One—“I am a self-made 

man.”
Friend—“And I suppose your wife 

and daughters are proud of you?”
“Yes; just about as proud as they 

would be of a home-made dress.”

Tolling.
Waiter (after guest has rung for 

ten minutes) : “Did you ring, sir?”
Guest: “No, I was tolling; I 

thought, you were dead!”

The Septic Tank.
It consists of a large concrete tank 

divided into two compartments by a 
1 vertical partition. The size for a 

single house is about 4 x 8 ft. and 
3 Va ft. deep. This tank holds the 
sewage long enough for a certain kind 
of bacteria to destroy the solid mat­
ter. When the liquid accumulates to 
a certain amount a non-mechanical 
affair called a siphon empties one of 
the chambers into a system of field 
tile, called the absorption bed, laid 
shallow under the ground. Any re­
maining sewage is destroyed in the 
soil by another kind of bacteria that 
live near the top of the ground. In 
this way these friendly bacteria are 
enabled to do a very valuable work 
for us. This is science applied to a 
useful purpose.

We supply bulletin and blue-print 
to any one wishing to build a septic 
tank. All necessary information is 
given in these, and by their helpful 
suggestions any handy man can build 
it. Cost for cement, siphon fittings 
and tile amounts to about $52. The 
tank may be located close to the 
house and the tile laid under the 
lawn or garden.—R. R. Graham, 
O. A. 0., Guelph.

THE IDEAL 
Incubators and Brooders

It does not pay to turn cows into 
yards and compel them to remain out 
in disagreeable weather. It costa 
feed to keep cows warm.

tier jrunisnmenr.
It was in the jeweller's, and timid­

ly she held out her hand, on which 
sparkled a ring.

“A young man g-g&ve it to m-ine,” 
she stammered. “Is it a real dia­
mond?”

“Yes, it’s real all right,” replied 
the jeweller, staring hard at the gem, 
“but may I ask who gave it to you?”

“Why, Jimmie H—really, sir, I 
don’t see what business it is of 
yours,” shts cried indignantly.

“We’ll come to that in a minute, 
young lady,” said the jeweller. “You 
say his name is Jimmie Harris?'’

“Y-yes; but how did you know?” 
she asked wonderingly.

“It’s a beautiful ring,” repeated 
the jeweller, fingering it fondly; “but 
I’m going to keep it because Mr. 
Harris still owes me the last seven 
instalments on it.”

Blushing shamefacedly, she slunk 
away.

have been the leading machine» in 
the United State» for 38 year». Thi» 
year they are being «old in Canada 
at a price much below other makes of 
similar quality and theee machine* are built to !a»t a lifetime, and hav* 
a positive guarantee with every machine.

There is only one way to make money 
out of poultry today, and that is by 
artificial incubation and brooding. 
Get your cockerel» on the market 
when they are worth 75c a lb., and 
your pullets laying in the fall when 
eggs are 50c to 60c a dozen. Call 
and see these machines and be con-

BABY CHICKS—BARRED ROCKS 
White Wyandotte» & White Leghorns

W. R. STAPLEFORD
WATFORD Phone 25W

CUSTOM HATCHING—We will incubate your own eggs at a charge of 
5c per egg, taken in unite of 75. On eggs 'being shipped in we will box 
chicks and return. If eggs are fertile and fresh. Satisfaction guaranteed.

Use for Cold Potato.
It there is no paste on hand for 

the label you want to put on the 
trunk or bag rub a cold potato over 
the back of the paper label and It 
will stick as firmly as if glued.

Whimsical.
A college wag opines that the Bibli­

cal story of the creation must have 
been written by a baseball reporter, 
because It starts off with, "In the big 
Inning—”—Boston Transcript.

There is always someone, some­
where, who is anxious to buy What 
you have to sell. Someone has 
just the article you want to buy. To 
complete a deal each must know of 
the other’s wants, and there is no 
better or more certain way to make 
these wants known than through a 
little “Want Advt." in The Guide- 
Advocate.

The following apt comment on 
the careless motorist and his ulti­
mate fate comes from the Boston 
Transcript:
“If a freight train at a crossing

“Hits an auto fair and square 
“There’s the freight train—Where’s 

the auto?
“Echo answers ’Where?’ ”

Trees at the rate of 20,000 a day 
have been planted by farmers in 
Western Canada during the last 20 
years, according to a report of the 
Federal Department of Agriculture. 
A total of 150,000 000 young trees, 
the report shows, has been distrib­
uted to farmers in that section in 
1905.

Canada has entered into negotia­
tions with Germany for a trade 
agreement which will give her the 
benefit of the most favored nations 
agreement. Exports to that coun­
try very nearly doubled during 1924 
and at the close of the year Ger­
many was practically in the posi­
tion of being Canada’s third best 
customer.

A co-operative shipment of poul­
try to New York City, encouraged 
and handled by the Dominion Poul­
try Service, Alberta branch, 
brought good results. The ship­
ment consisted of two refrigerator 
carloads of turkeys and the ship­
pers received 25 cents a pound for 
their birds, the New York selling 
price being 41 cents a pound.

Among the interesting books of 
the season is “Canada’s Great High­
way; from the First Stake to the 
Last Spike,” by J. H. E. Sccretan, 
C.E., (published by Thorburn and 
Abbott, Ottawa). Dealing with the 
early history of the Canadian Pa­
cific Railway, the volume contains 
râcy reminiscences of life in con­
struction days as experienced by 
•the author, who was a member' of 
the company’s engineering staff.

COMMON THINGS

Our God created common things 
We’re using every day 

The grateful birds expressive sings, 
All young things skip, and play, i

Let’s not despise the common things 
The honest, common soul,

The “cake” was borne on angel wings 
And baked on common coal.

Let’s not despise a common thing 
The homely shepherd’s rod.

It challenged Egypt’s mighty king.
It proved the arm of God.

Then why look down on common 
things,

The home made bread we eat 
The eatables that farming brings 

Drink purling at our feet.

We can’t eliminate the clay,
Of it we must exist,

The common night, the commen day, 
On these we all subsist.

A Miracle’s a common thing 
If happening every minute,

But when our God suspends a thing 
We know that He is in it.

The miracle of night, and day, 
Eclipses and their cause, 1 

Can never reason God away,
As He reveals His laws.

Jan. 27, 1925 W. B. Law», Watford.

SUBSCRIPTION AGENT FOR 
PUBLICATIONS

The Guide-Advocate is authorized 
agent to receive subscriptions for all 
daily and weekly papers, magazines, 
etc. We keep a complete record of 
ail subscriptions received, date when 
forwarded and how sent—whether 
by money order, express order, or 
through the bank. This is for your 
protection as well as for our own. 
We can trace your payment up at 
any time when necessary. We save 
you the trouble of writing a letter, 
the cost of postage, money order, war 
stamps, etc. In other words we charge 
only the regular subscription price of 
any newspaper, magazine or period­
ical you care to take.

Sailing from New York on Jan­
uary 14, the “Empress of France," 
palatial Canadian Pacific steam­
ship,'' began her ’round-the-world 
cruise, which is to last 130 days. The 
vessel was gaily decked with flags 
and filled with happy passengers 
eager to enjoy the experience of a 
lifetime. F. L. Wanklyn and Mrs. 
Wanklyn, were among those on 
board. Mr. Wanklyn recently re- 
ired from his position as executive 
assistant of the Canadian Pacific 
Railway.

The most novel Christmas card 
handled by the Montreal post office 
this year was one prepared for the 
redoubtable Colonel George Ham, 
of the Canadian Pacific Railway, 
by a number of internationally 
known newspaper artists, creators 
of famous comic strip characters. 
In the centre of the card is a photo 
of the Colonel, while grouped around 
him, commenting on his good qual­
ities, are signed drawings of Pa 
Perkins, Tillie the Toiler and Mac, 
Barney Google and Fpark Ping, 
Our Gang and Dumb Dora. Colonel 
Ham is naturally very proud of fije 
card.

SebMce—Jl
"Ikeep six honest, serving men;

(They taught me All I Know):
Their nameo are WHAT and WHY 

and WHEN,
and HOW and WHERE and WHO”

WHAT was the Declaration of London? 
WHY does the date for Easter vary? 
WHEN was the great pyramid of 

Cheops built ?
I HOW can you distinguish a malarial 

mosquito ?
WHERE is Canberra ? Zeebrugge ? 
WHO was tho Millbcy of the Slashes ?

Arc these “sty men” serving you too? 
Qlvc them an opportunity by placing

Webster’s 
New International 
Dictionary
in your home, 
school, office, 
club, library.
This“Supremo
Authority” in aty 
knowledge offer» service, 
immediate, constant, lasting, trust­
worthy. Answers ell kinds of ques­
tions. A century of developing, 
enlarging, and perfecting under ex­
acting care and highest scholarship 
insures accuracy, completeness, 
compactness, authority.
“—i for a w
___ u '

those naminir this publication wo wÙÏ send/too 
t of Pocket Maps.

G.&C. MEP.RIAM CO. 
Springfield, Mans., U.S. A. Eat. 3833

1 "XtiMiri • 11 .mXArsnunnm f .TirmrgtTur-i- • umi'ium way
1 Sold in Watford by the Guide-

Advocate.

0666195023
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The Fresh Flavor CORN TROPHY IS WON BY 
SHELLAR PORT LAMBTONFRESH BREAD ponge and Alexander St»., 1

feted for high grade instruct! 
iperior employment service, 
ny time. Catalogue free.

W. J. ELLIOTT. Pr

Attendance and Exhibits La mb to»
Show at Forest Are Goodof delicious

Forest, Jan. 23.—Harry Shellar 
of Port Lunbton featured toe first 
day of La.o bton county’s winter fair, 
under the auspices of the Corn, Seed 
and Grain Growers’ Association, here 
yesterday by winning both big corn 
trophies, and also winning heavily in 
county and township competition.

a*cs H

Toronto, f3.—-:t w port­
ed here that Leslie W. Ok., T.L.A. 
fofr East Lambton, has di a o-eiated 
himself from the Progressive- and 
will not acknowledge the leadership 
of W. E. Raney, K.C., who was 
chosen house leader of the group 
Tuesday in succession to Manning 
Doherty. Hereafter according to the 
report. Mr. Oke will sit on the cross 
benches as a e’ear United Fa 
Ontario repr tentative, and 
likel'y will 'he ; ined by Ben"ah 
man, M. L. . before the nex 
sion of the \e~' ' ore is over.

Mr. Oke w ~of present at 
meeting wh ch elect'd M\ 1 
house leader a”d r ie known tY 
was oppose dfo he formation c 
Progress! v p.r: while not 
long ago Mr. T -wnian repud:at* 
leadership of Mr. Raney.

Issues S alcmen'
Mr. Oke is ued a -ta e-r.e: 

which he not only announced 
he had opposed the dec : n 
non-farmer to the -leadership, 
gave his reasons for so -doin r. 
a U. F. O. cand date ;n n :•( 
uency at the last election a 
one who has alwav ■ st^od i-m 
the principles of the U. F. 0, 
stated, “it is my understanding 
I was elected to the legislature to 
uphold the rights of the farmer in 
legislative affairs in accordance with 
the principles of the U. F. 0. organi­
zation.

“This being my conception of the 
circumstances under which I was 
elected, I cannot faithfully recognize 
any other allegiance to a group in the 
legislature, which, as at present con­
stituted, is in no sense charged with 
the advancement of U. F. O. prin­
ciples and ideals.

“This (being the case, I emphat­
ically deny that Mr. Raney is the 
leader of a group which is in any 
way entitled to be called U. F. 0.”

H667

GREEN TEA
Is preserved in the air-tight SAL AD A 
packet. Finer than any 
Gunpowder. Insist upon ALADA.

The events and winners of the 
trophy sweepstake and county class­
es are:

Trophies
The Bank of Toronto Trophy for 

best bushel of Dent corn, Harry MEDICALPlenty of eggs, winter and summer: don’t let 
your hens loaf or just be boarders. We GUAR­
ANTEE vour hens will lay more eggs, or 
your MONEY BACK from your dealer. We 
- ill send vou a cony of PRATT’S POULTRY 
BOOK FREE. Write for it TO-DAY.
PRATT POOD CO. OF CANADA. IT».. TORONTO

JAMES NEWELL, PH.B
LR-C.P .S- S. M.B.M.A., E 
Coroner County of Lambton, 
ford Ont. Office—Comer Mt 
Front Sts. Residence—Front 
block east of Main at.

HOW would you like to put your 
Teeth into a slice of such 

Delicious-looking Bread as that pic­
tured above ?
Sure you would !
THAT’S _

his third win, -Mr. Shellar gets the 
trophy permanently; second, James 
Hand of Alvinston; third, T. H. Lov­
ell, of Alvinston; fourth, J. Walden, 
of Thedford.

The points for the LeSueur trophy 
for 'best bushel of Dent 
the winning field, were awarded 
follows

C. W. SAWERS, M.D., Ph 
Watford. Ontario. Office—M 
Residence—Ontario st, east, 
hours—8.30 to 9.30 a.m., 2 t< 
7 to 8 p.m Sundays by appoi

LOVELL’S BREAD corn from 
as

Harry Shellar, 40 points 
from a total of 50; Bert Payne, Port 
Lambton, 34; James Hand. 32; Glen 
Payne, -Port Lambton, 30: J. A. 
French, Thedford, 25. Mr. Shellar’s 
win combined with hiis points from 
the field crop makes him the winner 
of LeSueur trophy this year by one 
half a point. James Hand was sec­
ond, Bert Payne, third, and Glen. 
Pavne, fourth on total points.

The Lambton Loan and Invest 
ment trophy for the best bushel of 
fall wheat and best field combined, 
was won by S. G. Richardson of Cam- 
lachie, with W. J. French of Thed­
ford, second.

Sweepstakes
Single ear Dent corn, Harry 

Shellar, Port Lamibton ; single^ ear 
Flint corn, Isaac (Linton, Alvinston ; 
ten ears of Dent corn, Harry Shel­
lar; ten ears Flint corn, George Faw­
cett; best bushel wheat, W.J. French; 
best bushel oats, L. H. Milton, Al­
vinston.

County Classes
Ten ears yellow Dent corn, James 

Hand, Alvinston ; Lester Innés, Port 
Lambton ; Bert Payne; J. A. French ; 
Fred Callum, Corunna.

Ten ears white Dent, Harry Shel­
lar, Clarence ’Murphy, Port Lamb­
ton; Glen Payne, Russell Lovell, Al- 
vipston ; Thomas Lovell, Alvinston ; 
James Tate, Alvinston.

Ten ears White Cap Yellow Dent, 
Harry Shellar; Jamev A bra. Corun­
na; Bert Payne, Wright Brothers, 
Petrolia; Irvin Wood, Croton: A. D. 
Donald, Bosanquet; J. A. French, 
George Fawcett, Bosanquet.

Ten ears Long Yellow Flint, Geo. 
Fawcett, Bert Payne, Wright Broth­
ers.

'Single ear Yellow Dent Lester In- 
nis; James Hand; J. A. French; J. H. 
Powell, Inwood.

Single ear Yellow Dent,
Shellar, Clarence >]^rph 
Lambton, Glen Payne.jF

Single ear, Whiter'Cap 
Dent, Harry Shellar, Jam*

INSIDEYOURHAVE

Painting and 
Papering

Fresh from our ovens daily
—wholesome and well baked 
—fit to grace the table of a King 
—Give it a trial.

onstit-

DR. G. N. URIE, I
LOVELL’S

-Kingdom. Member College Physic 
urgeons of Ontario.

Successor to Dr. W. G. Si 
Hours : 8.30 to 9.30 a.m.; 2 tc 
7 to 8 p.m. Sunday by appoi 
Office, Residence Main St., X 
Phone 32.

Bakery—Confectionery
WEDDING CAKES

to please the most exacting
DONE NOW! Don’t Wait until the Spring work begins
MY MANY YEARS’ EXPERIENCE BEHIND THE WORK

PAINTER 33. 3&0UC DECORATOR
St. Clair Street Watford, Ontario positively set forth that the forma- 

not opposed, DENTALtion of a new party wai 
as politics was necessary to advance 
the farmer?’ cause.”

Neither Mr. Drury, Mr. Raney nor 
Mr. Doherty had heard any tiling re­
garding the possibility of Hon. Ben- 
iah Bowman, M.L.A., lining up with 
Mr. Oke on the cross benches as an 
independent U.F.O. member.

GEORGE HICKS, D.D.S., 
University, L.D.S., Royal Col 
Dental Surgeons, Post grad 
Bridge and Crown work.Orth 
and Porcelain work. The bes 
ods employed to preserve the 
teeth. Office-Opposite Siddall 
Store, Main st.

Internal and External Pains
are promptly relieved by

THOMAS’ ECLECTRIC Ol
THAT IT HAS BEEN SOLD FOR NEARLY FIFTY YEARS 

AND IS TO-DAY A GREATER SELLER THAN EVER 
BEFORE 18 A TESTIMONIAL THAT SPEAKS FOR IT8 A

NUMEROUS CURATIVE QUALITIES.
G. N. HOWDEN, D.D.S., 

Graduate of the Royal Col 
Dental Surgeons of Ontario, i 
University of Toronto. On 
Latest and Most Approved 
ances and Methods used, 
attention to Crown and Bridg 
Office—Over Dr. Sawers’, W 
Watford. Ont.

ADELAIDE TWP. COUNCILDRURY IS AMUSED AT OKE 
STATEMENT

Declares East Lambton Member Is 
Laboring Under Slight Delusion.

Council as to the business of the 
year, touching mostly on the ap­
pointment of a road overseer and 
the appropriations to be set aside for 
each division. A by-law was passed 
appointing municipal officers. It. was 
moved by Coun. Parker and second- i 
ed by Coun. MeLeish, that all old 
officials be reappointed at the same 
salaries. On the third reading of 
the by-law, the treasurer objected 
and asked for his salary to be $200, 
instead of $180. A discussion arose, 
and the treasurer asked to be reliev- 

It was then moved 
Downer and seconded by

Toronto, Jan. 23—-Hon. E. 
Drury expressed amusement 
the statement issued by Leslie 
Oke, M.L.A., for East Lambton 
daring the latter’s determination to 

himself from the Pro-

over VETERINARY SURGE<

______  . Vel
Honor Graduate 

College. Denti 
All diseases of <J 

on scientif
_____ _____ Two doors s
the Guide-Advocate office. R<

J. McGILLICUDDY, 
Surgeon.
Veterinary 
■peciatly. 
animals treated 
ciples. Office—

______
—Main street, one door nortl 
Siddall’s office.

disassociate 
gressives at the coming session of 
the legislature and take his place on 
the cross benches as an independent 
U. F. O. member.

“If Mr. Oke is going to represent 
the U. F. O. in the 1925 legislature, 
then he will be representing an or­
ganization which is no longèr in pol­
itics,” Mr. Drury declared. He went 
on to explain that the U. F. O. defi­
nitely, formally and finally withdrew 
from politics by a resolution which 
was passed almost unanimously in 
the 1923 convention.

“The understanding was, however,” 
Mr. Drury pointed out, “that when 
the U.F.O. itself withdrew from poli­
tics, a new party was to be formed 
with its blessing. The resolution

INSURANCEed of his dutiei 
by Coun,
Coun. McLeish, that all salaries be 
the same as last year, except that of 
the treasurer, which shall be $200. 
Coun. Parker thought the council 
should apply for a new treasurer, 
and moved that the treasurer’s sal­
ary be fixed at $150. There was no 
seconder to this motion. Before the 
vote was taken, Coun. Parker asked 
for the yeas and nays, which were 
recorded as follows: Yeas, Sullivan, 
Reinhardt, Downer, McLeish. Nays 
Parker. The by-law was passed giv­
ing the treasurer $200. It was mov­
ed by Coun .Downer and seconded by 
Coun. Reinhardt, that the township 
account be left with the Standard 
Bank. (Carried.) The next order of 
business was the appointing of a 
road superintendent. For this posi­
tion three applications had been re­
ceived. After a lengthly discussion, 
it was moved by Coun. Parker that 
no overseer be appointed for the 
year 1925. There was no seconder 
to this motion. Coun. Downer moved 
and Coun. McLeish seconded a reso­
lution that this council appoint a 
road overseer for the year 1925. This 
motion was carried, the majority of 
the council members feeling that the 
township could not afford to lose the 
30 per cent. Government grant. It 
was moved by Coun. Downer and 
seconded by Coun. McLeish, that the 
appointing of a road overseer be laid 
over until further information is re­
ceived from the department. (Car­
ried.) Fred Rapley, who has been a 
very faithful servant of the township 
for the past 34 years in the capacity 
of auditor, tendered his resignation, 
and asked to be relieved of his du­
ties at once. Jno. Wilson was ap­
pointed auditor to fill the vacancy. 
E. R. Carrothers was appointed as-

THF LflMBTi
MUTUALMOTHER:- Fletcher’s Cas- X Vy

A>ria is a pleasant, harmless Sub- xf 
stitute for Castor Oil, Paregoric,
Teething Drops and Soothing Syrups, especially prepared for 
Infants itt arms and Children all ages. ______
To avoid imitations, always look for the signature of
Proven directions on each package. Physicians everywhere recommend it

FARMERS'
INSURANCE COMPAh 

(Established in 1875) 
fJOHN W. KINGSTON....P
JAMES SMITH..........Vice P
ALBERT G. MINIELLY.. 
THOMAS LITHGOW....
GUILFORD BUTLER............

* JOHN PETER Me VICAR..
I JOHN COWAN K.C............... :
J. F. ELLIOT
ROBERT J. WHITE.Fire In 
ALEX. JAMIESON

IP. J. McEWEN..........................
i W. G. WILLOUGHBY, Mans 

Watford Sec.-T
ROY E. McFHEvRAN Y 

f Aerent for Warwick and PI:

Harry

An Oil for All Men.—Th
the soldier, the fisherman, tl 

the out-door laborererman,
who are exposed to injury 

elements will find in Dr. 
iEclectric Oil a true and 
I friend. To ease pain, relies 
E-dress wounds, subdue lum'b 
f overcome rheumatism, it is e 
Therefore, it should have a 
all home medicines and be 
those taken on a journey.

!*»«**«* yen
tors®

WE SELL

Counter Che 
Books
AT LESS

THAN THE COST C

Postage Stamp:
Phone Us Your Orde

Tea Supply Inadequate 
Prices Higher

■ — ;f ‘-

Princess Kathleen Makes Maiden Voyage
trials the “Princess Kathleen”, built at the Clydesbank yards of John Brown and Company 
» Facific run between Vancouver, Victoria and Seattle, accomplished all that was

en87n6prs other officers who conducted, the trials and who will bring this and 
Ith Vi „5rRyerite ■ stlB under construction to Vancouver, expressed themselves as being 

Built with the object ofsDeedhur m» «2 the new steamships will considerably reduce time between ports,
two Princesses will he a,nd affording even better and more convenient service than is now offered, the
the Pacific Coart Thre^hnnfiLS ^ctuk,t’ th.e ™ost elaborate yet tastefully beautiful vessels operating on
“hLXtloyJho "^ty-eight feet in length, their Unes were specially designed for the service to 
Mm ofBeen thenew vessels describe them as being beÿenl comparison with any 
Public room' aro most oniriov. 2ver ,to tbe accommodation of the passengers, whose private quarters andJauuatÿ^&exp&ringt^cmM^tethi^n^nra? ^tcd UP’ The “Princess^Kathlêen” sailed from the Clyde on 
the West Indies and tie Panama V,al?c0uv?r m about thirty days, her route being via the Azores,
after her arrival. The “Princess’Marguerite" is aS&Zt toto™ th^cTyde^nfech^s!1838611801' S°°n

On her prelie
for service_________

expected of her, and the Canada 
a sitter chip A ' 
entirely sat: The Guide-Advoca

Mothers can easily kn< 
their children are troubl 
worms, and th’ey lose no tie 
plying a reliable reraedy- 
Craves’ Worm Exterminate]PRINTED MATTER of all funds 

when you want it.—Guide-Advocate

itiQNAL Rail
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Tenge and Alexander Sts., Toronto
Voted for high grade instruction and 
aperior employment service. Enter 

time. Catalogue free.
W. J. ELLIOTT. Principal.

Ki ~X
iki

NERVOUS
BREAK-DOWN

Paint in Back and Legs Re­
lieved by Lydia E. Pinkham’s 

Vegetable Compound
TIME TABLE

Iranis leave Watford station as 
oil owe :

irOING WEST
he .m.uodation. Ill............ 8.42 a-m
Chicago Express, 17...........11.59 a.m.
Detroit Express 83............ 6.61 p.m

ucago Express.................... 9.11 p.m.
GOING EAST 

întiirt. Limited, 80.. ...7.4» a.m 
Chicago Express, 6.....,11.2- a.m

ipress  2.60 p.m
hccommodation, No. 112. .6.08 p.m. 

Mr-TAOOART, Agent, Watford.

MEDICAL

JAMES NEWELL, PH.B., M.D. 
aRCP&S M.B.M.A., England 
_oroner County of Lambton, Wat- 

ford Ont. Office—Comer Main and 
ont Sts. Residence—Front st, one 
ock east of Main sL

C. W. SAWERS, M.D., Phone 13 
IWatford. Ontario. Office—Main st 

eiidence—Ontario st, east. Office 
ours—8.30 to 9.30 a.m., 2 to I and 

7 to 8 p.m. Sundays by appointment

DR. G. N. URIE, B.A.
: Licentiate General Medical Council' United 
Kingdom. Member College Physicians and 

nrgeons of Ontario.
Successor to Dr. W. G. Siddall 

I Hours : 8.30 to 9.30 a.m.; 2 to 4 p.m. 
1 7 to 8 p.m. Sunday by appointment. 
I Office, Residence Main St., Watford 
I Phone 32.

Ford, Ontario.—“I had a nervous 
break-down, as it is called, with severe 
pains in my back and legs, and with 
fainting spells which left me very weak. 
I waa nervous and could not sleep nor 
eat as I should and spent much time 
in bed. I was in this state, more or 
less, for over two years before Lydia 
E. Pinkham’s Vegetable Compound was 
recommended to me by my neighbor. 
Before I had taken five doses I was 
sitting up in bed, and when the first 
bottle was taken 1 was out of bed and 
able to walk around the house. During 
my sickness I had been obliged to get 
some one to look after my home for me, 
but thanks to the Vegetable Compound 
I am now able to look after it myself. 
I have taken Lydia E. Pinkham’s Blood 
Medicine in turn with the Vegetable 
Compound, and I certainly recommend 
these medicines to any one who is not 
enjoying good health. I am quite willing 
for you to use these facts as a testv 
monial.”—Mrs. J. Shepherd, 130 Jos. 
Janisse Avenue, Ford, Ontario.

Nervousness, irritability, painful 
times, run-down feelings and weakness 
are symptoms to be noted. Women 
suffering from these troubles, which 
they so often have, should give Lydie 
Pinkham’s Vegetable Compound 
trial. All druggists seii s- L

DENTAL

GEORGE HICKS, D.D.S., Trinity 
University, L.D.S., Royal College of 
Dental Surgeons, Post graduate of 
Bridge and Crown work.Orthodontia 
and Porcelain work. The best meth­
ods employed to preserve the natural 
teeth. Office-Opposite Siddall’s Drug 
Store, Main st.

G. N. HOWDEN, D.D.S., L.D.S., 
Graduate of the Royal College of 
Dental Surgeons of Ontario, and tilt. 
University of Toronto. Only the 
Latest and Most Approved Appli­
ances and Methods used. Special 
attention to Crown and Bridge work. 
Office—Over Dr. Sawers’, Main sti, 
Watford. Ont.

MOTHER!
Watch Child's Bowels
"California Fig Syrup" is 

Children’s Harmless 
Laxative

l

VETERINARY SURGEON

J. McGILLICUDDY, Veterinary 
Surgeon. Honor Graduate Ontario 
Veterinary College. Dentistry » 
epeciatly. All diseases of domestic 
animals treated on scientific prin- 

| ciples. Office—Two doors south of 
I the Guide-Advocate office. Residence 

-Main street, one door north of Dr. 
| Siddall’s office.

INSURANCE

THF LAMBTON
FARMERS’ MUTUAL FIRE 

INSURANCE COMPANY 
(Established in 1875)

JOHN W. KINGSTON... .President
I JAMES SMITH..........Vice President
[.ALBERT G. MINIBLLY.. .Director
I THOMAS LITHGOW............ Director

ïUILFORD BUTLER............ Director
I JOHN PETER Me VICAR. .Director
I JOHN COWAN K.C............... Solicitor
IJ. F. ELLIOT
1 ROBERT J. WHITE.Fire Inspectors 
j ALEX. JAMIESON
|P. J. McEWEN........................ Auditors
I W. G. WILLOUGHBY, Manager and 

Watford Sec.-Treasurer
| SOY E. McFHEDRAN Wanstead 

Agent for Warwick and Plympton

An Oil for All Men.—The sailor, 
I the soldier, the fisherman, the lumb- 
j erman, the out-door laborer and all 

who are exposed to injury and the 
l elements will find in Dr. Thomas’ 
I'Eclectric Oil a true and faithful 
I friend. To ease pain, relieve colds, 
I dress wounds, subdue lumbago and 
r overcome rheumatism, it is excellent. 
; Therefore, it should have a place in 

all home medicines and be amongst 
those taken on a journey. m

WE SELL

Counter Check 
Books
AT LESS

THAN THE COST OF
Postage Stamps I
Phone Us Your Orders

The Guide-Advocate

When your child is constipated, 
bilious, has colic, feverish-breath, 
coated tongue, or diarrhea, a teas­
poonful of genuine “California Fig 
Syrup” sweetens the stomach and 
promptly cleans the bowels of pois­
ons, gases, Ibile, souring food and 
waste. Never cramps or overacts. 
Contains no narcotics or soothing 
drugs. Children love its taste.

Ask your druggist for genuine 
California Fig Syrup” which has 

full directions for babies and child­
ren of all ages, plainly printed on 
bottle. Mother! You must say “Cal­
ifornia” or you may get an imita­
tion fig syrup. 416-k

x

FOR THAT

Bad Cold
YOU MUST TAKE

Mothers can easily know when 
their children are troubled with 
worms, and th’ey loss no time in ap­
plying a reliable remedy—Mother 
Craves’ Worm Exterminator. m

mEDÛCED PRICE25

INFECTIOUS ABORTION
A Serious Trouble threatening

Cattle Herds

There is a preacher in Kansas who 
should have his salary raised for 
making the following announcement 
from his pulpit : “Brethren, the pew 
opener and I will hold our regular 
prayer meeting next Wednesday 
evening as usual. -,

Sellers Should Be Honest With Buy­
ers—Outside Vows Purchased Need 
Careful Examination-—-Htiw to Deal 
With Infected Animals'-— Chicken 
Lice ami Mites

tContrtbuted by Ontario Department of 
Agriculture, Toronto.)

To protect a clean herd from be­
coming infected precautions must be 
taken to prevent infected cows from 
mingling with healthy ones. Suspect­
ed animals should be kept isolated 
until a test of their blood has been 
made. If the test results indicate a 
positive reaction, the animal should 
not be admitted into the clean herd. 
As already stated, the disease is gen­
erally introduced into a clean herd 
through obtaining adult breeding cat­
tle from an affected herd. Before 
purchasing breeding cattle careful en­
quiry should be made to ascertain if 
the herd from which they are being 
obtained is affected. One can some­
times gain a fair idea of this by 
checking up the number of calves and 
yearlings with the number of females 
of breeding age
Sellers Should Be Frank With 

Buyers.
As the bases of an honorable trana- 

; action between breeders, the buyer 
■ has a moral right to receive from the 

seller a frank answer as to the exist­
ence or otherwise of contagious abor­
tion in his herd. The buyer may still 
further protect himself by having 
newly obtained pregnant females kept 

| isolated pending a test of their blood 
or until they calve By sending blood 

I samples to a suitable laboratory for 
j examination by the agglutination test,
I a person is acting discreetly This 
: can conveniently be done and a re­

port received back within a week, 
i The same thing should be done in 
I the case of a bull. In purchasing cat- 
; tie at public auctions from unknown 
j herds the safest plan is to select only 

young cattle at weaning age, or not 
over one year old, and which have 
not been bred. In.all cases where the 
blood of an animal reacts to the test 
it indicates that it is infected, and is 
not a safe animal to be added to a 
clean herd, tut should be excluded, 
and, if the agreement of purchase 
will permit, should be returned to 
the seller or the original owner. 
Outside Cows Should Be Carefully 

Examined.
In event of outside cows being per­

mitted to come to be bred to the bull 
of a clean herd, they should only be 
bred providing they are free from 
vaginal discharge, and service should 
take place in a small yard or pen 
kept for that purpose. Needless to 
say outside cows from doubtful herds 
should not be allowed to mingle with 
those of a clean herd, nor occupy the 
pastures on the premises in order to 
prevent contamination. Precautions 
should also be taken in the case of 
cows from clean herds being sent to 
another herd to be bred. Likewise 
precaution must be taken in the case 
of clean-breeding females being taken 
to live stock fairs and exhibitions. 
The precautionary measures which 
have been described are quite simple 
and applicable to any herd, and if 
consistently carried out may prevent 
infection abortion from entering a 
clean herd. Should perchance a cow 
abort in/ a supposedly clean herd, it 
should be regarded irrespective of 
excusable circumstances, as being 
probably the contagious form rather 
than purely accidental and precau­
tions taken accordingly.
How to Deal With Individual Cows.

In the event, therefore, of any ani­
mal aborting in the stable, or at pas­
ture, |t should at once be removed 
from me herd and kept isolated for 
at leastLtiuree weeks, or until it has 
properly cî^trfed and all discharges 
have ceased. At the end of ten days 
from the time of aborting an exam­
ination of her blood should be made. 
Immediately after the abortion has 
taken place the aborted fetus and 
afterbirth should be safely disposed 
of by burying deeply in the ground. 
All of the contaminated bedding and 
litter should be removed from the 
stable and burned. The stable walls 
and stalls up to a height of about 
six feet, and the floors and gutters 
should be thoroughly cleaned and 
washed with a solution of ordinary 
lye and hot water, and then aisinfect- 
ed with lime wash and cresol or 
carbolic acid, in the proportion of 
one pound of cresol or crude carbolic 
acid to five gallons of whitewash.— 
C. D. McGilvray, D. V. Sc., Ontario 
Veterinary College. Guelph.

BKin. DO tnis on a warm orient iay. ; 
During cpld weather use the Hum 
flouride as a dusting powder, placing 
email quantities at the points meet 
frequented.—L. Stevenson. Director 
of Extension, Ontario Agricultural 
College.

Four fundamental factors to suc- 
.iQd fundamental kactors to sue* 
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UNDESIRABLE ALIENS.

Chicken Lice and Mites.
The presence of lice ahd mites in­

dicates indifference, or too much 
don't care. Lice and mites lower the 
vitality of the birds, making them 
more susceptible to colds, roup and 
other diseases. Mites are killed by 
spraying the house inside, paying par­
ticular attention to the roosts and 
nesting boxes, saturating well with an 
oily fluid. A mixture of kerosene and 
spent oil from the auto crank case . 
does very well and is not expensive. 
For lice use sodium flouride — one 
ounce to a gallon of warm water. Dip 
the chickens, saturatine feathers ani

Some Manage to Get Into England 
Through Crooks* Gate.

Scores of thousands of “crooks,” 
male and female, are on the official 
black lists circulated among the 
aliens officers and other officials con­
i'’ d at all British ports.

galarly, month after month, 
£o f these listed criminals try to 
•a:r. ugh from the Continent and 
la u .ngiand. How many suc- 
v - mown. But that the total
in ;■ nly a small percentage of

is certain. The latest 
liable ihow that, In twelve 

: three short of two thou-
u-u were refused admittance 

r<> 1 - o unify.
ntiy. ui he numerous 

• into ! .s country the
> Dover. In one year, 

d am: ninety-three
■ i - vi-ciei : ‘About turn!

vit.Ifm iive minutes of 
from ’ he boat that 

b: Xi. u there. he other favor­
is • am-.k.-; i'ates, in Older of popular­
ly, are Folkestone London, New- 
ha v en, and Southampton, at which 
b.n.er p rl one hundred and twenty 
undesirables were turned back in a 
year.

Nearly all these undesirables are, 
ui course, aliens, and it comes as a 
very great shock to most of them 
when the aliens officer at the dock 
Politely but tirmly intimates that he 
knows the life history of the indi­
vidual concerned from A to Z. In no 
circumstances will he be allowed to 
set foot in the street that runs by 
the dock gate. No, he must get on 
to the boat again and go back whence 
he came.

After a great deal of plotting and 
planning, of covering up one’s move­
ments, and doubling in one’s tracks 
for perhaps a month or two some­
where on the continent where one is 
unknown, it naturally would come 
as a shock to find oneself expected 
among the arrivals at a British port.

It is all due to a complicated but 
most efficient espionage system all 
over the world, in which vice-consuls 
and consuls do their share in noting, 
and immediately reporting on, the 
movements of all doubtful characters 
in their immediate neighborhoods.

The facts so gathered are sorted 
and tabulated, and so the black list 
at the British ports is kept up-to- 
date. Arrivals and departures of 
crooks are entered thereon method­
ically and punctiliously—which ex­
plains how an incident such as the 
following is possible.

Newhaven was the gate chosen 
some weeks ago by a brook grown 
weary of the Continent. He arrived 
on the boat from Havre, after some 
rapid and “twisty” travelling in 
France, and was astounded by the 
warmth of the welcome he received 
from the aliens officer the moment 
he moved down the gangway at New­
haven. That “gate” was shut irre­
vocably in his face. He decided to 
try another. He travelled back to 
Havre, caught a boat for Southamp­
ton, and a few hours later disem­
barked there.

He was too astounded even to 
curse when the Southampton aliens 
officer waved in his face a lengthy 
telegram—a precis of the unwanted 
crook’s reception some hours pre­
viously at Newhaven.

There are no restrictions on any­
one landing in the Irish Free State, 
neither is there anything to hinder 
the hundreds of crooks who might 
choose that gateway into England 
from using it. Arrivals from the 
Irish Free State are not interfered 
with in any way—hence the increas­
ing popularity of the crooks' Irish 
gate.

Pity the Salesman 
who cannot—

The salesman who is not 
free to use Long Distance 
without being criticized is 
probably not covering his 
territory in the most eco­
nomical manner, 
lie is competing with sales­
men who call up their cus­
tomers between visits; se­
cure repeat orders; or sell 
additional items;
—with Sales -Managers 
who encourage salesmen to 
use Long Distance, because 
it saves money avid time;
—with salesmen who, when 
travelling, telephone to ! 
customers in small towns 
from some central point.
Of two salesmen who both pre­
serve a proper proportion be­
tween expense and sales, the one I 
who uses Long Distance the most 
is usually the most effective.

Watchers of the Skies.
Compared with birds, human be­

ings have a poor sight. It is well 
known that an eagle is capable of 
sighting its quarry from a great 
height, and is able to swoop down 
and seize it exactly in the centre of 
its neck.

Most birds have good sight, but in 
some the faculty is more developed 
than in others. The woodcock, for 
instance, has the remarkable power 
of flying at a great speed through 
dense thickets as though it were fly­
ing through an open space.

It is also astonishing to see the 
pace at which a bird will alight upon 
a tree or building. Only most acute 
sight enables it to do this accurately. 
Then, how quickly birds discern 
food that has been left on the 
ground. Throw a piece of bread 
at a time when no birds are near, 
and in a few moments a number of 
them will be on the spot.

Bach New Subscriber Adis to the 
Value of Your Telephone

Girls ! A Gleamy Mass of 
Beautiful Hair

35-Cent “Danderine” So Improves 
Lifeless, Neglected Hair

An abundance 
of luxuriant hair 
full of gloss, 
gleams and life 
shortly follows a 
genuine toning < 
up of neglected 
scalps with de­
pendable “Dan­
derine.”

Failing hair, >
itching scalp and / I 
the dandruff is 
corrected immediately. Thin, dry, 
wispy or fading hair is quickly in­
vigorated, taking on new strength, 
color and youthful beauty. “Dander­
ine” is delightful on the hair; a re­
freshing, stimulating tonic—not 
sticky or greasy ! Any drugstore.

66,Cascarets” for Liver 
and Bowels-10c a Box

Don’t Stay Dizzy, Bilious, Headachy, 
Sick or Constipated

- Feel fine! Lei
.-‘Cascarets” clean
—~ /I your bowels and
==="-— stimulate your

jr liver. No griping
-~\ aT overacting.,
]y Millions of men,

te.'-?' 'gi women, and chil-
^3 ÊT* dren take this 

n harmless laxative
-=^ J=.= cathar tic. It

- ~ doesn’t sicken
you like pills, oils, calomel and salts. 
Tastes nice—acts wonderful. Sold at 
drug stores.

“DIAMOND DYE" IT 

A BEAUTIFUL COLOR

Perfect home dye- 
in,g and tinting is,L 
guaranteed with] 
mond Dyes. Just i 
in cold water, to t 
mft, delicate shades 
or boil to dye rjch, 
permanent colons. 
Each 15-cent pack*-, 
rgc contains direc­
tions so simple any 
woman can dye or 
tint lingerie, silks, 

ribbons, skirts, waists, dresses, coats, 
stockings, sweaters, draperies, cover­
ings, hanging, everything new.

Buy “Diamond Dyes”—no other 
kind—and tell your druggist whether 
the material you wish to color is wool 
or silk, or whether it is linen, cotton, 
or mixed goods. 508

SAVOUR ad. here
WOULD PAY '
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A. Brown & Co.

Local Happening:
The groundhog saw his shat 

I Candlemas Day.
Buy your Silk Sox now, s| 

|priced 69c■—-Swift's.
Mrs. R. Kells has left f 

| Catlharines where she will 
Î some time with her son.

Fabric Tires $5.75, Cord 
I Storage Batteries equally 
i priced.—R. Morningbtar.

Mrs. F. W. Everett has rt 
! to Brantford after spending 
days with her mother here.

Six weeks more of winter, s 
legend; which is probably 
Sroundhog or no grofairdhog.

Ladies’ Wool Skating S' 
in white and tan only, a wo 
bargain at $4.75.—Swift’s.

“The Side Show of Life" is 
story of a great fun maker, \ 
comes a military genius. It 
most unusual picture ever ,put 
eereen. Showing at the Lyceu 

■ Thursday.
The W. M. S. of the Me 

I Church will be held at the 
age on Tuesday, Feb. 10th, a 
o'clock p.m. Every member 
ed to be present.

The Trustees of the M< 
Church have secured the sen 
Rev. Perry S. Dobson D.D., p 
of Alma College, as the Anni 
preacher on March 15th.

All RuObers reduced to 
clear. Get yours now.—$*. D 
Son.

“The Side Show of Life” a 
two-worlds circus and society 
ed into a fascinating picture 1 
fun and thrills with Ernest T 
and Anna Q. Nilsson, showing 
Lyceum next Thursday.

Big Table Remnants pricec 
half. Help yourself—the after 
of stock-taking.—Swift’s.

The regular monthly mee 
the Women’s Institute will 1 
on Wednesday, February lltl 
home of Mrs. T. G. Mitchel 
call “My First Valentine.”

The regular meeting of Ls 
149 Chapter IO.D.E. will be 
the home of Miss Evelyn D< 
Tuesday, Fdb. 10th, at three c 

Mrs. Harry Pearce ar 
George have returned hon 
visiting two months with b 
Walter, of Detroit.

Dance in the Music Hall, 
day, February 12th. Phillips 
tra, Sarnia. Tickets $1.00, lad 

Watford’s faithful bell-rin; 
Walter Scott, has tendered h 
nation, being forced by ill h 
give up some of his duties.- 1 
has been filled by Mr. Duncar 

Another interesting bit 
is the fortunes made by spe 
in wheat which has topped t] 
mark in Winnipeg. ‘ Gettin 
for tile shearing” is the way 
eiders view the rush of th 
into the pit.

Watch Him Swell—'“Wb 
you going with that goat, litt 
“Down to the lake. Come o 
want to see some fun. This ; 
et a crate of sponges, and I 
down to let him drink.”

The Communion service 
Methodist 'Church was well 
and of great interest to all 
Four persons were recei 
membership. The Pastor ; 
pre-communion address on tl 
sity of repentance for sin a: 
ation for Communion.

Wall Paper—Special Pi 
the month of February. See 
patterns now.—P. Dodds & 

A visit is expected from ! 
of the Provincial Staff of 
T.U., in the position of F 
retary for Young Peoples V 
date for Watford is Feb. 
rangements are being mai 
•mass meeting of the young 
Watford churches.

The subjects for next S 
the Methodist -Church W: 
Gospel for a Bankrupt W 
the morning service. In thi 
“Some Remarkable Oonve 
the Home Missions of B. ' 
personal experiences of a I 
sionary. You ate cordially 

Mis' Regina Kennedy, w 
to many in Western -Onta 
the literary name of Cynthi 
the London Advertiser, died 
York Hospital on Saturday 
Wood poisoning developing 
infected tooth. Miss Kennc 
native of Guelph, where b 
place on Tuesday. She 
known locally by many of 1 
«r people and had visited i 
several times during her 
-London.
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WATFORD AND PETROL IA
HIGH PLAY TIE GAME

Lessons From The Eclipse

A WEEK-END OF EXTRA SPECIAL BARGAINS

Pre-In ventory Clearance
THE pasting of the moon 
1 between the earth and

for Friday and Saturday
3 PIECES, HEAVY DRILL SHIRTING 

iblack and white, per yard................ 25c 15 ONLY, CHILDRENS ALL WOOL 
COATS, Plain or Fur Collars, at. .

4 PIECES, ANDBRSONS GINGHAMS 
yard wide, small checks, per yard... 25c 12 DOZEN HEAVY ALL WOOL HOSE 

Worsted, sizes 6 to 10, per pair. .. . 39c

directly 
sun last

Saturday morning taught us some­
thing of the science of astronomy 
about which so very little is known 
-by the ordinary man in the street un­
til the happening of some extraor­
dinary event. It revealed to us that 
man’s knowledge of the heavens has 
reached a point where he actually 
konws the course of this earth and 
many of the orbits that surround it, 
an-d that he is able to calculate ex­
actly the speed at which they travel. 
It did seem marvellous to foretell 
the eclipse to the second, and the 
various phenomena that would oc­
cur as it took place. But to us the 
most striking evidence of man’s skill

LADIES’ COATS—for Friday 1 
and Saturday..................... ? off reg. pnce 3 ONLY, COMFORTERS, 

soiled, earh.......................
Slightly $1.50

MEN’S AND BOYS OVERCOATS, MACKINAWS, 
and SHEEP LINED COATS 1 ff ___
at....................................... t orr reg. pnce MEN’S FLEECE LINED SHIRTS 

quality, all sizes, each.........................
heavy 69c

Petrolia Jan. .27.—Petrolia H S. 
end Watford H. S. battled to a draw 
"•ere this afternoon in an interschool 
’•ockey fixture. The lea«rue co’n<nsts 
'* teams from Forest. Watford and 
Petrolia, for which the principals 
of the three school» have donated a 
trophy. The score was 2-2 after 10 
minutes overtime and as the visiting 
team had to catch the train the score 
was allowed to stand.

Shugg, for the visitors, opened the 
scoring after 20 seconds, when he 
raced the length of the rink to tally 
In the second frame Petrolia tied 
the score by a series of combinations 
with Watford aswering with a lucky 
count. In the last period both teams

, , tightened up and the game was the
fastest seen here in years. Bryant. 
Wilson and Thompson worked a ser-

The Store 
with

The Stock

The Store 
with

The Stock

KERWOOD
A grand old Euchre Party and 

Dance will be held in the Anglican 
Hall, Kerwood, on evening of Friday 
Jan. 30th. Cards from 8 to 10.30,
Lunch served. Dance 11.30 to 2.
Four prizes given for cards. Good 
time for young and old. Admission 
60c.

The Ladies Aid of the Methodist 
church will meet on Wednesday 
afternoon, Feb. 4th, in the church 
basement as there is extra work on 
band. All the members are asked to 
attend and help with the sewing.

All choir members are invited to 
attend choir practise on Friday even­
ing at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Jno.
Johnson.

iMr. Chris Moyle is in London at­
tending the County Council.

Kerwood Womens’ Institute
The Womens Institute held their 

monthly meeting at the home of Mrs. | . Wm

1NW00D
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Dobear, Pearl 

and Russel of Alvinston, visited Mrs. 
Leitch Sunday.

Mrs. Ed. Flannery and Mrs. R. J. 
Richardson called on 'Mrs. Eli Carrol 
of Aberfeldy Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Johnston, 
of Sunnyside, visited Mrs. Bannister 
on Sunday.

Rev. C. H. Streeter, spent Satur­
day night at the home of W. R. Daw­
son.

The Hockey Team played Brigden 
Thursday afternoon at Brigden. In­
wood was defeated.

-Mrs. Wm. Munro and George 
White spent part of last week in 
Sarnia.

iMr. S. S. Courtright and Mr. Wm. 
Munro were in Sarnia on Wednes­
day.

-Mrs. Barett, Mrs. Trowhill' and 
Graham are on the sick

of the next eclipse in Ontario by a 
Toronto Univertity professor, as 
follows:—

“Toronto and western Ontario 
will not be favored again with 
such an eclipse until 2144 A. D., 
when on October 26 the path of a 
total eclipse will sweep over the 
Niagara peninsula. The middle of 
the path will be Caledonia, at 
which place the eclipse will take 
place at 12.34 p. m. Eastern Stan­
dard time.”
But there are other lessons we

ies of tricks on Days and netted the 
final goal. Bryant. Thompson and 
Drope proved be t of the locals, 
while Shugg, Howden and L. Mc­
Intosh were the pick of the visitera. 
There was a large crowd present.
Watford—L. McIntosh, goal; Shugg 

M. McIntosh, defense; Howden, cen­
tre; Cooke, Rogers, wings; Taite, 
Prentiss, subs.

Petrolia—McHattie goal; Tanton, 
Drope, defense; Thompson, centre; 
Bryant, Wilson, wings; Lindsaiy,

should learn looking through the I Howlett, Previtt, subs.

Merideth Morgan on Wednesday 
afternoon, Jan. 21st, with a good at­
tendance. Roll-Call was answered by 
New Year Resolutions, some except­
ionally good ones were given. -Letters 
of appreciation were read from 
those who had received remembran­
ces and .boxes of cheer. A much ap­
preciated, paper was given by Mrs.
H, „McLeah on “Odds-and Ends,” and 
Miss McGuèan gave a delightful in­
strumental solo, several others who

, were on the program were unavoid­
ably detained at home. Considerable 
business was transacted. The next 
meeting will be held at the home of 
Mrs. H. McLean, when special lun­
cheon will be served and there will 
also be a sale of home made cooking 
and candies. A social hour was then 
spent over the teacups, luncheon be­
ing served by the committee in 
charge.

Installation of Rebekah Officers

On Jan 13th, the officers of Irene 
Rebekah Lodge, No. 226 was install­
ed by Sister Elva Waltham, P.D.D., 
and suite P.N.G. Sister Edna Mcln- 
roy.
N. G.—Sister Isobelle Dowding.
V. G.—Sister Lillie Carroll.
R. S.—Sister -Florence Grogan.
F. S.—Sister Jean Waltham.
Treas.—Sister Lottie Glover.
War.—Sister Winnifred Mclnroy. 
Con.—Sister Hazel Manicom.
R. S. N. Y.—Sister Emma Burrows. 
T. S. N. Y.—Sister Nono Wilson.
R. S. V. G.—Sister Eliza Brent. '
L. S. V. G.—Sister Kate Cor.key.
I. G.—Sister Elizabeth Gimlett.
O. G.—Sister Elsie McKnight.
Chap.—Sister Elva Waltham.
After installation a number of 
speeches were given among them, 
one from Bro. R. E. Waltham, 
Grand Conductor of the Grand Lodge 
of Ontario, which was enjoyed by 
ell. Afterward a dainty chicken sup­
per was served.

For Better Health-
See

DR. A. C. ANDERSON 
Chiropractor

Nervous, Spinal, and Long 
Standing Ailments

Watford—Mon., Wed., Fri. 
9 to 11 a.m.

Office Opposite Roche House 
Phone Strathroy 92W

Mr. John Lehrbass has returned 
from Detroit.

The young men and women met 
at the manse one evening last week 
and organized the Y. P. S. as follows:

President—Basil Johnston.
Vice-Pres.—-Margaret Gardiner.
Sec.-Treas.—-Gertrude .McVicar.
Program Committee.—-Mr. Ellis, 

Miss Tompkins, Hilda Barrett, Ella 
Craig, Stewart Gardiner.

The Presbyterians voted on 
church union on Monday night.

Mr. ad Mrs. O. Lehrbass were in 
Forest last week. They are spending 
this week end with their son, Mr. 
Lehrbass of Alvinston.

Mr. Jas. Rutherford visited his 
home in Toronto last week.

A successful auction sale was 
held at Mr. Robert McCabe’s on the 
20th. There was a large crowd and 
prices soared high. Geo. E. Brown 
Was auctioneer.

Mrs. J. W. Johnston returned 
from Detroit Saturday night ac­
companied by her son, John Lyl-e 
Johnston, M. D.

Make Care Of
Babies Easier

Stomach disturbances and consti­
pation are responsible for much of 
the peevishness of babies and young 
children. When the baby is cross or 
irritable the mother should not resort 
to so-called soothing mixtures to cor­
rect the trouble for in the majority 
of cases these mixtures simply drug 
the child into an unnatural sleep. 
What is needed is a gentle laxative 
that will sweeten the stomach and 
regulate the bowels. Such a remedy 
is found in Baby’s Own Tablets. 
They are easy to take and are guar­
anteed to be entirely free from 
opiates and narcotics. Concerning 
them, Mrs. Jos. Tousaignant, Ste. 
Sophie, Que., writes:—“I would like 
all mothers to know that I feel there 
is no other medicine to equal Baby’s 
Own Tablets. I always keep a -box 
in the house and their prompt use 
never fails to restore my little ones 
to health.” The Tablets are sold by 
medicine dealers or by mail at 26 
cents a box from The Dr. Williams’ 
Medicine Co., Brockville, Ont.

ALVINSTON
A very enjoyable evening was 

spent on Monday last when an oyster 
supper was held in Dollbear’s school- 
house. A varied program consisting 
of violin selections by Messrs. Frank 
Pavey, Dan. McKinley and T. H. 
Myers. Grace McCallum and Gert­
rude Purcell, gave several recitat­
ions which were much enjoyed. Bur­
ton Myers played an instrumental 
and Robert Morrison sang a solo, 
both -being well rendered. L. W. Oke, 
M. P. P., acted as chairman and mus­
ic was rendered by the Eu. Brooke 
Orchestra.

The regular meeting of the Y. P. 
S. of Guthrie Presbyterian church 
was held on Tuesday evening when a 
splendid program was given -by the 
“Buttercups.” The main feature of 
the program was a mock trial pres­
ented by the young people of S. S. 
No. 21, which was well given and 
very much enjoyed -by the large 
crowd which attended. Miss Alice 
Lightfoot, leader of the group, gave 
a well -worded address on “Educa­
tion,” an-d -H. A. Jackson rendered a 
violin solo which was much enjoyed. 
At the -conclusion of the program, 
lunch was served and a social hour 
spent. The next meeting will he un­
der the direction of the “Daisies.”

The death occurred in Detroit of 
-Daniel Fisher Burns, -beloved son of 
Mrs. J. A. Burns, and grandson of 
Mr. and Mrs. Angus Fisher, of 
Brooke. Deceased was fourteen years 
old. The funeral was held from the 
residence of his grandparents on 
Wednesday. -Interment taking place 
in Alvinston cemetery.

Frank McCormick spent the week­
end with relatives in Sarnia.

smoked glass if we fail to get them 
otherwise. The spectacle of the ec­
lipse should serve to remind us of 
the incomprehensible greatness of 
the Almighty who some time in the 
ages ago created the universe in 
which the world we inhabit is such 
a tiny speck. We are accustomed to 
associate with earthly structures the 
names of their founders or builders; 
yet somehow or other many of us 
foolishly or neglectfully look upon 
the world and the thousands of other 
worlds as something that sort of 
“just happened.” We know none of 
our earthly structures came but by 
diligence and intelligence on the part 
of human beings; and by the same 
course of reasoning we snould not 
forget that we owe the existence of 
man and all the exactly ordered 
worlds to a Great Almighty Being. 
And then, recognizing this great Cre- i 
ative and Administrative Power we - 
should not critize but submit in all : 
things to make our lives useful in ! 
the great plan.

FORMER ALVINSTON PASTOR 
ACCEPTS CALL TO OTTAWA

Hamilton, Jan. 25—-Rev. Clarke F. 
Logan, for four years pastor of Ryer- 
son Methodist Church here, has ac­
cepted a call to McLeod Street 
-church, Ottawa. He is a native of 
Bruce County; ordained in 1908, and 
was formerly stationed at Alvinston 
and other charges in London Confer­
ence, coming to Colbome Street 
Church, Brantford, in Hamilton Con­
ference, eight years ago.

NAPIER

Parkhill auditors 
per annum.

paidarc $75

The regular monthly meeting of 
the missionary society met at the 
home of Mrs. Male. McIntyre, on 
Wednesday, Jan. 21. Mrs. Macintosh 
the president, was in the chair, open­
ed the meeting by prayer. The les­
son was read by Mrs. Harold Field, 
and the paper was given by Mrs. -L. 
Winter. Mrs. M-cIn-tyre read a very 
interesting paper, and roll call was 
answered by a verse from the Bible. 
After the meeting closed a very 
dainty lunch was servejd by the host 
ess.

The annual church meeting was 
held on Tuesday, January 20th. The 
officers of the ensuing year were 
elected.

On Sunday next, Felb. 1st, the ser­
vice will be held in St. Andrews’ 
church at 11 a.m. and will continue 
each Sabbath at this hour through­
out the following six months.

Mrs. John Clothier and Master 
Earl are spending a few days with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Eastabrook. , 1

An Oil that is Prized Everywhere--
Dr. Thomas’ Eclectric Oil was put 1 
upon the market without any flourish ! Cooke 
over fifty years ago. It was put up 
to meet the wants of a small section 
but as soon as its merits became 
known it had a whole continent for 
a field, and it is now known and 
prized throughout this continent.
There is nothing equal to it. m

Referree—H. Cooke, Watford.

H.S. GIRLS DEFEAT STRATHROY'

The girls basketball team of the 
Watford High School climbed inte 
second place in the W.O.S.S.A. 
-league district group by defeating 
Strathroy Collegiate girls in a fast 
and hard fought game at the Armory 
here on Tuesday evening, the final 
score being: Watford High School 
girls 18; Strathroy Collegiate girls 
16.

It was a Western Ontario Second­
ary Schools Association league game 
and by their victory the Watford 
girls are now tied with Strathroy 
for second place in the -group stand­
ing. If they can hold second place 
the local girls wl'H feel- satisfies ax 
Sarnia by its victories over both 
Watford and Strathroy has a 
strangle hold on first place.

The teams :
Strathroy Collegiate Gilrls:—E. 

Sexton, T. Fisher and M. Tout, for­
wards; I. Gregory, M. McCabe and 
S. Bogue, guards; M. Frank, sub. 

Watford High School Girls:—B. 
E. MeKercher and R. Steph­

enson, forwards; M. Connolly, M. Me 
•Lean and D. Fowler, guards; D. Del- 
mage and E. Watson, subs.

Referee—Miss Scarrow, Sarnia.

The crossword puzzle is one game 
that is “on the square.”

Stock Taking
Prices Reduced on Many 

Lines to Clean Out
25c Off the price of any Tea Pot in window

4 or 5 ODD TEA SETS (See our Centre Window)

$11.00, $13.50 and $17.50 per Set

FINE ENGLISH CHINA------Blue
OFF any quantity you 

__  wish to buy.

Blue Willow Semi-Porcelain—Cup. and Saucer.

Plates, Vegetable DUhes, Soup., orf/ OFF 
Nappies, Etc, in any quantity . 4u /c
MANY OTHER ODD PIECES IN FINeTcHINA

________  which you can buy at a reduction

Drug Dept. Specials
The balance of our Plain or Toasted on 

Marshmallows, per lb.................. SvQ
Assorted QQ ' Horehound on
Humbugs,per lb Q*JC Drops, per lb. 39c

FiforqU'Uitï Hand Scrub’ regular 50c 3^
A few only Gillette Safety Razors, ^TpM^d
in the new style fiat case, sale price on 

was 98 cents—now.............

</. W. McLaren
7Ae Store


