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NEW YORK’S WELCOME 
TO CARDINAL

THE WARMTH OF RECEPTION
DEEPLY AFFECTS HIS

EMINENCE
By Frank A. Ball

(Staff Corrvwxradeiit, N. C. W. O.

New York, April 28.—Patrick 
Joseph Hayes came home today a 
Cardinal and six hundred thousand 
persons gave him a great demo­
cratic welcome. They found him 
the greatest democrat of them all.

Men grown powerful in a great 
land crowded to felicitate him— 
some as a new Prince of the 
Church, some as a distinguished 
fellow New Yorker, all as a great 
American. Humbler thousands, 
Catholic and Protestant, gave 
greeting from jammed street and 
window. There “'as a mighty din of 
whistles, bands, cheers. To all these 
was returned a broad, genuinely 
glad smile, tinged with wonder at it 
all ; an eager "Why, hello John” or 
“How have you been, Bishop ?” 
It was an informality in princely 
robes that at once enchanced the 
dignity of their wearer.

NewYork discovered another thing 
about Patrick Cardinal Hayes today. 
Already called the Cardinal of 
Charity, he might well be known 
also as the Apostle of Children. It 
was not to the great, assembled in 
New York today, that he extended 
his first formal blessing, nor to 
their prepared addresses of congrat­
ulation that he listened first. It 
was to six thousand school children, 
massed in the great Cathedral, that 
the first Pontifical Benediction 
went and it was from four childish 
voices that the first address of 
welcome came.

On the liner, it was told, he not 
only was the cordial fellow to every 
passenger but the special friend of 
a dozen children aboard And this 
evening he abruptly interrupted 
the welcome of eminent clergymen 
and laymen to wave his scarlet hat 
to a throng of youngsters who 
sought a glimpse of him.

TAKEN OFF AT THE BATTERY

Cardinal Hayes arrived at three 
o’clock this afternoon and was 
taken off the ship at the Battery. 
A flash of scarlet, clear in the 
bright sunlight on Deck C of the 
great Leviathan high above the 
welcoming steamship Machigonne, 
was New York’s first glimpse of 
him. There was a shout, then 
cheers. The ship’s band played 
“ The Star Spangled Banner" and 
through the din came a strident 
college yell from a group of 
students of the Cardinal’s own 
college (Manhattan) on a neighbor­
ing boat. His Eminence waved 
friendly greetings and beamed down 
on the welcomers. To his right, a 
member of his party waved a silken 
American flag.

Spying a particular friend, the 
Cardinal swept his broad hat 
through the air and laughingly 
called, "Come on up.” Encouraged, 
someone on the boat shouted : 
“Where did you get that hat ?” 
There was general laughter and 
the Cardinal’s smile broadened. 
Meantime, the party from the wel­
coming boat went aboard.

As the Police Boat Band finished 
playing “ Adestel Fideles,” two 
naval airplanes roared overhead and 
the student’s Band swung into the 
National Anthem. Cardinal Hayes 
emerged into the gangway, a striking 
figure clad in red robes, the gold 
buckles on his shoes flashing in the 
sunlight. He appeared radiantly 
happy. Another band started play­
ing “Home Sweet Home.”

FIRST TO GREET CARDINAL

Bishop John J. Dunn, Auxiliary 
and Administrator of the Arch­
diocese ; James Butler, K. C. S. G., 
Chairman of the Committee ; and 
James Egan, His Eminence’s uncle 
were the first to greet the Cardinal. 
With them were Commissioner 
MacDonald, Frederick J. Fuller, 
John Tracey, and Edward J. Kenny, 
members of the welcoming com­
mittee. Meantime, Mayor Hylan 
had boarded the liner from the 
other side with his committee ; 
Murray Hulbert, President of the 
Board of Aldermen ; Rodman Wana- 
maker ; and James Sinnott, the 
Mayor’s Secretary. The Surveyor 
of the Port, Thomas J. Whittle, 
after discharging his official duties, 
tendered the Cardinal the freedom 
of the port.

His Eminence was led to an im­
provised throne in the salon where, 
under a scarlet canopy richly em­
broidered with gold, he stood to 
receive and bless the distinguished 
ecclesiastics and laymen who 
crowded about him. The salon was 
decked alternately with American 
flags and the Papal colors.

Here there passed : the Cardinal's 
uncle who had reared him from an 
orphan of five ; the venerable Mon­
signor McKenna who already had 
welcomed two new Cardinals to New 
York ; Monsignor Charles Cassidy 
who had seen the Red Hat conferred 
upon Cardinal Hayes in Rome ; 
Brother Edmund who taught the 
Cardinal when he was a High school 
hoy ; and scores of others. To His 
Eminence they were all just old 
friends greeted once more. With 
his hat in his left hand and his

right hand extended, he smiled 
happily as he spoke to each. He 
betrayed not the slightest sign of 
fatigue and those about him said 
that the terrific strain at Rome had 
not affected him injuriously. Ap­
parently, he is in excellent health.

“ Well, how are you,” “ Bishop, 
I’m glad to see you,” “ Did you get 
the letter," " Thanks for your 
cable,” " A fine man, Mr. Mayor," 
were some of hie comments.

Once turning to his secretary, he 
said : “ Don’t forget those little 
children ” and then went on with 
the greetings. No one saw any 
children. Suddenly the Cardinal 
rose, with no word of explanation 
and stepped out on deck. All eyes 
turned to the shore where he gazed. 
There was massed a shouting, flag 
waving throng of youngsters. In 
utter abandon the Cardinal raised 
his broad scarlet hat over his head 
and waved it vigorously. Amid all 
the pressure of the official welcome, 
he had not forgotten that the chil­
dren were to be there. After glad­
dening them by his recognition he 
returned to the Cabin and the offi­
cial greetings were continued.

Pressed by the numerous news­
paper men, His Eminence assumed a 
thoughtful air.

“ Naturally, I’m delighted to get 
back,” he said, “ I have had a very 
eventful experience in Rome where 
I was made to feel what a very 
noble and great thing it is to be an 
American citizen. It occurs to me 
from what His Holiness said—per­
haps moie from the spirit in which 
he said it, the light in his eyes, and 
the tone of his voice—that in Europe 
today there is no greater friend and 
admirer of America than he. That 
is one of the most vivid impressions 
I carried away from the great cere­
mony which was practically entire­
ly American.”

Someone asked the Cardinal if he 
had followed the opening games 
of the baseball season. There was 
wistfulness in the Cardinal’s smile 
as he said he had heard the scores 
at sea, but that great duties had 
kept from him many of the joys and 
sorrowsof his city. Cardinal Hayes, 
in his college days, played baseball 
and was president of the College 
Athletic Association.

Asked of conditions in Europe, 
the Cardinal said Italy and France 
had appeared to him to be in a 
prosperous condition.

The Cardinal passed with a friend­
ly smile through another ordeal 
when photographers took two 
flashlight pictures of him on the 
improvised throne, and again on 
deck where he took off his hat and 
waved it and turned this way and 
that for the picture men. His 
comment once was : “ It seems
awfully wooden.”

At the dock a packed crowd broke 
into cheers as the boat was made 
fast. The Cardinal landed, still 
smiling, and passed through to the 
waiting automobiles to the martial 
music of “ Onward, Christian 
Soldiers.” The song brought a 
pensive air to his face, for Cardinal 
Hayes was Bishop Ordinary for the 
American chaplains during the 
World War and still holds that 
position.

PARADE UP THE AVENUE

Through a cheering lane His 
Eminence reached his automobile 
end, to the deafening sounds of 
bands and shouts, the caravan of 
fifty cars bearing the party began 
its triumphal procession—to Broad­
way, then to Fifth Avenue and on 
up that famous thoroughfare. 
Block upon block, a solid mass of 
cheering humanity greeted it. 
Tens of thousands watched from 
windows. To all His Eminence 
bowed and smiled.

But it was to the children who, 
at places lined as many as six blocks 
on either side, that he turned his 
chief attention ; and it was they 
who brought tears again to his 
eyes. They waved small flags 
and shrilled their greetings as the 
red robes of the Cardinal identified 
him.

Through dense crowds at the 
Cathedral doors His Eminence made 
his way beneath a canopy to the 
doorway where Monsignor Michael 
J. Lavelle, the rector, and Monsig­
nor Carroll, the Chancellor, awaited 
him.

As he entered the great structure, 
Cardinal Hayes’ face flushed with 
emotion and, after a glimpse, his 
eyes dropped as he evidently fought 
for control of his feelings. For, 
packed into the Cathedral, all facing 
to greet him, six thousand parochial 
school children had just completed 
singing the Star Spangled Banner 
and their young voices now broke 
into a soft hymn of welcome. 
Reaching the altar the Cardinal 
knelt and prayed with eyes cast 
down. Then he arose arid went 
into the Chapel of the Sacred Heart 
where he was robed with the Car­
dinal’s stole, with an ermine collar. 
He advanced to the altar with the 
three priests accompanying him 
carrying the great red hat with its 
2H tassels. Thrice, he paused im­
pulsively to permit teachers or chil­
dren to kiss his Cardinal’s ring,

THE CHILDREN’S GREETING

There was a hush, then a thin 
piping voice rose. It was that of 
one of the four children chosen to
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give Cardinal Hayes the simple
welcome he had especially wished. 
It told that a " spiritual bouquet ” 
was offered His Eminence from the 
million Catholic children of His 
Archdiocese. There were in it a 
hundred thousand Holy Commun­
ions, and an equal number of 
Masses and Rosaries, and a million 
pious prayers. The four children in 
turn spoke their welcomes ; and in 
turn, His Eminence thanked them 
and blessed them.

Then he conferred the Pontifical 
Blessing upon all six thousand. 
There was silence as he strove for 
control of his emotions. When he 
had succeeded in so doing, in an 
earnest address, he gave his thanks 
to the children and to all who had 
honored him today.

“ The impression made by this 
spontaneous demonstration of 
affection on the part of my own 
flock and of kindly good will on the 
part of the non-Catholic people of 
New York, can never be effaced,” 
he said.

GLAD TO BE HOME

“ I know that 1 am welcomed 
home,” he continued, “ first of all 
as an American citizen who has been 
honored by the most ancient and 
venerable spiritual throne in the 
world. Pope Pius XI., in every 
utterance, made it quite clear that 
his desire was to honor America, 
not for any political, scientific or 
economic achievement ; not for any 
advantage there might accrue to 
the Catholic Church in America ; 
not to gain favor with the Ameri­
can people ; but because of Ameri­
can charity to suffering humanity. 
America’s catholicity of charity, 
dispensing to the ends of the earth 
largess of mercy and hope and 
courage with the necessaries of life, 
has gained for our glorious republic 
a prestige and position among 
nations which none can take from 
her.”

After pledging himself to un­
ceasing effort to ‘ merit this 
acclaim ” he concluded :

“ There is no one in New York 
tonight more happy than I am, 
because I am home.”

CATHOLIC EDUCATOR MADE 
PRINCIPAL

Buffalo, N.Y.—Charles J. Costello, 
Catholic educator here who has 
become nationally known as an 
authority on industrial education, 
has been appointed principal of the 
new East Buffalo high school, to be 
erected shortly. The Buffalo school 
board honored Mr. Costello by vot­
ing unanimously to grant him the 
post.

The new high school will be one 
of the finest of Buffalo’s municipal 
buildings, and will be located in 
Teutonia park, one block from 
Humboldt park, the site of the 
$1,000,000 natural science museum 
soon to be built by the city. The 
object of the early appointment was 
that Mr. Costello might lend his 
expert advice to the architects in 
planning the building. The new 
principal will be entrusted with the 
task, literally, of building his own 
school, largely selecting his own 
teaching staff and establishing the 
traditions of the new institution, a 
responsibility that implies a remark­
able vote of confidence in Mr. 
Costello’s organizing and adminis­
tering ability.

Mr. Costello at present is assist­
ant principal of Technical High 
School here. He is a graduate of 
Canisius College, where he took his 
A. B, degree in 1907 and his 
master’s degree in 1910. He

8ualified for the New York State 
ecil Rhodes scholarship at Oxford 
University, England, in 1906, and 

received the alternate appointment 
in 1907. He also took graduate 
work at Columbia and Cornell 
Universities. He engaged in engin­
eering work three years before 
entering the teaching profession. 
Since then he has served in every 
department of the schools, up to 
special assistant department head 
and assistant principal. As princi­
pal of Technical Evening High 
School, he brought the institution 
to the attention of educators 
throughout the country as one of 
the best industrial schools of its 
class in America.

FOCH’S PROFESSION OF FAITH

Paris, April 17.—Marshal Foc.h 
has just returned from Rome where 
he paid a visit to the French semin­
ary to view the monument erected 
to the memory of the sem­
inarians killed during the War. 
Replying to the allocution of 
the eldest seminarian, Abbe de 
Cossé-Brissac, Marshal Foch deliv- 
ered a brief address in which he 
once again affirmed with great 
fervor his Christian faith.

"Those who courageously gave 
their lives with all the ardor of 
their soul and the energy of their 
convictions—we know from whence 
they drew their courage,” he said. 
"Much is said of moral strength. 
Each one seeks it where he thinks 
he will find it. But we go back 
very far, very high, even to Him 
who is the Father, the supreme 
cause, the inspirer of all strength.

One must have courage to go back
to Him. Without Him our weak 
spirit would agitate itself vainly in 
a dense fog. It Is He who, when 
the sky seems heaviest and darkest, 
sends those rays of simplicity and 
straightforwardness which clearly 
point out the path of duty and 
which give courage for great re­
sponsibilities.”

JUDICIAL REBUKE TO 
IGNORANCE

The decision of the Federal Dis­
trict Court of Oregon, declaring 
unconstitutional the Compulsory 
Public School Law passed by the 
voters of that State is something 
more than a victory for those who 
contend that the parent’s right to 
direct the education of his child is 
paramount. It is a ruling of a 
unanimous Court, the clearness and 
definiteness of which ought to show 
conclusively to any reasonable mind 
that the so-called “ 100% American­
ism ” which is being proclaimed by 
the Ku Klux Klan and affiliated 
organizations and frequently em­
phasized by violence and crime is 
based on ignorance.

Those who figure Americanism on 
a percentage basis have always con­
tended that the parent has no inher­
ent and inalienable right in the 
matter of education and that the 
State could coerce the citizen if 
sufficient clamor were created to 
counsel coercion. Blind, unreason­
ing ignorance sought by arousing 
clamor, to place the State of Ore­
gon on a par with Russia, the only 
country in Europe that denies this 
right. In the very moment of their 
temporary victory, the enemies of 
the private schools made apparent 
to those who were not ignorant and 
who had the welfare of Oregon at 
heart, that they had placed their 
State dangerously near the same 
position in relation to the other 
States of the Union that Russia 
occupies in relation to the family of 
nations. They had virtually invited 
ostracism. Leading newspapers 
reported the withdrawal of capital 
from Oregon and prospective busi­
ness developments abandoned. The 
American who did not count his 
Americanism as he counted calories 
was unwilling to take chances on 
future legislation by the forces of 
ignorance.

The Federal District Court, by a 
unanimous decision, held that “the 
right of parents and guardians to 
send their children and wards to 
such schools as they may desire is a 
privilege they inherently are en­
titled to enjoy.”

If proof were required of the 
intolerance and ignorance of those 
who directed the campaign against 
private schools in Oregon, it is to be 
found in the manner in which the 
decision has been received by those 
who regard the Fourteenth Amend­
ment as a scrap of paper to be torn 
and dispersed at the will of a 
fanatical mob. In a dispatch to 
“ The Fellowship Forum ” which 
has constituted itself the mouth­
piece of the combined forces of 
bigotry, the ruling of the Court is 
described as " the most dangerous 
decision rendered by any court in 
America within 100 years.”

The dispatch continues . “ Three 
old men, two of whom are past the 
age of seventy decided that this 
school law, passed by a 15,000 
majority of the voters of the State 
of Oregon, is contrary to the Four­
teenth Amendment in that it 
abridges privileges and takes away 
property, without due process of 
law, from the parents and owners 
of parochial and private schools in 
Oregon.

“ The decision rests upon four 
pillars, which are all rotten. The 
first one is the Myers case in 
Nebraska, where the Court held it 
contrary to the Fourteenth Amend­
ment to require a private school to 
cease teaching the German lan­
guage and teach in the English 
language only.”

It is worth while to consider who 
the “ old man ” is who delivered the 
unanimous opinion of the Oregon 
Court and what Court it was that 
furnished the precedent which is 
described as a rotten pillar.” If 
Judge Charles Edwin Wolverton is 
no longer young, his years of service 
have been spent in Oregon and for 
Oregonians. Graduated from an 
Oregon college, he practiced law 
for twenty years at the Oregon 
bar, during which time he married 
an Oregon lady, then served for 
eleven years on the bench of the 
Supreme Court, rising to the posi­
tion of Chief justice before being 
appointed a Federal District Judge 
eighteen years ago. He lectured on 
law for several years at two col­
leges in the State and is on the 
board of trustees of a third. He 
has been prominent in Masonic 
circles for several years and served 
a term as Grand Master of the Grand 
Lodge of Masons of Oregon.

If a judge with this record had 
written an opinion upholding the 
Oregon School Law, and that 
opinion had been concurred in by 
two other judges neither of whom 
was a Catholic—as was the decision 
declaring the law unconstitutional— 
what would have been said of 
Catholics if they had sneered at
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him as an “ old man ” whose ruling 
rested on a “ rotten pillar ?”

And what is this “ rotten pillar ?” 
It Is a ruling of the Supreme Court 
of the United States, for it was the 
highest tribunal in the land which 
rendered the decision in the Myers 
case which Is so denominated.

Here is the logical sequence of 
unreasoning ignorance inciting to 
bigotry. The rights of the individ- 
ual under the Constitution of the 
United States are to be overridden 
by the prejudices and hatreds of 
inflamed fanatics. If the individual 
appeals to the courts, the decision 
of the courts is to be derided and 
attacked. Then as a final contribu­
tion to self-styled “ 100% American- 
ism ” the Supreme Court of the 
United States shall be jibed at as a 
“ rotten pillar.”

It is well that citizens who do not 
have to proclaim the percentage of 
their Americanism should be 
reassured from time to time that 
they live under the reign of law and 
not under the black terror of 
ignorant and inflamed bigotry. For 
this reason the decision handed 
down by the Federal District Court 
of Oregon is particularly timely 
and encouraging.—N. C. W. C.

HEROIC GOOD SENSE 
IN HOSPITAL FIRE

Brooklyn, N. Y„ April 25.—The 
calm heroism of a nun, inspiring an 
entire hospital corps, probably saved 
200 patients from death or injury 
here Wednesday. A three-alarm 
fire did $30,000 damage to the St. 
Mark’s Avenue wing of St. Mary’s 
Hospital, and the entire wing was 
evacuated before the flames so 
rapidly that the work was done be­
fore firemen arrived, yet not a 
single patient was injured, and 
there was not the slightest sign of a 
panic.

It was the soothing voice of Sister 
Dorothea, in charge of the fourth 
floor* in the wing, that induced the 
first group of patients to leave 
quietly. It was her courageous ex­
ample to the other sisters and attend­
ants that stifled the first flutter of 
excitement, and it was under her 
direction the corps worked steadily 
and quietly, imparting confidence to 
their charges. Again, it was, 
Sister Dorothea who, choking with 
smoke from the burning building, 
insisted on making a personal tour 
of the entire fourth floor before 
leaving the wing. She found a hos­
pital attache who had been over­
come by the smoke.

The fire was listed as “accidental.” 
A mute patient discovered it on the 
top floor of the wing. He beckoned 
to a student nurse, who sent in the 
first alarm, then called Sister 
Dorothea and Sister Mary Margaret 
Sister Dorothea quietly summoned 
the nurses, next door, and others of 
the hospital staff assembled from 
other parts of the building. Under 
her direction, seventy-five patients 
were evacuated in a few moments. 
Some merely were told calmly to 
walk downstairs, others were taken 
on the elevator. As the fire made 
headway, it was decided to evacuate 
the entire wing, and this was accom­
plished, again without confusion.

Hospital attendants, police offi­
cials and firemen were unanimous in 
their praise of Sister Dorothea’s 
courage and good judgment in the 
crisis.

Dr. George Owens and Dr. 
John J. Flynn, with a staff of 
nurses, were performing an opera­
tion on a woman on the roof of the 
hospital when the fire broke out. 
Their patient was at a critical point. 
Directing that all preparations be 
made for a hurried move if it be­
came imperative, and stationing 
attaches to observe the advance of 
the flames, they went on with the 
operation. They completed it, and 
it is believed the woman will live. 
A moment after the operation, Dr. 
Flynn assisted at the birth of an 
infant, while the fire was still burn­
ing and parts of the hospital were 
being evacuated. The mother and 
child are doing well.

INDIAN CATHOLIC PRESS 
BEGINNINGS

Despite the formidable handicaps 
of the proverbial poverty in India 
and a Catholic population almost 
wholly made up of natives who 
speak only the vernacular tongues, 
the promotion of Catholic news­
papers in India is making progress. 
Recently two new weeklies have 
made their appearance, and there 
has been formed here the Indian 
Catholic News Service, with a broad 
system of gathering Catholic news 
in the peninsula.

The two new Catholic weeklies, 
one in English and the other in the 
vernacular, are published in Trivan- 
dram, the capital of an important 
State in the extreme south-west 
corner of the country. An idea of 
the perseverance of Indian Catho­
lics in their efforts for a Catholic 
press may be gained from the fact 
there recently have been two at­
tempts to establish Catholic dailies. 
One, in Trivandram, failed after 
bases, but the other, at Delhi, was 
partly successful. Lieutenant Col­
onel Ogerman. a retired member of 
the Indian Medical Service, made

the attempt, but falling to get an 
adequate response, was forced to 
give part control of the enterprise 
to non-Catholics. The present 
editor of ;the paper, however, is a 
Catholic, which insures a sympathe­
tic attitude toward Catholic news.

CATHOLIC FIREMEN 
HAILED AS HEROES

Chicago, April 26.—Seven solemn 
Requiem Masses in as many churches 
on Monday, Tuesday, and Wednes­
day, were sung for the seven Cath­
olic firemen who were crushed to 
death in fighting a fire in Blue 
Island Avenue, Good Friday night. 
These men, together with another 
fireman, and a civilian met death as 
a great wall toppled over, crushing 
the giant steel fire ladder like a 
reed, and burying them under tons 
of hot bricks, stone and concrete,

The city’s great paid tribute to 
the dead heroes in the several 
funerals, the churches being 
thronged, and the streets through 
which the funeral processions passed 
being lined with men, women and 
children.

Citizens are now engaged in rais­
ing a huge fund, to add to the funds 
provided by the firemen’s pensions 
and Benevolent Association benefits, 
to care for the mothers, widows and 
orphan children of the fire heroes,

TALES OF PRIESTLY HEROISM

Here are stories of priestly 
heroism, as written by the first 
reporters covering the tragedy. 
One writes :

“ Rev. Father E. A. Jones, of 
Holy Family church, was on the 
scene early. Before the buried men 
were reached he worked with the 
sledge hammer brigade fighting 
their way into the pit.

" But as soon as the first of the 
injured was exposed, the priest 
secured a fireman’s helmet and 
rubber coat and let himself down 
into the inferno. There he admin­
istered the last rites of the Church 
to the dying, and encouraged the 
less badly injured until they could 
be rescued.”

Another fire reporter, writing 
under the stress of the tragedy 
said :

“ Rev. Father William Gorman 
was in the headquarters of Truck 
Company No. 12, when news of the 
disaster was received. Jumping 
into a taxi Father Gorman hurried 
to the scene. He stumbled his way 
over the smoking debris until he 
came to where the men of Truck 
Company 12 were lying. There he 
knelt in prayer, offering religious 
consolation to the men beneath.”

FIRE marshal’s TRIBUTE

Fire Marshal Edward Buckley, 
paid the following tribute to the 
dead firemen and their living com­
rades :

“ I cannot too greatly praise the 
conduct of the firemen Good Friday 
night. The men who were killed 
and injured went up into that build­
ing in the face of danger without 
hesitation, and the explosion swept 
them away.

" What makes me proudest is that 
after the wall had fallen with these 
brave men under it, there was a 
rush of other firemen directly into 
that mass of blazing debris which 
endangered their lives every minute. 
They attacked the ruins with their 
bare hands while picks were being 
brought, in a brave effort to save 
their fallen brothers.”

FRENCH GOVERNMENT 
REPEALS DECREE

The French Government, having 
examined a report submitted by the 
Minister of the Interior has repealed 
the decree of June 30, 1914, pro­
nouncing the dissolution of the hos­
pital Order of Benedictine Nuns of 
Notre Dame du Calvaire of Orleans 
and ordering the liquidation of 
their property and holdings. The 
Minister of the Interior and the 
Minister of Finance are charged 
with the execution of the new 
decree.

This is the second decree issued 
by the French Government restor­
ing legal existence to a religious 
order which had been dissolved. 
The first was in favor of the relig­
ious of Broons and was motivated 
by the desire to recognize the 
splendid assistance given by the 
nuns of Broons to the Army Medi­
cal Service.

DIVORCE BILL BEATEN

London, April 26. — Another 
divorce bill has been defeated, this 
time in the House of Commons. It 
was introduced by Dr. Spero under 
the "ten minute rule,” and was de­
feated by a small margin of nine 
votes. The object of the bill was 
to permit divorce after a separation 
of five years, whether by judicial 
order or by mutual deed of separa­
tion, and to allow the dissolution of 
a marriage if either party fails to 
reappear after seven years absence. 
The bill was beaten by the Votes of 
the Catholic members, as twelve 
put their weight in the scale against 
it.

CATHOLIC NOTES

Brooklyn, April 26.—Three large 
estates on Long Island have recent­
ly been purchased for the diocese of 
Brooklyn for conversion into 
ecclesiastical institutious of various 
kinds.

Paris, April 21.—The Carmel of 
Lisieux, the shrine of the Little 
Flower, has received from the Pope 
as a gift, the candle which was 
blessed by the Holy Father on the 
Feast of the Purification.

Madras.—The Right Rev. Dr. Paul 
Perini, S. J., Bishop of Calicut, the 
latest diocese to be erected in India, 
and Administrator Apostolic of 
the Diocese of Mangalore, has been 
appointed a Papal count and assist­
ant at the Pontifical throne.

Paris, April 18.—Statistics issued 
by the Society of Foreign Missions 
show that in French Indo-China 
there are 1,126,000 Catholics out of 
a total population of 19,000,000. 
There are 18 bishops, a Prefect 
Apostolic, 888 missionaries and 904 
native priests.

Jersey City, N. J., April 26.— 
Catholics, Protestants and Jews 
united at an organization meeting 
here Tuesday to combat bigotry and 
promote better feeling among the 
three groups. The new organiza­
tion is to be known as The Three 
Creeds, and it is hoped to make it 
nation-wide. Officers were elected 
from each of the three faiths.

London, Eng.—The Yorkshire 
Association of Change Ringers rang 
a peal consisting of over 5,COO 
changes to welcome Canon Dolan 
back to Sheffield on his return from 
the Holy land. The canon was with 
the pilgrimage which was headed 
by Cardinal Bourne, and which was 
received by the Pope on its visit to 
Rome.

Cologne, April 15.—Great prep­
arations already are under way at 
Paderborn, Westphalia, for the 
celebration of the 900th anniversary 
of the emperor-saint, Heinrich, who 
died in the castle of Gronau, near 
Goettingen, J*uly 18, 1024. St.
Henry was an emperor of the Saxon 
line, and was admitted to sainthood 
together with his wife, Kunigunde.

Oliver D. Williams, a negro, who 
is a senior in the Fordham Univers­
ity School of Law, and who is work­
ing his way through college, has 
just been awarded a scholarship of 
$200 a year by the State of New 
York. The award was made after 
Williams had entered the competi­
tive examinations in academic sub­
jects and won high honors. Williams 
lives in Brooklyn.

Washington, D. C., April 26.— 
Francis R. Lowther, of St. Louis, 
has been designated by the National 
Council of Catholic Men to act as 
its representative at the national 
convention of the Boy Scouts of 
America, at St. Louis, May 9 and 10. 
Mr. Lowther is a member of the 
executive committee of the N.C.C.M. 
The Boy Scout organization has 
25,000 Catholic boys enrolled.

Cologne, April 15.—Missionary 
activities are nearly completely 
organized in the Cologne arch­
diocese and there has been a healthy 
growth of the work, despite the 
national misfortunes, it was shown 
in a report just submitted at a con­
ference of the Priests’ Mission 
Union here. The organization’s 
organ, Priests and Missions, has 
risen from a circulation of 17,000 in 
1928 to 20,000 early in 1924.

London, April 21.—The bogus 
“ oath ” of the Knights of Columbus 
is being circulated throughout 
England. In the North it is being 
fastened on to the Knights of St. 
Columba, a rapidly growing organ­
ization which is modeled on the 
American order, and the growth of 
which is evidently a matter of con­
cern to Protestant bigots. There 
are already 12,000 Knights of St. 
Columba in this country. Their 
development has not yet gone 
beyond the first degree.

German officialdom and the Ger­
man press, without regard to party, 
joined in felicitating Cardinal 
Pacelli, the Papal Nuncio, on the 
occasion of the recent celebration of 
his silver jubilee as a priest. The 
German government sent its con­
gratulations, and Premier Braun of 
Prussia, Chancellor Marx and Dr. 
Stresemanr, Minister of Foreign 
Affairs, added their good wishes. 
Cardinal Pacelli is regarded highly 
throughout the Reich for his ability, 
his impartial justice and his tactful 
conduct in these troublous times.

Rome, April 25.—The Rev. Dr. 
Paschal Robinson, O. F. M., former­
ly professor of Medieval History at 
the Catholic University of America, 
has recently been named as Con­
sulter of two of the Sacred Con­
gregations through which the 
affairs of the Church are adminis­
tered. These two bodies are : the 
Sacred Congregation of the Affairs 
of Religious and the Sacred Con­
gregation of Seminaries and Uni­
versities. Dr. Robinson left the 
Catholic University in 1920 when he 
was appointed Ajiostolic Visitor to 
Palestine.
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GERTRUDE MANNER1NG
A TALE OF SACRIFICE

BY FRANCES NOBLE

CHAPTER X.—Continued

He laughed too as he answered :
“ It is rather strange I should not 

have found it out before, isn’t it, 
that you belong to the family I have 
often heard spoken of by some 
friends of mine in B—shire ? I 
visited them last year for a few 
days, and I several times heard 
them mention Whitewell Grange. 
Once we passed it in a drive, but 
could not see the house from the 
road, of course.”

Gerty’s eyes sparkled now.
‘‘Ah, how strange ! Then you 

have actually been so near my 
home. I wish you could have seen 
it, Mr. Graham ; it is such a dear 
old place. Not very grand, per­
haps, though / think it the grand­
est place on earth, and 1 know papa 
does too in his heart. Did they— 
your friends—tell you we were a 
Catholic family, Mr. Graham ?”

He smiled at her eagerness.
" O yes ! Mies Mannering ; and 

they told me that your family lost a 
good deal at the time of the 
Reformation. But I should hâve 
listened with much more interest 
could I have known I was going to 
make your acquaintance, of 
course.” And the grey eyes looked 
down so tenderly that Gerty averted 
hers for a minute.

“ That is what we are so proud 
of, Mr. Graham," she said warmly, 
“ knowing how much our family 
suffered—for the faith.” And she 
spoke the last words bravely, scorn­
ing the word “ Reformation,” 
which to her sensitive conscience 
would have seemed a cowardly one 
in this case, when she was so 
determined to make amends for her 
previous shyness on the subject. 
" We are quite proud of not being 
very rich, you know, because it was 
for that we were impoverished."

Stanley Graham turned away a 
moment, as though the sight of her 
bright face pained him ; but he 
continued directly :

” And your brother, Miss Manner­
ing, is he in England or abroad ?”

“ Oh ! in England, Mr. Graham,
at N-----College, in the seminary
there. He is very young—not 
twenty yet—and he has only just 
finished his novitiate, you know. 
0 Mr, Graham ! if you only knew 
the Jesuits properly you would 
never think them so dfeadful ; you 
would admire them as much as any 
one must who knows them really.’’

Her very earnestness seemed to 
trouble him ; but he strove to hide 
the feeling, as he said gently but 
somewhat uneasily :

” You are determined, then, not 
to forget my offence ? What shall 
I do to repair it fully ?”

“ Indeed I did not refer to that at 
all—really I did not, Mr. Graham. 
Oh, do not think so, please.” And 
the sweet eyes smiled with a gentle 
pleading. “ Of course, if you have 
been brought up to think of the 
Jesuits and Catholics altogether as 
bad, or at least worthless, how can 
you help it, Mr. Graham ? I was 
not blaming you, but I wish it were 
not so ; that you could know how 
different it is in reality, the same as 
I wish for Lady Hunter and Sir 
Robert.”

And as she sighed there came 
such an earnest, yearning look over 
Gerty’s face, as showed her com­
panion what a deep, true nature 
and sympathetic woman’s heart lay 
hidden beneath the girlish exterior.

‘‘You are very good, Miss 
Mannering,” he said earnestly. 
“ I assure you I appreciate your 
kindness in thinking of me as a 
friend like this, and I must thank 
you for your wish very sincerely, 
though I—cannot echo it.”

And before Gerty could speak 
again a gentleman came up, and, 
putting his arm in Stanley’s, drew 
him away into the centre of a group 
some yards off, where Gerty soon 
lost sight of him.

But a great load seemed lifted 
from her heart, which was singing 
inwardly, as it were, as she sat 
there alone again, absorbed in her 
own thoughts. How she had been 
mistaken in Stanley Graham ; how 
different had been his behavior 
from the coldness which she had 
expected ; how kind he had been, 
more so than ever almost, in manner 
if not in words ; until the sacrifice 
she had been prepared to make had 
completely slipped away, quite 
uncalled for now ! Perhaps there 
might even be a hope that some day 
he himself might receive the grace 
of conversion. More unlikely things 
had come to pass ; and why should 
she not pray and hope, for the grace 
for his soul as well as for any other? 
Perhaps he was not so bitterly 
irreligious after all, as her cousin 
had told her. Lady Hunter might 
be mistaken, or was it—and as 
another thought half rose in Gerty’s 
mind the color mounted again to 
her face and her heart beat trem­
blingly. Could it be that her own 
hidden feeling was not so wholly 
unreturned? did Stanley Graham 
perhaps care for her just a little, as 
surely his manner implied ? and was 
his hatred or contempt of religion 
softened on finding that she was a 
Catholic, that she was so proud of 
being one ?

“ Oh ! if I could be the means of 
his conversion !” was her enthusi­
astic thought. “ If through poor 
little me such a one as he is, so 
noble and gifted, should become a 
Catholic some day, how grand it 
would be ! But if any one could 
know I was even dreaming cf such

a thing, wouldn’t I die nearly ! 
How could he ever care really for 
aie, a bit of a thing like me, and he 
so run after, so superior to any one 
I ever knew ?” And the fond, 
adoring heart sighed wearily. 
" Well, I can pray for him all the 
same, as I do for Julia and Sir 
Robert ; he will never know how I 
could have—loved him. I shall go 
back to papa, and be an old maid 
all my life: ‘ Miss Mannering of 
Whitewell Grange,’ people will call 
me. I shall have plenty to do, taking 
care of the poor, and helping 
Rupert’s poor too, when he is on 
the mission, out of what is his own, j 
after all. Nobody need ever know 
that there is something in my heart 
which will prevent me from ever : 
marrying, as I know there is and 
always will be ; and if they could 
know, they would only laugh—even 
Father Walmsley would, perhaps, 
to think that my heart could have 
gone so entirely to any one I have 
known only a few days. I’m not 
afraid of ever betraying it to any 
one, even to papa, because it would 
make him unhappy if he thought 1 
was.” But though Gerty tried to 
smile and look cheerfully at the 
dreary prospect she had conjured 1 
up, hope would whisper to her 
heart, trying to drive away the [ 
gloomy picture.

When the evening was over, when 
she had received Stanley Graham’s 
earnest tender adieux, with hie : 
voice still ringing in her ears, 
Gerty stood a few minutes with her 
cousin before going up-stairs, and 
told her of her conversation with 
him during the evening,

“ It seemed so natural to be talk- I 
!ng to him like that, Julia ; and I 
wonder how it never all came out 
before. But he did seem surprised 
to hear 1 was a Catholic, Julia.”

“ I told you he would be, love. 
He would be the very last one to 
think that any one in whom he felt 
interested should turn out to be a 
Catholic—indeed he would pur- 
posedly avoid talking of religion at 
all, I know, for fear of clashing 
with any prejudices ; and this will 
be how the fact has been so long in 
coming out, dear. For however 
quiet and unconcerned he may have 
seemed to you on the subject, 
Gerty, he is very bitter in his 
heart, and so scornfully and im­
patiently so that, unlikely as I am 
to become a Roman Catholic, I am 
a thousand times more likely than 
Stanley Graham is ever to have any 
faith at all.

But even these last / cheerless 
words could not drive away thenew 
hope that had arisen in her heart.

‘‘Julia does not know what 
prayer can do; she knows nothing 
of God’s grace and the changes it 
can work if he chooses. She does 
not know how powerful our Blessed 
Lady is in interceding for us with 
God, when our own prayers are not 
worthy to be granted.”

And Gerty slept that night with 
a greater peace and calmness in her 
heart than had dwelt in it since the 
night before; when she had wept so 
bitterly as the discovery forced it­
self upon her of the change that 
was coming over her so quickly, the 
discovery that the old girlish life 
was ebbing away and the woman’s 
life beginning for her ; that her 
idolized father was losing the first 
place in her heart and thoughts, 
giving it up to a mere stranger ; 
that the prospect of returning to 
the dear old home no longer filled 
her with unmixed delight.

CHAPTER XI.
“ Poor papa !” And Gertrude’s 

tears fell, as she sat alone in her 
bedroom with a letter from her 
father in her hand.

Nearly a fortnight had elapsed 
since the evening recorded in the 
last chapter. The month in London 
was coming to an end ; it was the 
day before the one settled for her 
return home, and Gerty had just 
received a letter from Mr. Manner­
ing telling her how he longed to 
see her again, to welcome his 
darling back once more to the old 
sweet life together. He was send­
ing the housekeeper to fetch her 
home, as he himself wished to be 
there before her to see that all was 
nice and comfortable to receive her, 
he said.

“ I am like a child almost, 
Gerty," he wrote, “ in impatience 
for the arrival of the day after 
tomorrow. Father Walmsley must 
think so too, I fancy, for he broke 
through his rule of never dining 
out on Sunday, and actually came 
home with me after Mass, to help 
me to behave rationally, I suppose. 
How will my little girl look when I 
kiss her again, I wonder. A little 
paler, perhaps (but that can soon be 
remedied), but not changed at all 
in reality ; not grown very stately 
or fashionable, I hope—indeed, I am 
sure. One thing I know : she will 
look happy, and feel so too, to be 
with her lonely old father—not a 
bit sorry to leave all the grandeur 
of London. Have I not guessed 
rightly, Sunbeam ? I wonder now 
how I lived all those years you were 
at the convent, Gerty. I have so 
much to tell you, about Rupert and 
the college, and about my retreat ; 
and I shall have so much to listen 
to also, I know, though you have 
written such nice long letters. I 
have just been up again to look at 
your room, to see how they have 
put up the new picture of the 
college I have brought home for 
you. You will be delighted with it, 
I expect ; and I have had it hung 
opposite the bed, as I thought you 
would like. I am writing to Lady 
Huntpr today too, for the least I 
can do is to thank her myself for 
all her kindness to my little girl ;

but you must also say everything 
that is nice to her for me.” And 
with a few more loving words the 
letter concluded. And Gerty eat 
there like one in a dream, with the 
letter in her hand, gazing out before 
her with tearful eyes and pale, 
fixed face, as the past month rose in 
retrospect before her. It was all 
over now, with its pleasures and 
bewildering delights ; the end was 
at hand of her brief elysium, and 
she was going back to the old life, 
the life which seemed so long past 
now, with its sweet, simple duties 
and joys.

And why was she so pale and 
tearful ? why w^s there none of that 
delight in her face which she had so 
fondly pictured would be hers when 
this day should come, which but 
three short weeks ago she had felt 
so sure she would feel ? Was she 
regretting the pleasures and amuse­
ments, the elegant society and 
admiration, she was about to leave ? 
No, oh, no! If it had been only 
these, how easily, nay gladly, would 
she have turned her back on them 
to go once more to the father who 
yearned so for her presence ! But 
there was another life, apart from 
the outward one of gayety, which 
would not be cast off or left behind 
—a new existence of restless joy 
and hope and care, which ‘had be­
come part of herself, changing the 
happy, careless girl into a thought­
ful woman, which must go with 
her wherever she went, its very 
presence making any other life 
seem cold and dark. And for this 
it was that the tears were falling— 
the knowledge that she could not, 
as she had so merrily promised, 
take back with her to her father 
her happy, free, girlish heart ; that 
it was hers no longer, but given up 
wholly to another, given with all 
the depth and fervor of the nature 
which until now even she herself 
had scarce knownz was hers, and 
this with yet no assurance that such 
a love as she gave was bestowed in 
return, no assurance yet, but only a 
trembling though almost certain 
hope.

Every day for the last fortnight 
Gerty had met Stanley Graham. 
Riding, driving, at the opera or else­
where, he had been ever at her side, 
until society was now growing 
accustomed to the fact that haughty 
Stanley Graham had at last been 
fairly conquered, and that sooner or 
later Lady Hunter's pretty little 
cousin would win the position so 
long coveted in vain by many an 
older, prouder beautv.

Lady Hunter herself viewed the 
course of events with a mixed feel­
ing of delight and vague uneasi­
ness, which latter she more than 
once expressed to Sir Robert, who, 
however, failed to share it.

“I hope it will all turn out 
happily,” she said to him. ‘‘To us 
of course there seems no reason 
why it should not ; for I can hardly 
believe sometimes that our little 
Gerty has made such a conquest, 
and so quickly too. But you see, 
Robert dear, her father is such a 
very staunch Romanist, and 1 know 
more than you do of the faith and 
practice of strict Catholics like they 
are, especially since Gerty has been 
with me ; and I can't help wonder­
ing how it will please him to see 
her marry one who is not only not of 
their religion, but of no religion 
at all. And another thing, Robert ; 
how will Stanley, with his ideas, 
like a Catholic wife ? how will he 
reconcile himself to see her con­
stantly practising all those observ­
ances which he holds in such con­
tempt ? Perhaps his love for her 
might soften his dislike to her "re­
ligion, but I can’t help thifaking 
otherwise. I ought to know Stànley 
well enough by this time ; and it 
seems to me that much as he might 
love his wife, he would never allow 
her to act in opposition to his 
wishes in that respect. He will 
make a fond, adoring husband, one 
to be proud of too, so long as his 
wife makes his will hers ; but in 
the other case, if she should want 
her own too much now and then in 
anything important, why, I 
shouldn’t like to change places with 
her, that’s all. He won’t spoil his 
wife, Robert, like you do.” And 
Lady Hunter kissed her husband 
with a fond affection.

He smiled kindly and cheerily.
“1 hope you are wrong, Julia. I 

hope so ; and though I do not like to 
contradict, I think you are, my 
dear. You are too anxious about 
Gerty, because, of course, you feel 
a certain responsibility now attach­
ing to you on her account. Of course 
I don’t know so much as you do of 
Catholics, but it seems to me that a 
young girl like Gerty would soon 
give in to the superior judgment of 
one like Stanley, especially if she 
loved him as any girl must love such 
a husband as he would be ; more 
than all a sensitive, enthusiastic 
little thing like she is. She would 
die, Julia, depend on it, sooner than 
go against his wishes. And as to 
Mr. Mannering, it may be a blow at 
first, but it would be a blow to give 
her to any one at all just yet, 
whether of their own religion or 
not, and if he sees her happy he 
must soon grow reconciled.” And 
he smiled again cheerily in his 
kindly ignorance of even the mean­
ing of the words faith and religion, 
which he spoke so lightly, as though 
they were things to be worn or cast 
aside at pleasure or convenience ; as 
though there were no heaven or hell 
at stake, no God to be pleased or 
offended ; as though truth and error 
were alike in his sight.

“Well,” sighed her ladyship, "I 
hope you are right, dear, I’m sure ; 
for if ever Gerty came to any sorrow 
through my fault, I should wish to 
have cut my hand off sooner than

have written the letter inviting her 
here. And it Is too late now to 
remedy matters. Stanley evidently 
means to ask her to be his wife, 
though I should not be surprised if 
he did not do it just yet ; and poor 
Gerty, much as she tries to hide It, 
cannot conceal from me where her 
heart is : for 1 know, Robert, as 
plainly as if she told me, that the 
love which comes only once in a 
lifetime in all its full strength and 
fervor has come to her now at 
eighteen.”

TO BE CONTINUED

DREADFUL DALYS
There was no getting away from 

the fact that Western avenue was 
shocked.

Western avenue, Cokeford, was 
the Mecca of the retired.y There 
was a retired colonel, a retired 
clergyman, a retired solicitor and a 
retired architect.

Into this Eden came the disturb­
ing element of the Dalys. Now, 
old Daly was the proprietor of the 
big emporium at Waterbury, a 
thriving industrial town some miles 
away. He had bought a house in 
Western avenue and retired there 
with his family, to the great disgust 
of the rest of the neighborhood.

I am not going to say that the 
young Dalys were models of deport­
ment. There were seven of them, 
ranging from Cynthia, who had just 
turned twenty-one, to Terence, who 
was just seven. They were good 
enough children, you understand, 
but decidedly high-spirited.

Then, again, the Dalys were 
Papists and the whole troop of 
them went off to Mass every Sunday 
morning.

The Dalys were regarded with the 
deepest disapproval. Of course, Mr, 
Daly's social position rendered him 
totally unfitted for the society of 
retired professional men. The odd 
thing about it was that the Dalys 
did not seem to mind in the least.

It was Harold Wynne who first 
made the discovery that Cynthia 
was decidedly pretty. Harold lived 
with his mother at Fair View, and 
was popularly supposed to be read­
ing either for the church or the 
bar. He had been reading for the 
one or the other since he left school 
at the age of seventeen, but I am 
afraid his reading was not particu­
larly extensive.

Harold was quite a decent fellow 
at heart, but a small private income 
had reduced him to a terribly slack 
state. He was, of course, a keen 
Anglican, with a slight tendency to 
ritualism.

Harold had reached the age of 
twenty-five without falling seriously 
in love. Much credit was due to 
his excellent mother, who had so 
carefully guarded him against the 
wiles of designing females.

Harold was paying a visit to Miss 
Meakin, who lived next door to the 
Dalys, when he first discovered 
Cynthia. The Dalys were playing 
tennis, not the highly conventional 
game usually played in the gardens 
of Western avenue, but a real rough 
and tumble game, punctuated by 
excited shrieks from the younger 
Dalys. Cynthia, disheveled and 
slightly dusty, nevertheless looked 
delightful in her white frock, and 
Harold promptly fell in love.

The greatest difficulty was to get 
an introduction. The Dalys, at 
first prepared to be friendly and 
sociable to all, had soon discovered 
that they were living in an atmos­
phere of dislike, and had accord­
ingly banded themselves together 
to resist all comers. Here it was 
that chance favored Harold.

He was returning from a quiet 
spin in the country, and when about 
three miles out of town, discovered 
Terence sitting by the roadside, 
dirty, dusty and disconsolate. The 
chance was too good to be missed. 
Harold jumped off his machine and 
discovered that the youngster had 
been playing truant all day and 
walked for miles and miles and had 
finally lost himself. Ten minutes 
later old Colonel Cressman was 
horrified to see young Wynne cycling 
rapidly down the avenue with a 
small and dirty Daly perched in 
front.

By the greatest good luck in the 
world, Cynthia was at the gate, an 
anxious Cynthia, keenly concerned 
about the possible fate of her small 
brother. It was with great relief 
that she witnessed his arrival.

" Oh, Terence, you naughty boy, 
where have you been?” she scolded.

“ I discovered him by the road­
side near Little Houghton, Miss 
Cynthia,” explained Harold.

Cynthia looked at him with rather 
startled eyes. Unaware of the skil­
ful cross-examination that Terence 
had gone through during his little 
trip, she was wondering how on 
earth Harold had discovered her 
name.

“ Thank you very much indeed. 
It was very good of you to bring 
him home,” she said stiffly, and 
with a little nod, grasped Terence 
by the arm and disappeared.

It was, of course, sheer solicitude 
for the boy’s welfare that caused 
Harold to call at Kilmorna the 
following evening to inquire if he 
was quite all right after his experi­
ence the previous day. Mrs. Daly, 
much touched by his solicitude for 
her offspring, was far more friendly 
than Cynthia and a few minutes 
later Harold found himself on the 
lawn, being introduced to the rest 
of the family.

They were quite a decent lot, he 
discovered, for old Mr. Daly had 
determined to give them all a good 
education. Cynthia was. of course, 
charming, whilst Michael, who 
hoped to be a priest, was a very
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good sort indeed. The kiddies
were amusing little beggars, and 
the old folks simple and unaffected.

The dreadful news of Harold’s 
fraternization with those dreadful 
Dalys was conveyed to Mrs. Wynne 
by Miss Meakin. She had actually 
seen Harold playing tennis with 
them. Then she dropped her voice 
and mentioned casually :

“Of course, the eldest girl is 
rather good looking.”

There were tears and expostula­
tions when Harold arrived home, 
but for once he was firm. He 
absolutely refused to cease his 
acquaintance with the Dalys, and 
hie mother, after the heat of the 
moment was over, reflected that, 
after all, Cynthia might not be 
such a bad match ; at any rate, the 
old man had money.

But alas for his mother’s hopes ! 
When Harold proposed—and he did 
so at the end of three months—he 
was met with a decided refusal.

“ My dear Harold;” said Cynthia, 
calmly, “ 1 like you extremely, but 
I could only love—a man My old 
dad has worked hard ever since he 
was a boy of seven, and the man I 
marry must be able to earn his own 
living, even if he has a private 
income. Forgive me if 1 hurt your 
feelings, but look how you waste 
your life.”

“ But I am reading for the 
Church,” expostulated Harold.

“ Well, in the first place, I would 
never marry a Protestant, particu­
larly a panon ; and again, you have 
been reading for the Church or bar 
for years and years.”

Next day Cokeford, and especially 
Western avenue, was thrilled by the 
sudden disappearance of Harold 
Wynne. For the first time Mrs. 
Wynne called on the Dalys and 
learned from a tearful and some­
what remorseful Cynthia that she 
had turned Harold down. The 
following day, however, a letter 
from Harold arrived from London, 
stating that he was all right and 
giving certain directions about his 
income, but no indication as to 
where he was staying.

It was nearly a year later when a 
young man clad in a rather soiled 
tweed suit arrived at Cokeford 
railway station. His hands were 
rough and stained, but his shoulders 
were finely squared and he carried 
himself like a man. He turned off 
the main street and ascended West­
ern avenue. Cynthia, sauntering 
down, gave a little start of surprise 
when she caught sight of him.

“ Harold !” she gasped.
He crossed the road and gripped 

both her little hands in his.
“ Well, Cynthia, I have come 

back,” he said quietly.
She looked at his rough hands.
" What in the world have you 

been doing ?”
"Oh, I got a job at a motor 

engineer’s. I know my work fairly 
well by now, and with the assist­
ance of an expert friend of mine, I 
intend to open a shop in Cokeford. 
There should be a jolly good open­
ing here ; there’s only one in the 
place, and that’s out of date.”

She looked at him with a smile.
“ You gave us an awful fright 

when you left. We thought you 
were dead.” .*•

“ And did you care ?”
“ A little,” she admitted.
“Only a little? Was that all, 

Cynthia?” he questioned.
She raised her blushing face to 

his. “ Well, no. Rather a lot.”
“Cynthia.” He bent and kissed 

her full on the lips, regardless of 
any chance passerby. The rest of 
the conversation, though interesting 
is immaterial.

“ Well, first of all, we will go and 
see my mater,” said Harold finally. 
“ And then tomorrow, after Mass, 
we will speak to Father Quinn.”

“ Oh,” Cynthia suddenly faltered, 
in distress, “ I had forgotten. You 
know, dear, I can never marry a 
Protestant. Mr. Harold—”

“ I should be very sorry if you 
did.”

Cynthia looked puzzled.
“ I’m afraid I don’t quite under­

stand.”
“ My dear, I don’t do things by 

halves. I not only learned how to 
work, but how to believe. There’s 
only one religion a logical man can 
believe, and that is the Catholic 
Faith.”

And so the story had a happy end­
ing after all.—Ernest W. Boxall in 
Catholic Fireside.

CREDULITY AND ITS 
LESSON

Another myth has been exploded. 
The widely heralded girl psychic 
from the plains of Kansas who 
could find missing articles, peer into 
the future, and perform weird 
stunts that taxed the credulity of 
the worldly wise, has been exposed 
as a seeker of publicity. Her so- 
called psychic powers were simply 
the clever invention of press 
agents.

Once again the public has been 
fooled, at least that portion of the 
gullible public who.swallow without 
the traditional grain of salt the in­
credulous stories of imaginative re­
porters. There was not much in 
this story of the girl psychic to 
attract the attention of the thought­
ful. But it was just sensational 
enough to arouse the curiosity and 
to excite the admiration of those 
too credulous minds that are always 
willing to accept without investiga­
tion any theory however prepos­
terous, and any claim however 
absurd that bears some little sem­
blance of truth, provided its prom­
ises to make life more enjoyable, 
and the search for truth easier.

There is a lesson in this and
similar hoaxes that have been per­
petrated by designing schemers 
upon the general public, that^e 
should not be lost. The newspaper 
reading public are too prone to 
accept as gospel truth what they
read in the papers. Newspapermen 
are not to blame for this. The 
province of the newspaper is to 
chronicle facts as they receive them, 
leaving their interpretation and 
acceptance to the reader's judg 
ment. The average newspaper 
should be read with a critical eye. 
When any preposterous story 
appears concerning the«occult and 
the psychic, we as Catholics have 
one effectual test to apply to It, 
namely, does it conflict with any 
article of faith. If it does, then we 
are sure that it is false and that 
further investigation will reveal 
its falsity. We know that God 
alone knows the future and can re­
veal things hidden to men. 
Others may claim to possess that 
power, and by fraud, duplicity, or 
guesswork appear to substantiate 
their claim. The First Command­
ment forbids us to attribute to 
creatures a faculty that belongs to 
God alone. Foretelling the future 
is reserved to God. That is why 
Catholics are forbidden to consult 
fortune tellers, mediums, psychics, 
clairvoyants and other claimants to 
supernatural knowledge, because 
this is giving a worship to creatures 
that God alone deserves.

Sometimes God reveals the future 
through the instrumentality of his 
saints and holy people. Then His 
voice is clear and distinct, and the 
character of the mouthpiece bears 
the stamp of His instrument. But 
God does not issue His knowledge 
of the future to professional mounte­
banks who make a good living in 
telling fortunes or foretelling 
future events. As Chesterton once 
remarked apropos of the so-called 
revelations of spiritism, “one does 
not expect to hear the voice of God 
issuing from a coal hole.”—The 
Pilot. ____

ONE CHURCH OR 
MANY CHURCHES
Wilfrii Faisons, S. J., in America

The men who write headlines for 
the papers speak an English dialect 
all their own. Apparently they 
arrived at this dialect by means of 
space and the mere length of words. 
Every treaty or convention is a 
“ pact every investigation is a 
“ quiz every altercation is a 
“ clash.” So they often speak of 
“ the Church.” Thus : “ Dissen­
sions in the Church “ the Church 
accused . . . “ says the
Church is not up-to-date,” and so 
on. Reading this, one is tempted 
to ask : “ which church does he 
mean Is there anything in the 
Christian world which can be called 
“ the Church ?” Usually the Pro­
testant sects are referred to. Is 
there any “ Protestant church ?” 
Catholics as a matter of course 
speak of their Church as “ the 
Church,” because they know it to 
be the true Church of Christ. Pro­
testants, who pride themselves on 
being more toleradt in this matter 
than Catholics, how can they talk 
of “ the Church ?” The headline 
writer, of course, means "church­
men,” or “ Christendom,” or 
“ Protestantism,” all words too 
long for a headline. A certain 
rich man once said that he cared 
not who wrote the newspaper 
columns, if he could only write the 
headlines. Is there then any truth 
in those words “ the Church ?” Do 
they convey any definite idea ?

What is the situation in the 
Christian world today ? There is a 
Church, the Catholic Church, which 
is united in one faith and one 
obedience, traces its individual 
existence back to the Apostles, is 
spread over the whole earth, and 
succeeds everywhere in making men 
lead lives that are full, beautiful 
and good. These are not claims, 
but facts. A newspaper man said 
to me not long ago : “ you talk as if 
all these other churches broke away 
from the Catholic Church.” The 
answer was easy, and historical : 
” not only that, but I can put my 
fiiger on the year in which they did 
oreak away.” There is the Eastern 
Church, once with a sort of unity 
but since broken up into national 
sects. That left the Church in the 
year 1054. In the West, the Pro­
testant churches, beginning with 
Germany in 1517, and England in 
1584, made a distinct and definite 
break with the old Church. They 
tave since split up into innumerable 
divisions. Before Luther that was 
not so. There was one Church in 
Western Europe from the time of 
Peter and Paul.until the time of 
Luther. There had been divisions 
before, Arians, Nestorians, Donat- 
ists, Eutychians, but they did not 
survive the test of time, and after 
splitting up into small sects, died. 
Thus they showed that Christ was 
not with them, for, Christ’s Church 
is undying. The fact is that in the 
Middle Ages just before Luther 
there was one Church. Now out­
side the Catholic Church, there are 
many churches, and divisions of 
churches, and dissensions in those 
divisions.

This is the query that is troubling 
the hearts and minds of many earn­
est Christians : is this as it ought to 
be ? Should there be one Church or 
many Churches ? We are told that 
there should be many churches, 
because man is free, and must 
choosy, and follow his bent. But 
that is just the question : is man 
free in this matter ? Besides people 
do not want to be free in this sense. 
People are looking for truth, and

if they could only discover what it 
was Christ taught, they would 
gladly accept it. And this is pre­
cisely wnal they cannot discover, 
when, looking at what the headline- 
writer calls ‘ the Church,” they see 
there no sign of truth’s guidance, in 
the multiplicity of conflicting sects. 
The result is that they turn away 
with sadness and look for truth 
elsewhere, in science, or evolution, 
or “freak” cults. Is this as it 
ought to be? Is this what Christ 
desired ?

Christ is the Founder of Chris­
tianity. He brought a new religion, 
a New Testament to replace the Old 
Testament by which God had ruled 
those who believed in Him. Did He 
intend that it be so difficult, impos­
sible even, to find the truth of what 
He taught ? We cannot believe it. 
And if He did not intend this, did 
He take any means to insure our 
finding that truth ? To answer that 
question is to get on the right 
track. Last week we saw here that 
Christ did really establish an 
authority to witness to His message. 
Where did He embody that author­
ity ? Where is it today ? Has it 
been lost to men? Is there any 
corporate guidance founded by 
Christ for the sake of those who 
seek truth ? Protestants admit 
that He did desire a sort of unity, 
but say that the whole of Christen­
dom is the one Church He founded, 
divided up into national churches 
and sects. Is the present state of 
dissension in Christendom desired 
by Christ?

We can find the answers to these 
questions only by questioning Christ 
Himself. What does He say in the 
Scriptures ?

Christ founded Hie Church in this 
way : He chose twelve apostles, one 
of whom fell away, and to them 
He gave the mission of carrying 
His work all over the world, and of 
continuing it in their successors “to 
the consummation of the world.” 
As Christ brought a message from 
God, bo they were to preach that 
message to all men iMatt. xxviii., 
19-20.) In this task of witnessing, 
of teaching what He taught, He 
promised His own abiding presence 
with them, and He promised that 
His Spirit would guide them always 
(John xv., 26-7 ) "Teach them to 
observe also that Lhave commanded 
you.” It is clear that Christ’s idea 
was of a body of men, teaching 
with authority, teaching the same 
doctrines, teaching in His name the 
truth. “He who heareth you, 
heareth me. He who believeth not, 
shall be damned” (Matt, x., 4 ; 
Mark xvi., 16.) Can it be that all 
these separate sects, not daring to 
teach with authority, mutually 
repudiating one another and 
denying one another’s faith, are 
the successors of the Apostles, 
carrying on their mission ?

Moreover Christ clearly meant 
this body which He founded to guide 
men to truth, to be one in undivided 
unity. “Other sheep I have,” He 
said, “that are not of this fold : 
them also must I bring, and they 
shall hear My voice, and there shall 
be one fold and one shepherd." 
(John x., 16.) He also said that His 
Church is one Kingdom, not 
"divided against itself” (Matt. xi„ 
25.) It is one vine, one tree, one 
organic living body, one Spirit- 
guided whole. Whatever it is, it is 
certainly not a conglomeration of 
conflicting sects, all at sixes and 
sevens. “Holy Father,” Christ 
prayed, “keep them in thy name 
whom thou hast given me ; that 
they may be one as we also are one. 
. . . and not for them only [the 
Apostles | do I pray, but for them 
also who through their word shall 
believe in me." (John xvii., 11, 20.) 
If the warring sects are parts of 
Christ’s Church, then either Christ’s 
prayer is not heard and His Spirit 
has left the Church, or His Spirit is 
teaching some men one thing and 
some another, some the truth and 
some the opposite, error. It is very 
clear that the authority which 
Christ left in the world to teach 
men, is in one undivided Church 
and not in a divided Christianity.

This is a very consoling thing to 
know, that Christ did not leave us 
to flounder about, always seeking 
truth and never finding it. It is 
wholly in keeping with what we 
know of his character of wise and 
good man, and true God, that each 
successive generation should have 
the sure means of coming infallibly 
to the knowledge of what He 
taught. Yet Christ, loving friend 
and merciful God, was also what we 
call a good administrator. It was 
no flabby organization that He 
founded, not knowing its own mind 
and unable to enforce its own 
authority. The constitution of 
Christ’s Church has “teeth in it.” 
Every social body must have such 
strength or it will never survive 
the storms of the world. In a 
world where a state or any other 
society with no authority quickly 
falls into anarchy, we may be very 
sure that Christ would not leave 
the Church, whose purpose is the 
eternal salvation of men, without 
the bond that holds bodies of men 
together, be they armies or debat­
ing societies.

Christ said to the Apostles : 
“ Amen I say to you : whatsoever 
you shall bind upon the earth, shall 
be bound also in heaven ; and what­
soever you shall loose upon earth, 
shall be loosed also in heaven.” 
(Matth. xviii., 18). Now what do 
these words mean ? These are 
spiritual bonds which He gives the 
Apostles power to tie and untie, for 
their effect will be ratified in 
heaven. Christ spoke in a Hebrew 
dialect, and in that dialect, 
Aramaic, these words “bind ” and 
" loose ” mean to make laws. The

old Jewish rabbis and lawyers often 
used them in this sense. So Christ 
is saying to the Apostles that when 
they make laws, these laws will be 
ratified in heaven. After the 
Apostles, and those who succeed to 
their power, speak, God will speak. 
The laws they make, God makes. 
Thus sublimely does Christ give to 
Hie Church the authority it will 
need to keep men’s minds "and wills 
one united in the Faith.

What has happened to Protestant­
ism ? Those who first broke away 
from the old Church, did so by 
denying her authority. At first 
they tried to retain the same 
authority in themselves. But their 
followers quickly showed them how 
illogical they were. The Funda­
mentalists had their Modernists 
even then. If each man is free, 
then there is no authority, the 
argument held then as it does now. 
And the result was inevitable. 
Luther, whose idea was to reform 
the Church, hence the name 
“ Reformers,” found himself with 
many sects on his hands, and the 
number grew daily greater, much 
against his will. But, and this is 
the important point, this disunion, 
this breaking-up into sects, is 
inherent in the principle on which 
Protestantism is founded, flow 
can the Holy Ghost be with those 
whose fundamental charterdestroys, 
has destroyed, and must destroy, 
the unity of Christendom? Can 
anything show more clearly how 
far the sects have wandered from 
the Christianity of the Gospels ?

The lesson of this line of thought 
is perfectly clear. To the Catholic 
it gives a calm assurance that he is 
in the right way of Christ’s truth. 
In the midst of the present clamor 
of Modernist pulpits he points to 
the irrefutable facts: Christianity 
is a Revelation ; Revelation came 
whole and entire from God to the 
Apostles ; the Apostles and their 
successors are the witnesses to that 
Revelation, and are Divinely guided 
in stating what it is and what it 
means. But the traditional Pro­
testant, who looks on Modernism as 
a plague, as a pagan philosophy, a 
non-Christian cult, where does he 
stand in the light of the facts of 
Scripture ? Can he defend his own 
religion ? As long as he also holds 
to the principles of Protestantism 
he cannot defend it. Those 
principles have disintegrated every 
sect that ever held them. They 
will, and must continue to do so. 
Christ’s idea of organic unity of 
one body in one faith, one flock 
under one shepherd, and the Pro­
testant idea of the freedom of the 
individual in faith, cannot stand 
together. The non-Catholic Chris­
tian of the modern world is now 
called on to make the choice. On 
one side is a collection of hetero­
geneous sects, widely differing in 
doctrine and discipline; on the 
other, the Catholic Church, sure in 
doctrine, compact in discipline. On 
one side is Christ’s Church, on the 
other are many churches, owing 
their origin to fallible men.

THE GROWTH OF THE 
CHURCH

The annual publication of the 
Official Catholic Directory for the 
United States is eagerly awaited by 
all who follow with increasing inter­
est the growth of the Church in 
this country. Every year the facts 
and figures listed in this publication 
show the number of Catholics in­
creasing, churches multiplying, new 
priests being added to the clergy, 
and Catholic schools and pupils con­
stantly advancing both in numbers 
and in equipment.

This year is no exception. In fact 
the record of Catholic progress made 
since the last publication of the 
Official Catholic Directory is partic­
ularly noteworthy. In his prelimin­
ary announcement the editor calls 
attention to the conclusive evidence 
of the growth of the Catholic 
Church in the United States, in the 
following words.

“This fact is apparent in the in­
crease in the Catholic population of 
this country, which now totals 18,- 
559,787, showing an increase of 
298,994 over the figures given in 
1923. A further indication is evi­
dent in the number of Catholic 
clergymen. There are now 23,169 
Catholic priests in the 104 archdio­
ceses, dioceses, and vicariate-apos- 
tolics listed in the General Sum­
mary. This shows an increase of 
614 over the total of last year. In 
1923 the Necrology of the clergy 
totaled 848. If to this figure we add 
the increase of 614, we obtain 967, 
which indicates that this number of 
seminarians were ordained last year, 
an increase of more than one hun­
dred over the newly ordained clergy 
for the year 1922. One hundred and 
ninety-nine new churches were 
established and 650 more students 
were enrolled in ecclesiastical sem­
inaries. The number of children 
attending Catholic schools is 1,998,- 
876, an increase of 65,956 pupils in 
one year.”

Since last year also the number of 
American bishops has been in­
creased by four. The Hierarchy of 
the United States now consists of 
four Cardinals, thirteen archbishops, 
and ninety-eight bishops

These figures are enlightening and 
consoling. They show forth the 
numerical strength of the Church in 
the United States, but they indicate 
also very clearly the vigorous faith 
of the people who have waxed 
strong in numbers because they 
have been energized by faith. Their 
numbers and their growth and 
progress furnish eloquent testimony 
for the faith that is in them.—The 
Pilot.
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Mature has designed for growth—egg, bone- 
marrow, malt .extract, organic iron and 
phosphates rich in vitamins—and the most 
delicate can assimilate it. That is why 
doctors all over the world employ ViroL

VIROL
. Sol* Importers : fcOVRIL, LTD., 2725, Park Avenue, Montreal a

Music is pre-eminently the science 
of the soul.—Father Burke.

m
Look! Mother

KIDDIES can't help getting 
dirty. Curious little hands 
touch anything—germ-laden 

though it may be. Chubby hands 
and knees are always being 
scratched, bruised and infected.

Lifebuoy Protects
Yet, no matter how dirty the 
kiddies get, mothers know the 
danger is past when rosy bodies 
arc washed with the creamy health- 
guarding lather of Lifebuoy Soap.
Lifebuoy contains an antiseptic 
health-ingredient which cleanses 
every pore, removing all impuri­
ties and leaving the skin sweet, 
refreshed and purified.
The wholesome odour vanishes in 
a few seconds, but the protection 
of Lifebuoy remains.

LEVER BROTHERS LIMITED 
TORONTO
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STEAMSHIP
TICKETS

ALL LINES

Tours — Cruises — Travel
Write for Information

MELVILLE
STEIMSHIP & TOURIST CO.

TORONTO

T^ighiTJhere
WHERE YOU CAN PUT 
YOUR HAND ON IT

keep a bottle of

Then—when the children develop 
Sore Throat, or Pain in the Chest— 
or there is a Bruise or Burn or Cut 
to Dress — you have the right 
remedy to ease the pain, allay in­
flammation, render the wound anti­
septic and start healthy healing.

$1.25 a bottle
at most druggists or sent postpaid 

by io6
w. F. YOUNG INC.

Lyman Building - - Montreal

GORDON MILLS

Louis Sandy
HABIT MATERIALS 

and VEILINGS
Specially Produced for the Use of
Religions Comminltles

Black, White, and Coloured 
Serges and Cloths, Veiling» 

Cashmeres, Etc.
Stocked in a large variety of widths 
and qualities. Samples forwarded 
on application.

LOUIS SANDY
Gordon Mills

STAFFORD, ENGLAND
Telegrams—Louisandl, Stafford 

PHONE No. 104

DON’T THROW Yonr OLD CARPETS AWAY
No matter how old, how dilapidated t we thoroughly clean and sterilize 
them ) tie a rope around them and send to us to bo made into the famous

“VELVETEX RUGS”
Reversible —they wear a life time. We have thousands of recommenda­
tions from our satislled customers.
In Montreal, Toronto, Windsor, Walker ville, Sandwich, Ford, St. Thomas, 
Sarnia and London our driver collects your carpets from attic, collar or 
off the floor.
Beware of imitations. Wo are the only makers of "Velvetex Rugs.” Wè 
pay express both ways on all orders everywhere.
See our guarantee in folder. Send for free folder No. 46.

CANADA RUQ COMPANY
VOlvetex Building:, Carling: St. LONDON, ONT.

Established 1009. 16 years building Public Confidence in quality.

Wonderful Egyptian Remedy 1Samaria” Prescription 
for drunkenness, which 

science has proved is a disease and not a habit and must be treated as such. 
Prohibition legislation does not help the unfortunates. “Samaria” may be 
given in Tea, Coffee, or any liquid food. Send stamp for trial treatment.

SAMARIA REMEDY GO.
DEPT. 21 142 MUTUAL STREET, TORONTO, ONT.

PEDLARS
METAL

CEILINGS

THE most artistic, * 
sanitary, durable 
and economical inter­

ior finish for lodge 
room», churchvR, school», 
and othrr public build­
ing», as well iim for homvH. 
Fireproof and crackproof.

WRITE FOR CATALOG L. C.

The PEDLAR PEOPLE Limited 
Established 18CI

0«h.w. . . Ontario

Central Commercial 
College

72» 3T. CATHERINE W.

MONTREAL
QUEBEC

The ideal course in
Pitman’s Shorthand

AND

“Touch” Typewriting
for ambitious students

Phone Up 7363

P. O’NEILL
PRINCIPAL

TAIT-BROWN OPTICAL GO.
Physical Eye Spécialiste

48 JAMES ST. N, HAMILTON 
PHONE REGENT 1414

BRANCH

BROWN OPTICAL CO.
223 DUN DAS ST. LONDON

FUNERAL DIRECTORS
John Ferguson A Sons

ISO KINO ST.
The Leading Undertakers A Em helmets 

Open Night and Day
Telephone House 373. Factory 648 I

E. C. Killingsworth |
FUNERAL DIRECTOR

Open Day and Night

889 Burwell St. Phone 8971

Established Over 30 Years

J. SUTTON & SON
Funeral Directors

621 Ouelette Avo. Windsor, Ont. 
PHONE SEN. 835

E. MULLEN
14 May St. LONDON, CANADA

Phone 67I4M
Painting and Paper
Hanging Samples on request

G. M. MURRAY
66 KING ST. LONDON

Expert Radiator and 
Auto Sheet Metal Worker

BRAZING OF ALL KINDS 
PHONES - NIGHTS 8448. DAY 232T

87 YONGE ST., TORONTO 
PHONE MAIN 4030

Hennessey
"Something More Than a Drug Store"

DRUGS CUT FLOWERS
PERFUMES CANDIES

Order by Phone — we deliver
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FOR

SALE ATi 
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k PRICE
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FZ7T ottter. Me/fu^Acro/rso sy~

T. C. Sullivan, Chatham, Ont.

Poultry & Eggs Wanted
Top Prices Paid

According to Quality

C. A. MANN & CO.
78 King St. London, Ont»

LONDON 
OPTICAL Co

Have Your Eyes Examined
Dominion Saving:» Building

Richmond St. Rhone 61 SO

F. STEELE
LONDON'S LEADING /

OPTOMETRIST and OPTICIAN
Dundas 8t., Opposite Loew'e 

and Allen’s Theatres
Branches at Kitchener and 8t. Thomas
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THE BREAKDOWN OF IRISH 
NEOOTIA TIONS 

The Anglo-Irish Treaty which gave 
Dominion status to the Irish Free 
State, also gave to Northern Ireland 
the option of retaining the status 
conferred by the Government of 
Ireland Act of 1920, “ subject to the 
necessary modifications.”

“ Provided that if such an 
address be so presented, a com­
mission consisting of three per­
sons, one to be appointed by 
the Government of the Irish 
Free State, one to be appointed 
by the Government of Northern 
Ireland, and one, who shall be 
Chairman, to be appointed by 
the British Government, shall 
determine in accordance with 
wishes of the inhabitants, as 
far as may be compatible with 
economic and geographic con­
ditions, the boundaries between 
Northern Ireland, and the rest 
of Ireland, and for the purposes 
of the Government of Ireland 
Act of 1920, and of this instru­
ment the boundary of Northern 
Ireland shall be such as may be 
determined by such commis­
sion."—Clause XI. of the Anglo- 
Irish Treaty.”
This provision of the Treaty is 

clear and unequivocal. It con­
stitutes a treaty obligation which 
the British Government is.bound to 
carry out. This Mr. J. H. Thomas, 
Colonial Secretary in the MacDon­
ald Cabinet, has publicly acknowl­
edged. However, he—like the rest 
of the world—would prefer an 
Irish settlement by agreement. 
Negotiations to this end, the 
cables tell us, have broken 
down. That perhaps was to be 
expected at this stage. For though 
Ulster has decided to remain under 
the British Government, and sends 
representatives to the British 
Parliament, she repudiates an Act 
of that Parliament that passed both 
Lords and Commons with ,t large 
majorities and received the Royal 
Assent ! And this is not all. Ulster 
recognized the Treaty by taking 
advantage of the right therein 
conferred to vote herself out of the 
F tee State, but repudiates the 
provision quoted above which specif­
ically qualifies that right. Ulster 
loyalty and Ulster logic are like 
that. Sir James Craig, the Ulster 
premier, has declared again and 
again that he will not appoint the 
Ulster nominee to the Boundary 
Commission. He thinks or professes 
to think that such refusal on his 
part will render the whole provision 
nugatory. That seems pretty chil­
dish. Though no provision was 
made in the Treaty nor in the sub­
sequent Act of Parliament ratify­
ing it to replace the Ulster nominee, 
that does not relieve the signatories 
of the Treaty from carrying out an 
essential treaty obligation. It was 
by an Act of the British Parliament 
that Northern Ireland was con­
stituted and given its present 
boundaries ; another Act of Parlia­
ment ratified the treaty provision 
for the rectification of these bound­
aries ; it may take another Act of 
Parliament to enable the Boundary 
Commission to function in spite of 
the obstinacy of Northern Ireland. 
That is all. When that is done 
negotiations for an all Irish settle­
ment will have a better chance of 
success. When the Six-County 
people are disabused of their chil­
dish notion that their obstinate 
refusal to appoint their member 
of the commission renders the 
British Government impotent to 
fulfil a treaty obligation they will 
be more likely to listen to reason. 
While this notion obsesses them they 
are likely to be as impervious to 
reason as a balky mule. So the 
first step toward settlement is to 
provide ways and means for the 
Boundary Commission to function 
with or without an Ulster repre­
sentative.

The bad old tradition of Protest­
ant Ascendancy is deep-rooted in 
Ulster. " For all civic purposes,” 
says the Irish Independent, ” Cath­
olics of the Six Counties are now to 
be outlawed.” At the coming 
County and District Council elec­
tions " the Catholic population will, 
in effect, cease to have the rights of 
citizens.”

"Even In districts and counties,” 
continues the Independent, “where 
Catholics are in an overwhelming 
majority they will no longer have 
the right to appoint a road-mender, 
nor will they have a voice in select­
ing a tenant for a laborer’s cottage. 
We doubt if the modern annals of 
any State can show such an example 
of shameless partisan legislation as 
that which is now to result in the 
exclusion of the Northern Catholics 
from the rights to which they are 
entitled. When the bomb and the 
bullet had deprived hundreds of 
Northern Catholics of their homes 
and their means of livelihood, the 
Belfast Parliament sought by more 
subtle means to complete the dis­
comfiture of the minority under its 
rule. It began by abolishing Pro­
portional Representation, the only 
system of election yet devised to 
give fair play to minorities as well 
as to majorities. But even with 
the abolition of P. R. the Belfast 
politicians found that there were 
large areas in which the Catholics 
could still return their nominees. 
That possibility has now been re­
moved. Working upon schemes 
drafted and advocated by the Par­
titionist election experts, electoral 
areas have been altered and so 
gerrymandered wherever the Cath­
olics were in a majority that their 
representatives are henceforth to 
be in a minority.”

This spirit of the Northern Pro­
testants aggravates the whole 
question in issue. Will rectification 
of the boundary in accordance with 
the Treaty settle the question ? It 
would relieve large Catholic areas of 
Orange tyranny ; but there would 
remain in any case a Catholic min­
ority helpless and hopeless under 
Orange domination with a more 
embittered Protestant Ascendancy 
spirit. Adequate provision for the 
protection of this minority is an 
important consideration.

There is little doubt that it was 
the confident hope of the English 
as well as the Irish signatories of 
the Anglo-Irish Treaty that North 
and South would come together and 
arrange amongst themselves the 
conditions on which Ireland would 
achieve national unity.

The chaotic conditions within the 
Free State caused by Republican 
lawlessness and rebellion destroyed 
that hope or at least postponed all 
chance of its realization. To Cana­
dians of Irish descent the interne­
cine strife fomented by the Re­
publicans is harder to understand 
than the ignorant and unholy pre­
judice of the North. It frustrated 
all hope of solving the one great 
national question for Ireland—the 
achievement of national unity ; and 
it went far to justify in the opinion 
of a world, whose sympathy had 
gone out to Ireland fighting for 
freedom, the attitude of Protestant 
Ulster ; without that justification 
Ulster’s present position would be 
impossible.

A Catholic Ulsterman writes to 
an English Catholic newspaper that 
the Boundary Commission can only 
profitably be used as a lever to force 
the North to come to terms ; but, 
when both the “Six Counties and 
England have been forced to see 
that there must be some arrange­
ment made, a solution should be 
sought otherwise than by an 
alteration of the Border.”

He continues :
"That solution must be such that 

it is clear to England and to all the 
world that the Six Counties are 
being treated with absolute fairness, 
that their prejudices, however un­
reasonable, are being respected, that 
they are not being placed under the 
heel of people whom they regard, 
stupidly, as their enemies, and that 
their religious opinions and special 
business interests are being in no 
way prejudiced.

“They may have no right to ask 
for such safeguards from their own 
people ; but the fact is that no solu­
tion that does not guarantee them 
can be carried in face of the trem­
endous forces arrayed against us. 
On the other hand, the solution 
must restore the unity of Ireland, 
which was jeopardised by De Valera 
and his plenopotentiaries in their 
eagerness for a sovereign status, 
which in the circumstances could 
only be a fictitious one.

“Futhermore, it must safeguard 
the rights of the oppressed Catholics 
who are suffering such shameless 
oppression at the hands of Sir James 
Craig's Government.”

If the Ulster minority has been 
given an exceptional position for 
bargaining, so, also, does Clause XII. 
of the Treaty give real power to the 
Free State. “ Rectification ” of 
the boundary Is a term coined prob­
ably to evade the Treaty condition. 
That will not be so easily done. 
Eamon Duggan, one of the Irish 
signatories of the Treaty and a 
member of the Free State Ministry, 
punctured any such little scheme, 
last week, in these words :

” The decisive words of Article 
XII. of the Treaty,” he said, “ are 
almost identical with those of the 
Treaty of Versailles regarding such 
plebiscite areas as Prussia and 
Upper Silesia. In those cases the 
words were interpreted to mean not 
a mere rectification of the frontier, 
but the drawing of a completely 
new frontier, in the delimitation of 
which the wishes of the inhabitants 
were given primary consideration. 
The same words in the Anglo-Irish 
treaty must be taken in the same 
sense.”

The enlightened Ulsterman, whom 
we have quoted, puts strongly and 
clearly the great difficulties of the 
situation. He knows whereof he 
speaks. And it is refreshing to find, 
in spite of his picture of the amaz­
ing prejudice against their Catholic 
fellow-countrymen, that he has a 
kindly appreciation of the virtues of 
his Protestant neighbors :

“In spite of much narrowness and 
intolerance these people, especially 
in the rural districts, have many 
virtues and fine qualities. They are 
industrious, honest according to 
their lights, orderly, and docile, and 
have a fine civic sense.”

And, after adisheartening account 
of the difficulties and obstacles in 
the way of an understanding be­
tween North and South, he adds :

“As against all this, however, 
there is the fact that Partition is 
recognized as an evil by both North 
and South, that it is terribly ex­
pensive, that it hampers business in 
the Six Counties even more than in 
the rest of the country, and that 
the natural tendency is towards 

eunion.”
So, though our newspapers car­

ried the story of the breaking down 
of negotiations between Dublin and 
Belfast, it is not too much to hope 
that at some time or other they will 
be resumed and will not break 
down.
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LEO XIII. ON CAPITAL AND 
LABOR 

By The Observer

Thirty years ago the great Pope 
Leo XIII. said :

“Associations of every kind, and 
especially those of workingmen, are 
now far more common than hereto­
fore. As regards many of them, 
there is no need at present to inquire 
whence they spring, what are their 
objects, or what the means they 
employ. There is a good deal of 
evidence, however, which goes to 
prove that many of these societies 
are in the hands of secret leaders, 
and are managed on principles ill 
according with Christianity and the 
public well-being ; and they do 
their utmost to get within their 
grasp the whole field of labor, and 
force workmen either to join them 
or to starve. Under these circum­
stances, Christian workingmen must 
do one of two things ; either 
join associations in which their re­
ligion will be exposed to peril, or 
form associations among them­
selves—unite their forces, and shake 
off courageously the yoke of so 
intolerable and unrighteous an 
oppression. No one who does not 
wish to expose man’s chief good to 
extreme risk will for a moment 
hesitate to say that the second 
alternative should by all means be 
adopted.

“Those Catholics are worthy of 
all praise—and they are not a few— 
who, understanding what the times 
require, have striven by various 
undertakings and endeavors to 
better the condition of the working 
class without any sacrifice of prin­
ciple being involved.. They have 
taken up the cause of the working­
man, and have spared no efforts to 
better the condition both of families 
and individuals ; to infuse a spirit 
of equity into the mutual relations 
of employers and employed ; to 
keep before the eyes of both classes 
the precepts of duty and the laws 
of the Gospel—that Gospel which, 
by inculcating self-restraint, keeps

men within the bounds of modera­
tion, and tends to establish her- 
mony amongst the divergent Inter­
ests, and the various classes which 
compose the State. It is with such 
ends in view that we see men of emi­
nence meeting together for discus­
sion, for the promotion of concerted 
action, and for practical work. 
Others again strive to unite work­
ingmen of various grades Into asso­
ciations, help them with their advice 
and means, and enable them to 
obtain fitting and profitable em­
ployment. The bishops on their 
part bestow their ready good will 
and support, and with their approval 
and guidance many members of the 
clergy, both secular and regular, 
labor assiduously in behalf of the 
spiritual and mental interests of the 
members of such associations. And 
there are not wanting Catholics 
blessed with affluence, who have, as 
it were, cast in their lot with the 
wage earners, and who have spent 
large sums in founding and widely 
spreading Benefit and Insurance 
Societies, by means of which the 
workingman may without difficulty 
acquire through his labor not only 
many present advantages, but also 
the certainty of honorable support 
in days to come. How greatly such 
manifold and earnest activity has 
benefited the community at large 
is too well known to require us to 
dwell upon it. We find therein 
ground for most cheering hope in 
the future, provided always that 
the associations we have described 
continue to grow and spread, and 
are well and wisely administered.”

When Pope Leo wrote that fam­
ous Encyclical in the year 1891, the 
spread of social revolutionary theor­
ies, under the influence of Marxian 
Socialism, was already very marked 
in Europe. Since then, the move­
ment has grown more aggressive 
in Europe, and has spread to the 
United States and Canada.

The workingmen of Belgium, a 
Catholic country, were for a time 
much under the influence of the 
fever. Agitators told them they 
were slaves, and promised them 
wonderful earthly happiness to be 
had by becoming Socialists—the 
same sort of promises that are 
being made on this side of the 
Atlantic today. The danger was 
offset in Belgium in accordance 
with the ideas expressed by Pope 
Leo.

Under the presiding Bishop 
Doutretour of Liege, three Con­
gresses of social workers were held, 
in 1886, 1887, and 1890, in which the 
most vital questions were exhaus­
tively studied and discussed. 
Canon Pettier, Professor of Moral 
Theology in the Grand Seminary of 
Liege, became the apostle of a 
social reform movement. The 
friends of reform founded a Dem­
ocratic Christian League, which, 
encouraged by the bishops, and 
keeping within the bounds of strict 
Catholic doctrine, bent all its 
energies on reform.

The Bishop of Liege formed 
among the secular priests a new 
order, called The Almoners of Labor, 
whose energies were entirely 
directed to bettering the lot of the 
working people.

pattern of Christian unity ? Is it an 
organization founded on com­
promise—la Christ, or Is God, to be 
supposed to surrender some 
phase of Truth, to accept what 
He quite clearly counts to be 
wrong, in order to maintain a unity 
which could not otherwise survive 7 
Such a suggestion is intolerable, 
and 1 shall be blamed for even hav­
ing mentioned it. But, if Christiana 
are urged to ‘sink differences,’ to 
put away what seems to them 
fundamental in order to secure a 
united organization we have a right 
to ask : Is compromise on things 
vital really consistent with the 
mind of Christ or with any mind of 
real honesty ? Compromise was no 
word in the vocabulary of Christ, 
nor is it in the vocabulary of any­
body who cares for truth.”

proceed Immediately with their 
scheme for the harnessing of the 
water power of the Lochaber 
district, and operations are ex­
pected to be in full swing during 
the coming summer. The under­
taking which is estimated to cost 
between three and four million 
pounds ought to go far towards 
relieving immediate distress, and 
opening a new era of prosperity 
for that much tried land. Of the 
details of this scheme we shall 
have something to say next week.

NOTES AND COMMENTS 
The Earl of Birkenhead contrib­

utes to a recent number of the Sun­
day Times, an interesting character 
sketch of the Archbishop of Canter­
bury. In the course of it he says : 
“The Archbishop of Canterbury 
cannot discharge his functions effi­
ciently if he be merely a great 
moralist and a great priest. He 
can, indeed, if he be also a man of 
imagination, exercise a far-reaching 
influence over that cosmopolitan 
body of theological thought which 
men call the Church of England. 
But he cannot govern, without des­
troying, his historic trust unless he 
has a genius for compromise.”

We have italicized the concluding 
words as setting forth, in a phrase, 
what is historically find constitution­
ally the predominating character­
istic of the English Church. Her 
proud boast of "comprehensiveness” 
is indeed but another word for com­
promise—compromise, alas, too 
often, as many quite recent in­
stances prove, of the most vital 
truths of Christianity. And yet 
this is the one ground on which the 
various Protestant bodies base their 
plea for unity.

We have run across an interest­
ing quotation or two on the present- 
day tendency towards Science- 
worship. Science rightly under­
stood has done much for humanity 
in the past and rightly guided is 
destined to do much more in future. 
But as every normal man knows 
there are many things of the most 
vital import which are beyond the 
reach of science, and before which 
science must in the long run bow 
her head. In a recently published 
book, “ Icarus, or the future of 
Science,” Bertrand Russell, the 
author, says : "Science has not 
given men more self-control, more 
power of discounting their passions 
in deciding upon a course of action. 
It has given communities more 
power to indulge their collective 
passions, but by making society 
more organic, it has diminished the 
part played by private passions. 
Men’s collective passions are mainly 
evil ; far the strongest of them are 
hatred and rivalry directed towards 
other groups. Therefore, at pres 
ent, all that gives men power to 
indulge their collective passions is 
bad. Tnat is why science threatens 
to cause the destruction of our 
civilisation.”

And, along the line of physical 
experiments, another English re­
viewer, Mr. Robert Blachford, dis­
cussing Mr. J. B. S. Haldane’s book 
“ Du-dalus,” says : " The conserv­
ative has but little to fear from the 
man whose reason is the servant of 
his passions, but let him beware of 
him in whom reason has become the 
greatest and most terrible of the 
passions. These are the wreckers 
of outworn empires and civiliza­
tions, doubters, disintegrators, 
deicides.”

We have refrained heretofore 
from touching upon the exodus of 
recent months from the Hebrides, 
as a subject almost too sad for 
comment. If, as the Edinburgh 
Scotsman affirms, the islands are 
“ over-populated to the extent of 
a third,” it is not, as the same jour­
nal opines, because they are incapa 
ble of supporting the population, 
but because the economic chaos of 
the Highlands and Islands as a 
whole, brought about, it should be 
added, by human greed and class 
legislation, has made them what 
they are. It is the old cry of the 
Canadian Boat Song, “ that a degen 
erate lord might boast his sheep.” 
That the present exodus, as other 
similar movements whether from 
Scotland or Ireland, within the past 
century and a half, entailed scenes 
harrowing in the extreme goes 
without saying. But we would 
rather look upon the brighter side 
which brings to Canada under Cath­
olic auspices what the Scotsman 
describes as so many " fine speci­
mens of manhood.”

On this subject Dr. T. R. Glover, 
a writer of some name in England, 
has this (slightly paraphrased) to 
say in the London Daily News : 
“What, then, is the unity of Christ 
and His Father, which is to be the

To extend the quotation : “It was 
heartening on Saturday to see the 
fine specimens of manhood that were 
setting forth on what will undoubt­
edly prove their greatest adventure, 
and one could not but notice, de­
spite the loud farewells and the 
tender, tearful leave-takings, the 
spirit of Christian resignation, 
which is perhaps the most sublime 
virtue to be found in this almost 
totally Catholic community. These 
men from the beautifully sounding 
islands of Barra, Benbecula, South 
Uist, and Eriskay had been striving 
for years to wrest ja meagre living 
from the rocky and ingrate insular 
soil, and only their love of the land 
and the strong ties of kinship pre­
vented them from abandoning the 
struggle long ago.”

There is promise nevertheless of 
better days for both the Highlands 
and Islands. It is announced that the 
British Aluminum Company are to

THE OREGON DECISION
THE PAROCHIAL SCHOOLS ARE 

ENTITLED TO PREVENTIVE 
RELIEF

Dr. Lyman P. Powell, Director. Educational
Department. Coamopolltan Magazine

Ever since The Oregon Compulsory 
School Law requiring all children 
in the grammar grades to attend 
Public schools was adopted, 
November 7, 1922, 1 have been say­
ing both in Bulletin and Editorial 
that a step had been taken which 
would have to be retraced. In the 
opening page in May Cosmopolitan 
I indicate that “ Public and Private 
schools are two blades” of the same 
scissors, and that in consequence 
both should be supported until our 
Public schools become at least so 
perfect that naturally there will 
nowhere be "yearning for a single 
Private school,”—a time not near at 
hand.

The appeal taken to the United 
States Court sitting at Portland, 
Oregon, has now been heard. Be­
fore an audience which packed the 
Federal courtroom the new law has 
lately been declared unconstitu­
tional, and the Governor, Attorney 
General, and District Attorney are 
restrained from enforcing it. This 
Federal decision may of course on 
appeal be set aside by the Supreme 
Court.

But few will expect this to occur 
who read the ctext in full. Colonel 
Sandy Beaver hopes our Supreme 
Court will have a chance to pass 
upon it. Like Dr. R. B. Gooden he 
seems sure this recent decision will 
stand any test. The decision ranks 
with the best in our history from 
John Marshall’s day to Supreme 
Justice Taft. It reveals both a 
human understanding and a legal 
knowledge rarely matched in any 
Court decision. It rests upon the 
solid principle many have expressed 
to me in interview that while the 
State has power to regulate, it has 
no power to destroy the education 
of the young.

This digest of the decision has 
been made possible by the courteous 
promptness of Brigadier-General, 
M. F. Davis of New York and Dr. 
Joseph A. Hill of Oregon, prominent 
in the controversy, in hurrying to 
me the text, the brief for the 
defense, a transcript of the pro­
ceedings and the newspaper reports. 
The decision in full outreaches the 
space conditions of the Bulletin. 
But the following summary and 
quotations will perhaps suffice to 
indicate the quality and significance 
of a decision which may rank with 
the Dartmouth Case.

The Oregon law, which was to 
take effect in 1926, allowed the 
State to exceed the limitations of its 
power. It took utterly away from 
Private schools their right and 
privilege to teach in the grammar 
grades. Thus it deprived them of 
their property without due process 
of law. " One does not have to 
await the consummation of threat­
ened injury to obtain preventive 
relief.”

“ The act could not be more 
effective for utterly destroying the 
business and occupation of private 
schools, if it had been entitled, an 
act to prevent parochial and private 
schools from teaching the grammar 
grades. This serves to emphasize 
the seriousness of the controversy. 
Indeed, the simile is no stronger 
than the argument for the adoption 
of the measure put it : A divided 
school can no more succeed than a 
divided nation. That such is the 
purpose of the act is obvious and 
incontrovertible."

The right of non-public schools 
to teach in the grammar grades and 
the right of parents to engage them 
to instruct their children the Court 
pronounces “ within the liberty of 
the 14th amendment.” This right 
would seem to be the more secure 
because " parochial and private 
schools have existed almost from 
time immemorial.”

“ Compulsory education being the 
paramount policy of the State, can 
it be said, with reason and justice, 
that the right and privilege of 
parochial and private schools to 
teach in the common school grades 
is inimical or detrimental to or 
destructive of that policy ? Such 
schools and their patrons have the 
same interest in fostering primary 
education as the State, and appro­
priate regulation will place them 
under supervision of school author­
ities, so they will not escape the 
duty of proper primary instruction. 
No one has advanced the argument 
that teaching by those schools is 
harmful or that their existence with 
the privilege of teaching in the 
grammar grades is a menace or of 
vicious potency to the State or the 
community at large and there 
appears no plausible or sound reason 
why they should be eliminated from 
taking part in the primary educa­
tion of the youth. It would seem 
that the act in question is neither 
necessary nor essential for the 
proper enforcement of the State’s 
school policy.”

“ The melting pot idea applied to 
the common schools ... is an 
extravagance In simile. A careful 
analysis of the attendance of chil­
dren of school age, foreign born and 
of foreign born parentage, at pri­
vate schools as compared with the 
whole attendance at schools, public 
and private, would undoubtedly 
show that the number is negligible, 
and the assimilation problem could 
afford no reasonable basis for the 
adoption of the measure.

The very purpose of placing the 
effective date so far ahead as 1926 
in order to give ample time for 
schools affected to adjust them­
selves to new conditions is really a 
confession that such schools will be 
hurt seiiously if not irreparably. 
The hurt has apparently already 
begun. The schools are already 
losing their patronage because “ the 
act is a statute duly adopted and 
promulgated.” " The injury being 
of a quality that is continuous and 
accelerating, it must be stayed if 
the ends of justice are to be met.”
“It is not denied that the State 

in its sovereign capacity, is en­
titled to the exercise of what are 
termed police powers . . . But 
there is a limit to their exercise. 
They can not be exercised arbi­
trarily and despotically nor unless 
there exists a reasonable relation 
between the character of the legis­
lation and the policy to be subserved. 
Nor is the State legislature the final 
judge of the limitations of the 
police power. Its enactments will 
be set aside when found to be 
unwarranted and arbitrary interfer­
ence with rights protected by the 
Constitution in carrying on a lawful 
business or occupation in the use 
and enjoyment of property. In 
other words, the exercise of the 
police power is subject to judicial 
review, and property rights cannot 
be ruthlessly destroyed by wrong­
ful enactment.”

No one questions the right of the 
State to a reasonable supervision of 
Public schools. “ The real test is : 
Has the State, through its legisla­
tive functions, the power, under the 
guise of police regulation, to deprive 
parochial and private school organ­
izations of the liberty and right to 
carry on their schools for teaching 
in the grammar grades ?”

“ Other questions have been pre­
sented, but, their decision not being 
necessary to a determination of the 
controversy involved, they are not 
considered.”

" The motion to dismiss will be 
denied, and a preliminary injunc­
tion will issue, restraining the 
defendants from threatening or 
attempting to enforce the act com­
plained against.”

The state may regulate, not
DESTROY, SCHOOLS WITH TEACHING 
POWERS AND PROPERTY RIGHTS.

“ Where will you shorten the arm 
of that power (Oregon Law) once it 
is conceded ? Why not extend it to 
secondary education, and then to 
collegiate education, and finally to 
university education ? For that 
power if it exists at all. can strike 
down the institution of Harvard or 
Yale, or any other that is conducted 
by private management, and allow 
the State and the Government a 
complete and absolute control of all 
education.”—From the argument of 
Mr. J. P. Kavanaugh against the 
Oregon Law of 1922.

THE KULTURKAMPF AGAIN 
THREATENS GERMANY

By Rev. Dr. Wilhelm Baron von Capitaine 
(Cologne Correspondent. N. C. W. C.|

^ The Kulturkampf against the 
Catholic Church threatens to de­
stroy what little of the Old Ger­
many war and revolution have left, 
Cardinal Faulhaber warns in a 
pastoral letter issued for the 
coming jubilee |of St. Corbinianus, 
Apostle of Bavaria. The Cardinal 
vigorously replies to recent attacks 
against the Church and points to 
the graves of thousands of Catholic 
dead in the War to prove the 
loyalty of Catholics.

"For the present, there remains 
to our people poverty and devasta­
tion,” says the pastoral. “What 
the four years of War has left has 
been almost destroyed by the five 
years of revolution, and what the five 
years of revolution has passed by is 
now threatened with destruction by 
the Kulturkampf against the Holy 
Church.”

Cardinal Faulhaber recalls, in 
denouncing the attacks on the Pope, 
that former Popes and Bishops have 
been assailed, but declares that to. 
attack the Catholic Church at this 
time, when the tombs of thousand 
upon thousands of Catholic dead 
mutely attest the loyalty to country 
of Catholics, is a crime that cries to 
heaven. _____

A GOOD FRENCH LAW

The two Chambers of the French 
Parliament have voted, in turn and 
thus rendered final, a new law in­
tended for the protection of the 
family. Introducing a new offense 
in the French penal code, this law, 
which was promoted by M. Louis 
Marin, present . Minister of the 
Liberated Regions, represses the 
“abandon of the family.” It per­
mits punishment of a man who, 
having deserted his home, leaves 
his wife and children without re­
sources. It also applies to children 
who voluntarily leave their parents 
destitute, etc.

Under the terms of this law, any 
person who has been sentenced to 
pay a pension to his wife, children 
or parents and who has voluntarily 
let more than three months pass 
without paying this pension will be

r
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held guilty of abandoning hie 
family and will be puniihed by im­
prisonment of from three months to 
one year or to payment of a fine of 
from 100 to ‘1,000 francs. Repetition 
of the offense will always be 
punished by imprisonment. Fathers 
and mothers condemned for aban­
doning their families may also be de­
prived of their rights as citizens.

CRIME OF OBSCENITY
JUSTICE FORD BRANDS IMPURE 

LITERATURE AS MENACE 
TO COUNTRY

Boston, April 26.—One of the 
features of the dinner of the Knights 
of Columbus, held here this evening 
was an address by Supreme Court 
Justice John Ford, of New York, on 
“The Crime of Obscenity.” Justice 
Ford, whose efforts on behalf of the 
Clean Books League have attracted 
nation; 1 notice, spoke in part as 
follows :

"With your kind permission 1 
shall address you upon a subject of 
first importance to America. While 
it is a moral subject, 1 shall not 
appeal to you as Catholics, nor go 
beyond those canons of fundamental 
morality which are recognized by 
the constitutions and the law of all 
the States and of the United States 
as vital to the preservation of the 
republic, and which are accepted by 
Protestants and Jews, and indeed by 
decent and patriotic men and women 
of every shade of religious belief, as 
well as by Catholics.

“But knowing the Knights of 
Columbus as I do, and familiar with 
the sublime code of morals rigor­
ously insisted upon by your great 
church, I felt confident that I should 
find a receptive audience here.

“This veteran army of practical 
Christianity which you represent 
has it within its power to extirpate 
the monstrous evil which is eating 
into the moral fiber of the rising 
generation. I mean the deluge of 
printed and pictured obscenity 
which has burst upon this country 
since the World War, and which is 
undermining the very foundations 
of Church and State alike.

A DELUGE OF OBSCENITY

“A deluge of obscenity engulfs 
the land, I have said. I do not ask 
you to take my word for it. 
appear for the people in their case 
against putrid prints. I call as my 
first witness Hamlin Garland 
writer of the first rank. In the 
New York Times Book Review of 
December 23, 1923, writing on 'Cur­
rent Fiction Heroes,’ he refers to 
young girls seen on Fifth Avenue 
"in flesh colored stockings, with 
bobbed hair and painted lips,’ and 
asks : "On what model do they form 
their manners ? What kind of 
mothers will they make ?’ Hamlin 
Garland finds the answer to these 
questions in the Theater Magazine, 
and quotes from it as follows :

“ ‘The drama today is a reflection 
of the condition of the world as left 
by the aftermath of the great War.
. . . The idle, profiteering,
thoughtless public wanted to be 
amused . . . the playwright who 
could attract and entertain the mob 
became the lion of the hour. He 
gave them plays in which prostitutes 
were the heroines. . . The red- 
lamp district was transferred from 
the “Tenderloin" to the stage. . .

" ‘A certain class of women play­
goers like to see the prostitute on 
the stage. Perhaps they see in the 
hectic heroine what they might have 
beeDinother circumstance!. Weak, 
unmoral, barren by principle, they 
let their empty-headed daugMern 
imitate the harlot in dress and 
manner, and their sons go to ruin

similar career. It is simply an 
effort to exploit prurient curiosity.
If houses of prostitution and resorts 
of vice are condemned by law and 
every possible effort made to sup­
press them for the good of the com­
munity, I see no reason why the 
vicious and filthy incldenta of the 
lives of the inmates of such Illicit 
resorts should be allowed to be 
spread before the public, young and 
old, in the printed page.’

"When a book like that can gain 
access to our homes by judicial 
decree, is there any wonder that 
the deluge of obscenity is submerg­
ing the country, for I repeat that 
so long as the source of supply re­
mains open no vigilance can prevent 
the foul publications which it emits 
from entering every State and 85% 
of them come from New York City. 
The demand for them is like that 
for bootleg whiskey and narcotic 
drugs.

And the shame of America is 
that it has become the literary gar­
bage dump of the world. Foreign 
writers whose works would not be 
tolerated in their own countries 
find a ready and profitable market 
here, where they are palmed off as 
foreign classics So bad have con­
ditions become that the postmaster 
general in his last annual report 
calls attention to the pernicious 
activities of foreign dealers in 
obscene matter. He goes so far as 
to recommend the active participa­
tion of the United States in an in­
ternational conference with the 
object of securing the cooperation 
of foreign countries in suppressing 
the traffic in books, pictures, and 
objects of a pornographic nature 
now coming to the United States 
from foreign countries.

"Last month six thousand foul 
books and three thousand obscene 
pictures in a single lot were cap­
tured making their way into the 
port of New York. When the boot­
leggers can ply their illicit trade so 
successfully as we know they do, the 
bookleggers can do so, too, and they 
are doing it in violation of the 
Federal statute declaring the im 
portation of obscene matter a crime 
punishable by a fine of $5,000 and 
imprisonment for five years, or 
both. There is an abundant and 
unfailing supply of printed deprav­
ity from foreign shores.
“LOATHSOME !” SAYS DISTINGUISHED 

WOMAN
“I asked a distinguished lady to 

read one of the books of which we 
complain and write me her opinion 
of it for publication. Here is her 
letter :

“ ‘I read at your request (naming 
the book.) It was the most loath­
some thing I ever did. The feeling 
was one of having walked through 
a filthy sewer, full of poison gas—a 
book of stupidity and vulgarity— 
beyond words to describe. I now 
know the necessity of just such a 
League as you have organized, and 
1 will do what I can to help.’ That 
letter was written Dy Mrs. Hamilton 
R. Fairfax, president of the Society 
of Colonial Dames.

“Canada shrinks from contact 
with the foul prints of this country. 
In the Canadian Bookseller and 
Stationer of recent date is printed 
a "black list’ which I hold in my 
hand of the publications barred 
from importation and distribution 
by our northern neighbor. The 
great bulk of them are published in 
the United States.

longer necessary, huge buildings 
which were none too big when they 
were built a few years ago.

Mrs. Virginia Crawford, a well 
known Catholic social worker, and 
for twenty-five years a member of 
the Marylebone Board of Guardians, 
says that the Marylebone work­
house, which at one time housed 
2,000 inmates, today has only 700 in 
spite of the fact that two work­
houses in nearby sections have been 
closed down.

This state of affairs has been 
brought about by the trend of 
recent legislation. The old age 
pension, which is granted to people 
over seventy, helped to empty the 
workhouses, in Mrs. Crawford’s 
opinion ; and if the pension age 
should be lowered, as is suggested, 
to sixty-five, the need of the work­
houses will be lessened still further.

Unemployment insurance and 
sick insurance benefits, which are 
payable under a compulsory national 
scheme, also tend to keep people 
out of the workhouses.

The matter goes further, for 
when the parents are not forced 
into the workhouses, their children 
are not forced into the Poor Law 
schools ; and therefore these schools 
are being depopulated.

It is not generally recognized in 
America that the much discussed 
" dole ” which is paid by the govern­
ment to the unemployed, is dis­
tributed under the insurance 
scheme to which the recipients con­
tribute whilst in employment.

HEADS OF DIOCESAN 
SCHOOLS CONFER

for her.’
“ ‘The 

that the 
heroines

italics are mine, but all 
editor says of abortive 
upon the stage can be 

applied to present-day fiction. The 
woman libertine is in process of 
glorification in book as well as in 
play. . . That such plays, such 
stories, are profoundly affecting 
the manners of our boys and girls 
cannot be disputed. . .’ ”

After quoting from an address 
delivered by George W, Ochs before 
the Women’s Christian Temperance 
Union a year ago, in which the pub­
lisher flayed “the forces now 
imperiling, through impure books, 
our moral values—yea, civilization 
itself,” Justice Ford continued ;

“My third witness should be 
known to most of you. He is Jus­
tice Victor J. Dowling of the Appel­
late Division of the Supreme Court 
of New York. His was the dissent­
ing vote when his court, consisting 
of five justices, by majority of four 
to one, reversed the conviction of 
Harper & Brothers for publishing 
and selling a filthy book. That was 
the decision which broke down the 
New York obscenity law in 1920, 
and opened the floodgate to the 
deluge of obscene prints which has 
inundated our State, and indeed the 
entire country, too, for no State is 
protected so long as the center of 
distribution in New York has free 
license to operate.”

This is what Justice Dowling 
had to say in his dissenting opinion :

“ ‘This book purports to be the 
autobiography of a common prosti­
tute It is filled with the revolting 
details of the author’s life in vari­
ous houses of ill fame in different 
sections of this country. It sets 
forth at length the physical and 
financial difficulties attendant upon 
her chosen means of livelihood, as 
well as her periods of successful 
operations. Her continued periods 
of drunkenness, her diseased con­
ditions, her cynical disregard for 
decency, are all narrated. The book 
reveals no purpose to act as a warn­
ing to others against embarking on

GOD S LAW DEFIED WITH IMPUNITY

“Plain talk on this subject is the 
need of the hour. Sin is an offense 
against God. Crime is a violation 
of man-made law. All sins are not 
crimes. Obscenity is a heinous sin. 
It is also a loathsome crime under 
the law of this and every other 
State as well as under the law of 
the United States. This crime is 
rampant today in America and is 
committed a thousand times daily 
by habitual criminals who defy the 
law of God and man with impunity. 
It is an abominable crime, for its 
effect is to deprave the minds, and 
pollute the souls of innocent chil­
dren, and to corrupt the morals of 
the whole people.

“American literature formerly 
was wholesome,ennobling,inspiring. 
We have fondly looked upon our be­
loved America as morally superior 
to European countries. It has now 
become the cesspool into which 
drains the foul sewage of degenerate 
foreign writings and pictures. We 
are becoming a byword in the mouth 
of all the world. What boots our 
great wealth and our material prog­
ress if our spiritual life is contami­
nated and debauched ? What judg­
ment would George Washington 
pronounce upon us for tolerating 
the abhorrent conditions in the 
great country of his untold sacrifice 
and infinite love ? I leave you to 
answer those questions in the light 
of these words from the Farewell 
Address :

“ ‘Of all the dispositions and 
habits which lead to political pros 
perity, religion and morality are 
indispensable supports. In vain 
would that man claim the tribute of 
patriotism who should labor to sub­
vert these great pillars of human 
happiness—these firmest props of 
the duties of men and citizens.’ ”

EMPTYING THE WORKHOUSES

The social changes in England 
have created a condition of affairs 
which is interesting political econ­
omists. In spite of the increase of 
unemployment, the workhouses are 
emptying and the Poor Law is being 
rapidly abolished. The Boards of 
Guardians, which are responsible 
for the relief of distress under the 
Poor Law, are closing down, as no

SUPERINTENDENTS’ WORK 
WARMLY PRAISED BY 

BISHOP SHAHAN
Washington, D. C., April 26.— 

Catholic education is passing rapidly 
from the nebulous, confused state 
in which it found itself only a short 
time ago, to a concise, firm and 
organized position which portends 
great progress, Bishop Thomas J. 
Shahan, rector of Catholic Uni­
versity, declared here Wednesday 
in his address of welcome to the 
Superintendents’ Section, Catholic 
Educational Association, which held 
its fifth semi-annual meeting at the 
University this week.

Forty-two members, a larger 
number than ever before, attended 
the meeting, which was declared to 
be the most interesting yet held.

Bishop Shahan was warm in his 
praise of the progress made in the 
diocesan schools and of the devotion 
of the superintendents. " There is 
reason to believe,” he said, “ that 
in the next decade most of the 
dioceses will be provided with 
systems of education, both secular 
and religious, which will lack little, 
if anything, of perfection. The 
final step will come when a univer­
sity education will be regarded as a 
duty.

“ I feel that every year your 
organization is growing in influence 
nnd possibilities,” continued Bishop 
Shahan, “ and it is not too soon to 
create a closer relationship among 
Catholic educational leaders. The 
diocesan superintendent is passing 
rapidly from the statue of an 
individual to that of an institution. 
No officer in the diocesan system 
today is more efficient, necessary 
and eager in his work than 
the diocesan superintendent. The 
effectiveness of the superintendents’ 
labors is shown in the increased 
number of children in the schools 
and in the general growth and 
elevation of the Catholic educational 
system. The Catholic University 
was proud to entertain them and 
glad to serve the highest interests 
of the Church through education, 
and thereby the highest interests of 
the nation.’’

The Rev. Dr. James H. Ryan, 
director of the Department of 
Education, National Catholic Wel­
fare Conference, on the opening day 
of the conference gave the superin­
tendents a comprehensive review of 
the legislative situation, as it 
affects Catholic education. He 
emphasized the tremendous backing 
some of the measures antagonistic 
to Catholic institutions have, and 
urged the strongest possible support 
in the educational counter struggle 
that is being waged by his depart­
ment in defense of Catholic inter­
ests. Dr. Ryan also bespoke co­
operation from the superintendents 
in Catholic High School Week, 
which will open shortly. He 
thanked those present for the 
“whole-souled cooperation" they 
have already given.

One of the most earnest discus­
sions of the meeting developed 
when Father John R. Hagan, at the 
end of his paper, suggested that the 
section might well turn its attention 
to the providing of better living 
conditions for Catholic school 
teachers. In some instances lack 
of sufficient facilities for exercise 
and incomplete household equip­
ment are militating against the 
health of the teachers, it was said 
in the discussion which followed. 
The section was shown to be 
united in the view that such condi­
tions wherever found should be 
corrected promptly. A discussion 
of teachers’ salaries, an outgrowth 
of the talk on health, revealed that 
a considerable start already has 
been made in raising the meager 
salaries these religious receive.

Diocesan normal schools, teachers' 
libraries in parish schools, a more 
standardized Catholic school curric­
ulum and physical training courses 
in normal schools were urged by 
speakers, and received general 
approval in the discussions.

SWISS CATHOLICS 
UNITED

By Dr. Frederick Funder 
Vienna (JorroHpondont, N. (J. W. 0.

Solid facts have just refuted the 
persistent declarations throughout 
Europe that a split was imminent 
between the two large wings of the 
Conservative party in Switzerland, 
the group which represents the 
Catholic interests in the country.

For many years, the Swiss Con­
servative Party has been made up 
of Catholics styling themselves the 
Conservative wing and those known 
as the Christian-Social wing. The 
chief divergence of the two groups 
lies in the fact the Christian-Social 
wing devotes itself particularly to 
the protection of the interests of 
laborers and emphasizes the social 
side of the party’s political program. 
Time and again, the Catholic press 
of Switzerland has denied rumors 
that the two wings were about to 
break up the party, but still the 
rumors persisted.

Now, however, the election for 
the High Council of the Catholic 
canton of St. G alien has definitely 
disproved the present crop of mis­
information. The Conservative and 
the Christian-Social Catholics cast 
their ballots in perfect accord, 
electing 77 Catholics where formerly 
76 held office. The Liberals elected 
67, the Social-Democrats 26, a gain 
of 2, and the Democrats 18, a loss 
of 8. The Swiss Catholic press is 
overjoyed at the new proof of Cath­
olic solidarity. The Hochwacht 
says :

"The Catholic program of the 
Conservative People’s Party, in­
cluding both Conservative and 
Christian-Social elements, once more 
has held good. It is a ques­
tion of life and death for 
the Catholic party that it contain 
both Conservative and Christian- 
Social elements. Separation of 
these elements would drive the Con­
servatives into the arms of fanatical 
reaction and the Christian-Socialiste 
to the powerful Socialist bloc. The 
Catholic idea would run the great­
est danger. Never, therefore, 
would a party leader think of doing 
away with the union by trying to 
have one element pull away from 
the other. If hot-headed persons on 
the right or left ever have spoken 
of such a separation, the leaders 
have promptly disavowed them.”

ment of the Catholic High School 
movement.”

Mr. Hurley declare! “ the chief 
objective of every young man ahould 
be an education ; a college course, if 
possible, but at least graduation 
from a high school.” “ Elemen­
tary school training," he adds, 
“ seems to satisfy too many bright 
young men, particularly many of 
our Catholic boys." Many young 
men, he says, imagine they are not 
promoted to higher positions 
because they are Catholics, but the 
chief reason is that they have 
missed the early opportunity of 
acquiring a foundation of knowl­
edge.

Archbishop Glennon appeals for 
the CathoNc High School as a 
protection against the lure of " the 
glamor, the vulgarities, the 
depravities of life ’’ to adolescent 
youth. He points out the high 
school's importance because it is at 
the high school age this lure is the 
greatest.

“ The youth now enrolled in our 
Catholic high schools are the 
potential Catholic religious and lay 
leaders of the future," Admiral 
Benson points out. “ It is incum­
bent on us to see that this number 
is constantly increased." Admiral 
Benson reminds that he who has a 
proper conception of his duties to 
iis fellow man and his obligations 
to God is a better citizen and mem­
ber of society, and recalls that the 
inculcating of these things is 
fundamental in the Catholic school.

Education which embraces an 
element of religion brings with it a 
spirit of self-sacrifice, a willingness 
to do something for others, toler­
ance toward opponents and a spirit 
of friendship toward all," Arch­
bishop Dowling declares in his 
endorsement of the movement.

Mr. Justice Stafford, in voicing 
his approval, says: "The Catholic 
High School movement commands 
my hearty approval.” It is " noth­
ing short of insanity ’’ to neglect 
educational opportunity, he declares.

WEEKLY CALENDAR

MORE HIGH SCHOOLS

CATHOLIC UNIVERSITY DANTE 
COLLECTION FURTHER 

ENLARGED

Washington, D. C.—A hundred 
volumes were added to the Catholic 
University’s Dante collection, al­
ready one of the finest in the 
country, by the gift to the univer­
sity of the entire library of the late 
Right Rev. Maurice F. Burke, 
Bishop of St. Joseph, Joseph J. 
Schneider, librarian of the univer­
sity, announces. Mr. Schneider has 
just completed sorting and classify­
ing the Burke library, which totals 
more than 8,000 volumes.

Bishop Burke some years ago 
gave to the university his Dante 
collection, and the hundred volumes 
now added are those he had collect­
ed since the gift. He was known 
as probably the foremost student 
of Dante in the country, and was 
president of the American Dante 
Society. The Catholic University 
Dante library now numbers about 
500 volumes. The other parts of 
the Burke library were found to be 
rich, particularly, in the depart­
ments of Literature and History, in 
both English and French, many 
volumes being in the latter 
language.

Five additional cases of books 
have been prepared at the univer­
sity for shipment to Japan to aid in 
the reconstruction of the library of 
the University of Tokio, which 
suffered greatly in the recent 
earthquake.______

FRENCH INDIGNANT AT TURKS 
FOR CLOSING SCHOOLS

ny people be found today who 
aid (‘

many
would do half as much 7 

"The number of churches has in­
creased, communications have im­
proved, but no one takes advantage 
of them. All in all, weekly attend­
ance at church has certainly dimin­
ished.”

BURSES

FOR CATHOLIC BOYS AND 
GIRLS URGED

Washington, D. C., April 25.—A 
ringing call to Catholics of the 
country to support the Catholic 
High School as “ essential to the 
work of Catholic education ” and 
an institution "established to serve 
the most precious interests of Cath­
olic youth ” has been made by Hi 
Eminence William, Cardinal O'Con­
nell, in connection with Catholic 
High School Week, which will be 
held May 11 to May 17. The Depart 
ment of Education, National 
Catholic Welfare Conference, is 
sponsoring the movement, in which 
more than 6,500 parochial schools 
and 2,000 academies, high schools 
and preparatory schools are expected 
to take part.

The movement has called forth 
earnest indorsement from the moat

& imminent members of the Catholic 
[ierarchy and laity. The Most 

Rev. John J. Glennon, Archbishop 
of St. Louis ; the Most Rev. Austin 
Dowling, Archbishop of St. Paul 
Edward N. Hurley, chairman of the 
U. S. Shipping Board during the 
War ; Admiral William S. Benson, 
Mr. Wendell Phillips Stafford, 
associate justice of the Supreme 
Court of the District of Columbia, 
and others have added their written 
encou ragement.

Cardinal O'Connell’s statement 
encouraging and blessing the effort 
is as follows :

“ The Catholic High School is 
essential to the work of Catholic 
education. If Catholic education is 
to fulfill its sublime mission, the 
distinctive Catholic training of the 
individual must be continued dur­
ing the entire period of intellectual 
and moral growth and development. 
At every stage of this vital process 
the contributing means and methods 
are identical and unchangeable.

“ The saving knowledge of Jesus 
Christ, the enlightening and 
strengthening power of divine 
grace, the inspiring examnle of the 
religious teacher, the clear presenta­
tion of God’s standards for human 
life—these are means used by 
Catholic education in the making of 
men and women of intelligence, 
virtue and character.

“ The need of these influences is 
imperative in the crucial years of 
adolescence. What guidance shall 
be given to the ardors and enthusi­
asms, the hopes and ambitions of 
restless, unsettled youth ? The 
truths of God must enrich the 
unfolding mind. The law of God 
must become the norm of con­
science. The sense of personal re­
sponsibility to God must direct and 
control conduct. A thorough Cath­
olic education is the perfect safe­
guard as youth makes its perilous 
advance into maturity of years.
“The Catholic High School has 

been established to serve the most 
precious interests of Catholic youth. 
Its existence is inevitable in the 
light of the principles of Catholic 
educational work. The constant 
increase of schools of this type is 
evidence of a holy and praiseworthy 
purpose to enlarge the field of 
action of the Catholic School. May 
God bless abundantly every effort 
and every sacrifice in the advance-

Sunday, May 11.—St. Mammertus 
Archbishop of Vienne in Dauphine. 
He is noted for having instituted 
the fasts and supplications called 
the Rogations. On one occasion 
when a fire was ravaging the city 
and had defied the efforts of man to 
put it out it was miraculously 
quenched through the prayers of 
the Saint.

Monday, May 12.—St. Epiphanius, 
Archbishop, was born in Palestine 
about 810. He entered the monastic 
life and built a monastery in his 
native country. Later he became 
Bishop of Salamis and died in the 
year 408.

Tuesday, May 18.—St. John the 
Silent, was born of a noble family 
at Nicopolis in Armenia in the year 
454. Not only to shun the danger 
of sin by the tongue, but also out of 
sincere humility and contempt for 
himself, and the love of interior 
recollection and prayer, he very 
seldom spoke, and when obliged to, 
it was always in a very few words 
and with great discretion. Against 
his will he was consecrated Bishop 
of Colonian in Armenia but later 
resigned this dignity and lived for 
many years doing menial work in 
the monastery of St. Sabas without 
revealing his identity. When it was 
proposed to ordain him to the 
priesthood, John revealed himself. 
For forty years he confined himself 
to his own cell.

Wednesday, May 14.—St. Pachom- 
ius, Abbot, was a young heathen in 
the Roman army when he was con­
verted through the kindness of the 
Christian inhabitants of a village 
through which he passed. He built 
a monastery to which vast multi­
tudes flocked. His visions and 
miracles were innumerable.

Thursday, May 15.—Sts. Peter 
and Dionysia were two martyrs at 
Lampsacus, a city of Asia Minor, 
during the Decian persecutions. 
St. Peter was the first to suffer. 
He was bound to a wheel and 
tortured and then beheaded. 
Dioysia, a young virgin, was 
martyred a short time later.

Friday, May 16.—St. John Nepo- 
macen, was born in answer to a 
prayer in 1880. His parents con­
secrated him to God and his holy 
life as a priest led to his appoint­
ment as a chaplain to the Court of 
the Emperor Wenceslas. When the 
Emperor sought to force the Saint 
to reveal the confessions of the 
Empress, St. John refused and was 
cast into prison and tortured. He 
was set free for a time but finally 
was seized and cast into the river 
by command of the Emperor.

Saturday. May 17.—St. Paschal 
Baylon, from the days of his child­
hood was marked out for the serv­
ice of God. He entered the 
Franciscan Order in which he 
remained a humble lay brother. 
He was distinguished for an ardent 
love and devotion to the Blessed 
Sacrament. Unlettered as he was, 
he was accounted a master of 
theology and spiritual science. He 
died in 1592.

Paris, France.—A most painful 
impression has been created in 
France by the news that the Turks 
have closed the French and Italian 
schools of Constantinople, even 
though these schools would have 
accepted the removal of religious 
emblems.

Several papers are demanding 
the intervention of the Paris Gov­
ernment and the Labre Parole, In 
particular, asks : "Will France 
permit such an iniquity ?”

The Semaine Religieuse of Paris 
has published a letter from a promi­
nent Turk, whose name is withheld. 
The letter, which was addressed to 
Cardinal Dubois is, in part, as fol* 
lows :

“As a Turk and as a former stu­
dent of St. Joseph’s College at Kadi- 
Keuy and of the Commercial Insti­
tute directed by the Brothers of the 
Christian Schools, where I got my 
bachelor’s degree of secondary edu­
cation and the superior diploma of 
commerce, I wish to declare that 
during the ten years I spent in 
those institutions I was able to 
appreciate the great value of the 
education given by those unselfish 
and devoted men who always re­
spected with the most perfect 
tolerance the beliefs of their stu­
dents who belonged to other relig­
ions. No pressure was ever exerted 
to make us take part in religious 
ceremonies or in the teaching of 
catechism or the history of the 
Catholic Church.”

FOR EDUCATION OF PRIESTS 
FOR CHINESE MISSIONS

What is a Burse? A Burse or 
Free Scholarship is the amount of 
$5,000, the annual interest of which 
will perpetually support a student, 
till he becomes a Priest and Mission­
ary in China. The sum itself is 
securely invested, and only the 
annual interest is spent for the 
training and education of a candi­
date for the priesthood. When one 
student has reached his goal, 
another takes his place, and thus 
all who are contributing towards 
the Burse Fund will be helping to 
make Missionary Priests long after 
they have been laid to rest. Imagine 
how much good can be done by one 
priest and missionary ! Let every­
one, therefore, according to his 
means contribute to such a meri­
torious work. Send your contri­
butions to Father Fraser care of 
the Catholic Record.

QUEEN OF APOSTLES BURSH
Previously acknowledged $3,047 18 

ST. Anthony’s burse 
Previously acknowledged $1,685 96 
Friend, Perth.................... 2 00

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION BURSH

Previously acknowledged $2,923 98
COMFORTER OF THE AFFLICTED BURSH
Previously acknowledged $461 46
ST. JOSEPH, PATRON OF CHINA BURSH
Previously acknowledged $8,275 88 
Friend, Fairfield................ 1 00

BLESSED SACRAMENT BURSH
Previously acknowledged $601 06 
Friend, St. John, N. B .... 5 to

ST. FRANCIS XAVIER BURSE
Previously acknowledged $408 80

HOLY NAME OF JESUS BURSE
Previously acknowledged 1829 00 

HOLY SOULS BURSH

Previously acknowledged $1,804 89 
John J. Macdonald, St.

Mary’s, Ont................... 10 00
LITTLE FLOWER BURSE

Previously acknowledged $1,218 69
In Memory of Mary...........  1 00
Miss C. T. MacDonald,

Brook Village................. 1 00
SACRED HEART LEAGUE BURSH 

Previously acknowledged $3,126 70 
Mias C., T. MacDonald,

Brook'Village.................
Mrs. S. A. MacAdam,

West Somerville, Mass.
S. H. League, Chapleau,

Ont., (per Mrs. H. E.
Cote)...............................

1 00

10 00

27 00

DEPLORE EMPTINESS OF THE 
"REFORMED" CHURCHES

Paris, France.—The Protestant 
review Le Christianisme Social 
carries an article under the signa­
ture of M. Paul Passy, deploring 
the tendency of the faithful of the 
Reformed Church to abandon pub­
lic worship.

“We can have no illusions as to 
the fact. Statistics have been com­
piled on this subject in England, 
Switzerland and America. I have 
not the figures at hand, but I know 
that they all show at least a relative 
decrease. I do not know whether 
the same work has been done in 
France, but it is sufficient to open 
one’s eyes to observe that things are 
about the same here.

"This is the case more or less 
everywhere and under the most 
varying circumstances. Crowds 
are no longer seen thronging to hear 
a well-loved preacher and on the 
other hand the Protestant churches 
in the various quarters and in the 
suburbs are often empty. In the 
country, in the districts of old 
Huguenot descent, the older people 
say that in their childhood people 
would walk six kilometers in any 
weather to go to church. Could

For May 
Investment

To those with funds now in hand 
for investment or with funds 
which will be shortly available, 
our new investment list, which 
is now ready for distribution, will 
be found of interest.

This list contains a wide selection 
of securities of Canada’s prov­
inces, cities, towns and industrial 
corporations together with an 
attractive list of odd amounts. 
Yields range from 5% to 7.20%.

Canadian dividend and interest 
payments during May will approx­
imately be 845,000,000. As a 
large portion of these funds 
together with other available 
funds will be seeking investment, 
we suggest that selections be 
made as early as possible.

Copy of May Investment 
List on request

AE-AMES&CO
DfPfNOABiX MVCSTMEHTS - CSTAMltSMEO

MOHTRtAL TORONTO »™ W*
VICTORIA.B.C. CHICAGO. ILL

THE CATHOLIC CHURCH 
EXTENSION SOCIETY

DONATIONS 
Previously acknowledged $7,554 87 

MASS INTENTIONS
R. J. C„ Grand Falls......  1 00
A. McC., Windsor...........  10 00
Mrs. J. Burgess, Montreal 1 00 

Contributions through this office 
should be addressed

Extension,
Catholic Record Office, 

London, Ont.

Many of Canada*s Finest Homes
ARE NOW 
HEATED BY

Spencer
Self - Feeding

Boilers
giving a service un­
heard of before their 
introduction, and by 
burning Anthracite 
Buckwheat coal, sav­
ing thousands of dol­
lars annually to their 
owners.

The SPENCER is the most efficient boiler known 
for burning any size or grade of coal, coke or oil.

Write or Phono Us for Catalogue 
We Are At Your Service

The Spencer Healer Company ol Canada, Ltd.
MONTREAL
71 St. James St.

TORONTO
68 Adelaide St. East

WINNIPEG
186 Portage Ave. East
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FIVE MINUTE SERMON
■1 HKV. WILLIAM OKMOUY, D. D.

THIRD SUNDAY AFTER 
V EASTER

THE KNOWLEDGE OF OUR RELIGION
“ Thou art My beloved Hon : in Thee 1 am 

well pleated." (Luke 111. 22.i

It »t first sight appears strange 
that God the Father should have 
expressed His delight in the 
person of Christ. He was God’s 
Son—therefore, God—and hence, 
necessarily must be perfect in 
all His qualities. Whatever per­
fection was found in the Al­
mighty Father—and it was infinite 
—existed in no less a degree in Jesus 
Christ Himself, who was of the sub­
stance of the Father, begotten from 
all eternity. A moment's reasoning 
is enough to convince any one of 
this truth.

In a sense, this statement from 
God the Father was needed. Not, 
however, because there could be any 
real, well-founded doubt concerning 
the infinite perfections of Christ, 
but because the people needed this 
instruction, in order that they might 
have the proper idea of Christ and 
of the truth of His mission. They 
were yet infants in Christianity. 
The sublime truths regarding it and 
its Author had to be taught them, 
so that they could grow into strong 
adults in the knowledge of their 
faith Christ appeared to be a 
human being like themselves, and 
they might have considered Him 
only a simple man. So God, His 
Heavenly Father, made it clear to 
them that He was His Son. This 
action of God the Father was also 
a consolation to Our Saviour in His 

. humanity. He was doing His 
Father’s work well, both as God and 
as man. As God He enjoyed the 
beatific vision and no happiness on 
earth could come to Him that would 
be new. But as man He could 
suffer ; He could, as it were, yearn 
for a word of cheer and apprecia­
tion from His Father, to accomplish 
whose ends He had descended to 
earth. It was, therefore, a demon­
stration of God's goodness, both in 
sight of the peop'e and before His 
divine Son, when He said those 
sweet encouraging words to Christ.

But it was also done for another 
reason, with another purpose in 
view. It was to serve as practically 
a command to us to learn well who 
Christ is, and to become familiar 
with the doctrines of our faith. In 
other words, we must take an in­
tellectual pleasure and delight in 
the great truths that God has re­
vealed to us, through His divine 
Son. These revelations were not 
made known to us in order to be 
forgotten, nor was there lacking on 
the part of God an intention that 
we take a lively interest in them. 
We must realize their importance, 
for they are the noblest of all 
truths, and our minds may profit­
ably dwell a lifetime upon them. 
It is true that they may not help 
us in our material welfare, but we 
never should forget that there is 
a higher, spiritual welfare to be 
kept always in view. We must en­
deavor to learn everything we can 
relating to it, in order to attend 
to it in the best way possible. We 
were made principally for this latter 
life, and we have the eternal com­
mand to value it more highly than 
the material. In other words, we 
must care more for our souls than 
for our bodies.

It is not pleasant to note the 
numbers of people of all classes, 
even Catholics, who are ignorant of 
so many of the great truths of God 
and religion. And it becomes more 
unpleasant to observe how the 
majority of them make no real 
attempt to step from their ignor­
ance into light ; nay, it is quite 
evident that they have no such 
desire. The heart does not occupy 
itself with the things of which it 
knows little or nothing. Attach­
ment comes really from knowledge. 
The knowledge upon which we base 
our attachment may sometimes be 
false ; but even then the attachment 
remains until this fact becomes 
known to us. With regard to relig 
ious truths, they cannot be false, 
since God is their author, and the 
love we form for them never can 
discover any reason for its discon­
tinuance. Through these truths, in 
a certain sense we pass to the love 
of God, whose infinite qualities of 
amiability never can be anything 
but true. This mutual affection is 
so strong that it never will lessen, 
unless we render false the qualities 
that cause God to love ilk as friends, 
or destroy their goodness. Where 
there is no interest manifested, or 
even only a passing one, no real 
love is found. So it is true of our 
connection with God. And what are 
we, bereft of God’s love ?

We can not exactly blame all 
those who are ignorant of the Faith, 
since many never were given oppor­
tunities of learning it. They may 
have lived in distant places, which 
were but seldom visited by a priest. 
Some have been prevented from 
learning the truth through the 
negligence of their parents. But 
this can not be said of those who 
are ignorant of their religion in the 
present generation. Literature, 
treating all the phases of our holy 
faith, and written in language that 
all can understand, is within easy 
reach at a nominal price. There 
are numerous Catholic publications, 
overflowing with instruction for old 
and young, which can be brought 
into the home at regular intervals 
at little expense. There are the 
sermons of the pastors, and of mis­
sionaries who come at regular 
periods, to instruct and arouse the 
people. All these help wonderfully

in this direction. In the rectories, 
instruction will be given cheerfully 
and willingly to any one who needs 
It. For the young, there are the 
parochial schools, the maintenance 
of which necessitates sacrifices 
being made by teachers and people. 
Yet how many send itheir children 
to other schools where they are 
never taught, even indirectly, any­
thing that would tend to lead their 
thoughts toward God and religion. 
Ignorance today regarding the 
tenets of religion is in the most 
cases due to carelessness and sin. 
It is no wonder that so many will 
stand by deaf, dumb, and mute, 
when they should be raising a voice 
of defense ! And how can it be 
otherwise, for, not having weapons 
with which to fight their enemies, 
they must yield. Shame on them ! 
Christ has said that He who refuses 
to confess Him before men He 
would not confess before His Father 
in heaven. Those who fail to con­
fess Him through culpable ignor­
ance are no doubt as guilty as those 
who fail to do so through negli­
gence.

Let Catholics arm themselves for 
the fight against ignorance, errors, 
and prejudice, by filling their minds 
with the truths of their religion, 
and, as far as possible, with solid 
reasons for the faith that is in 
them. Their interest, too, in the 
God who made them and who they 
expect will reward them, should 
urge them on to the work necessary 
to acquire this knowledge. To be 
good Christians, in the true sense of 
the word, they must be acquainted 
with their religion. Otherwise they 
become like quacks in the worldly 
professions, though even lower, for 
the latter make a pretense at true 
knowledge and often deceive people 
into believing them The quack 
Christian, however, can do nothing, 
for sincerity and love of his great­
est of blessings should be his only 
arms ; but these he is absolutely 
unable to have if God’s grace reigns 
not in his heart and a true knowl­
edge of religion dwells not in his 
mind. _____

MOTHER’S DAY
RECALLS GLORIOUS HISTORY 

OF THREE GREATEST 
MOTHERS

Denver Catholic Register

Mother’s Day !
What a wealth of meaning is 

summed up in the word Mother ! 
The Church has a ceremony called 
canonization when, after long in­
vestigation, one of her children con­
spicuous for holiness of life and 
virtue is declared to be among the 
saved in heaven, and worthy of 
special honor. But there is another 
form of canonization with which we 
are all familiar — the canonization 
of our own mothers in our hearts. 
When a grown man or woman thinks 
of virtue, it is generally in connec­
tion with Mother.

God loves this trait in us. He 
has given us the special command 
to honor our fathers and our 
mothers, and He has given His 
Church a very special devotion to 
His Mother. The Catholic Church 
loves Mothers’ Day, because it re­
calls to her children’s minds the 
Great Mother whose memory the 
faithful so tenderly treasure all 
during this month. The Blessed 
Virgin Mary could truly be called 
the Mother of God, because she was 
the Mother of Jesus Christ, who 
was the eternal Second Person of 
the Blessed Trinity become man. 
She was the Mother of God, because 
she was the Mother of a Person who 
is God. That Person is our second 
Adam, our Father in the spiritual 
life, and because she is His Mother, 
Mary is the Mother of us all.

She was sinless, never having 
been stained in the slightest way. 
She was, therefore, the special 
Queen of Mothers. We love to 
think of our mothers as angels of 
purity ; sweet souls who would 
sacrifice everything but God for 
us. Mary was such a Mother.

Perhaps the next greatest mother 
in Christian history was St. Monica. 
Her beloved son Augustine, had 
fallen into the heresy of the Mani- 
cheans and was leading a life of 
wretched immorality. For many 
years she prayed and wept for him, 
and although he even dared to 
insult her in order to escape her 
importunities, her prayers won out, 
and he became, like her, one of the 
greatest saints who has ever adorned 
the Church. *' Such a mother !” he 
says of her. And well he might ; 
for as great writers have declared, 
she bore him twice, once in the 
womb, once in the spiritual life.

Going back into the Old Law per­
haps the greatest mother we meet 
was that of the Machabees. “ Now 
the mother was to be admired above 
measure,” says the inspired word 
of God about her, (II, Mach. 7, 
20-21.) “ and worthy to be remem­
bered by good men, who beheld her 
seven sons slain in the space of one 
day, and bore it with a good cour­
age, for the hope that she had in 
God ; and she bravely exhorted 
every one of them in her own lan­
guage, being filled with wisdom : 
and joining a man’s heart to a 
woman’s thought.” They were going 
to death as martyrs for the Jewish 
religion, then the true Church. 
“ And last of all after the sons, the 
mother also was consumed.” His­
tory does not record a braver 
spectacle, with the single exception 
of Mary’s vigil at the foot of the 
cross, while the Son of God hung 
dying and a mob of maybe a million 
people surged around insulting 
Him. The supreme palm of bravery 
among women, therefore, goes to 
two mothers. Could anything be

more sublime than the tribute of 
the Holy Ghost to the Machabees’ 
mother—” joining a man’s heart to 
a woman’s thought ?”

It is true, indeed, that the life of 
a consecrated virgin is the noblest 
a woman can lead, as St. Paul dis­
tinctly teaches, but the mother in­
stinct is so noble that the reward 
in heaven for the faithful queen 
of a family must be vyy high. 
What more glorious picture is 
there than that of a mother and 
child ? William Gilmore Simms, 
the poet, says on this :
The wind blew wide the casement, 

and within— •
It was the loveliest picture ! — a 

sweet child.
Lay in its mother’s arms, and drew 

its life,
In pauses, from the fountain—the 

white round
Part shaded by loose tresses, soft 

and dark,
Concealing, but still showing, the 

fair realm
Of so much rapture, as green 

shadowing trees
With beauty shroud the brooklet. 

The red lips
Were parted, and the cheek upon the 

breast •
Lay close, and, like the young leaf 

of the flower,
Wore the same color, rich and warm 

and fresh :—
And such alone are beautiful. Its 

eye,
A full blue gem, most exquisitely 

set,
Looked archly on its world—the 

little imp.
As if it knew even then that such 

a wreath
Were not for all ; and with its play­

ful hands
It drew aside the robe that hid its 

realm,
And peeped and laughed aloud, and 

so it laid
Its head upon the shrine of such 

pure joys,
And, laughing, slept. And while it 

slept, the tears
Of the sweet mother fell upon its 

cheek—
Tears such as fall from April skies, 

and bring
The sunlight after. They were tears

of joy ;
And the true heart of that young 

mother then
Grew lighter, and she sang uncon­

sciously
The silliest ballad-song that ever 

yet
Subdued the nursery’s voices, and 

brought sleep
To fold her sabbath wings above its 

couch.

THERE ARE NO TABLETS JUST 
AS GOOD AS DR. NORVALL’S 

STOMACH AND TONIC 
TABLETS

When you ask your dealer for a 
bottle of Dr. Norvall’s Stomach and 
Tonic Tablets insist upon getting 
them. Some dealers may tell you 
that they have tablets just as good 
as Dr. Norvall’s but when you try 
them you will find they do not 
possess the tonic and laxative prop­
erties of Dr. Norvall’s Stomach- 
and Tonic Tablets.

Druggists throughout Canada 
recognize their merits and they now 
admit Dr. Norvall’s Stomach and 
Tonic Tablets are in a class by 
themselves.

Mr. H. V. Mercer, Druggist of 
Lindsay, Ont., says : “ For consti­
pation, biliousness and sick head­
ache Dr. Norvall’s Stomach and 
Tonic Tablets have no equal.”

Mr. W. H. Semple, Druggist of 
Cobourg, Ont., says that he recom­
mends Dr. Norvall’s Stomach and 
Tonic Tablets because he feels it is 
his duty to recommend what will 
give the best results.

They are sold at 28 cents per 
bottle, and if your dealer does not 
keep them in stock we will mail 
them to any part of Canada or New­
foundland for 26 cents a bottle or 
five bottles for one dollar.

Take no substitutes and insist 
upon getting Dr. Norvall’s Stomach 
and Tonic Tablets.
Address,
The Dr. Norvall Medical Co., Ltd., 

168 Hunter Street,
Peterborough, Ont,

AT THE THRESHOLD OF 
CHRISTIANITY

Floyd Keeler in America

While denominations here have 
been discussing the terms on which 
they would consider uniting with 
one another, while they have been 
setting forth all sorts of programs, 
all preceded by an “If, some of 
them even suggesting that they 
would unite with Rome, if only the 
Pope would resign or something of 
that sort, while all their well-mean­
ing but futile schemes have been 
going up in the air, their represen­
tatives in the foreign mission field 
have been taking some very practi­
cal steps along these lines. With 
them it is not merely an academic 
question, nor has it been even a 
matter of greater efficiency in 
administration alone, it has been a 
matter of life and death. “The 
heathen in his blindness” is not 
always such a dumb fetish worship­
per as we have at times been wont 
to think. The mere fact that he is 
not a Christian does not prevent the 
intelligent East Indian or Japanese 
or Chinaman from being quite on a 
par with hie Western neighbors in 
his knowledge in general, or even of 
religion in particular. In India 
especially the Christian is met by a 
well-educated gentleman who says 
qujte calmly and with a sense of

superiority that he is a Hindu 
because Christianity seems to him 
too much concerned with material 
advantages and too little concerned 
with the soul of man ! No wonder 
that those denominations which lay 
the greatest stress upon what they 
are pleased to designate as "practi­
cal Christianity” are confronted 
with the necessity for some sort of 
change in their methods. Moreover 
the almost unholy rivalry which is 
all too evident between sects repels 
rather than attracts the non-Chris­
tian.

We arc so accustomed In this 
country to the idea of keen compe­
tition along every line that we 
deprecate the existence of those 
rival systems only when there is a 
manifest overcrowding of a field, 
and only where world prudence 
dictates the withdrawal of some, or 
the merging of other sects, does the 
problem come home to us. In the 
mission field, however, problems too 
large for any single denominational 
group to handle effectively are 
bound to arise, and the baneful 
effect of interdenominational strife 
must be kept in the background, if 
converts are to be made at all. The 
mission leaders have realized these 
things and have set about with no 
small degree of statesmanship to 
remedy them.

Several problems at once confront 
a person who advocates anything 
which looks like a reunion among 
the scattered forces of Christen­
dom. All agree that such a reunion 
is desirable, even essential, but few 
agree as to the terms upon which it 
may be brought about. And not 
only does this come into prominence 
one had almost said, loom up as an 
impassable barrier, when the ques­
tion of reuniting the separated 
bodies to form one organic whole 
comes up, but it obtrudes itself 
even when cooperation is the point 
at issue. How great a difficulty it 
is, and what steps have been taken 
to overcome it, are ably set forth in 
two articles which appeared in the 
International Review pf Missions 
for October, 1928, entitled "Is 
Identity of Doctrinal Opinion 
Necessary to Continued Missionary 
Cooperation?” and “The Practica­
bility of Missionary Cooperation in 
the Face of Doctrinal Differences.”

In the second of these the Angli­
can bishop of Bombay sets forth 
certain minima without which, to 
his way of thinking, there can be 
no measure of cooperation. He 
says :

“I do not see how cooperation in 
propagating the belief in Jesus 
Christ as the determining factor in 
life can possibly be carried on 
together by persons who affirm Him 
to be God, and others who deny that 
He is God . . . Missionary coopera­
tion in any sphere is cooperation in 
bringing to men a revelation about 
God, and, before we can cooperate 
in doing that, we must agree in 
general what revelation of Himself 
God has made and we are to 
preach.”

These, which appear eminently 
reasonable, are the bishop’s answers 
to certain questions which were 
raised in these articles, and Dr. 
Robert E. Speer, who wrote the 
first-named paper has much the 
same to say. Though he has not 
hesitated to set forth the difficulties 
he has found, he believes that

“Any institution whose work does 
not involve divisive doctrinal issues, 
it would seem, might as truly be a 
cooperative undertaking, providing 
the cooperators trust one another 
as fellow-Christians, as that those 
parties should go out to China or 
India on the same steamship.”

And even where doctrinal ques­
tions do divide he feels that in 
“cooperative missionary undertak­
ings and associations identity of 
opinion on the whole body of Chris­
tian doctrine is not requisite,” 
though, in his view, it is essential 
that all “should hold a fundamen­
tally unitary faith in and about our 
Lord Jesus Christ as He is set forth 
in the New Testament,” and what 
he means by that is further made 
clear when he states his own belief. 
Speaking in the third person he 
tells us

“He accepts the whole of Chris­
tianity as set forth in the New 
Testament. He believes unquali­
fiedly in every article of the 
Apostles’ Creed. No language is 
adequate to state his conception of 
Christ. He believes that He is more 
and greater than any words can 
ever express, “the Word made 
flesh,” God incarnate, reconciling 
the world to Himself, the only 
Saviour, our Lord and our God. 
He believes in the truthfulness of 
the record of Christ's life, including 
His miracles, and rejoices with 
great joy in the miracle of the 
Virgin birth, and of the real resur­
rection of Christ and of His future 
personal advent.”

But, he rather woefully con­
cludes, “I am afraid this may seem 
to many very antiquated and 
unmodern."

It would seem, therefore, as 
though anything approaching or­
ganic unity among the various non- 
Catholic bodies is, indeed, remote, 
but in their mission interests they 
are already finding it possible to 
join together in various pure phil­
anthropic, educational or medical 
enterprises, and out of these are 
growing up native“united Churches” 
which are developing a nationalistic 
tone in the Christianity of their 
respective countries and are becom­
ing a force which must be taken 
into consideration. We cannot 
wave these phenomena aside as the 
ebullitions of an immature enthusi­
asm. TJiey are the practical 
expression of an earnest desire, an 
intense yearning for what the
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Health Restored by 
I The Fruit Treatment

Fourteen years ago, Mr. James S, 
Delgaty, of Gilbert Plains, Man., 
was a nervous wreck. His system was 
shattered by Nervous Prostration, 
and he was reduced in weight from 
170 to 115 pounds.
i He wrote on May 15th, 1917, 

“Every medicine I tried proved uselt -s 
until a friend i ml need me to take 
'Fruit-a-tives.’ I organ to mend at 
once. After using this fruit medicine 
for three months, 1 was back to normal. 
1 have never had such good health 
as I have enjoyed the past six years. 
We are never without a boxof‘rruit- 
a-tives* in the house.”

Writing again on September 27th, 
1923, Mr. Delgaty says, “1 stand by 
my letter to you in 1917—I still 
recommend ‘Fruit-a-tives’."

“Fruit-a-tivcs" is a complete fruit 
treatment—being made of the juices 
of fresh ripe fruits and tonics.

25c. and 50c. a box—6 for $2.50— 
at druggists or sent postpaid by Fruit- 
a-tives Limited, Ottawa.

Oriental converts see as a necessary 
fundamental in the Christian 
religion, unity. That they are 
misguided in their efforts to reach 
it, is. unfortunately, only too true, 
but that they will reach something 
that satisfies them in this regard is 
very evident, and if they do reach 
that stage of satisfaction apart 
from that Divine unity which the 
Catholic church alone knows, then 
we shall find ourselves confronted 
with an obstacle far greater than 
any which now meets us. A united 
Protestantism in the mission field 
will be a formidable antagonist, not 
only in its active opposition to the 
Catholic system, but also in its 
breeding of self-satisfaction, and in 
its consequent inability to see the 
necessity for anything further.

Now is the time, if ever, to show 
the excellencies of the Church's way 
before this cooperative movement 
gains too much headway. The 
opportunity is before us. Our mis­
sionaries are the only ones who can 
point the way, and because Catholic 
missionaries from English-speaking 
lands are the ones who have the 
most knowledge of the conditions 
which have brought about cooper­
ative associations and movements, 
they are the men who must take the 
lead in showing the “more excellent 
way,” the Divine Plan. It is, per­
haps, the greatest thing they have 
to do, yet they must choose just the 
right occasion for doing it. In this 
theirs is a situation of great delicacy 
and we must support them even 
when we do not know exactly why 
they are doing the things they do. 
The plain duty of every American 
Catholic is to give to his missionary 
representative every ounce of spir-

PROVINCE of ONTARIO
DEPARTMENT OF MINES

Ontario’s Minerals
The Province of Ontario contains 407.262 

square miles, over three times the area of the 
tiiitish Isles. Seventy per cent, of this vast 
area is underlain by pre-Cambrian rocks, which 
are p e eminently the metal-bearing formation 
of this part of Canada. Much the larger part 
of the Province lies no th and west of Lake 
Nipissing. The goldfields of Porcupine, Kirk 
land Lake, the silver mints of Cobalt. South 
Lorrain and Gowganda. the r ickel-copper 
deposits of Sudbury, which supply over 90 per 
cent, of the world’s nickel, testify to the 
mineral richness of this vast region.

Much of this great, stretch of territory is only 
paitly explored and it is doubtful whether a 
more attractive field for nrospcc' o s can be 
found anywhere in the world The Climate is 
invigorating, there is plenty of wood and 
water, and though the "ountry is broken, there 
are no mountain*, the max mum altitude being 
about 2,000 foot. The prospector can go any­
where in his canoe. Working couditions 
underground are most favourable, the rock is 
solid, water gives little trouble, and the 
temperature varies from about 43 degrees F. in 
winter to 48 F. in summer.

This vast area known to contain practically 
every commercially valuable metallic and non- 
iuetallic mineral, excepting coal and tin, only 
awaits development.

In 1923 Ontario’s total mineral output was 
valued at $68,281 658.

To the end of 19^3 Ontario had produced 
metallic wealth worth $718,90 ,000, the value of 
the principal metals in round figures being as 
follows :
Silver........$227,700,000 Pig Iron........$85,200,000
Nickel ....... 18M,3IXI.0<'0 Copper .........64,300 000
Gold ...........  128 400,000 Cobalt............11,9(K),0OO

Dividends and bombes aggregated $.‘13,641.978 
for gold companies and $89,942,054 for silver 
companies.

For lists of publications, maps, geological 
reports on mining areas and other information 
apply to
Hon. Charles Mc^rea or Thos W. Gibson 

Minister of Mines, Dep. Min. of Mines, 
Toronto, Canada.
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Coal .

Eventually — Why Not Now ?

Patterson Coal & Coke Co.
( J. F. NOLAN )

William St. and C. N. Ry.

Phone 2207 LONDON. ONT.

itual support he can lend, and also, 
which is of even more immediate 
need in this case, make it possible 
to have our missions so materially 
equipped that they can, without 
making; themselves seem ridiculous, 
point to their excellencies in the 
very matters which the non-Catholic 
cooperative plans seem to produce 
and at the same time can show un­
questioned superiority in the things 
of the Spirit. Thus they can appeal

to the better classes among the 
native populations with some assur­
ance that their plea will be heeded.

A quarter of the world’s popula­
tion is at the threshold of Christian­
ity. Will it be the spurious kind 
which has all but broken down in 
Western lands within the past 
decade or eo, or will it be that vari­
ety which we know Christ Himself 
left us to perpetuate ? You, reader, 
have no small share in determining.
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MANUFACTURERS OF

CERAMIC MOSAICS FOR FLOOR
AND WALLS ...........

OUR TILE HAS BEEN USED ON THE FOLLOWING JOBS :
KNIGHTS OF COLUMBUS BUILDING, MONTREAL

Swimming Pool and Toilets
CHURCH OF THE SACRED HEART, MONTREAL

( Vestibules and Aisles > and
NUMEROUS ROMAN CATHOLIC SEMINARIES AND HOSPITALS

MJBEROIDAROOFINGS/
50 DIFFERENT GRADES

The RUBEROIDC2,m,ted
Y/ie Pioneer Manufacturers of QualiUj Roofings

OFFICES OFFICES AND FELT AND
AND WORKS WAREHOUSES BOARD MILLS
MONTREAL TORONTO PORT NEUF PQ

Stained Glass 
Windows

For Commemorating 
Lives and Events are 
Most Satisfactory...

Special Designs 
Sent on Request
Estimates cheerfully given

The Hobbs Manufacturing Co.
LIMITED

MONTREAL TORONTO 
LONDON WINNIPEG

MACMILLAN’S

Pocket Classics
Bound in Cloth Full Notes Uniform in Size
ARMES—Old Enxli.h Ballads 
ADDAMS—Twenty Years at Hull House 
ADDISON—Sir Roger De Coverley 
ANDERSEN—Fairy Tales
ARNOLD—Sohrab and Rustum and Other

AUSTEN—Pride and Prejudice 
AUSTEN—Sense and Sensibility 
BACON—Essays
BAKER - Out of the Northland 
BLACKMORE—Lorna Doone 
BOSWELL—Life of Johnson (Abridged) 
BROWN, ED.—Epoch Malting Papers in Amer­

ican History
BROWNING, MRS—Poems 
BROWNING, R.—Shorter Poems 
BRYANT—Shorter Poems 
BURKE—Speech on Conciliation 
BURNS—Poems
BAKER—Short Stories and Collections 
BULWER-LYTTON—Last Days of Pompeii 
CARHART—Selections from American Poetry 
CARLYLE—Essays on Burns and Burns’

CARLYLE—Heroes and Hero Worship 
CARROLL—Alice in Wonderland 
CHAUCER—Prologue, Knightee Tale, Nonnee 

Priest’s Tale
CHURCH—Story of the Iliad 
CHURCH—Story of the Odyssey 
CHURCHILL-The Crisis 
CHURCHILL—Richard Carvell 
COLERIDGE—Ancient Mariner 
COOPER—The Deerslayer 
COOPER—Last of the Mohicans 
COOPER—The Spy 
COULT—Letters from Many Pens 
COWPER AND GRAY—Poems 
CURTIS—Prue and I 
DANA—Two Years Before the Mast 
DEFOE—Robinson Crusoe, Pt I.
DEFOE—Robinson Crusoe, Pt. II.
DE QUINCEY—Essays 
DE QUINCEY—Opium Eater 
DICKENS—Christmas Carol and Cricket <m 

the Hearth
DICKENS—Tale of Two Cities 
DICKENS—David Copperfield, Pt. I. 
DICKENS—David Copperfield, Pt H. 
DICKENS—Oliver Twist 
DRYDEN—Palamon and Arcite 
ELIOT—Adam Bede 
ELIOT—Mill on the Flose 
ELIOT—Silas Marner
BOYNTON—Poems for Secondary Schools 
EMERSON—Early Poems 
EMERSON—Essays 
EMERSON—Representative Men 
FRANKLIN—Autobiography 
FUESS & SANBORN—English Narrative 
FUESS & SANBORN—Oral Reading Poems 
GASKELL—Cranford
GATHANY, ED.—American Patriotism in 

Prose and Verse
GOLDSMITH—The Deserted Village 
GOLDSMITH—Vicar of Wakefield 
GRIMM—Fairy Tales 
HALE—Man Without a Country 
HALL—Select Orations 
HART—Representative Short Stories 
HAWTHORNE—Grandfather’s Chair 
HAWTHORNE—House of the Seven Gablee 
HAWTHORNE—Mosses from an Old Manse 
HAWTHORNE—Twice Told Tales 
HAWTHORNE—Tanglewood Tales 
HAWTHORNE—Wonder Book 
HAWTHORNE—Scarlet Letter 
HELLER—Early American Orations 
HOLMES—Selections from Poems 
HOLMES—Autocrat at the Breakfast Table 
HOMER—Iliad. Translated 
HOMER—Odyssey, Translated 
HUGHES—Tom Brown’s School Days 
IRVING-Alhambra 
IRVING—Life of Goldsmith 
IRVING—Sketch Book

IRVING—Tales of a Traveller
IRVING—Knickerbocker History of New Yerk
JOHNSON—Arabian Nights
KEARY—Heroes of Asgard
LAMB—Essays
LAMB—Tales from Shakespeare 
LINCOLN — Writings 
LOCKHART- Life of Scott 
LONDON—Call of the Wild 
LONG FE LLO W— Evangeline 
LONGFELLOW—Hiawatha 
LONGFELLOW-Miles Standish 
LONGFELLOW—Tales of a Wayside Inn 
LOWELL—-Vision of Sir Launfal 
LOWELL—Earlier Essays 
MACAULAY—Essay on Addison 
MACAULAY7—Essay on Clive 
MACAULAY—Essay on Milton.
MACAULAY—Essay on Warren Hastings 
MACAULAY—Life of Johnson 
MACAULAY—Poems 
MALORY—Morte d’Arthur 
MILTON—Cornus, etc.
MILTON—Paradise Lost, I., II.
McCONNELL—Southern Orators
PALGRAVE—Golden Treasury
PARKMAN—The Oregon Trail
PITTENGER—Collection of Short Stories
PLUTARCH—Three Lives
POE—Poems
POE—Prose Tales
POPE— Homer’s Iliad
POPE—Homer’s Odyssey
POPE—Rape of the Lock
POTTINGER—English Essays
READE—Cloister and The Hearth
ROOSEVELT—Writings
ROSSETTI. C—Selected Poems
POOLE—The Harbour
RUSKIN—Crown of Wild Olives and Queen 

of the Air
RUSKIN—Sesame and Lilies and King of The 

Golden River 
SCOTT—Ivanhoe 
SCOTT—Kenilworth 
SCOTT—Lady of the Lake 
SCOTT—Lay of the Last Minstrel 
SCOTT—Quentin Durward 
SCOTT—Guy Mannering 
SCOTT—Rob Roy 
SCOTT—Talisman 
SHAKESPEARE—As You Like It 
SHAKESPEARE—Coriolanus 
SHAKESPEARE—Hamlet 
SHAKESPEARE—Henry V.
SHAKESPEARE—Julius Caesar 
SHAKESPEARE—Macbeth 
SHAKESPEARE—Merchant of Venice 
SHAKESPEARE-Romeo and Juliet 
SHAKESPEARE—Tempest 
SHAKESPEARE—Midsummer Night’s Dream 
SHAKESPEARE—Richard II. 
SHAKESPEARE—Richard III. 
SHAKESPEARE—King Lear 
SHELLEY and KEATS—Selected Poems 
SHERIDAN—Rivals and School for Scandal 
SOUTHEY—Life of Nelson 
SULLIVAN—Washington to Wilson 
SPENSER—Faerie Queen, I.
ST. JOHN—Narrative and Lyrical Poems 
STEVENSON—Travels with a Donkey and 

Inland Voyage 
SWIFT- Gulliver’s Travels 
TAPYOCK—Modem Reader’s Chaucer 
TENNYSON—Idylls of the King 
TENNYSON—In Memoriam 
TENNYSON—The Princess 
TENNYSON—Shorter Poems 
THACKERAY—Henry Esmond 
THACKERAY—English Humorists 
THOMPSON- Hound of Heaven 
THOREAU—Walden 
TREVELYAN- Life of Lord Macaulay 
VIRGIL—Æneid
WASHINGTON—Farewell Address 
WHITTIER-Snowbound

Price 55c. Each Postpaid 
THE CATHOLIC RECORD London, Ont.

I



I

MAY 10 1024 THL CATHOLIC RECORD
SEVEN

CHATS WITH YOUNG
MEN

MOTHER'S WAY
Tender, gentle, brave and true, 
Loving us whate’er we do !
Waiting, watching at the gate 
For the footateps that are late, 
Sleepless through the hours of 

night
Till she knows that we’re all right, 
Pleased with every word we say— 
That is ever mother’s way.
Others sneer and turn aside 
Mother welcomes us with pride ; 
Overboastful of us, too,
Glorying in all we do.
First to praise and last to blame. 
Love that always stays the same 
Following us wher'er we stray— 
That is ever mother’s way.
She would grant us all we seek, 
Give her strength where we are 

weak.
Beauty ? She would let it go 
For the joy we learn to know.
Life ? She’d give it gladly, too,
For the dream that we pursue ;
She would toil that we might 

play—
That is ever mother’s way.
Not enough for her are flowers,
Her life is so bent with ours 
That in all we dare and do 
She is partner, through and 

through ;
Suffering when we suffer pain, 
Happy when we smile again,
Living with us night and day,
That is ever mother’s way.

- Edgar A. Guest

MOTHER’S DAY
It is something more than a pretty 

sentiment that has inspired the ob­
servance of Mother’s Day. It is a 
solemn admission on the part of 
those who direct the trend of 
national celebrations, of the great 
and growing need of a more inten­
sive cultivation of the ideal of 
motherhood. It is an expression of 
the age old, time worn, and oft 
confirmed conviction that a country 
depends for its perpetuity and 
prosperity more on the purity of its 
ideal of home then upon the 
strength of its armies or the wealth 
in its exchequer. The glorification 
of motherhood expressed in such a 
nationwide tribute as Mother’s Day 
is, therefore, a sign of the victory of 
the spiritual over the material, of 
the triumph of right over might, and 
in a sense of the conquest of sound 
standards of the old fashioned mor­
ality over the pernicious principles 
of theorists and faddists.

The wistful haunting longing in 
the old ballad has ever had a pecul­
iar , fascination for the average 
man. In the depths of his own soul, 
and in the quiet solitude of his 
heart, he pleads with childish 
eagerness, “Backward, turn back­
ward, 0 time in thy flight, make 
me a child again, just for tonight.” 
Time will turn backward tomorrow 
and make all men children again 
for a day. They will be trans­
ported on Mother's Day back again 
to what must ever be for every 
normal man the sanctuary of his 
highest hopes, the shrine of his 
deepest devotion, and the first and 
strongest inspiration, his mother’s 
knee.

Happy shall we be as a nation if 
like children, we learn there the 
precious lessons so lovingly imparted- 
The ideal of motherhood is one of 
the nation’s strongest bulwarks. 
Her sweet influence penetrates 
everywhere and ennobles and in­
spires to great actions and heroic 
deeds. All our material prosperity 
must rest upon the adamantine 
foundation of pure homes, watched 
and tended by good mothers. Be­
hind our far flung battle line 
during the War was an army of 
little gray mothers watching, wait­
ing and praying for their boys, 
across the sea, behind the holy priest 
or nun, in church, school, or hospital, 
back of the statesman in the halls 
of legislation, the jurist in the court 
of justice, doctor at the bed side of 
the sick and dying, and the laborer 
at his bench or the captain of indus­
try in his office, stands another 
figure that guided him in his early 
days of childhood, watched over him 
in the dangerous days of youth, and 
now inspires him in his life’s work— 
his mother.

Every saint in history without ex­
ception had a good mother. Every 
great man has acknowledged, what 
Lincoln so well expressed when he 
said : “All I am in life, I owe to my 
mother, God bless her.” These 
mothers lived quiet simple lives for 
the most part, undismayed by the 
rushing legions of the army of pleas­
ure, unenvious of the riches, the 
honors, and the pleasures of the 
world, content only to fulfill their 
sublime vocation of motherhood as 
God intended and as their con­
sciences directed. The empty world 
heeds not their coming or their 
going, but the angels in Heaven 
smile upon them and God welcomes 
them with joyous praises to their 
Heavenly Home. Mother’s Day is 
one to be observed with praise and 
thanksgiving, with prayer and with 
love for the holy ideal it ennobles 
and hallows. But in a wider sense, 
we cannot ennoble, we cannot 
hallow, this one day, for to those 
who understand, every day is 
Mother’s Day.—The Pilot.

DAILY MASS
“Every day, sweet son, hear Holy 

Mass!” So spoke the father to his 
son in the days of chivalry. It was 
the usual custom in those days, 
Leon Gautier tells us in his beauti­
ful book on that period.

Good Christians are eager to hear 
Holy Mass every morning. Like the 
mother of St. Augustine who says

himself, that she never failed to
assist daily at the altar, they neglect 
nothing in order thul to sanctify 
the beginning of their day. Had 
they numerous occupations they 
rose earlier, thus rendering their 
action more meritorious.

During his stay at Laghouat, Gen­
eral Sonis, of whom Galiifet says : 
"No one knew better than he both 
how to command and how to obey,” 
never failed to assist at the Holy 
Sacrifice of the Mass. “At six and 
half, or seven,” wrote one of his 
attaches, "he went to church in 
silence. I used to accompany him.” 
This habit never interfered with the 
discharge of the important duties 
of his position On the contrary, 
he found himself better disposed to 
fulfill them, as is always the case 
when one has peace of conscience 
and joy of heart.

“The best way to economize 
time,” wrote Ozanam, "is to lose 
about half an hour every morning 
at Mass.

La Roche Jacquelein, expressing 
the same thought in his military 
language said : “When I have lost 
my morning Mass, 1 live on a lower 
level all the rest of the day.”

The illustrious Daniel O’Connell, 
in spite of hie busy life, was con­
stantly faithful to this pious habit, 
and the Dominican, Father Burke, 
declares that what greatly contrib­
uted to his entering the priesthood 
was the devout attitude of the great 
Irish orator during Holy Mass.

THE BLUFF THAT FAILED
A successful old lawyer tells the 

following story anent the beginning 
of his professional life : “I just had 
installed myself in my office,” he 
said, “had put in a phone and had 
preened myself for my firstclient who 
might come along when, through 
the glass of my door I saw a 
shadow. Yes, it was doubtless some 
oue to see me. Picture me, then, 
grabbing the nice, shiny receiver of 
my new phone and plunging into an 
imaginary conversation. It ran 
something like this : ‘Yes, Mr. S.,’ 
I was saying as the stranger 
entered the office, Til attend to 
that corporation matter for you. 
Mr. J. had me on the phone this 
morning and wanted me to settle 
a damage suit, but I had to put him 
off, as I was too busy with other 
cases. But I’ll manage to sandwich 
your case in between the others 
somehow. Yes. Yes. All right. 
Good-by.’ Being sure, then, that I 
had duly impressed my prospective 
client, I hung up the receiver and 
turned to him. ‘Excuse me, sir,’ 
the man said, ’but I’m from the 
telephone company. I’ve come to 
connect your instrument.’ ”—Catho­
lic Universe.

OUR BOYS AND GIRLS
QUEEN OF THE MAY

Children, children trooping fair 
Through the fields this morn in 

May—
All the silver daisies there,
With the buttercups so gay.
Seem to whisper, sweet and airy,
“ Love our Queen ! love Mary !”
All the lilies of the lea
Shake and shake their snowy bells ;
And the violets, with glee,
Murmur through the dewy dells ;
“ Be not of your service chary— 
Love our Queen ! love Mary !”
Till the crocus, full of light,
And the golden dandelion,
Seem to turn their faces bright 
(Like the stars of old Orion,I 
Breathing from their blossoms 

fairy—
“ Love our Queen ! love Mary !”
Down the field and past the brook, 
Through the wood the whisper 

runs—
Sweetest words in Nature’s book ! 
Ever chant them, blessed ones,
Ever swell that chorus airy,
“ Love our Queen ! love Mary !”

—Eleanor (J. Donnelly

MARY’S MONTH
If all the words that have been 

written concerning the Blessed 
Mother of God could be gathered 
together and printed in one book, 
what a remarkable volume it would 
be.

From New Testament times and 
before has Mary been a predominant 
figure throughout the world. 
Writers of every age have paid 
tribute to her. Thousands of lines 
of verse have been penned in her 
honor, some of these by the greatest 
poets the world has known. In 
Dante’s Divina Comedia many 
references to Mary may be found :
There suddenly I seemed 
By an ecstatic vision wrapt away ; 
And in the temple saw, methought, 

a crowd
Of many persons ; and at the 

entrance stood
A dame, whose Sweet demeanor did 

express
A mother’s love, who said, “ Child, 

why hast thou
Dealt with us thus? Behold thy 

sire and I
Sorrowing have sought thee,” and 

so held her peace ;
And straight the vision fled.

But while much has been written 
to the glory of the Queen of May, 
unfortunately there are many 
people who sneer at Catholic devo­
tion to the Blessed Mother. These 
sacrosanct ones contend that our 
love for Mary verges on the idol­
atrous. The fault-finders insist 
that we “worship” the Immaculate 
Mother of the Redeemer. We are 
accused of putting the Mother 
before the Son. Catholics know 
how foolish, not to say malicious, 
these contentions are. To deny,

however, seems to be futile. The
minds of the critics are so thor­
oughly saturated with the prejudice 
of the ages that to argue is, in 
great measure, waste of precious 
time.
«Catholics do not worship Mary. 

They do know, however, that in her 
they have a mediator who Is all- 
powerful with her Divine Son. The 
earnest ’client of Mary need have 
little fear concerning eternity. She 
hears the supplications of her 
devoted clients ; she pities and she

8leads. Thus it is that every good 
atholic is devoted to Mary and 
goes to her for favors that, if asked 

for in humility and faith, are almost 
always granted, provided they are 
for our good.

And here we are once more at the 
gateway of Mary’s month. Long 
years ago it was Florence McCarthy 
who wrote :
My heart is waiting, waiting for the

May ;
Waiting for the pleasai.t rambles 

where the fragrant hawthorn 
brambles

With the woodbine alternating that 
scent the dewy way ;

0 my heart is weary waiting, wait­
ing for the May.

In Rudyard Kipling’s volume of 
poems, “ The Seven Seas,” will be 
found this verse :
0 Mary pierced with sorrow, 

Remember, reach and save 
The soul that goes tomorrow 

Before the God that gave ;
As each was born of woman,

For each, in utter need.
True comrade and brave foeman, 

Madonna, intercede.
And so it goes throughout the 

literary world. Poets, Catholic and 
non-Catholic, have written words of 
praise and prayer to the Blessed 
Virgin. Nor have writers of prose 
withheld their tributes, zstc’ o 

During (he approaching month of 
our Mother, why should not all 
Catholics show by their devotion 
that they are real lovers of the 
Queen ? In every church through­
out the world there will be May 
devotions. Her altars will be 
dressed in the flow»rs of May and 
made beautiful in other ways. 
Thousands will gather every even­
ing to pay tribute to her. There 
are other thousands who should do 
so. Why not forget the more friv­
olous pleasures of life for a short 
month and devote a little more time 
to thought of the Blessed Mother in 
Heaven ?

“O purest mother, whose heart 
was pierced with the sword of 
sorrow let thy anguish plead for me. 
Draw me close to the bosom of thy 
mercy, and hold me until the storms 
of life are past. Do this for the 
sake of thy divine Son.”

It was St. John Damascene who 
prayed to Mary thus : “ O Mother 
of God, if I put my confidence in 
thee, I shall be saved. If I am 
under thy protection I have nothing 
to fear ; for to be devoted to you is 
to have certain arms of salvation, 
which God gives only to those whose 
salvation He wills in a special 
manner.''—Catholic Sun.

FUNDAMENTALISM IS 
NOT FUNDAMENTAL
Because of the Fundamentalists' 

defense of the Virgin Birth of our 
Divine Lord, Catholics must not con­
sider that the principles are also 
the principles of the Catholic Church. 
It may even be doubted whether 
the agitation, that this association 
of Christians is carrying on, is help­
ing rather than hindering the pro­
gress of religion. Anything that is 
intrinsically illogical can hardly be 
welcomed as an ally to the cause of 
truth.

The Fundamentalists are not well 
named. The principles that they 
defend are not fundamental. For 
example they maintain that the 
Bible is the only and the infallible 
rule of Faith ; that is, that, if there 
should arise disputes about Chris­
tian teaching and practice, these 
disputes can, and should, be settled 
by reference to the express words of 
Holy Scripture. But it is obvious 
that there are such disputes 
amongst themselves. For example 
they do not all belong to the same 
organization. Some are Baptists. 
Some are Presbyterians. Some are 
Methodists. Some are Episcopalians. 
If the Bible is their only rule of Faith, 
why do they belong to different 
denominations that have historically 
grown out of disputes that have 
never been successful ? The rule 
of Faith proposed has not become 
a rule. Nor is there any evidence 
that it will become one in the future. 
All attempts at union between the 
various sects have failed. The 
foundations offered have not been 
accepted by the Fundamentalists 
themselves.

On the other hand, their oppon­
ents, the so-called Modernists, have 
really tried to effect some kind of 
unity. They have said substantially, 
to the Fundamentalists : “ We
have accepted the theory that the 
Bible must speak for itself without 
any interference of Pope or Church. 
We have examined it scientifically. 
We find it to be an historical docu­
ment that has come down to us 
from many different sources. Its 
text is contained in thousands of 
manuscripts that to some extent 
differ from one another. It is filled 
like any book or library of books, 
that was written centuries ago. with 
errors. Many of these are due to 
the copyists who wrote by hand. 
Some are due to theologians who

If the Bible is the sole source of
true doctrine, then first, we must 
be sure that we have the original 
text. It is only scholars that could 
be relied upon to reconstruct a 
trustworthy edition of the Sacred 
Scriptures. Moreover, our studies 
have convinced us that there is no 
evidence that the Bible is the work 
of inspired writers. It is a library 
of religious writings extending over 
centuries. It is a unique record of 
the search of man for God. But it 
represents a development rather 
than a revelation. It is only Cath­
olic tradition that has made a 
human record into an inspired 
‘Word of God.’ We do not accept 
Catholic Tradition ; and we cannot 
understand why you should. The 
idea that the Bible proves itself to 
be ‘the Bible’ is illusive. We think 
that the Bible proves itself to be 
a human record. We do not find in 
it any more evidence for its being 
inspired than we find in It any evi­
dence for the infallibility of the 
Pope. This does not mean that we 
do not recognize' the value of both 
the Holy Scriptures and of the 
Papal system. Both ure important 
developments. Both of them are 
worthy of human interest. We 
make the Bible explain itself and 
this is what we read in it : An 
entrancing history of man’s search 
for God ; but nothing more.”

How do the Fundamentalists re­
spond ? They respond by uncon­
sciously and illogieally falling back 
on the Catholic Church. Although, 
as some one has pointed out, 
the most active Fundamentalists 
would probably welcome the K. K.K. 
as an ally, it is to Catholic Tradi­
tion that they turn. They begin to 
talk of the Apostles’ Creed, of the 
witness of the Chprch, of the lives 
of the Saints as evidence of what 
has always been believed about the 
Bible. But this is to stultify their 
own appeal to the Bible and the 
Bible only. Moreover, they have 
brought a great deal of bitterness 
into the controversy. They have 
charged their opponents with pride 
and atheism. Some of them have 
even suggested forcible repression 
of the theories that differ from their 
own. All of these things go to 
prove that the ‘Fundamentalist’ 
principle of the Bible as the sole 
source of Christian doctrine fails 
them when put to the test.

In the contention between Modern­
ist and Fundamentalist the Catholic 
has no place except to point out 
that this confusion has always been 
inherent in, and sn integral part of 
Protestantism. The contention has 
its value as demonstrating the irra­
tional principles of the so-called 
Reformers. When these latter 
threw off the guidance of the Church 
and proclaimed the sovereign author­
ity of the Bible, they forgot that it 
was the Catholic Church, solely and 
alone, that guaranteed both the 
authenticity and the inspiration of 
the Bible.

There is, however, a great danger 
to religion in this controversy. It 
is certain that many people will 
think that the truth of the Bible 
has been destroyed. Nothing could 
bs farther from the fact. It is 
surely plain that science has its 
limitations. It deals only with 
evidences. There are no evidences 
that have in any way weakened the 
rock of Holy Scripture. The diffi­
culties pointed out by modern critics 
were known to Catholic theologians 
centuries ago. From the earliest 
Christian ages, repeated attempts 
have been made to correct and pre­
serve the true text of the Bible, 
which, like any other document of 
antiquity, has suffered at the hands 
of numberless copyists. But to 
suppose that anyone has discovered 
evidences that disprove the un­
broken tradition of the Church is 
simply false. If some critics have 
lost their Faith, it is not due to any­
thing that they have discovered. 
People lose their Faith through 
many causes. Faith is a divine 
grace. — Catholic Standard and 
Times.

AN OLD WOMAN’S ROSARY

I bless myself, and I kiss the cross.
And the holy Creed I tell :
And the Paters and Aves trip off my 

tongue,
For it’s me that knows them well.
For it’s many a day these same old 

beads
I told in the same old way—
I got them my first Communion 

morn,
And that’s sixty years this May.
’Twas the Joyful Mysteries that 1 

liked
(And I said them joyfully.)
When Our Lord was only a Child 

Himself
At His Blessed Mother’s knee.
Ochone! but it’s many and many a 

year.
I’ve turned from the joyful deeds;
And I cry on the Sorrowful 

Mysteries
With tears as big as my beads.
For my beautiful boy with the 

fever went,
And “himself” next morning died.
Do you wonder I think of the 

Mysteries
That end with the Crucified ?
For it’s then as I’m telling each 

blessed bead,
A-kneeling beside my bed.
We two women, God’s Mother and 

me,
Have many a talk of our dead.

High Quality
ha» distinguished

"SALMA"
H62Q

for over three decades. Pure 
and Delicious Always. — Try it.

Keeping Valuables Safely
The purpose of a Safety Deposit Box 
is to keep valuables safe from fire 
and theft. If you have stocks and 
bonds, insurance policies or a will, 
keep them in a Safety Deposit Box.
You can rent one at this Bank for a 
small sum. *i

IMPERIAL BANK
OF CANADA

190 Branches in Dominion of Canada.

ATLAS Before you build
see this new Veltex Brick — at­
tractive texture — a range of 
beautiful shades.BRICK

A hard, durable brick, which 
produces a most effective ft dish 
in the facing of all buildings.
Colors are natural — cannot 
fade — Red, Buff, and Fire- 
Flashed.

INTERPROVINCIAL BRICK CO. OF CANADA, LTD.
HEAD OFFICE : 30 TORONTO 8T., TORONTO

piSHING
TACKLE

Guns, Ammunition 
Hunters’ Supplies

CAMP SUPPLIES
Now is the time to order your Camp 

Outfit Get our FREE Catalogue. It 
will help you.

ALCOCK, LAIGHT & WESTWOOD CO. Limned
70 K NG ST. W. TORONTO

gYTY\

Qhsolute Protection 
"Whatever comes

By insuring “four ways’’ with a North 
American Life policy, you can provide against 
every possible misfortune which might deprive 
yourself or your loved ones of a secure future 
income.

Such a policy pays “four ways.”
1. Death
2. Accident
3. Total Disability
4. Old Age.

Thus, with a $10,000 policy under this “four 
way,” North American Life plan your bene­
ficiaries receive in the event of your death from 
natural causes—$10,000.

If your death is accidental, your heirs re­
ceive—-$20,000.

In case you are tdtally disabled through 
sickness or accident, you enjoy a monthly in­
come of $100.

And at the same time your policy represents 
a saving for old age when lessened earning 
power will reduce your income.

We will be glad to send you full particulars 
about this “Absolute Protection” Policy.

NORTH AMERICAN LIFE
ASSURANCE COMPANY

Solid as ike Continent”
Head Office - Toronto, Canada

“Agents in every 
important centre 
in Canada ".
I---------------------------------------------------1

MANUFACTURED

Furs
Coats and Jackets

Scarfs and Chokers

GOURDIER'S
KINGSTON . ONT.

kWVVN

«
Order Now

The rush waron will booh be 
here. Have our representative call, 
take measure men h, give eetimate 
and erect awning free.
Avoid disappointment later.

WE MAKE EVERYTHING 
MADE OF CANVAS

Carter, Son & Co.
619-621 Dundas SI.

Phone 6197

BLUNDERS

WHY IS THIS WRONG?
When mail is allowed to accum­

ulate in offices until closing time, 
it not only places an additional 
burden on the postal service, but is 
apt to miss important early after­
noon train dispatches. This often 
causes a whole day’s delay in de­
livery. Mail should be postée as 
soon as it is ready, and at frequent 
periods of the day.

ÏLYMYEP umjxi OTHER BELLS k ï m f cix/pgk sweeter, more dur-

CHURCH ifcaf able, lower price
-TW C"UR.FREE!CATALOGUE

E JLe XjS. ^ TELLS WHY.» 
lo Cincinnati Beil Foimdr? Co.. Cincinnati. 0,•‘QUALITY AND SERVICE”

“Metallic” 
Store Ceilings

You’ll like “Metallic” ceiling—never 
cracks, can’t shake off, «reproof. 
Attractive, economical, easily put up 
in old or new buildings. Increases 
light—Improves appearance.

Scores of patterns
For stores, kitchens, churches, etc. 

Booklet and estimates free.

Metallic Roofing Co.^T
Mnfrs. phone lake, oeoo Limited

Hotel
New Southern
Michigan Blvd. at 13th St. 

CHICAGO
A Hotel that is more than 

a Hotel—A Home
ABSOLUTELY FIREPROOF 
300 Light, Large, Airy Rooms

One block from 111. 
Cent., Mich. Cent, 
and "Big 4” R. R. 
Station. Walking dis­
tance from theatre and 
shopping district. 
Excellent Cuisine.
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FOREIGN MISSIONS

ROME GRATEFUL FOR 
GENEROUS AID

Btihop's House, 90 Central, Ave.
London, Ont., April ‘26, 1924 

Dear Rev. Father :
On February 28rd last I trans­

mitted to His Eminence, Cardinal 
Van Rossum, Prefect of the Congre 
galion de Propaganda Fide, a 
cheque for $»,800 contributed by 
the Diocese of London to the 
Society for the Propagation of the 
Faith. Under dates of March Uth 
and 14th I received acknowledg­
ment from both His Eminence and 
the Secretary General of the 
Society. It is a great pleasure for 
me to quote the following extract 
from the letter of Cardinal Van 
Rossum :

“I am truly grateful to Your 
Lordship for having forwarded the 
splendid sum of $5,800 collected in 
your Diocese for the Pontifical work 
of the Propagation of the Faith 
which I immediately transmitted to 
the Superior Council. 1 beg of 
Your Lordship to present the thanks 
of Propaganda to the Diocesan 
Director and his assistants, to the 
zealous ladies of the Catholic 
Women’s League, and to all who by 
their generosity have contributed 
to the support of the foreign 
missions.’’

The words of Father Nogara, 
Secretary General of the Superior 
Council which I give here, will be 
read with equal interest. He 
wrote :

“His Eminence, Cardinal Van 
Rossum, has transmitted to me the 
sum of $5,800 collected in the 
Diocese of London in favor of the 
missions. .This generous offering 
gives me great joy because we are 
daily receiving appeals from the 
foreign missionaries whose needs 
are very great and whose resources 
are very limited. It is a joy to be 
able to help them. I return, there­
fore, my most sincere thanks to all 
the contributors in your Diocese to 
this sacred cause and I beg God to 
bless you ; these indeed shall re­
ceive their reward exceeding 
great.”

In communicating to you these 
precious words of approval from the 
centre of Catholicity I desire to ex­
press my own great satisfaction and 
gratitude. At the same time I 
appeal to the Diocesan Director and 
his assistants, to the pastors of the 
Diocese, to the members of the 
Catholic Women’s League and to 
our Catholics in general and with­
out exception that there be no de­
crease of zeal or generosity, but 
that the work of the foreign 
missions be brought home as a 
personal duty of prayer and sacri­
fice for every Catholic within the 
limits of the Diocese of London.

I am also transmitting to you 
herewith the Report of the First 
Annual Diocesan Offering to the 
Society for the Propagation of the 
Faith. In many instances the 
parishes have done extraordinarily 
well. In some few only a perfunc­
tory interest has been taken in this 
blessed work. A comparative study 
of the results will not be without 
instructive consequences and may 
lead to more fruitful efforts here­
after.
With my cordial blessing, I* remain 

Yours faithfully in Christ,
M. F. Fallon,

Bishop of London.
CONTRIBUTIONS BY PARISHES

London, Ont., April 25th, 1924. 
Right Rev. M. F. Fallon, D. D„

90 Central Ave., London, Ont.
My Lord :

I have the honor of presenting to 
you herewith the first Annual Report 
of the Society for the Propagation of 
the Faith, including the complete 
list of contributions made by the 
parishes of the Diocese and a full 
statement of expenditures.
Loiselleville.............  ..................$ 0 00St. Martin’s, London...................... 0 00Staples............. .......................... 0 00Paincourt..................................... 5 00St. Peter’s, Prairie Siding................ 10 00Petite Cote .................................. li 03French Settlement........................ 12 00Tilsonburg ............................... . 15 15St. Augustine.......  ................... 18 10Immaculate Conception, Stratford__ 22 00Logan................  ...................... 24 15Holy Trinity, Windsor................... 28 55Raleigh....................................... 30 80Leamington.................................. 32 00ParkhilF...................................... 32 60Biddulph..................................... 33 00Alvinston..................................... 34 15Zurich......................................... 36 00St. Joseph’s Hospital, London.......... 36 20West Lome...... ............................ 37 65Goderich...................................... 38 15Tecumseh.................................... 39 00Hesson........................................ 40 30Blessed Sacrament. Chatham........... 42 25

8»

Keeps
*7he Home Clean

fMLLETT’S PURE 
w FLAKE LYE is the
first-aid to home sanitation. No­
thing equals it for cleaning out 
sinks and drains, cleaning greasy 
cooking utensils, keeping floors 
clean, etc. Get a can from your 
grocer. It will eave you much 
hard labor.

* GILLETT’S r
1007, PURE FLAKE

LYE

THE CATHOLIC RECORD
Htrathroy ........................
Thaiiiesville.....................
Belle Hiver......................
Tilbury.............................
Clinton..............................
McGregor.........................
Ashfleld................. .
Big Point.........................
WTngham .....................
tit. Thomas......................
Petrol e a...........................
St. Patrick's, London ...
Maidstone .............
Walker ville.....................
Corunna...........................
Port Lambton.............
Lasalette..................
Kldgotown ............
O L. P. 8.. Windsor.......
Wood elec.........................
St. Michael's, London...
titoney Point..................
Kinkora ...........................
Ford..................................
Woodstock.......................
Wallaci burg....................
Seaforth.

41 36
60 00
62 00 
51 10 
61 6066 oo 68 86 
60 011 68 00 
63 40 
84 75 68 86 
70 00 
76 00 
76 00 
78 85 
80 00 
81 20 
82 76 
til HO 
92 10

100 (XI 
100 00
101 00 
106 30

St. Co umban .............  ......................... , 110 (X)
Our Lady of Mercy, Sarnia...................  110 70
Mt. Carmel .......................................... 110 85
Sandwich................................................... Ill 90
Dublin........................................................  125 00
Amherst burg............................................ 182 85
H. Joseph's. Chatham ........................... 180 00
8t. Joseph's. Stratford............................. 181 85
IngersoU..................................................... 182 (X)
St. Alphonsus'. Windsor........................   183 (X)
St. Mary’s, London.................................. 191 80
St. Marys................................................... V08 00
Slrncoe........................................................ 2x8 00
Immaculate Conception, Windsor....... 326 85
St. Joachim...............................................  412 46
Cathedral ................................................. 1,457 00

BALANCE SHEET 
RECEIPTS

Cent ibutlons from parishes .. . . 
Interest...............................................

$6 819 68
3 41

$6,823 09
EXPENDITURES

Printing and Stationery........................$ 444 13
Exchange on cheques................. .. 3 jr
For warned to Cardinal Van Rossum 5,080 00
Home Bank Deposit ............................. 81 25
Balance on hand............. ........................ 494 34

$6.823 09

I remain yours faithfully in Christ, 
J. C. Kelly,

Diocesan Treasurer.

GOD AND HIS CHURCH

"The jurisdiction of the Pope, with 
freedom of communication with 
Rome, instead of the palladium of 
liberty which it has over and over 
again proved itself to be, looks to a 
jaundiced eye as a thraldom than 
which no human tyranny can be 
greater. As a matter of fact and 
history, the Church as a government 
has been immensely powerful, and 
yet men despise her. As a matter 
of fact and history she has been of 
all governments the most patient, 
forgiving, and benign ; and yet men 
hate her. As with God so with her. 
They despise His power, and they 
are irritated by His mercy. The 
secret both of men’s indifference 
and of their dislike to the Church 
as a government lies in this single 
truth, that she is a theocracy. ..

“Because all the heavy work, in 
fact the solid foundations, of 
European civilisation, such as the 
sanctity of marriage, the mitigation 
of slavery, the courtesies of warfare, 
the glories of law, the limitations of 
despotism, the preservation of 
literature, the founding of univer­
sities, and the patronage of fine arts, 
were all her creation,—because she 
does not do by herself exclusively 
the easier work of completing this 
civilisation, but lets diplomacy and 
physical science share the toil and 
carry on what it was at the outset 
a mere by-play on her part to begin, 
men conclude that as an institution 
she knows of nothing but timidity 
and retrogression and that she who 
is the light of the world is never 
happy except when she has become 
its darkness. Neither do men 
suspect that when she seems to fail 
as an institution, it is because the 
civil power is cramping her as a 
government.”

(Father Faber, “ The Blessed 
Sacrament a Picture of God.”)

DIVORCE BLAMED FOR CHILD 
DELINQUENTS

Paris, France.—The annual Dio­
cesan Congress of Paris devoted its 
work this year to the study of 
various questions concerning the 
family, such as legislation, educa­
tion, ethics, etc. Two prominent 
members of Parliament were among 
the speakers : M. Isaac, former 
Minister of Commerce, and Dr. 
Thibout who is known as an author­
ity on questions pertaining to fam­
ily life. Both speakers declared 
legislation could not encourage 
large families if religion did not 
influence the masses.

An important statement was 
made by M. Isaac. The former 
Minister has been collecting 
statistics on the ancestry of delin­
quent children who come before the 
children’ scourtsin France. Accord­
ing to these statistics it appears 
that about two-thirds of the chil­
dren and young boys brought to 
court are the children of parents 
who have been divorced or separated. 
As the number of divorces and 
separations is relatively small com­
pared with the number of united 
families, the conclusion is that 
criminality is very high among 
children of separated families as 
compared with that of children of 
normal families.

SOCIALISTS SUFFER DECISIVE 
DEFEAT IN MECKLENBURG

By Rev. Dr. Wilhelm Baron von Capitaine- 
(Cologne Correspondent, N. C. W. C.)

Cologne, April 15.—The parties of 
the Right won a great victory in 
the last elections for the Landtag 
in Mecklenburg, striking the death 
knell of socialism there, and already 
the effects are beginning to be felt. 
The German-Nationalists partic­
ularly have been victorious.

Numerous concessions were 
forced, among them one that the 
black, red and gold reieshbanner 
should not be hoisted over the 
Landtag building. More important, 
however, was;;the granting of the

demand that "all employee and 
functionaries who after the revolu­
tion were appointed to office not 
because of special learning or 
ability but merely because of party 
affiliation, be dismissed imme­
diately.”

In Saxony, in the trial of the 
former minister Dr. Zeigner, It was 
brought out that Zeigner was 
appointed chiefly because of his 
membership in the Socialist party, 
and not because of ability. He has 
been condemned to three years in 
prison for misuse of his < fficial 
powers and bribery. In Brunswick 
there have been similar convic­
tions, and evidence of misuse of 
power was adduced at the recent 
Ludendorff-Hitler trial in Munich.

CATHOLIC WOMEN’S LEAGUE

Statement of Receipts and Ex­
penditures of the C. W. L. in Arn- 
prior for year ending April 80, 1924.
Total Receipts for year... $1,445 14

EXPENDITURES
Diocesan Fund.......................... 88 00
Convent Fund.......................... 882 86
Western Fund and Sisters

of Service........................... 100 00
Bishop's Fund.......................... 60 00
Capita Tax...........................15 40
Postage, Stat. and Inciden- 6 iMdi

tale...............................  *84 36
Charities.............................. 265 69
Balance in Home Bank......  ! 11 _88

____  $1,445 14

OBITUARY
MRS. THOS. PODEY

There passed to rest at her home 
2037 Rose St., Regina, Saak.,
Bridget Teresa Healey, wife of 
Thos. Fodey, aged seventy-four 
years, after an illness of more than 
two years. She was born in Toledo, 
Ont., and was the youngest daugh­
ter of the late Mr. and Mrs. Healey 
and came to Regina, Sask., with her 
family from Brockville, Ont., in 
1918. She was the mother of six 
children three of whom are dead 
and the remaining three are Rev. 
Mother Marie Loretta de Sion of 
Moose Jaw, Miss Olive Fodey and 
J. B. Fodey of Regina, all of whom 
were with her when the end came. 
His Grace Archbishop Matthieu, 
assisted by Father O’Hare, Rev. 
Father Gillies and Rev. Father 
Murray, celebrated Solemn’^, Re­
quiem Mass ; Regina Knights of 
Columbus and Altar Society of Holy 
Rosary Cathedral attended in a 
body and burial was made in 
Regina Cemetery. The services at 
the graveside were conducted by 
Rev. Father O’Hare, pastor of 
Holy Rosary Cathedral of which 
Mrs. Healy was a devout member. 
R. I. P.___________

DIED

McCormick.—At his home in West 
Williams, Middlesex Co., Ont., on 
Sunday, Feb. 24th. Stephen Mc­
Cormick, in his sixty-first year. 
May his soul rest in peace.

McCarroll.—At her late residence 
830 Elen Street East, Sudbury, Ont., 
Miss Mary McCarroll, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. F. J. McCarroll. 
May her soul rest in peace.

Fodey.—Bridget Teresa Healey, 
beloved wife of Thomas Fodey and 
mother of Rev. Mother Marie 
Loretta de Sion. Moose Jaw, Miss 
Olive Fodey and J. B. Fodey, Regina, 
passed away at her home 2087 Rose 
St., Regina, April 21, aged seventy- 
four years. May her soul rest in 
peace. ______

When one has fallen into any sin, 
the best remedy is to have instant 
recourse to the Heart of Jesus in 
the Most Holy Sacrament.—St. 
Alphonsus Ligouri.

TEACHERS WANTED
WANTED qualified teacher who can teach 
French and English, for Public school. Section 
No. 3, Townsnip Papineau. Maltawa, Ont. 
Apply to (Miss) ucrmalno Seguin, Sec. S. S. 
No. 3, Mattawa, Ont. 2878-3

WANTED
POSITION as practical nurse or housekeeper 
in or out of London. References exchanged. 
Thoroughly competent. Apply Box 456. 
Catholic Record, London, Ont. 2377-2

Empire Exhibition Visitors
Convenient and comfortable accommodation. 
In the Heart of London, near Trafalgar
Bquuru. Llewellyn Chambers, 1 5 Pall Mai! 
Place, London, S. W. I., England. Mrs. M. 
Barni, Prop.

NOW CLEARING
ALL

SPRING and SUMMER

Suits
AT WORTH WHILE 

REDUCTIONS
Cotne in and View Them

iStie
[IADIEf ]|||[ WEAR C?

158 DUN DAS ST

LONDON

AGENTS WANTED

Columbia, Manitoba and Saskatchewan. 
Apply, with references, to

THE MANAGER, 
Catholic Record,

Ixmdon, Ont.

MAY 10. 19‘24
AGENTS WANTED

AGENTS to sell Donalda Knitting Yarn suit­
able for machine or hand knitting. We are 
the largest Yarn mall older house In Canada 
and can give you lowest prices. We allow you 
to make a profit from 80c. to 96c. per pound on 
the sale of cur yarn. We furnish your custom- 
era with printed knitting Instruction* free. 
Wrlt4j today for territory and sample card 
showing 38 shades of our Yarn. Donalda Mfg. 
Co., Dept. 162. Toronto. 2363-tf

TAYLOR-
FORBES
HEATING
SYSTEMS

'J'HE "Sovereign” Hot Water 

Boiler is built to save fuel and 
manage its own fire. The area of 
the grate—capacity and design of 
the fire-pot—and the proportions of 
the inner air chamber promote 
a slow rate of combustion that will 
steadily increase the volume of 
heat passing on to the radiators.

The Sovereign 
will burn any 
kind of fuel per­
fectly.

Supremacy:

There is 35 years 
practical study 
of requirements 
built into the 
Taylor- Forbes 
heating systems. 
During thisperiod 
the results of 
actual operation 
in thousands of 
homes have been 
closely checked 
with scientific 
tests to secure 
fuel economy.

A booklet on heating mailed on request

TAYLOR-FORBES
COMPANY, LIMITED - GUELPH, CANADA 

Heating Systems and Radiators
Established

1888
Fifteen branches from Coast 

to Coast In Canada

DISTRICT AGENTS:
W. B. PENNOCK

733 Ouellotto Ave.
Windsor, Ont.

T. M. HAYES
991 Wellington 8t.

London, Ont.

The SoalTha*MakcsWarm Friends
There is no time like living present to prepare for future 
needs, therefore order your next winter’s supply now

Finney & Shannon
Yard —599 Adelaide St. Phone 5241

Wrought Iron Range Company
of Canada, Limited

MANUFACTURERS OF
Hotel, Restaurant, Cafeteria and Institution

Kitchen Equipment
Ranges, Carving Tables 
Cream Dispensers

Tea and Coffee Urns
Milk, Cream, and Water Coolers

Office Showroom and Factory

149 KING ST. W., TORONTO

BICYCLE 
SUNDRIES

Outer Tires, each ......$1.60 to $3.00
Tubes, each ...................... 75 “ 1.50
Pedals per pair ......................... 1.35
Frame Pumps, each.........................65
Foot Pumps, each ...........................75
Repair Kits, each............................ 15
Carrier with two straps................. 35
Enamel (Black) per tin ................. 20

Planet Bicycles $35 to $55 
Rebuilt Bicycles—$15 Up

We can repair and supply parts 
for any make of Bicycle

PLANET BICYCLE CO.
69 Queen 8t East, Toronto,|Ont.

Special SALE
EAGLE TIRES
AND TUBES

Tires Tubes
30 x 3‘.................... $ 8.95 $1.70
31 x 4 ..................... 14.00 2.46
32 x 4 ..................... 17 00 2.75
33 x 4 ..................... 18.00 3 00
34 x 4 ..................... 19.50 3.50

Tires Guaranteed 5000 Miles
Cash must accompany all orders 
Express prepaid on orders of $25

J. E. BROWN
496 Yonge SI. Toronto. Ont.

TRAINING SCHOOL FOR NURSES 
MERCY Hospital Training School for Nurses 
offers exceptional educational opportunities for 
competent and ambitious young women 
Applicants must be eighteen years of age. am 
have one year of High school or its equivalent 
Pupils may enter at the present time. Appli 
cations may be sent to the Directions of Nurses. 
Mercy Hospital. Toledo. Ohio. 2110-tf

WANTED
WANTED experienced housekeeper to take 
full charge of house and two children, ages 
seven and five. State wages and experience. 
Address W. M. Walsh, Box 271, Aylmer. Ont. 

 2378-1

WANTED a girl to help with general house 
work ; experience in cooking. Please state 
wages. Address Mrs. E. McCarroll. Alliston, 
0nL 2378-1

NURSING
MOUNT St. Mary's Hospital Training School 
for Nurses, registered and approved by its 
Regents at Albany, offers exceptional advan­
tages to yput.g women who wish to enter the 

Profession. Several vacancies areNursing Profession, ouwrai vacancies are 
offered at present to applicants having onef1 Hitrh o/ih/w\l A rtrl ........ 01.-4—— O   I  
n.vÿ7

muruu at, present to applicants having one 
'ear High school. Address Sister Superior, 
forint St. Mary’s Hospital. Niagara Falls

2368-15
FOR SALE

1 SET Encyclopaedia Brlttanica. $25.00 ; 1 get 
Catholic Encyclopaedia. $35.(0 ; 1 set of 
Stcddard Lectures, $35.00. All bound in % 
morocco and in perfect condition. Also 1 set 
** Cabinet of Irish Literature,” (4 vols.), bound 
in green and cold cloth, $6.00. Address Box 
458, Catholic Record, London, Ont. 2377-2

ST. CATHERINES HOSPITAL 
OFFERS a two and one half year course in 
nursing. 300 bed general hospital. Registered 
School. Classes enter in September and 
January. For further information apply to 
Directress of Training School, N. Y., Brooklyn.

2365-22

POSITION WANTED
CATHOLIC music teacher desires position as 
choir director or church organist in any part of 
Ontario. For full particulars kindly write 
Box 448, Catholic Record, London, Ont.

2367-tf

FOR RENT
A SUMMER cottage in the village of Bayfield, 
Ont., on Lake Huron. Completely furnished 
with exception of table and bed linen. Excel­
lent bathing beach and good fishing. Most 
desirab e location. Rent $250.00 for season. 
Apply Box 459. Catholic Record. London. 
Ont. 2377-3

MULHOLLIN’S—MONTREAL

Shipped to all parts of Canada. Special terms 
to Ldergv and Institutions. Write for particu­
lars. 786 St. Catherine West, Montreal. Que. 
Phone up 347. 2355-52

Don’t Take a Chance
MAKE SURE “when planning that new Home’’ of having 
it comfortably and economically 
heated — by specifying and in­
sisting on the installation of
The Famous

and -

‘NEW KING BOILER'

NEW KING 
BOILER

f __

Imperial
Radiators “IMPERIAL RADIATOR'

Ask your architect or heating contractor, or write us and we will 
f r gladly give you the information you desire without any obligation

(l) Fuel Economy (2) Quick Heating (3) Easy Operation
There is no other Boiler to equal the “ NEW KING”, which has the Two 
Side Water Way Positive Circulation Feature not found in any other Boiler

FREE BOO K Wo have ,,rin,od a handsomely Illustrated booklet on the subject of Hot Water Heating entitled -■ Com-
————--------------------  rortable Homos", which very simply explains the Important features of this method of House Heating
We will gladly send this booklet. FREE, postage paid, upon receipt of your name and address.

We manufacture Steam and Hot Water Heating Apparatus for Buildings of every description.

IMPERIAL RADIATOR COMPANY LIMITED
HEAD OFFICE AND PLANT

ST CATHARINES, ONT.
SALES OFFICES AND WAREHOUSES

228 ST. HELEN’S AVE. 1 OAK ST.
TORONTO MONTREAL

AOKNTH AND AGENCIES OF THE 
CATHOLIC RECORD

In 8t. John, N. B., single copie* may be

«ui'clmsitti from Mrs. M. A. McGuire, 219 Main 
...John J. Dwyer. 171 Union tit. and MIhh R 
U. GlfM-Hon, 10Prince Edward tit.
In Montreal ninglo copie* may bo purchased 

from J. Milloy. 211 tit. Catherine St. West.
In Ottawa, Ont., single copies may bo pur­

chased from J. W. O'Brien, 141 Nicholas St.
In Sydney, N. 8., single copies may bo 

purchased at Mu ruby's Bookstore.
In Glace Bay, N. 8., single copies may be 

purchased at McLeod's books Lore.
The following agents are authorized to 

receive subscriptions ana canvass for the 
Catholic Rkoord :

General
J.

encrai Agents—Stephen V. James, George 
Quigley, Miss Bride Saunders. Resident 
onts If. Chamberlin, Hilson Ave., Ottawa 

West: Phone Sherwood 348 W. ; Mrs. Geo. K. 
Smith, 2263 Mance St, Montreal ; Miss Anne 
Hogan Hulton I\ O., St. Vital. Man, ; John P. 
O Farrell, 115 Cartier Ave., Quebec City ; Thos. 
Lavcllc, 631 Casgrain tit., Montreal.

V 1*. Costello, 1760 7th Avenue West, 
Vancouver, B. C

General Agents—G. J. Pocock, P. A. 
Arsenault, Howlan, P. E. 1.

Frank K. Fallon, General Representative for 
Ontario.

GOOD NATURED 
AFTER BREAKFAST ?

You are sure to be 
if you drink

Rowat’sCollee
At the Morning Meal

The choicest beans, roasted by 
experts and freshly ground makes 
Rowat's Coffee the finest on the 
market.

Order a Pound To-Day 
7Qc.

T. A. Rowal & Co.
ESTABLISHED 1887

grocers importers

250 Dundas St. London, Ont.

MISSION SUPPLIES
A SPECIALTY

Large assortment of Up-to- 
date, First Quality 

Mission Goods
Write for particulars, etc.

INCREASE DEVOTION In the home 
by In-tailing a Statue of Our lady, beauti­
fully hand painted —
12 Inch S2 IS Inch—S3 20 inch-SS

Cassocks and Surplices 
for Altar Boys

J. J. M. LANDY
16 Dundas St. W. Toronto

COWAN’S
IN YOUR GARDEN 
tb USE

PURO
TO SWEETEN THE 
SOIL

- - -

f. ■ ‘

“PURO” 
WILL MAKE YOUR 

GROUND MORE FERTILE
A sour condition exists in many soils— 

particularly where shaded by houses or 
trees. Lime is the remedy.

Puro Hydrated Lime is water-slacked. 
Consequently It corrects the acidity of the 
soil without the burning effect of quick 
lime. It makes the garden more product­
ive, and the lawn a rich dark green of vel­
vety softness.

A four pound package Is sufficient for 
120 square feet (10x12) of the average 
garden or lawn.

1 lb. Package 16o 
4 lb. Package 35c.

Cowan Hardware Lid.
125-127 Dundas St. London 

PHONES 3461 - 3462

MEMORIAL.
(WINDOWS f\(r
ENGLISH

ANT,<,U1\WLV LYON 
GLASS Co

o' 141-3 CHURCH ST.TORONTO ONI

FOR EVERY

CANADA CHURCH GOODS Co Ltd1
149 CHURCH ST. - TORONTO

I


