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CONSTITUTION AND BY-LAWS.

ARTICLE L

Name, Object, Jurisdiction and Membership.

Sec. 1. This Body shall be known as the Fed-
erated Association of Letter Carriers of the Do-
minion of Canada, and shall be composed of

Subordinate Branches, working in accordance
with this Constitution.

Sec. 2. The objects of this Association shall be
to unite fraternaliv all Lettef Carriers in the Do-

ft'

minion of Canada for the mutual benefit of each;

to seek improvement in tlie condition of all and
strive to promote the Vv'elfare of every member.

Sec 3. The Federated Association shall have
complete jurisdiction overall questions arising in

or between Branches, regarding the work of the
Federated Body, and its judgment in all cases
shall be final. It alone shall possess the power to

make, amend or repeal this Constitution. It

shall issue Charters duly executed by the Presi-

dent and Secretary, to Branches as hereinafter
provided. It shall have power to levy assess-

ments on Branches for its maintenance.

Sec. 4. Any Association of Letter Carrier
employed in Post-offices throughout the Domin-
ion of Canada, may become a Branch of this

Association by making application to the Fed-
erated Secretary for a Charter. Said application
shall be accompanied by a statement of the num-



ber of members in their Association, names of the
officers and the necessary fee. Only one Branch
of the Federated Association shall be maintained
in each town or city.

Any city or town not having the number of
Carriers to form an Association in said town or
city, then individual Carriers may join the Fed-
erated Association as members at large, on pay-
ment of the annual dues and assesments to the
Federated Association, until such time as said
city or town shall form a Branch of this Associa-
tion. When any city or town has five members
at large in the Federated Association, the said
live members shall then form a Branch Associa-
tion.

Sec. 5. Upon the receipt of a Charter, a gen-
eral invitation shall be extended to every Carrier
now in the Civil Service, by the Branch to which
they are attached, to join this Association within
six months, and any Carrier not joining this As-
sociation within the time specified in this section,
it shall be in the power of the said Branch to in-

crease the fee for membership of the same join-

ing this Association after said date to any
amount they may see fit and necessary to the
welfare of the Association.

Sec. 6. The following shall be eligible for
membership in the various branches^ vizi Letter
Carriers in service and Superintendent of Car-
riers.

Sec. 7. The jurisdiction of a Branch shall be
confined to the town or city wherein said Branch
is located.

Seo. 8. The annual dues of the members of

each branch to the Federated Association, shall



be sixty cents, payable semi-annually in advance
by the Branch on the first day of IVlay and No-
vember of each year, to the Fedated Secretary.

ARTICLE II.

Annual Meeting and Representation.

Sec. 1. The Federated Association shall meet
annually, between the first day of July and the
first day of November, at such time and place as

may be determined upon by a majority of the
delegates present at the previous session.

Sec. 2. Special meetings may be called by the
President, on the written request of not lesa than
one half of the Branches ; said Branches to re-

present not less than two-thirds of the member-
ship of this Association. The object of the meet-
ing shall be stated in said request and shall ap-
pear in the call for the meeting. And no other
business shall be transacted at said meeting.
None but delegates elected to attend the previous
Annual Meeting, or their alternates, shall attend
a Special Meeting. .^

Sec. 3. Each Branch shall be entitled to one
delegate for fifty members or fraction thereof,

two delegates for over fifty and up to one hundred
members or major part thereof, said membership
to be based upon the number of members who
have paid dues for the six months preceding the
Annual Meeting.

Sec. 4. Branches shall meet at least once in

each quarter, and delegates to the Annual Meet-
ing shall be elected at least thirty days preceding
said Annual Meeting of this Association and
shall hold office for one year, delegates shall hold
office until their successors have been elected and
shall have qualified.
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Sec. 5. At the same time and in the same
manner that delegates are elected, an ec{ual num-
ber of alternates shall be elected. In the even n of

death, resij^nation, inability or other dis(|ualifica-

tion of a dele^^ate, the alternate h ivin«; the highest
number of votes ut the election, shall succeed to

the vacancy with all the rights and privileges of

a regularly elected delegate. If the delegate to

the Annual Meeting cannot attend, the alternate
becomes ihe delegate to the Special Meeting.

Sec. 0. The Secretary of the Federated As-
sociation shall prepare and send to the Secretary
of each Branch, not later than the first day of

May, in each year, proper blanks for the creden-
tials of delegates. The Secretary of each Branch
shall send to the Secretary of tlie Federated
Association a credential for each delegate elected,

signed b\' the Presidenc and attested by himself.

A duplicate of said credential, attested in like

manner, shall be furnished each delegate and
must be presented by hitn to the Committee on
Credentials of the Federated Association, on the

first day of the Annual Meeting.

ARTICLE III.

Officers.

Sec 1. The officers of the Federated Associa-

tion shall be. viz\ a President, Immediate Past
President, Vice-President, Secretary and Treas-
urer. There shall be one Vice-President for each
Province. The Vice-President for the Province
having the largest number of Branches to be
known as the J-'econd Vice-President. The Vice-

President or the Province having the next largest

number of Branches to be the third Vice-Presi-

dent, and so on.
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Sec. 2. Nomination shall be made in writini,'

on the morning of the last clay of the conveniion,
and the election of ofilicers shall take place on the
afternoon of the same day. A majority of all the
votes cast shall be necessary to an election.

Where there is more than one nomination for

any office, voting must be by ballot. Hhould
there be but one nomination, the President shall

declare said nominee elected by acclamation.
When three ballots have beei» taken and no
election secured, only the two hi;^he8t candidates
in the last ballot taken shall be voted for, the re-

maining candidates to be withdrawn. The pre-

ceding paragraph may be enforced by a two-
thirds vote after one ballot has been taken, in

which there was no election.

Sec. 3. All officers shall be elected at the An-
nual Meeting and shall hold office until the next
succeeding Annual Meeting or until their suc-

cessors have qualified.

Sec. 4. In the event of death, resignation, in-

ability or other disqualification of an officer, the
President shall as soon as possible select a suc-
cessor for the vacancy.

Sec. 5. Only officers and delegates in attend-
ance at the meeting at which the election is held,

are eligible for election to any office.

ARTICLE IV.

Duties of Officers.

Sec. 1. The President shall preside at the
Annual, and at any Special Meeting of this

Association. When this Association is not in
session, he shall decide all questions of Law and
enforce the provisions of this Constitution. His
decisions on any matter shall be subject to appeal



to the Executive Board, whose decisions shall

hold good, until approved or set aside by the Fed-
erated Association at its Annual Meeting, at
which all such decisions, with the facts connected
therewith, shall be reported. He shall be Chair-
man of the Executive Board. He shall fill all

vacancies until an election can be held, affix his

signature to Charters, and to all papers that re-

quire his signature to properly authenticate the
same. He shall have power in case of an emer-
gency, to call a meeting of the Executive Board;
shall appoint at the Annual Meeting a special

committee on rules and credentials; shall make at

the Annual Meeting a written or printed report
of all official acts during the year, and perform
such other duties ac are required by this Con-
stitution. At the end of his term of office, he
shall deliver to his successor, all books, papers
and other property of this Association, that may
be in his possession.

Sec. 2. The Vice-President when officially no-

tified that the President is unable to attend any
meeting of the Federated Association, or the
meetings of the Executive Board, shall preside at

such meetings. In the event of resignation, death,
inability or other disqualification of the Presi-

dent, the Vice-President shall become President
until his successor shall have been elected and
qualified. In like manner the Second Vice-
President, under the same or similar circum-
stances or conditions, shall succeed the Vice-
President. It shall be the duty of each Vice-
President to jealously guard the interests of the
Association in their ^respective Provinces, to

strive to increase the number of Branches in said

Provinces, and at all times, to be vigilant and
watchful of the genert*l good of Letter Carriers. It

shall be the duty of each Vice-President to submit
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a written report of the general condition of all

Association matters in their respective Provinces.

They shall have the power to cail for informa-
tion concerning the condition of any J^>ranch in

their jurisdiction, and the Secretary thereof
shall give the information desired as far as pos-
sible. The jurisdiction of a Vice-President shall

be aefined at the Annual Meeting. When every
Province has at least one Branch Association,
said jurisdiction shall not extend outside the
Province to which he belongs. .

Sec. 3. The Secretary shall keep a correct re-

port of the proceedings of this Association, read
all communications, reports and petitions, pro-

cure a seal and afiix the same to all documents of

an ofticial character; prepare for publication a
copy of the proceedings of any meeting of this

Association, within forty days from the holding
thereof; make to the Association a comjjlete
written statement of its condition, compiled from
the latest report of all the J branches. He shall

conduct the correspondence of said Association
and keep a record of the names of membeis. date of

organization and locat on, together with a list* of

the officers of each Branch; he shall have charge of

the seals, books and papers belonging to the
Federated Association; shall prepare and furnish
to Branches all supplies authorized by the Asso-
ciation. Where there is a price fixed for said
supplies, the same shall not be furnished until

the monev therefor has been received. He shall

keep a true and correct account between the Fed-
erated Association and all Branches of the same;
shall present to the Federated Association, at

each Annual Meeting a full and correct statement
of monies received. Deposit all monies received
in the name of the Association in such Pank as
the Execrtive Board may select, all funds in his
hands exceeding the sum of twenty dollars. He
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shall keep a correct account of his receipts, dis-

bursements and investmeiits, his books shall at

all times be open for inspection by the Executive
Board, or any duly authorized committee of the
same. He sluill prepare a book in which shall be
placed the name and Post Office address as well

as the Branch represented, of every delegate to

the Annual Meeting succeeding his election or

each re-election, said b ok to be for the use of the
Preaident. He shall keep any statistics coming
to his knowledge likely ito prove of utility or

value to this Association; at the expiration of his

term of office, he shall turn over to his successor
in office all books, papers, funds, securities and
other property of this Association which may be
in his possession and perform such other duties
as the Constitutioi and rules of tliis Association
may require. He shall also be a member of the
Executive Board. The Secretary shall be required
to give bonds for the faithful performance of his

duties, in the sum of $ , said bonds to be ap-

proved by the full Executive Hoard and paid for

out of the funds of this Association.

Sec. 4 The Treasurer shall pay all orders re-

gularly issued by the Secretary and signed by
the President. He shall keep a correct account
of his receipts, disbursements and investments.
His bouKs shall at all times be open for inspection

by the Executive Board, or any duly authorized
committee of the same He shall make at each
Annual Meeting a full report of all monies re-

ceived, disbursed, invested or in his hands. At
the expiration of his term o*f office, he shall turn
over to his successor in office, all books, papers,

securities or other property of the Association

which may be in his possession, and perform
such other duties as the Constitution and rules ol;

this Association may require. The Treasurer
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shall be requirec) to give bonds for the faithful

discharge of his duties in the sum of $
,

said bonds to be approved of by the full Execu-
tive Boartl, and paid for out of the funds of

this Association. The Treasurer shall also be a

membei* of t!ie Executive Board.

Sec. 5. The Trustees shall have charge of the
property of the Federated Body. They shall in

vest any surplus (general funds) placed in their

hands by the Federated Body in readily convert-
able securities, Government or Municipal. They
shall not at any time loan such funds or monies
on personal security or real estate mortgages.
They shall deposit with the Federated Secretary
for safe keeping, all deeds or securities belonging
to the Federated Body. They shall collect and
pay to the Federated Secretary all monies re-

ceived from investments. They shall carry out
the interests of the Federated Body in all things
and promptly report all transactions to the Fed-
erated Secretary. They shall give a good and
sufficient bond if required to the Federated As-
sociaton for the faithful performance of their
duties, w^hich bond shall be approved of by the
Executive Board and deposited with the Feder-
ated Secretary.

Sec. 6, The Executive Board shall consist of

the President, Secretary and Treasurer, and two
members who shall be elected at each annual
meeting of the Association. The Executive
Board shall have a general supervision and con-
trol over the Association. They shall have power
to decide appeals from the decisions of the
President. Such decisions of the Board to stand
and be in force until the next Annual Meeting of

the Federated Association, whose decision shall

be final. They shall appropriate semi-annually
from the funds that are available, such sums for
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the use of the Executive Committee as the Chair*
man of that Committee shall call for. Im case of

neglect of d^^y or violation of this Constitution
on the part of any Federated or Branch Officer,

the Executive Board shall have power to remove
suoh officer after a fair hearin ', subject to appeal
to the Federated Association. The Executive
Board mav hoi a a session at least once in each
year, the time and ^^lace to be determined by the
President. The President and Secretaiy of the
Local Branch of the City or Town in which the
session is held, shall be empowered to act with
the Board, durin<^ session, and all the neceseary
expenses of such Meetings shall be paid from the
Treasury of the Federated Associatian. At ever

v

meeting or session of this H )ard, said accounts
shall be examined into carefully and the Secre-
tary and Treasurer shall be prepared to render
an account as complete as the time allowed for

the preparation of the same leaves it in their
powder to do. No expense shall be incurred by
any officer of this Association without the athor-
ization and approval of the Executive Board.

ARTICLE V.

Revenue.

Sec 1. The Revenue of the Federated Associ-
ation shall be derived from the following so; rces,

viz\ Charters to Branches, Beneficiary Certificates

to members, Capitation tax and profits from the
sale of sup2)lies furnished by authority of the
Federated Association to Branches. The fee

for Charters to Branches shall be two dollars,

Beneficiary Certificates to members one dollar, a

Captation tax of sixty cents per member per an-

num, payable semi-annually in advance, by each
Branch on the number of members in g* od stand-
ing in the Association, on or before the first day
of November and May in each year. And from



such other sources as are in accordance with the
objects and business of the Federated Associa*
tion. The rate shiU be fixed year by year by
the Federated Association.

Sec. 2. All Bjoks, Bhinks, Badges, Jewels,
Regalia, Emblems and Seals used by Branches,
shall be of the size and pattern as those prescrib-

ed and must be secured from the Secretary of the
Federated Association.

AKTICLE VI.

Governing the Federated Association and
Branches Funds and Assessments.

Sec 1. The Beneficiary Funds of the Associ-

ation shall be collected and used exclusively for

the purpose of paying death claims.

Sec. 2. Each Carrier shall at the time of his

initiation pay to the Financial Secretary one ad-

vance assessment of one dollar, together wath one
dollar for his Beneficiary Certificate and six

month's Capitation Tax and shall pay the amount
of one dollar on each subsequent assessment
while a member of the Association.

Sec 3. There shall be paid on the death of

every member who is in good standing at the
time of his decease, the sum of one thousand
dollars.

Sec 4. Provided however that should a death
occur when one assessment on each member
would not amount to the sum named in hie
Beneficiary Certificate, then the sum paid shall

be the amount as one assessment on each mem-
ber in good standing in the Association at the
date of said death.

Sec 5 A certificate shall be issued to mar-
ried members entitling them to a maximum sum
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of five hundred dollars upon the death of his wife
upon payment of half rates. The rule governing
General Certificates shall be tlie rule governing
the Be certificates.

Sec. C). On the death of a member m good
standing the President of the Branch shall ascer-
tain the cause of deaih and the circumstances
attending the same, together with an affidavit of
attending Physician stating the cause, and same
shall be forwarded to the Secretary of the Feder-
ated Association by the President and Secretary
of the Branch of which deceased was a member,
in accordance with the form furnished by the
Federated Secretary. Further proof of such death
may be required, if deemed necessary, by the
President of the Federated Association.

ARTICLE VII.

> Payment of Claims.

' Sec. 1. On receipt of satisfactory proofs of
the death of a member or a member's wife the
Federated Secretary shall draw cheques in favor
of the person or persons named in the Beneficiary
Certificate, for the amount due on said death and
forward them with all the papers relating to the
case to the President of the Federated Associa-
tion.

Sec. 2. If upon examination of the papers
they are found satisfactory, the President shall
return them suitably endorsed to the Secretary of
the Federated Association and the Secretary and
Treasurer shall sign the same and immediately
transmit them to the Treasurer of the Branch of
which deceased was a member.

Sec. 3. It shall be the duty of the Treasurer
of the subordinate Branch on the receipt of the



16

cheques from the Secretary to deliver t'lem to

the person or persons in whose favor they are
drawn, and to receive in return the Bcneliciary
Certificate properly endorsed, which Certificate

shall be forwarded to the Federated Secretary
who shall place it on file in his office. Said de-

livery shall be certified by the President and
Secretary of the subordinate Branch and entered
upon its records.

Sec. 4. In case of the death of the person or
persons named in the cheques before delivery is

made, they shall be returned to the Secretary of

the Federated Association, with the statement of

the facts signed by the President and Secretary of

the Br nch and new cheques shall be drawn pay-
able to the pe son or persons entitled to the

Benefit.

ARTKJLE VIII.

" Assessments.

Sec. 1. When the condition of the Federated
Treasury shall make it necessary to levy assess-

ments, the Secretary shall on the first of the
month notify every Branch to forward imme-
diately the assessments from every member ini-

tiated on or before the death for which the call

is made on the form prescribed by the Federated
Association, which shall include a list of all

deaths that have occurred subsequent to the
last assessment.

Sec. 2. The Secretary of the Branch upon the
receipt of the call for assessments shall imme-
diately acknowledge the same to the Federated
Secretary and shall certify to the Treasurer the
amount due to the Federated Association by the
terms of the call. The Treasurer of the Branch
shall there upon forward to the Federated Secre-
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tary within thirty days from the call thereof , the
amount so certified and in case there shalJ be
more than one assessment, the jemainin*^ assess-

ment or aiisessments must be forwarded within
thirty days thereafter and in the manuer hereto-

fore directed.

Sec. 3. In case the amount due from the sub-
ordinate Brancli is not received by the I edcrated
Secretary within thirty days from the date of the
call, he shall record the suspension of any delin-

quent Branch, and notice of suspension and
the cause thcr*iof shall be mailed to the Presi-

dent and Secretary of the suspended Branch, and
during the suspension of a ^subordinate Branch it

shall not be officially recognized except on busi-

ness pertaining to its reinstatement.

Sec 4. Any Branch so suspended shall stand
re- instated on the receipt of the amount due, to-

gether with a fine of ten cents for each member
in good standing at the date of its suspension,
which fine shall he paid into the general fund of

the Federated Association, whereupon its rein-

statement shall be certified by the Federated Sec-
retary to the suspended Branch. A Branch so
reinstated shall be required to pay all assess-

ments called during the thirty »iays next after th'^

date of its suspension.

Sec. 5. Any Branch suspended under the law
for non-payment of assessments and fines, failing

to reinstate itself within the period of two months
shall become dissolved.

AUTICLE IX.

Collection of Assessments By Branches
from Members.

Sec. 1. When it becomes necessary to levy
assessments, the Federated Secretary shall noti-

fy the Secretary of each Branch who will send a



notice of such assessment to each member of said

Branch, said notice shall be in the form provided
by the Federated Association and shall be left at

the last known post-office address or handed to

him in person. If the notice is left or mailed to

the last given address of the member, it shall be
sufficient notice to him.

Sec. 2. Each member shall pay the amount of

his assessment to the Financial Secretary within
thirty days from the date of such notice and any
member failing to pay his assessment within
thirty days shall stand suspended from the Asso-
ciaiion, and all benefits therefrom until such
assessment or future assessments shall be paid by
him, whereupon he shall be reinstated to tull

benefits in the Association. But it is hereby ex-
pressly declared, that the death of a member
while so suspended shall disentitle him to be re-

stored into good standing or to have Ms certifi-

cate renewed by payment of any assessment or
assessments for which he had caused his certifi-

cate to be made void, and that payment so ten-

dered by his personal representative or represen-
tatives during the said period, shall in no case
be held to restore the said member into good
standing in this Association or to renew the said
Certificate.

ARTICLE X.

Beneficiary Certificates.

Sec 1. A Beneficiary Certificate cannot be
made payable to a creditor nor be held in whole
or in part, nor assigned to secure any debt which
may be owing by the member. Any assignment of

a Beneficiary Certificate by a member or Bene-
ficiary shall be null and void.

i,v.<.„
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Sec. 2. In case a Beneficiary Certificate is lost

or beyond a member's control, the member may
in writing surrender all claim thereto and direct

that a new certificate be issued to him, payable to

the same or new beneficiary or beneficiaries upon
makin*,' affidavit of the facts in the case. This
declaration must be satisfactory to 'the Federated
Secretary and be accompanied by a fee of fifty

cents. The issuing of such new Certificate shall

cancel and render null and void any and all pre-

vious Certificates issued to such member.

Sec. 3. In the event of the death of all the
Beneficiaries desij^nated by a member before the

decease of such member, the benefit shall be paid

to the lethal heirs of the deceased member, and if

no person or persons shall be entitled to receive

such be efit by the laws of this Association it

shall revert to the Beneficiary Fund.

Sec. 4." A member may surrender his Bene-
ficiary Certificate and a new Certificate shall

thereafter be issued, payable to such Beneficiary

or Beneficiaries as such member may direct, in

accordance with the laws of the Association, up-

on payment of a fee of fifty cents, said surrender

and direction must be made in writing on the

Beneficiary Certificate, signed by the member,
and endorsed by the Secretary of the branch, and
forwarded to the Federated Secretary, parole

evidence or desire to change the Beneficiary,

must be disregarded.

ARTICLE XI.

Dissolution of Branches—Resignation of

Members—Expulsion of Members.

Fec. I. Any Branch becoming dissolved it

shall be the duty of the President, or if there is

none, of the senior officer to deliver up the Char-
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ter and otlier property to the Federated Secre-
tary, and all effects received by him from a dis-

solved Branch shall be restored in the event of

its being reinstated, which reinstatement may be
done by a major ity vote of the Federated Association
at the Annual Meeting, or during recess by the
Executive Board by order of the President on
payment of all dues and assessments due at the
date of dissolution.

Sec. 2. Any member of this Association who
may at any time resign his position as a letter car-

rier to better his condition or for other causes not
conliicting with the rules of the Civil Service,

shall be entitled to continue a member of the
Beneficiary Fund of this Association on pa} ment
of the annual Capitation Tax and all dues and
assessments in connection with the said Bane-
ficiary Fund.

Sec. 3. Anv member of this Association who
may be dismissed for cause or convicted for any
criminal offence against the rules of the Civil

Service, shall be deemed to have resigned from
Membership and shall cease from all benefits and
other privileges in this Association.

ARTICLE XII.

Sec. 1. All Branches of this Association shall

have the power to make local by-laws for their

own government, such by-laws not to conflict with
the Constitution and L8i.w8 of the Federated As-
sociation.

Sec. 2. All Branches making by-laws for their

own Government must ift all cases submit a copy
of the same to the Federated President for ijis

approval before being adopted by the Branch.
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i KG. 3. No business shall be transacted by
this .Association nor laws passed for its j^overn-

ment th t shall in any way conflict with the rules
of the Civil Service. All discussions of a politi-

cal or sectarian character are strictly prohibited.

RULES OF ORDER.

1. The President shall call the meeting to or-

der promptly at the time stated or adjourned to.

2. The President shall have the general direc-

tion of the hall, the right to name any member to

perform the duties of the chair (but such substi-

tution shall not extend beyond recess) and shall

also preserve order and decorum in the proceedings.

3. All committees shall be appointed by the
President unless otherwise ordered by the Asso-
ciation, in which case they shall be elected by a
majority vote.

4. All resolutions relating to other than
ammendments to the Rules of Order, shall be
submitted when the roll of delegates is called.'o'

6. A delegate desiring to speak, shall rise imd
respectfully address the Chair; shall announce
his name and the Branch he represents and he
shall not be entitled to the floor until the Chair
has formally recognized him.

6. No member shall speak more than once on
the same question nor more than ten minutes,
unless by consent of the Association.

7. When a motion is made and seconded, it

shall be stated by the President, when it is deem-
ed to be in possession of the Association, and
may be withdrawn by consent of the Association,
before an amendment is offered or decison had.
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8. When a question is under debate, no mo-
tion shall be received but to adjourn, to take a re-

cess, to lay on the table, from the previous ques-
tion, to postpone for a certain time, to commit, to

to ammend, to postpone indefinitely, which
several motions sliall have precedence in the ol-

der named.

9. A motion to adjourn shall be always in or-

der, but beinj^ decided in the ne<^ative shall not
be again entertained until such moti n, call or
order shall take place.

10. The following motions shall not be debat-
able, to wit: to adjourn, to take a recess, to lay
on the table, to take from the table, to go into
Committee of the hole, and all questions relat-

ing to the priority of business.

11. No motion or proposition, upon a subject
different from that under consideration, shall be
admitted under color of amendment.

12. A motion to re-consider must be made by
a member voting with the prevailing side and
shall take precedence of all other questions except
a motion to adjourn.

13. The previous question 'laving been moved,
shall be put by the Chair in this form; shall de-
bate now cease and the main question be now
put; and until decided no other business shall be
in order.

14. All questions of order shall be decided by
the President without debate.

15. Appeals from the decision of the Chair
shall be made in writing and signed by two dele-

gates. Only the Appellant and the President,
who shall vacate the (/hair for the time being,
shall debate the appeal.



16. Reports of Committee shall be signed by

such members thereof as concur therein.

17. No Committee shall sit during the daily

sessions of the Association, unless by special con-

sent. - ,i;.;Y

18. These Rules shall not be altered unless by

a two-thirds vote of a meeting of the Federated

Association. . .
.:-':-
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ORDER OF BUSINESS.
OPENING MEETING.

1- Oalliiij^r 17 oil of Officers.

2. Calling Roll of Representatives.

^. Reading Minutes.

i).

(1

7.

8.

9.

10

11.

12.

Report of Committee on Credentials.

Report of Officers.

Report of Executive Board.

Report of Committees in the following or-der—Appeals-New liusiness.

Report of Special Committee.

Unfinished Business.

New Business. Present::tion of Resolutions
Petitions, ^c. by Branches in their nu'rnerical order beginning with Bianchd

Presental ion of Bills .ind Accounts.
Adjourning or Closing.

/^f3R



If' 'i'"m.,uiw,w.v.".S'

h/-0

i

i
*4 H

J



r:.

n

I -t.v

<!%»






