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VOL VI.-No. 7.] NOVEMBER, 1850. {NEw SERIEs.

ART. XXXT.-Sk7etches of the Ende-
mic Fever of Upper Canada, and
of the Effécis of ils Climate on Eu-
ropean Conslitutions, by Joiiu JAn-
RoN, Surgeon, Dunnville.

[CONCLUDED FROM OUR LAST.]

After what lias already been said of
the character of congestive fevers it
would be out of place insuch a sketch
as this to give a detail of all their va-
rieties; and the appearances they exhi-
bit. For these I mnst refer to the
writings of the lamented Armstrong,
Dr. Wood's:Practice of Medicine, con-
taining the best articles on malarious
fevers I have.found il any system, and
the mo-re concise and pithy reports of
the British Naval Surgeonrs on the dis-
cases of the \Vest Indies, to be found
in Dr. Jas. Johnson's, Work,' and the
pages of the Medico-Chirurgichl Re-
view particularly; those of Dr. Dick-
son and Mr. Waller on the Mariegalante
Fever. I will confine myself to such
modifications as are common in Canada.

The tendency to congestion may be
detected in the state of the bilions ar-
rangement. The look of a patient will
be unusually haggard, the upper tarsi
depressed and eyes listless; the usual
pains and aches little complained of
except perliaps in the lunibar vertebroe
and coccyx, the prostration of strength
andtendeny to perspiration ou exertion
will be great, and attended with somne-
thing like syncope ; the drowsiness
and:tendency to sleep in the afternoon
more marked; and the following sen'
sations, o well describd'by Dr."Wood,
I have ofleri seern i l ots, and felt'

le goin aout and attending to

business :-" Usually the paroxysms
begin with simple drowsiness, the pa-
tient forgets quickly what lie may have
donc, said or desired ; stops, Nvheio'
speaking, inthe middle of a sentence,
or uses one word for another, and often
stammers.3

These symptoms are not confined to
the derangements preceding a first at
tack of fever, but can as readily be de-
tected in those which may follow, as
the subsequent derangements and agule
generally put ou the variety ofthe pre
ceding fever. Such symptms fr
quently pass into vhaf has been called
the "ecomatose interniittent," some-
times complete in the first attack'; but>
this may be sliglit and the second and
third more severe. The history of the
case, the appearance: of the patient
lying stretched out at length, and not
huddled up as in common: ague; the,
sunken countenance, the state of the
skin, often hot, soft, and moist, or if
dry in one part covered with>erspira-
lion in another, and those alternating,
so that we may have all three stages of
fever present on .the body at the samer
time-the pulse soft and rdther small,
but frequently fuli ard firin, though'
yielding 1readily under the finger, and
altered by the changing state admo-
tion of ihe patient, profuse but partial
perspirations breaking out, especially
about the head and neck, are;some of
the leading characteristics.

This state is often well exemplified
ii stout flabby childrenunder ten years
of age. I'them the attack is usually
sudden and attended:with convulsions,
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and may, for an hour or two, put on a
very inflanmatory appearance ; but the
paise then becomes soft, partial mois-
ture corne out on the skin, and the real
nature of the affection is manifested by
its course, and will gradually be more
slight in subsequent paroxysms, as the
secretions are restored to a healthy state,
and be ultimately stopped by a single
dose of quinine. Such attacks are fre-
quently preceded for days by startings,
disturbed sleep, and other head symp-
toms, and are capable of being arrested
in this stage. They frequently put on
much of the appearance of epileptie fits,
recurring regularly like ague, and con-
tinuing occasionally for months or even
years ; their real nature being easily de-
cided by their history and the effects of
treatment. I have seen the sane con-
vulsions and epileptiforni fits at the
commencument of the disease in adults,
but more rarely, unless vhere fever and
'delirium trenens are combined, vhich
will be afterwards noticed.

A remittent fever, when fairly formed
may also show a tendency to many of
the preceding symptoms; the patient
making little complaint, but appearing
oppressed and to be laboring under
a me affection of the head; or more than
usually restless, with general irritability
but always with great ýrostration of
strength. The pulse may be full but
without decided strength, but often ra-
ther small and irritable, and always ex-
ceedingly variable ; the tongue either
contracted, dry and red, with a harsh,
dry:skia; or rnuch coated and moist,
with perspiration ; the paroxysms of fe-
ver always irregular, frequently occur-
ring in the nigit, and the stages imper-
fectly developed. The excretions very
offensive, and often of a red color, dying
everything they touch of a deep yellow;
those froim the bowels approaching an
orange tint, vhich is almost as charac-

teristic of the state of depression in con-
gestive fevers, as the rice-water dis-
charges are of choiera. The mucos'
linings may become affected in tirne,
and apth appear in the mouth and
fauces, when the fever Vill become al-
most continued, attended by the usual
typhoid symptoms. The brain, from
the first, will appear muddled, and de-
liriui will occasionally show itself;
and very often a train of symptoms re-
sembling those already mentioned in
the quotation from Dr. Wood's work:-
" The intellect will be at times exceed-
ingly clear and the fancy vivid, but the
patients will always be found incapable
of directing their attention for any length
of time to a particular object, or of at-
tending to the least business arrange-
ment."

Attacks of mania, during the continu-
ance of these fevers are by no means
unfrequent. I once had three cases at
the same time within a few hundred
yards of each other. They usually sub-
side vith the fever, but form a trouble-
some complication that always protracts
it.

Maniacal symptoms will also show
themselves in the state of bílious de-
rangements preceding and following
these fevers. In the first state, uneasy
fullness and weight in the head will be
complained of, but the general history
of the case, and the slightly bilious and
depressed look of the patient, may b
ail to guide us to the true cause of the
mental malady., The bowels will gen-
eîally be found slutggish, the secretions
unnatural, and the skin dry. The ef-
fects of calomel purges and quinine, will
be decided; either ague or aguish per-
spiration soon after heing recognised,
and. the patient relieved for a tirne, but
tie wvhole train of symptons may re-
turn iii a greater or less degree with the
bilious derangements of the season.

294 THE BRITISH- AMERICANî
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The same affections occurring after a
fever are stili more troublesome. They
are rarely attended by regular ague;
but the patient does not regain his ap-
petite and flesh, looking ghastly and
exceedingly miserable, though it will
be impossible to detect any organic af-
fection. The skia vill usually be dry,
and vhen perspiration does come out,
the smnell will be offensive; the tongue
generally clean, red and moist, becom-
ing coated with every attack of fever ;
and these, though of a paroxysmal char-
acter, are never regular. The bowels
will be irregular, usually sluggish ;the
stools dark brown, viscid and tending
to black, and offensive.; the color of the
urine will vary, and the aguish snell
may be detected about the patient and
his cloihes. le will generally be found
exceedingly listless and unwilling to,
leave his bed or the side of the fire,
passing restless and sleepless nights.

The mental affection will vary-often
to be detected only in the changed ha-
bits and dispositions of a patient to the
most furious and decided maniac ; at-
tended by depraved secretions, fits of
paroxysmal fever, and great depression
and sinking; the patient lying for hours
in an exhausted state, covered with
perspiration, with cold extremities, and
scarcely a pulse to be felt.

ln cases of this variety of fever, at-
tended from the first with irritability
and restlessness, I have seen epileptic
fits supervene ii tle course of the dis-
ease, the effects of which are very pe-
culiar. The pulse of the patient and
his heat of skin will sink with each fit,
the former being scarcely to be felt, and
the hands and extremities becoming
Cold and covered vith a clammy pers-
piration; these will ,both regain their
ordinary state after a time only to lose

sit aga with eaci subsequent fit; in'
fac, every fit being attended by a state

of collapse, while red dry tongue, pick-
ing at the bed clothes, and other typhoid
symptoms always accompany them.
The patient vill be insensible during
the fits and for some time after, but in
the intervals delirium may not be pre-
sent; the mental faculties being often
little disturbed until towards the close
of life, which is usually preceded by
that gradual sinking and long-continued
cold extremities so common in typhoid
fevers.

The sudden alteration of the expres-
sion of the countenance after the occur-
rence of the fits deserves notice. The
features sink, and the appearance of
excessive old age becomes as decided as
I have seen it in the vorst cases of cho-
lera. I once lost a lad of nineteen and
an old man of eighty years of age in the
same day with these syrmptoms it
would have been impossible to tell, from
the expression of their countenances,
son-letime before death, which vas tha
elder of the two.

At other times, when the unusual
symptoms of the fever are little marked,
we may suddenly find irritability and
restlessness cone on ; the pulse become
irritable and intermitting, with, slight
subsultus tendinurn and perhaps some
head symptoms. The subsequent at-
tacks of fever will instantly vary, and
put on the appearance of the most de-
ciled typhus, with sinking pulse, dry
glazed tongue, muttering delirium, pick-
ing at the bed clothes, &c. &c.; often
attended by voniting of dark offensive
matter, and always by discharges of
depravedársecretions from the bowels.
This state may require the u e of stimuli

'to prevent sinking fromrr collapse; but
the consequences to be dreaded are epi-
leptic fits, or a train of low typhous
symptoms under which the patient will
be carried off. It is often prevented, or
speediiy removed, by a judicious bu
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free use of calomel, opium, purgatives,
and quinine, wben hie fever will again
assume its usual course : thus showing,
by the evanescent character of the
change, that it must have depended on
some temporary state of the secretions
or the blood, and not on any peculiar
virus taken into the body and requiring
time for its elimenation ; or any change
of structure of the organs, or alteration of
the mucous tissues or glands connected
vith thens.

Another forrn of this fever is exempli-
lied in the cases of the Pineket family,
published in your Journal of November,
1849. There the skin was dry, the se-
cretions dark and viseid, the heacd evi-

dently affected, though the peculiar
symptoms of it were not prominent, or
the functions of the brain much deran-

ged. In Charlotte's case the effects of
calomel, purges, and of quinine, while
the secretions remained in a norbid
state, were seen, as well as of stimuli,
which I there administered to a greater
extent than I had ever donc before,
merely on account of the fatal tendency
if the disease. Her countenance and
skin lost their bronzed appearance, but
none of the other symptoms gave way:
·md death would likely have happened
n the same mariner, irrespective of the
ifction ofthe throat. The suppression
>f the disease and the return of healthy
,ecretions in two of the cases the instant
rnereurial ptyalism appeared, are to me
lecisive of the nature of the affection,
md of the only mode of treatiment at all
à be depended on, as the effect of qui-
dne was scen to be se uncertain while
hé secretions are depraved, and the
.ndency to fever is unchecked.

The morbid dissection reported is also
aluable as occurring in an extreme
ase, the like symptons being exhibited
i often withoutbeing followed by death;

nd in private practice the opportunities

are few of corroborating the diagnosis
even in fatal cases. The most particu-
lar points seem to be the extefit of the
congestion of the vessels of the head
with so little derangement of the fune-
tions of the brain; the -normaI state of
the liver, longs, and spleen, and of the
peritoncal lining of the abdomen; the
peculiar colour of the bile, and the se-
cretions in the stomacli and duodenum,
and the offensive smell emitted, which
prevented a more minute investigation.

The ochrey colour of the bile and se-
cretions in the stomach is unusual. I
have only seen it in one case besides,
the bistory of which may have some
bearing on my peculiar opinions in these
cases.

la 1847, the wife of an emigrant in
better circumstances, who came frorn
Ireland 'about the time the emigrant
fever was so fatal, but which the family
escaped, was, after being some weeks
bere, seized with intermittent fever and
botvel complaint, but which did not pre-
vent ber fron taking a journey into the
country for ten days or a fortnight, du-
ring which she sufferied a good deal. i
was called te see her two days after she
got bomne, and found ber in a state of
perfect collapse, with much of the cho-
lera expression of countenance, the ex-
tremities cold, pulse almost gone, and
body covered with a clammy perspira-
tion ; there were no cramps and little
pain of the belly, but great thirst and an
incessant discharge of an ochrey colour-
ed fluid, in no large quantity, from both
the stomach and bowels, and that with-
out pain or effort, as if squirted out by a
sudden contraction of the tubes. I had
recourse to calomel, opium, and stimu-
lants, but relief was only partial, though
the patient lived for tbree days. The
ochrey coloured discharges became corn-
pletely changedso on after taking the
calomel, and she had discharged in the
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same manner, a grass green matter ex-
actly agreeing with the description of
the chopped spinage discharges that
were found in the typhoid fevers follow-
ing attacks of cholera in this country.

This seems to be the place to notice
that peculiar combination of the symp-
toms of malarious fevers with those of
delirium tremens, and its effect in de-
pressing the powers of life, which is so
apparent. The class of symptomis to
which the terni delirium tremens is ap-
plied bas so long been looked on as the
effect of cerebral itritation requiring for
its alleviation and cure the most power-
fui stimuli, that it would secm hetero-
doxy eiher to question the proposition
or to suggest a different mode of treat-
ment. In 1830,-when in China, I met
vith a decided case of malarious fever,

combined at its very commencement.
with the symptoms of delirium tremens.
It was vith the' utmost anxiety-that I
had recourse to the usual course of calo-
mel and purgatives, and with a tremb-
ling band that I dared to take Exx of
blood The effects of these were salu-
tary rather thon otherwise; but I sus-
pended such unusual proceedings and
iad recourse to stimuli, thougli the

stools 'were all along black, tarry, and
offeisive. After a severe attack my
patient recovered, but the impression
was left on my mind that the state of
the secretions was a prominent cause of
the peculiar affection, which 1was ulti-
mately strengthened by the fact that I
could always suppress the slightest ten-
dency of the symptoms of the delirium
Io return by the free use of calomel
purges, and which the state of the bow-
els at the time generally required ; and
that two years after the patient again
got the fever at the same place, it was
accompanied by precisely the same
sy'nptoms, and carried hi off by in-
flamiation of the brain.

la Canada I soon found cases of dili-
rium tremens accompanied by the most
decided symptoms of bilious derange-
ment, with paroxysms of intermittent
and remittent fevers, and exhibiting a
set of symptoms scarcely to be met with
in the usual descriptions of the disease,
in the treatment of which I have every
year departed more and more from the
recognized routine, and had recourse to
calomel, purgatives, and blood-letting.

The following extract that I lately
met with in Rankin's Half-yearly Ab-
stract of the Medical Sciences, for 1848,
was to me exceedingly gratifying, tend-
ing as it does to support my own deduc-
tions and the unusual mode of practice I
was following; and it cannot be without
its value to the profession that indivi-
duals so wide apart should, be observing
with such different objects in view,-
Mr. Corfe's being to determine the cause
of delirium tremens under ordinary cir-
cumstances; and mine, without ques-
tioning the recognized course of the
affection, being merely directed to a pe-
culiar modification of malarious fevers
occurring in bard drinkers, and those
subject to attackis of delirium tremens,
and in which the two diseases might be
combined; and that the practice re-
sulting therefron is not only safe but
successfnl.

Mr. Corfe states :- ILt should be ob-
served that every case of threaïening
delirium tremens is precèded by more
or less biliary derangement;; and, as
these men rarely enjoy active or healthy
secretions from their alimentary canal,
it does appear, from 'the observations of
alarge number of cases in thishospital
the disease is purely hepatic in its ori-
gin., This opinion is entertained by Dr.
Seth sThotepson, who has most succeess-
fully treated some of the worst cases of
this disorder with large and repeated
doses of calomel,, followed by brisk ca-
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thatties; and he bas never been obliged
to resort to opium at all, sleep having
succeeded the active unloading of the
bepatic system. It bas long since struck
my mind that the invasion of the dis-
ease springs from a suddcu, or, it may
be, a graduai poisoning of the blood, by
means of a chemical alteration in the
bile and urine; and that some of the
elements of one or both of these secre-
tions are carried through the circulation.
My chief reasons for drawing these con
clusions are the following-Tte disease
has given way in a decided manuer
under sharp purgation with calomel,
&c., and the improvement is invariably
coexistent with the passage of numerous
dark, offensive, and deeply-bilious evac-
uations. Again, a very large number
of cases, and thosé of the worst form'
present tLhemselves with symptotns
poison by urea. .It is stated that theyf
have bad one or more fits; these fits
are distinctly epileptic, and exactly re-
sembling those attacks which sometimes
occur in persons labouringunder albumi-
nous disease of the kidney, and in whom
the disappearance of urea from the urine,
and its presence in the circulating fluids
have been repeatedly detected by Dr.
Christison and others. In fatal cases of
delirium tremens an epileptic fit is often
the forerunner of death."

It strikes me that Mr. Corfe is too
limited in his views; that the poisonous
state of the blood is brought about by
the alteration of the bile and the urine;
and that sonie of-the symptoms he men-
tions may be caused by the presence of
urea in it, resulting from the nearly
complete suppression of urine in most
of the cases. The adoption of them
would tend to localise the affection in
the liver and kidneys; while' the vitia-
ted state of the stomacli and small in-
testines- show an early alteration in the
chyme itself, from which the, blood is

directly derived in a state that even
normal glands could not perforim their
usual functions.

I have seen in this disease the urine
entirely suppressed for days without
epileptic fits or the effects of urea in the
blood being apparent; on the other hand,
I bave often seen these results occur
instantaneously, and without tme slight-
est chance of their being produced by
such a cause: while the symptoms
and course of the disease would tend to
show that the vitiated secretions of the
liver and kidneys were the effect of the
state of the digestive functions resulting
from the disease and the habits of the
patient, wlcreby the blood submitted to
the action of these glands is so changed
that their secretions are altered, and a
tendency to inflammation in their sub-
stance induced ; just as we sce exenipli-
fied in ptyalistm. Mercury enters the
blood, 'the secretion froni the salivary
glands is changed, and an enlargetment
and inflammation of their substance
takes place.

The functions of both the liver and
kidneys are most important in preserv-
ing a healthy state of the blood ; but we
frequently sce the bile, when secreted
from normal blood, prevented by me-
chanical obstruction from entering the
duodenum, and taken into the circula-
tion by absorption without the bilions
derangernents of rnalarious fevers or di-
lirium tremens being produced ; and the
urine may be retained in the bladder,
or even not secreted for days, witbout
the poisonous effects of urea being
manifested. Iu Britain you often have
most perfect jaundice from mechanical
obstructions, without malarious fever;
and I have seen a like cause produce
the sane result in malarious countries,
and in parties subject tofevers, without,
a single symptom of them being present
showing evidently tbat the state of the
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blood must depend on some other cause
than the increase or decrease of the se-
cretion of the bile, or any temporary
alteration in the state of the gland. Fe-
vers being produced by a congested state
of the liver and consequent alteration in
the bile, and by inflammation of the

membranes of the brain or mucous
linings of the stomach, to which ihey
are attributed by so many, were long
stunbling-blocks in my way in arrivimg
at the truc cause of the diseuse. Each
or all of these may bc present withou. a
fever of this class, as well as duriug the
course of one, wlien observation will
generally show them to be the result of
previous derangement, and not the pri
aary cause of the affection. We may

be obliged to refer to thesi observations
vhen speaking of dropseal affections

with albuminous urine resulting froni
malarions fevers ;. this state of the urine
constituting "Bright's Disease" being
so often looked on as the result of a
peculiar disorganization of the kidneys,
but recent enquirers are questioning the
deductions, as the state of .the urine is
frequently fouud without alteration of
the kidneys, and ascribing both to ie
effect of altered blood, of whicl Briglit
supposes them to be the cause.

In this country, where the habit of
driniking to excess is so frequent, the
efect is soon perceived on the diseuses
of the climate. The oily skin, the per-
spiration and breath more than usually
offensive, a white contracted and trem-
bling tongue, a sort and intermitting
pulse with some degree of subsultus
tendinum, are indications of the habits
of a patient, and ocurring with bilious
derangements may lead us to expect an
attack of-delirium trem'ens. These are
frequent during the sickly season, occur-
ring both after a debauch and vith little
-alteration in the usual habits of a patient.
The bi6lous symptons are usually in

excess, requiring a free use of calomel
and purgatives for ieir removal, and by
which the peculiar state of tie delirium
ii 'mure effectually alleviated than by
opium and stimulants.

In con firmed drunkards, whose habits
have undermincd their constitutions, the
first we may hear of the disease wvill be
the occurrence of au epileptic fit, and
will fiud the patient with bilious de-
rangements, the usual symptorns of
delirium tremens, and in a state of
nearly perfect collapse,-the breath and
odour from the body miost horribly of-
fensive. The fits will recur in quick
succession, sometimes two or three in
an hour; I have known them continue,
with slight intervals, for a veek or ten
days, the patient at last dying, with
symptoms ot inflammation within the
hcad. At other tines, occurring as fre-
quently and lasting as long, accompa-
nied by tetanie symptoms, perfect opis-
thatonos, from which the patien ireco-
vered : the diseuse becoming paroxys-
mal, and the patient ultimately sinking
as if poisoned by his own secretions.
Coma often appears on the second or
third day, and the patient soon sinks. I
saw one case with orange coloured dis-
charges fron the bowels ; the depression
was excessive, and the patiènt sunk ex-
hausted in less than 24 bous without
either corna or affection of the brain.
The leading peculiarity is the'disgusting

odour issuing from"h'e body, not confi-.
ned to the excrements and bréath, but
steaming from every pore, rend]ering k
often impossible to approach it without
experiencing sickness at stomach, and
producing the impression on those un-
accustomed toat the pa-

tien's ecremas fr dys were, stil
kept under tha bcd. I once had a case
wil pectoral symptms: the expectora
tion was as offensive as that found in
gangrone of ïhe lungs, though nouc
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state was present,--the odour being con-
moa to every other discharge from the
body. When death is not the result of
inflammation of the brain or coma, it
usually happens suddenly when least
expected.

We find many patients had recourse
to drastic purgatives, and often to blood-
letting, on the occurrence of hie preno-
nitory symptomns of these affections; the
lancet may be freely used wh1en the
constitution is not completely broken
down, and if neglected an apoplectic
attack during a paroxysm of fever may
result. Large doses of calomel and
drastic purgatives will be required to
bring about frce discharges fron the
bowels, and may be repeated every
second night until the secretions arc
restored, and the fever and delirium
suspended. I have never entirely omit-
ted the ,use of stimuli and opium, but
only give occasional full doses as the
symptoms might secm to require. I
have also used camphor in large doses.

lu the epileptie attacks the constitu-
tion of the patient and the state of col-
lapse may prevent the abstraction of
blood on the accession of the disease;
but it must Ëe watched, and the acces-
sion of an inflammatory affection at
once suspended by a free bleeding,
vhich I have even repeated, and blood

will then be easily obtained, notwith-
standing the partial state of collapse in
which the patient may be. In all cases
of congestion the patients ought to be
bled in the horizontal position; and the
effects of it on the constitution narrowly
watched.

In the tetanic case, an individual in
ordinary health dropped down in a fit
and was picked up with collapse ; the fits
recurred, and symptoms of delirium
tremens showed tlemselves. Mr. Allen,
surgeon of the Royal Navy, saw him
beforo my arrival, and could only get a

few ounces of blood frorn bis arm. The
disease vent on incrcasing, and t vas
four or five days after that we found the
anticipated inflam matory symptons
prescnt. I at once took thirty ounces
of blood fron the arm, to which we
attributed the safety of the brain and the
ultimate suspension of the fits. The
secretions never becamne hîealthy, nor
did the disgusting odour leave the body.
He died about thrce weeks after being
bled, in the mianner previouslystated.

Dunnville, Ang. 1850.

ART. XXXIH.-A few Rernarks on
the Developînent and Structure of
the Human Teeth, with an Enquiry
into ihe Cause of Dental Carics.
By R. M'LroNT, D.D.S., Quebec.
Almost every age of the world's his-

tory has been signalized by soie valu-
able discovery in science or art; but
the present is emphaticaUy one of in-
vestigation. Men of every nation have
investigated most closely that depart-
ment of science peculiarly their own.
The result lias been most satisfactory-
truth lias been elicited, facts have been
established, and many things hitherto
considered facts, proved to be hypo-
theses and chimeras.

In no departnent of science lias the
result been more satisfactory than in
the medical. Physiologists, with a
most laudable curiosity, have scruti-
nized the motions of the beautiful ma-
chine, and almost revealed to ouir
astonished vision the secret springs of
life itself. Pathologists have presented
us with morbid specimens of almost
every disease that flesh is heir to, and
in almost every stage.

We are not now in doubt as to the
cause of the vexatious cough vhich is
too surely the precursor of that nelan-
choly disease, pulmonary consumption;
dissection shows it to be attributable to
the presence of tubercles in their forin-
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ing stage. Nor are we left to conjec-
ture as to the cause of the profuse ex-
pectoration and hemorrliage of the more
advanced stage : ocular denonstration
has likewise shown these tubercles
broken down, and blood vessels rup-
tured by their ravages.

Chemist3, too, have analysed the
gases, and put us in possession of
means to counteract their injurious
tendencies. They have determined
the exact proportion of the constituents
of bone, blood, and muscle. They have
made their knowledge subservient to
the health and happiness of man, the
amelioration of the brute creation, and
ev'en agriculture itself.

But much remains to be learned-
man has not yet reached the ne plus ul-
tra of scientific research, and to an end
so desirable, so fraught vith interest to
the well-being of our fellow creatures,
let each one ]end himself, and by close
observation contribute his share to: lte
establishment of general facts and prin-
ciples.

The teeth regarded as they are by
ll, as very important organs of the h-

man body, have corne in for a certain
amount of scientific observation. Good-
sir, Arnold, Blake, Fox, Nasmyth, Hjar-
ris, and many others have not thought it
bencath them to consecrate varied and
brilliant talents to the investigation of
this subject. We have had elaborate
ani interesting treatises written on the
structure and formation of these organs,
and many able disquisitions on the dis-
cases to vhich they are subject. Caries
being by far the most frequent of these,
I would desire in this paper to cal
more general attention to it, in the hope
that by stating the opinions of the most
eminent dental pathologists, and the
few facts I have observed in my own
experience, I may induce others to do
flie saie, the result of vhich will be

the recognition of gencral principles,
whereby we may be enabled to inter-
pret accurately Ihe phenomena of den-
tal disease, and pave the way to still

greater improvements in dental sur-
gary.

But, in order riglitly to understand
the cause and treatment of this disease,
it may be well to see that we are fully
acquainted with the structure and for-
mation of the organs themselves. For-
tunately flte researches of the achrorna-
tic microscope have tlirown much light
on the subject ; indeed, hardly anything
remains to be desired.

As early as the year 1678, Leuen-
hoch described the human tooth as
made up "of very small, straight, and
transparent pipes, and he calculated
that the number of these pipes in a
single molar amounted to five mil-
lions." !! Subsequent investigation has
proved the correctness of his investiga-
tions, and moreover that these 'tubuli
do not traverse the spaces between the
successive layers, as in ordinary bone,
but are originated from the pulp cavity,
and radiate outwardly, having their
long axis corresponding with the course
of the tooth fibre.

The diameter of these tubuli at their
radiating point is about 110,000th of
an inch, but t17ey become muclh smaller
as they radiate towards the surface.

As every one kIows the teeth are
composed of animal and mineral sub-
stances in intimate union,, the earthy
components are secreted by the red
portion of the blood, while the muci-
lage which goes to form the animal
proportion is derived from the vhite or
serous part. According to Berzelius,
an analysis of 100 parts of dentine gave
the following constituents

Phosphate of Lime. 62.
Fluate of Lime ....... 2.
Carb. of Lime.. ..... 5.5
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Phos. Magnesia ........ 1.
Sod aa . ... ........ . 1.5
Gelatine. ...... 28.

but these proportioins, i is ahnst need-
]ess to say, vary Ii ahiiost every cae.
according as the ieli are handor oft,
the earthy constiuents beinst fonnd iii

mucli greater abundance in tlie former
than in the latter.

Althongh the ossification of ihese
organs does not begin to take place tili
about the fifili monilit of intra-nterinie
existence, their rudimeintal formation
in the jaw is observable at a muuch car-
lier period. Mr. Goodsir, in a paper on
this subject, publisied in the Edinburgh
Medical and Surgical Review of Jan-
uary 1839, says that he commenced his
microscopie investigations in an em-

bryo of the 6th week, at which period
lie observed a groove formed by 1î:c

semi-circular folds of mucous mem-

brane exiending arouid eacli jaw; as
this videns from behind forwards, a
ridge running ii hie sane direction
rises from its floor and divides the ori-
ginal groove into two others. The ou/er

one forming the duplicature of mucous
membrane fron the inside of the lip to
thò outside of the alveolar processes."

The inner one ie calls " the primftive

denial groove, in which the gerins of
the future teeth make their appearance.

At about the 7th week after concep-
tion the first temporary molaris makes
its appearance in the bed of this groovo

in the shape of a "free granular papilla

of an ovoidal form," the long diameter
of which is antero-posterior. By the
Sth week the temporary cuspidatus is

observed in like manner; by tIe end
of the 9th week the germs of the iici-
sores appear. During the lOth veck
the 2nd temporary molaris is observa-
ble, thus completing the deciduous set

of teeth.
The sides of the groove now gradu-

ally approach eaci otier, forning a

jfoli ie whieh iivests each looli. Tle
pîpil - of the respeciive leeth now be-

inî to ana:m- a patiienhiinr forni, the
ininres ihat of the future t eeth: the
euspida i bec-me simple cones, and
ti olîares liaiten transversely.

At this perlod (tihe .1thn weelk) the1
priiinilive denial gruove coitains hie
grmns of the ienmporary teeli. This
grioove is now si1uated Iighe r up iii the
jaw tihan before, and may now, says
AMr. Goodsir, " be denoiinated the se-
coudary dental groore, from lithe fact
that it is here tirat provision is made for
the production of the pernanent teeth."

This is brought about, says our au-
tlhor, by "a depression of a cresceit
shape immediately belhind tie inner
opercula of the follicles," The opercula
in tle meanî tiire close the moulis of
the follieles, but without adhering to
them, beginningwith lthe central inci-
sores, then with tihe laieral, then the
cuspidati, and so on to the second mo-
lares.

The secondary groorc being now
closed up, ti follicles are converted
into sacs, the papile into the pulips of
the termporary teeth, and tie crescent
formed depressions into cavilies of re-
serre, froi which the pulps and sacs of

the permanent tceth are produccd.

An intervening space is now observ-
able between the pulps and the sacs, in
-whichr is deposited a "gelatinous gran-
ular substance," whiclh at about the
5th month of gestation is found to have
extended over the whole of the interior
of these organs, and is believed to b
destined for the formation of the enamel,
wlicl interesting process vill shortly
cone under notice.

The outer membrane of this sac is
picnmifully supplied with blood from
small twigs sent off fron the dental
aiteries, which anastomosing "ramify
on the entire surface of the membrane."
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hlie eminences of It tenporary teeth
having now becomie vascular-, begtin. to
ossify ; layer after laver beingz depositcd
fron without mcards, or fror the sur-
face lo th centre of Ihe tooli, in this
respect diff'ing from the fonnation of
ibe otcer lones of lie bd v.

The before-mentioned cavities of re-
serve are no-w observed above and be-
lhind the temporary teceth inbedded in
tie naxillary tuberosity, they soon ac-
quire the appearance of dental pulps,
aud "rernain in li is posilion until the
lengthening and irruption of the tom-
porary tecth, -when they gradually re-
cede and insinuate themselves between
lte temporary leeth, until they are only
connected by their proximal extremi-
lies, througeh the aiveolo-dental fora-
mina, or itinera-dentium of Delabarre."

Dentine is covered by a hard and
beautifully polished substance called
ename. This invests the crown and
neck of every looth, and raaterially pro-
tects tIe subjacent osseous tissue fron
the action of injurious agents. Tlie
eartihy salts greatly predominate over
the animal matter in the enamel. The
following is an analysis of 100 paris

Phosphate of Lime.... 85.3
pluate of Lime ......... 3.2
Carb. of Line .......... 8.
Pios. IMagnesia ..... .5

Soda............1.
Animal Matter......... 1.

According o Coodsir, Raschkow, and
Nasmyth, three of the most eminent
autiorities on this subject, the enamel
is formaed froin lie gelatinous granular
substance before mentioned; and which
is situated between the follicle and the
ooth germn, lhe latter of whici it closely
envelopes. This granular substance is
surrounded by a flaid whici Raschkow
says bears a striking resemblance to
the liquor amnii, and whici, by a po-
culiar unknown process, is transforned

i
into a membrane which attaches itself
to the pulp.

According o tiis author the inner
surface of tiis membrane consists of an
nininilt number of short fibres, each of
w-hici lie considers an excretory duct,
whose funelion it is to secrelo "the
enamel fibre corresponding Io it."-
Those fibres, at a certain point in the
ossification of the detal pulp, begin to
secrete the earthy salis which chiefly
make up this substance. This mem-
brane is believed to be the bond of
union which exists between the enamel
fibres and the bone of the tooth.

The enamel fibres are of an hexago-
nal form, and radiate from the centre to
the surface of the tooth. The cells of
the enamel, says Mr. Nasmyth, "are
of a semicircular form, and the con-
vexity of the semicircle looks upwards
towards the free external portion of the
tooth." These cells are arranged in
undulating curves, thus securing infi-
nitely greatei strength and resisting
power than if -tiey were straigit regu-
lar coluns.

There is yet another substance n-
cluded in thi structure of the human
teeth, called the "crusta petrosa," or

e n and which invests the
fang only: from its being more vascu-
lar lia dentine it serves the admirable
purpose of preserving a close union
between the tooth and the bony sub-
stance in which it is imbedded. As
regards the structure of the " crusta
petrosa"I it is vcry similar to that of
dentine, having an infinite number of
minute cells and tubuli intersected in
its thickest layers by vascular canais.
This substauce can be detected by the
naked eye on the teetli of all the herbi-
vorous mamraalia : but it needs the aid
of a microscope to discern it on the
human teeli.

In concluding our rernarks on this
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part of the subject, it is perhaps hardly
neccssary to state to the professional
readers of this Journal, thiat the teetih
arc vascular and capable of circulatingt
red blood. The auithor of tIhis paper
Intely saw, in the city of Baltimore,
several teeth taken from the month of a
man just drowned, and which were so
palpably charged with blood that they
looked like pieces of red coral. It is
probable that the red blood had been
violently injected into tIhe bony canals
at the moment, and during the exertion
of asphyxia. Dr. Maynard, of Wash-
ington, U.S., has several specimens in
his possession; and Mr. Tomes, dentist
to the Middilesex Ilcrpital School, Eng-
land, has in his late work given a
beautiful drawing of a section of a tooth
in this condition: it was extracted fron
the mouth of a gentleman who had just
before undergone very violent bodily
exercise.

I shall now proceed to notice shortly
the nature and cause of that most de-
structive disease to which the teeth are
sublect,-Dental Caries.

I say dental caries because there ap-
pears to be little analogy between caries
of the teeth and that of the other bones.
Decay of the teeth consists in a break-
ing down of their molecules, a decom-

position of tIhe earthy salts of which
they are composed, unaccompaniedi by
-pain (the pain in a diseased tooth being
caused by the exposure of the nerve.)
The decay assumes almost every va-
riety of appearance, from white or
cream color to that of a dark brown or
very black aspect. This disease is
unaccompanied by those phenomena
usually observed in inflammation of the
other bones, such as suppuration, a
discharge of fetid sanies, growth of
fungus flesh, &c.

Indeed, it is now almost universally
conceded that inflammation is not the

cause of dental decay. Vere it so, ita
attacks woul( not be conifined, as they
are, Io the crowns of tIe teelh, but be
as liaile to a fieet the roots, the enamel,
or the pulp caviîy. The Irut h is, the
osseous part of a tooth is toofecb/y and
imperfectly vitalised Io admit of ils
beinr sulject to inilammation.

It is troe that tlie lining rncmbrane of
a Iooth nay be, iay often is, attacked
by inflammation ; but the pain and
condition of a toolli il this state is in
ail respects widely different from one
aoeecied with the disease in question.

As another, and we think quite con-
clusive, evidence that inflammation is
not the cause of dental decay, we may
mention the fact Ihat teeth of otlier
animails, or those of bone or ivory in-
serted as aitificial substitutes, are, in
certain cases, as liable to decay as the
living human teeth, and the decay
exhibits about the smie appearance in
the one as in the ollier. This of course
could not take place, were caries de-
pendant upon inflammation.

It is now universally acknowledged
by the educatedi members of the pro-
fession, that dental caries is a chemical
erosion of the teeth, by the action of an
acid, either contained in the fluids of
the mouth or lthe resuilt of decomposed
particles of our food, which may find
lodgment in the interstices of tie teeth.
This acid entering into combination
with the earthy salis of whicli the organs
are mainly composedî, breaks them
down by little and little, until finally
the nerve is laid bare Io the action of
the atmosphere and external irritants,
and the well-known pain of ioothache
is tlie result, an atfection more familiar
to the mnouths of most persons than even

household words."

It might indeed be supposed that as
there are but four acids which possess
a stronger aflinity for lime than the
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phosphorie, viz.: the oxalic, tle suc-
cinie, the tartaric, and the sulphuric ;
therefore all the other acids would have
no injurious effect on these orgaus
but every observing dentist knows the
contrary. However, we are not left in
any doubi upon this subject ; for by the
interesting experiments of Prof. West-
macott, performed before the class of
the Baltimore college of Dental Surgery,
we have a detailed account of the ac-
tions of nearly all the acids, vegetable
and mineral, on the human teeth.

The following was the result of the
experiments:--Acetic acid, or common
vinegar, and likewise citric acid, en-
tirely corroded the enamel iin two days ;
malic acid (or that produced fromt ap-
ples) acted nearly as readily ; muriatic,
sulphuric, and nitric acids, although
much diluted, made a very marked im-
pression in about the same time ; super
taitrate of potash proved very injurious ;
while ordinary table raisins so affected
the enanel in 24 hours that it could be
detached with the finger-nail.

Now when we remember that all the
above-named ingredients either enter
into the composition of our daily food,
or are exhibited as very general medi-
cinal agents, we canniot wonder at the
prevalence-I had ahnost said univer-
sality-of dental caries.

Prof. C. A. Harris, of Baltumore, (and
a more eminent authority cannot be
cited) is of hIe opinion that caries is
iiore generally caused by an acidulated
condition of the salivary and nucous
fluids of the mouth, than by the extrin-
sic exhibition of acids, or by that gene-
rated from putrescent particles of food.

This gentleman instituted a series of
experiments fron which it appeared
that thomucous secretions of the mouth
were, in the generality of cases, cbar-
ged with nitrous (septic) acid, while
tlose of the parotid, submaxillary, and

sublingual glands were as universally
neutral; however, in cases-of marked
gastrie irritation, especially if of long
standing, the salivary secretions like-
wise were invariably found to be in an
acidulated condition.

According to MM. Tieddemann,
Gmelin, and Donné, the latter of whom
has investigated this subject with his
characteristic carefulness, it appears
that the saliva is always alkaline when
the stomacli perforns its functions pro-
perly, -nd tbis being its normal quality,
lie considers all deviations from it as
indicative of gastric disease.

Desirous of arriving at some accurate
conclusion on the subject, I have been
in the habit of testing the saliva of my
patients for some time back, and I have
found that the salivary secretions gave
evidence of being slightly charged with
an acid; but I confess I could not accu-
rately deternirne the condition of tlie
mucous secretions.

Ii two or three cases which have
coern under my notice, vhere the den-
tine was slightly or not at all affected,
I have observed the sae phenomena;
so that I confess the result of my own
experiments has not been as satisfac-
tory in corroboralion of the above theory
as miglit have been expected.

Moreover, if dental caries is caused
by an acidulated condition of the secre-
tions of the mouth, how comes;it that
the lower incisores, which, are con-
stantly bathed in the secretions of the
submaxillary and sublingual glands, are
comparatively exempt from the disease
in question ? Unless these teeth are 0f
a denser texture. than the others, (of
which there is no evidence), and so
more capable of resisting the action of
any chernical agent, it urnist be admit-
ted l iat this fact stands mucl in the
way of ihe intelligent cstablishment of
the above theory.
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With ail due deference to the opinion
of Prof. Harris and 0iiers wiho taae his
viewv of the question, i arm inclined to
think that dental caries is more fre-
quently caused by lthe action of an acid

generated by the acelous ferimeumation

of portions of food whieh may lodge
about the teeth. The lower incisores
being more closely arranged than the
other teeth, do not afford the sane op-

portunity for this lodgnent, and hence
I believe iheir comoparative exemption
fromi the disease ; and this explanation
is the more satisfaclory Io my own
mind, as daily observation convinces
me that caries of t/te tee/t is a disease
incompalible ith perfect cleaniiness of
the organs. Were this duiy religiously
observed, 1 fully believe - our occupa-
tion would be gone." Il this respect
at least every man could b his owni
dentist.

However, we are only on the tires-
lold of scientific enquiry b hut a spirit
of invesuication and ardent deshte for
knowledge have been .stirred up among
the ed ueated members of thei profession
which vil] not rest, we trust, iiil the
phenomnena and cure of dental disease
are as palpable and easy of demonsitra-
tion as many oller facts in inedical
sc;ence.

Let each one lend his energies and
consecrtiae his talents to an end so de-
sirable. Let him enter the field of
laborious pains-taking investigation, in
the spirit of one who is determined to
surmount all obstacles, whose patience
vill hold out, and whose ardor will not

flag, antil he has reached the " ultina
liule'? of scientifle research. Let him
go forth under the shadow of that Il ban-
ner wiih a strange device Excelsior,"
and we doubt not lie will one day reach

the sumit of professional excellence
and professional trulli.

His reward will be, not so mtuchî hav-

ing his Iiie iiscribed in the temple of
Fm e, for lthat is perisiible ; but railher
the conciousness of iavinz lessened
the overwhelning burden of human
suffering, and of having discovered the
cause and cure of one of the nany "ills
that fi-sh is heir Io."

Qucbcc, Sept. 2, 1850.

ART. XXX III.-Fracture of the Thy-
roid Cartilage, through the Pomu m
Adami. By Gonro D. Ginn, M.D.
Licenciate Royal College of Sur geons
ii Ireland, Phkysici'on to te ilon-
treal Dispensary, Member Parisian
Medical Society, 4$c.
The folowing case I send for inser-

lion in ithe Briish American Journal,
from the fact of its being of very rare
occurrence--no author, that I am aware
of, having either met with or described
a similar accident.
* On the Ist September, 1845, a heal-

thy looking man, aged about 30, ealled

upon mie at the Montreal General los-
pital, when Interne of that Institution,

for advice about his throat.
He stated that two or three days pre-

viousily, when gctting out of a carriage,
lie fell, and struck one of the steps near
the wheel \vith the I boue of the neck,"

and ever since his voice has been im-
perfect, with, at the sane time, a
strange feeling, about the throat.

On examination, i found a longitu-
dinal fracture through the pomum ada-

mi of tlie thyroid cartilage, the two

ends of which could be moved upwards

and downwards, and in, a direction

fron before, backwards, producing a
cartilaginous or soft crepitus, if I may
so describe it. The deformity produced

during this manipulation vas trifling,

and when the parts were untouched the
fractured ends were in lte proper posi-
tiou. There was no swelling observa-
ble, and deglutition: was not interfered
with, although lie had this peculiar in-

describable sensation in the throat.
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Tlre was not even any tenderness

on a roiugh examinalion, and no appear-
ance whatever of supervening inflarn-
ination. When speaking, the voice
was sliglhlly rough and hoarse, and now
and then whis.pering.

In the trealmerit, I recommended the
neck to be kept quite loor. an;l froc
from the use of a liglt eiýVat or ker-
chief; a tiuid div.; to ýabstain fron
conversation ;> úd to maintain perfect
rest and quie

I never saw the patient but on this
occasion, so cannot. therefore say how
the case nay have terninated, but pre-
sume that the fracture 'mu S have uni-
ted1 without any difficulty.

48, Craig Street.

ART. XXXIV.-Report on the Past
. and P-esent Condition of the Insane

in Canada East. By DocToR FPt-
MONT, one of the ianagers of the
Quebec Lunatic Asylum.

[Rcad at a Meeting of the Association
of Medical Superintendeuts of Ame-
rican Institutions for 'Ihe Insane,
June, 1850.]

Until comparatively lately in Canada
East no attempts were made to treat
insanity as a disease, in many cases
susceptible of alleviation and cure.
Fron the settlement of Canada until
1845, this unfortunate class of the hu-
man family were kept confined, either
in close apartments in private dwell-

ings, in the gaols of the different dis-
tricts, or in cells mande iii buildings
attached to and under thc care of some
one of the religious communities de-
voted to the relief of the sick and infirm
in the districts of Montreal, Thrce
Rivers, and Quebec.

Before entering more particularly into
the description of the condition of the
insane in this part of the British Pro-
vinces, I:would vish to be distinctly
understood, that no reiark or opinion

Sexpressd i this report is intended or
ineant to eTnsu1re any counullity or
individuals connected witi the care of
the insane, but nerely the systems

pursued and not the execution thereof.
The cells above alluded to -were

nearly similarly constructed in each of
thle three districts. They were made in
soie buildings one story high, sur-
rounded with a high fence ; they vere
from ciglit to nine feet square, and the
same in height. Each had a small
glazed and grated window in the out-
side wall, of about a foot square, and in
the passage dividing the two rows of
cells, there vere snall openings, also
grated. Through these windows liglt
was admitted, anI, when opened, air.
In winter stoves were placed in the
passage to diffuse lieat; in summer
some very imperfect ventilation was
procured by opening a window at either
end of the passage. To each cell was
affLxed a wooden trough in the side,
leading to a covered canal outside,
which, if the patient would use it, con-
veyed his evacuations to a main sewer.

Little or no medical treatment was

,given to the cases thus in confinement,
although a medicali an was nominally
attached to each establishment, who
gave his services gratuitously when
called upon.

The patients were ministered to by a
man keeper for the males, and a wo-
mankeeper for the females. To. keep
them clean, the patients vere, one by
one, removed to a spare cell, while
their own gloomy and miserable abode
underwent the necessary process of
vashing and ventilation.

The patients ina question were ail at
the charge of Goveriment, and cost the
Province at flit average rate of $-2.50
per week for each.

It is evident that neither the cells,
nor the attendauce on he unfortunate

307
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popte conhned therun, Could zllow of
the enjoyrent of1 exterial air Or r"r xr-
cise, nor of moria or even muedical
tre<atmuent upon any systim aitbrdingr a
reasonable horpe r)f menal enre. They
w'ere simply plaves of confinement,
without tie possibilily of benefricial
eff'ect upon the unhappy persons afiliet-
ed with the dreadful nalad1y of insan-
ity, further than placing them out of tIhe
reach of danger to oteirs, and diminish-
ing that to themselv'es wicih would
have resuited from their personal frec-
dom. Indeed, they were more likely
to produce or increase insanity than to
cure it. The remark of one of thle pa-
tients, removed from the cells, vas
original, and pretty correct: le inci-
dentally observed, "Ilthat if the Juidge
and the seven individuals who con -
demned him to be so confined had
themselves been retained ihere, as he
had been, for nearly eighteen years, he
thought they would thon be fuliy as
inad as lie v This case, a comn-
plete wreck in mind, is an example of
a large majority of the cases which iad
'béen confined in those celis.

This statu of matters relative to the
insane, seems to have been a mere ex-
tension of ihe accommodation viioh
w'as found to exisi nt lite conquest. At
that time, four cells destined to the safe
keeping of thc insane, were attached to
the Grcy Nunnery ai Montreal ; four to
the ceneral Hospital at Quebec, and!
two to the General Ilospital at Three
Rivers,-all comniuit oes of ladies, ori-

ginal1y fournded for the relief and care
of tie sick and infirm.

As early as 1824, many efforts were
made by the laie Honorable John Rii-
ardson. oe of the members of tIhe Le-

gislative Council, for the establishment
of a Lunatic Asylun upon tihe iniproved
principles wvhich were tihe guides of
such institutions in .Europe and Ameri-

1
ca., If is from a report miade by a
corrrmmitt'i of tIre Connei, of whielh tihis
ruly excellent mari and philantlroprist
wa l Cairman, that some of tIre fore-

going information was obtained.

To sho iow ittle irsarity, as a dis-
<'ase, was understood, il is siateid in tIe
evidence attached to hlie report "thiat
the patients unrrdergo medical treatment
for their cure, argrecably to Pinel of Paris,
and Hlaslam of London ; instructions for
which treatment are mu tie hands of the
nuns ! ! !" It is obvious that the modern
improved plan of treating tire insane un-
der those circurnstances, was quite im-
practicable-medical treatment perfect-
ly uselss, and any attempt at moral
treatmuerit, not only absurd, but in truth,
bordering on the ridiculons.

It was not tili the year 18-13, shortly
afier Sir Charles Metcalf, assumed the
Governient of the Province, that any
suc'cessful attempt ai a change in tihe
deplorable condition of tire insane in
Canada w'as made.

Moved by his benevolent disposition,
he directed minute investigation to be
ruade in the matter, and froi tIre in.-
formation received, le deemned it ii
perative not to delay any longer some
amlioration in the painful airrd distress-
ing condition of this interesting class of
adllicted humanity. Accordingly a lei-

porary arrangement was made vith
some medicl men in lhe city of Que-
ibeeG, for ilte maintenance, care and
treatment of such insane as w'ere Iher
at the charge of tie Government, in tihe
districts of Quebec and Tliree Rivers.
Shortly afterwards a similar arrange-
ment having failed in. Montreal, tIhe
insane from that district also were trans-
fcrred to Quebec.

A property was leased at Beauport,
in the neiglibolrhood of the city, com-
prising :a manor house, an extensive
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block of ont-buildings of sionle, and
about two hundred acres of land.

lu Sepember, 1815, the arrange-
ments were cempicted for the reception
of onc himlred patients. Soon after,
the patienis fron hie cells ai Queboc

were reiiiovtl to this new temporary
asylum. Tliey wcre removed in open
carriages and in cabs. ilaniv of these
unfortunate people had been froin ono
vear andi under to twenty-eight years in
close confinement; and as a natural
physiological consequence, most of
ther presented body and mind equally
broken down and liseased; neverthe'-
less, they appeared delighted with the
ride, and the view of the city and river,
trecs, and passurs by, appeared to ex-
cite in themr the nost plensurable sen-
sations. One, a man of education and
talent, whose mind was in fragments,
but whose recollections of a confine-
ment of twenty-eight years was most
vivid, vandered fron window to ivin-
dow. le saw Quebec and knew it to
be a city ; lie knew slips and boats on
the river and bay, but could not com-
prehend steamers. They vere placed
together at table to breakfast, and it
was most interesting to witniess hie
propriety of thir conduct, to vatch
their actions, to listen to their conver-
sation with each other, and to remark
the arazement with which they re-

garded every thing around them.
A fewvjweeks after, the insane patients

from the other districts were also re-
moved to hie temporary asyluin at
Beauport. Attempts had been previ-
ously made in Montreai to ameliorate
thoir condition by removing theni from
the cells to the Gaol, and the effects of
even this change were apparent in
their improved state and condition.
They were less violent, and their minds
less weakened by close confinenent.

The vhole number in the asylum in
October, 1815, was eighty-two.

The history of no one case aecompn-
ied the transfer (if these unfortunate bo-
ings, butthecre wasreasontobelieve that
few, if any, were cases of recent date.
Ccrtainly, at least three-fourths had
becn in confinement for many years,
and under circuimstances that precluded
flic reasonable hope of any benofit be-
ing dcrived from any moral or medical
treatment w'hatever. Very many ar-
rived, chained and excoriated, furious
and excited by restraints, and impaired
in health by long continued seclusion.
Indeed the question with many was
not whether they would recover their
reason, but how long they would live.
Of this nunber, five only have been dis-
charged either cured or relieved.
Since then, a number of recent cases
have been adnitted, and as will ap-
pear by the returns, a proportionate
number of cures have been effected.

In Lower Canada, before being re-
moved into an asylum or deprived of
his liberty, an individual, if of age,
must be interdicted and declnred inca-
pable of managing his own affairs,
This done before a judge by the advice
of seven persons, who arc, or are sup-
posed by law to be, relatives or friends,
and as such, this assemblage is'styled
an assemblée des paren ts.

The establishment to which these
patients were then removed, although
vastly superior to those whence they
came in means to allow the reasonable
expectation of improvement to many,
-was far fromi possessing ail the roquire-
ments necessary to the most advantage-
ous treatment, of suclidiversificd cases
as they presented. Novertheless much
was donc towards the ceonfort and alle-
viation of their truly deplorable condi-
tion.

As soon as their muscular powcrs
were sufliciently restored, the patients
were inducod to employ lhemselves in
occupations most conigenial to ilicir for-
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ager ha.nls and taos somne woked in
Ihe ;rarde., others preferr aing and

sltngwood.. The~ femalie patients

were laken cut daily and iany tif then
engaged in weeding in the --arden.-

The efTects of tIhis system were sonu

apparent in their improved heallth and
sphits; they becarne stronger and ale
and slept better.

Considerable difficulty was expeien-
ced in finding suitale mens of ei-
ployment for our patients during our
long Canadian -winters. Whenver
the weather woulid permit, those w-ho

could be induced to do so, wcre em-
ployed at various out-door work, and in
shovelling snow and renovin'g il on
smnall sleighsio a ile distance fron the
premises. In the evening, inost of the

patients both male and female, nmused
themselves in dancing, of whichl they
seem to be passionately fond. Music
and dancing, as a source of amusement
and recreation, werc found to be admi-
rably adapted to the insane ; it seened
to divert their minds from their disorder-
ed fancies, without unduly exciting
thei; and it imduced many of thent lo
take exorcise, ýwho could be injaced to
do so in no other way. Even as rene-
dial agents, they were found of benefit.
In one case, they roused a patient front
a state of the most abject melancholy,
and gave a stimulus to his mental fac-
ulties, wlhich resulted in perfect recov-
ery. la another case, they offected a
change from a state of inelanlctoly
with strong suicidal propensities, to a
state of cheerfulness and enjoyment,
whiehstill continues, and may yet re-
sult in a cure. Drafts, Backgammon,
books, and the daily papers, were also
the in-door means of amusement and
recreation at their disposal. The ap-
proach of spring, howevér, w-as always
hailed by thein with great delight, as

the time w-h'en they couild again employ
hermselves in the garden and grounds.

The total nubrer of patients who
wvere atdmittedI in' the asyl1îum duriung
the iresi e vears of ils estabiishment
was 2H, viz:

Mue............... 1 223.Femnalcs .. .......... .112-234
Of these there have been discharged

during lthat time[:
Reovered males. 16

" Femnales,.........14-30
Improved male,....... .. 7

SFenales,..........5-12
Not inproved: maies,.. ... 6

4 Feinales... .6-12
Died: males,... .4

Females,. .26-50
101

And there remained : maies, 70
Females, 60-130

234
Of the cases admitted into the asyluni

during the same period of lime, forty-

three were brought in within one vear
from the first attack of disease, and of

this number there have been discharged,
cured, 21 ; improved, 2; not improved,

2; and 1, died; leaving 17 cases, of

which five have subsequently recovremed.

The twelve remaining are improved,

and with two or three exceptions

arc likely to recover.
The building then occupied as an

nvilum, lthough the best that could bo
obtained at that tine, was not built for

the purpose and was manifestly inade-
quate. It did not afford the rmeans of
carrying out the wishes and intentions

of the managers as to the complete sep-
a ration ard classification of the patients,

and from their increasing number, il

became necessary to remove several to

another building in the vicinity.
These circumstances, under au arrange-
ment vith Government, for a further pe-

riod of seven years, led to the orection of
an iospital of such extent, and with such
arrangements, as lo combine every

thing necessary to the cure of persons
afllicted with mental diseases. The
necessary contracts were entered into in
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December, IS, for thre erection of the

llo>pital, a view of which is hiereto au-

nexed, and îhe b1 uilding was finished and

occupied under the naine of Quebec

Lunatic Asvlurm in M\lalrh last.

The grounds purlhased for the use

ofthe establishnent, comprise 7) acres,
varied in surface, vell wooded, and

watered, and coimanding a perfect

vîew of the city, harbor and surrounding

conutry. The Asylun itself is a mile

and a quarter from Quebec, is sîtuated

on tIhe north side of tle Beauport turn-

pike road and is surrounded on thre

threco sides by the river des Taupicres.

The building is of gray limestone

hammer-dressed in courses, and is cov-

cred with slate. It is two stories high,
surmounted by a donie, and possesses
a basement story and atties. Itsfacade
towards the road is 217 feet in lengti,
vith two wings at right angles to the

front, cach 132 feet long.
Tie entire building is heated by four

hot air ciamibers and flues, al] of which
are placed under ground.

The establisiment is abundantly sup-
pulied with pure soft w-ater, which is
conducted from the river des Taupieres
into the building by pipes, aud convey-
ed into cisterns in the atties by a pow-
erful force pump. This pump is also
fitted with hose to serve the purpose of
a ire engine.

The building is thoroughly lighted
by gas, -which is ranufactured from.
coal, in a separate building crected for
the purpose in the rear. This building,
similar in constructionto the main build-
ing, contains also a wash house, and
other offices.

The establishment is fitted up wîth

ten cast iron water closets on an impro-
ved principle. The contents are con-
veyed by iron pipes to large cess-pools

placed outside the building.
Sixty feet of the main front is used in

t the basement for kitchen purposes. On

1lie 1irst blar b1w hall, the reception
rom, physicianS olliee and servants,
dning rooma.

The second story is occupied princi-

pally, bv the warden and his family,
and tihe atie are used as bed rooms by
the house and farm servants. The re-
mainder of the front and the entire
wings are devoted exclusively to the

use of the patients. The male patients
occupy the east and the female patients
the west front and corresponding wing.

The patients on each side are subdivi-
ded into four classes. The idiotie, and
those patients who are intractable or fil-
thy in their habits, occupy the north end
of the vinrgs; two day rooms, two water
closets, and bath rooms, and twelve
sleeping roons are devoted to this class
of the inmates in each wing. A corri-
dor on the first flat, 130 by 120, and four
dormitories are occupied 'on each side
by a class whose habits are more orderly.
Corresponding day rooms and dormito-
ries in the upper flats are devoted to a
stîll more orderly class of patients. The
front, on each side ofthe centre building
is used by convalescent patients. Two
large day rooms and six dormitories are
devoted to Ibis class of patients.

The establishment, as now completed,
is capable of all'ording ample aceommo-
dation for 200 patients and their neces-
sary attendants. The attie story, ex-
cept sixty feet of the main front, is not
fitted up, nor used, but is susceptible of
division into dormitories and small bed
rooms to accommodate at least one hun-
dred additional patients. As to the
numbers at present in the Asylum, I beg
leave to annex a copy of the last month-
ly return-from 1st tO 31st May

Men-Remained, 77; since admitted, 6;
discharged, 2 ; dead, 0; remaining, 81.
Women--Remained, 84; since admitted,
1 ; discharged, 3; dead 0; remaining, 82.
Total-Remained, 161 ; since admitted,
7 discharged 5 ; dead, 0 ; remaining,
163.

Remnar/cs.-Of the seven admitted
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during the month, four are likely to re-
cover; one-is doubtful, and two are like-
]y to be incorable'cases.

Of the five discharged during the
rnonth, four were quite well and one
much improved.

(Signed,) J. Douo.s.
Quebec, June 2d, 1850.

ART. XXXV.-Third Annual Report
of the Regents of the University of
1hle condilion of the Siate Cabinet of
Natural History, and the listorical
and Antiquarian Collection annexed
thereto. Albany: JWeed, Parsons &
Co. 1850. Svo. pp. 175.

The Cabinet of Natural -istory at
Albany appears to be in a highly pros-
perous condition. Eleven papers are
comprised in the report ; two of which
are zoological catalogues, a third of the
minerais, rocks and fossils; and a fourth
of the historical and antiquarian collec-
tion : the specimens in ail iavinîg been
presented during the year 1819. Seve-
ral vainable papers on inineralogical,
geological, and antiquarian subjects
conclide the report. A number of
beautiful highly finisied and coloured
representations of Indian work are con-
tained in the volume. We heartily
vish the managers of tlie Cabinet pros-

perity, and that they could infuse into
institutions Of a similar nature with us
sone of that zeal which is so imarkedily
evidenced in the report before us.

ART. XXX VI.-Remarlks on tlie Coin-
paralive Value of the diff~erent
Ailnestletic Agents, by Gi.onou HAY-
Wma), M. D., Boston. Pamphlet,
ip. 11.
This little brochure is a professed

enquiry into the comparative value of
Sulphurie Ether, Chloroform, and Chlo-
rie Ether as AnSsthctic Agents. It is
valuable as containing a statement of
the author's experience on the subject,
an experience by no means small. Dr.
1-Iayward considers Suilphuri Ether as

the most valuable of the three, giving
rise by its employment to no unplea-
sant symptoms. Chlorofonn he con-
demns on several grounds, but chiefly
in consequence of the fatal results
which have occasionallv attended its
exhibition. So far as our own observa-
lion extends, w-e do not coincide in Dr.
Hayward's opinion; and we are satis-
fied that general surgical experience
would decide in favour of Chloroform,
if net in, America, at least in Great
Britain, France, and Germnany. The
few fatai cases whieb have occurred-
(fow considering 'the eXien to, which
the practice of anosihesia by Chloro -
forma is carried)-do nott wilh us at
Ieast, afford any suflicient reàson aiga:nt
ils exhibition. This subject is still ine
its infancy, and a vide field is open to
investigation in regard to the nature of
the ansthelic to b employed in par-
ticular cases, the quantity to be cxlii-
bi'ed in reference to ils toxical azency,
&c. Dr. -ayward's pamphlet, by di-
recting attention to this matter, will
contribute mach to this desirable result.

ART. XXXVIL-An Historical Sketch
of fle Staie of Medicine in the A .ie-
rîcan Colonies, froin theirfrst set-
tiement to lite period of the Revolution,
by JoirN B. BxcK, M.D. Prof. of
Mat. Med. and Medical Jurispru-
dence in the College of Physicians 4.
Surgeons cf t/tc Ci/y cf New York,
4. 4c-. 4c. Second edition. Albany,
1S50. Pampldet, pp. 63.

This is a most interesting account of
the carly condition of Medicine on the
continent of America among the Anglo-
Saxons. The mere fact of a second
edition being called for proclairs the
estimation formed of the work by the
American Medical Profession. We have
rend it with pleasure and profit, and
regret. that our spae., so limited, prohi-
bits our making copious extracts.
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ART. XXXVIII.-A Theoretical and
Practical Treatise on Midwifery,
including the Diseascs of Pregnan-
cy and Parturition; by P. CAZEAu,
Adjunct Professor in the Faculty of
Medicine of Paris, c. 4'c.: adopted
by the Royal Council of Public In-
struction. Translat ed from the 2nd
French edition, by ROe1. P. TromiAs,
M.D. Philadelphia: Lindsay 4
Blakiston. 1850. Byo. pp. 765.

The literature of our Profession is at

the present day so well stockei with

works of distinguished merit on Mid-
wifery, that additional ones in our own
language would seem almost a super-
fluity. The present volume comes
highly recommended, and the transla-
tor has exhibited good judgment in
ushering it before the Profession.

The work is divided into four parts.
The first is devoted to the anatomy of
the organs concerned in reproduction.
The second takes up the subject of
Gencration, comprising conception,

gstation, the development of the ovum,
S;n>gar3 s the mother: and with regard

to the fPents, its dimensions and weight,
position andl attitude, and functions.
The conclusion cf this part is devoted
to the varions diseases of the pregnant
state. These important subjects occupy
nearly one-third of the whole treatise.
The third part is. confined to the consi-
deration of Labor in general,-natural
labour in particular, with the various
presentations and positions. The fourth
part treats of the various kinds of dys-
tochial labours, and the several kinds
of obstetrical operations; and the last
part is devoted to the placenta, to
homorrhage occurring before, during
and after its extraction, to inversion of
the uterus and rapture of it.

Having carefully examined the work,
we cordiallyrecom'ment it to the notice
of students, and the members of the

profession. The various points of prac-.
tice are juliciously given, and may be

safely followed. The fact of its having
been adopted by the Royal Council of
Public Instruction in. Paris indicates at
once its value; and when we further-
more observe that the work is fully
enriched by the labours of antecedent
writers, it will bc found to the enquir-
ing student, and the medical practi-
tioner, a collection of rich rmaterial.

We observe an omission on the part
of the American translator. He miglit
have enhanced the value of the work
still further by remarks on the employ-
ment of anestieties; as this subject is
not alluded to in the original, Dr.
Thomas probably did not consider him-
self waranted in doing so. His own
notes, which are not extensive, are in
the main judicious.

RACTICE OF MEIDICINE &PATIIOLOGY.

On the Communicability of Asiatic
Cholera, by ALEX. H. STEvENS, M-D.
-Two theories, and two only have been
conceived to account for the existence of
tho Asiatic cholera. It is the design of
the following paper to examine each off
these in detail, and to endeavour to de-
cide to which of thern truth belongs.

According to the first tbeory, the dis-
case is caused by a peculiar state of the'
atnosphere extending over vast regions,
imperceptible to the senses, and giving
no evidence of its existence :by statical,
chemical or medical tests, or indeed: in
any other way than in the causation of
the cholera. The starting point of the
doctrine is therefore a double hypothesis.
It assumes without proof: 1st, That.
this peculiar state -cf te atrnosphere
exists. 2d, That it is tlie cause of cho-
lera. These propositions have no other
support than that which they derive
from eacli other. Cholera exists, there-
fore there is a peculiar state of the at-
iosphere. There is a peculiar state of
the atinosphere, therefore cholera exists.
This is palpably only reasoning in a
circle.

It is contended that the hypothesis
derives support froni analogy, that -
fltenza is owing to an unknowcI coundi,
tien of the atmosphere, and that uthe
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spread of thcse diseases is very similar
one to another. What is the precise
evidence that influenza is owing to an
unknown or meteoric state of the atmos-

phere ? There is no evidence of any
peculiar condition of the atmosphere,
except Ie existence of the disease of
which il is supposed ta be the cause,
uniess it be that it is not easy otherwise
to account for it. Butis it not presump-
tuous in the present state of our know-
ledge-sufficiently advanced only ta
make evident the extent of our igno-
rance-to consider as proved that we
knov ail the modes in which these dis-
cases may be caused. and knowing no
other, therefore il can only be in the
atmosphere ? This cannot for a mo-
ment be believed. The generation of
platits or animais without a germi can
be supported by stronger arguments.

Every hypothesis should account sa-
tisfactorily for the phenomnena which it
professes ta explain. The one under
consideration fails of doing this. The
key does not unlock the door; ahlhough,
if il did, it would not follow that it bc-
longaed ta il.

A vessel corning from Havre becomes
the sceie of cholera several weeks afier
lier leaving that port, and on lier ap-
proach ta the banks of Ncewfoundiland.
lere she first encountered, say the ad-

vocales of this hypothë'is, the mtîcteorie
condition ofthe atnospherc whici is the
cause of cholera. In lier progress to
New York new cases occur. Sie lands
lier passengers; new cases occur among
them, and among those who have inter-
course with them, and among themn
only.

Let us apply this hypothesis ta the
explanation of these facts. Was the
atmospbere between Newfoundland and
Nev York, and at New York, infected
or not by the ship and lier passengers
or independently of thei ? Otiher ves-
sels were constantly navigating the saune
waters, aud no cases of cholera occurred
amongst then.

There is no evidence of any general
or wide-spread infection of the atmos-
piere. But the vessel encountered a
particular " streai " of infection ol'the
banks of Newfoundlanl, kept in it du-
ring lier approach and after her arrivai
at New York. Now the doctrine of
meteoration ias ever looked ta widely-
diffused influences, and regarded dis-
cases prevalunt in limited localities as

arising from local and not general epi-
demic causes. I wili not further dwell
upon this assumption, for it is too im-
probable ta require a more extended
notice.

The hypothesis of disease being caus-
ed by a imeteoraccous state of the atmos-
phcre does not at ail advance our know-
ledge of the remote causes of disease. It
is improperly called an explanation. It
is only a confession of ignorance; and
just as strong proof might be adduced
tihat diseases werc inducecd by witchî-
crafi, or the influence of comets anud
fiery dragons in the heaveis ; of the
latter, indeed, imieteoration is but the
expression ; it should be discarded frotu
science; it belongs ta the dark ages.

But it nay b argued thtat the shipi
became infectcd ut Newfoundland, and
broughît the infection with lier, and thus
kindled up an infected atmosphere in
New York. In wiat way ? As one ill
of the snall-pox conveys the poison to
another through the air infected by iim.
This involves personal communicability
or contagion, as it is called, which the
advocates of hie hypoithesis deny. Did
she bring with her animtalcuhe, or the
scels of fungous plants, which as in
yeast propagato thtemselves ? Of this
there is no prouf, and were there proof
tlcy vould he only modes of contagion
or personal communication. Enotiu, I
trust, has been said to show that the
hypothesis of reteoration is untenable.

There is another mode in vhich ana-
logy night lead as ta suppose the cho-
lera is comuntnicatted, i. c., fromn the
persans, clothing, and habitations of the
siek. The experience of a single week
during the prevalence of choiera would,
if collected, fill a volume witih cases
showing more or less conclusively the
extension of cholera froi the sick ta the
well. The facts are sa numîerous and
so iuotorious that iL is deetned unneces-
sary ta cite any one in particular. The
appeal is confidently made ta ail candid
medical observers ibr the truth of the
assertion, that the introduction into a
heialthy region of a person ill ofi cholera,
is very generally fbllowed by the occur-
rence of' other cases among tiose who
have iad intercourse witlh. him. But 1
go further, and maintain that the disease
since its first origin in Asia lias not ori-
ginated de nôvo, but has been propaga-
ted successively from person ta person.

The stronigest proof that cholera tmay
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originate de ncSowould be the discovery
of the disease in regions ihat have had
no communication with those wherein
choiera has existed. No such proof can
be adduced, but over the whole of the
wide-spread regions occupied by the
Pacific and great Southern oceans,
greater in extent than all the continents,
studded over with islands more or less
occupied by inhabitarits, the cholera has
never been faund except where it has
been brought in ships.

It bas never occurred in ships except
among those. fron infected ports, or
having on board passengers or goods
from infected places. It first came to
this continent in 1832 in infected ships.
It carne again in the same way in 1849.
It was carried up the Mississippi and
ils tributaries in stean vessels, in the
same way it was carried up the great
Northern lakes of A inerica. It lias never
taken a contrary course, or originated
on board stean vessels or slips from
mere filth or crowding together of human
beirgs, wlere such vessels have noi
come fromu infected places. It his ever
followed the course of commerce ard of
human intercourse, and it has never, sa
far as I have been able to ascertain, oc-
curred in insulatad or-even in isolated
localities, where it.might not have heei
coIveyed by infected persons or their
clohing. The proof of such conveyance,
it rmtust be admitted, cannot always be
obtained, but tihis is equally true of
small-pox, tneasles, booping-cough, scar-
let fever, &c, diseases which are ad-
rnitted to be propagated by contagion, or
as I would rather express it, by personal
communication, eitier directly or tiro'
the medium of infected ciothing.

The doctrine ofi the communication of
cholera from person to person is not like
the former, a mere hypothesis, but is, on
the contrary, an inference front facts. If
we suppose that there is no power of
personail conmuit]nicabiliy, the chance,
or the probability that the first case of
choiera would occur among the hundred
or more who were brought within the
influence of the sick who arrived here,
rather than among the 400,000 inha-
bitants of New .York, who had no suci
communication, is precisely in the pro-
portion of tiese numbers to each other,
and when we endeavour to calculate the
probabilities or rather the improbabili'«
ties of the second, third, and fourli case'
occurrmg among- the saine 100, ý it is

difficult to express it in figures. It
amounts Io millions of millions. But it
is objected to the contagious nature of
the cholera: Ist. That communicable
diseases are capable of attacking the
systen only once, whereas one attack of
the cholera affords no exemption against
a second. To this may be answered,
that exemption from a second attack is
not without exception the characteristic
of any contagious disease ; small-pox,
measles, hooping-cougLh, and scarlet
fever,-do occasionally occur in the same
individual a second time.

With other contagious diseases, such
as puerperal fever, erysipelas, and per-
haps typhus fever, a first attack affords
no immunity against a second. But no
contagious disease is like to any other in
its character. Soie may originate de
noro, others do not; some nay be cou-
veyed by inoculation, others cannot be
so transitted. Analogy is in favor of
diffèrence and varieties, and were it
otherwise it is a weak argument, as
against inferences fron facts. The only
proper use of analogical reasoning, is to
imiake it the basis of conjecture where
lcts are wanting to establiih principles.

It is objected against the communica-
bility of choliera froin one person to
another, that amongst hundreds who
are brought within the sphere of conta-
gton, if contagion really existed inthe
person of the sick, only one may con-tract the disease: this argument has
been put forth triumphantly, as decisive
agant personal communicability.

This sane argument would prove that
the cause of the disease did not exist in
the air. It would apply even with
additional force. If the cause is meteorie,
then among 500,000 persons in the ciy
and suburbs of New York, a proportion
vastly less is attacked while ail are alike
exposed. But here analogy is brought
in ta support the argument: Diseases
communicable froin person to person are
in the majority of cases comnmunicated.
This is true, but only under favorina
circunstances. Cholera requires favor,
ing circumstances peculiar 1t it only-
and does not lose its quality of conta-
giousness, because it is not imparted
except the recipient be in a proper state
to receive the infection. So does typhus
fever, and in a greater or less degree-all'
contagious diseases. Nature knowsino
Procrustean bed to which all diseases'

c
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must alike conforrn in their modes of
transmission. True philosophy observes
and records the 'laws of nature, but does
not prescribe them.

It lias been further urged against the
contagious nature of the choiera, that
intercourse with the sick, as in hospitals
for example, lias not appeared to in-
crease the dangers of infection. On this
point I apprehend that in a dense popti-
lation where the disease is extensively
prevaient, the poison is applied to ail
and not more truly to those in the vici-
nity of the sick than others. Ini walking
a crowded street we may unconsciously
come in contact or proximity with per-
sons suffering from cholera, tiemselves
perhaps unconscious of being under its
influence. Moreover, the general im-
munity of those about the sick is not
without many striking exceptions. In
the Greenwich hospital during the epi-
demie in 1832, I am informed by Dr.
Lee, fourteen nurses out of sixteen died
of cholera.

It must be admitted that cases of
choiera occur in which it is diicult and
even impossible to detect the mode in
which the contagion has been conveyed:
but it must be borne in mind that it may
be retained in clothing, and that it ad-
heres tenaciously to d wellings for a greal
length of time; that it is conveyed by
persons not atlected themselves with
the discase, and it seems highly proba-
ble that the premonitory diarrhœa is
capabie of imparting the disease. It is
very generally believed chat a peculiar
condition of the atmosphere precedes
cholera, in some instances causing influ-
enza, and that .this peculiar state of the
atmosphere exists even in localities
where no cases of cholera exist, giving
rise to diarrhoa fron slight causes, in-
such as under ordiaary circumstances
would be attended witlt no such conse-
quences.

It relation to the first point, viz.: the
antecedence of influenza, it is by no
neans uniform .or even general ; not

enough so, considering the frequent oc-
eCrence of epidemic influenza, to ren-
der it probable that tiere is any con-
nexion between the two diseases, or
that they arise from any modification of
one and the same cause.

It should moreover be borne in mind,
that the number of those who suffer
frain cholera in its premonitory stages
only, butwhich yet constitute cases of

the disease, is vastly greater than those
in which the malady runsits full course,
and herein lies the true peculiarity of
cholera-a characteristie which belongs
to no other communicable disease. Other
diseases go through ail their stages ; this
only can be arrested. It is thus the
most curable of ail diseases.

In regard to the existence of diarrhoa,
or a tendency to it, in almost ail persons
in localities vhere cholera prevails, it
is admitted. For in such localities ail
are more or less under the influence of
the poison. But that such a condition
obtains in localities remote from those
where cholera exisis may well b ques-
tioned. During the present epidemic,
and also in that of 1832, I saw mîany
cases in various parts of the country
remote from those where choiera pre-
vailed, in which articles of food which
in the city of New York were almuost
sure to induce cholera, were habit ually
taken by ail classes with entire impu-
nity. If there were any exceptions to
this practice, they were amongst persons
who lived in fear of the diseasc, who
took medicines as preventive, and altered
their habituai diet. In view of these
circumstances, it does not appear that
the meteoric hypothesis receives any
support from the admitted tendency to
diarrhœa in the localities where cholera
prevails.

Before the introduction of the choiera
in a vessel fron Havre in December,
1848, there was no uniusuail tendency to
diarrha observed uear New York, nor
was there any prior to its introduction
fron Canada in 1832. An argument
against the contagiousness of cholera
has been drawn from the fact that it
attacks, in far greater ratio than others,
Iliose wlho are filthy and who reside in
filthy places. Yet it must be borne ii
mind that some of the mîost filthy occu-
pations have scemed to alford an exemp-
tion fromn cholera. A distinction should
be made between those -whose occupa-
tions are among filthy matters aid those
who are filthy from the want of ablution.
But adnitting the statement to be par-
tially truc, it admits of another solution
than that which argues that the local
impurities aggravate the choleric char-
acter of the atmosphere. They who live
in their own filth are more likely than
others to commit errors in diet; are
most apt to be intemperate in the uise Of
ardent spirits, and above ail, they sleep
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in crowded rooms and are thereby de-
bilitated and incur increased risk of
receiving the contagion, for crowds of
all kinds are admitted to favor the ex-
tension of cholera. Moreover, the ha-
bitations of the class of persons under
consideration, are for the most part in
low and damp situations. It may be
ihat the cholera poison gravitates to the
lowest places, and it is altogether proba-
ble that, like other foreign natters in
the air, it attaches itself to moisture,
and these facts seerm to furnish-sufficient
reasons why such persons and such
places furnish so disproportionate a
number of victims.

I an quite aware that on the whole
the weight of medical authority is
against the contagiousness of choiera.
In such matters truth is arrived at by
slow degrees. Small-pox prevailed for
several centuries before its coutagious
character was admitted Sydenhan
classed it withi epidemics such as perip-
neunony and influenza, and until with-
in a little more than one hundred years,
ït was not supposed to be communicable
from person to person. Dr. Mead wrote
a treatise in proof of its contagiousness.
Some may contend that although cho-
lera be communicable from person to
persoan it is better for the community
that the truth should not be admitted or
proclaimed. But besides the general
principle that scientific truth should
never be concealed, if such conceal-
ment were even possible, it will be ob-
vious to any one who considers the
subject, that the question has other
bearings of vast importance as regards
the practice of quarantine in ports, pri-
sons, and other public establishments
where large masses of huiman beings
are congregated together. Is there no
advantage to be derived from a know-
ledge of the fact that isolation affords
entire security? That the painful and
ofien injurious restrictions in diet are,
under such circumstances, entirely un-
necessary? How mucli needless ex-
posure, often fromu miere curiosity, may
be avoided by excluding fron the pie-
sende of the sick those who manifest a
tendency to diarrhiea, who use ardent
spirits to excess, wbo are debilitated in
body ani tinid in mind and by hushand-
ing the strengthi and supporting the
energies of devoted friends at the bed-
side. But' further, ' the progress" of
Cientific investigation is by successive

accumulation-the discovery of one
truth becomes the basis of another.

The contagions character of cholera
once admitted, we are in a position to
inquire how soon the disease acquires a
contagious character; how long after
death the bodies of those who may die
of cholera may communicate the dis-
case; how long the contagion may be
retained in clothing, buildings, ships,
&c.; the action of heat. and cold on
these agents, in neutralizing the poison:
the period of incubation ; the liability of
the same person to a second attack ;
and the most effectual measures of per-
sonal and public Hygiene. It cannot
be doubted that a more perfect know-
ledge of these subjects than we now
possess will disarn the pestilence of
many of its terrors. Notwithstanding
the, fatal character of cholera without
treatment, it is in its early stage the
inost curable of all diseases. It is in-
deed among the few-the very few-
diseases which, strictly speaking, are
curable at all; other diseases are ma-
naged, this is arrested.-Transactions
of the Medical Society of thte State of
New York.

SURGERY.

Self-inflicted Wound of te Tiroat,
laying open the Œsophagus-Recovery.
(Under the care of Mr. Adams.)
Wounds of the throat in persons who
attempt Io commit suicide, may be of a
trifling kind, or cause death instantane-
ously, either by hcenorrhage orsuffoca-
tion. There are between these two ex-
tremes a great variety of lesions resul-
ting from self-inflicted vounds of the
throat, placing the patient in a more or
less dangerous situation'; among these,
the complete division of the thyroid and
cricoid ca:tilages, with a subsequent
wound of the osophagus, are looked
upon as extremely hazardous, and the
management of such cases requires great
care and nicety. It is, however, satis-
factory to notice, that an enlightened and
close attention to the treatment 'nay
triumph over the numerous difficuhies
which lie in the way of recovery when
the wound is of the above nentioned
destructive description; and it is otir
pleasing .duty to record a case, iately
under the care of Mr. Adams, where
favouraile results were obtained.
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Fron the notes o Mr. Ball, the house-

surgeon, who very courteously afforded
ns frequent opporturrities of seeing the
patient, we are enabled to give the fol-
lewing details. On the 28th of Febru-
ary, 1850, a man, about twenty-five
years of age, of thin, spare make. and a
salesman by trade, was adiiited into
the hospital with an oblique incision in
the anterior part of the throat , extend-
ing from above the thyroid cartilage to
the lourth ring ofthe trachea. Bath the
thyroid and cricoid cartilages, and the
three first rings of the trachea, were di-
vided ;the kiife had passed bet ween the
sterno-hyoid and sterno-thyroid mus-
cles, and had slightly lacerated iiem at
their inner edges; the isthmus of the
thyroid body was laid bare, but not di-
vided. This desperate w ound was in-
flicted by the patient's own hand while
under considerable exciternent, with a
comnion table-knife, about an hour pre-
vious to admission. The bremorrhage
had been considerable, but had ceased
when the patient entered the hospital;
the lungs, however contained a large
quantity of blood, which had passed
into the trachea, and this fluid, excited
by its presence in the lungs, constant
cough, with expectoration of ihe blool
through the woundl in the throat.

This fact again proves vow seldom
the suicide succeeds in wounding the
common carctid or jugular vein, the
hæmorrhage mostly proceeding from
some of the primary branches of the
external carotid. Here it would appear,
that the violence used was expended
upon the division of the liard bodies
above mentioned, viz., the thyroid and
cricoid cartilages, the rings of the tra-
chea, and, as will be seen below, part of
the œsophagus, these organ being prob-
ably rendered prominent by the head
having been thrown backwards. The
eut was likewise an oblique one, and
was therefore less likely to reacli to a
greater distance posteriorly.

The patient, under these circum-
stances, was immediately put to bed,
his head and shoulders were raised by
ineans of pillows; a silver tube was
passed into the trachea to facilitate the
ejection of the blood ; and lint, wet with
cold water, applied to tie wound. Mr.
Adams saw the patient a few hours after
admission, when the breatbing was
nuch. easier, a large quantity of blood
having been expectorated through the

tube. Mr. Adams approved of wiat
had been done,and ordered thirty drops
of tincture of opium to be given the pa-
tient wit hout a vehicle, so as not to tax
the powersofdeglutition; but he swallow-
ed this small quantity of fluid with
great difficulty, atd the attempt excited
a vilent fit of coughing. The patient,
made towards the eveomng, several un-
sulccessful attemopts to swallow small
quantities of milk, but the greater por-
tion o it passed ino the trachea and
caused violent cougb; the milk, at the
same time, escaping by the wound in
the windpipe.

These phenomena confirmed Mr.
Adams in the previous suspicion of a
wound of the osopiagus; the canula
was iherefore remitoved from the wound
iii ie iraciea, and an attenpt made to
pass a flexible tube into the stoiach;
this was, however found impracticable,
for the tube invariably passed irouight
thte wound in the trachea, instead of gli-
dinig down from the pharynx into the

eajophagus, àid excited an alariinig
aimount of irritation. No doubt now re-
mtained regarding the wound having
reached the oesaphagus; and as no tube
could be passed into the stomaeh, Mr.
Adans had recourse to encnata for
nourishing the patient. A pint of beef-
tea was iherefore injected; the man was
allowed to moisten his mouth with a
wet rag. and as he breaithed quite freely
ihrough the wound, it was not thouglht
advisable to replace the canula into it.

This method of administering food by
the rectum is invaluable in such cases,
and the patient owes his life to this mea-
sure; it is a pity that itis not invariably
adopted in analogous circunistances.
''be case of a child, for instance, was
lately nentioned at tie Surgical Society
o Paris, vhio had died of inanition. The
liule patient had iad tracheotonmy per-
iorned upon him to ward oftimpetnding
suffocation from croup; as the Iood sub-
sequently pàssed through the opening in
the trachtea, the esophageal tube 'was
thought of, but cou id not be used, owing
ta the inflaied state of the larynx ; the
child died. It is not too much to sup-
pose that the child miglt perhaps hav
been saved by nourishing enemata.

The difficulty of deglutition in Mr.
Adams' patient wention increasing on
the second day ; even the swallowing of
his saliva gave him great pain; he was
therefure ordered halfa pint of beef.tea
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to be injected intothe rectum îhree limes
daily. in the nighît the patient spoke
once or twice in a whisper; but strict
silence was enjoined, as the effort of
speaking excited fils of coughing, which
left him greatly exhausted. The bowels
having been relieved on the next day
afier admission, Mr. Adams ordered
thirty drops tincture of opium to be ad-
ministered in a starch enema of one
ounce, towards evening, to procure rest.
The patient was likewise removed ino
a private room, as the cold air excited
cough. This change to a ihigher tem-
perature proved very beneficial; the ir-
ritation about the air passages diminish-
ed considerably ; there was much less
cough; and a very evident improvement
was noticed in the paticnt'scountenance.
H e, however, was muc h torpented with
thirst, to satisfy which, Mr. Adans
ordered an enema composed of a pint of
cold milk; and directed a smnall piece of
ice to be placed in the patient's mrouth.
The wound, in the meaitime, went on
very favourably, and was dressed sole-
ly with lint dipped in cold water.

On the lifth day tIe patient was able
to speak in a whiisper without pain or
exciting cough, and there was great im-
provenent; lhe was nourished enirely
by beef-tea and milk etiemata, with the
administration of thirty drops of tincture
of opium by the same means every
niglht, the bowels being kept regular.-
On the cleventh day after admission, he
began to take a small quantity of bread
and milk by the nouth, which, lie suc-
ceeded in svallowing without any difli-
culty. T71he woiund lad in the mean-
lime rapidly filled up, and was now
about one-flourth of its original size. Beef
tea, milk, rice-ipudding, and porter, were
soon taken by the mouth, and the
patient improved rapidly up to the
twenty-third day after the rash nct. when
symptoins of constitutionai disturbance
appeared, and pain vas conîplained of
both in the head, neck, and shoulders.
A purge oicalomel and tlubarb, and a
blister to the temples, did not succeed
in renoving these syt patois; tlie tonîgue
became tremulous and the pulse weak;
the patient was therefore prescribed bark
with half a grain of hydrochlorate of
norphia at nigrht ; and by the assistance

or wine, Porter, &c., regained his
strength ; the wounid hiealed'ecompiletely,
and tle patient was dlischarged in a very
satisfactory condition forty-one days afier

admission. Hie was still holding his
head ralher erect, however, and hisvoice
was somîiewhat indistinct ; but it is to be
stupposed iliat wii the eventual perfect
consolidation of parts within the trachea,
and subsequeit absorption of exuberant
fibrinnus leposiis, the voice will regain
ils former toie. It will be noticed iat
no vessel required tying, and tiat no
secondary hStmorrhage took place; and
as certain, not unimportant, branches
of the external caro:id must have been
divided, the fleet of the cessation of the
bleeding will be an additional illustra-
tion of the retracting power of arteries,
when compleiely divided. Nor should
it be passedi unniiced how well was ex-
emplified in the foregoing case the pro-
priety of avoiding plaster aed sutures, as
is genîerally advised by systenatic wri-
ters wlien reating of wounds of the
îhorax-Lancet.

Treatmient of Ancurism by Compres-
sion.-Remarks by the Dublin MIedical
Press on Dr. Bergin's case, publisled
in a previous No. of the British Ameri-
can Journal.-l justice to Dr. Belling-

hama, and to his method of treating

Aneurism by compression, we extract

the followini, from the Dublin Meical
Press of the 2(l Oct. The inaccuracies
in the mcthod of treatment by compres-
sion, pursued by Dr. Bergin in his case,

struck our mind forcibly; but w-e wvaiv-
ed all observations of our own, in'expec-

tation of a re p!y to Dr. B.'s communica-

tion froin two medical gentlemen who

volunteered it-one of whom has since

left the city. We entirely coincide iii

the justice of the following remarks;
and would moreover observe, that even

had Dr. Bertrgin treated his case with
the strictest attention to the rules laid

down by Dr. Beilingbam and with no sud-
cess, the result would not, cf itself, have

milisated against Ihe general utility of

the practice, which has been so exten-

sively confirned.-CEd. B. A. J.

To any one unaccquainted with the
method of treating aneutism bycompres-
Sion, as emlployed in the Dublin Houspitals;.
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the perusal of the foregoing case would
give a very unfavourable impression of the
efficacy of pressure in the cure of the dis-
case. "I Having read (Dr. Bergin says) in
your journal Dr. Bellingham's paper on
• Aneurism andtheir Cure by Compression,'
I determined to try its effects in this case,
and in the event of its failure to resort to the
ligature." Then, "after bandaging the
limb (he observes) from the tocs upwards,
I applied two tourniquets over the femoral
artery-one immeidately above the tumour,
and the other a short distance above the
first so as to alternate the pressure, and al-
so to follow as closely as possible the nethod
described by Dr. Bellinghiaim."

We shall premise by observing, that the
mode of employing compression adopted by
Dr. Bergin is not that recommended in Dr.
Bellingham's work, and that if such a mode
as Dr. Bergin used had been attempted to
be carried outin Dublin, it would necessar-
ily have failed ; and not only failed, but it
would probably have proved even more fatal
than the records of surgery prove the
ligature of the femoral artery for popliteal
aneurism to have been.

The aneurism, in the case given by Dr.
Bergin, is described as being of a very large
size : " it occupied the whtle of the lower
third and a greater portion of the middle
third of the thigh ;" its pulsation was very
violent, " so as almost to throw the stetho-
scope off the tumour ;" while pressure with
the finger upon the artery above "merely
moderated the circulation in the tumour, but
was not sufficient to arrest it completely."

In such a state of the circulation, and
with such a form of disease to deal with, Dr.
Bergin, without using any preliminary mnca-
sures, at once commenced " by bandaging
the limb frotn the toes upwards ;" the neces-
sary effect of which would be to retard or
impede the return of the blood by the super-
ficial veins, according to the tightness with
which it was applied.. He then " applied
tourniquets, so as to alternate the pressure."
l'On the application of the tourniquet, the
circulation through the tumour immediately
ceased." Thus the passage of the blood
down the main artery of the limb was eut
off, as well as the current through the col.
lateral vessels, and the blood was entirely
prevented from returning by the veins.-
This could not of course be continued for
any time without occasioning great suffer-
ing, which became so intense "as to oblige
the patient, although a man ofgreat courage
and patience, to change the pressure fron

one instrument to the other every eight or
ten minutes."

As mxight have been anticipated fron
such a beginning, we have next a melan-
choly detail of sleepless nights and intense
sufferings, which morphia failed to relieve;
and when the patient could bear it no longer,
the pressure was discontinued, " the tumour
having increased in size," and " the leg and
thigh having become cold and odematous."

We have more than once taker occasion
to protest against the misapplication of the
terni compression, when applied to proceedings
in which all the rules which should guide us
in the application of pressure are violated.-
We do so again, because ive believe the
principles upon which this method is based
are still imperfectly understood outside the
city of Dublin ; indeed Dr. Berrin's case
is a strong example in point, and instead of
being surprised at the failure of compression
in his hands, we arc only surprised that the
patient had the resolution and fortitude to
bear it as long as is stated. We even think
it not unlikely that the doctor may have
been deccived in this respect, and that the
patient, in his absence, loosened the tourni-
quet, and thus escaped loss of limb, or of
life, fron rupture of the sac, or from gan-
grene of the extremity.

As the case given bv Dr. Bergin is likely
to be copied into other journals, we have
thought it right, in quoting it bere, to ac-
company it by these remarks; more particu-
larly, because of the disingenuous way in
which similar cases have been seized upon,
and held up as beacons to warn surgeons
against attempting the cure of aneurism lby
compression ; which it is charitable to sup-
pose, has sometimes been donc through ig-
norance of the manner in which compression
effects the cure of aneurism, and of the
mode in which pressure ought to be applied in
order to ensure this resuIt. Besides, as Dr.
Bergin promises, " in a future number" of
the journal, " some remarks upon the rela-
tive value of compression and the ligature,"
our impressions, on the perusal of bis case,
may possibly prove of assistance to him.

ANATOMY.

A new variety qf Vascular Anastono-
ses between the Vena Porta and Vena
Cava Inferior.-M. Claude Bernard,
read a paper before the Academy of
Sciences, upon a new variety .of vas-
cular anastomosis.

The author described a special mode
of anastomotic communication existing
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between the vena portæ and the infe-
rior vena cava, immediately on the
entrance of these two great vascular
trunks into the liver.

In the liver of a horse, where M.
Bernard iad studied this disposition,
the trunk of the vena porta and that of
the vena cava, just on their penetration
of the liver, are separated only by a
space of three or four centimetres. The
hepatic substance which fills up this
space, and which represents the lobus
spigelii, is often pressed against and
atrophied from the fact of the¢occasional
enormous dilatation of the trunk of the
inferior vena cava.

-It is in this space of separation ex-
istino between the trunk of the vena
cava~ and that of the vena portai in
which are foutd the anastomosng
vessels, which M. Bernard proposes to
describe, and which are for the purpose
of causing a direct communication be-
tween the abdominal venous systern of
the vena porta witlh the general venous
system. These vessels proceed from
Ihe trunk of the vena portw to pass close
to the vena cava in forming an anato-
imical disposition entirely special. As
soon as the trunk of the vena cava has
penetrated through the liver, and often
also a little before it, it gives off a cer-
tain nunber of branches, wvhich, sone
being situated superficially, others deep-
ly, subdivide on penetrating through
the thickness of the substance of the
liver and on carrying themselves to the
right side of the vena cava inferior.
These vascular branches furnish others
which are lost in traversing the hepatic
substance, but a large number pass
directly through the external surface of
tbe vena costa inferior, where they dis-
tribute thermselves in a singular and
unusual maanner. In fact, these rami-
fications expand upon the external sur-
face of the vena cava inferior, present-
ing in the first place the appearance of
a mag-nificent network of vasa -éasorumn,
but, on examining them more closely,
we observe that a great many of these
branches, in place of dividing them-
selves into capillaries, sink in abruptly
to communicate with the cavity of the
vena cava inferior. These vascular
branches open themselves separately,
where (and this disposition is very fre-
quent) numerous branches ýreunite
themselves previously, in a manner to
form a pouch or common reservoir

Nvhich communicates directly with the
vena cava inferior.

These: anastonosing vessels do not
possess any valves in any part of their
course. Their walls vere slightly re-
sisting, and present the same structure
as the other ramifications of the vena
porta, whilst the branches of the sub-
hepatic veins, on the contrary, partake
iii a very evident manner of the mus-
Cular structure which characterises the
hepatic portion of the vena cava infe-
rior. This dilference will prevent, in
all cases, the confounding the two
orders of vessels on their opening into
the vena cava. Besides the mouths of
Ihe opening, of the branches of the
vena porta, are distingui.shed from those
of the small sub-hepatic veins, by their
great regularity and the longitudinal
direction of their muscular fibres simi-
lar to the vena cava inferior.

This system of direct communication
of the hepatic vena porta with the vena
cava inferior, which does not exist only
at its entrance into the liver, but which
may be equally seen in the depths of
that organ and throughout the large
trunks of the sub-hepatic veins, and
especially in the vicinity of their inser-
tion into the trunk of the vena cava in-
ferior, establishes in a very extensive
manner, a true collateral hepatic circu-
lation.-Gazette Ml/edicele.

Researches to prove the non- Vascu-
larity of certain Animal Tissues. By
JoSEPH ToYNBEE, F.R.S.-In the in-
troduction to this paper the author first
speaks of the process of nutrition iri those
animal tissues which are pervaded by
the ramifications of blood vessels, point-
ing out the circumstance that even in
thiem there is a considerable extent of
tissue which is nourished without being
in contact with vessels. The knowledge
or this fact leads to the study of the
mode of nutrition in those tissues which
contain no blood-vessels; these are di-
vided into the three following classes,
vIz.

The first comprehends articular car-
tilage of+the ditferent classes of fibro-
cartilage.

The second comprises the cornea, the
crystalline lens, and the vitreous bu-
mnour.

The third class includes the epider-
inoid appendages, viz., the epithelium,
the epidermis, nails and clawà, hoofs,
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hair and bristles, feathers, horn, and
teeth.

The author then proceeds to show
Ihat the due action of the organs, into
the composition of whicl these tissues
enter, is incompatible with their vascu-
larity. In proof of the non-existence of
blood- vessels in these tissues, he states
that he has demonstrated, by means of
injections, that the arteries which pre-
'vious anatomists had supposed to pene-
trate into their substance, either as se-
rous vessels or as red blood-vessels too
minute for injection, actually terminate
in veins before reaching them; lie also
shows that around these non-vascular
tissues there are nitnerous vascular
convolutions, large dilatations, and in-
tricate plexuses of blood-vessels, . the
object of which lie believes to be to
arrest the progress of the blood, and to
allow a large quaniîy of it to circulate
slowly around these tissues, so that its
nutrient liquor may penetrate into and
be diffused througli them. The author
states that ail the non vascular tissues
have an analogous structure, and that
they are comnposed of corpuscles, to
vhicl he is induced to ascribe the per-

formance of the very itmportant fune-
tions in the process of their nutrition, of
cireulating throughout, and perliàps of
changing the nature of the nutrient fluid
vhich is brought by blood-vessels to

their circuiference. The author then
brings forward facts in proof of the ac-
tive and vital properties of tliese corpus-
cles, and concludes his introduction by
stating, that it appears to him that the
only difference its the mode of nutrition
of the tissues which contain blood-ves-
sels and those whicl do not, is, that in
the former the fluid which nourishes
thern is derived from the blood that
cireulates throughout the capillaries
contained in their substance ; whilst, in
the latter, the nutrient fluid exudes into
them; and that, in both classes, the
particles of which the tissues are com-
posed derive from this element, which
nourish tlem.

The author then enters on an exani-
nation of the structure and mode of nu-
trition of the several tissues of each of
these three classes.

Of the Joints.-In considering the
first class, the development of articular
cartilage is described at great length
during its various stages and at the dif-

ferent periods of life. Numerous dis.-
sections of the ovum and fotus are given
in detail to illustrate the frst stage,
during which it is shown that no vessels
enter into the substance of any of ie
textures composing a joint, but that tlie
changes they undergo are effected by
the nutrient fluid from the large blood-
vessels by which each articulation is
surrounded. lu the second stage of the
developmerit of articular caitilage it is
shown that the epiphysal cartilage is
gradually hollowed into canais, within
which blood-vessels are extended, which
converge towards the attached surface
of the articular cartilage : in this stage,
vessels are also prolonged over a consi-
derable portion of the free surface of the
cartilage between it and the synovial
membrane.

In the third stage, thiat which is ex-
hibited in adult lite, the epiphysal car-
tilage is converted into osseous cancelli.
These contain large and very nunieroiîs
blood-vessels, ramnitfying throughout the
wiole of their cavity, and are separated
fro:n the articular cartilage by a very
fine but complete lamina of bone, the
articular lanella, which is composed of
corpuscles; and the author believes that
the principal source of nutrition to the
articular carilage is the nutrient fluid
eliminated by the large vessels of the
cancelli, and which permeates the ar-
ticular lainella. The free surface of
adult articular cartilage is nourislied by
vessels which extend to a short distance
over its margin, and between it and the
synovial membrane.

It is quite certain that the vessels thus
situated do not enter the substance of
the articular cartilage, inasmuch as the
arteries terminale in veins at the cir-
cunaference of the latter. Iii this situa-
tion, the ,arteries become continuous
with the veins in the fbllowving ways:
firstly, by their aIl ending in a single
vessel sitmilar to the terminal sinus in
ihe vascular area of the chick, frou
which the veins arise; secondly, the
arteries terminate in dilated cavities,
vhichi give origin to veins: and lastly,
the two sets of vessels are directly cou-
tinuous by mneans of loops of various
characters: the apparent object of ail
these modificationus is to cause a consi-
derable quantity of blood to circulate
slowly in the vicinity of articular carti-
lage.
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The author points out the presence of
fine tubes which pervade the attached
portion of articular cartilage: to these
he ascribes the functions of transmitting
through its substance !he nutritive fluid
derived from the vessels of the cancelli.
and he also shows that articular carti-
lage becomes thinner as man advances
in life, and that this change is effected
by its graduai conversion imo bone, a
process which is always going on.

Fibro-cartilages constitutie the second
tissue of the first class: they are divided
by the author into two classes; one
comprising those which are nut covered
by a synovial membrane; the other in-
eludes t.hose which have each surface
lined by it. The structure of fibro-car-
tilage is carefully investigated, and in
order to arrive at some definite conclu-
sions on this subject, whereon anatomisis
of al[ ages have so much differed, he
made numerous dissections of fibro-car-
tilages in the different classes of animals
at various periods of their development,
the results of which he details. le
shows that this tissue is composed of
cartilaginous corpuscles and of fibres,
the latter preponderating in adult life,
the former in infancy: and that durisg
life the corpuscles are gradually con-
verted into fibres. He enters at length
into the question of the vascularity of.
these cartilages; and froin a careful
study of many injected ,specimens of
man and animals at various periods of
their development, the particular results
of which lie relates, he states that blood-
Iessels are contained only in their
fibrous portion : these have the function
of nourishing the part that is cartilagi-
nous, vhich, being subject to compres-
sion. and concussion, does not contain
any.

The Eye.-The cornea, crystalline
lens, and vitreous humour, each forming
a part of the eyeball, are included in
the second class of extra-vascular tis-
sues.

1. The structure of the cornea is
described as being very lax, and con-
taining corpuscles only in a small quan
lity, mixed with bright fibres. The
opinions in favour of its vascutarity are
combated, and it is shown that the
blood vessels which converge towards
its circumference are disposed in two
different ways. Those which are the
principal source of the fluid that nou-

rishes it, and which from their position
may be styled the sclerotico-corneai
arteries, are large and numerous ; they
are situated in the snbstance of the scle-
rotic, and they converge to the point
where this latter structure joins the cor-
nea, in which position, without much
diminution in their size, they suddenly
become contiguous with the veins that
take a retrograde course.

A second set, the conjunctivo-corneal
arteries, pass over a small extent of the
surface of the cornea, where they form
a narrow band: the arteries terminate
by forming luops with the veins, and do
not penetrate the substance of the cor-
nea.

2. The crystalline lens is described
as being composed of corpuscles, of
which the radiating fibres are constitu-
ted. The arteria centralis retinS is the
source of nutrition to this organ ; it
ramifies over the posterior surface of the
capsule in the form of large branches;
Ihese pass round the circumference,
upon the periphery of which they be-
come straight, and terminate by forming
loops wit'h the venous radicles.

3. The vitreous humour does not
present any traces of vasculatity, and
although many anatonists have in
generai terms represented the arteria
centralis retinæ as giving off in its course
through the organ minute branches into
its substance, stili those who have paid
especial attention to this subject have
not been able to find such vessels The
author believes that the nutrition of this
structure is accomplished by the vascu-
lar ciliary processes of the choroid, and
that the fluid brought by the latter is
diffused through its substance by means
of the corpuscles of which its membrane
is composed, assisted by the semi-fluid
character of the humour.

Of the Skin, yc.-The third class of
extra-vascular tissues comprehends the
epidermoid appendages. The author
describes them all as composed of cor-
puscles, which are round and soft where
they are in contact with the vascular
chorion, compressed and flattened where
they are farther removed from it. He
points out, in the substance of the hoof
of the horse, the existence of fine canals,
which he supposes to conduct fluid
through its mass; and he states that the
perspiratory ducts of the human subject
possess a structure analogous to the
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spiral vessels of plants. The author
describes each of the tissues of this
class, and shows that the various modi-
fications presented by the vascular sys-
tem with whiclh each is in contact have
the sole object of enabling a large quan-
tity of blood to approacli and circulate
slowly around them. He also points
out, in connexion with this subject, the
rernarkable vital properties which are
possessed by these non-vascular tissues.

The conclusions to which the author
of this paper arrives are the following:-

1. The articular cartilage of joints in
a healthy state contains no blood-vessels
and that it is nourished by the vessels
which surround it; in certain diseases of
the joints these vessels are prolonged
into the substance of articular cartilage.

2. The fibro-cartilages of the joints
and of the spine when heaithy, contain
blod-vessels only at their cicumifer-
ence; in disease they become vascular.

3. That the following structures of
the eye-viz., the cornea, the crystal-
line lens, and the vitreous humour pos-
sess no blood-vessels ira a healthy state;
in some diseases of the eye the cornea
becomes vascular.

4. The epidermis of the skin, teeth,
nails, feathers, and the hoofs of animais
have no blood-vessels. The hoof of the
horse is pervaded by numerous fine
canais which circulate a fluid through-
out the whole of the substance, and give
to it the elasticity so essential to the due
performance of its fumntions.

The author states that his object lias
been to establish as a law in animal
physiology, that organs are capable of
being nourisled, and of increasing in
size, without the presence of blood-ves-
sels in their substance.

The application of the above-named
law to the study of surgery, in reference
to the causes of the extension of vessels
into the extra-vascular tissues of the
eye and the joints, when in a diseased
state, and to the measures to be adopted
for the prevention and cure of those
atfections which are dependent thereon,
and to pathology in the investigation of
the nature of morbid structures, particu-
larly of those classes which contain no
blood-vessels, will, the author feels cer-
tain, be productive of scientific interest,
and of practical advanitagc.--Dublin
Medical Press.

MIEDICAL JURISPRUDENCE.

On the Morbid Appearances in Ar-
senical Poisoning, 4-c. witl Medico.
Legal Observations, Bly T. G. GEOGHE-
GAN, M. D.-The increase of the crime
of poisoning of late years lias become
not alone a matter of serions social im-
port, but has tended to invest toxicolo-
gical inquiries with an additional interest
to the physician, both in his public and
curative relations. Of the various sub-
stances resorted to for criminal purposes,
the arsenical compounds rank undoubt-
edly foremost, both as to the greater fre-
quency of their employment, and as re-
lates to the delicacy, variety, and gravi-
ty of the questions to which they give
rise in medico-legal practice.

The great importiance of the study of
arsenical poisoning clearly appears from
staistical evidence collected in England
and France.

Thus of 543 cases of poisoning which
formed the subjects of coroners' inquisi-
tions in England and Wales during two
years, 186 were of this nature.

Of 185 cases which occurred in France
in fourteen years, 199 were arsenical.

Of 97 poisonings in Ireland whiclh
bave been brought under my notice, and
in which the special substance adminis-
tered was determined, no less than 72
were arsenical, or three-quarters of the
wbole.

A case ofthis naturehaving been late-
]y submitted to me, I propose, in the first
instance. exhibiting the norbid parts to
the society,(1) and afterwards to ofper
some general observations on the ap-
pearances which have presented them-
se.ves in other instances which I have
investigated, together with some addition-
al remarks on certain other points in the
history of arsenical poisoning. The
specimens laid upon the table is the
stomach of a female past the middle
age, who died from the effects ofarsenic,
under the usual symptoms of gastro-
intestinal irritation, after an illness of
sixteen hours. The organ having been
transmitted to me with a view to the de-
tection of the poison, I observed the foi-
lowing appearances a week after death,
at which period the body was exhumed,
and found free fron any trace of putre-
faction.

The peritoneal coat presented a dif-
fuse, a red, and towards the splenic end,
a brownislh tint. There was a marked
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contraction of the muscular coat about
three inches from the pylorus. An uni-
form reddish fluid (12 fluid ounces,)of the
consistence of thin gruel, and depositing
brown flocculi,formed the contents,which
were of an acid reaction, indicated freely
the presence of arsenious acid in solution
and included a considerable quantity of
insoluble hæmatosine. The mucous
membrane was found at the splenic end
of a mottled reddish-brown colour, cover-
ing a stratum of coarse rarniform vas-
cularity (in the submucous tissue,) soft,
and presenttng a few pethechial ecchy-
moses, and one or two erosions (of the
area of a fourpence,) with an undefined
border, which exposed the unaltered sub-
mucous coat. The body of the organ
(as far as the contraction). exhibited a
remarkable arrangement of dark black-
ish purple strealis of extrav.asated blood,
deposited in the substance of a softened
mucous membrane, and capable ofready
removal by the nail, which laid bare
the sound subrnucous texture. These
streaks (whichaffected for the most part
the direction of the long axis) were of
trivial thickness, scarcely elevated, flat-
tened on the surface, and made up of a
close aggregation of irregular blotches.-
Ainongst these lines there were inter-
spersed a fev of the lighter coloured
petechial (fluid) ecchymoses, observed
at the splenic end. The remainder of
the mucous surface was of a brown red,
which abruptly ceased at the contrac-
tion, between which and the pylorus,
the membrane' where untinged by bile
was grey, and coated with viscid opaque
mucus of the same colour. The mucous
membrane generally was softened, not
capable of being peeled offat the splenic
end, but yieldi'ag on traction in the body
and towards the pylorus, flaps of one
quarter and half an inch respectively.-
The submucous coat, except at the great
tuberosity, seen:ed free from injection.
There was no trace of true ulceration in
any part of the organ. The mucous
membrane of the duodenum was red-
dish and apparently a little thickened,
and presented an oval ulcer of the size
of sixpence, with a thick elevated edge,
its surface exposing the submucous, and
in the centre the muscular coat. As the
patient had previously corplained of
pain in the region of the stonach, it is
probable from this (and other considera-
tions) that the above ulcer was the re-
suit of tlie antecedent disease.(2) The

softening of the iucous membrane in
the present case seems referable to the
prolonged action of the contents during
a week's inhumation, and not to the in-
fluence of the poison, which, in my ex-
perience,bas not been observed to pro-
duce that effect. The heart and lungs
were reported to have been in a natural
condition. The stomach at the end of
four weeks was scarcely altered, as I
shall further explain when alluding to
the antiseptic influence of arsenic. I
shall now proceed to the general consid-
eration ofthe niorbid condition which oh-
tain in arsenical poisoning, confining
myself on the present occasion to the
stomach, both as being the organ which
presents the mostvaried and striking ap-
pearances, and being also that which I
have enjoyed the most extended oppor-
tunities of examining.(3)

The morbid alterations produced in the
stomach by the action of arsenious acid,
arising as they do either from its local
influence as an irritant, or indirectly
from its absorption, and being independ-
ant of any corrosive agency(4), cannot
of course be considered distinctive.
From this circumstance, however, they
are well fitted to convey tothe inexperi-
enced examiner a correct idea of the ap-
pearances to be expected in irritant poi-
soning at large. To these common
signs, there are accasionally superadded
some of a peculiar nature, arising out of
the physical properties of arsenic> to be
afterwards described. The following
results have been arrived at from the ex-
amination of sixteen fatal cases:-

1st. All (with one exception, in which
maceration had aitered the parts,) ex-
hibited signs of irritation in the formi
either of-a vascular injection ; b, ecchy-
mosis; or c, coloration. The ,mucous
membrane was engaged in fifteen;. the
submucous coats aiso, in five; the peri-
toneal in two; and the venous arrange-
nient of the great extremity in one case.

The ramiforin vascularity I have only
fountid in the submucous coat,; which
seems also not subject to any of the other
varieties of injection. , The puncti-
form, or closely stellate, is by f ar: the
most common variety. occupying exten-
sive tracts of mucous surface, and cither
uniformily distributed, or disposed in
sinuous lines or scattered patches. The
striated vascularity I have met with but
a one intance.

2nd. Diffuse redness, although tnoro
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frequently present, according to my
experience, than any othler deviation
from the natural state, I have not enu-
merated under the head of vascular in-
jection since, without denying ils occa-
sional morbid character. I feel disposed
to view it as a pseudo-morbid change
resulting from the influence of transu-
dation and imbibition on the punctuated
vascularity. A ccor dingly, I have obser-
ved the latter to degenerate into diffuse
redness by the influence of tine and ex-
posure to the action of stomachie con-
tents. The diffuse redness may exist
alone or in combination with other re-
stlts of irritation.

3rd Ecchymosis as a consequence of
arsenical poisoning lias presented itself
to my observation under the forti of-
a, well-defined blotches, oval, angular,
or circular, and generally small; or b, of
lengthy streaks, parallel or areolated.
Both are formed of a thin stratum of al-
tered, nearly black, and apparently
coagulated blood, deposited in the tissue
of the mucous membrane. They are
scarcely elevated,and the (mucous mem-
brane at the point occupied being muci
softened) are readily removed by gentle
scraping, leaving behind an erosion of
corresponding figure. A variety of
ecchymoses. which I venture to desig-
nate thepetechial (seen iin five cases,)
is essentially different from the foregoing.
It consists ofinvariably snall and rather
florid blotches of fluid'blood, thinly scat-
tered for the nost part on the summits
of the rugSo, and unaccompanied by
softening of the membrane. This con-
dition might be confounded by the inex-
perienced observer with the punctuated
injection, from which. however, it is
readily distinguished by the lens, which
reveals the vessels of the latter.

The ecchymoses just described do not
appear to me to result, as might b,e sup-
posed, from tie lodgment ofsmall, mas-
ses, or particles of the poison on the mu-
cous surface, whicli I have not observed
in any, instance. On the contrary, I
have seen them produced by fluid poi-
sons, as ardent spirits, &c., which can
only act by creating a violent dpternina-
tion of blood to the entire surface and
consequent ru pture of the weaker vessels.
One at least of these conditions may
moreover exist, under circumstances in
which the poison could have onîly reach-
ed the affected part by absorption, as in
the external application of arsenic, or

where the spots involve the endocardial
membrane. - The only effect which I
have observed as strictly traceable to the
local action of arsenic on the mucous
coat is a fungous thickening (forming an
elevated ridge or circular raised patch,)
with or without the effusion of lymph,
and surmounted by adherent arsenic.(5)

It is possible that the non-occurrence
ofsloughing of the mucous membrane,
from the local contact of arsenic, is due
either to its high viiality, or to a partial
protection ofits surface by these mucous
or fibrinous effusions.

4th. Erosion of the lining membrane
I have met witi in one-fourth of the
cases examined, and under two forms.
1. The circular. 2. Long narrow sinu-
ous streaks. Both expose the submucous
coat. The former, which generally oc-
cupies the splenic end, presentsa soft un-
defined non-elevated margin free from
red coloration. The margins of the eroded
streaks, on the contrary, sharp. A care-
ful examination of these erosions has im-
pressed me with the belief, that they
are produced by the removal of the mu-
cous membrane where occupied by the
black extravasation. Accordingly, they
can be produced by gently scraping the
latter; and in one instance (fatal in thir-
ty-six hours) in which I found extensive
linear erosion, a portion of the eroded
surface was found still coated with the
black matter.

I have never encountered true ulcera-
tion of the stomach in arsenical poison-
ing, although I have -seen it extrenely
well defined on the posterior part of the
buccal mucous membrane (in a case
fatal in four days and a ialf.)

I have not been able to trace soften-
ing of the mucous tunie to tie action of
arsenic, not laving seen it in cases ex-
amined sufficiently early 1o preclude
the piossibility of its pseudo inorbid
origin. From the great îenuity of the
membrane at the splenic end, a very
short contact with the contents will suf-
fice to produce considerable softening.
particularly, wlhen the latter (as ofrten
occurs) have a decidedly acid reatioli.
In such I have witnessed froni the latter
cause, arsenieli poisoning, another pseu-
do-morbid change; nanely, extensive
brownish blaclk staiining of the mucous
surface of the splenic end, siiiilar to
what is occasionally seen fromt the ac-
tion of oxalic acid. This arises froni
the influence of gastrie acid (lactic?) oti
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the blood contained in the highly in-
flamed imucous surface, and a like col-
or is imparted te the contents when
bloody. Although softening of the mu-
cous membrane appears not an equivo-
cal result of the influence of the arsenic,
to the latter may be referred :

5th. Diminished adhesion of the mu-
cous to the submucous coat. This is
best observed at the pyloric third,
wlere traction will ofrten furnish a flake
an inch and a half te two inches in
length, being probahly three or four
times the natural amount.

Having spoken of the mucous and
submucous membranes, I have only to
state, 'hat ir. two instances I have ob-
served diffuse red coloration, and in two
capilliform injection of the peritoneal
coat, without effusion of fribrine or se-
rum.

The examination of the physical
characters ofthe stomachic contents is a
matter of much importance in medico.
legal inquiries, and, will be often found
to elucidate, in a most unexpected man-
ner questions, which may , involve the
life ofan accused party. Thus, in one
instance that fell under my notice, the
determinatiion of the nature ofasolitary,
seed found on the iucous surface be-
came of serious moment. In another
the discovery of grains of abot in.
the colon, furnished nie the means of
affording suflicient legal evidence for'
the identification of a body buried seve-.
ral weeks, in which there had been ne
label aflixed to the colin, and where the
countenance was too much altered te be
recognized, except where the contents
depuit grains of arsenic (which I have
met in two cases), they do not for the
most part present anything to distin-
guish t hein froin those observed in other
forms of non-corrosive irritant poisoning.
For the more accurate intermation,
however, of the more inexperienced in-
quirer, i subjoin(6) the numerical results
of the conditions observed, promising
that the most usual con binations of
them are, probably-1. The thick, and
turbid, and bloody, (insoluable hona-
tosine,) and 2. The copious, viscid,
and bilious, (brown or green). In ai-
luding te the pseudo-morbid changes pro-
duced in the stonach at ulterior periods,
the modifying influence of putrefactive
gases on deposited arsenic, and the con-
sequent formation of sulphuret arsenic,
need scarcely be alluded to, being now

vell known te medical jurists. A condi-
tien, however, of the mucous membrane
has presented itself te my notice, which
is capable of leading te mistake-name-
ly, a copious deposit of adherent yellow-
ish white crystals of ylwsphate of mag-
nesia and ammonia on its surface.
This occurred in a case of arsenical poi-
soning exhumed after forty-seven days,
and was evidently a post-mortem
change, as it was present also in the
lining membranes ofthe heart(7)

The peritoneal surface, alsoof the liver
in contact with the stomach, in some in-
stances, presents a deposit of white span-
ular matter, (which in a case of arseni-
cal poisoning, I have known mistaken
for arsenic supposed te have transuded.)
This [have found to consist of sulphate
of lime. Its mode of production is net
very apparent.

Although it is no part of my present
purpose te enter into the subject
of the detection of the poison, I
shall conclude the notice of the storna-
chic contents by observing generaily,
that the mode of combination of the poi-
son (when discovered) is also liable te
alteration through the influence of cir-
cumstances which have cone into oper-
ation antecedent to death. Thus I have
seen in one instance, in which arsen-
iotis acid, taken by a suicide, become
converted into arsenic of copper by the
antidotal employment of sulphate of
copper followed by albumen. Arsen-
ious acid is, however, exempt from
those alterations resulting from the ac-
tion of animal fluids and tissues, which
somietines create difficulty in the case
of other mineral poisons.

In the judicial examination of cases
of arsenical poisoning, nuch attention
bas been excited of late years by the
singular condition of preservation in
which the digestive tube and (in soine
cases) the entire body bas been discov-
ered at comparatively remote periods
after death. As such inquiries are of
sortie importance to the practitioner in
the cxeicise of his'medico-legal-func
tions, 1 shall proceed to relate the obser.
vations which I have been enabled to
mtake.

A. In the cases in whici the wlhole
body has been the stbject of inspection,
the following conditions have beeri nu-
ted:-

lst. Complete preservation of the
body and viscera (dtring )eriods of ob
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servation of from sixty-thrce to seventy-
two hours) under cireumstances higlty
favourable to putirefaction.

2nd. Rapid putrescence ofbody and
visera (under conditions extremely ad-
verse to decomposition).(8)

3rd. Good preservation of the stomach
and intestines; the body decaying as
usual (at periods of forty-seven and
seventy-five days after death, the illness
having been of eleven days duration).

4th. Rapid decomposition of the al-
.mentary canal; the body remaning un-
affected. (Examination thirty-four iours
after death : illness or fourteen days).

B. The digestive tube, or parts of it
(reumoved froma the body), bas exhibited
the undermentioned plenomena.

lst. Almost complete preservation of
stomach (emptied ofits contents) during
four weeks, followed by modified deeay
during eighmt weeks, with neutral state
of tissue, and terminating in ammonia-
cal decomposition.(9)

2nd. Rancid putrefaction.-I venture
to apl)ly this designation to a singular
condition which I believe to have been
not hitherto described, and whiel I have
witnessed in three cases. It is charac-
terized by apeculiar odour (somewhat
like that of fatty matter when undergo-
ing slow decomaposition), and by a per-
sistent and strong acid reaction, whlich,
ia a stomach still unider observation,
'has been retained undiwinished during
more than three years and a half. I
have found in these casesthatthetissues
retain their physical characters and muor-
bid appearances utimpaired for some
weeks, but finally becoie softened and
discolored.(10)

In arsenical poisoning, as sometimes
happens in other forms of death, the dL-
cay of the alimentary canal is not equal
throughout ; thus, in a case (fatal in less
than a day) the intestines conmenced
to putrefy 24 hours after death (iii
cold weather), and on the third day the
ccum was advanced in putrefaction,
the stomach remnained unchanged-a
circunistance perhaps due in that case
to the presence of free arsenic on parts
of its surface ; yet the uterus and a por-
tion of muscle which could have only
contained the small quantity of the poi-
son that reached them through the blood,
were quite fresh on ithe filih day. [o
corniparing, however, the preservation
of the dillrent organs, due allowance
should bu. made for diversity of tissue.

A careful examination of the cases
which have occurred in my experi-
ence lias led me to the belief ihat, with
the exception possibly of those instances
in which the poison in quantity is in di-
rect contact with an organ (e. g., the
stomach) the preservation in structures,
on the contrary, is not influenced by its
presence or absence in their tissue.
Thus I bave found arsenic absent in the
membranes of a stomach, which, after
an inhumation of forty-seven days, was
in a state of considera ble preservation,
and the great intestine, which afforded
not more than one twentieth of a grain
of arsenic, was in an equal state of in-
tegrity after seventy-five days. Arsen-
ic was discovered freely in the liver,
which was less preserved.(l1) On the
other hand, in recorded cases, in which
the whole body has putrified rapidly,
the presence of poison bas been indica-
ted in the fluids and tissues either by
çhemical examination, or (as in a case
which I have witnessed) by the short
duration of the illness having been in-
compatible with the elimination of the
portion absorbed. The quantity of the
latter, nioreover, even in those organs
which appropriate the greatest amnount
(e. g., the liver). is absolutely small;
not, perhaps. exceeding, on an average,
from one and a half to two grains; and
ience incapable of effecting their pres-
ervation by direct chenical union. I
have been hence led to infer that arsenic,
in most cases, produces its antiseptie
effects, local or general, by means of a
catalytic or disposing influence, in vir-
tue of which such changes are produced,
cither in the molecular condition of the
tissues, or in the atomie groupings of
their ultimate elements, as confers on
them a character of unusual stability.
Ii concluding this notice of the post-
morteni changes in arsenical deaths, I
wish to allude to the alleged evolution
of an alliaceous odour during the decay
of the body. Albhough I have not met
this condition in the body at large, I
have perceived it nosi distinctly during
the slow decay or organs which have
received the poison by ,absorption-as
the liver. 1, have no doubt that it is
due to the evolution of arseniuretted hy-
drogen.(12) Sone of the facts already
cited, in association of a variety of oth-
ers, are I conceive, incompatible with
the hypothesis offered by Liebig as ex-
planatory of the modus operandi of va-
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rious mineral poisons (arsenic included),
which assumes their deadly action to
be due to. a chemical union with the
tissue of the different organs, and conse-
quent arrest of those vital transforma-
tions within them, which are essential
to the performance of their functions.
That chemical combination of the poison
with the tissues takes place I have
satisfied myscif wiih respect to the
liver.(13) We are not, however, from
hence legitimately entitled to infer, that
such union is the cause of the usual
symptomatic manifestations, and fbr the
following reasons:

ist. The quantity of the organic tis-
sue involved in such combination (com-
pared with the mass of the organ) is
excessively small, as already shown.(14)

2nd. The lesion of function is often
inversely as the amount of poison con-
tained in tie tissue (as in the liver,
mtuscular system, &c., compared with
the brain and heart)

3rd. Life is often compromised in
cases where the entire of the compound,
which may have been formed by the
union of the poison with the tissues, has
been eliminated by the excretory organs.

The foregoing considerations, togeth-
er witlh rapid disappearance of poisons
from the blood,(15) lead to the inlrence
that the depositions of the latter in the
tissue of the secretory organs and in the
nuscular and osseous systems, so far
froin being the cause of the formidable
manifestation observed, is, on the con-
trary, a beautiful provision for the allo-
cation of those substances in parts in
which their presence is productive of
the least disturbance. Even in the now
advaniced state of physiological know-
ledge, it must be confessed that however
definite our conceptions may be of the
localaction, absorption, circulation, dis.
tributioi, and final elimination of poi-
sons, the intimate nature of their influ-
ence on remote organs has yet te be de-
termined. Thus, notwithstanding the
ingennity of modern theorists, wearestill
ignorant of the precise modus operandi
of strychnia on the spinal cord, of tobac-
co or arsenic on the heart, or of opium
on the brain.
, There seems, meanwhile to be little

reason to doubt that arsenious acid pro-
duces a profound disturbance in the mol-
ecular constitution of the blood-a dis-
turbance which perhaps (through the
agency ofoperations to bo hercafter dis-

covered) influences certain classesof
vessels, w'hile others remain exempt.
It may be also readily conceived that such
disturbance may be perpetuated after
the withdrawal of the exciting cause,
and that hence an explanation may be
afforded of the occasional fatal effects of
poisons at periods posterior to their sep-
aration from the blood, or their final el-
imination from the system.

The late experimental investigations
of Dr. Blake, and of Frierichs and Woh-
ler, as to the absolute or comparative ino-
cuity of arsenic acid (which is isomor-
phorus with, and hence capable ofreplac-
n, the phosphoric acid of the blood,
without subversion of the molecular
construction of thatfluid), and the harmi-
less nature of ihat singular organic
compound of arsenic, cacodylic acid,
afibrd some countenance to the views
above stated, which I desire to be con-
sidered in the light of suggestions only.

(1) Read before the Surgical Society
of Ireland Jan. 26, 1850.

(2) I examined not long since the
duodenum ofa gentleman between twen-
ty and thirty years of age, who died of
perforating ulcer of that part under cir-
comstances incompatible with tie sup-
position of poisoning.

(3) It is much to be regretted that the
post-mortem inspection of the abdom-
inal cavity, and in some cases to the
stomachl alone, and thus that muuch mat-
ter of great interest and importance -in
medico-legal history is lost. The ap-
pearances which I have had occasion
to observe in the heart, lungs, and blood,
have been in some cases remarkable.-
In the first, endocardial (lietecbial>
ecchymoses in hoth ventricles; in the
lungs, intense congestion, approaching
in appearance to pulmonary apoplexy
and general bronchtitis, which latter I
have more than once found indicated by
physical signs during life. The condi-
tion of the blood I have found variable,
sometimes coagulated in the heart, and
fluid in the great veins (as happens j
various other forms of death,)'and .occa-
sionally viscid in the pulmonary vessels.
In one instance, examined ten hours af-
ter death, the fluid blood removed from.
the venoussystem coagulated in the re-
ceiving vessels, affording a, milky se-
rum.

(4) In the common acceptation of Ilie
tern corrosion"which is uriderstood

3129
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to imply such chemical action as issues
in alteration of the colour or consistence
of the part, it is not, however, to be in-
ferred from the absence of the latter re-
sults, that no chemical influences are
mutually exercised by the poison and
the mucous membrane; such, in the
case of arsenious acid, are most probably
in operation, and for aught that can be
aflirmed to the contrary, may be the
cause of its irritant action on mucous,
and its sphacelating effect on ulcerated
surfaces.

(5) In one esse (fatal in twelve hous)
numerous patches of tough, coriaceous
fibrine, some of them large size, vere
discovered strongly adherent to the mu-
cous surface, which, to a correspondin
extent, was intensely vascular anà
greatly thickened. In another there
were two ridges much elevated (formed
solely by the lining membrane) and
crested with a mixed coating of arseni-
ous acid and mucus.

(6) In sixteen cases the contents
were-In Il bloody; 9turbid; 6viscid;
5 bilious ; 6 thick ; 4 flocculent; 3 acid ;
2 rancid ; 2 fetid;1 intenselyso, without
putrefaction, and apparently from ster-
coraceous regurgitation; I coffee-col-
oured.

(7) Professor Apjohn has examined
a similar condition of the peritoneum.

(8) This occurred in the case of an
individual who fell a victim to the acci-
dental administration of arsenic after an
illness of thirty-six hours. The weather
at the time was decidedly cool; the sub-
cutaneous cellular membrane notwith-
standing was emphysematous (from pu-
trefaction) twenty-two hours after death,
and the intestinal canal in eight hours
more, was much, advanced in decompo-
sition, of a dark green colour, and rap-
idly evolving gases of extreme fetor.

(9) The case to which this observa-
tion refers is that recorded at the com-
mencement of this paper. The poison
appeared to be altogether in solution,
and vhen modified decay commenced,
the surface of the organ becarne coated
with a pulpy matter. The morbid ap-
pearances, ho'vever, remained little al-
tered. At this date (thirteen weeks
after death,) the black extravasation is
quite distinct, the ,walls of the organ
firin on traction, and the peritoneal sur-
face retentive of its lustre. The odour
is different from that of common putre-
faction.

(10) The absence of ordinary ammon-

iacalputrefaction is not eonfined to cases
in which death has been produced by
arsenical poison. I have found a stom-
ach, which contained a quantity of vege-
table matter (apparently apples,) under-
go the acetous fermentationin ils tissue,
and retain it (although frequently
washed) for several months. It is stili
singular that a fluid so prone to decom-
position as urine, is occasionally im-
putrescible. Thus I have had a speci-
men (containing abundance of urea)
which remained perfectly fresh for
years, although kept in a vessel by no
means air-tight. It perhaps included
more saline matter than usual. I have
observed much retarded putrescence in
some other specimens.

(11) In this case, although the pa-
tient survived eleven days, the poison
seemed present in as great quantity in
the liver as I have found it in others
which were fatal in a few hours. In
an other instance, I detected the poison
in the same quarter after an illness of
fourteen days. It was, however, in
much less quantity than usual.

(12) It vas curions tu observe that
numerous minute insects that had at-
tacked fragments of these organs (con-
tained in ¢a closed vessel), seemed in
no wise incommoded by the atmos-
phere in which they were placed.

(13) The liver of the patient poisoned
by arsenic (the organ having been di-
vided into small fragments) was macer-
ated in successive portions of distilled
water, till all the blood and soluble mat-
ters were extracte' ; almost the entire
of the poison vas found in the insoluble
residuary tissue.

(14) Were the quantity of absorbed
poison sufficient tu chemicaiy saturate
the proximate principles of our organs,
the latter should in all fatal cases be
imputrescible, which is contrary to ex-
perience. It is remarkable that, in
poisoning by corrosive sublimate, which
has such a powerful afflinity for animal
matters, the preservation even of the
digestive organs is not effected by it,
except at those points of the mucous
membrane corroded by its direct con-
contact; such, at least, is the result of
my experience.

(15) In a case of poisoning by ace-
tate of lead, in which two drachrms
were administered -twelve hours be-
fore death, I was unable to detect a
trace of the poison in the blood collected
from the heart, although the heart itself
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gave indications of its presence ; while
in the liver, kidneys, lung, and tissue
of the intestine, it -was readily discov-
cred. The deposit of poison in the os-
seous system has been interestingly
shown in some recent cases of animal
poisoning. From this system, however,
it is ultimately eliminated-; thus I could
not discover any trace in a portion of
the femur of a girl who died on the four-
teenth day, although I found it in the
liver. The recent researches of Mdr
Millon (Annales des Chimie) on anti-
nony, demonstrate that the latter sub-

stance renaîns (in some cases of tar-
tar enetic poisoning) in the structure of
the bones for several weeks, and alte
occasionally in the subeutaneous for
1 have searched for arsenic in the latter
quarter, in the above case, without suc-
cess.

33itisl} 'trmfricant 30ttrî1I.

MONTREAL, NOVEMBER 1, 1850.

The Distinction between Right and
Wrong, a Test of Insanity.-" Under
the law of England, the substantial ques-
tion in ail cases, whatever the kind of
insanity set up, as laid down by the most
celebrated judges, was this,-Whether
at the time the act was committed, the
prisoner wascapable ofjudging between
right and wrong-whether ho did or did
not know that he cormmitted a crime
against the laws of God and nature, or
to which punishment was annexed."-
Mr. Justice Aylwin's charge on the trial
of William Shutts for murder, as reported
by the .llerald.

There is scarcely a subject more emi-
nently worthy the attention of the Legis-
lator than that of Insanity, involving as
it frequently does, questions of the gra-
vest responsibility. In cases of nmurder,
this plea is very frequently raised to
shield the murderer from the consequen-
ces of his act. Indeed it has been so
very frequently invoked in extenuation
of punishment, as to have awakened the
keenest suspicions of its reality in parti-
cular cases ; and whenever urged, should
with the greatest propriety be received
with caution, and its grounds Most nar-

rowly scrutinized. It is our firm im-
pression that not every case of murder,
in which the plea of insanity has beer
successfully urged in extenuation, bas
been one of impulsive homicide : equally
so is it our belief, that the plea has not
been advanced, or if so, not successfully
maintained, in cases in which aberration
of mind unquestionably existed. As an
example of the latter, we may urge the
case of Jones, a private of the 19th Reg.
convicted of the murder of Corporal
Fitzgerald, whose insanity, active at the
time of the commission of the murder,
terminated in utter dementia. This
case, of late occurrence in this city, ex-
cited at the time very general interest,
and was followed by the appointment of
a commissio de lunatico which saved
him from the scaffold. Under any cir-
cumstances, the greatest caution should
be exercised in the acceptance or rejec-
tion of the plea,and in aIl cases,science as
it is, not as it wvas some centuries ago,
should be made to yield its tribute of in-
formation.

Of ail the questions which can be sub-
mitted to the consideration of a medical
jurist, there are none more perplexing
than those involved in the existence or
non-existence of insanity. It is a disease
which, in its protean forms, defies the ap-
plicability of any single test; and ai-
though in early days of medical science,
crude notions may have originated, and
induced, the adoption of the, test -of in17
sanity which heads this article, modern
researches have completely exp'oded it.,
Of what use is the progressive march of
science, unless it can be rendered avail-
able for beneficial ends-and it does
seem to be a singular anomaly, that two
such remnants of barbarism should-still
disgrace the statutes of English crimi-
nal law, as the definition and test of in-
sanity just al!uded to, and the empannel-
ing of the jury of matrons to determine
aquestion of pregnancy, which was actu-
ally put in practice in Aug. 1847, by Mr.
Baron Platt, in London, iii the case of
Mary Ann Hunt. This highly respect--
able jury having duly investigated, re-
ported-" the prisoner is not quick with
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child," whereas her pregnancy was sub-
sequently certified to by compe-
tent medical authority, whose opinion
stayed her execution, an opinion wvhich
was in due time fully verified.

The subject of insanity has been so
fully studied in France, America, and
England, during the present century, as
to leave but few questions connected
with it unsolved, so far at least as they
permit of solution. As a result of this
close investigation, there is not one cir-
cumstance more fully established, than,
that an inability to discriminate between
right and wrong, is not only not a uni-
versal characteristic of the disease, but
that the contrary is almost always pre-
sent in cases of the description, termed
by modern authors, moral irisanity,
in which the reasoning powers may be
scarcely impaired, while the natural feel-
ings, affections, or desires are so per-
verted as impulsively to lead to breaches
of the moral law. This is a fact, as
firmly and fully established by observa-
tions as a fact can well be ; and yet in
opposition to universal medical testimony
concurrent on this point, because the
law of England maintains the contrary,
such testimony must be set aside, and
these laborious investigations rendered of
no avail. It is full time that this con-
dition of matters should be altered, and
that the jurisprudence of insanity should
not be fettered as it is. We have no
wish to quarrel with the lonorable Judge
who defined what the law was
on the subject. He was the expounder
of the law, as it is, not its maker ; but
emphatically some wider, more generous
views should be entertained in regard to
this matter, founded on the generally
recogynised principles of science. 1\edi-
cal science, may, under certain circum-
stances, be truly said to be the handmaid
of justice, and the latter cannot with pro-
priety, accept some of the advances or
improvement, which the former has made,
and reject blindly others;

One of the most singular incongruities
in reference to this subject, consists in
the fact, that the law will readily recog-
nise and -admit evidence of insanity in

civil cases, which it stoutly rejects in
criminal-that it has a willing and keen
eye for it in cases of the former descrip-
tion, while it almost disdains a search
for it in those of the latter. To a cer-
tain extent this is right ; but it must not
be forgotten that the practice may be
carried too far,and that a too jealous admin
istration of the law, which lias thrown its
.zEgis around society to restrain the cri-
minal, or punish him for his crime, may
at the saine time inflict a deeper-far
more rankling-w'ound, by a bigoted sac-
rifice to form and precedent, of one vie-
tim of perverted reason. Let us not be
misunderstood upon this subject. We
do not belong to that sect of phil-
anthropists who advocate the abolition
of the death penalty for murder ; but we
do think that that movement owes its
origin mainly to the ill-judged adminis-
tration of retributive justice. Men's
minds naturally revolt at the stern exe-
cution of a criminal, placed in that posi-
tion by an act, for which, by a mysterious
dispensation of Providence, he is not res-
ponsible ; and in all cases, especially
when the previous existence of insanity
has been proved, and knowing well the
strong tendency to relapse-if a doubt
nan be entertained, the prisoner should
have the benefit of it.

Demonstrative Midwifery. - During
the last session of the University of Buf-
falo, Dr. White the Professor of Obstet-
ries, adopted the system of Demonstra-
tive Midwifery, practised in some of the
European schools. The graduating
class vas alone present, and everything
appears to have been conducted with the
greatest decorum. Seventeen medical
gentlemen of Buffalo, however. with
greater zeal than discretion, openly stig-
matized the proceeding as " wholly un-
necessary, and grossly offensive alike to
morality and common decency"; that it
should not be " practised in any civilized
community",; and wound up by adminis-
tering what they were pleased to term

a severe rebuke" to Dr. White. An-
oiymous letters upon the subject, ap-
peared also in some of the, Buffalo daily
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papers, animadverting in no rineasured
terms upon the practice adopted at the
University, and upon Dr. White as its
author ; until, finally, matters reached
such a height, that an action for libel
was instituted " by the people against
Dr. Horatio N. Loomis, which was tried
at the Erie County Oyer and Terminer,
June 24, 1850. The report of the trial
is exceedingly interestîng, and embraces
the testimony of a number of the leading
Physicians of the United States, specially
subpoenad, almost every one of whom
fully sustained Dr. White. The tes-
timony was exceedingly strong against
the Defendant, and although the District
Attorney in his opening address con-
demned the course of the Defendant in
severe yet appropriate terms-and al-
though the charge of Mr. Justice Mallet,
characterized as it was by legal learning
and scientific research--was also against
the defendant, yet the Jury brought in a
verdict of " not guilty."

While we are unwilling to admit the
sligh test superiority in the mode of teach-
ing Midwifery adopted by Dr. White,
over that zommonly practised, viz : per-
sonal bed-side attendance, as obtains
most usùally in all our Lying-in Hospi-
tais, we do not intend to find fault with I
hiin in his adoption of the former method.
The practice does, however, in our
opinion, carry witih it a violation of one
of the fundamental rules of the lying-in
chamber.: that ail unnecessary exposure
of Me pätient should be avoided. The
iccoucheur's cyes should, in all cases
f a nalural description of labor, be at

tis fingers' ends; and the student's
ducation in Midwifery should be per-
ected at his digital extremities. En-
ertaining these views, we do not approve
f the denonstrative mode of teaching
Iidwvifery ; but we nevertheless cannot
ut most heartily condemn the conduct
f the " seventeen" as one of the gross-
st breaches of professional decoruni and
ourtesy, with which we have ever met,
nd displaying a degree of ignorance and
resumption as to the practice of " civili-
ed communities" for which we were
Vholly unpropared.

COLLEGE OF PHYSICIANS
AND SURFEONS.

QUEnrc, Oct. 8, 1850.
At the semi-annual meeting of the

Board of Governors, of the College of
Physicians and Surgeons of Lower Ca-
nada, held this day, at'the School of
Medicine, Quebec, there were present,
Dr. Blanchet, V.P. Dr. Tetu,

« Von Iffland, " Marmette,
ce Hall, " Brigham,
, Badeau, Peltier,
eMarquis, Jackson,
« Kimber, " Russell,
«Sewel, « Marsden,
«David, " Morrin,
«e Weilbrenner, " Bardy,
« Nault.
Dr. Blanchet, Vice-Presideit, having

taken the chair, the minutes of the meet-
ing of the loth July last, at Three Ri-
vers, were read-as was also a letter
from Dr. Francis Fortier, of St. Michel,
District of Quebec, declining to accept
of his nomination as one of the Gover-
nors, and tendering his resignation-
which, on motion, vas accepted.

Excuses for non-attendance at this
meeting were offibed by Drs. Johnston,
Sutherland, Chamberlin, Fowler, and
Arnoidi; which were accepted as satis-
factory. The report from tie commit-
tee nanied at the triennial mnetin to
examine the Treasuber's oks, ac-
counts, &c., reported that they had duly
examined all, and found eveyîthing
correct, and a sum of £133 Los, in the
City and District Savings Bank, at the
credit of, the College.

The committec to which was referred
the matter of obtaining a testimonial
of the late Dr. Arnoldi, reported ait
length recommending that a Like.ness
painted in oil, should be obtained,vhich
report w-as received and adopted, and
the conmittee empowered to obtain
one.

Moise Sabourin, M. D., M'Gill Col-
lege, having been duly sworn, was
granted his License.
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Richard P. Coffy, L. R. C. S. L., T.
Boudreau, John Doherty, University of
New York, J. Giasson, P. Desjasdin, G.
St. Armand, S. Payne, A. Beaupré, hav-
ing been examined nnd found quali-
fied were granted their Licenses and
ten gentlemen were renanded to their
studies.

The following gentlemen wore ad-
mitted to enter upon the study of medi-
cine, viz :-Messrs. J. Franchere, P.
St. Jean, Charles Chamberland, S.
Goyette, Charles Buckley, O. Lanctot,
P. Pepin.

There being no further business, the
Board adjourned.

P. M. BARnY,
Sec. Coll. Phys. & Surg. Dis. Quebec.

Toronto University. - We observe
that this University has effected an im-
portant alteration in the Curriculum for
its Medical Degree :-Students are not
now obliged to pass through Arts before
they can obtain honors in Medicine. In
this respect, they now follow the Scot-
tish system, which is the same that has
been always adopted at M'Gill College.
We regret, however, that in altering their
Curriculum, they have not deemed it ex-
pedient to assimilate their system of
instruction to that previously adopted
in this section of the Province:

The Senate of the Toronto University
have rade some important alterations
in the regulations relative to the course
for obtaining Degrees in Medicine. We
have been requested to publish ther:

The only degree in Medicine to be
here after conferred, shall be that of M.
D.,fer which the requisites shall be-

1. Having taken a degree in Arts in
this University, - or in a University or
College, the degrees of vhich are re-
cognized by this University, or having
passed the natriculation examination in
Greek,Latin and Mathematics, and from
and after the beginning of the year
1851-52, the Element of Natural Phi-
losophy, before the Faculy of Medicine.

2. Having attained the age of21 years.
3. Having been engaged, in Medicat

Studies not less than four years; having

attended not less than two courses of
Lectures, each of six months duration,
on-1. Fractical Anatomy, withdissec-
Principles and Practiceof Medicine. 4.
tions. 2. Anatomy and Physiology. 3.
Principles and Practice of Surgery. One
six months' course on-5. Materia Medi-
ca and Pharmacy. 6. Chemistry.-7.
Midwifery and diseases of Women and
Children. 8. Medical Jurisprudence-
and one three months' course on-9.
Practical Chemistry'-in this Univer-
sity, or in a University or College or
School of Medicine recognized by this
Unniversitv.

One year of the four to be spent in
attending Lectures in this University;
and certificates for attendance upon
more thîanfour or less than lio of the
above subjects in one year wiIl not be
received.

4. I-aving attended the Medical and
Surgical practice of a recognized Hos-
pital for eighteen months, and Medical
and Surgical Clinical Lectures during
six months of the above time.

5. Iaving passed Examinations in
all of the above subjects. The Examina-
tions to be conducted by .printed ques-
tions and viva voce examinations on the
written answers, at the discretion of the
Examiners

6. laving performed the appointed
exercises, which shall consist of a thesis
on some Medical subject, chosen by the
Candidate and approved by the Dean of
the Faculty. and the performance upon
the Dead subject of such Capital opera-
tions as may be required by the Exami-
ners.-Pariot.

Upper Canada School of Medicine.-
We observe that a new school of medi-
cine has been started in Toronto, making
the third in that city. The lectures will
be delivered as follows :-Midwifery, by
Dr. Hodder; Anatomy, by Dr. Bethune;
Medicine, by Dr. Bovell; Surgery, by
Dr. Melville; Medical lurisprudence, by
Dr. Badgley; and Practical Anatomy,
by Dr. Bethune.i Clinical lectures wili
be delivered at the Toronto Dispensary;
and Obstetrical -cases provided at the
Lying.in lospital. -The lecturers will
illustrate their subjects by suitable pre-
parations, diagrams and plates ; and a
choice and extensive Library will be at
the disposal of the Students, under pro.
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per regulations. From what we know
of the character and abilities of the lec-
turers, we have no doubt that students
will derive advantage from following
thes'e courses, We observe, however,
that there is no lecturer on Chemistry.

MGill College.-By the rernoval of
Doctors Badgley and Macdonnell from
this city, and the consequent resignation
of the Chairs which they respectively
held in the University, appointments
have necessarily followed. The chair of
Medical Jurisprudence, held by Doctor
Badgley, has been filled by the appoint-
ment of Dr. Arnoldi; and that of Clini-
cal Medicine, held by Dr. Macdonnell,
by the appointment of Dr. Sewell. The
annual winter session in the Faculty of
Medicine, commences on Monday, the
4th instant.

At the Annual Meeting of the Medico-
Chirurgical Society, on the 5th October,
the following gentlemen were elected of-
ficers for the ensuing year:

President, F. C. T. Arnoldi, M. D.-;
First Vice-President, A. i. David,
M. D. ; Second Vice-President, Wm.
Wright, M. D.; Secretary, George D.
Gibb, M. D. ; Treasarer, WVm. Suther-
land, M. -D.

Comnittee of Arrangement -W. E.
Scott, M. D. ; G. D. Gibb, M. D.; and
R. P. Howard, M. D.

At the Annual Meeting of the Patho-
logical Society, held on the 14th of
September, the following gentlemen were
elected officers for the ensuing year:-
President, - - - H. Peltier, M. D.
Vice-President, G. E. Fenwick, M. D.
Secretary, - - G. D. Gibb, M. D.
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29.60 29.49 29.62 29.54 S E b s S W S W
29.67 29.65 29.52 29.69 W b N W byN WbyN
29.81 29.77 29.76 29.77 S 2W S S W S W
29.64 29.58 29.73 29.63 NWb N NW bN NW bN
29.70 29.72 29.66 29.71 NWbN W . W
29.67 29.59 29.71 29.63 s W SWbyS SWbyS
29.61 29.56 29.62 29.59 W W 1 W
29.64 29.62 29.60 29.63 W W NW W N W
29.63 29.61 29 64 29.65 W W W-
29.66 29.68 29.68 29.68 WWW W NW W N W
29.75 20.72 29.70 29.74 W W W
29.85 29.86 29.75 29.87 W 3W W
29.88 29.79 29.89 29.79 W W W
29.59 29.5.3 29.71 29.55 S S W
29.48 29.41 29.54 29.44 S W S V S W
29.49 29.58 29.43 29.60 S w W W
29.85 29.82 29.74 29.83 WbyN S W S
29.79 29.73 29.82 29.75 s 8 S
29.72 29.74 30.73 29.72 S S s
29.57 29.44ý 29.70 29.51 S S S
29.82 29.81 29.53 29.81 N N N
29.88 29,77 29.81 29.81 E N E N E
29.72 29.55 29.78 29.49 NEbyE E N E E
29.27 29.29 29.20 29.35 W W ' W
29.64 29.72 29.49 29.73 IV W IV
30.00 29.96 29.82 29.95 W W S i

WEATHER,

7 A.M. 3P.M. 10P.M.

Clo'dy Fair Shw's
Fair Rain Rain
Fair Fair Fair
Fair Fair Clo'dy
Shw's Rain Rain
Fair Fair Fair
Fair Fair, Fair
Clo'dy Fair Fair
Fair Fair Fair
Fair CIo'dy nain
Rain Fair Fair
Shw's Shw's O're'st
CIO'dI Fair Fair
tir Fair Fair
Fair Fuir Fair
Misty Fair Fair
Mity Fair Fair
Cln'dy Rain Clo<'dy
Clo'd) Clo'dy t¶in
Clo'dy Fair Fair
Fuir Fair Clo'dy
Fair Fair- O'rc'at
(lo'dy J'rc'st O'rc'st
Fair Itain Th'dr
Fair Fair Fair
Fair O'rc'st Clo'dy
Clo'dy Rain Rain
O'rcst Rain Clo'dy
Fair Fair Fair
Fuir Fuir Clo'dy

335

T R7 Mximum 88 on the 1st, at 3 P. M.Maxinum, 230.00 in, on the 30th, at 7 A.M
T i Minimum, '38 " 26th,ut A. M. N '' Minimum, 29.20 " " 27th- at 3P,M.

Mean of the Month, +61.7 Mean of the Mouth, 29.68 inches.
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