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The Jesuits and their Estates In Canada.

A discussion has recently been started 
in the French press of Quebec on the 
subject of the restitution of the property 
of the Jesuit order in Canada, which was 
attached to the Crown domain in the 
year 1800. The opening of this question- 
at the present time would lead to the 
presumption that this famous order had 
been persecuted and its property confis­
cated. Such, however, is not the case. 
The history of the Jesuits in Canada is 
briefly as follows, according to a French 
authority :

They began to arrive here in 1625, at a 
time when the Recollects had been here 
about 10 years. In 1633, the Recollects 
withdrew, but returned in 1672 to remain 
here until the death of the last of their 
number towards 1800. The Jesuits, from 
the outset, devoted themselves to the 
education of the Indian, as well as of the 
Canadian youth, and on this account the 
Kings of France granted them at different 
times large tracts of land which they 
held as Seigneurs, like all the other 
lands in New France. When the country 
was ceded to England in 1763, the King 
of England was substituted for the King

The Egyptian Climate.

While the circumstances of the Egyp­
tian climate are in general reassuring, 
there are important differences between 
various parts of the country and between 
various seasons of the year. The medical 
records of the Frengh occupation, 1799- 
1801, afford much information On these 
points ; the English expedition under Sir 
Ralph Abercromby, which landed at 
Aboukir in March, 1801, and re-embarked 
there in September of the same year, had 
a less varied and on the whole more favor­
able experience of the Egyptian climate. 
One of the English medical chroniclers 
found that the downfall was much less 
copious than in other hot countries— ex­
cept near the sea coast ; but this experi­
ence did not extend into the most un 
healthy season. According to Baron 
Larry, who was surgeon-in-chief to the 
French army in Egypt, the seasons in that 
country maybe divided as follows : He 
begins with the season which happens to 
be the one now current, lasting about 
three or four months, from July onwards, 
jtnd corresponding generally to the rise 
and overflow of the Nile. It is the damp 
season, the season of morning and even-

of France, but the change in no way 
aflected the Seigneurs or their tenants 
Nevertheless, the Jesuits ended by' being 
made an exception, as will be seen. Pre 
cisely about this time (1762-64) the ene 
mies of the Jesuits had them expelled 

• from Franco, Spain and Portugal. The 
English Crown decided that, for the 
future, no members of the Order from 
abroad would be admitted into Canada. 
Those, however, who were already in the 
country, were neither molested, nor dis­
turbed. In 1800 Pere Cazot, the 
of the survivors, died, and the Quebec 
House of Assembly united the property 
of the Jesuits to the Crown domain, the 
revenues thereof being set apart for edu­
cational purposes according to the inten 
tion of the French kings in making the 
original grants. It will thus be seen that 
neither England nor Canada can be 
counted among the persecutors of the 
Order. On the contrary, its members 
have invariably been treated by them 
with kindness. It is only within thirty 
years that the Fathers of the Or 1er re 
established themselves in Quebec and 
Montreal, where they enjoy the fullest 
liberty. Half of their number in the 
country at present are native Canadians, 

The properties they mow seek to re­
cover are now of immense value, as will 
be seen by the following list furnished 
"by Mr. David, of Montreal, to Le Monde 

Seigniory of Notre Dame des Anges, or 
Charlesbourg, Seigniory of St. Gabriel or 
Lorettes. Seigniory of Sillery, near Que 
bec ; Seigniory of Belair, Seigniory of 
Cape Magdalen, Seigniory of Batiscan, St. 
Christopher’s Island, Seigniory' of Magda­
len Prairie, opposite Montreal ; Reaux Is­
land, Fiet of Pachigny, in the city' of 
Three Rivers ; Fief near Three Rivers, La 
Vacherie, near Quebec, St. Roche’s ; a 
farm near St. Nicholas, a lot in the Upper 
Town, Quebec ; various lots in the Upper 
Town, Quebec ; lots in Montreal, being 
sites of the Champ de Mars, City Hall, 
Court House, etc.

Mr. David, in urging the restitution of 
these estates, remarks :—

“As for us Catholics, our du)v is to an­
nounce to the world, in the most unmis­
takable terms, that an injustice has been 
committed, and that reparation is deman­
ded, if not in the name of religion, at 
least in the name of justice.” .

Should the Jesuits succeed in estab­
lishing a legal claim to the property 
above, they would be the wealthiest reli­
gious community in America, or, for that 
matter, in the world. But there are 
other questions to be considered which 
seem an insuperable bar to the restora­
tion.

Comparative weight and yield of Eggs. 
—A correspondent of the Country Gentle­
man gives the standard yield and weight 
of eggs for different varieties of domestic 
fowl as follows :—

Light Brahmas and partridge Cochins, 
eggs 7 to the pound; they' lay, according 
to treatment and keeping, from 80 to 100 
per annum, oftentimes more if kept well. 
Dark Brahmas, 8 to the pound, and about 
70 per annum. Black, white and buff 
Cochins, 8 to -the pound; 100 is a large 
yeald per annum. Plymouth Rocks, 8 to 
the pound, lay 100 per annum. Houdans, 
8 to the pound, lay 150 per annum; non- 
sitter. La Fleche, 7 to the pound, lay 
140 per annum; non-sitter. Black Span­
ish, 7 to the pound, lay 150 per annum. 
Dominiques, 9 to the pound, lay 130 per 
annum. Games, 9 to the pound, lay 130 
per annum. Crevecceurs, 7 to the pound, 
lay 150 per annum. Leghorns, 9 to the 
pound, lay' 150 to 200 per annum. Ilam- 
burgs, 9 to the pound, lay 170 per annum. 
Polish, 9 to the pound, lay 150, per 
annum. Bantams, 16 to the pound, lay 
60 per annum. Turkeys, eggs 5 to the 
pound, lay from 30 to 00 per annum. 
Ducks, eggs vary greatly with different 

iyjpecies, tut from 5 to 6 to the pound, and 
from 14 to 28 per annum, according to 
age and keeping. Geese, 4 to the pound 
lay 20 per annum. Geineas, 11 to the 
pound, lay 60 per annum.

ing mists, and the usual forms of camp 
sickness—fevers, diarrhoeas and ophtal 
mias. The second, which he names the 
season of fruitfulness, begins about the 
winter solstice, and lasts to the first week 
of March. The prevailing westerly wind 
in the damp season goes round to the 
east, and for the most part remains in that 
quarter. The nights are extremely' cold, 
but the days are as warm as a European 
June, and all nature is fresh and revived. 
The third season is what he calls the un­
healthy season ; it includes March, April 
and part of May, and corresponds to the 
time when the noxious kampsin is apt to 
blow. The wind is from the south, and 
about every fifth day it rises to a hurri­
cane, blows with that degree of violence 
usually for four or five hours, and again 
subsides. The wind is hot, and it carries 
with it particles of sand from the desert, 
as well as noxious emanations from fields 
watered by the Nile. The season that 
follows, from the first of June to the com 
mencement of the inundation, is the sea­
son of steady and invigorating winds, 
The wind gets up at sunrise, and falls 
suddenly after sunset. Passing over the 
Mediterranean, these winds cany inland 
much vapor, which condenses in torrents 
of rain on the Abyssinian mountains, and 
causes the annual rise of the Nile. The 
nights are now cool, without being damp; 
the heat of the day is extreme, and would 
be insupportable but for the steady north 
wind that tempers it. It is the purest 
and most healthy season of the Egyptian 
year. There is practically no sickness, 
and the French surgeon found that 
wounds healed with remarkable rapidity. 
That season is over for the current year, 
and it will be the damp season—in so far 
as Egypt is ever damp—which the tooops 
will first encounter.

In Colorado is a ten-acre field which is 
simply a subterranean lake covered with 
soil about eighteen inches deep. On the 
soil is cultivated a field of corn which pro­
duces thirty bushels to the acre. If any 
one will take the trouble to did a hole to 
the depth of a spade handle he will find 
that it will fill with water, and by using a 
hook and line fish four and five inches 
long may be caught. The fish have neither 
scales nor eyes, and are peach-like in 
shape. The ground is a black marl in 
nature, and in all probability at one time 
an open body of water, on which accumu­
lated vegetable matter, which has been 
increased from time to time, until it now 
has a crust sufficiently strong and rich to 
produce fine corn, although it has to be 
cultivated by hand, as it is not strong 
enough to bear the weight of a horse. 
While harvesting the hands catch great 
strings of fish by making a hole through 
the earth. A person rising on his heels 
and coming down suddenly can see the 
growing corn shake all around him.

Lizzie Hammond, a chambermaid in a 
fourth story room where she had no 
business to be, attempted to avoid ex­
posure by climbing out of the window 
and sliding to the ground by means of a 
telegraph wire that passed by just, within 
reach. Before she had descended many 
yards the w! o burnt her hands as though 
it was red hot, and she was compelled to 
let go. In falling her body bounded 
back and forth between two parallel walls. 
This loosened the momentum of her de­
scent, which was still further diminished 
by striking on a telephone wire. 
She thus escaped being killed by 
the fall, but the physicians found 
that her neck was disjointed as it would 
have been by hanging. They cliloformed 
her, set her neck back in its proper place, 
and now have hopes that her youth 
and strong constitution may carry her 
through.

“Say what you will about him,” said a 
citizen of a seedy looking neighbor who 
had seated himself in the shadow of a 
fence to rest, “he is always true to his 
sense of duty.”

“What duty ?”
“The duty of gettine drunk.”

Mexicans and their Harried Life.

The well-to-do Mexicans have their own 
peculiar method of managing their mar­
ried life so that familiarty may not breed 
contempt. Husband and wife have en­
tirely separate apartments, and neither 
is expected to enter the apartments of 
the other except on invitation. These 
apartments are in the same house, or at 
least in the same enclosure, yet they are 
usually separated by a considerable space. 
Each has a separate set of attendants or 
servants, and nothing seems in common 
between them except at table, at which 
they always eat together, the nursery for 
the children and the yard or court, with 
its flowers, figs and vines. When the 
husband desires the company of his lady 
in his apartments he writes an invitation 
in terms of the most formal and lofty 
politeness, encloses it in a perfumed 
envelope, seals it, and sends it on a silver 
tray in the hands of a servant. The lady 
acknowledges the invitation in the same 
way, and if she accepts, which she is most 
likely to do, she appears at the door of 
his apartments at the appointed hour, in 
bridal costume, escorted by one or more 
of her ladies in waiting. These then re­
tire. The husband receives her at the 
door, leads her to a little table, where he 
treats her to chocolate or tea, cakes, 
fruits, etc. In the midst of the apart­
ments he has a room furnished in the 
most exquisite way he is capable of, 
which he holds sacred to his lady and 
never occupies unless; she is present. 
This room is his pride. He spares no ex 
pense to make it as unique and charming 
as possble. When the gentleman has 
received his lady into his aparments 
it is not proper to leave her 
until they have breakfast edj
which does not usually occur until 
nine o’clock. After the lapse of some 
days—I did not know how many—eti­
quette requires that the lady shall return 
the husband’s compliments by a similar 
invitation nicely sealed in a perfumed 
envelope on a silver tray. He acknow- 
leges the invitation with many thanks, 
and if he accepts, wljjch it is presumed 
he is quite sure to do, he first indulges in 
the bath, prigs himself up in his best 
array, patronizes his perfame bottles and 
his pomades, and at the appointed hour 
is received by the queen of his affections, 
who is dressed like a bride to tio honor 
to the occasion. She has also, in the 
midst of her apartments, a room which 
she holds sacred to her husband and 
which she never occupies unless he is 
present. It may be supposed that this 
sacred room is her pride above all things, 
and to adorn and watch over it, the chief 
occupation and joy of her life. They 
remain together in the lady’s apartments 
till breakfast, after which they again 
separate. Thus there is a continual in­
terchange of courtesies and a perpetual 
courtship. They tell me that this 
pretty way of doing continues as long as 
they live, even-if it be a hundred or 
more years.

WAR IN EGYPT.
DoLesseps has just arrived at Paris. In" 

an interview he said the first fact that 
should be known regarding the Egyptain 
matter is that the movement is a national 

8. He was convinced that Arabi has 
the whole nation at his back. His force 
is probably betwen 25,000 and 30,000 
Arabs, and he has arms for 200,000, and 
when he needs men he can get them. 
He had every reason to be satisfied jwith 
the manner that Arabi had behaved to­
ward the canal.

The English had no need of the canal 
for their operation». DeLessps said Arabi 
had not placed a price on his head, but 
after the English had landed at Suez he 
had received a letter fron Arabi, saying 
that he knew it was not his fault, and 
giving him notice that the- sweet water 
canal would be «£. English sailors had 
behaved very txjnly, firing right and left 
in the streets and killing many Arab 
woman and childem, and one of DeLessps 
own employees. The English army is 
very well organized. He thinks the war 
will be a long one, and the final results 
cannot yet be forecasted. No serious 
operations could be undertaken unless 
the bad weather and the overflow of the 
Nile were at an end-that would be in 
October. The war would be no military 
promenade. It was not true that Arabi 
Pasha had mutilated the English dead 
and wounded; he ha‘d heard nothing of 
that from officers in Egypt. England 
had been long intending to get her finger 
into Egypt on some pretext or another. 
The whole Egyptian trouble has been 
caused by the intrigues of Edward Mallet

shelling Arabi Pasha’s camp. The enemy 
replied, there shells falling within ten 
yards of Fleming depot, Ramleh lines. 
Two more British guns joined in the fire, 
whereupon a lively cannonade ensued. 
The enemy continued to make excellent 
practice, all their shells falling close to 
the British camp. The water in the 
canal broke through the dam to-day and 
is one and a half meters high. A Greek 
who recently arrived here from Cairo gives 
a gloomy accouht of the situation there. 
He fears that when Arabi Pasha is de­
feated, he will destroy the city. He 
estimates that there are at Cairo only 
1500 troops will join in pillaging the city 
at the first opportunity. He says that 
Circassians are maltreated if seen on the 
streets in Cairo.

Lord Dufferin, yesterday informed the 
Sultan that England would assent to 
landing of 2,000 or 3,000 Turkish troops 
at Port Said. It is understood that 
Dervish Pasha will command the ex­
pedition and Baker Pasha will be chief of 
Staff.

Paris, Sept. 5—A despatch from Con­
stantinople to-day states that the Anglo- 
Turkish military convention has been 
signed.

The Times' Port Said despatch reports 
that large numbers of Bedouins have 
again been seen ou the banks of the 
canal between Port Said and Ismailia.

The enemy has apparently been rein­
forced.

Some rebel officers from Salihiyeh 
arrived at Ismailia to tender their sub­
mission]. Over 8,000 Arabs are now re 
ported to be fortifying Salihiyeh. The

,, , enemy are embarking their baggage andand for the purpose of giving England .... v t ...... . .. „ . military stores from Fort Ghemileh.‘“is opportunity. He had not seen any

Five yeai-s ago Wilhelmian Rousseau 
arrived in this country from the little Be­
lgian town of Roubais. A bright face, a. 
pair of crutches and a blasphemous parrot 
constituted the sole capital with which 
she began business in a strange land. She 
is about returning to her parents and her 
old home with $40,000, which the mute 
appeals of her winning countenance have 
extracted from the pockets of the benev­
olent people of New York and Philadel­
phia.

The position of high constable for the 
Algonia district has been rendered vacant 
by the resignation of John Dawson. The 
Expositor is of opinion that the necessity 
for such an officer has passed away, and 
that the salary attached to the office 
might be more judiciously spent in pay­
ing rangers in connection with the Crown 
Land offices, to show people through lie 
Crown Lands and assist them in locating 
.ands.

Mr. Geo. Wright, an old and respected 
resident on the Windmill road near Hali­
fax, has been forced to flee from the place 
with his family to avoid the villainous 
persecution of unknown persons. The 
last outrage perpetrated wa .he burning 
ing of his ham just after he had finished 
storing the season’s crop of hay. ■ He had 
previously appealed to the authorities for 
protection, but without success.

Some of the Edmonton merchants are 
finding it cheaper to bring in their Cana­
dian goods by way of the Missouri River 
and Benton than by way of Winnipeg. 
This, the P.attleford Herald thinks, ought 
not to be the case, for a rail and Water 
route with a few transfers ought to be 
able to compete successfully with the 
Missouri route, with cart freight from that 
point to Edmonton. "

A recent controversy over the post- 
mastership at Penn Yan recalls an old 
explanation of how the place got its out­
landish name. The story goes that two 
colonies, one of Pennsylvanians and one 
of Yankees, settled there, that each 
colony wanted to name the settlement 
after its old home, and that they finally 

’ agreed upon Penn Yan as a compromise.

actual fighting but there had been many 
more killed and wounded among the 
English then they had reported; also 
many cases of sunstrokes and a little 
cholera. When he had been in Egypt 
before, when troubles had begun, he had 
found some opposition to Arabi among 
the Bedouin chiefs, but now they were, 
he believe<|, all for Arabi, even those who 
before had opposed him. Arabi had 
said to him (DeLessps) that they were 
Egyptians before they were any thing else 
Even if Arabi were killed or captured, 
the war would not on that account come 
to an end. The English might buy 
some chiefs, but that would not help 
them much. The Khedive was a. man 
who would never be able to govern the 
country. Even if the English succeeded 
in re-establishing his authority, it would 
end, if the English were successful, in 
his either being deposed by them or in 
his being a merely nominal ruler. At 
present he was a prisoner and nothing 
that he did had any weight with the Eng­
lish people. De Desseps said that the 
Suez canal trouble* could not occur with 
the Panama canal, because the Americans 
never interfered in matters that did not 
concern them, while it has been the in­
variable practice of England to be always 
meddling in other peoples affairs. He 
had no apprehension that Panama would 
ever hear cannon fired. Work on the 
Panama Canal was progressing favorably 
and was being pushed forward with the 
utmost activity. He leaves Paris on Mon 
day.

Kassassin, Sept. 3.

Salihiyeh has been abandoned by 
Arabi. It is not expected that we shall 
be ready to advance for a week.

Mahmoud Ishmy has written a report 
addressed to the Khedive with plans 
revealing the positions and strength of 
the enemy. The translation will be sent 
to General Wolseley. From Internal evi­
dences it is believed its statements are 
correct.

The substance of Mahmoud Ishmy’s 
information has been telegraphed to 
Gen. Wolseley. It is believed that the 
influence of Mahmoud Ishmy’s will be 
useful in bringihg over rebels.

M. Victor Lesseps, in a report to the 
Suez Canal Company, says General 
Wolseley informed him that the English 
Government accepted the responsibility 
for damage and obstruction to the traffic 
of the canal.

A body of 100 marines made a raid to 
day on the villages between Alexandria 
and Meks and arrested all persons who 
were unable to give a good account of 
themselves. The authorities are taking 
stringent measures to prevent the indis 
criminate land of persons without means 
or employment. One hundred and fifty 
such persons who landed here yesterday 
have been sent to the Arsenal pending a 
decision as to whether or not they shall 
be compelled to return on board the 
vessels from which they disembarked.

Four Bedouins who were caught looting 
in Pawleh have been sentenced to death.

A despatch grom Port Said to the Daily 
News says the fresh water canal at 
Ismailia is falling rapidly. The water 

has

A Horrible Death.

The schooner Benson, of which Capt 
James Anderson was commander, had 
gone to Lake Superior for a cargo of 
timber, she .and two or three other crafts 
being towed by the tug Metamora. The 
tow arrived safely at the camp on Serpent 
River, qnd the work of leading commenc­
ed. On the aecond day after araival, 
while the timber was being put aboard 
the Benson, an accident occurred, and 
the horrible death of Capt. Anderson was 
the result. Great iron grips are used to 
draw the huge, heavy slippery sticks off 
timber into the vessel. In some way 
these grips slipped when Captain Ander­
son was standing by, and flying up, caught 
the captain by the head and literally 
tore his head off. The sight was a sick­
ening and horrible one, and the acci­
dent cast a gloom over the entire 
camp, and especially over the crew 
of the Benson. The hardy sailors, 
some of whom had been through 
war, ashore and afloat, said they never 
witnessed anything so terrible before, 
and certainly hoped they never would 
again. What made it more terrible was 
that a second before the captain was in 
robust health, a whole-souled, large- 
hearted, good-natured friend, talking in 
his jocular way with the men. When the 
latter heard the grip slip, saw the body 
slung twenty, or thirty feet, andrtlie head 
remain in strings in the fearful death of 
the horrible tool, it was more than they 
could stand. The decapitated body and 
and the head and fragments were dres­
sed as well as possible by an undertaker 
and forwarded by boat and rail to the 
family at Port Dalhousie. Capt. Ander­
son had hosts of friends, and was highly 
esteemed generally.

The Dublin Tragedy.—Westgate, alias 
O’Brien, one of the alleged murderers of 
Cavendish and Burke, is in jail at Spanish- 
town. He adheres to his confession and 
several times threatened suicide. Whew 
asleep he is troubled with fearful dreams 
and raves excitedly. He has revealed the 
names of his alleged accomplices to the 
authorities, but they are kept secret. He 
general belief is that he had something to 
do with the tragedy. No one is permitted 
to see him in prison.

The manganese mine recently discover­
ed in i inslow, Colchester County, promisee 
to do well for its owners. Several small 
seams have been partly traced, and the 
main seam where they all converge is 
being looked for with good prospects off 
success. A few barrels of the ore were 
sent to boston a short time since, and the 
result was, it is reported, satisfactory to 
the owners.

One Indian 7 pound mountain battery I company has reduced the supply at 
has arrivèd here. Stores are being fast Ismailia and Port Said, 
brought up and the Engineers are busy Arabi Pasha has established a line of 
entrenching the camp. A forward move- defence from El Karaim to Salihirgeh. 
ment is daily expected. Gen’ Wolseleyis making every effort to

London, Sept. 4—Gen. Wolseley tele- organize a complete system of field 
graphs from Ismailia to-day as follows : suPP*y f°r I*18 force. Hie task is much 
“All quiet at the front. The Highland more serious than the foreign element in 
Brigade will remain afloat at present to I'Sypt is willing to admit. Meanwhile 
furnish working parties here. I am Gie enemy is content to be purely oh 
clearing out the hospitals and sending I Gle defensive. It is rumored that Arabi
away the wounded and serious cases of 
sickness in the troopship Malabar.”

A despatch to the Times from Kassassin 
dated yesterday, says the enemy keeps a 
close watch all about our camp, and 
numerous Bedouin horsemen are prowling 
in the vicinity, rendering it unsafe to 
venture far out. Last night one of the 
Life Guards was killed. His body was 
recovered and found to be mutilated. 
Arabi Pasha has an excellent position 
here, and is in direct communication by 
ftiihvay with Deagazcry and Saliheyeh, 
and water for his forces is brought up by 
rail and canal. His active cavalry succeed 
in masking his movements and keeping 
them secret.

An Indian cavalry detachment and the 
Royal Irish Dragoon Guards scoured the 
country between the camp and this point 
and Maxama and returned without 
seeing any marauding Bedouins.

Pasha has brought heavy guns from 
Cairo to Tel El Kebir to silence the 
British 40 pounders on the armed train. 
Matters are proceeding smoothly at 
Kassassin. Food is abundant at present, 
but the daily consumption is sd great 
that it wi l not be easy to provide sup­
plies for furthèr use.

The Sultan’s proclamation to the 
Egyptians has been issued. It declares 
Arabi Pasha a repel for disobeying the 
orders of the Khedive and of Dervish 
Pasha, thereby provoking the interver- 
tion ot England.

It states that the declaration conferred 
upon Arabi Pacha was bestowed at the 
instance of Dervish Pasha, in consequence 
of Arabi Pacha’s protestations of fidelity. 
In conclusion the proclamation exhorts 
all Egyptians to obey the Khedive.

It is stated by the Gateway Express 
that the poorest paid civil service officiel 
in Manitoba, in proportion to the amount 
of work he has to perform, is the post­
master at Emerson. His salary amounts 
to $1,300 per year. The business of the 
office has increased three hundred per 
cent, during the past twelve months.

A few days ago while Mrs. R. P. Irwin 
of Aurora, was engaged picking currants 
her arm became poisoned, it is supposed, 
with hellebore which had been sprinkled 
on the bushes to kill worms. Her arm 
became badly swollen, and was exceed­
ingly painful,and at one time it was feared 
that a surgical operation would be neces­
sary to save her life.

At Italian Bar, Fraser River, British 
Columbia, on the 17th of July, while P- 
0. Charlebois and three others were mak­
ing a canoe, a sudden squall blew down a 
tree, which fell down on Charlebois and 
caused his death in less than an hour. 
The unfortunate man was a native of 
Coteau Landing, Quebec, and aged 44 
years.

A meeting was held in Minnedosa last 
week to discuss the liquor question. At 
the close a petition asking the Local 
Government not to interfere with the 
present liquor law of the North-West was 
circulated, and all in the audience, ex­
cepting three persons, willingly placed 
their names to the document.

Mr. and Mrs. Col. Bates, of Ohio—the 
latter formerly Miss Anna Swan, the Nova 

Uneasiness among the Europeans con-1 Scotia giantess—were passengers on the 
tinues unabated. Sensational rumors of St.John express Thursday morning. They 
every kind are circulating to-night and Come to visit her parents and relatives at 
it was reported that- the French consul j New Annan, Colchester County. It has
general had asked for transports to re­
move French subjects, but it is proved 
to be entirely groundless. The British 
military authorities have mapped the 
town into districts which are connected 
by telephone and they feel satisfied that 
this will enable them to quell any unfor- 
seen outbreak.

At 5 o’clock this evening the English 
heavy guns near the Cairo railway began

been nine years since Mrs. Bates was in 
Nova Scotia. After travelling through 
America and Europe—the latter tour oc­
cupying three years — and amassing a 
snug fortune in exhibitions, they settled 
in Ohio, 36 miles south of Cleveland, and 
cultivate an extensive farm. Mr. B. is a 
Kentuckian, and quite capable of being 
the helpmate of Nova Scotia’s largest 
daughter.

A deputation from the Toronto Corn 
Exchange recently waited on Mr. Hick­
son, General Manager of the Grand Trunk 
Railway, to take into consideration the 
advisability of erecting grain market» in. 
Canada and of concentrating the grain at 
certain points.

“Are you fee'ing very ill?” asked the 
physician. “Let me see your tongue, 
please?” “It is no use, doctor,” replied 
the patient, “no tongue can tell how bad 
I feel.”

This is the way that the Londo 
“ World” puts it : “ The Bostonians, who 
consider their Court House the ‘hub’ or 
axle-box of the universe.

<
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X

In addressing an ».#*«• 
gentlemen it is on.y 
gents, as they embravi­

ably of ladies and 
necessary to say 
the ladies.

In France fanciful bibbed aprons^* 
fashion borrowed from England, are worn 
in country houses this season.
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ADMINISTRATION OF CROWN LANDS

The Sun refering to the recent land 
sales says :

There was scarcely any Complaint among 
the operators because ot the one year limit.

This is an extraordinary statement even 
for the Sun to make, and indicates either 
a surprising ignorance of the facts, or a 
wilful disregard of them. We grant that 
a few friends of the Surveyor General, 
who feared competition if the licences 
were for a term of years, speak in favor 
of the present arrangement, but the1 
large minority of those present at the 
land sale, we may say nineteen out of 
every twenty, condemned the one year 
system. A few would say that it did not 
particularly affect them individually, but 
that the principal was wrong. The con­
demnation was almost universal. How 
any person who professes to know any­
thing about lumbering, can pretend that 
a license for one year only is as valuable 
as one for five years, passes our compre 
hension; and why this retrograde step 
should have been taken is equally inex­
plicable, unless rumor gives the true ex­
planation, when it says that certain 
operators, warm personal friends and 
political supporters of the Surveyor Gene­
ral. finding themselves likely to be finan­
cially unable to secure the blocks ot land 
they desired for a term of years, had 
sufficient influence to bring about the 
change.

But it is not only of the stumpage regu­
lations that the lumbermen complain. 
Frequent complaints are made of the 
unfortunate cha- acteristics of the head 
of the department, which were conspicu­
ous during and after the land sale. We 
do not care to discuss such matters, and 
would make no reference to them if it 
were not that they were obtruded upon 
public notice, as though to challenge 
criticism. We do not think tiiat the 
affairs of the Province would suffer, if the 
gentleman who is charged with the ad­
ministration of Crown Lands, would pay 
a little more regard to—we will say, the 
dignity of his official position.

We regret also to say that complaints 
were made that the Surveyor General 
has employed his official powers to the 
disadvantage of persons who happen to 
be politically opposed to him, and the 
instances which could be cited in support 
of the statement are numerous and con­
vincing.

In the administration of the routine 
Grown Land business and the settlement 
of disputes between applicant» for grants 
the Surveyor General has gained almost 
universal condemnation. His reputa­
tion throughout the country is that of a 
man who is! thoroughly unreliable, while 
he is dilatory in the extreme.

It was an open secret that one of Mr. 
Fraser’s chief troubles, in the last year 
of his premiership, was how best to get 
rid of the Surveyor General; and at the 
dose of the last session, when Mr. Adams 
made such an extraordinary exhibition 
of himself over the Act relating to 
constables, it was freely stated that Mr. 
Eraser’s unwonted firmness was inspired 
by a hope that he could exasperate the 
Surveyor General up to the point of re­
signation. But he did not do so, and 
the Department is still presided over by 
a man whose name to-day in Fredericton 
is associated with expressions of sympathy 
and support for two of the worst crimi 
nais this city has ever produced. It is 
impossible that outraged public opinion 
can much longer submit to these things.

RAILWAY MATTERS.

, As will be seen by an advertisement 
elsewhere the New Brunswick Railway 
Company have assumed the management 
of the New Brunswick and Canada Rail­
road. The St. Stephen Branch and the 
Houtton Branch, and the whole system 
will be k own as the New Brunswick 
Railway. For the information of that 
phenominally rediculous journal, the 
Sun, we desire to say that this is the 
only statement which the Herald has 
been “ instructed ” to make concerning 
the late railway deal, and for making 
this announcement we will receive $1.00 
per inch for the first insertion, and fifty 
cents per inch for each subsequent in­
sertion. No discount for cash.

Thé Sun has worked itself up into a fifth 
rate fury over a paragraph in which we 
wished to intimate our belief that we had 
not seen the last of the railway combina­
tions which would be formed, and it 
has discovered a new pet name for the 
Herald. This time we are the oracle of 
the Ring. We propose to avert ourselves 
of the privilege of an oracle and to give 
the San a little of the information it 
pines for. The probability is that a strong 
effort will be made to make St. Andrews 
the winter port of the Dominion. No 
less an authority than Sir Charles Tupper 
has said that ‘-St. Andrews must oe the 
winter port of Canada.” Mark the ex­
pression, not simply may be, but must be. 
In proof of his faith in this prediction Sir 
Charles Tupper has purchased twelve 
hundred acres of land near St. Andrews, 
and is now in England, it is said, princi­
pally to organize a company to purchase 
his estate and convert it into cattle 
yards, and also to make arrangements 
for the construction of wharves for ocean 
going vessels at St. Andrews. In this 
effort he will be seconded by Sir Leonard 
Tilley, formerly of St. John, but now of 
St. Andrews; who besides is the owner of 
property there, and as financial Minister 
of Canada has no doubt great influence 
if he choses to exercise it. We are not 
aware whether “ the Ring ” of which the 
Sun says we are the oracle includes the 
two valiant knights; but we refer our con­
temporary in its search- for knowledge 
to those gentlemen for answers to the 
questions which he showers upon us. . ,'t 
is a question however if-the Minister of 
Finance will feçl called upon to answer 
any enquiries from a St. John newspaper, 
as it is Ions since he has ceased to take 
any interest in that city, and can scarcely 
manage to exist in its foggy atmosphere. 
The brightness of his knightly ornaments 
may perhaps be dimmed by the damp 
ness.

duals they would be interested in bearing 
a large part of the expense of an efficient 
system of protection. The people will 
hardly submit to the handing of three 
lands over to the Dominion Government. 
That body has already sufficient of à hold 
upon.this Province. As we have said, re 
ports do not assign to all the members ot 
the Government opinions favorable to 
such "a transfer, and it is probable that in 
the end wise councils will prevail and 
nothing of the kind be done.

. WE SPEAK AT LAST.

Although we refused to answer the 
Sun's catechism, we cannot resist the fol­
lowing from the Capital :

And when the Woodstock and Harvey 
branch is built.— Telegraph, Aug. 31st.

Very" important results, especially to 
Woodstock and St John, may be looked for tp 
follow closely upon the new departure.— 
Woodstock Sentinel, Sept. 2.

Perhaps the Herald will rise and explain 
ill it knows about the above. It must not 
forget that it is published in Fredericton, 
and ought to work in the interests of this 
city. Beating about the bush, on its part, will 
not answer any longer, neither will silence. 
What are the company’s intentions about the 
bridge? “ Important results to Woodstock 
and St. John." This is a decidedly cool way 
of putting it. Is Fredericton to be ignored ? 
Is it to continue to be the jumping-off place 
Of the New Brunswick Railway?

We have not yet decided whether we 
shall buy the N B Railway or not. When 
we have we will say what we are going to 
do. Until then our answer is “ we don’t 
know." The gentleman who is managing 
the road, pending the purchase of it by 
the Herald, said the other day that the 
company had no further information for 
the press than had already been made 
public. No doubt it is very wrong on 
tneir part not to tell all their plans ; but 
we cannot help it. When the Herald 
takes charge things will be different.

u

A report is in circulation, .and it origi­
nated with a member of the government, 
that the Solicitor Generalship would be 
offered to Mr. Mitchell of St. Stephen. 
Another report gave it to Mr. Morton 
of Sussex. In point of fact it is probable 
that both these gentlemen have been 
sounded by the government, and neither 
have r'vcn a favorable answer.

The Reporter favors the building of the 
Miramichi Valley Railway, but seems to 
feel very badly about somebody whose 
motives have been •'impugned” and 
whose actions have been “misrepresen ted 
by a certain portion of the press.” It is 
certainly very naughty for any portion of 
the press to impugn or misrepresent. 
We are not quite sure whftt is meant by 
this, but we are really quite certain that 
it is something very wrong. Perhaps it 
means insinuations that writers, who are 
endeavoring to do good in a humble way, 
are endeavoring to do harm; perhaps it 
means gratutious insults to persons who 
have been lucky enough to get hold of 
money without working for it. We have 
ourselves had an experience of what it 
means to be maligned by “a certain 
portion of the press ” in every possible 
way financially, intellectually, socially 
and even in family relations, if it is 
against such things as this that the 
Reporter raises its voice, we congratulate 
it, even although we may think it tardy 
in its recognition of the impropriety of 
such conduct. We do not wish to be 
understood as intimating that our con­
temporary has offended in the manner 
above indicated. It is very much to be 
regretted that it is impossible apparently 
to discuss public questions in Fredericton 
without laying ourselves open to all 
manner of personal charges. We may 
meet "with the editors of our contempo­
raries and converse agreeably upon sufch 
subjects; but if we venture to make a 
suggestion in print, at once there comes 
an avalanche of abuse and misrepresen­
tation. Let us have an end of such 
things, and discuss public matter* with­
out dragging in selfish considerations.

THE INLAND FISHERIES.

It is reported that it is contemplated 
in certain official quarters to hand over 
to the Dominion Government all the un­
granted land on the streams within this 
Province, which are suitable for salmon 
fishing stations. We do not know that the 
view is entertained by the whole Govern­
ment, and we hope it is not, because it 
would be a great error to hand over to 
the Dominion authorities lands which 
with a little care would prove a source of 
considerable revenue to the Province. It 
has been established after considerable 
litigation, which had to be carried on by 
private individuals at their own cost, that 
the right to the fisheries on the inland 
streams is vested in the riparian owners, 
and the Province yet holds the title to 
many fishing stations, which, if offered at 
public competition for short terms of 
years, would bring a good price. It is 
argued by those who favor handing the 
land over to the Dominion that the 
streams would thereby be protected ; but 
it is well known that the protection which 
is afforded under the present system 
amounts to very little, while il the fishing 
privileges were leased to private indivi-

THE ytAR.

It cannot be objected that Wolseley’s 
method of conducting a campaign is dila 
tory. Since he landed at Ismailia, there 
has been a constant succession of col­
lisions wit^ the enemy, and although on 
one occasion the day’s fighting resulted 
in at least no advantage to the British, 
on the whole the advance has been suc­
cessful, and the position of Arabi has 
been greatly weakened. We note the 
Egyptian forces are more effective in 
artillery than in any other arm. The 
boasted Bedouin cavalry, of which 
much was foretold, has proved itself to 
be little else than an ill-conditioned rabble 
which keeps out of danger, and reserves 
its ardor tor the pillaging of frightened 
fellaheen and assaults on defenceless 
women. Their artillery is proving itself 
formidable, clearly establishing that it is 
upon an effective service of field artillery 
that the greatest dependence can be 
placed in warlike operations. This is the 
lesson of the Franco Prussian war re 
peated. Fortunately the British are more 
than able to compete with their oppo­
nents in heavy guns. The brilliant charge 
made by the British cavalry on Monday's 
battle, which is more particularly des 
cribed elsewhere shows that the pluck 
and daring of the army is unimpaired. 
The campaign will no doubt be very 
severfe; but it cannot be very protracted, 
because the Egyptians cannot bo in 
position to keep the. field very long 
against a foe which is able to cut them off 
from a supply of ammunition suitable for 
use in the improved weapons.

Z A BY-L,V it NEEDED.

Now that we have a. pavement on a 
part of Queen street, through which the 
dust and other matter which collects up 
on it will not pass, it is necessary that a 
by-law should be enacted, requiring the 
occupiers of the premises in front of 
which the pavement is, to sweep it 
thoroughly every mbrning, and after 
water works have been introduced, to 
wash it off at least once a day, as is done 
in large cities. In this way can the pave­
ment be kept in a proper state.

We wish to urge upon Mr. Colter not to 
allow the season to pass without making 
the needed improvements on the Nor 
mal School grounds. Their present con­
dition is not at all creditable to the city 
or the government, and we do not think 
the public will begrudge the small outlay 
necessary to put them in proper shape.

The County Gaol.—The Herald having 
diricted attention to the state of the gaol, we 
thought it well to send a representative to 
see the gaoler and ascertain if any steps had 
been taken to make it secure. Mip Long was 
very emphatic in his condemnation of the 
condition of the building. He said that it 
was by no means a safe place for the confine­
ment of desperate criminals, or indeed of any 
man, who is charged with a crime sufficently 
serious to make him willing to run some risk 
to secure his liberty. At present Mr. Long 
keeps a watch upon the prisoners up to mid­
night, and after that hour one of the police­
men takes charge ot the outside of the gaol. 
In this way any attempt at escape will be 
readily detected, but it is absurd that such 
precautions should have to be taken, and it is 
a question whether it is cheaper in the end to 
pay for the alterations necessary to make the 
prison secure, or for the services of the men 
who have to watch it. In the basement of 
the building are cells. Those are in such a 
condition that to keep a man confined in 
them for any length of time is to place his 
life in danger. An expenditure, and by no 
means a large one, is needed to provide 
sewerage. Surely the committee of the 
fiounty Council, which is charged with this 
matter docs not propose for the sake of 
saving a few dollars to allow this very 
objectionable state of things to continue..

WAR IN EfcYPT.

-The Telegraph has

A Large Snake.—A gentleman from the 
rural districts called at this office on Tues­
day afternoon to give us a paragraph, he 
said, about a large spotted snake which he 
had noticed several times on the McLaughlin 
Road, in Dundas parish, about 1G miles from 
here. Although our informant says he did 
not see the reptile, he vouches for the truth­
fulness of the story. It was first noticed 
about two year's ago, and since then by an­
other party about six months ago. Thcre was 
great excitement raised over the matter, and 
it was proposed to go in search of the monster 
but the incredulous scouted the idea, and 
it was finafty abandoned. On Sunday 
last a young man coming through the woods 
‘‘for a short cut,” met the snake, and he, it 
is said, became greatly alarmed, (as his 
blanched features too intelligibly told when 
he reached the village) and began to tell his 
experience. He described the snake as meas­
uring about 15 feel long, about as large round 
as a six-inch stove-pipe, and spotted on the 
back. As the adventurer is regarded as very 
truthful, many who were loth to listen to the 
story at first have now given credence to it 
and are discussing the propriety of going out 
in search of the venomous creature to, if pos­
sible, secure it for a curiosity.— Moncton 
Transcript.

Official.—A Post Office order reached 
Fredericton Friday, payable to the Gov­
ernment of New Brunswick. The city Post­
master, with admirable appreciation of the 
political situation, declined to recognize the 
existence of such a body.

/

London, Aug. 30- 
the following :

Ismailia, Aug. 28__ When morning
came, great excitement prevailed in our 
camps, at Kassossin, in consequence of 
the Egyptians showing themselves in con 
siderable force in various directions. 
Gen. Graham presently sent Major Hartt 
with an escort of mounted infantry under 
Lieut. Pigott to ascertain their strength 
and exact position. Mqjor Hartt pro­
ceeded two miles towards Tel El Kabir, 
when the enemy opened fire with two 
guns. Pigott dismounted his men and 
returned the fire briskly, his men holding 
their ground well for some time, though 
eventually they were obliged to retire up­
on our camps. At 10 o’clock, 4,000 
Bedouins appeared on our right and front 
two miles, but on our guns opening fire 
they retired. About three o’clock their 
infantry advanced in open order upon 
our left, bringing up several guns which 
they placed at short distances from each 
other, and presently showed several 
pieces of artillery on our right. Our guns 
openeti fire and our men turned out to 
face the . attack. The fight. now
was warm, and during the whole 
afternoon the little garrison made a good 
defence. Meanwhile the cavalry, which 
was five miles in our rear, had been twice 
signalled by Gen. Graham to support 
him, and had advanced almost to our 
position without encountering the enemy. 
By 7.30 p. m. the whole, force, consisting 
of the first and second Life Guards, the 
Horse Guards, 7th Dragoons, part of 4th 
Dragoons and I9th Hussars, with four 
guns, set out to succor the troops at 
Kassossin. Col. Stewart, who directed 
the course of the brigade, disposed the 
men so excellently that he was able to 
pilot them safely to thp point of contact 
without coming under the fire of guns, 
which were then pounding the Kassossin 
camp. He led the way along the ridge 
to out flank the enemy ann turn his 
position. Col. Russell brought his men 
over four miles of heavy ground so that 
by nine o’clock, when they halted on the 
stay line, they found themselves so close 
to the Egyptians that shells went over 
their heads in quick succession, landing 
nearly half a mile in their rear. From 
the position the cavalry had gained 
they could see the enemy close on 
the horizon in very large numbers, where­
upon Russell dismounted the cavalry and 
ordered a sharp musketry fire, but they 
found that the enemy was closer than 
anticipated. Just then Gen. Lowe dash- 
64 up and gave%the command to mount 
and form in line and charge. Scarcely 
had the words been uttered when the 
Household Cavalry and Dragoons swept 
on to meet the foe. In a yery few 
moments the horsemen had charged the 
enemy with great bravery, and the outer 
guns having ceased firing, mingled with 
the Egyptians and cut them up seriously. 
A general rout hereupon followed, Arabi’s 
artillerymen getting their guns away, 
while his infantry fell into a disordered 
mass upon the banks of the canal, a few 
dashing into the water to save themselves, 
It would be difficult to imagine a more 
complete success than was qow seen. 
The bravery of the cavalry in charging a 
blind position, the strength of which it 
was impossible to tell, rendered the enemy 
almost panic-stricken. Russell's horse 
fell dead, but he seized another and before 
the enemy’s position was gained he was 
well in front once more. The enemy fell 
back rapidly. We now command the 
country leading to Tel El Kebir. Great 
pertinacity and bravery were shown dur­
ing the day by the mounted infantry and 
the detachment of the 4th Dragoons w^th 
them. Lieut. Pigott was mounted. All 
along the line the greatest care had been 
taken to provide for emergencies, which 
shows how judicious are the arrangements 
of Gen. Wolseley. The men who took part 
in this gallant achievement had worked 
for nearly twenty-four hours on empty 
stomachs but never dreamt of grumbling. 
The British cavalry charged straight at 
the guns, sabering gunners and flying in­
fantry beyond them. The battle was 
ended at a stroke. A scene of wild con­
fusion ensued. Some of the guns wore 
still firing and bodies of infantry kept 
up a fusilade. Our infantry at Kassassin 
had a hot time. Hundreds of shells 
burst in the confined space. The shelter 
trenches afforded but insufficient pro­
tection. The Egyptians came on and 
in spite of the heavy tire of our men 
rapidly gained ground, and would soon 
have rushed on our entrenchments when 
the roar of our guns on the left followed 
by the rush of our cavalry proved too 
much for them and from that moment 
they thought only of flight.

London, Aug. 30—An important order 
was received at Woolwich, to-day, to for­
ward to Egypt at once a formidable light 
siege train. It will weigh, with equip­
ments, 2,000 tons, and will require 1,136 
officers and men. The ordnance will con­
sists of 36 pieces of artillery of various 
calibres, including 10 forty-pounders and 
10 twenty-five-pounders.

Additional troops have been ordered to 
the frontier where the Government has 
determined to concentrate 4,000 men 
immediately. The Hora (newspaper) 
says that this number will be sufficient if 
a movement of Turks is only instigated 
by the Turkish local commander, but if 
the impulse emanates from Constantino­
ple the struggle will prove serious.

• Despatches from the frontier claim that

the Turkish troops were repulsed on 
Monday and Tuesday with considerable 
loss. The Greeks occupy a strong posi­
tion at Vigla, which is exactly on the new 
frontier, to the north of Searbos. The 
Bishop of Latamona, with eighty peasants, 
has joined the Greeks.

Gen. Hawley and a brigade of High­
landers under Gen. Alison, have embark­
ed in four transports, including the Iberia, 
France and Lucitania. The British au­
thorities state that their destination is 
Ismailia.

Sir Evelyn Wood has assumed corn- 
nan d of troops in Alexandria and 

vicinity.
A correspondent of the News telegraphs 

from Ismailia::—
I rode over the scene of the cavalry 

charge at Ki ssassin Lock. I found two 
acres thickly strewn with corpses of the 
enemy. Some of our cavalry were still 
seeking our dead and wounded. Two 
dead Life Guards men were so mutilated 
that they were quite unrecognizable. 
The enemy’s loss must have been at least 
400.

A despatch from Alexandria says that 
250 marines from the Invincible and In­
constant will land there on Thursday to 
assist the garrison.

Mahmoud Ferny will arrive at Alex­
andria and will be handed over to the 
Khedive’s Government, to be dealt with 
ps the ministers may decide.

A despatch from Ismailia to Reuter’s 
Telegram Co. says the British are advanc­
ing in full force toward Kassassin.

The News has the following from Is­
mailia:—

The British did not anticipate the 
recent attack. The result shows we are 
ready for anything. It is reported taat 
the enemy fled to Tel-el-Lebir. Our posi­
tions remain much as they were, but the 
cavalry advanced a few miles on the ex 
treme right.

The steamer Siam, with 10 officers and 
475 men, for Egypt, sailed .from London 
to-day.

M. Coundouriotis, Greek Minister, has 
had another conference with Said Pasha, 
Turkish Minister of Foreign Affairs. It 
understood that orders will be sent by 
the Porte to the commander of the Turk­
ish troops on the Greek frontier to cease 
hostilities. A detachment of Turkish 
troops has left Salonica for the Greek 
frontier to restore order.

The official report of Gen. Howe, re 
guarding the action of the cavalry at 
Kassassin, confirms the details already 
published. He says after the charge the 
ground was strewn with bodies of dead 
Egyptian infantry. He states that the 
enemy are now throwing up work in front 
of Kassassin.

The Times' Alexandria correspondent 
says : News has been received from Cairo 
that at the meeting of Notables, August 
29th, at which the Governor of Ismailia 
was present, speeches were made re­
cognizing Arabi as the sole ruler of 
Egypt. The Prefect of Police, on hearing 
this, declared against Arabi, and ordered 
the arràst of all persons present at the 
meeting. He is organizing a Turkish 
police for the protection of the Khedive’s 
interests. The Governor of El Arish has 
declared for Arabi Pacha, and has in­
fluenced two tribes of Bedouins in his 
favor.

A wounded Egyptian officer who has 
been lying upon the field since Monday’s 
fight, says the Bedouins killed all the 
wounded they found on the field who 
were not Mussulmans. The affair of the 
26th caused much depression at Tel el 
Kebir, but Arabi,1 upon arriving there, 
personally, sent troops forward to attack 
Kassassin. Before despatching them 
upon their mission he made a short 
speech, saying that our movement in the 
rear had thrown the Egyptian plans oi 
defence into complete confusion, and 
that it was absolutely necessary «to defeat 
the enemy.

On Thur^ay morning Gen. Wilkinson, 
in command of the Indian cavalry, con­
ducted a reconnoissance on the right 
and Col. Tulloch on the left. We got 
within sight of the enemy’s lines, his 
pickets falling back, and sketches were 
made of his position, which was not con­
sidered to be so strong as reported.

Forty seamen from the ironclad Mino­
taur and a company of the 53rd regiment 
quietly approached the enemy's position 
opposite Ramleh, last evening, and blew 
up with gun cotton a house on the canal 
which had long been a point of vantage 
to the enemy’s sharp shooters. Thé oper­
ations was not interrupted by the Egyp­
tians. )

A fresh reconnoisance shows that Tel 
el Keber is Strongly entrenched, the 
fresh water canal forming a natural 
defence.

There is reason to suppose that Arabi 
Pacha has forced many of his men to 
work on the trenches, even in chains. 
Two manacles covered with” blood were 
found on the field. |

Sixty-nine dead Egyptians still remain 
on the scene of the cavalry charge.

News has been received from the in­
terior that Arabi Pacha is selling Euro­
pean properties to natives. Several well- 
known properties belonging to Europeans 
have been confiscated and sold End the 
names of native purchasers given.

Gen. Wood has contracted his lines to 
Ramleh, thus strengthening his position.

Arabi Pacha publishes in Cairo daily 
reports of English defeats with immense 
losses.

History of the tiordens ot Fredericton.

Mr. Editor,—In the August number of the 
Gardeners’ Monthly, published in Philadel­
phia, U. S., the editor, in his seasonable hints, 
says : So far, this season, we have had this 
rapid glance at northern and north-eastern 
Pennsylvania, sonthern, central and western 
New York, and over a hundred miles into 
southern Canada, and it has given great 
pleasure to note how gardening is prosper­
ing in the remote villages, the contrast be­
tween now and, say, a dozen years ago is 
remarkable. Flowers are everywhere. 
Choice fruits abound. The plots around the 
humblest houses show some desire for taste. 
Choice trees and shrubs are not uncommon, 
but above all this there is an evident attempt 
at neatness and cleanliness everywhere. It 
interested the writer of this very much to 
know the views of leading horticulturists 
how all this has come about. One said it 
was through the introduction of lawn 
mowers. Another, the influence of Maga­
zines. like the Gardeners' Monthly, and an 
enlightened agricultural press. Another 
thought the Centennial Exhibition in Phila­
delphia deserved the credit. Another prais­
ed the tree agent, who brought nice things 
things to the most impossible places. Still 
another thought of James Vick, Peter Hen­
derson, and a score of other names, etc.’ 
Now, Mr. Editor, as most of your readers 
are interested, more or less, in gardening 
or horticulture, it may be interesting to re­
trospect the last dozen years in Fredericton. 
I purpose giving you a few facts, as roy own 
knowledge extends no further, in reference 
to personal observation, than the last twelve 
years in this city, so that your readers may 
judge if the people’s tastes are growing in 
this direction, or otherwise. In some res­
pects they arc not, but generally they are. 
as the esteemed editor of the Gardeners 
Monthly finds them in the States and south­
ern Canada. In the year 1870,1 left England, 
my native country, engaged myself as gar­
dener for one year with a gentleman in this 
city. At that time, or that year, there were 
five British gardeners employed, about Ered- 
ericton, as follows : A. Ross, gardener, Gov. 
Wilmot, Government House. Mr. Ross came 
from Edinburgh, a Scotchman, who thought 
quite as much of himself as others did, yet a 
good gardener, and had three or more good 
men under him. Both vegetable and flower 
gardens were, during Gov. Wilmot’s stay, a 
credit to the city and Province. My own 
impression has been that Judge Wilmot in­
fused as much or more life and taste in this 
direction than any other one person by ex­
ample both at Government House and his 
own place, Regent St. There was no con­
servatory at that time at Government House, 
the extent of the glass were two small green­
houses, with hot beds, etc. But these small 
houses contained some rich and rare plants, 
which were exhibited at the Provincial Ex­
hibition in Fredericton that year,

Mr. Randolph al«o employed an English 
gardener that year, one Wm. Hood, from 
Carter & Co., Seedsmen, London, England. 
Mr. Hood was a very good gardener, but had 
rather an unruly member of a tongue, 
which often hurt him. Nevertheless, Hood 
made great improvements about Mr. Ran­
dolph's residence, made as nice a croquet 
ground as any in the Providce; also planted 
cedars and other trees and improved the 
carriage drive. These improvements are to 
be seen to-day.

J. W. Brayley, Esq., Druggist, also import­
ed John Bebbington from Carter & Co., 
the Royal Seedsmen, from their nursery, at 
the Crystal Palace, London, England, a 
single young gardener, industrious and per­
severing, yet far from being perfect, either 
in knowledge or temper. John made quite a 
display at the Provincial Exhibition that 
year, with Mr. Brayley’s plants and hot house 
grapes. Mr. B. had a very nice collection of 
Exotic Plants at that time, and a flower and 
small vegetable garden, with several glass 
houses for plants and grapes, which were 
afterwards destroyed by fire.

Hon. Judge Fisher employed a Scotch gar­
dener; one James Tait. Mr. Tait found a 
piece of wilderness ground behind the 
Judge’s residence, converted it into a flower 
garden, and made it blossom as the rose. 
Mr. T. understands the business in all its 
branches ; is a very well informed man ; does 
not believe in sounding his own trumpet : 
is very reserved and discreet, and will do 
justice to whoever employs him.

A. Gibson, Esq., Marysville, that same 
year, employed John Coulson, from York- 
shire, ^ngland. John was a very upright 
kind, apd industrious young man ; loved his 
business, we believe better than anything, 
save his farnily,‘yet Coulson did not like his 
employer to find fault with him. He had 
been in Mr. Gibson’s employ several 
years previous to this, and ‘ had laid 
out, if I do do not err, Mr. Gibson’s 
grounds. Mr. Coulson left that year for 
Boston and obtained emyloyment from a 
florist in Worchester Mass., for a year or so 
and afterwards secured a private place where 
he is at present with a number of hands under 
mm, at a large salary. I am informed Mr. 
Coulson obtains from one to two hundred 
dollars yearly for prizes at the Exhibitions 
for plants, flowers, fruits or vegetables, 
which goes into his pocket. John is a good 
faithful man his employer, for his own 
interest, wishes to keen him. Several 
years later Mr. Fcnety engaged a gardner, 
Thomas Burrows, a native of Halifax. 
Thomas had his faults like most men but was 
a tasty fellow in a garden. Having put up 
glass for raising flowers and the surroundings 
being very favorable with the addition of 
these floral treasures beautiful vases of 
different forms shades and sizes and colors, 
in other words art and nature combined : 
Mr. Fenety’s garden for a number of 
years obtained a reputation to surpass any­
thing between here and Halifax.

Wedding BELLS.-Thursday night there was 
a large and fashionable gathering présentât 
ht. Ann s Church to witness the marriage of 
Miss Hunter and Dr. G. E. Coulthard. The 
bride s sister was bridesmaid and Mr. Byron 
Coulthard was the best man. After the 
ceremony they were driven to the Dr’s resi­
dence Carleton street. On the return of the 
Lincoln tea meeting party, with the Freder­
icton Rass Band at their lead, they marched 
to the Dr. s residence and gave him and his 
bride a long serenade to which the interested 
parties presented themselves and were loudlv 
cheered. Wedding cake was distributed.

«
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London’s Fire Chief,

CAPTAIN SHAW’S DESCRIPTION OF THE SYSTEM 
USED IN THE DOUBLE CITY ON 

THE THAMES.

(From N. T. World.)
Capt. Eyre M. Shaw, Chief of the Lon­

don Fire Department, arrived in this uity 
yesterday from Liverpool on the White 
Star steamer “Baltic.” He was met at 
the wharf by his son, Mr. Robert C. 
Shaw, and went to the Victoria Hotel, 
where he will remain while he is in New 
York. Captain Shaw said yesterday :
“I cannot say how long I shall stay in the 
city, what I shall dc jvhile here, or where 
I will go to when I leave here. I con­
template trips to all the large cities. I 
must go to Cincinnati for the Firemen’s 
Convention, which will, I believe, take 
place in that city on or about the 12th of 
September.”

“How does your force compare with 
that of New York, Captain 7 ”

“I cannot say as yet that I am aware of 
what number of men you have. In Ion- 
don we have about 119 men on day duty 
and I should say about 143 during the 
night, each set working twelve hours. 
TJiey cover 121 square miles.”

When told that New York had 750 
men to cover forty-two square miles, 
Captain Shaw expressed some surprise, 
and said: “I suppose they must be neces­
sary. I have tound in the course of my 
travels that different cities require dif­
ferent systems of protection. For in 
stance, London’s system would not do 
for either New York or Paris, while 
neither of the latter would suit one or 
the other, and neither would prove of 
any service in London.”

The reporter asked him how many 
engine companies there are in London. 
Captain Shaw replied : “We have fifty- 
three land fire engines, 121 fire escape 
engines, three floating steam fire engines. 
The force all told numbers 536 men, that 
number including the chief officer, the 
superintendents and other officers.”

“What other equipments have you 7” 
“We have eleven movable land stations 

four floating stations, three large land 
fire engines, thirty-five small steam land 
fire engines, two steam tugs, four barges, 
-twenty-nine hose-carts, fifteen vans and 
two trollies.”

“What are movable land stations 7” 
“They are large vans that are taken to 

a designated spot every night at eight 
o’clock, each one drawn by four horses. 
The horses are then returned to the 
engine-house to which they belong. They 
are sent the next morning at eight o’clock 
to fetch the vans back. In each van is 
an engine and a number of men, who are 
always ready to attend a fire in the im­
mediate neighborhood where the van is 
stationed. We are forced to use those 
stations on account of the cost of building 
permanent stations. The engine does 
not leave the station, but depends upon 
its length of hose to reach a fire.”

“Do you use the same system of tele­
graphing alarms as is used in New York ?”

“No. You see, London is divided into 
four parts or sections, each having a 
number of engines. Each section has a 
central office to which alarms are sent. 
Thej are then wired to me. We have 
in all fifty-three telegraph lines under 
our control, With forty-four call points, -or 
as they are called in this city, ‘alarm 
boxes.’ Several engines that remain 
near the central office are drawn by 
horses. But,” he continued, “we have 
seven telephone lines in operation, and 
I hope by this time next year to do away 
entirely with the telegraph system and 
use only the telephones.”"

“Have you any difficulty in using the 
telephone ?”

“Yes, a little ; but that comes from 
having the wires under ground, imperfect 
ly insulated. This I hope to obviate. 
Our fire alarm circuits are seven in num 
her. They have been of great service 
during the past year, and have undoubt­
edly helped us to save a great number of 
lives and a deal of valuable property ; but 
we are occasionally annoyed by occasional 
false alarms. Just before I left we had 
three from one box.”

Captain Shaw asked who supervised the 
building and care of theatres. When 
told that a Btiilding Bureau had charge 
of the erection of all buildings in the city, 
lie said : “I know your building law's are 
superior to ours. In fact I have studied 
them and cannot see how they can be im­
proved upon, providing, of course, that 
they are properly carried out.

“What protection against fire have the 
theatres in New York?” the Captain 
asked.

When told t|iat two firemen were 
placed upon the stage at every perform­
ance he was surprised and said, “that if 
he would do that in London the managers 
would resent it. I might as well put a 
man in every citizen’s house.”

The captain asked why it was that there 
are so few chimney fires in America in 
comparison to those of London ? II e « as 
told that it was probably owing to the 
general use of hard coal instead of soft, 
lie next wanted to know what was done 
with the owmer of a chimney that had 
caught fire. He was told that usually 
they were fined $5.

“Well,” he said, “our laws are queer in 
• that respect. If a chimney catches tire 
and the fire is put out before it does fur 
tlier damage the owner is fined a sum not
exceeding £1, and costs, but if he does
not discover it, or from any other cause 
it does any damage to the building itself, 
he is not only exempt from the fiine,

but is free to collect the insurance it his 
premises are covered.”

During the day Captain Shaw called at 
the Fire Department building and spent 
some time in conversation with President 
Gorman, Commissioner Purroy, Chief Eli 
Bates and Secretary Carl Jussen. A 
cainparison of the equipment of the 
London and New York departments fol­
lowed, in the course of which it appeared 
that the hose used by the London tire 
brigade was a third of the weight of that 
used by the New York firemen. The 
London tiré hose costs about a third of 
that used in New Pork and it lasts about 
twice as long. Captain Shaw said that he 
had discarded rubber hose altogether and 
used in its stead a fabric hose manufactur­
ed by Maegregor, of Dundee.

Cnpnbllslied Pagre from the Life of Geo.
Washington.

It is the merry summer time. To him 
the mother of the father of his country :

“George, dear, where have you been 
since school was dismissed?”

“Hain’t been nowhere, ma.”
“Did you come straight homé from 

school, George?”
“Yes, ma’am!”
“But school is dismissed at 3 o’clock, 

and it is half past 6. How does that 
come?”

“Got kep’in.”
“What for?”
“Missed m’ joggrafy less’n.”
“But your teacher was here only an 

hour ago, and said you hadn’t been at 
school to-day?”

“Got kep’t in yestiddy, then,”
“George why were you not at school 

to-day?”
“Forgot. Thought all the time it was 

Saturday.”
“Don’t stand on one side of your foot 

in that manner. Come near to me 
George, you have been swimming.” ’

“No ma.”
“Yes, you have, George. Haven’t you?” 

N o a, p.”
“Tell your mother: George?”
“N u c k."
“Then what makes your hair so wet, 

my son?”
“Sweat. I run so fast cornin’ from 

school.”
“But your shirt is wrong side out.”
“Put it on that way when I got up this 

morning for good luck. Always win when 
you play for keeps if your shirt’s on 
wrong side out.”

“And you haven’t the right sleeve of 
your shirt on your arm at all, George, 
and there is a hard knot tied in it. How 
did that come there?”, .

“Bill Fairfax tied’it in when I wasn’t 
looking.”

•‘But what were you doing with your 
shirt off?”
“Didn’t have it off. He just took’n tied 
that knot in there when it was on me.”

“George !”
“That's honest truth, he did.”
About that time noble Bushrod came 

along with a skate strap and we draw a 
veil over the dreadful scene, merely re­
marking that boys do not seem to change 
so much as men.

Just Received.
1 case Horn & Rubber Dressing Combes ;

5 gross Tooth Brushes (English manufac­
ture) ;

5 gross Davidson's Rubber Nipples ;,

5 gross Alcock’s and Seabuiy & Johnson’s 

Porous Plasters ;

18 dozen Wade & Butcher’s Razors ;

4 gross Packer’s Tar Soap ;

1 barrel Peppermint Lozenges ;

For sale low, Wholesale and Retail at

Geo* H. Davis'
Drug Store,

/
Cor. Queen and Regent Street». 

FREDERICTON.

NEW BRUNSWICK

FOUNDRY.

McFARLANE,

THOMPSON A

ANDERSON

are now manufacturing and have for sale at thei 
Foundry,

KING ST. FREDERICTON

TMEIB CELEBRATED

First Prize Hay Presses,

COOKING STOVES,
in all sizes.

CYLINDER STOVES, with Russia and 
Common Iron Tops, for wood 

burning.

WROUGHT IRON

WOOD FURNACES
MADE TO ORDER.

deco

Martin Lather's Ring.

A correspondent in Louisville, Ky., 
writes that he has in his possession a 
curious ring which formerly belonged to 
his great grandmother, who lived in Ger­
many, and that he is inclined to think it 
was Martin Luther’s wedding or engage­
ment ring. On the inner surface is en­
graved “D. Martino Luthro—Catharina 
W. Boun, 13 Juni, 1525.” The owner 
describes his treasure as follows : “On 
one side is carved a representation 
of the crucifixion, the cross is 
carved through the gold, and the 
outlines of the figure stretched upon it 
are very fine. In the centre of the cross 
piece of the cross is a fine ruby around 
which are carved these letters, I. N. R. I. 
Just at the foot of the cross on the right 
is carved a head with a bishop’s hat on it, 
and on the left side of the cross is a palm ; 
on the other side of the ring are carved a 
ladder and spear, and between these is an 
anchor around which is twisted a rope. 
The gold in the ring is very fine and of a 

■ pale hue, and has not the appeamce of 
being so old. I can trace, it back about 
one hundred and fifty years. How the 
ring was obtained by my great grand­
mother I do not know, but the family 
were ardent Lutherans' and I think they 
may have gotten possession of the ring in 
this manner.” Martin Luther was un­
doubtedly married on the 13th of 'June, 
1525, but his wife’s name was Catherina 
von Bora, not Catherina W. Boun, and 
the present owner of the heirloom will 
probably do well to take reasonable pride 
in the possession of a ring wnich once be­
longed to his great grand-mother without 
attempting to identify it with the hero of
the German reformation__Second Cen-
tury. '______

The Oka Indians on the Gibson reserve 
have as yet no minister, but through the 
kindness of Rev. Mr. W. A. Strongman, 
B. A., they have had occasional services 
and the Sacraments administered. A 
minister will be very welcome and useful. 
They have on several occasions walked 
ten miles to Sabbath morning services.

The Methodists of Portage la Prairie 
instead of building a $40,000 church as 
was at first intended, are building a three- 
story block on Saskatchewan avenue, in 
which they intend to have three stores 
for rental in the first story, and the second 
and third storys to be used as a church.

DIPHTHERIA !
JOHNSON’S ANODYNE LINIMENT will posi­

tively prevent this terrible disease, and will posi­
tively cure nine cases out of ten. Information that 
will save many lives, sent free by mail. Don’t 
delay a moment. Prevention is better than cure.

I. S’. JOHNSON & CO., Boston, Mass., formerl 
Bangor, Me.

N

FREDERICTON, DECEMBER 4, UWI

Fall & Winter
IMPORTATIONS.

NEW- GOOES.

FRESH STOCK. LOW PRICES.

THOS. W. SMITH & SON
are now prepared to meet the wants of tnev 

’numerous customers.

Clothing Department
A‘LARGE LINE OF

CHINCHILLA BEAVERS,

In Blue, Brown and Black.

PLAIN BEAVERS,

In Black, Bine and Brown.

PRIME WEST OF ENGLAND

PILOT CLOTHS,
ALL SHADES.

A Superior Line of GERMAN OVER 
CO A TINGS ; also a well assorted 

stock of SPRING AND FALL 
OVERCOATINGS

IN SUITINGS:
English Suitings, Scotch Suitings, Irish Suitings, 

French Suitings, German Suitings, 
Canadian Suitings and 

Domestic Suitings.

__ We run a Staff of FIRST-CLASS CUT
__1RS, and warrant an A No. 1 fit every time, or
no trade.

IN OUR CUSTOM TAILORING DEPART 
MENT COMPETITION DEFIED

READYMADE CLOTHING,
n Ulsters, Overcoats, Reefers, Suits, Rubber- 

Tweed Water-Proof Overcoats, Cardigan 
Jackets, in new and nobby patterns.

A FULL STOCK OF

Gents’ FURNISHING GOODS,

HATS, CAPS, TRUNKS, PORTMANTEAUS, 
«fee., in great abundance.

NEW DEPARTMENT.

Our Boot & Shoe
DEPARTMENT

is now filled up. In Ready-made we have an 
immense assortment, from the leading Canadian 
houses.

Men’s Fine Boots,. Coarse and Medium Boots, 
Low Shoes, Congress Boots and other English 
Walking Boots.

A JOB LINE OF ROBBERS AND 
OVERSHOES now on hand.

In our Custom Boot and Shoo Department, ou 
foreman, MR. WILLIAM TUFTS, will endeavor 
to meet the wants of all with good workmanship 
and a first-class fit. Our stock is now open for put 
lie inspection. Drop in and see us,

THOS. W. SMITH & SON.
F’ton.iDec. 4,1881.

«££

CHEAPEST
ORGANS

For the Money in Fredericton or 
New Brunswick.

Fredericton, June 12, 1882.
LEMONT & SONS.

NEW BOOK STORE.
Oar Motto—Best Goods for the Feast Money.”

McMUREAY & FENETY.

PARSON’S PURGATIVE PIUS make New 
Rich Blood, and will completely change the blood 
in the entire system in three months. Any person 
who will take 1 pill each night from 1 to 12 weeks 
may bo restored to sound health, if such a thing be 
possible. Sold, everywhere, or sent by mail for 
eight letter stamps.

I. S. JOHNSON & CÔ., Boston, Mass., formerlv 
Bangor, Me.

Make Hens Lay!
An English Veterinary Surgeon and Chemist 

now travelling in this country, says that most of the 
Horse and Cattle Powders sold here are worthless 
trash. He says that Sheridan’s Cavalry Condition 
Powders are absolutely pure and immensely valu­
able. Nothing on earth will make hens lay like 
Sheridan’s Condition Powders. Dose,one teaspoon- 
ful to one pint food. Sold everywhere, or sent by 
mail for eight letter stamps. I. S. JOHNSON <fc 
CO., Boston, Mass., formerly Bangor, Me.

FREDERICTON

Marble Works.

SCHOOL

BOOKS

Very Cheap

MAPS

and

GLOBES
at

Lowest Rates.

NOTE PAPER,

FOOLSCAP,

LEGAL CAP 
and

ENVELOPES

W h o 1 es ale

Retail.

JUST

RECEIVED

22 Bales

ROOM PAi

Direct

from the

Manufactory

New

DESIGNS

Handsome

PATTERNS

and

h will be sold low

Call and see

T II E M.

MONUMENTS, TABLETS,
BEDSTONES.—Granite and Freestone,

In all its branches, as cheap as anywhere in 
the Province.

Material and Workmanship guaranteed.

JUST BELOW NORMAL SCHOOL, 
QUEEN STREET, FREDERICTON.

JOHN MOORE.
2-12-81

Golden Fleece.
New Fall Goods

87 Packages now Opened,
COMPRISING IN PART

WHITE AND GREY BLANKETS.
CAMP BLANKETING,

GREY AND WHITE FLANNELS, 
LADIES’MANTLES.

LADIES’ MANTLE CLOTHS.
(A very large stock, all colors and qualities.) 

LADIES’ FURS.
LINEN GOODS.

(In Table Damasks, Napkins and Towels,) 
BERLIN GOODS, 

dn Clouds, Jackets, Ac., Ac.) 
0ÜKNING GOODS;

FRENCH MERINOES, CASHMERES, 
C0BURGS AND LUSTRES.

LARGE STOCK OF WINCEYS.
(Good value,)

COLORED DRESS GOODS

3-BUSHEL GRAIN BAGS

and a general assortment.

WHOLESALE AND RETAIL.

PRICES MODERATE.

John M‘Dona,ld

For Sale or Hire on easy terms. Any one wishing an Organ would do weld 

to call and see "our Organs and Prices, Terms, etc., before purchasing.

We have sold a large number of the above patter»., __ 

which have given the best of satisfaction, 

as our testimonials will show.

McMUBRAY k FEÏÏETY.
IRQÏÏ. OAKUM.

TO ARRIVE TO-DAY :

200 TONS EGG COAL.
FOR SALE LOW.

John Richards & Son.
June 26

Before buying your Milk Paus
Come to Lemont’s.

He is retailing them at wholesale Prices. 
Juno 28

RECEIVED ANI IN STORE, EX. BARQUE “ PARAMATTA,” AND S. S, “HIBERNIAN” AND 
"CASPIAN”;—17,7€ Bars Refilled and Spike Iron: 580 Bundles Plating and Iloops, various sizes and 
gauges: 210 Bundles Navy and Hand-picked OAKUM: 318 Bundles Nos. 20, 22,23, 24 and 20; 310 Sheets, 
Nos. 10,12,14,16, and 18 SHEET IRON; 3 Cases GALVANIZED SHEET IRON.

1. & F. BURPEE & CO.
230BOILER PLATES, Best B. B., B.B. B., and Lowmoor; Boiler Tubes and Rivets: 471 Bills. Sled 

Shoe Steel: 151 Steel Plow Plates : 47 Bdls. Too Calk Steel : 37 Bdls. and 15 Bars Mounted MnchineStccl, 
15-16 to 3 inch.

TO ARRIVE PER “PHŒNIX,” FROM ANTHWEM* : 15 Ciisks SHEET ZINC, Nos. 6 to 10.

Sled Shoe steel.
Sheet Zinc. Sheet Iron.

CARRIAGE BOLTS, &c.
Just received 

IASE Carriage Bolts; Duck and Drill Axle 
" ~ "" ns and Nails.

'/.. R. EVERETT.
1 fX_______ ______ ________
A vV Clips; Tufting Buttons and_Nails._

March 15

FILES. FILES.
Just received direct from the Manufacturer:

i'XNE case Files and Horse Shoo Rasps. For sale
V/ low.

July 7 Z. R. EVERETT.

FLY TRAPS. FLY TRAPS.
Just received:

0HE gross FLY TRAPS. For sale low.
Z. R. EVERETT.

June 5

Milk Pans, Crocks.
,1 PQ A PIECES Milk Pans, Batter Crocks, Pré- 
T-UUy servo Jars and Flower Pots, very low, at 
wholesale anu retail, at

LEMONT’S Variety Store.May 8

WASH BOARDS.
Just received ;

DOZEN Zinc Wash Boards. For sale whole
' sale or retail.

may 28 Z. R. EVERETT

Cabinet Organs.
^ MORE magnificent Cabinet, ------------------------- Organs receivedto-day at

LEMONT’S Variety Store. 
Sell for cash or on installments, 
may 12
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THE WEEKLY HERALD
Charles H. Lvorix, Editor and Proprietor.

FREDERICTON, SEPTEMBER 7, 1882. ;

DOMINION AFFAIRS.

Mr. Mackenzie may have, as the tory 
■gans say he did, told the electors of 
East York that he was as thorough a free 
trader as ever; but he added, and this 
the organs omitted to state, that free 
trade, or anything approaching to it, is 
an impossibility in Canada. He claimed 
however, that whenever it is possible 
to lessen the burdens of the people a 
reduction in the tariff should be made. 
Mr. Mackenzie probably entertains the 
old fashioned notion that in raising a 
revenue it is better to consult the 
interests of the many than to obey the 
dictates of a few, who are not content to 
do business in the country unless they 
are given exceptional advantages. The 
Canadian tariff" has ceased to be, if it 
ever was, a political question, in the true 
sense of thef word. Protection, as a 
square issue, has never been presented to 
the people. In 1878 we w re told that 
readjustment only was intended, and the 
tory chiefs claimed that they favored 
protection. In 1882 so great had been 
tile extravagance of the tory govern­
ment, and such burdens had been laid 
upon the people, that there could not be 
found in all Canada a public man who 
pretended 'hat it was possible to do 
more than readjust the tariff in favor of 
■oesumers. Liberals as well as tories 
admitted that under any tariff which 
would raise sufficient revenue, there 
must be large protection given to manu­
facturers.. The only object the tory press 
can have in keeping prominently forward 
any expressions, made use of by their 
opponents, favorable to the principles of 
free trade, is to lead the public mind 
away from what are the great questions 
involved in Dominion politics. The 
chief end and aim of Sir John Macdonald 
and his friends is to keep in power. To 
do this they will resort to any means. 
If any doubt, we would refer them to a 
few of the leading incidents in the 
career of the premier and his party,—the 
Ftaific Railway scandal, the Boyd tele­
grams, the Letellier case, the Pacific 
Railway fraud and monopoly, the Ontario 
boundary award, the interference with 
local Legislatures. We pass over the scores 
•f corrupt acts which could be named, 
ef w'lich the Onderdonk $209,000 job is a 
sample. Macdonald has only kept in 
power by tactics of a most disreputable 
fond. We therefore look, with some 
alarm, for what his next move will be. 
The public cannot fail to have noticed in 
<6e recent changes in the persontl of the 
cabinet the extraordinary prominence 
given to Quebec interests. Following 
dose upon the heels of these changes, 
we have an avowal made by Mosseau, the 
new Quebec premier, that the Ontario 
Boundary award was disallowed at the 
dictation of the French Tories, and at the 
■une time a claim is put forward in the 
organs of the Quebec Local Govern­
ment for better terms at the hands 
of Parliament, in comparison with which 
■ay demands made heretofore on behalf 
of New Brunswick are modesty itself. 
No one who has watched the record of 
Macdonald will for a moment doubt that 
he will submit to these demands, if he 
sees no other way of keeping his French 
following. together. There is danger 
ahead. If Ontario is to be despoiled, and 
Quebec aggrandized,- the bond which 
holds the provinces together will be 
strained to a dangerous degree. Add to 
this the fact that in the West already the 
spirit of the people is chafing under the 
iron rule of monopoly, and we think it 
will be admitted that the Macdonald 
ministry has sown enough seed to secure 
Canadians a bountiful harvest of dis­
content. The country will indeed be for­
tunate if it comes out of its dangers with­
out something much more serious.

RAILWAY MATTERS.

The burden of the complaint of some 
of our contemporaries is that the Herald 
knows very much more about the New 
Brunswick Railway Company than it is 
willing to tell. We do not propose to 
gratify our friends by saying whether we 
know or do not know any of the plans of 
the Company : but we will say that if any 
one had so exalted an opinion of the 
Herald's judgment as to take it into their 
confidence, we shall endeavor not to 
abuse the trust. The fact that we said a 
few words about the Miramichi Valley 
Railway has called forth a fusilade from 
tiie press, and some very curious state­
ments are indulged in. One paper grave­
ly informs the public that the people of 
Fredericton have made up their minds 
that the only way they can get on a 
through line of railway is to build the 
Miramichi Valley line. If any such idea 
as that is in this city it is marvellous that 
no one has come in contact with it and 
it is equalfy astonishing that the leasing 
of the X. B. & C. Railway can have any 
effect upon the construction of a road 
from here to the North Shore.

The Solicitor-General—The Sun says 
that Mr. Morton has accepted the Solici- 
tory Generalship, and will be sworn in to­
day. Our own advices from St. John, 
yesterday morning led us to expect this; 
but we are none the less surprised to find 
that Mr. Morton has taken such a course. 
We shall reserve our comments for the 
present.

THE SOLICITOR GENERALSHIP.

The acceptance of Mr. Morton of the 
office of Solicitor General is an event 
without any especial significance except 
of a personal character. Unless he can 
carry the vacant seat, as well as his own, 
his entrance into the admmirtration will 
not only add no strength, but will be a 
positive source of weakness. We confess 
to a feeling of surprise at his acceptance 
of the office. If report does him justice, 
he was not at all backward in avowing 
his determined hostility to the “ Tory 
crowd,” with which he has allied himself, 
and we do not think we would do him an 
injustice if we said he had given the op­
position gn unqualified assurance of sup­
port. That he has been so dazzled by 
the first offer of office, as to be unable to 
see the error he makes in accepting it, 
does little credit to Mr. Morton’s judg­
ment, and still less to his good faith. In 
appointing him to the office, the govern­
ment have plainly declared it to be their 
intention that it shall remain a sinecure. 
It is a matter of serious concern to the 
Province that neither its Attorney Gene­
ral nor Solicitor General is capable of try 
ing an important lawsuit. Of course, we 
have Mr. Hanington, who has already 
received large fees as a counsel in crimi­
nal cases, and Mr. Wetmore, who will, no 
doubt, faithfully, if expensively, conduct 
any Crown busineas which may be as­
signed to him ; but neither of the recog­
nized Crown officers would trust himself, 
neither would the public trust him, to 
conduct even an ordinarily complicated 
criminal case. If Mr. Morton were a 
gentleman of great experience at the 
Bar, his accession- to the ranks of the ad­
ministration would be a gain, and we 
could find some sort of an excuse for his 
acceptance of an office at the hands of 
men, who ignored his very existence un­
til they wanted to use him ; but as he is 
not, and as the chief functions of his posi­
tion, which he will successfully discharge, 
will not be those of most value 
to the country, and as from being 
an independent representative he has 
stooped to accept a position the duties 
of which he must find he cannot fulfil, 
we confess that we are very greatly 
surprised. The public will ask why a 
gentleman who has always claimed to be 
in favor of economy and reform should 
perpetuate in his own person a sinecure 
which has already exacted much un­
favorable comment. The government 
by its extraordinary composition chall­
enges criticisms of the personal qualifi­
cations of its members. Excepting Mr. 
Hanington it does not contain a lawyer 
of anything like the first class. He has 
a good reputation at the bar, and can 
conduct a case with considerable skill 
and has the reputation of being a good 
consulting barrister, but beside him there 
is none other in the executive committee 
who makes, or is entitled to make ^the 
least claim to prominence in his pro­
fession. This was felt to be the case 
by friends of the government here, and 
the feeling found .expression in the 
rumor to which the Reporter alluded on 
Saturday, namely that Mr. Colter would 
give up the Chief Commissionership and 
Mr. Wetmore enter the government as 
Soli itor General. As the government 
now stands "the publfc does not feel that 
confidence in the administration of the 
Crown business which ought to be main­
tained, and every one will be sorry to 
see that Mr. Morton’s appointment in­
dicates a continuation of that system 
under which one man gets the title and 
draws the salary, while another is paid 
out of the public chest for doing his 
Xvork.

A CONFESSION.

An honest confession is good for the 
soul we are told, and we propose to try 
the benefit to be derived from the fullest 
and most complete recantation of a grave 
political heresy. The Herald has been 
very pronounced in its opposition to the 
Local Government. It has declared its 
views in strong terms, and has advanced 
with all the force it was capable of every 
argument at its command, against what 
in its irreverence it has called the Dor­
chester Combination. We wish to say 
that we have not been doing the Govern 
ment justice ; that so far from being open 
to the charges of extravagance and Tory­
ism we have made against them, they are 
in all truth and soberness working, slowly 
but surely, the greatest political reform 
ever attempted in any country. It has 
been claimed that New Brunswick has 
been governed enough Mr. Hanington 
and his colleagues are demonstrating that 
it can get along without being governed 
at all. The Opposition claimed that the 
business ot the country could be managed 
with fewer departmental chiefs. Messrs. 
Hanington & Co. are proving that 
“Generals” are entirely unnecessary—that 
affairs can be managed without any such 
people at all. So thoroughly automatic 
is the governmental machine that for 
weeks together no member of the Execu­
tive thinks it necessary to come near his 
office. It is thus made evident to the 
most superficial observer that the idea 
that there should be a government in a 
relect of by gone days, a fossilized notion 
which ought to be laid away with such 
fallacies as that a Crown Land officer 
ought to be able to try causes. When 
the Legislature vote no confidence in 
Hanington & Co., the Lieutenant Governor 
will be inexcusable if he calls Upon any 
one to take their places. It has been 
demonstrated beyond a question that 
New Brunswick does not need a Govern­
ment. Hurrah for Reform !

I HE BRIDGE.

It is about time that the construction 
of a highway bridge across the St. John 
received attention. The legislature 
granted $50,000 for a subsidy. Is any 
more wanted and if so how much 7 We. 
do not think that any more than $20,000 
additional would be required. This can 
be obtained at 5 per cent, entailing a 
charge of $1000 a year. Are the city 
and county prepared, to take stock in a 
company to that amount 7 If so the 
bridge can be built this winter. * St1. 
Mary’s parish alone pays more than a 
thousand dollars ferrage yearly. We 
believe it would be content to be assessed 
$250 a year for a bridge. Fredericton 
ought to pay a like sum. Douglas $150, 
and the balance $350 be apportioned 
upon the other parishes interested. 
This would provide for the interest, and 
the charge would not be felt by the 
ratepayers. We would thus have $70,000 
secured, which will build a substantial 
highway bridge. We do not discuss the 
question of a railway bridge. It is just 
as well not to mix those matters up. We 
do not say that we are opposed to a 
railway and highway bridge in connection 
with each other; but what we do say is 
that all-we need trouble or -selves about 
is the highway bridge. The St. John & 
Maine and the Fredericton Railway are 
quite as much interested in a railway 
bridge as are the people of Fredericton, 
and even more so than the New Bruns­
wick Railway is. The people of Fred­
ericton can well efford to wait and see 
what these roads are going to do. Let 
our people go to work and get the high 
way bridge. If the Railway Companies 
wish to unite in the project they will ndt 
be backward with their propositions, and 
these can be discussed when they are 
made.

We suggest that a meeting be held at 
an early day either in Gibson or Frede­
ricton to take the matter into considéra 
tion. A very little effort is necessary to 
carry the matter to a successful issue. 
The Municipal elections are not "long 
distant and an exertion should be put 
forward in the parishes most interested 
to secure an expression of opinion upon 
this subject.

MIRSMICHI VALLEY RAILWAY.

The World is probably anxious that 
this road should be built; but it makes 
a very great mistake to attempt in an 
article upon the snbject to make politi 
cal capital. It also invites some com­
parisons- as to what has been done by 
the Liberals of New Brunswick towards 
the developing of the business and re­
sources of the country, and what has not 
been done by the tories ; but it is better 
not to enter into the question in con­
nection with the Miramichi Valley 
Railway, as to secure that road, or such 
a modification of it as will meet the 
necessities of the case,,, will require the 
co operation of all parties.

The Herald did not claim any origi­
nality for the suggestion that the 
government should guarantee interest 
on bonds instead of giving a cash 
subsidy. It was quite aware that the 
government felt favorably disposed 
to such a course, but it also 
knew that legislation would be 
necessary to enable the government to 
give such a guarantee, and until the 
necessary statute is passed it would be 
no use for the Herald to tell any capi­
talist “to go ahead at once.” The people 
to “go ahead” in this matter are the peo­
ple of Fredericton and Miramichi. Let 
them get the guarantee of interest, secure 
such promise of aid from the Dominion 
government and the counties interested 
as they can, then organize their company 
and put their enterprise in a practical, 
intelligible shape before capitalists. We 
quote from the World :

It does not seem probable, taking the re­
sources of the valley into account, that the 
Miramichi Railway would be earning less 
than $45,000 a year, above working ex­
penses, at the end of ten years, and this is 
all the interest on the bonds would amount 
to, if capitalists could be got to take into 
account the exceptionally good prospects of 
the road and the fact that it will have prac­
tically no rival for either local or through 
business, because of its being so much shor­
ter than any other route, they would surcly 
see that there is every ground for the belief 
that it would be a paying road from the 
start, and that there need be no fear of its 
inability to pay interest on $900,000.

Among the reported schemes for the 
evasion of the Chinese immigratiefn bill is 
one that is designed to keep up the sup­
ply of Chinese women, who have always 
been few in number in proportion to the 
number. These women are said in Cali­
fornia to be bought and sold as slaves, 
and should a scar-city in the supply occur, 
their price would be likely to go up to a 
high figure, say $600 to $1,000 each. But 
the Chinese traders are likely to get 
around the immigration law by bringing 
on every business trip two or three women 
apiece from China, whom they will pass 
off" as their wives. The immigration of 
merchants and their families is not pro 
hibited by the new law, and it would bo 
next to impossible to dis prove the claim 
that women so brought over are wives 
duly enrolled in wedlock. It might even 
pay Chinese traders to make trips-for this 
special purpose.

The Sun, which sneered at our state 
ment that B. R. Stevenson would be Judge 
of Probates of Charlotte, now announces 
his appointment.

Oar Basinet» Houses.

Our neighbors across the street, though 
not giving very much attention just at pre­
sent to wholesale trade, are in a position, 
owing to the large retail stock they carry 
and the excellent connections they have with 
manufacturers, to do any amount of jobbing. 
We refer now to the old established firm of 

LEMUNT A SONS.

When our representative asked what they 
made a specialty of, a smile beamed upon 
the countenance of the junior member of the 
firm, and he replied, “Everything in our line;” 
but upon being pressed closer, he said that 
they were now prepared to give wholesale 
purchasers glass and crockeryware in great 
variety and at St. John prices. He said that 
they had contracted their jobbing trade after 
1872, but were fully stocked, and were pre­
pared to supply dealers with these two lines 
of goods to any extent they desired. The 
stock of crockery which this firm carries is 
very large and it includes all the finer varie­
ties. They have a very heavy variety of 
stoneware, such as crocks, jars and milk 
pans. In glass they have tableware in great 
extent and variety, lamps, lanterns, and 
aboutevery thing that is made in glass. They 
also carry a large assortment of table cutlery, 
which they are prepared to give to the trade 
allow figures. This firm have correspondents 
in Liverpool and London, Paris, Berlin and 
Hamburg, and what they have not in stock, 
they can procure for their customers with 
the greatest despatch and on the most favor­
able terms. In furniture their stock is very 
large. The only line of goods in which they 
do any jobbing to speak of is in common 
chairs, but in more expensive articles they 
find that customers from outside districts 
prefer to buy where they can have a variety 
to select from. Messrs. Lemont & Sons 
occupy four flats of their large brick build­
ing on Queen street, and their display of 
goods there is really something extraordi­
nary.- They also occupy the lower store and 
two flats above it in Coy’s brick block, also 
a large storehouse in the rear, also another 
storehouse near the upper end of Queen 
sfêet and a workshop near the lower gnd. 
There is really no reason why persons in the 
trade should pass Lemont & Sons’ in looking 
for a place to purchase a stock of goods. 
They are, as we have said, able to sell goods 
as low as anyone in St. John, and persons 
from up river buying here will save largely 
in freight and in travelling expenses.

The efforts of the Herald, to bring before 
the notice of the public outside of the city the 
ability and readiness of Fredericton mer­
chants to do a wholesale trade, are very gener­
ally appreciated by the citizens. Wherever 
our representative has gone iu search of in­
formation he has found one sentiment pre­
vailing, namely, that it is absolutely essential 
for the business people of Fredericton to bestir 
themselves and enter into sharp competition 
with their neighbors in all lines of goods. 
The more wholesale trade which can be 
bought to the city the better, and we judge 
from the success which has attended the 
efforts already put forward that there is a 
prospect of the city becoming an important 
distributing centre. Among the firms which 
are doing a very good business in this direc­
tion none stand higher for their push, enter­
prise and desire to accommodate than

WHITTIER & HOOPER,

who for nearly two years have been carrying 
on a business on York street, almost exclu­
sively wholesale. They do not desire to do 
a retail trade, and never sell,excepting in job 
lots, when they can reasonably avoid doing 
so. They keep a traveller on the road most 
of the time, and find that they are able suc­
cessfully to hold tiftir own in prices against 
any other houses handling the same lines of 
goods. Their special lines arc teas, spices, 
confectionery, cigars, soap, canned goods, 
essence#, woodenware and some lines of 
patent medicines. They carry in addition an 
innumerable variety of other lines, such as 
wrapping paper, paper hags, matches, and 
the like. In fact they are able to fill all 
orders for goods usually sold in country 
stores, except boots, shoes and dry goods. 
They cater especially for the jobbing trade, 
and in order, to keep and extend their connec­
tions, they adopt two principles. They buy 
at the lowest prices, and sell at the lowest 
margin consistent with safe trade. In this 
way they make it an advantage for traders to 
deal with them. They claim to be able to 
give their customers an advantage in this 
respect, that there is no other wholesale 
house either in this city or St. John 
which carries so great a variety of goods. 
One of their customers the other day expressed 
his surprise at finding a house where dll his 
order could be filled. “In St. John,” he 
said, “I would have had to. go to half a dozen 
different places.” They conduct the jobbing 
business with a view to meet the small trader’s 
purse. If he cannot take a full case of goods 
they will break bulk. This firm also handles 
country produce, and are prepared to take 
all that the country people have to sell. 
They have just added to their stock a lot of 
toys for Christmas trade, wholesale only, and 
are prepared to fill orders for any-quantity. 
They will sell assorted cases, which will save 
purchasers the trouble of making selections. 
Messrs. Whittier & Hooper occupy two stores 
and a waveroom in Edgecombe’s Block, on 
the corner of York and King streets, in this 
city.

[We think it well to add that these notices, 
of our business houses are not advertisements, 
and are not written at the solicitation of tbe 
persons whose business is referred to. They 
are iutended to follow ns a sequel to our 
articles on the future of Fredericton, and to 
show in the most convincing way possible 
that a wholesale trade can be done in the city, 
and it is in a fair way of being done. They 
are intended as advertisements of the city.]

What they are saying.—It will never get 
hard.

The sand is too fine.
There is too much loam iu it.
It will get so hard it will crack.
It will cost too much money.
It ought to have been put tip at tender.
It is a first class job.
It will last forever.
It isn’t like what they do in Boston.
It will be the best sidewalk in the province.
That's the way yon do it, eh ?
It's kind of dirty work, ain’t it?
And so on. It is fun to hear the com­

ments.

CITY COUNCIL.
The regular meeting of the City Council 

was held Tuesday evening, His Worship the 
Mayor in the chair.

The minutes of the last meeting were read 
and approved.

The Auditor submitted the following re­
port, which was adopted :

Public Works..............................$1,160 76
Roads and Streets...................... 129 10
Contingent..*.........;................... 130 83
Fire Department.......................  HO 56
Wharf.......................................... 27 40
City Hall..................................... 13 33
The petitions of Edward Sweeney, Edward 

Stewart, and John Brannen, to be relieved 
from paying taxes was referred to Assess­
ment Appeal Committee.

Aid Wilson presented a petition for chang­
ing the situation of the Gas Alley fire bell.

It was referred to the Fire Committee.
A petition was submitted to have a street 

lamp placed at the end of the cross street 
made lately below the Parliament Buildings 
Square.

On motion resolved that the petition be 
complied with.

Assesment Appeal Committee submitted 
their report, which was adopted.

The Road Committee submitted their re­
port, which was adopted. By the report it 
appenres that the cost of laying the asphalt 
sidewalk was $1,615.93, and that the road 
that has been macadamized has been done at 
the rate of $12.50, per rod.

The report, recommended the Council to 
invite tenders for laying asphalt sidewalks 
between Regent and Carleton streets, and 
York and Westmorland streets. The dis­
cussion on the above became so spirited that 
the Mayor read some of the rules of the 
Council relative to order and said they must 
be observed.

The Water Works Committee submitted 
their report, and on motion of Council, re1 
solved that the report be taken up section 
by section.

Aid Simmons thought the committee 
acted too hurriedly in asking for tenders, 
without the consent of the Council. He 
moved that an adjourned meeting of the 
Council be held to-morrow evening to give 
the Council a chance to inspect the specifica­
tions and the tenders.

Aid. Wilson said that the tenders were on 
the table and could be examined any time 
by the Council.

Aid. Farrell thought the privilege asked 
in Aid. Simmons’ motion should be granted 
and he would support the motion.

On the vote being taken the motion was 
carried. *

Aid. Wilson said that as an explanation 
with regard to the pipe was needed, he would 
say that Mr. Neill was very little higher than 
the other lowest tenderer, who was a Mon­
treal man, and as Mr. Neill belonged to this 
place and guaranteed to furnish the first ship 
load of pipe by the first of October, they 
concluded to award the contract to Mr. Neil. 
He therefore asked, as Mr. Neil would have 
to wire for these goods, that this be accepted, 
but tne Council concluded that twenty-four 
hours would make no difference. The matter 
will be taken up to-night.

On motion the Council adjourned.

The adjourned meeting of the City Council 
was held in the Council Chamber, last night, 
at 7.45 o’clock. The object of the meeting 
was to consider the report of the Water Works 
Committee which was as follows :—
To the City Council.

Your Water Works Committee beg to 
submit the following report :

Your committee feeling themselves en­
couraged in their laborious duties beg the 
hearty endorsement of their action and the 
full authority given them to use prompt 
measures. At the special meeting of the 
City Council held in July last, and also 
takiug into consideration the unanimous 
decision of the Board to forward the work 
of introducing water immediately after the 
adoption of their report at said special 
meeting on 21st July last, held a meeting of 
the committee to consider how further to 
proceed after due consideration arrived at 
the following conclusions :

To employ Messrs Crafts and Forbes to 
prepare detailed plans and to call for tenders 
with as little delay as possible in order to 
submit the same if possible at the September 
meeting of the City Council. Mr. Crafts 
arrived in the city in August, and after 
careful sounding and surveys in seve.-i 
localities finally located the pumping works 
immediately above Smyth Street. The 
committee having secured the necessary land 
from the Government (one hundred feet on 
Government House Road by two hundred 
and forty-one feet on the river front), caused 
the same to be surveyed.

Detailed plans and specifications were 
then prepared for the following works and 
materials :

1. Crib-well and Guard-cribs, in river.
2. Pump well.
3. Pipes and special castings.
4. Hydrants and valves.
5. Pumping machinery.
6. Contractor’s work (laying pipes.)
And tenders were forthwith invited in all

the city papers and two St. John papers in 
accordance with said plans and specifications 
for all but No. 6 (laying pipes) which will 
require to be tendered hereafter.

The tenders for No. 3 pipes aud special 
castings No. 4 hydrants and valves No. 5 
pumping machinery wore opened by your 
committee en the first and second days of 
September iust., and carefully examined and 
considered with the assistance of your en­
gines, Messrs. Crafts & Forbes, and your 
committee decided to recommend the fol­
lowing tenders for* adoption by tile city 
Council:

No. 3, pipes and special castings to Jas. S. 
Neill, Fredericton, for straight pipes at 
$37,77. per ton.

Special castings $65,86. per ton, delivered 
iu Fredericton in five weeks from signing of 
contract,freight and duty paid.

No. 4 hydrants to the Coggin Manufactur­
ing Co., of Boston, for 2,700 each, duties to 
be added.

Valves to the same Company, at the fol- 
j lowing rates :

»

.............$8 956 me u ............. 11 354 .... ....... 17 95
8 “

tt ............. 27 00u .............40 0010 11
12 “

u ..............50 00
All delivered at Fredericton, duties to be 
added to above prices.
No 5 pumping machinery to Holly Manu­
facturing Co., of Lockport New \ ork, for 
one Gaskill Compound Duplex pumping 
engine and boiler for the sum of $13,500 * 
delivered and placed in position by the 1st 
January next duty andfreght paid.

The tenders for No 1 crib-well and guard-

*
r

crib, and No 2 pump-well were opened by 
your committee on Monday, the 4th inst., and 
the committee decided to recommcned the 
following tenders for acceptance, viz :
No I, Guard Crib, Whitman Haines, St

Marys, for................................. ............. $400
Crib Well, Whitman Haines.................. 927

$1,327
No 2, Pump Well, A. Limerick, F’ ton, $1,324

Your committee have endeavored carefully 
and exp^itiously to perform their duties, and 
it now remains for the Council forthwith to 
adopt or otherwise their labor and place them 
in a position to further proceed with the 
undertaking. They are pleased to say that 
the tenders for materials and work arc so far 
not in excess of the estimates of the engineers. 
All the plans and specifications and tenders 
are laid before the City Council for their per­
usal and consideration. It is necessary that 
the tenders recommended by your com­
mittee be adopted, and the City Coiincil be 
directed to draw up the contracts, the same 
not to be executed until proper securities be 
furnished to the satisfaction of your commit­
tee. Any delay at this stage will have the 
effect of putting back the completion of the 
waterworks for more than a year, as the pre­
liminary step, that is, the putting down the 
crib well and guard crib and pump well, and 
connecting the same, can only be done to ad­
vantage at extreme low water.

Your committee further report that it is 
now necessary to place at least $10,000 as 
water debentures on the market for the pur­
pose of placing the Treasurer in à position to 
honor cheques against the sewerage and 
water account. This amount will be required 
to pay engineering and incidental expenses 
in connection with survey, tenders, specifi­
cations aed printing, (including the amount 
already advanced from ordinary revenue), 
the putting down and completing the crib- 
well, guard-crib and pump-well, and the 
iron piping connecting the same, and 
probably also towards paying for the iron 
pipe for the. street, which may be ex­
pected to commence to be delivered be­
fore the debentures are all printed, exe­
cuted, and disposed of. Your committee 
therefore recommend that the City Council 
do forthwith order the issue of debentures 
to be called Water Debentures to the amount 
of $10,000. Such debentures to be issued 
under the authority of the Act of assembly 
passed at the last session of the legislature, 
to be in similar form as near as may be to 
the consolidated debt debentures and to be 
made payable on the year after the last of 
said consolidated debt debentures are pay­
able to be executed in the manner prescribed 
by the act, and your committee authorized 
to negotiate for the sale of the same on the 
best terms possible, not however in any 
case to dispose of any of said debentures 
below their par value; all of which is re­
spectfully submitted.

Alex. Burchill. 1 „ ,
Wm. Wilson. . _ Ro?d 
John Macpheiiso.v I Committee.

Before taking up the Water Committee re­
port it was resolved that a committee of three
be appointed to draw up a code of by-laws to 
govern the Water Works committee.

The chairman of the Wharf committee sub­
mitted a report which was adopted.

Pursuant to motion of last Council meeting 
of the Water committee report was taken up 
section by section. Each section was read 
and approved without discussion, and the 
report was accepted as a whole.

Aid. Wilson moved that the committee 
be empowered to ask for tenders for lay- 
ing the pipe, said tender to be submitted 
to the approval of Council. Aid. Hall said 
lie was opposed to this as he considered that 
the committee had enough on their bauds at 
present. Aid. Farrell said he agreed with 
the motion, considering how the matter now 
stands. On motion resolved that the com­
mittee be empowered to ask for tenders for 
the erection of a building in which to place 
the machinery.

On motion the Council adjourned.

Sabbath Schools.—Mr. E. Payson Porter, 
statistical secretary of the National Sabbath 
School Union of the United States and Bri- , 
tish . rovinces, delivered a very interesting 
address to the sabbarti school workers on 
Friday evening, Sept. 1st. At the close of 
the address, a motion was made to form a 
Sabbath School County Organization. The 
Rev. John W. Wadman was called to the 
chair, and Geo. A. Perley was requested to 
act as secretary. A committee of five was 
appointed to name the officers of such county 
organization, viz. : Messrs. Win. Creeiman. 
Wm. Lemont, S. D. Macpherson, Mrs. J. G. 
Gill and Miss Ella Thorne, who retired for 
for consultation. After a brief delay. Mr. 
Macpherson, as chairman, reported as fol­
lows: Mr. Wm. Creclman. President ; Mr. 
Wm. Lemont, Secretary-Treasurer : and 
Messrs. John Spnrdcn, E. C. Freeze, Leonard 
M . Johnston, and Geo. A. Perley, Executive 
Committee. It was then moved, and carried 
unanimously, that the reportbe adopted. It 
was then moved, and carried unanimously, 
that the Executive Committee appoint Vice- 
Presidents for each parish in the County. A 
vote of thanks was then passed and present­
ed to Mr. Porter for his able address, and the 
meeting closed with the Doxology and Bene- 
diction.

The Turmoil at St. Ann’s—Several cor­
respondents have written to ns respecting the 
rude conduct of the crowd who attended at 
the Parish Church to witness a recent* wed­
ding. We do not see that it will do any good 
to publish their letters ; but We must express 
our surprise that any reason whatever wouir 
cause our townspeople to so forget £hemsev<^' 
aud the character of the place they were in. 
as appeals to have been done by many of 
those « ho were present on the occasion re­
ferred to.

*
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LOCAL NEWS.
Honest —The Capital admits that not even 

the Leader of the Opposition can find the 
Government.

The Manse.—Joshua Limerick has the con­
tract for repairing the Manse of St. Paul’s 
Church. He receives $812.

Woodstock Fair.—The Carleton County 
Agricultural Society hold their exhibition at 
Woodstock on the 14th of October next.

Teachers’ Institute.—The Carleton Co. 
Teachers’ Institute holds its annual session 
in Woodstock on the 7th and 8th of Septem­
ber.

Hymknial.—The Albion House flag waved 
Tuesday in token of an interesting ceremony 
in which a brother cf the proprietor partici­
pated.

Kino’s County.—The Sun announces that 
G. Hudson Flewelling, of Clifton, will be a 
candidate for the vacant seat in King’s 
County.

A Kind Offer.—Mr. and Mrs. Steven Glasier 
kindly offered the use of their beautiful 
grounds to the Methodist Sunday School for 
a picnic.

Insane.—Wellington Nash, a native of New 
Brunswick, 34 years of age, was committed 
to the Napa Insane Asylum.—San Francisco 
Chronicle.

Land Sale.—At the Crown Land Office 
yesterday afternoon fifty-two square miles of 
land was bi3 in by Robert Connor at the 
upset price.

A good Appointment.—Miss Bateman, 
formerly of the Model School of this city, is 
now an assistant teacher in the deaf and 
dumb school, Halifax.

Seizure.—The custom authorities at 
Georgetown, P. E. I., made a seizure of 
twelve casks of Kerosene, a large quantity 
of tea and other merchandize.

' Very Indignant.—The Capital is very in­
dignant because we replied to its nonsense 
with chaff. We refer our contemporary to 
Proverbs 26th chapter ani 5th verse for our 
justification.

Hides.—The last two boats from St. John 
have brought together five hundred hides for 
the Gibson Leather Company They are 
Western hides and were ordered by the com­
pany from Montreal.

After Many Days.—The new pavement 
from Carleton to York street is finished at 
last, and is pronunced by everyone to be a 
complete success. We may say farewell, a 
long farewell to plank sidewalks in Freder­
icton. ______________

Tow Boats.—There are twe tow boats at 
the wharf below the City Hall at present. 
One is used for bringing the production of 
Shaw’s Tannery down river and the other 
is loading with freight for the upper St. 
John.

Deserted.—Alexandria, when taken re­
cently by the English, conld not have shown 
fewer, of Arabi Pacha’s followers; than 
would this place have shown of its inhabi­
tants, had there been two more excursions 
from the city yesterday.

The late W. H. Friel.—William H. F riel 
one of our most widely known citizens, died 
on Saturday, a little after noon. The diseased 
was about 48 years of age. He was the son 
of the late James Friel. Mr. W. H. Friel was 
for many years Deputy Sheriff of York 
County. His health failed him some time 
ago. He has been practically confined to 
his house ever since last January, only hav­
ing been out twice since that time.

Off for Europe.—Henry I. Taylor and 
John R McIntosh, both of the graduating 
class of'82 of the New Brunswick University 
left by steamer for New York, yesterday 
morning whence they will sail foi Edinburgh; 
where they expect to take a course in the 
Edinburgh University. Mr. Taylor intends 
taking a medical course, Mr. McIntosh an 
arts course. They will make seven graduates 
of the University, now attending that place

Died in the Lockup.—Yesterday afternoon 
Daniel Donaho, a truckman, was driving 
along near the officers square, he was -noticed 
to suddenly fall to the ground. He was 
placed in the square- and while there took 

fit from which he soon recovered. The 
police arrested him for being drunk and lodg­
ed him in the lockup At 11.30 there did not 
appear to be anything wrong with deceased, 
but at 2.30 a. m., when the lockup was again 
visited,he was found dead. A coroner’s jury 
was summoned and after viewing his remains 
ordered the body to be sent home. It is 
supposed he was poisoned.

F. C. B. District Meeting.—The Free 
Christian Baptists of the Fredericton District 
opened their annual meeting at Lower 
Queensbury yesterday. The chief business 
is the preparation of the reports of the con­
dition of the various churches for the general 
conference which will convene at Woodstock 
this year during the first of October. The 
district meeting will last about two days. 
A number of the members of that denomin­
ation of this city started early yesterday 
morning for Queensbury.

An explanation Wanted.—The Moncton 
Times says that “Hon. Mr. Hanington is in 
town to dry.” Now as the C T A is sup­
posed to be in force in Moncton we can 
understand how any thirsty soul might feel 
to dry there; but this will hardly apply to 
our effervescent premier who, with all . his 
faults, is a square temperance man. We 
hope the Times will tell us when and where 
Mr. H. got wet. A little drying won’t hurt 
him.

The old Playhouse, refered to in Mr. 
Creed’s interesting paper, used to stiftid just 
on the upper side of Mr. Bliss’s residence. 
The building was erected by Mr. Ackerman 
for a store, hotel and publiti hall, and was at 
one time used as a barracks. It was subse­
quently pulled down and the cottage on 
Sunbury Street, next the engine house, in 
part erected from the materials. The cottage 
in question now belongs to Mr. Ackerman.’s 
grandson, H M Stevens of Somerville, C C.

Police News.—Frederick Chase was fined 
$50 Monday for selling liquor. The evi­
dence against him was his own admission on 
tlie Macdonald perjury trial.

A complaint is made against Mr. F. 
Ckments for keeping a cross dog. The ani­
mal on Saturday severly bit a lad named 
McIntosh, who is now under medieal treat­
ment. The dog is said to be naturally quiet, 
but the boys worry jt constantly.

Neil Gormerly, drunk, $10.

Removal.—Every one will regret the 
removal of Rev. Carl Prbcillius from Fred­
ericton. He is to take charge of a parish at 
Salmon River. No clergyman is more 
highly esteemed in the city than Father 
Precillius. His sterling manliness commands 
the respect of every one.

Knocked out of Time.—As Tuesday night’s 
train from St. John was approaching Wcls- 
ford, the engineer noticed some cattle on the 
track, where one o£ them remained until re­
moved by the cow catcher of the engine. 
After the train was stopped it was found that 
the cow had not been killed.

Rather Thin.—An unsigned letter, ad­
dressed on the envelope to the Herald, but 
on the inside to the “ captial,” dated at New 
York and bearing the New York postmark, 
was received at this office on Saturday. 
The letter is clearly the proouction of a 
person accustomed to writing, but hae been 
copied by some one in a cramped hand, and 
half the words are mispelled. The style of 
composition betrays the authorship. It is 
an appeal to the public against certain 
witnesses in the Lee case. We shall not 
publish it.

A Sensation.—A story comes from Wood- 
stock to the.effect that a railroad employee 
there, suspecting Ins wife of improper rela­
tions with a fellow employee, informed the 
partner of his joys and sorrows that he was 
going west for a few days. Instead of so 
doing, he hid himself in a room commanding 
a view by a stove-pipe hole of his wife’s bed­
room. After waiting two days and a night 
without anything to eat, he discovered his 
wife and the suspected party, whp is a mar 
red man, in flagrante delictu. Calling a wit 
ness, he exposed the guilty pair.

Committee Meeting.—The committee ap­
pointed by the congregation of St. Paul's 
Church to make arrangements for celebrating 
the fiftieth anniversary of the - Presbyterian 
Church in this city-, meet in the vestry of St. 
Paul’s Church, this evening, to make further 
arrangements with regard to the celebration.

Fredericton^ Rural Cemetery.—-At the 
annual meeting of the Fredericton R tirai 
Cemetery Company, held Monday, the fol­
lowing officers were elected : G E Fencty, 
President ; J S Beek, Secretary ; G N Bab­
bitt, Treasurer ; Hon. DWark, W Carman, 
Dr. Harrison, John J Fraser and Jas A Van- 
wart, Directors.

Fredericton Deaf and Duhis School.— 
Prof. Woodbridge is in Moncton holding 
meetings in aid of the deaf and dumb school 
to be started in this city. In the several 
towns he visited he met with good success. 
He is accompanied with two deaf and dumb 
pupils who illustrate the method of teaching 
and exhibit specimens of their work.

Musical.—The people of Gibson are very 
much pleased with the singing given in the 
Methodist church under the leadership of 
Mr. Perkips. Last Sunday evening the 
quartette, “God is a Spirit,” was beautifully 
rendered by Miss Perkins, W. Adams, Jas. 
McAdatn, and T. M. Graevcl ; and on the 
previous Sunday, the anthem, “Rest in the 
Lord,” was well sung, the solo being taken 
by Mrs. Perkins.

Personal.—Mr. Morton came to the city 
Tuesday, accompanied by Messrs. W. E. 
Perley and E. McLeod, and was sworn in 
Solicitor General.

Mr. C. G. Hildreth, Secretary of the Holly 
Manufacturing Co., of Lockport, N. Y., has 
been in town for a few days, in the interest 
of the above company. Although the Holly 
system of water works is used in many cities 
of the United States, it has been but recently 
that Canadian cities have*atvakend to the fact 
of this system being equal to any and supe­
rior to most systems in every respect. Mr. 
Hildreth feels confident that, as a start has 
been made, the introduction of this system in 
many cities of the Dominion will rapidly take 
place.

Preliminary Examination of Prof 
Foster.—The preliminary examination 
Prof. Foster M. P. for Kings, which has been 
conducted before G B Seeley- Esq, was con 
eluded Tuesday evening. As commissioners; 
Messrs. C W Weldon, G C Gilbert and J 
Armstrong appeared for the petitioners, and 
Messrs. F C Barker, W II Tuck and A 
Fainveather for Mr. Foster, The case oc­
cupied two days and it is defficult to tell 
how much longer it would have taken, had 
Prof. Foster’s counsel cross-examined him 
The expenses to which the Professor was 
placed during the campangn amounted 
$161,30. ______________

Marriage. — Another of those pleasant 
events which we record almost daily and 
always with pleasure, took place in St. 
Andrew's Church, St. John, early on Tuesday 
morning, when Mr. Albert Edgecombe, of this 
city, was married to Miss Minnie Logan 
daughter of Mr. William Logan, of St. John 
The groom was assisted by Mr. Fred Edge 
combe, brother, and the bride by her sister. 
Miss Annie Logan. The ceremony was per 
formed by Rev. Mr. Love. The attendance of 
friends of the young couple was vçry large. 
Mr. and Mrs. Edgecombe, after receiving the 
congratulation of their friends, were driven 
to the St. John A Maine depot, where they 
took passage on the morning express for the 
United States.

The Far West.—We have before us a copy 
of the Fort McLeod Gazette published awày 
out West. It is not quite half as big as the 
Herald, and pnblished'every alternate week 
at $3,00 per year. We note the arrival of 
Major Dowling and 112 men. The Major, 
who is our ex-alderman, is said to be “look­
ing hale and hearty after his trip to Canada.” 
The number before us is-dated July 29th. Its 
latest foreign dates are up to June 30, justa 
month old. We observe in an advertisement 
of an Hotel in Calgarry, under the shadow 
of the Rockies, that “the tables arc laid out 
in the latest Western style (Eastern style 
being played out)”

Picnics.—The Roman Catholics of Oro- 
mocto lielt^a Picnic at Oromocte Island Tues- 
-day. The Fredericton Brass Band, was 
present.

The Methodist Sunday School Picnic will 
be held at Mr. Stephen Glasier’s, on a day 
shortly to be announced. A capital pro­
gramme will be prepared .-

The picnic of a number of the 
colored folks of this city was held Tuesday, 
the picnicers going down in a special car, 
about ten miles. The day passed off pleasant­
ly, but as the Scott Act was not strictly en­
forced, a number of the party became a little 
too gibbous, and a lively discussion took 
place on nearing the station which ended in 
blows. During the excitement, one of the 
women fainted, and had to be taken home in 
a coach. Had it not been for this distur­
bance, the. affair would have passed off 
pleasantly throughout.

Fredericton Deaf and Dumb School.—A 
public meeting in aid of the above school was 
held in the Masonic Hall, Chatham, on Tues­
day night. Rev. Wallace Waites presided, 
and in his opening remarks strongly urged the 
necessity that existed for a good institution 
in this Province. Mr. Wood bridge’s address 
was well received, having fully enlisted the 
sympathies of the audience by the examin­
ation of one of his pupils. A liberal collec­
tion was taken up at the close of the meeting. 
Rev. Mr. Waites, Rev. Mr. Forsyth and Mr. 
Winslow, President of the Montreal <Bank, 
have promised to forward information re- 
spec ing the deaf and dumb of the district, 
and to help the movement as far as possible. 
Transcript.

The Boss Jail Breaker.—Thomas FlanaJ 
gan was arrested by officer Thibideau on 
Monday night dbout 9 o’clock. When the 
officer was goiug down Duke street he found 
Flanagan lying close to the excavation for 
the sewer. If he had attempted to rise he 
undoubtedly would have fallen into the hole, 
which was about fourteen feet deep. He 
was in such a stupor from the effects of the 
liquor that he was not aware of his danger. 
Officer Thibideau was in the lock-up at five 
o’clock on Tuesday morning before going 
home and said that Flanagan was then secure. 
Before the hour arrived for the opening of the 
court the prisoner to.ok his leave of the pre­
mises, since which time non est Inventus— 

Transcript.
The Championship.—Among the problems 

which pass the ordinary understanding Of 
mortals is the question of aquatic champion­
ship. What constitutes a champion is one 
of these things no fellow can find out. It 

pears, however, that it is not necaéfàry to 
win races to be a champion. This disting­
uished honor may be gained by the use of 
printer’s ink. All that is necessary is that a 
man who wants to be champion, should 
challenge some body else whom he knows 
cannot accept, and then publish to the world 
that he is entitled to the distinguished honor 
and then, -by some rule of aquatic nomen­
clature, he straightway becomes a champ 
ion. Our sporting editor, for example, who 
don’t know the difference between a scull 
oar and a telegraph post, may issue a pro­
clamation to-morrow- offering to row any 
man for a million or two, and if he is so 
lucky as to select a time when the other 
champion’s bands arc blistered, or the cliamp- 
ious have the stomach ache, can be success­
ful. Yes, it is the easiest thing in the world 
to be an aquatic champion.

Picnics.—The picnic of the Maugcrville 
Lodge, U T A, No 118 was held yesterday 
on the grounds -of Hon John Farris, Grand 
Lake. The May Queen was chartered to 
convey the picnicers to and from their des­
tination. It was arranged so that any person 
desirous of going from here could go at 
reduced rates. The boat left the wharf at 
7.30 a m, taking quite a large number of 
passengers. The 71st Band accompanied 
and throughout the day furnished music 
which made the affair more pleasant than it 
otherwise would have been. After an en­
joyable day was spent the picnicers returned 
the boat arriving about 11pm.

The Methodists of Xashwaaksis, had a 
Tea meeting. Baziar, Concert, etc., yester­
day afternoon at or near the Hall of that 
place. Tea was served during the afternoon, 
and at 7 o’clock, the Hall formed the centre 
of attraction as a concert, the music of 
which was furnished by the Marysville choir 
with Prof. Sterne, as conductor, was being 
held in the Hall. - The Tea meeting was 
a success, and the time enjoyable.

Serious Accident.—One day last week as 
Mr. Daniel Wood was crossing-the bridge 
near Mr.PatriekOwens,in Rushagonis,having 
a load of hay on the waggon, some old 
planks that were patched on the decking to 
make the bridge passable, came ill contact 
with the wagon causing the binding rope to 
give way. The horses became frightened 
and started to run away. The load w-as up­
set and Mr. Wood hurled to the ground, 
striking with such force as to severely injure 
him. He remained there until fonnd by Mr. 
Owens, who after much labor succeeded in 
restoring him to consciousness and after­
wards conveyed him to his home. Mr. 
Wood’s injuries were severe, hut at present 
he is recovering. Judging from reports this 
bridge has been out of repairs for two years 
and in fact the road there generally. It 
might be a slight hint to.the Chief Commis­
sioner of the way in which public money has 
been expended there (if any has been at all), 
to take a trip and see fo'r himself ; but our 
informant says if he travelled through the 
Wilsey road to Hartt's Mill lie would be com­
pelled to procure a carriage, (milt a little 
stronger, than the common run, to insure a 
safe journey.

The

A History of the Gardens of Fredèrietoi

(Oon tinned.)
About the same time Mr. Ketchum erected 

a conservatory for plants as well as glass 
houses for fruit, ipcluding peaches and 
grapes, and engaged Mr.Tait, (he having left 
the employ of Judge Fisher) as gardener. 
Mr. Tait made great improvements beautify­
ing his grounds, laid out a geomatrital 
flower garden and planted it elaborately with 
popular plants in all the variations of form 
and color.

Several years ago John A. Morrison put up 
a greenhouse for raising flowers, etc. for his 
grounds, engaged J. Bebbington as gardener 
(at that time in the employ of Hovey & Co., 
Boston), who extended his pleasure grounds, 
laid it out and made it one of the finest dis 
plays in the Province. Then came A. Ray. 
Esq., after the death of Judge Wilmot. and 
bought the late Judge’s place with the fine 
collection of plants, etc,' and has been adding 
to it since, so that he has now the best lot of 
palms, with other tropical or hot country 
plants, most of them of the latest introduc­
tions, in the Province or perhaps the Domi­
nion. As for his garden of roses, including 
hardy house plants and tender, they are the 
finest lot I ever saw, as well as the largest. 
Mr. R. of course pays little attention to mak­
ing a display of bedding plants, as classed by 
florists, as his heart is more upon those 
better class of plants from foreign countries 
which are mostly kept in heated houses the 
year round.

During the last ten or twelve years, several 
smaller, greenhouses have been built, as well 
as those for starting early tomatoes, etc 
Probably your readers will inquire where are 
these gardeners to-day? It is true I scarcely 
know one who employs a thorough, practical 
gardener, but they have laid the foundation 
for this gardening taste. For instance, Mrs. 
Morrison says she has learned from gardeners’ 
books and experience, considerable, so that 
she is able and competent to superintend her 
own garden, for which she deserves great 
credit. It is my impression that Mrs. Mor­
rison raises as many red and white currants 
in her front and vegetable garden as all the 
rest in town comb.ined ; as well as a great 
lot of strawberries, raspberries etc., various 
kinds of vegetables, for which Morrison’s 
garden is famous.

Mr. Ketchum not being here, of course his 
gardens arc not kept up ns in the past; 
neither is Judge Fisher’s, the family being 
away. G. E. Fenety, Esq., this year does 
not compare with past years, in reference 
to the elaborate flower decorations, otherwise 
it is clean and well kept. Government 
House is rather behind time in modern taste 
and style of flower gardening. Mr. Ran­
dolph has a good garden, a beautiful 
residence, does not plant much in the way 
of flowers but carnations and annuals, etc. 
A. Ray, Esq., as I have already stated has 
the chief attraction, outside is his rose 
garden with 7000 of the newest and fanciest 
varieties.

Mr.Kënney, Regent street, the oldest horti­
culturist in town, has a fine show of annuals, 
especially zinnias, but his onions are a sight. 
This ground produces wonderful fine onions 
yearly. Mr. K. considers there will be from 
100 to 125 barrels. Mr. K. has nRade a living 
in Fredericton for a number of years by rais­
ing vegetables, plants, and pot flowers, but 
his onions, for a number of years, have been 
his chief paying crop.

astonishingly—Short time it takes 
Zopesa to act upon the Digestive organs and 
the Liver, proves its wonderful affinity to the 
stomach. The first dose relieves. A sample 
bottle convinces, a large bottle cures. •

Daisies—Now-a-davs not to use “Tea- 
berry,” the new- exquisite for the Teeth and 
Breath, argues not to he Recife relie ; take a 
look at it at your drug store. 5 cent 
samples.

Baptist Newspaper Consolidation.—The 
sentiment in favor of one paper for Maritime 
Baptists has strengthened to conviction 
Among the reasons are : 1. One paper,
strong in the support of the whole body, 
would, at no greater cost, be larger and 
abler. 2. One paper, making known the 
work and wants of the denomination to all 
would call forth . common sympathy and 
interest and fuse its membership into one. 
3. One paper, assuring a single policy, would 
secure denominational unity and expansion 
The Convention heartily endorsed by reso­
lution the policy of consolidation, and 
pledged moral support to equitable measures 
to secure a single paper. In harmony with 
this resolution a public meeting of members 
of the Convention was held in Leinster 
Street Baptist Church, Aug. 22nd, 1882, and 
it was unanimously resolved to form the 
Maritime Baptist Publishing Company, 
purchase existing organs, and to publish the 
proposed paper. The follow-ing gentlemen 
were chosen to solicit stock and act as pro 
visional directors until the Company 
regularly organized : T M King, John March 
and H C Creed, Esqrs., Revds S B Kempton, 
J H Saunders, J E Goucher, C Goods'pead, 
J B Woodland, J W Manning, C G McDonald 
J A Dnrkee, G O Gates, E M Kierstead, J W 
Bancroft. At a subsequent meeting of the 
provisional directors, an executive committee 
of three was appointed, with power to add 
to their number. That, committee now stands 
as follows Rev J A Durkee, John March, 
Esq, Rev C Goodspeed, B H Eaton and H C 
Creed, Esqrs. This committee is authorized 
in announcing that the Visitor is prepared 
to sell and the MessengerI to consider pro­
posals to this end. All that is necessary to 
success in this enterprise, so fraught with 
good to the denomination, and so full of 
promise to the Company, is a general sub­
scription of stock. The Committee there­
fore lay the stock list before the Baptist 
public.

J. A. Durkee, Chairman Ex. Com.
Drowned.—One day last week, Mr. Ache- 

son Carson, of St. Patrick, and his two sons, 
were engaged haying in his meadow- at Dig- 
deguash Lake, a small lake that empties into 
the Magaguadavic. The hat of Robert, a 
fine, well-developed, muscular lad of fifteen, 
blew off his head and across the lake. He 
went to recover it, undressed, plunged into 
the lake and sw-am across, his father and 
brother standing watching him. He reach­
ed the other side in safety, and turned to 
come back. His father and brother having 
no fear on his account, ns he was a good 
swimmer, resumed their work. A few seconds 
afterwards, on casually looking towards the 
the lake, they saw the lad’s hat floating on 
the water, but he was nowhere visible. The 
elder brother at once jumped into the water 
and swam to the spot where he last saw 
Robert. Meanwhile the father, who could 
not swim, constructed a raft which he poled 
out on the lake. After a few minutes’ search, 
he found the body lying in about six feet of 
water, a very short distance from the shore. 
The lad’s limbs were in a swimming posture. 
When brought to the surface, life was ex­
tinct.—Rag Pilot.

The Head Waters or the St. John.

We do not remember to have seen any 
thing in print descriptive of the St. John, 
river above St. Francis, and as there is a 
large tract of country in Maine and Quebec, 
of which our people know very little, but 
form which many million of feet of lumber 
have and will likely continue to come for 
many years. We gladly make room for the 
following account of a trip to the head 
waters of the St. John, river by a correspon­
dent, accompained by a friend, whom he 
introduces to the public under the name of 
“the Captain.” Wc.mny introduce the letter 
with a statement which we lately had from 
an experienced lumberman, namely that 
there is upon the head waters of jheSt. John, 
in the State Maine, sufficient spruce lumber 
to permit, under careful management, of 
an annual cut of thrity millions of super­
ficial feet for an indefinite number of years to 
come. This statement is of value in con­
nection with what has been said and writen 
concerning the conservation of the forest 
wealth of New Brunswick. Our correspon­
dent says: Sir, I send you an account of a 
trip to the head waters of the St. John. On 
Monday Aug. 7th 1882, in company with 
“the Captain,” I went by rail 4o Grand 
Falls. We were very much pleased with the 
excellent character of the crops. On reach­
ing Grand Falls we were comfortably enter­
tained by Landlord Olive of the Grand 
Falls Hotel, who had plenty of guests in his 
house and knows how to entertain them 
right royally. We left next day for Ed- 
munston by rail at 6 a. m. arriving at 
11 a. m., and afterdinner pushed on towards 
St. Francis, arriving at Baker Brook, 
about thirteen miles from the terminus of the 
railway where we stopped for the night with 
Daniel Chrisholm, who joined our party for 
the cruise. We dined next day at Robert 
Connors’ at whose store we supplied ourselves 
with what we needed for the journey. Mr. 
Connors has built a fine house, planted trees, 
and laid out his grounds most tastefully. He 
has cleared his farm in an excellent manner, 
thus setting an example to his neighbors, 
which everyone hopes they will imitate. His 
store is a very extensive establishment. This 
is about two hundred and twelve miles above 
Fredericton, so that we are justified in think­
ing that we are getting pretty well “upriver. 
At St. Francis, we embarked in our canoe, 
which was pretty heavily laden and started 
out to pole into what to us was an unknown 
land. The settlement extends about two 
miles above the St. Francis, and some of the 
farmers are very well situated. Here at the 
foot of some rapids we pitched our tent for 
the night. The next morning, being Aug. 10, 
we started out bright and early, the men poled 
the canoe through the rapids, the Captain 
and I walked. We had now reached the end 
of the settlements which extend from this 
point in what is practically an unbroken 
succession of farms for over three hundred miles 
to the Bay ofFundy. There are a few settlers 
above, which I will speak of in passing, 
After passing the rapids we took to our canoes 
again, and found no difficulty until we pass 
Cross Rock, which, judging from the logs 
upon it, must be a bad place for river drivers 
in the spring. We pass on the way several 
small clearings, and at each little house there 
is a lot of small children, for whose condition, 
so far away from every advantage, one can­
not help feeling pity. We took dinner on the 
beach at Casey’s, with a bill of fare which 
wouid have delighted a hungry man and ap­
petites fully equal to the occasion. Shortly 
after dinner we reached

Mlseellaneons Licences.

“There will be fun over them before they 
are done,” said a barrister to a Herald repre­
sentative yesterday. His reference was to 
the “land league” cases, so called, in which 
sundry commercial travellers seek to evade 
the payment of the licence fee by putting 
forward the fact that -they are ratepayers in 
the County of York. Seven of these cases, 
in various stages of advancement, are now 
before the Police Court, and if all are to he 
litigqfcd out, there certainly will be •'fun be­
fore they are done. ’ The city authorities 
wish to have one case taken as a test, and 
all the others to abide by it. To this the 
defendants are not disposed to agree, so that 
a fine lot of litigation may be looked for.

The whole question of miscellaneous licenses 
is one which will bear a little consideration. 
Without saying that they are wrong in prin­
ciple, perhaps theyare not, we are not sure 
that they do not work mischief to the city. 
Fredericton has a reputation for treating 
dealers from abroad very hardly. Its repu­
tation in this respect is probably not borne 
out by the facts ; but we hear of a great 
many people who think our city by-laws are 
so framed as to make it risky for strangers to 
do business here. Of course we know that 
the intention is only to protect retail dealers 
from competition at the hands of transient 
people, but the reputation of the city goes 
much further than this. We should hardly 
like to advocate the repeal of the Act autho­
rizing the imposition of a fine upon persons, 
not rate-payers in the city or county,who do 
business here without a license ; but we invite 
the attention of the public to the "matter, and 
shall be glad to hear what our business people 
have to say. If, as some assert, the exaction 
of a license fee keeps buyers away, the sooner 
it is proclaimed far and wide that every per­
son is free to come here and buy goods the- 
better. Such we believe practically is the 
case, and if by any,construction of the law a. 
license is exacted from men who come here 
to buy produee the sooner we have a change 
the better. The question to be considered 
is does the miscellaneous license law preju­
dicially affect the city trade ? If it does it 
should be repealed. Everything should be 
done to induce people to come here to trade.

We are showing in the Herald how this 
place is likely to become a centre for whole­
sale trade. Let all obstructions be removed 
to the prosecution of bnsiness by persons 
from abroad. Of course we need not ex­
plain that there is nothing in any statute or 
by-law to prevent all the world from coming 
to buy goods of our merchants. What we 
should like to see is the same freedom ex­
tended to all who come here to purchase the 
produce of the country. Practically we 
believe it is, but if there is any doubt about 
it, let it be at once removed.

Refering to the fact that the Collector 
at Montreal was superannuated while 
quite able to perform his duty, the Toronto 
Globe suggests that it would have been 
better to have kept him in office and paid 
his successors the retiring allowance.

We offer no apology for frequently calling 
attention to Johnson's Anodyne Liniment, as 
it is the most valuable remedy that has ever 
been produced. It is a sure cure for diar­
rhoea, dysentery and cholera morbus.

War, famine and pestilence all combined 
do not produce the evil consequences to a 
nation which result from impure blood in our 
veins. Parson's Purgative Pills make new 
rich blood and prevent all manner of diseases.

the allegasu,

one the nollest tributaries of the St. John,
It seems as if the main river made a graceful 
curve to welcome and receive this beautiful 
stream and bear its waters to the sea. There 
is a small settlement here, but it does not 
appear to have improved much since my 
last visit fifteen years ago. Three miles 
further up is the mouth of

little black river,

where there is a settlement. We found one 
of our Kingsclear boys, Charles Kelley, son 
of George Kelley, married and settled upon 
a small farm here. We arc now approaching 
one of the wildest parts of the river St, 
John. Persons who have seen them as they 
foam in the spring say that no -grander sight 
can be imagined than

•THE BIG RAPIDS

which here, for three miles, plunge along be­
tween huge boulders with which the river is 
studded. The river mqkes many feet of 
fall here, and at all seasons of the year it is 
difficult to navigate the rapids. Many serious 
accidents, often accompanied by loss of life, 
occurred here. The captain and I walk­
ed around the Rapids, but our men got 
the canoe safely through. About a mile 
above, at widow Jackson's, we pitched our 
tents, having made twenty-two miles, which, 
as our canoe was large and deeply loaded, 
was a pretty good day’s work. That night 
it rained heavily, so that the river rose 
several inches the next forenoon.

The next day we passengers walked again 
along the bank, and after going several miles 
we came to a small cabin in the woods, where 
a man and his wife live all alone. A few 
miles further Willett’s farm is reached. A 
few miles further we come to the

widow castoria’s

farm. This woman lost her husband fifteen 
years ago, bnt although far away from any 
settlement, she has brought up her family of 
five children; and made a farm on which she 
keeps three horses, and twenty-four head of 
cattle, besides other stock.

(To be continued.)

Brace up.—Your system for work. Zopesa, 
the new Dyspepsia and liver remedy, attends 
strictly to business by correcting the 
Stomach, Liver, and "Kidneys. Sample 
bottles, 10 cents: large bottles, 75 cents.

MARRIAGES.

On the 30th nit., by Rev. J. W. Wadman, Mr. 
Charles H. Brewer, of Bright, to Miss Sarah L. 
Capeon, of Douglas, York County,

DEATHS.

In this city, on Sept 2nd, 
the 48 year of his age.

William H. Friel, in

Behind Time—The Egyptian prophet is 
not making schedule time. Ho was due 
at Cairo about four weeks ago, and ap. 
parantly is as far away as over. There 
are not wanting those who suggest that 
that the story of his advance is a canard, 
and that he is yet in his native Sdudan- 
The arrangements which Wolseley is mak­
ing do not appear to bo based upon any 
expectation of the approach of a large 
hostile force down the Nile Valley. It is 
very difficult to get any reliable informa­
tion from the interior of Egypt ; but in 
non3 of the late despatches is there even 
a hint at Achmet and his huge army.

HORSE POKES.

6DOZ. Ilorso Pokes. 
For sale by 

July 8

JUST OPENED
AT

8. F. SHUTE’S,
2 cases containing the following :

GERMAN WORK AND LUNCH BASKETS,
Japanese Bamboo,Baskets,

PHJLADONE’S RAZORS,

Scissors, Pocket Knives,
Nickle Paper Weights,

Ash Pans, Nut Picks
Fruit Knives, Cegar Lighters and Ventilated Arahets

' A Nice Lot of

WALKING STICKS.
Long Handled JAPANESE FANS for 

Covering.

Also, a splendid lino of

B RIA R_P IP E S.
REMEMBER THE PLACE :

S. F. SHUTE’S,
Sharkey’s Block, Queen Street. 

Fredericton. March 29.

A nice article and cheap. 
JAMES S. NEILL

VARNISH. VARNISH.

JUST received, direct from tile manufacturer, 2 
cases Varnish, Rubbing, Body and Gearing Body Varnish.

July 3 Z. R. EVERETT,
BABY’S CHAIR ROCKERS & DEXTER 

HORSES
May 8 at LEMONT’S Variety Store.

HOI HO!!

A LARGE line of Childrens’ Cabs and PeraS 
•atois just received. Call early. .

At LEMONT’S VARIETY TORE

■ ’fcaa». I—m,i all1 h ...... —Mk-
i
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An Indian Festival.

ANNUAL CELEBRATION OF THE SIOUX SUN 
DANCE.

Fort Bennett, Dakota, August 12,1882. 
The annual festival of the Sioux sun 
dance has just occurred here, and it was 
sta r tling spectacle, and coming as it did 
in a camp of 5,000, the festival was cele­
brated with great pomp and circumstance 
on the Cheyenne, 35 miles northeast of 
the post. This is the first festival they 
have been permitted to célébrité for six 
gears. The larger bands represented are 
Hose of Blackfeet, Kettle Sans Arc, Min- 
neconjou, and the sub-chiefs Rattling 
Bib, Thunder Cloud, Youn0-Man-Afraid- 
ef-his-Shadow, and Spotted Eagie, beside 
a host of lesser lights were present. 
Fifteen hundred of these belong to the 
Cheyenne river agency. The balance are 
legations from Standing Rock, Rosebud 
and Spotted Tail agencies. These are all 
blanket Indians, and 1500 of them were 
tiie late hostiles under Sitting Bull. Ar­
riving upon the scene, your correspon­
dent found himself on the outskirts of an 
Indian village numbering 5,000, and many 
of them but lately hostile.. We were 35 
miles from the post. The midnight scene 
was indescribable. Behind, the moon 
was struggling through big gray clouds ; 
before us lay the gleaming camp fires of 
lie savages who were

MARINO NIGHT HIDEOUS 

with cries, groans, and yells. Twenty 
minutes later Maj. Walsh rode back with 
permission to enter. After introductions 
ef Battling Rib, Red Shirt and Fair Wea­
ther, Maj. Lewis’ little 10-year-old son 
Willie acting as interpreter, we were es­
corted to the arena, a circular inclosure 
containing about an acre. The sides con- 
risted of a shed of poles coverd with 
sfcins and blankets with the open side 
-fronting the inclosure. In the centre of 
the ring was a cottonwood tree eight 
■dies "n diameter and 30 feet high, from 
which the bark had been peeled, a small 
toft of branches remaining at the top. 
This pole was ornamented with medicine 
(tilings mysterious). From the top hung 
» sheaf of sacred herbs, beside which 
there were innumerable ornaments of a 
nondescript character. Shortly after we 
watered the arena a party of 20 or more 
began the beating of drums and chanting 
elprayers, which called into the ring two 
young men naked except the breech 
doth, ornamented with paint and 
feathers, each carrying in his hand a 
riosen bone whistles, ornamented, also, 
with feathers. These commenced danc­
ing, at the same time blowing a whistle 
and keeping their eyes fixed on the 
moon. Couple after couple joined in 
entil there were at least 50 in semi- 
eàrcular rows, dancing and whistling, now 
fret, no slow, the cadence of the whistles 
beeping time with the drums. Every 10 
or 15 minutes there was a brief pause, 
when the drums would stop and the 
dancers change whistles. This is the

DANCE OF THE MOON,’ /
and is an invocation to the gods. The 
only words our little interpreter could 
catch were: “Lord, we are praying to 
thee.” This was kept up until daylight. 
To give the reader a proper understand­
ing of the following ceremony that took 
place during the interval from daybreak 
■itil sunrise, I will preface by a word of 
explanation. When an Indian desires 
to steal a horse or a squaw, or be success- 
fid in any enterprise, he goes to the top 
ef the highest hill and there covenants 
with his gods to bestow upon him certain 
gifts, if he succeeds in his undertaking, 
fri be offered at the next annual festival. 
These offerings are thrown into the ring, 
and each Indian has the privilege of 
catching the gift if he can,he who catches 
being considered the favorite of the gods. 
Shortly after daylight began this offering. 
Pieces of wood, stones, and feathers ar- 

. tached to pebbles were thrown into the 
ring, each piece representing a horse, dog, 
gnn or other gift, the catcher calling upon 
the owner and receiving the property re­
presented. About 100 yards from the 
arena we were shown a large tepee, made 
of raw hides, within which were eight 
young braves preparing for

THE ORDEAL AND THE TORTURE.

Notwithstanding the intense heat, a 
fire was kept "up on the inside for the 
purpose of steaming up. The latter was 
done by heating rocks and pouring water 
upon them. This is the first step in the 
ordeal of torture. At sunrise they were 
led forth after having been subjected to a 
temperature of 100= for a period of 48 
hours, without food or water. When they 
eame to the gate of the inclosure they 
■prang into the ring, amid the yells of the 
assembled multitude. While the master 
ef ceremonies was getting ready, those 
wretches amused themselves by holding 
hot coals of fire on the backs of their 
hands, and now came the climax of hor­
rors. A big, half-naked and hideously 
painted savage rushed forward with a 
long gleaming knife and with lightning 
rapidity carved and raised the skin and 
musclés on the pectoral re don, while a 
half dozen others tied lariats to the de­
tached pieces of flesn. -The lariats were 

. 20 feet long, the distant end being at­
tached to the medicine tree in the centre 
of the ring. During this performance one 
poor wretch fainted dead away, and was 
carried oft" amid groans and hisses 

TO BE DRESSED AS A SQUAW,

as an evidence of humiliation and dis­
grace. The others stood with quivering 
Bmbs, hands clasped over heads and their

glassy eyes fixed on the glaring sun. At 
a given signal the drums began to beat 
and the chants to sound. Now the 
dancers began to move their bodies up 
and down, slowly at first, then faster and 
faster, pulling on the tethers, yelling with 
pain and excitement, the crowd joining in 
a pandemonium of howls and horror that 
no pen could even describe. At the end 
of the first hour two had broken loose, 
and were carried off amid the joyous 
shout of admiring friends. At the end of 
the second hour the friends^f a young 
brave of an unmentionable name, rushed 
in and tore him loose, carrying him off 
covered with blood and glory. Later a 
member of our party familiar with Indian 
character, concluding that it was better 
not to remain longer, as during the mad­
ness of their delirium at such times they 
will suddenly become possessed of a bad 
heart and strike the tomahawk into the 
brain of their best friend among the 
whites. This was, probably, the first time 
that so small a party of white men had 
ventured into so large a camp on such an 
occasion, without the protection of troops. 
When we left the camp it was reported 
that Litttle No Heart, the young buck 
who fainted in the ring, was dead.

Lsndlns of the Gnards.

The correspondent of the London 
Times writes from Alexandria as follows, 
under the date of August 13th, about the 
appearance T the guards :—Yesterday 
afternoon a battallion of the Scots Guards 
and another of tÿe Grenadiers moved out 
to Ramleh. At four in the afternoon 
the soldiers in the highest spirits at the 
prospect of escaping from the confin­
aient and heat of the crowded decks, 
were drawn up along the quay in full 
marching equipment, The men wore 
scarlet tunics, the Scdts white helmets, 
the Grenadiers light brown. Their water 
bottles were filled, their ammunition 
pouches and haversacks well stored. 
The dressing of the line was perfect, as 
Sir John Adye, Sir Archibald Alison, the 
Duke of Connaught, and others passed 
slowly down. The Duke looks brown 
and healthy, and is growing a beard. He 
wears long buff riding boots, and has ad­
opted a leather scabbard, which looks 
neat and servicable, and cannot blunt 
his sword. Sir John Adye assembled the 
officers round him, and uttered a few 
inspiring words, in the course of which, 
however, he reminded them that their 
enemy was determined and well armed. 
Then the band struck up ; 1,500 bayonets 
flashed - in the. sun ; the long column 
marched into the town. At the head 
rode the Prince. The route lay through 
ruined streets. Here and there a tur- 
baned head peeped from a window. At 
the comers were gathered scowling Arabs 
and women shrouded in wraps to the 
eyes. Half way down the Rue des Sœurs, 
the scene of the massacre, a bold crag 
jutted up, crowded with stately palm 
trees. In the pleasant shade a group of 
Arabs—men, women, and children— 
stood or reclined, their graceful attitude 
brought out clearly by the bright blue 
sky in the background. They were much 
startled and ' impressed by the six big­
chested pipers, who struct up together 
a wild Gaelic melody as they strode by 
before the Scots Guards. The Arab boys 
ran by the side of the pipers, grave, long- 
robed natives drew closer together, and 
certain excitible sailors on leave executed 
a hornpipe in the midst of the crowds. 
As the troops went through the great 
square, now marked out in piles of 
charred stone, the Europeans in the 
crowd expressed their admiration of the 
bearing and physique of the men. “What 
devils !” exclaimed a stout Italian in a 
tone of rapture to his friend. All was 
managed well at the railway station, 
except that places had been so nicely 
calculated for the Scots that your 
correspondent had to ride on the 
top of the guard’s brake. The 
train steamed slowly through an 
Arab village outside of the town, in 
which women shook their fists after us 
and boys shouted maledictions through 
the stone outwork put up by the French 
at the battle of Alexandria, on through 
groves of beautiful date palms that swept 
the carriage roofs, and drew.up finally be 
yond Ramleh. The force here disem­
barked and moved into tents by the side 
of the 40th ' Regiment ; the Grenadiers 
arriving later in the evening.

, About Kissing.

To seal a kiss, that’s fair.
To buy a kiss, that stupidity.
Two girls kissing, that’s waste.
To kiss another man, that’s nasty.
To not kiss at all, that's bad taste.
To kiss your sister, that’s necessity.
To kiss your wife, that’s punishment.
To kiss the baby, that’s unsatifactory.
To kiss an ugly woman, that’s courage.
To kiss the chambermaid, that’s dang­

erous.
To kiss the mother-in-law, that never 

happens.
To kiss the girl you are engaged to, 

that’s expected.
To kiss an old maiden aunt, that’s 

hypocrisy.
To kiss a blooming girl cousin, that’s 

-peaches and cream. *
To kiss another man’s young and 

beautiful wife, that’s nice, but naughty.
To kiss three girls the same evening, 

that beats a pair.
To kiss a pretty girl when her pa is 

watching, that raises you right over the 
fence. ' *

For Sale or to Rent.
Possession given immediately.

THE Bouse lately occupied by the subscriber, on 
Charlotte street.

For particulars enquire of _ ___
& H. PHILLIPS.

F'ton, Aug. 31—2ins.

Farm for Sale.
THE subscriber offers for sole his Farm, situated 

on the Pennine Stream, eight miles from Fred­
ericton , consisting of 550 acres, of which 150 acres 

are cultivated ana in good condition.
A house in fair conaitipn and a good barn on the 

premises.
Excellent pasturage and good watering facilities 

wVl be disposed of at a bargain.
r further particulars apply to Alex. McSorley 

tiioSon, or to the undersigned, on the premises.
JAMES McSORLEY.

Pennine, Aug 17—w 3ins

Notice.
fflHE New Brunswick Railway Company having 
l leased the Main Line of the New Brunswick 

and Canada Railroad Company "and theSt. Stephen, 
Woodstock and Heulton Branch Railways, hereby
S've notice that from and after this date the said.

ain Lino and Branches will be operated by the 
New Brunswick Railway Company, as lessees under 
style of “The New Brunswick Railway Company." 
Alfbkd'Skkly,

Secretary. ISAAC BURPEE,
Vice-President.

Gibson, Sept. 1—2w

OATS,
FEED, LIME & PLASTER.

For Sale Low.

W. E. MILLER & CO.’S 
Feed and Seed House,

QUEEN STREET, FREDERICTON, 
Opposite People’s Bank.

July 3,1882

Admistrator’s Notice.

NOTICE is hereby given that Letters of Adminis­
tration in the Estate of Lemuel G. Nason, late 

of Lincoln, Sunbury County, farmer, have been 
granted to the undersigned. All persons indebted 
to the said Estate are requested to make immediate 
payment to Messrs. Gregory & Blair, Solicitors, 
and all claims against the Estate may be presented, 
duly attested, three months from date.

Dated August 2nd, A. D. 1882.
ANDREW G. BLAIR, 

Administrator.
Fredericton, Augusts, 1882.

MUSIC. -
SEND for our new catalogue of 5-cent music and 

wholesale price list, which is the lowest. BAI­
LEY & CO., 615 Washington St., Boston, Mass. 

August 1».

Servant Wanted.
A PROTEST ANT GIRL, for General Housework, 

in a New Hampshire village, on the Railroad. 
A capable person, willing to work, who can furnish 

satisfactory references, and who will remain a year 
at least and work for $9.00 per month, where there 
are children, and where she will be kindly treated, 
may address REV. S. L. GEROULD, Goffstown, 
N. H., UnitedStates.

July 29,1882.

August 22, ’82.

*
Received, at

DEVER BROS/S
One Case of

IT nd er wear,
Ladies' and Children's sizes.

One Case of

MOOSE!,
20 DOZEN HOOP SKIRTS,

from 25 cents up.

25D0Z. RUBBER APRONS,
in all sizes.

/

At our usually low prices.

BEYER BROS
Fredericton, August 23

CHAS. H. STERLING,
(Successor to C. L. Esta^-rooks, Esq.) 

DEALER IN

FLOUR, MEAL, TEAS and GENERAL 
GROCERIES.

CONFECTIONERIES, SCHOOL BOOKS & 
STATIONERY. .

HARDWARE, GLASS and CROCKERY- 
WARE in great variety," TINWARE, &c.

OHAS. H. STERLING!,
ST. MARY’S FERRY, - - YORK CO

St Mary’s Ferry, Jane 1

notice:

HAVING sold my stock and trade to Mr. Chae.
H. Sterling, I beg leave to thank my friends 

for their liberal patronage bestowed upon me for 
the last twenty years, ana would ask for a continu­
ance of the same to my successor.

C. L. ESTABROOKS,
J une 1,1882.—w St. Mary’s Ferry.

GROUND
BONES,

Just Received and lor sale Low,

3 Tons Fine Ground Bones.
GEORGE T. WHELPLEY.

may 22,1882.

Arrived To-day.
rnwo new Cabinet Organs, 8 and 10 stops ; splen- 

did finish. First class music and verycncap 
for cash or on the instalment plan, at

LEMONT’S House Furnishing Store.
Aug 17

MATTRESSES.

LARGE lot of Wool, Excelsior and Husk Mat-
. tresses at 

August 3
LEMONT’S Variety Store.

LADIES,

DON’T bother with paper and paste, when you 
can buy Self-Scaling Air Tight Fruit Jars so 

cheap at
LEMONT’S'Variety Store

August 3

EXECUTORS NOTICE.
ALL persons having claims against George 

Hallett, Trader, late of Millville, York County, 
New Brunswick, deceased, are hereby notified to 

present the same to the undersigned within three 
calender months, and all parties indebted to said 
estate are required to make immediate payment to 

JOHN HALLETT,
' G. F. KNOX,

Millville, June 1—w tf Executors.

CLARKE, KERR & THORNE,
ST. JOHN, N. B.

We have added to onr stock during April :

354 Packages Hardware, Ac.. 
337 Bundles Hardware, Ac.,

And offer to Wholesale Buyers a most complete 
• assortment of

V

English, American, Foreign and "
HARDWARE, CUTLERY, 

FANCY GOODS, Etc.

Merchants visiting St. John are cordially invited to 
inspect our

‘SAMPLE ROOM.” ,

40 OASES
Rubber Boots 

and Shoes
lately received at

LOTTIMER’S
Fashion tie Shoe Store.
In Ladies’ G Aits’ Misses’ Boy’s and Child­

ren’s sizes.
Fredericton. MaJch 30.1882.

Seeds and Fertilizers.
The Subscriber has on hand, which he offers for 

sale at the lowest cash prices :
Lime,

Land Plaster,.
Bradley’s Superphospates,

Timothy Seed,
Clover Seed,

Alaska Seed,
White Fyfe Seed Wheat, 

Seed Peas,
Silver Hull Seed Buckwheat, 

Buckwheat Rough Seed,
Black P. E. I. Seed Oats,

White Russian Seed Oats, 
English, Portland and Newark Cements, 

Hay, Straw, Oats, Heavy Feed, Bran 
and Feeding Oats.

Office and Warehouse Campbell Street, above 
City Hall.

JAMES TIBBITS.
May 4,1882.

CABBAGE. CUCUMBER,
LETTUCE, CARROT,
BEET, RADISH,
SAGE, SWEET MARJORAM,
PUMPKIN, SQUASH,
TURNIP, ONION,
Of all varieties, put up by Jardink & Co.

TftlOTHY, RED and ALSIKE CLOVER 
SEED.

SUPERPHOSPHATE.
18Tons Cumberland, Bradley and Neeley’s Super­

phosphates at
G. T. WHELPLEY’S, 

Under the Barker House. 
May 10—Farmer 3 ins.

We are prepared to give satis­
faction to all who patronize us.

Clarke, Kerr & Thorne,
PRINCE WILLIAM STREE T. 

St. John, N. B.
St, John, May 4—w 2 mos

British House,
WILMOT’S BLOCK

CARPETS, CARPETS,
CARPETS.

Brusels,
Tapestry,

Wool,
Union,

Hemp,
Hearth Rags, Door Mats and Sheepskin Mats.

JOHN MCDONALD
QUEEN STREET.

BALOON FLY TRAPS 
June 24 at JAMES S. NEILL’S.

WHEN YOU WANT TO BUY

Boots and Shoes
in Fredericton, don’t forget that

À. LOTTIMER
Has Removed

HIS CELEBRATED

SHOE STOEE
to the Store in

Machum’s Brick Building,

Next door below Dover Bros.’ 
Dry Goods Etabllsbnient,

And just 5 Doors above his Old 
Stand,

NEARLY OPPOSITE THE NORMAL 
SCHOOL BUILDING,

QUEEN STREET, FREDERRICTON 
F’ton, May 4,1882.

Just received direct from the Manufactory

TWO UPERIOR CABINET ORGNS.
WILCOX & WHITE, MAKERS.

Which will be sold cheap for cash or approved 
paper.

12-17-81
JOHN RICHARDS & SON.

Gray’s Specific Medicine.
YflADE MARK The Great ENG-rRADE MARK 

lish Remedy.
An unfailing 
cure for Seminal 
Weakness, Sper­
matorrhea, Iin- 
potency, and all 
Diseases that fol­
low as a sequence 
of Self-Abuse; as* 
loss of Memory,

BEFORE (Atme. Universal Lassi- AFTER TAKffC- 
tnde, Pain in the Back, Dimness of Vision, Pre­
mature Old Age, and many other diseases that lead 
tolnsanity or Consumption and a Premature Grave.

Full particulars in our pamphlet, which wc 
desire to send free by mail to everyone. îfë^Tho 
Specific Medicine is sold by all druggists at $1 per 
package, or six packages for $5, or will be sent free 
by mail on receipt of money by addressing

THE GRAY MEDICINE CO.,
Toronto, Ont., Canada.

NAILS. NAILS.

J~UST received and in stock 200 kegs Nails. For 
sale at less than factory prices.

mav 26 %. R. EVERETT.

A. L. BLYEA,
ATTORNEY-AT-LAW, CONVEYANCER, k, h
Agent for the Agncnltnral Insnranco Company, of Water- 

town, N. Y.
Accounts collected. Loans negotiated. 

OFFICE-COR QUEEN &CARLET0N STREETS, 
Opposite new Post Office,

FREDERICTON, N. B.
May 11.—w 3 mos '

GREGORY & BLAIR,

BARRISTERS AND ATTORNEY $ 
AT-LAW.

NOTARIES PUBLIC,

FREDERICTON.

GEO. P. GRKGO ANDREW G. BLAIR

GIBSON LEATHER 00.,
Manufacturers of all descriptions of

Patent % Enamelled Leathers
FOR SHOE & CARRIAGE PURPOSES.

—ALSO—

WAXED,SPLITS

HARNESS AND UPHOLSTERING LEATHER.
GIBSON, N. B., (Opposte Fredericton.)

Landing per Rail this week another cargo of

SUPERIOR SOF COAL,
For sale cheap from cars or shed.

JOHN RICHARDS & SON.
12-17-11

A. F. Randolph,
IMPORTER & WHOLESALE DEALER IS

FLOUR, COBXMK jL. PORK, 
Sugar,Molasses, Tea, Act

Corner Queen Street & Phœxix Square

FREDERICTON, N. B.
dec5

g WALNUT SIDEBOARDS;

NICE Walnut Book Case ;

EBONIZED Lady's Secretary ;

LARGE lot of Wialnut Centre Tables;

Q1 A BEDSTEADS, various kinds, for 
s&WJ sale at

LEMONT’S House Furnishing Store. 
June 28

New Brunswick

RAILWAY CQMPANY.
SUMMER TIME TABLE.

BEGINNING MONDAY, July 24th, Trains will 
run as follows :

sir I if Psssenger Train leaves Woodstock 9.ID A. M. for Gibson,
I c A n U Passenger Train leaves Gibson for 
l.DO I. M. Wooodstock, Fort Fairfield, Cari­
boo. Presque Isle, Grand Falls and Edmundston.
0 EC I) VI Passenger Train leaves Wqodstocl^ti O.DD 1. M. forFortFairfield,Cariboo,Presqu3H| 
Isle, Grand Falls and Edmundston. “V
E oft I VI Passenger Train leaves Presque Isle 
O.uU A. Al. for Woodstock, Gibson, Grand 
Falls and Edmundston.
IMS 11 Passenger Train leaves Edmundston 
I.UV I. Al, for Woodstock, Presque Isle and 
Gibson.
«(Ill 1 11 MixedTrain leaves Grand Falls for 
D-Uu A, Al. Woodstock and Gibson.
n on 1 ll Mixed Train leaves Gibson for Wood- 
i.uv A, Al. stock and points North.

1 10 P M Mixed Train leaves Woodstock Ifor

Train going north of Aroostook arrives at Grand 
Falls 8.30 p.m., where passengers tor St. Leonards 
and Edmundston remain until 9.00 a. m. next 
morning. Passengers from Edmundston for points 
south of Aroostook remain at Grand Palls until 
6.00 a. m. next morning. „ ,

Freight Trains will run daily between all stations, 
leaving Gibson 7.20 a. in., Woodstock 11.15a.m., 
Presque Isle 6.00 a. m. . . _ .

Immediate connection is made at Woodstock 
with trains of the New Brunswick & Canada Rail­
way to and from Boston, Portland, Bangor, St. 
Stephen, St. Andrews, St. John and all points 
East, West and South, and at Fredenoton with 
trains to and from St. John, and with Union Line
Steamboats. „ , , ___

Freight to be forwarded from Gibson by the 6.00 
a. m. Train must be delivered at the Freight House 
at or before 4.00 p. m., the previous day.

Return Tickets for one and one-half of the regular 
fare for sale at all Ticket Offices.

Tickets for sale in St. Johiwat St, John & Maine 
Railway Ticket Office; by H. Chubb & Co., and by 
the Union Line Steam boats at their Office and on 
the boats. ALFRED SEELY,
A. J. Miles, Assist Superintendent

Master of Transportation.
- Gibson. July24,1882. 1

HAYING TOOLS FOR 1882.

JUST received and in stock a full line of Haying 
Tools from the American and Canadian Manu­

facturers direct, and for sale Wholesale and Retai 
by

JAMES S. NEILL.
100 doz Canadian and American Scythe Snatbsl 
90 “ “ H Scythes:
60 44 44 44 Hay Forks;

30 0 44 44 44 Hay Rakes;
40 41 Hay Fork Handles;
85 boxes Scythe Stones ;
10 tons Grindstones daily expected ;
2 doz Bush Scythes ;
3 44 Grain Scythes ;

12 44 Reaping Hooks.
Wholesale customers solicited, as I can com­

pete with any house in the Maritime Provinces. 
June 30

Cooper&Pinder7
Carriage & Sleigh Makers,

KING STREET, - - - NEAR YORK 

FREDERICTON N. B

This is the best place in the city to buy 

SLEIGHS, BUNGS and SLEDS

REPAIRING A SPECIALTY.
If you want a "’’rst Class Sleigh this 

winter leave in your order early.

First Come First Served.

We guarantee to give satisfaction in all 
cases 

dec5

FISH.
JUST RECEIVED A LOT OF SUPERIOR

Salt Shad and Herrings,
In half barrels. For salo low.

ALSO ALWAYS ON HAND 

A good assortment of

FRESH SMOKED PICKLED, ADD DRY AND CANNED FISH,
Frozen Salmon and Sea Shad a specialty.

Orders promptly attended to and delivered in the 
city free of charge.

THEODOR P. NOBLE,
Basement City Hall.

F’ton, Aug 31,1882.—difcw

ALABASTÏNB.
A Natural Material for finishing 

Walls, Ceilings,
ROUGH PLASTER, NEW SMOOTH SAND FIN­

ISH, A SOILED HARD FINISH7 PAINT­
ED WALLS, WOOD CEILINGS, WALL 

PAPER,-BRICK, ROUGH BOARDS, 
CANVAS, Etc., Etc.

Superior to Kalsomine.
READY FOR USE BY ADDING HOT WATER. 

CAN BE MIXËÏTbY ANY ONE.

Any Housekeeper can Apply it without the aid al 
Skilled Labor. -

A 1 a bus t i n <- Is a Valuable 
Discovery.

It constitutes a permanent finish for Walls, 
assimilating with the plaster, and' will xot nvn 
OFF. H does not deteriorate by age ; in this re­
spect it is unlike all other preparations of a similar 
character. Alabastixk is a disinfectant, and ren- 
ders apartments healthful. Cracks iu the Walls 
can be filled by mixing the Alabastixk thick, which 
cannot bo done with Kalsomine.

Five pounds of Alabastixk will cover 50 square 
yards, or 4o0 square feet, two coats.

Have just received direct from New York sixteen 
cases of the above, comprising Thirteen Different Shades.

For sale Wholesale and Retail bv
„ JAMES S, NEILL.F ton, April 5

BURNERS.

1 oil UAMP Burners, very low at wholesale, at 
August 3 LEMONT’S Variety Store,

00 IN THE SHADE.

KEEP your rooms dark and cool, by buying the 
hxcelsior Vt mdow bhades at 

Augusts LEMONT’S Variety Store.

PARIS GREEN AND LONDON PURPLE. 

Just received:
200 Y’lrraFe’^y tirccn; 1 bartel London Purple. 

Ju,y8 JAMES S. NEILL. .

■

HORSE POKES. j

6 *For side bv ^>°*te9' n*ce article and cheap.

JAMES S. NEILL.

I
July 8

4*4
'h

1 V ir-au- J
r^.-s

1
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LOCAL NEWS.

%

Police News.—Mrs. Jane E. McIntosh was 
fined $50 Thursday for selling liquor to two 
boys.

Basket Picnic.—The residents of Gibson 
had a basket picnic on “sunny bank,” Sat­
urday, and passed a pleasant afternoon.

THE BAPTI8J CHURCH.
LAYING OF THE CORNER STONE—AN INTERESTING | 

CEREMONY.

in the day to a very great audience, and im­
mersed six persons, and Mr. Estabrooks in the 
evening, both with great freedom. It is my 
earnest prayer that the place may be taken ;

. and not only mine,but all Prince Emmanuel's 
Yesterday morning at 10 o clock the subjects, are continually at the Throne of 

comer st- ne of the new Baptist Church in His grace, that Fredericton might be taken 
this city was laid. The day was auspi- from the Prince ef darkness ; and some have 
cious, the heat of the sunÿ rays being faith that it will. The day that Mr. Harding

Methodist Chcrch.—Rev. Dr. Sprague I tempered by light clouds. A large nunv | preached there were jbut five that attended
will arrive in the city on Thursday and her of persons gathered to participate in
will preach in the church here on Sunday | the ceremonies, which we may say were

carried out with singularly good taste.evening next.

Building Note.—D. Babbit has purchased 
a lot of land at Gibson, adjoining his mill, 
from Henry Gill, and proposes to erect a 
dwelling there.

the church since. The next Sunday Mr. 
Crandall was there, the soldiers were all 
ordered to attend the Church service and not 
to go to meeting, which was very much 

There were present upon the platform ! against the poor soldiers’ wish. The next or 
erected for the occasion the pastor of the following Sabbath Mr. Crandall preached at 
church, Rev. F. D. Crawley, Rev. Mr. the lower village, and Mr. Harding at Prince 
Mowatt, of the Presbyterian Church, Rev. I William. • • *”
Jos. McLeod, of the Free Baptish Church, 
and Rev. Mr. Wadman, of the Methodist 
Church. An efficient choir, led by M. S.

Enlarged.—The Gleaner comes to us en­
larged in size. It is now as large as the
Daily Herald. It will be published weekly I Hall, were also present, Miss Guiou acting 
for one dollar per year. as organist. Punctually at the hour ap­

pointed His Honor Judge Steadman an 
nounced that the exercises would begin

This immersion of six persons in 1802 was 
one of the earliest baptisms performed in 
Fredericton. The very first case, as far as is 
known, was the baptism of two or three 
colored persons, in the year 1792, by David 
George, a colored evangelist,from Shelburne, 
N. S. A very interesting account of the 
career of this remarkaole man is to be found

For England.—Sergt. W. Robinson, R.
M., of this city has been ordered to join his 
regiment, the Royal Artillery, and will leave by the choir chanting the 84th Psalm, in Dr. Bill's “Fifty years with the Baptists,” 
here in n few flox-a for F.mria„a I Rev. Mr. Crawley read from the Scriptures I taken from Benedict’s “ History of the Bap-

as follows- I tist9-” I1 appears that he visited Frederic
Property Sale.—H. G. Wetmore sold at I Q0d be merciful unto us, and bless us, and 

Auction Thursday, the Kirlin property, caa3e His face to shine upon us. That Tin- 
Queen street, occupied by Howard & Crangle way may be known upon earth, Thy savintr 
as a Billiard salron, to Mr. John Moore, for | health among all nations. Let the peopl
$2,000.

Spanish Students --The music-loving 
citizens of Fredericton will be sorry to learn 
that the Spanish Students have cancelled 
their engagement at Fredericton for the 
present.

praise Thee, O God, let all the people praise 
Thee. O let the nations be glad and sine 
for joy ; for Thou shall judge the people 
righteously, and govern the nations upon the 
earth. Let the people praise Thee, O God. 
let all the people praise Thee. Then shall 
the earth yield her increase, and God even 
our own God, shall bless us. God shall bless 
us ; and all the ends of the earth shall feai

Baptist Seminary.—The Visitor in a vig­
orous article calls on the “whole constituency 
of the Convention to rally and wipe out our I him.
debt and raise the means to equip our Baptist I will sing of the mercies of the Lord lor 
Seminary.” ever : with my mouth will I make known

CRICKKT.-Tbe Halifax Chronicle says the Thy faithfulness to all generations For I 
Fredericton cricket club was unable to get haTe said, mercy shall be built up forever 
a good eleven together to meet the Lome Thy faithfulness shalt Thou establish i, the 
club, of Halifax, at St. John, and the pro- I veiy heavens.
posed match is off.

Tea Meeting.—The tea meeting at Lincoln 
was a complete success. Quite a large party 
went down from the city. They returned 
about 10.30 p.m. The Fredericton Brass 
Band was in attendance.

Baptist S. S. Picnic.—The Baptist Sunday 
School had a fine day for their picnic at the 
Hermitage Thursday, and the children 
enjoyed themselves immensely rambling 
through that classic locality.

Political.—G. Rix Price publishes his 
card for the vacant seat in King's County. 
He comes out squarely in opposition, and ex­
presses his willingness to submit to the de­
cision of a convention if one is held.

Praise waiteth for Thee, O God, inSion : 
and nnto Thee _shall the vow be performed 
O Thou that hearest prayer, unto Thee shall 
all flesh come. Blessed is the man whom 
Thou choosest, and causest to approach mitt 
Thee, that he may dwell in Thy courts : tve 
we shall be satisfied with the goodness o 
Thy house, even of Thy holy temple.

One thing have I desired of the Lord, that 
will I seek after ; that I may dwell in the 
house of the Lord all the days of my life, to 
behold the beauty of the Lord, and to in­
quire in His temple.

Lord, Thou hast been our dwelleing place 
in all generations. Before the mountains 
were brought forth, or even thou hadst form­
ed the earth and the world, even from ever­
lasting to everlasting, Thou art God.- O 
satisfy us early with Thy mercy ; that we 
may rejoice to be glad all our days ; make 
us glad according to the days in which thou 
hast afflicted us, and the years wherein we 
have seen evil. Let they work appear nnto 
they servants, and they glory unto nheir

W. C. T. U.—The regular weekly meet­
ings of the Woman’s Christian Temperance 
Union, which have been discontinued during 
the hot season, was commenced on Wed­
nesday afternoon, Sept. 6th, at four o'clock, I children, and let the beauty of the Lord our 
in club house parlor. God be upon us,and establish Thou the work

of our hands upon us : yea, the work of our 
Returned.—Messrs. R. Bellamy and W. T. hands, establish thou it.

Whitehead, have returned from their ex- The large audience remaining with un 
ploratory survey of the timber land upon the covered heads during this and the sub- 
North-west Branch of the St. John Biver- sequent proceedings. Rev. Mr. McLeod 
We understand that they report very favora- tben engage(j jn prayer, alter which 
blv upon the country.• 1 - MR. CRAWLEY

Bazaar,—The ladies of the St. Mary’s made a short but_ very touching address, 
sewing circle intend holding a bazaar on the He spoke of the infrequency of such
13th inst., on the green fronting Rev. Wm 
Jaffrey’s residence. The proceeds are to go 
towards building a public hall midway 
tween St. Mary's and Gibson.

Cottage for Sale.—Any person who 
desires to purchase a well-built commodious 
cottage in Gibson, with U acres of land at­
tached, and a good barn and outbuildings. 
Should enquire at the herald office. Terms 
reasonable and possession given immediatly.

That Bangor Sensation. Wc do 
think there is any truth in the report

occasions as the present, and of the 
general interest which centered around

ton in July of the above named year, and 
obtained from the Lieutenant-Governor a 
license, signed by Jonathan Odell, secretary, 
granting him permission “to instruct the 
black people in the knowledge, and exhort 
them to the practice, of the Christian reli­
gion.” Later in the same year he visited 
this place again, for the purpose of batizing 
three of the people. He says in his own nar­
rative : “ Two brethern took me to Frederick 
town in a boat. I baptized on the Lord's 
Day, «bout 12 o’clock; a great number of 
people attended. The Governor said he was 
sorry he could not come down and see it ; 
but he had a great deal,of company that day, 
which also hindered one of his servants from 
being baptized.”

It was not till 1813 that a movement was 
made toward the organization of a Baptist 
Church in Fredericton. In the old record book 
of “the Baptist Church sojourning at Water- 
borough and adjacent villages," the follow­
ing entry occurs under date of December25th, 
1813 : “ Our beloved brothers and sisters in
Christ, William Wilmot, Ebenezer Esta­
brooks, John Marsh, Theophilus Ring, Han­
nah Cromwell, Olive Ring, Deborah Hartt 
(wife of Alline Hartt), desired their dismis­
sion in order to form a Baptist Church in 
Fredericton, which was granted.” On the 
1st of January, 1814, these two persons with 
Amasa Coy, Ann Fraser and Robert Fraser, 
met together at the house of Jarvis Ring, and 
were formed into a church by Rev. Elijah 
Estabrooks, pastor of the mother church at 
Canning or Waterboro, who for some years 
took the pastoral charge of the new chnrch 
as well. The first deacons of the chnrch 
were William Wilmot (father of the late 
Judge Wilmot), Jarvis Ring and Amasa Coy.

A meeting-house was already in course of 
erection, several of the brethren just named 
having boldly undertaken to commence the 
building, when they had only £75 in hand 
for the purpose. They were strong in faith 
and earnest,in works, and by the next June 
(1814), the house was completed, “at a cost 
of £653, and all paid but £90.” That build 
ing stood on the north side of King street, 
below Regent steeet, where a three-storied 
wooden tenement house now stands. There 
the little Church worshipped for more than 
a quarter of a century, during which time 
nearly 120 persons were added by baptism, 
anti the actual -membership increased to 
ninety-two.

In the early times there were many diffi­
culties against which the feeble band had to 
struggle. Destitute of a regular pastor for

them, which was confined not simply to seTeraj years, they enjoyed the occasional 
those present, but wns shared in by ministrations of Elders Robert Scott, L. Ham- 
many who though absent were present in mond, E. Estabrooks and Duncan Dunbar, 
spirit. He leferred to thq cloud of in- In 1820, Rev. Theodore S. Harding became 
visible witnesses which surrounded us, pastor of the church, and so continued for
and in well chosen words spoke of those 
who in years gone by and others who 
within a few months had passed away 
from the church militunt to the church |

two or three years, but was only able to visit 
them occasionally'. During that time, and 
down to 1831, the pulpit was supplied with 

arying regularity by Elders D. Dunbar, R. 
Scott, David James, David Harris, Charles 

GeorgcTe'e Jr",has confessed to the murder I triumphant. He said that the laying oi I Tupper, jonatiian Davis, Thos Magee, F. W. 
of a man near Bangor. His name has. how- the Corner Stone of a church was à re- Miles, and Robert Davis, of whom Charles 
ever been connected with such a crime, presentative and symbolic act, and he Tupper held the pastorate for a time in 1825, 
which is probably the foundation of the re- spoke of the future work of the church David Harris from 1826 to 1829, and Robert 
port. ____ and the probability that the Gospel of Davis in the latter part of 1830. For two or

Giuson Leather Co. Picnic.—Over two Christ might go forth from the walis, three years following, there "”lsno BfipUst 
u on . , . . . , , .. . ., - preaching here except when Father Josephhundred dollars were taken m by the Gibson SOOn to be reared, “even unto the ends £randaUBwag able tu vigit the placej and for

Leather Co. employees at their picnic, over 0j the earth.” 
and above expenses. It is intended to ap-| MR. H. c. creed, a. m.,
propriété the amount to some purpose in 
connection with the Gibson Methodist 
Church. ______ ________

Not bad in its way.—There is running 
through the newspapers an ad. of a certain 
medicine used by the wife of a certain news­
paper man with good effect. This did not 
strike many people as a joke, until they saw 
it next ^bove the notice of the marriage of 
the newspaper man to his second wife.

The Crops.—Where the frost has not done 
damage the crops are excellent. Wheat is 
said never to have been better. The hay crop 
has been got in in excellent shape. Oats are 
above average, and potatoes will give an 
abundant yield. The season-opened un- 
favcranly but has proved on the whole all 
that can be desired.

Forest Fires.—Immense forest fires have 
been raging on the Miramichi River, near 
McICiel Brook, on the R R Co's lands.
Great anxiety was felt for the safety of the 
lumbemen’s supplies stored there, and re­
gret for the valuable lumber destroyed. The
tires were caused by fishermen leaving their
camp fires burning.—Ex

Not many changes.—A Herald represen­
tative asked a high official of the N B 
Railway Thursday, if he had anything to 
tell the public respecting the effect of the 
new arrangements, particularly as respects 
contemplated* changes in the location of 
officers and works. The reply was “no ; 
but there will probably not be many 
changes.” _____________

Church News.—Bishop Medley has recently 
^■n visiting the churches in St. Stephen, 
l^fcnd Manan, Campobello, St. Andrews, St. 

George, etc., holding confirmations, conse­
crating churches, 
Episcopal functions.

and performing other 
I)r..Kingdon has been

doing the same in Peters ville, Welsford, Oak
Point, Plackville, Derby, Chatham, Sussex, 
Springfield, Gagetown, etc.

then read the following :—
BRIEF HISTORICAL SKETCH OF THE 

BAPTIST CHURCH IN FREDERICTON.
Existing records supply but little informa­

tion respecting the early history of the Baptist 
community in this town. The records of the 
Church have been preserved continuously for 
some fifty-one years past, but previous to 
that period wc have-only the briefest memo­
randa of the monthly Conference meetings, 
giving the names of members received and 
dismissed from time to time. A few additional 
facts have been gleaned from old letters and 
other sources.

From a letter written by Zebulon Estey 
Esq., grandfather of the late William S. 
Estey, dated at Gagetown, the 10th of March, 
1802, a glimpse is obtained of the condition 
of things eighty years ago. The letter is ad­
dressed to the Rev. James Manning, a Baptist 
minister at Lower Granville, Annapolis Co., 
Nova Scotia. It speaks of the earnest and 
successful labors of Rev. Theodore S. Hard 
ing, (commonly known as Father Harding,) 
“in almost eyery part of this Province,” and 
narrates the circumstances of an ordination 
at Long Island, Queen's County, in which 
“the Rev. Sirs, Messrs. Harding, Estabrooks, 
Crandall and Harris” took part. The writer 
says ; “A good many from the Long Reach', 
some from St. John and some from St. Ann’s 
were present.” He coutinues as follows : 
“The Sunday after the ordination, Mr. Elijah 
Estabrooks held a meeting at Fredericton 
The meeting was held in the Play House ; for 
Mr. Akcrman had converted the Play House 
into a meeting house for the Baptist ministers 
to preach in.” [The house referred to was 
situated on Waterloo Row, at or near the 
residence of George J. Bliss, Esq.] “You 
may depend, sir. that Prince Emmanuel’s 
ministers had hlowed the Gospel trumpet 
so effectual in Fredericton, that ear-gate is 
open ; some of the grandees begin to listen, 
and others to threaten. Mr. Harding preacliel

a year or two longer the chnrch enjoyed only 
occasional visits from ministers, among 
whom were Timothy Robinson, Richard Mc­
Lean, T.FS. Harding, Samuel Robinson and 
Thomas Magee.

In 1834, Rev. Frederick W. Miles was call­
ed to the pastorate, which position he occu­
pied until his death. For nearly three years 
(1835-1838), he was also Principal of the 
Fredericton Seminary, the cstablishmen or 
which was largely due to his suggestions 
and his energetic efforts. Compelled by ill- 
health to resign his office as Principal, and 
to desist from ministerial labors, his place in 
both capacities was supplied for a time by 
Rev. Charles Tupper, father of Sir Charles. 
This was in 1838-39. Mr. Miles then resumed 
his duties ; but it was only a few months be­
fore he found that his working-days were 
ended. He died, universally lamented, early 
in 1842, in the thirty-seventh year of his age.

Previous to this, however, an important 
event had taken place in the history of the 
Fredericton church. A new house of worship 
had been built,—that which, with its altera­
tions and additions, was destroyed by fire on 
this spot, on the 8th of August last.

It was in the summer of 1838 that a com­
mittee, consisting of Messrs. John T. Smith, 
Asa Coy, J. G. Harding, Zebulon Currie and 
Z. G. Gabel, was appointed to superintend 
the erection of a new meeting-house. Ad­
vertisements for tenders were published in 
October in the Royal Garette, Sentinel and 
Courier. Five tenders were received, at 
sums ranging from £2050 to £2399; but the 
committee decided that the highest amount 
they were willing to pay for the erection ot 
the building according to the plan and 
specifications was £1750. These terms were 
subsequently accepted by Mr. William 
Morgan, whose tender was the lowest, and 
the contract was accorâingly made with 
him. The whole building was to be finished 
inside and out, on or before the 10th of June 
1840. It a'ppears fromthe records however, 
that ti e work was not entirely completed

till some months later, and the total amount 
paid the contractor, including extras, was 
about £1903. The old meeting-house was 
sold for £177, after the pulpit and pews had 
been removed and placed in the basement 
or vestry ot the new one, where they re­
mained in use until 1862.

The new edifice, which presented a hand­
some appearance, was opened for public 
worship on Sunday the 8th of November, 
1840, on which occasion a dedication" 
was preached by Rev. J. E. Bill, from the 
words in Haggai 2: 9,—“The glory of this 
latter house shall be greater than of the 
former, saith the Lord of hosts; and in this 
place will I give peace, saith the Lord of 
hosts.” The house is said to have been 
crowded, above and below, and a deep im­
pression was made npon the people:

In the early part of that year, Rev. W. H. 
Beckwith had spent a month or two with 
the church, and as a result of his labors a 
religious revival took piace, and some 
twenty-three persons were baptized. In the 
autumn, Rev. I. E. Bill was engaged 
pastor for one year, and commenced his labor 
on the first of November. The revival in­
fluence continued and increased under his 
ministry, so that before the month of June 
following, more than sixty persons had been 
added to the church by baptism. Mr. Bill 
remained in Fredericton for a year longer 
and had the satisfaction of baptizing nine 
others, making more than ninety baptisms 
in two years,—the largest number in an 
equal time in the history of the church.

After Mr. Bill’s retirement, in 1842 and 1843, 
the Chnrch enjoyed the occasional ministra­
tions of Rev. Charles Tupper and Rev. Wm. 
Hall, the latter of whom became their pastor 
in May, 1843, but removed in September of 
the next year. Then Rev. Charles Spurden, 
who had come from England to take charge 
of the Fredericton Seminary, was engaged to 
speak once each Sunday, until a regular 
pastor could be obtained. This was ac­
complished in November, 1845, when Samuel 
Elder accepted a call to the pastorate, and 
was ordained to the ministry of the gospel. 
After nearly' six years of faithful service, in* 
terupted for a time by severe illness, Mr. 
Elder was obliged to give up his charge, in 
order to visit the United States for the 
benefit of his health. It was of no avail, 
however, for he died within a few weeks, in 
the city of Philadelphia, May 23, 1852. Then 
followed the pastorate of Rev. J. D. Casewell, 
from October. 1852, to March, 1854. After 
being without a pastor for more than a year, 
the church engaged Rev. George Seely, who 
remained one year only, during which time 
about forty persons were received into the 
church by baptism. Then followed another 
year'dnring which there was no regular 
pastor, but Rev C Spurden and others sup- 
pied the pulpit. In June, 1857, Rev. H. P. 
Guilford accepted the church’s invatation to 
the the pastoral office. His labors, assisted 
by Rev.'A. B. Earle, the Evangelist, resulted 
in the addition about twenty-three persons 
by baptism. He resigned his position in 
November, in order to take the editorial 
charge of the Christian Visitor. This left 
the church again pastorless, and it was 
not till August 1860, than the vacancy was 
filled by the choice ifRpv. J. C. Hurd A. M.
In the mean time the church was supplied 
with preaching by visiting ministers, includ­
ing Revs E. N. Harris, E. Dewhurst, P. Todd,
J. Blackcney, A D Thompson, P Reese, J E 
Bill, Jno. Rounds and others, and by 
Brethren C Spurden and G E Day of tbs 
the Seminarv. The number of members re­
ported by this church to the association in 
1860 was 137. The deacons at that time 
were Wm S Esty (who had than served as 
such for thirty years, and who continued in 
the office till his death, twenty-one years 
later, in 1881), Asa Coy (who served about 
years), J C Watson, John P Smith, John L 
Haines, Wm Sewell and John Guiou.

Dr. Hnrd was pastor for seven years, with 
an interval of about eighteen months, (1864- 
66) during which he was absentin the United 
States, having; resigned his connection with 
the church and returned to it again. In the 
interim the pulpit was supplied by Rev. C. 
Spurden, D. D., and Mr. J. E. Hopper, licen­
tiate, both teachers in the Seminary, and 
others occasionally. During the whole pas­
torate of Dr. Hurd, nearly fifty persons were 
baptized, twenty of them by Dr. Spurden.

In August, 1867 Dr. Hurd’s resignation of 
the pastorate was accepted. On the 23rd ot 
September a new Baptist church was organ­
ized in the city, called the Queen Street 
Church, composed at first of fourteen persons 
who had been members of churches elsewhere 
and at the same time Prot. J. E. Hopper, A 
B., one of its members, was ordained to the 
ministry. In October seventeen members oi 
the old church were admitted at their own 
request and united with the new organization 

Dr Spurden was then engaged as pastor oi 
the old church, and filled that position most 
accepablv until May, 1869, when, after pro­
tracted negotiations, the two churches were 
happily re-enited, coming together by agree­
ment without pastors or other officers. A 
year elapsed before a pastor was secured, 
during which time the pulpit was occupied by 
Revds J E Hopper, Dr Hurd, D W Crandall, 
Dr Spurden, A Estabrooks, and others during 
the first three or four months, Calvin Gooe- 
specd, Principal of the Seminary, for several 
months, Elder Jacob Knapp for a fortnight 
in 1870, and J W Manning for ten weeks in 
the summer. In the revival that took place 
under the labors of Mr- Goodspeed and Elder 
Knapp, thirty-four persons professed conver­
sion and were baptized.

The next regular pastorate, and the longest 
in the history of the church, was that of Rev. 
Theodore II. Porter, which began here in 
November, 1870. Th£ number of members 
reported that year was 195, which number 
was increased during Mr. Porter’s pastorate, 
by the addition of about two hundred 
members, 122 of whom were added by bap­
tism. Of these lie himself baptized 79, in 
the year 1875 alone, sixty-nine persons were 
baptized in connection with this chnrch. The 
losses by death, removal, etc., during the 
same period, amounted to over eighty.

It is needless to do more than mention the 
leading events and changes of the past ten 
years. Most of the members of the church 
here present to-day will have fresh in their 
memory the years of impaired health of their 
beloved pastor, Ilro. Porter, hislong absence 
in quest of health, first in the South and then 
on the Pacific const,—the admirable service 
rendered by Dr. Spurden as co-pastor in 1875 
the failing hcalth of that good mar,, and his

death in January, 1876,—the induction into 
the pastorate of Rev. A J. Stevens in 1876, 
when the stalwart young man of God was 
so touchingly welcomed by the retired pastor, 
weak in body but strong in heart and voice, 
the earnest, hearty service done by Mr. 
Stevens,—his early, much lamented death 
in March, 1880,—the coming of our present 
esteemed pastor a few months later : all this 
we can vividly recall to-day. Of other 
events in the history of the church since the 
union, I may just mention the adoption of 
the principle of free seats in 1869, the ad­
option of the annual eleetion of office-bearers 
in the same year and its abolition in 1871, 
the adoption of the “weekly offering” system 
of raising money for church purposes in the 
same year, the building of the Parnonage in 
1872-3, the improvements made in the 
audience room of the church in 1878, inclur 
ding the removal of the pulpit and the square 
pews,—the famous bazaar at which $1100 
were raised (clear of expenses),-the adoption 
of allotment of sittings in 1878, and of the 
contention plan of denominational benefi­
cence in 1879,—the religious revival of 1880, 
under D. L. Chubbuck, evangelist, the re­
novation and enlargement of the house of 
worship in 1881, and its distrnction by fire 
in March of (he present year.

It may be wed to mention the fact that 
Baptist Associations have met with this 
church seven times, first in 1817, and last in 
1872, and the Baptist Convention of the Mari­
time Provinces three times, in 1848, 1870 and 
1878.

The church, previous to the fire, was in a 
prosperous condition, and well equipped for 
Christ’s work. A list if the office-bearers is 
given in a document accompanying this, as 
well as a complete list of the present mem­
bers, numbering three hundred and eighteen. 
For the better carrying on of her various 
forms of effort, there are several snbordinaté 
organizations,—besides the Sunday School 
which is now sixty years old. These include 
the Women’s Missionary Aid Society, organ­
ized in 1870, the Sister's Committee on 
Church Work, the Young People’s Mission 
Band, and the Fredericton Baptist Institute, 
the last named having for its object the cul­
tivation of the literary and musical talents 
of the members of the church and congrega­
tion. This sketch would be very, incomplete 
were I to omit to mention the remarkable 
number of Christian ministers and mission­
aries whose names have been registered as 
members of the Fredericton Baptist Church 
The list embraces the following names :

Richard E. Burpee tha first missionary to 
the heathen sent from these provincesf who 
was baptized in this church in 1829, and went, 
out to Burmah in 1845; G. F. Currie, baptiz­
ed by Dr. Hurd in 1862, now a missionary in 
India ; E. W. Kelly, baptized by Rev. T. N. 
Porter "in 1872, licensed to jyeach by this 
church in 1874( and now to go out as a mis­
sionary to Burmah ; Mies Carrie Hammond, 
missionary to the Telugus.who was baptised 
by Mr. Porter in 1871, and was a member of 
this church nearly four years; and Mrs. 
Sarah A. Kelly, lately a missionary among 
the Indians in the West; and then all those 
who have labored in the home field,—Jarvis 
Ring, one of the early members, ordained in 
1847 ; William Hall, licensed and ordained in 
1843 ; Sanford Boyce, ordained here as an 
evangelist in 1842 ; Samuel Elder, ordained 
here in 1845 ; Isaiah Wallace, baptized by 
Samuel Elder in 1848, and licensed here in 
1852 ; J. H. Hughes, a member of this church 
for a year or two; C. H. Corey, D. D., a mem­
ber for two years, now President of the 
Baptist Institute at Richmond, Virginia 
A H Munro, a member for three years, and 
licensed here in 1854 ; James White, licensed 
by this chnrch in 1864 ; B F Rattray, a mem 
ber for some Urne ; J E Hopper, a member for 
several years, and ordained in this city in 
1867 ; E M Kierstead, Secretary of the Con­
vention, and now a Professor in Acadia Col­
lege; baptized by Mr Porter in 1871, and 
licensed here in 1874; Joseph Cahill, a mem­
ber for several years, and licensed here in 
1873 ; Calvin Currie, baptized bv Mr Porter 
in 1872, and licensed by this chnrch in 1876 ; 
B N Hughes, W H Beckwith and D P Harris1 
at present members of this chnrch. The list, 
as will be seen, does not include the pastors 
of the church, who have simply been members 
while occupying the pastorate.

Here this sketch must close, for it has ex­
tended itself beyond the length originally in­
tended. Let us unitedly hope and pray 
to-day that the Fredericton Church may, 
under the blessings of God, be in future more 
emphatically than in the past, “a burning 
and a shining light.”

Memo.—The contract price of the new 
edifice now in course oArection is $16,000. 
Work on the ground was begun on the 6th 
of July last.

Mrs Charles Spurden, widow 6f the late 
Rev. Chas. Spurden D.D. was then escort­
ed to the Corner Stone by Judge Stead 
man. The stone is a large block of 
Dorchester Freestone, and is laid at the 
corner of the building on the junction of 
Brunswick and York streets. It contains 
a copper box in which are deposited :

1. Contemporaneous record of the day.
2. History of the Baptists of the Maritime 

Provinces, bv Rev. I. F. Bill, D. D.
3. Memorial Volume of Acadia College 

and IlortOn Academy.
4. YcarBook of the Baptists of the Mari­

time Provinces, 1881.
5. Minutes of the Western Baptist Associa­

tion of New Brunswick, 1881.
6. Calendar of the University of Acadia 

College, 1882.
7. Calendar of Holton Collegiate Academy 

and Acadia Seminary, 1882.
8. .Historical sketch of the Fredericton 

Baptist Church, 1814-1882.
9. Complete list of the present members of 

the Church, resident and non-resident, and 
of present and former pastors and other of­
fice-bearers.

10. Photographs of the Church edifice pre­
vious to 1881, and as existing when destroy­
ed by fire.

11. Photographs'of Revds. Samuel Elder, 
Charles. Spurden, D. D., T. H. Porter, A. J, 
Stevens and F. D. Crawley, Pastors of the 
Church.

12. Current Canadian coins and notes of 
tlfe People’s Bank of New Brunswick. ,

13. Copies of the Inst issues of the “Chris­
tian Visitor" and “Christian Messenger.”

14. Copies of the latest issues of the Fred-
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a ease 6t . 
Dyspepsia or 
Biliousness 
for 76 cents? 
It Is awfully 
unwise to 
agonize un­
der the many 
ailments 
arising from 
Dyspepsia,Indigestion, 
Disordered 
Stomach and 
Liver, when 
this offer is 
made to you 
in your own 
home In all 

■BBS* sincerity, 
with an absolute certainty oi 
curing yon.

KO P ns A (from Brazil) cures 
Dyspepsia and Biliousness. A 
single dose relieves ; a sample 
bottle convinces; ^ 76 cent 
bottle cures.

It acts directly npon the 
Stomach, Liver, and Kidneys.

Cleansin ', Correcting, Reg­
ulating, Zopesa gives energy 
and vim to the Brain, Nerve, 
and Muscle, simply by work­
ing wonders tspon the Diges­
tion, and giving activity to 
the Liver

Cut this out, take it to any 
dealer In medicines, and get 
ct least one îiî cent botlleot 
Kept.sc, n ml tell your neighbor 
how itac's. It is warranted 
;o cure ‘Dyse* ;>sia and Bil-
'iisncuK

ericton “Reporter,” “Maritime Farmer,” 
Capital," and Hkrald.
15. Programme of the Exercises of the Day. 
The following is the contemporaneous 

record of the day above referred to:
In the year of our Lord 

One thousand eight hundred and eighty-two, 
in the forty-sixth year of the reign 

' of Her Majesty
QUBBN VICTORIA,

The Rt. Hon. William Ewart Gladstone 
Premier of the United Kingdom ;

The Most Hon. the Marquis of Lome, Gov­
ernor-General of the Dominion of Canr 
adaf

The Rt. Hon. Sir John A. Macdonald, Pre­
mier of the Dominion of Canada;

The Hon. Robert Duncan Wilmot, Lieet.- 
Governor of New Brunswick ;

The Hon. Daniel L. Haningtou, Leader ef 
the Government of New Brunswick ;

G. Fred. Fisher, Esq., Mayor of the City of 
Fredericton.

■I
Friday the first day of September,

The Corner Stone 
of the

Baptist Church in Fredericton, 
was laid

with appropriate religious exercises.

The church at this date numbers three 
hundred and eighteen (318) members, ef 
whom two hundred and twelve, or just two- 
thirds, are now resident in Fredericton an* 
vicinity.

The office-bearers are as follows :
Pastor :

Rev. Frederick D. Crawley, A.B. 
Deacons :

William Sewell, Archibald F. Randolph
David W. Estabrooks, Théo. H. Rand,D.C.L. 
William Cooper, John W. Spurden.

Clerk :
Herbert C Creed, A M.

Treasurer :
Allan H F Randolph, A B. 

Superintendent of Sunday School:
John W Spurden.

Organist: Mrs J Z Currie; Chorister: M8 
Hall; Curator: Nicholas T Wheeler ; Sextan: 
Charles Parsons.

V,

building committee :
Judge Steadman, Chairman.

D F George. A F Randolph,
T H Rand, D C L, Lewis Crouse, ,
J G McNally. George Kitchen,
Wm Wheeler, Jos Sherwood.

Architect :
D E Dunham, St John.

Contractors :
Messrs Bond & Milden.

(Signed) Herbert C. Creed,
Clerk of the Church.

Fredericton, Sept 1, 1882.
The stone having been placed in position 

by Mr. Milden,Mrs Spurden placed morter 
upon the foundation with the silver 
trowel and said:

‘Wc lay this Corner Stone to the honor 
and glory of Jehovah, Father, Son and Holy 
Spirit. Here may the rich and the poor meet 
together to worship the Lord, the Maker of 
us all. From this place may the everlast­
ing Gospel of the Son of God be carried even 
unto the ends of the earth.”

After which the stone was lowered to 
its place.

The choir and people present then 
joined in singing “Our God our Help in 
ages past,” after which the Revs. Messrs. 
Mowatt and Wadman delivered short 
addresses; The Doxology was sung and 
the assembly dismissed with the benedic­
tion.

Funerals.—The funeral of the late Mrs. 
Alexander Gibson, junior, Thursday after­
noon was very largely attended not only by 
persons from the neighborhood but from the 
city ns well. The services at the grave and 
in the church were conducted by Rev. Mr. 
Evans. The death of this esteemed lady is 
a severe blow to a large circle of friends and 
relations. Thoroughly domestic and womanly 
in her tastes she was esteemed by all who 
knew her. Her early death, she was only 
31, ia rendered doubly sad by the fact that 
she leaves a little family who will miss the 
loving care which a mother only can give 
her children. Mr. Evans preached a very 
interesting sermon, " '"n the text, “Blessed 
are the dead who <h i the Lord,” in the 
course of which ! ide many kindly 
allusions to the worth ' n deceased.

The funeral of the i.i Hon. J. H. Craw­
ford, Solicitor General of New Brunswick, 
took place Thursday afternoon from his late 
residence, Hampton, Kings Co. The Pro­
vincial Offices in this city were closed as a 
token of vesper, "j: .... hrerased gentleman.

X
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POOR DOCUMENT

SELECT STORY.

A FIVE-DOLLAR BILL.

it if

said
had

“Oh, pshaw! You can manage 
you’ve a mind to.”

“I dont see any way of making one 
dollar ten, unless I steal the other nine,"’ 
said Arthur Glenham to his companion, 
Frank Weed.

“Can’t you borrow it of somebody?” 
persisted Frank.

“I wonder who’d lend me so much 
money as that! Nine dollars is a big pile 
of money."

“I knew 'twould be just so,” growled 
Frank. “If you’d only save up your 
money as the rest of us have, you 
wouldn’t have all this truoble.”

“I couldn’t save what I never had,'’ re­
plied Arthur. “I only get six dollars a 
week,” he continued. “Five of it goes to 
mv mother, and when I have any spend­
ing money, its for little outside jobs, 
haven’t had any of those lately. If I had, 
they wouldn’t amount to ten dollars.”

“I’ll tell you what. Arthur," put in 
Frank again this time as if he had reach 
ed the solution of the matter, “don’t give 
yotir mother any money this week, and 
that will be five, and the one you’ve got 
six, I guess-yon can squeeze through on 
six dollars."

“But my mother depends on the five 
dollars for her Thanksgiving dinner,” re­
plied Arthur.

“Well, what of that? You won’t be 
there to eat it.”

This was evidently a very startling pro 
position, and Arthur flushed to the roots 
of his hair, but he said simply.

“What excuse would I give for not 
taking her the money as usual?”

“Oh! tell her that the boss went away; 
and there was nobody to pay out any 
money, or you lost it, or something. Why, 
Ed. Perry does that every once in 
while, and his mother always believes it.”

“Ed. Perry is going with you, I suppose?”
“Oh, yes, we couldn’t get along without 

Ed. He’s the jolliest fellow in tlje 
world.”

“I am not going home now,’. 
Arthur a moment after, ‘and you 
better not wait for me.”

“All right. I’ll see you to-morrow. 
Well get a splendid dinner at the hotel, 
and enjoy ourselves a thousand times 
better than if we poked around home. 
I’ve engaged the fastest team in Dalton's 
stable, and we ought to start by eight 
o’clock sharp.”

Now Arthur had not had a vacation for 
.* long time, and in spite of every argu­
ment which conscience suggested, he 
did not want to go with the boys on this 
trip which they had planned for Thanks 
giving Day. No thought of cheating his 
mother, or failing to produce the regular 
five dollars ever occurred to "him. There 
was something else in his mind, however, 
which he had been turning over all 
through his talk with Frank. There 
was a way of obtaining five dollars with­
out anyone’s ever being the wiser. He 
could borrow it from the petty cash 
drawer, of which he had the full charge 
in the large manufacturing establishment 
where he was employed. He could 
return it twenty-five and fifty cents at a 
time, until it was paid. “That certainly 
wouldn’t be stealing,,’ he argued. “But 
what would you call it ?” enquired con­
science. Arthur found it exceedingly 
hard to give the transaction a satisfactory 
name and so he sat by his high desk and 
thought it over. The more he thought 
the weaker he grew, and finally the young 
man slipped down from his chair, slipped 
his hand into the drawer, and took out a 
five dollar bill. This he slipped into his 
pocket and the slippery transaction was 
finished. He had just taken down his 
hat to leave, when the door opened, and 
the porter entered to clean up the office.

“ What are you doing here so late, 
Master Arthur?” enquired the old man.

“ Oh, seeing that everything was all 
right," replied Arthur avoiding the 
porter's eyes as he spoke.

“It’s a grand good thing to leave every­
thing all right,” said the porter ; and it’s 
a grand good thing to know that the Lord 
always helps us when we try to do right 
ourselves. Where are you going Thanks­
giving, Master Arthur?”

“Had the old man been secreted some­
where and witnessed the thieving trans­
action ?” Arthur asked himself with a very 
red face. That^seemed impossible, but 
was it so?

John French, the porter, was a very 
areligious man, and was called by the boys 
in the place “a shouting Methodist.” 
There was usually a little contempt in 
'their, manner of speaking of the old man, 
but let anything be the matter with one 
•ef their number, and the “shouting Metho­
dist” was always the first one called upon.

“I was thinking about going away with 
the boys,” replied Arthur, wishing the 
five dollar bill back in the drawer with 
Jill his heart.

-“But that'll cost something,” replied 
John ; “and I s'pose your mother can’t 
spare you much ?”

“No, John.”
“Mebbe you’re calculating on borrow­

ing it of somebody, Master Asthur?” 
“Well, what if I am?”
“Only that borrowing, unless you know 

just how and when you’re going to pay it, 
is pretty nigh as bad as stealing. I’ll tell 

; what to do, Master Arthur. Just ask

the right one, always the right one, Master 
Arthur.”

Oh ! how that five dollar bill burned in 
1 Arthur’s pocket ! His feet seemed glued 
to the floor, and his heart thumped so 
hard against his breast that it frightened 
him. The old man took up his broom, 
and waited respectfully for the young 
man to leave the room before he began 
sweeping. Then, as Arthur made no 
motion to go, he said, “Something's the 
matter with you, my boy. Can old John 
do anything for you, or is it the Lord’s 
business, Master Arthur?”

“I meant to pay it back again,” said 
Arthur, taking the bill from his pocket; 
“but it would have taken me a long time, 
John and as the old man drew near to 
see what his companion held' in his hand, 
he continued : “It’s a five dollar bill and 
I took it from the cash drawer. I sup­
pose you'll hate me now, John; but it’s 
all up, and I can’t help it.”

“Bless the Lord, 0 my soul !” said John, 
“for the work He has done. I hate you, 
Mister Arthur ! Give me your hand, my 
boy, and le* us thank the Lord for this 
great escape.”

“Nothing would have saved me, John,” 
said Arthur, with tears in his voice as well 
as his eyes, “if you hadn’t come in just as 
you did.”

“Proud and happy am I to be the Lord’s 
instrument in such a work,” said the old 
man. “He sent me, Master Arthur, and 
now let us praise His holy name.”

After that prayer Arthur rose strength­
ened and refreshed, full of thankfulness 
and a purpose to do right.

“Have you got the money, Arthur?” 
enquired Frank the morning.

“No, Frank,” was the quiet reply ; “I 
have concluded to stay at home -on 
Thanksgiving.”

“All right,” replied Frank. “After this 
we boys’ll know that you don’t want any­
thing of us, and the whole crowd’ll steer 
clear of you.”

Nothing could be better than this 
surely and Arthqr Glen man was glad 
when the boys acteu upon their leader’s
suggestion, and let him alone__Zion's
Herald-

Characterlsttes or the Spider.

The worst thing about this poor insect 
is, that it is so thoroughly ugly. In it 
nature has sacrificed everything to the 
formation of thefindustrial machine neces­
sary for supplying its wants. Of a circu­
lar form, furnished with eight legs, and 
eight vigilant eyes, it astonishes (and dis 
gusts) us by the pre-eminence of an enor­
mous abdomen. Ignoble trait ! in which 
the inattentive and superficial observer 
will see nothing but a type of gluttony. 
Alas ! it is quite the contrary. Ibis abdo­
men is its workshop, its magazine, the 
pocket in which the rope-maker keeps his 
stock; but as he fills his pocket with 
nothing but his own substance, he can 
only increase it at his own expense by 
means of a rigid sobriety. True type ot 
the artizan ! “If I fast to-day,” he says, 
“I shall, perhaps, get something to eat 
to-morrow; but if my manufacture be 
stopped, everything is lost and my 
stomach must fast for ever.” In charac­
ter the spider is watchful and cunning ; 
in disposition timid, uneasy and nervous, 
being endowed with a more sensitive 
nature than is possessed by any other in­
sect. These characteristics are the natu­
ral result of its miserable condition, which 
is a state of constant, passive, weary wait- 
in To be forever watching the cease­
less, joyous, careless dances of the fly, 
which pays no more attention to the 
greedy desires of its enemy or the gentle 
whispers of “Come here, little one ; come 
this way,” is to be in a state of constant 
torment, to be continually undergoing a 
succession of hopes and mortifications. 
The fatal question, “Shall I get any din­
ner 9” is cqntinually presenting itself to 
the dweller in the web, followed by the 
still more sinister reflection, “If I have no 
dinner to-day, then no more thread, and 
still less hope of dining to-morrow.” The 
male spider often makes a meal of his 
progeny, whilst the female- loves them so 
tenderly that if she cannot save them 
in circumstances of peril she prefers to 
perish with thepi. The love which she 
bears to her little ones she does not share 
with her mate. Sometimes, after having 
attempted in vain to prevent him from 
devouring their offspring the idea appears 
suddenly to present itself to her mind 
that the cannibal is himself good for food, 
on which she instantly falls upon him and 
eats him up__Michelet.

CITY DIRECTORY.

• ARRIVAL AND DRI'ARTDRR OF TRAINS.
Fbkdmictox Railway.—Trains for St. John 

leave the Station, on York street, daily at 
7 a. m., and 2.15 p. m.; and arrive from St. 
John at 11.45 a. m. and 7.45 P. M., daily, 
Sunday excepted.

Trains for Fredericton Junction, Saint Ste­
phen, Bangor, and all points West, leave 
Fredericton at 9.15 a. M.r and arrive from 
the same points at 4.40 p. m. daily, Sundays 
excepted.

New Brunswick Railway.—Trains leave 
Gibson daily (Sundays excepted) at 7.45 
a. m. for Woodstock, Aroostook, Caribou, 
Grand Falls, and Edmundston ; and arrive 
from those points at 4.30 p. m. Passengers 
for St. Leonard and Edmundston remain 
over night-at Grand Falls.

Intercolonial Railway.—The Halifax ex-

Sress leaves St. John at 8 A. M. daily (Sun- 
ay excepted) ; and arrives at St. John at 

8.25 p. M.
The Halifax and Quebec express leaves St. 

John at 7.30 p. m. ; and arrives at 7.35 a. m, 
daily, Sundays excepted.

THE POST OFFICE.
The Post Office is situated in the Square on 

the corner of Queen and Carlcton streets 
The General Delivery, Stamp, and Registry 
Offices are open from 7 A. ji. until 8.30 p. m. 
daily (Sundays excepted). Box holders have 
access to their boxes until 9.30 p. m. The 
Money Order Office is open from 10 a. m. until 
4 p. m. Letter Boxes are located as follows- 
Near the corner of Waterloo Row and Sun- 
bury streets, at the Auditor General’s Office, 
the’Queen Hotel, the Barker House, the W. Ü. 
Telegraph .Office, the Bray ley House, and 
Lung’s Hotel. These boxes are served as fol­
lows : At 6.30 a.m., and in the afternoon, 
the Waterloo Row box at 12.20 ; the Auditor’s 
office box at 12.30; Queen Hotel 12.35 ; Barker 
House 12.40; Brayley House 12.50; Long’s 
Hotel 12.55 ; W.TL Telegraph Office 1.00.

The mail for England, via New York, is 
made up on Tuesday of each week at 8.20 
a.h., and via Halifax on every Friday at 
1.40 p.m.
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are on the ground floor of the City Hall. 
They are open daily (Sunday excepted) from 
10 a. m. until 4 p. h.

you i
the Lord! He will tell you. I never 
asked him a question in my life that He 
didn’t answer. Sometimes ’tain’t just the
answer you'd like to get, but it’s always

A woman bathed in red flannel costume 
at Rye Beach the other day, and a cow 
in a neighboring field made a drive for 
her, and for a time there was more surf 
than Neptune had provided. They had 
to kill the cow in order to get the woman 
safely back to her bath house. That was 
the alternative of killing the woman to 
get the cow back to her grass.

A little boy had his long curls cut oft 
the other day, and was annoyingly re­
minded of the fact by the remarks of all 
his friends. Going with his family into 
the country, soon after his arrival he 
came running into the house in great 
sorrow, crying, “ Mamma, mamma, even 
the hens laugh at me ; they all say. 
‘ Cut-cut-cut-got-your-hair-cut !' ”

A St. Louis company issues insurance 
policies on the lives of infants, the 
parents paying five cents a week and 
getting $25 if the child dies, “to cover 
funeral expenses.”

Church of England Temperance Society.— 
Patron, His Lordship the Metropolitan f 
President, Rev. G. G. Roberts ; Secretary, 
G. Douglas Hazen.

St. Ann’s Lodge, U. T. A., No. 166.—Geo. 
J. Bliss, President; J. T. Horseman, Secre­
tary.

Meets every second Thursday in the Re­
form Club Rooms, Queen Street.

Women’s Christian Temperance Union.— 
Mrs. Steadman, President ; Mrs. Sampson, 
Secretary.

Meets every Wednesday at 4 p. m., at its 
rooms in Reform Club building

St. Dunstan’s Total Abstinence Society.— 
President, James E. Barry ; Secretary, F. 
McGoldrick.

Meetings are held weekly in their Hall on 
Regent Street, on Tuesday evening at 8 
o’clock.

York Division S. of T.—W. P., R. H. 
Mackey ; R. S., A. G. Jarvis.

Meetings are held weekly in the Temper­
ance Hall, on York Street, on Friday even­
ing at 8 o’ clock

Reform Club.—President, George J. Bliss ; 
Secretary, Richard H. Philips.

Meetings are held in their rooms on Queen 
Street, on the second and fourth Tuesday oi 
each month.

Young Men’s Christian Association.— 
President, G. F. Atherton ; Cor. Secretary, 
G. E. Coulthard, M- D.

Meets every Tuesday evening at 7.30, and 
on Sunday evening at 8 o’clock.

Royal Arcanum, Fredericton Council, No. 
165.—W' J. Crewdson, Regent; G. E. Coul­
thard, Secretary.

Meets at the Y. M. C. A. Rooms the second 
and last Tuesday in each month, at 8 p. m. 
Limit of insurance, $3,000.

Royal Arcanum, Lome Council, No. 486- 
Regent. G. S. Peters ; Secretary, E. S. Way- 
cott. • '

American Legion of Honor.—Fredericton 
Council, No. 274.—Herbert C. Creed, Com­
mander ; C. A. Sampson, Secretary. Meets 
in Fisher’s Building, on the first and third 
Wednesdays of each month, at 8 p. m. In­
sures from $500 to $5,000.

Home Circle, Maple Leaf Council, No. 26 
—John J. Weddall, Leader; G. E. Coulthard, 
Secretary..

Meets on the first and third Thursday in 
every month, in Y.M.C.A. Rooms. Insures 
from $500 to $5,000.

Fredericton Historical Society.—George E 
Fenety, President; A. Archer, Secretary.

Regular meetings on the second Thursday 
in January, April, July and October in each 
year.

Hiram Lodge, No. 0, F. & A. M.—Harry 
Beckwith, W. M. ; T. G. Loggie, Secretary.

Meets in Masonic Hall, Carleton Street, 
first Thursday in every month.

Fredericton Royal Arch Chapter, No. 77, 
Reg. G. R. A. Chapter of Scotland.—G. D. 
Lugrin, P. Z. ; R. M. Pinder, H. ; N. Camp­
bell. J. ; A. F. Street, P. P., Scribe E.

Regular Convocation third Wednesday in 
every month in Mason Hall, Carleton Street.

Alexandria Lodge, F. and A. M.—Alfred 
Seely, W. M.; Edgar Hanson, Secretary.

Meets first Tuesday in each month in 
Haines’ Hall, St. Mary’s Ferry.

Victoria Lodge, No 13,1 0 O F—J D 
Fowler, N G ; J F Richards, Rec Secretary.

Meets every Monday evening at 8 o’clock, 
in the Lodge Room, Edgecombe’s Block, 
York Street. ,

Grand Lodge, L. O. A.—William Wilson, 
Grand Master, Fredericton.

Graham Lodge, L. O. A., No. 20.—W. 
Wilson, Master, Joseph Walker, Secretary.

Meets in the Orange Hall, Queen Street, 
west end, on the first Friday in every 
month.

Walker Lodge, L. 0. A., No. 35.—H. S 
Carman. Master; Geo. S. Parker, Secretary.

Meets in the Orange Hall on *he first Me 
day in every month.

T. G. O'Connor,
IMPORTER OF

BRITISH AND FOREIGN

WOOLLEN MANUFACTURES

Lately arrived, a magnificent nsevrtment of

English, Scotch & Canadian 

CLOTHS,

BEAVERS, NAPS,

DIAGONALS, SERGES, 

OVERCOATINGS,

WORSTED SUITINGS, 

CHEVIOTS, &c., &c,

Suitable for the present season.

A Splendid Stock of

MENS’ & BOYS’ “READY-MADE” CLOTHING,
WINTER SUITS,

OVERCOATS,

ULSTERS,

REEFERS

Men’s uFurnishings,”

Underclothing, étc., dee.

N. B.—Men and Boys’ Clothing made to 
order, under supervision of a First Class 
Artisan.

T. G. O'CONNOR,

Next below Barker House, Queen Street,
" FREDERICTON, N. B.

Lowest Prices in the Dominion.' 
12-7-81

Iron, Steel, Cable Chain, Etc.
Just received per Steamship “Hibernian” from 

Liverpool via Halifax.
Ill rPONS Bar Iron ; 167 tons SI jd and Sled Shoe 

^ Steel : 24 bundles Toe Caulk Steel ; 17 casks 
Cable Chain : 18 doz. Galvanized Buckets -.1 case 
Cutlery, Table Knives and Forks, Carving Knives, 
Scissors, Pocket Knives ; 1 case Pad Locks ; 1 case 
Files, (Butcher’s).

Per sale Wholesale and Retail.
dec5 JAMES S. NEILL

Cook Ranges and Stoves.
Just received from Hamilton, Ontario 

24 Cook Ranges and Stoves ;
6 doz. Tea Kettles, assorted ;
6 doz. Pots, assorted ;
6 doz. Spiders, assorted.

For sale low by
Feb 22 JAMES S. NEILL.

Garden Tools.

IN Stock and for sale low, Garden Tools of all 
kii 'kinds.

Fredericton, May 1,1882,
Z. R. EVERETT.

George C, Hunt,
Druggist & 

Apothecary.
ESTABLISHED 1853.

KEEPS CONSTANTLY ON HAND
A Full Line of

PURE DRUGS AND CHEMICALS,
A Full Line of

GENUINE PATENT MEDICINES,

A Full Line of 
DYE STUFFS AND DRYSALTERIES 

A Ful lice
I'OOTH, HAIR, NAIL AND CLOTHES 

BRUSHES,

A Full Line of
CHOICE ENGLISH and FRENCH PER 

FUMES.

A Fall Line of

CHEAP PERFUMERY lor Pedlers and 
Country Stores,

A Full Line of
GENUINE HAVANNA CIGARS,

A Full Lino of
CHEAP CIGARS for Pedlers and Country 

Stores.
A Full Line of

CIGAR CASES, MEERSHAUM & BRIAR
PIPES, CIGAR HOLDERS and 

Tobacconists’ Goods Generally.

A Full Line of

WALLETS, POCKET BOOKS & PURSES
Full Lino ot

FANCY and SEASONABLE GOODS for 
the Holidays.
A Full Line of 

XMAS GOODS.

The stock is at present very complete, and is being 
constantly renewed in wholesale or retail quantities 
at Lowest Cash Prices.

dec5

GEORGE C. HUNT, 
Sterling’s Brick Building, 

Queen Street, 
Fredericton

TABLE GLASSWARE—A CONSIGN­
MENT.

26 Barrels, Wholesale and retail, at 
IÆM0NT.S.

June 2

TEA. TEA.
ITIORTY packages CHOICE TEAS. Large assort­ie ment. First Class Groceries.

May 10
G. T WHELPLEY’S, 

Under the Barker House.

Oranges.
Just received and fo; sale low,

35 BOXES OF ORANGES.

May 10
G T. WHELPLEY’S,

Under the Barker House

THE WEEKLY HERALD-
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The Weekly Edition of the Hkrald will be issued on

EVERYTHURSDAY
V

at four o’clock in the afternoon. It will be a quarto, that is, an 
eight page paper, and will be printed upon a sheet 31x46 

inches in size. It will be

LARGER THAN ANY OTHER SHEET PUBLISHED IN FREDERICTON,

and the equal in size of any paper published in the Maritime Provinces. It

will be. emphatically

THE FAMILY PAPER OF THE PROVINCE
Something that every one, rich or poor, wants. It will give all the news of the 

week, both home and foreign, up to the hour of going to press, in 
fresh, readable style. To ensure this the services of com­

petent correspondents have been secured who 
are to send any late news by telegram.

NO OTHER WEELY PAPER IN THE PROVINCE GIVES TELEGRAPHIC 

NEWS REGULARLY ON THE DAY OF PUBLICATION:

The Herald will do this, because its aim is to be 

THE BEST FAMILY PAPER IN THE MARITIME PROVINCES.

I believe a first-class family paper will pay, and I am going to try the 
experiment.

The Weekly Herald will always contain a good stoiy, will tell all about the news 
of the religious world, will give the CHURCH APPOINTMENTS for the next 
Sunday and the ensuing week, and have an

Agricultural Department,
in which it will endeavor to give its country readers valuable information relating 

to the Farm. In this latter respect it will aim at being 
an agricultural newspaper.

New Features will be Introduced which Experience may show are Desirable.

Remember the Herald is the only paper in Fredericton which has upon its staff

A CITY EDITOR, WHOSE TIME WILL BE EXCLUSIVELY DEVOTED TO

LOCAL NEWS.

It is the only paper in Fredericton having a corps of correspondents who are

instructed to send in

LATE NEWS BY TELEGRAPH

IT IS THE ONLY PAPER IN FREDERICTON ESPOUSING THE (LIBERAL '
CAUSE IN POLITICS.

The Weekly Herald will not be simply a reprint, but will contain much 

matter which will appear in no other paper.

Terms ôf Subscription—$1.00 a 'Year, Postage Free

Or delivered free to Subscribers in the City, Gibson and St. Mary’s Ferry.

To Subscribers to the Evening Herald, or tri-weekly edition, the weekly 
edition will be sent for FIFTY CENTS.

865*All subscriptions before Januar 1st good until _December|lst,^1882.
i'W

CHAS. H. LUGRIN Editor and Proprietor.

Fredericton December 5 IS?' j


