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RURAL TOPICS.

BEST BBBBDS OF SWINE.
That breed whiuh pvoduvea the most 

pork on a given quantity of food nil 
must admit to he the best ; but the 
difficulty lies in ascertaining what 
breotf answers to this requirement. 
The Berkshire, Poland China, York­
shire, and Essex breeds are fonr of 
the best in this country ; and of those 
I consider the Poland China the most 
profitable. This breed originated 
about 40 years ago in Ohiuh, by a 
cross on several breeds, the Berkshire 
predominating, and the claim now to 
their being a pure breed is generally 
admitted to be correct. There is not 
much difference in form between 
Berkshire and Poland Chinas ; and as 
to color, while the Bcrkshircs are 
black, except the feet, (not all) and 
they also have white spots on different 
parts of their bodies. At 18 months 
old they often weigh 500 lbs; and at 
12 months 350 lbs. The carcass is 
beautifully formed, round and com­
pact legs short, and altogether a model 
that cannot be improved. Of course 
some farmers prefer other breeds, but 
theilgreat popularity of the Poland 
Chinas, seems to show that they stand 
at the bead of the list cf breeds of 
swine in the United States.

RAISING GEESE.
When a farmer has a track of low, 

marshy land near his house, where 
there is a running stream ol water, he 
might raise geese profitably, by con. 
fining them to this tract during the 
day in summer, and yarding them al 
night. When allowed to run on good 
grass land their manure is so strong 
that it kills the gross where dropped ; 
and for this reason many farmers 
have given up breeding them. Bui 
they are certainly profitable, as they 
arc subject to no disease, require no 
food but grass, and always salable 
dressed at a fair price, and their 
feathers will pay the expenses of keep­
ing them. With an extensive marshy 
range more money could ho made by 
raising geese than on any other kind 
of domestic poultry.

EARLY GARDEN VEGETABLES.
The prices that early vegetables 

command in country villages and par­
ticularly in largo towns arc often 
double those obtained at wholesale io 
large cities, as such markets often 
become glutted wtih vegetables and 
email fruits which have to be sold 
very low. Now, farmers cun grow a 
moderate supply of early vegetables, 
almost anywhere and get good prices 
for them. The Scientific Farmer says : 

■“It is to bo wondered at that so few 
farmers with ample facilities, in the 
vicinity of large towns, engage in the 
growing of early garden crops. They 
say it is no use competing with the 
larger gardeners whose products find 
their way to the inland towns, and so 
lay on their oars and lot the trade go 
by them. Now wo know from ex­
perience this is false. We have re­
peatedly carried earl)' beets, peas, 
sqCSa, etc., into a little town not 25 
miles from Boston on the lino of rail­
road, and sold them at a higher price 
than the regular gardeners received. 
Why ? Because our produce was fresh 
and palatable and not the leavings of 
the city stalls as much of that sent to 
inland towns is. A few crops, like 
these named, and sweet corn, late cab­
bage, rhubarb, cauliflowers, (a few) 
and perhaps some others, we know 
can be grown with profit. The rest 
the farmer had best leave the 
gardener.”

STABLE DUNG A PERFECT MANURE.
When the world was made its Crea­

tor designed that the land should be 
kept in a good state of fertility by 
stable manure alone; consequently, it 
was given all the elements of fertility 
that crops require. A writer on the 
comparative value of stable and com­
mercial manures says : “ Average 
stable manure is held to contain 0.3 lo 
0.0 por cent, of nitrogen, 0.4 to 0.6-1 
per cent, of potash, and 0 2 lo 0.3 per 
cent, of phosphoric acid. This is a 
fair proportion of the essential plant 
food ingredients, and confirms the 
statement often made, that barnyard 
manu* i*#a complete manure. So it 
is, as all practice shows, and when 
produced on the farm, is the most 
economical. But the above figures 
show that, at 15 cents per pound for 
nitrogen, 7J cents per pound for pot­
ash, and 5 cents per pound for phosp­
horic acid—the price these substances 
um worth in stable manure in com­
parison with them in more available 
forms in commercial manures—the 
value of a cord of stable manure, 
weighing i\ tons, is about 88.50.

VALUE OF COW MANURE.

Dr. Anderson gives the following 
as the component parts ol a cow’s 
manure in one year, based on an 
analysis :

103.3 lbs of ammonia 
88.5 “ “ potash.

** 04.0 “ “ 'phosphoric acid.

Tills represents a value of $22,75, 
as those commercial fertilizer are sold; 
nor is the estimate too much, as no 
farmer can afford to sell all the man­
ure that 10 head of cattle can make 
in a year for $227 50. The above 
analysis, undoubtedly, was made of 
manure that come from a well-fed 
cow, as cows that are wintered on hay, 
corn sL.lks and some straw only, will 
not produce a manure worth as much 
as those fed partly on meal. In 
brief, it is the quality of the feed 
that makes the quality of the manure.

TWO GOOD STRAWBERRIES.

A gardener near Boston writes :
“ I have tested a score or more of the 
leading sorts, and have found the 
Green Prolific and Charles Downing 
the most profitable on my soil—a 
medium sandy loam. The Green Pro­
lific, is the most profitable variety I 
have ever tried ; it is a very strong 
grower, with large dark green leaves, 
and extra prolific, and the firuit is 
borne on strong, erect stalks. The 
berry is of large size, sound, and very 
uniform, and of good flavor. Charles 
Downing is a vigorous grower, with 
a large conical berry of the highest 
flavor, and is very productive ; a pro­
fitable market sort, and for family use 
probably has no superior.” I have 
tested both of these varieties, and 
know them to be very productive 
and of good quality, and they produce 
good crops in all localities. The Green 
Prolific is a pistiiaie variety ; and 
must be grown near a staminate 
variety ; and there is none better 
than the Charles Downing. Set one 
row of slaminatos to|three of pistil ales. 
At least, that is required to fertilize 
the three rows of pistilates.

PROPAGATING PLANTS.

Our lady friends, says the Scienti­
fic Farmers, will be now preparing 
for their gardens, and a few directions 
coming from our own experience may 
not come amiss. Any lady, with no 
more trouble than is required to pro­
cure slips, can readily raise all the 
young plants she may desire. The 
preparation is as simple as this: A 
saucer or soup plate, partly filled with 
clean sand and the water kept above 
t ie surface. Sot this in a sunny win­
dow and insert your cuttings. An 
ordinary plant will root noarily as 
readily as in a propagating bed and 
may llien he transferred to small pots 
of earth. Bat remember to let the 
stem of your geraniums dry thorough­
ly on the cut surface before inserting 
The verbenas may bo put in as cut. 
The pink slips may be pulled, not cut, 
from the extremities of growing 
shoots. The begonias, heliotropes, 
etc., may be inserted at once. When 
polling, use small pots and rich earth 
well lightened up with sand, so as to 
give complete drainage, and do not 
remove to larger pots until the roots 
thoroughly fill the pots in which they 
are growing. Give plenty of air, 
keep well pinched hack, and when 
the time comes for removal to the 
borders you will have plants which it 
will cheer you to tend.

LICE ON POULTRY.

There is nothing that will so 
thoroughly eradicate those parasites 
known as roost lice as cleanliness, and 
this is brought about by spreading a 
thick pusto-of lime whitewash, after 
the filth is removed, over the roosting 
poles and about the building wherever 
these minute insects can claim a foot­
hold, and they will claim a foothold 
in ever/ crack and crevice, where 
they lodge during the day, always 
seeking lurking places where they 
hide from the light in tbo davtimo, 
and como forth at night to prey on 
the bodies of the fowls. You need 
never look for them on the upper 
sides of the roosting poles, which are 
worn smooth by the feet of the birds, 
but examine the under part where 
there is some roughness, and look 
sharp and close, or perhaps you will 
overlook the miles.—[Selected.

UNDERDRAINING.

The Rural New Yorker says : “ Where 
land is favorable for underdraining, 
the cost need not he more than from 
$2 to St per acre, according to the 
prices paid for labor and materials. 
The drains can bemadeof pine boards ; 
a strip 0J inches wide nailed on to the 
edge of a strip 5^ inches wide, and in 
lieu of a bottom, nail short strips 
across about 4 feet apart, to keep the 
sides in their places. This kind of 
drain will last many years, and do 
good service. Therefore, I would re­
commend underdraining as being the 
greatest benefit to the soil. But per- 

! sons who cannot conveniently under­
drain their land, should at least dig a 
few open ditches, of good size and 
proper depth, for mains, and then 
when ploughing make deep dead fur- 
rows, leading into tl.o ditches, which 
will Lo found highly beneficial.” The 
Rural writer estimates the cost of this 
kind of draining much too low, as the 
pine boards, at $25 per 1,000 feet, will 
cost $8 for every 20 rods of drain 
land. But the plan is a good one

where stones are not to bo obtained, 
bolter than drain tile, being a larger 
water course, and lasting almost a 
life-time.

MANURE FOB FRUIT TREES.

The Western New York Horticultu­
ral Society lately discussed the question 
of manure for fruit trees. One member 
said that he had used superphosphate 
of lime with good results. Another 
member said that ho had seen more 
benefit resulting from superphosphate 
the second year than the first, 
especially when the first was a dry 
season. Another member preferred 
wood ashes. He once used 1,800 
bushels of leached ashes on the sandy 
soil of his orchard and vineyard, with 
very great advantage, applying it at 
the rale ot 300 bushels per aero. The 
quality as well as size and yield of 
fruit was very much improved. An­
other member considered barnyard 
manure as the most profitable fer­
tilizer for fruit trees, as it furnishes 
all the elements required for growth 
and fertility. Fruit-growers should 
therefore manufacture all the manure 
they can, by keeping horses, cattle, 
pigs, poultry, and gathering up all 
the litter, &c. for the manure pile. 
Some people are liable to make mis­
takes in using stimulating manures as 
fertilizers for fruit crops.

DARK STABLES.
It is an established fact that dark 

stables lend to produce blindness in 
animals. A veterinary surgeon says :
“ Darknossproduceshlindness; because 
nature is outraged in the fact that the 
sight »f the eye is destroyed by want 
of light to present objects properly to 
the vision, and thus, by continued in­
activity, producing blindness. Even 
so is blindness, or imperfect vision, 
produced by an over-action of light 
upon the retina of the eye, as is always 
the case when light is admitted by a 
window, directly in front of the horse. 
Nothing is worse than this light so 
admitted. Nature is outraged, and as 
a penalty we have nervous, fretful 
horses, shyers, cribbers, balkers, run­
aways, and anything hut a reliable, 
pleasant horse.”

COMMENCING FRUIT GROWING.
A Western small fruit grower says: 

“I commenced the business on an in­
come of $100 a year ; now it is $3,000. 
My market has been mostly in our 
small towns near home. And it is 
astonishing what an amount of fruit 
can be sold in our small towns of from 
500 to 5,000 inhabitants, and at pay­
ing prices too. Bat as some one who 
reads this may think he will try the 
business too, I would just say ‘ go 
slow ’ at first.” That is good, and re­
member it takes years to become suc­
cessfully established ia small fruit 
growing, and then the profits may he 
light. Your land is to ho first put in 
good condition. Apply the manure 
liberally, even if you have enough for 
one acre only. “ Go slowly." Obtain 
the host varieties of fruits, as far as in 
your power, and be satisfied to make 
a mere living. Beware of sotting 
varieties that are not adapted to your 
climate. For instance, raspberries 
that may be very successful in one 
place may not be worth anything in 
another locality, and the same is true, 
in some degree, with strawberries, 
blackberries, grapes, &c.

TURKEYS-
Turkeys should not he bred in-and- 

in longer than two or three years, 
when a change of males is necessary. 
Hens about a ar old are best for 
breeding, but they often lay 40 or 50 
eggs before sitting. Older hens lay 
less. Remove the eggs daily, leaving 
a China egg in the nest. All that are 
to be allowed to sit, should hatch by 
the first of June. Every young turkey 
under four weeks old should he 
gathered lo its fold before sundown 
and shut in. Learn them to he gentle, 
so that you can pick them up and pul 
them under their mother’s wings, if 
necessary. " When hatching,” says 
a writer on turkeys, “ remove the 
shells from the nest, and allow them 
to remain twenty-four hours after 
hatching before feeding. For the first 
two or throe days I keep them on the 
old neat, as it is al! warm throughout, 
and feed on thick custard, with a pro­
portion of ono part egg and the other 
now milk. I keep them in this feed 
for nearly a week, and allow little or 
no ran for them, and then only in the 
warmer portion of the day. Keep 
them clean, dry and warm (and they 
will hear a goodly amount of heat), 
well fed, and they will keep quiet and 
repay you for this extra care, that at 
the first outlook may appear like fool­
ishness, but it is not. When they are 
about a week old I begin to wean 
thorn away from custard and intro­
duce whole buckwheat, and allow 
more run. When commencing to feed 
buckwheat, do not forgot to furnish 
water for beverage, or thick, sour 
milk, and clam or oyster shells broken 
fine. The old-fashioned idea of rais­
ing turkeys on curd alone, and allow­
ing thorn to range from ono end of the 
farm to the other has exploded.”

EXPERIMENTS WITH PHOSPHATE.

At a meeting of the western New 
York Farmers’ Club, a mom her re­
ported that in 1874 he used 150 lbs. of 
phosphate to the acre on a field of 
barley, and secured 47 7-10 bushels 
per acre, against 28 1-7 bushels whore 
the phosphate was not used. In 1875, 
on two-rowed barley, be raised 43 3-8 
bushels, against 25 5-6 on land not so 
manured. He believes in special fer 
tilizers, and proposes the coming year 
to uso 500 lbs. sown broadcast on po­
tatoes ; then mix 100 lbs. with wood 
ashes and apply in the hill. Another 
member said : “ Wo ought to know 
what we buy the special fertilizer for 
—if for potatoes, buy a fertilizer rich 
in potash—if for wheat, one rich in 
phosphoric acid.”

BREEDING MARES.

The best ago of mares for breeding 
is from six to twelve years ; bat they 
often produce colts when fifteen to 
eighteen years. It is a doubtful policy 
to allow oi l, broken down mares to 
breed, unless they possess some re­
markably good qualities, because a 
valuable horse can be raised, worth 
from $200 to $500, as cheaply as one 
worth $50. In horses like produces 
like too unerringly to spend much 
money in raising pooranimals. Broken 
wind, spavin, ringbone, founder, and 
blindness in a dam is transmissible to 
the colt. So, also, is the temper and 
defects in her form. One of the best 
English writers on this subject says:
“ Breed as much as possible with pure 
blood of the right kind, and breed 
what is technically called up, not 
down ; that is, by breeding the mare 
to a male of superior, not inferior 
blood to herself; except where it is 
desired to breed like to like, for the 
purpose of perpetuating a pure stream 
of any particular variety which fa 
needful. A half-breed mare should 
never be put to a half-breed stallion, 
as in that case the product in nine 
cases out of ten degenerates below the 
dam, whereas if she bo bred to a 
thorough-bred stallion, the product 
will bo superior. Another error is, 
to breed from mares that have become 
noted for their speed. Some persons 
will pick up some long-logged, broken- 
down, trotting mare, which could 
perhaps trot her mile in 2.30, think­
ing to produce something very fine. 
Nothing can be more ill-judged, as in 
the majority of instances it is sure to 
end in disappointment. A mare, with 
all the best blood in her veins, if she 
has not got good shape and good 
points, is not fit for a stallion."

THE BEST SALT FOR BUTTER.

At a late meeting of the National 
Butter, Cheese and Egg Association 
in Chicago, the question camo up in 
regard to the best salt for dairy uso ; 
and the decision was that Ashton’s 
Liverpool is the best. I quote a few 
remarks : “ Several members said they 
had formerly used Ashton’s but of late 
they had been unable to get the 
genuine imported salt, and they had 
changed, some to Boston salt, others 
to Onondaga, still others to Western 
brands or other Liverpool makes. 
Mr. Thomas Webster of Samuel 
Thompson’s Nephews, New York, the 
agents of Ashton’s salt for fifty years, 
satisfied the Convention that the sail 
was fully up to its previous high 
standard of quality, and was the same 
in all respects that it had always 
been. Ho said that there always had 
been and was still a secret process 
employed in the manufacture of Ash 
ton’s salt which no other salt makers 
possessed. His firm was bent upon 
prosecuting every man who sold or 
offered any counterfeit of Ashton’s 
brand which, he. knew, had been ex­
tensively pirated.” 1 .advise dairy­
men to obtain this salt, if possible, as 
I have used it for butter many years. 
It sells at about one dollar per sack 
more than other kinds ; but a sack will 
salt 1800 lbs. of butter ; and what is 
one dollar saved on that quantity; 
while, perhaps, you will lose $60 or 
$70 in the priée of it, if poor salt be 
used 7

ARTIFICIAL BUTTER.

There is an article called “ oleomar­
garine ” now being manufactured 
extensively aiid sold as butter. It is 
reported from good authority that 
3,000 firkins of it are made weekly in 
the vicinity of New York, to say 
nothing of what is made elsewhere; 
and that it is preferred by hotel 
keepers, and restaurants, to real butter 
of tbe common grades. Mr. Willard, 
the editor of the Dairy Department of 
the Rural New Yorker, says :

The process of manufacturing oleo­
margarine butter has so far perfected 
the grain and flavor that many per­
sons do not readily detect the differ­
ence between it and ordinary butter, 
while it is often preferred' to the 
common grades of the genuine article. 
What, then, would he the result of 
this state of things, or what should 
we naturally expect ? Would it not 
have a demoralizing influence oil the 
butter trade—reducing prices of the

genuine article ? Indeed, may not the 
extraordinary weakness manifested in 
the butter market at the present time 
bo in some measure attributable to the 
oleomargarine production ? If its 
manufacture goes on increasing in the 
ratio that it has during the past year 
or so, the butter dairymen of the 
country may well fear for their in­
terests, for they have a dangerous 
competitor in this new substitute, not 
only in the homq markets, but in tbe 
markets of the world. In our dairy 
market reports, our readers will have 
obseived that oleomargarine, or arti­
ficial'butter, is quoted in tlie London 
markets at a price not much below 
American; and we are informed that 
immense quantities of this article are 
constantly being put into British con­
sumption. That the article lias already 
obtained a strong foothold in English 
markets cannot be doubted, and from 
what we can learo, it is likely to be 
permanently retained as an article of 
food under the name of ** Margarine.”

MILK ROOMS.

The quantity of cream prod need by 
milk depends greatly on tbe situation 
of the milk room. A cool, airy room 
in the cellar, if it be high and well 
ventilated, and on the north side, 
answers the purpose very well. But 
the floor should be cemented, and no 
odors of decayed vegetables should be 
allowed to enter it. Milk rooms are 
often constructed above ground, some­
times connected with the dwelling, 
and sometimes separate ; but they 
should always bo shaded by trees or 
otherwise. When the large modern 
pans are used, an out-door room is 
preferable to a cellar, especially if the 
water from a cool spring can be 
brought underground and made to 
circulate under and around the pans.

A FERTILIZER FOR STRAWBERRIES.
An experiment made last year by 

myself may not como amiss at this 
time with those who grow strawberries.
I procured a half hogshead, filled it 
with rain water, and put into it one- 
quarter pourd common nitre. When 
the strawberry plants were blossom­
ing out, I gave thorn a sprinkling of 
the solution at evening twice a week 
until the fruit was nearly full size. 
The result was double the amount of 
fruit on those where the liquid was 
applied to was obtained from those 
right alongside of those where none 
of the liquid was applied. Let us give 
it a trial.—[Selected,

LICE ON CATTLE.
I find the following good remedies 

for lice on cattle in the “ Country 
Gentleman :” I once rid my stock, 
which was badly infested with lice, 
by sifting ground plaster along the 
neck and back. Two or three applica. 
lions did the work effectually. The 
plaster should he very fine and dry. 
Another method which I have used 
with great satisfaction is with carbolic 
acid. One ounce of carbolic crystals, 
one pound of common bar soap, melted 
together by the addition of a little 
water. Lot an animal be washed in 
a strong suds made with this, and it 
is sure death to all parasites, and will 
cure all ski i diseases. Both these 
remedies are simple, harmless and 
effectual. Lice will live fur a long 
time in the wood work about the 
barn ; it is a good plan to whitewash 
about the lean-to, and prevent their 
spreading in that way.

MANURING CORN.
In manuring for corn apply the 

dung or fertilizer near the surface. 
This is our practice, and as wo find it 
successful, we can offer substantial 
reasons. Tbe corn plant loves warmth, 
ar.d the roots grow best in the warmest 
earth. A temperature of 90 degrees 
is said to bo the most favorable for 
the growth of corn roots. Now by 
applying the fertility near the surface, 
the roots find nutriment to absorb at 
the point where the physical agencies 
are present for the most rapid develop­
ment. If a hill of corn be dug in the 
fall, and the roots exam ined, the upper 
portion will be found very fibrous, 
while other roots run down deeply, 
apparently to bring up the needed 
moisture.—[Selected.

HOW TO PROTECT MELONS.
Common land plaster is a sure pro­

tection to melon and cucumber plants, 
if sprinkled on while the dew is on 
them, and if put on as fast as needed.
I find finely sifted coal ashes mixed 
with plaster—half of each—just as 
good as pure plaster. Lime should 
not bo used; as it kills the plants. 
Boxes 12 to 15 inches square, open 
top and bottom, and 8 to 10 inches 
high, are an excellent protection 
against insects, as well as cold weather.

GOOD BREEDS OF FOWLS.
The four best breeds of fowls in 

this country are :
1.—Light Brahmas, the finest form, 

one of the largest, the most beautiful, 
very peaceable, confined by a fence 
three or four foot high, require each 
only ono bushel and three pecks of 
mixed grain a year, cost of feed $1, 
and lay about 150 eggs annually of 
very large size,

2. —Plymouth Rucks, produced 15 
years ago by a cross of Dominique 
fowls on an Asiatic breed, not quite so 
largo as Brahmas, very hardy, con­
sume same quantity of feed as Brahmas, 
and lay as many eggs as that breed — 
a fine market fowl.

3. —Leghorns, a small-fowl, various 
colors, all good, require a high fence 
to yard them, non-sitters, too small lu 
sell well dressed, cat a bushel and a 
half of grain in a year, not very hardy 
combs liable to freeze, valuable only 
for their eggs, lay from 150 to 200 
each in a year.

4. —Uamburgs, several colors, a 
splendid little fowl, non-sitters, not 
quite as large as Leghorns, require 
the same food, noted assplendid layers, 
and that, like the Leghorn, is all they 
are good for, or in the main.

A GOOD CEMENT.

The following way of making a good 
cement is said to produce an article 
that is excellent: A good cement for 
mending almost anything may be 
made by mixing together litharge 
and glycerine to the consistency of 
thick cream or fresh putty. This 
cement is useful for mending stone 
jars or any other coarse earthenware, 
stopping leaks in seams of tinpans or 
wash boilers, cracks or holes in iron 
kettles, &c. I have filled holes an 
inch is diameter in kettles and used 
the same for years in boiling water 
and feed. It may also be used to 
fasten on lamp tops to tighten loose 
nuts, to secure loose bolts whose nuts 
are lost, tighten loose joints of wood 
or iron, loose boxes in wagon-hubs, 
and in a great many others. In all 
eases the article mended should not 
be used till the cement has hardened, 
which will require from one day to a 
week, according to the quantity used. 
This cement will resist the action of 
water hot or cold, acids, aud almost 
any degree of boat.

PLANTING POTATOES.

From thousands of tests it has been 
shown that there is no difference 
generally in the crops when planted 
in drills or in hills—at least not 
enough difference to enable farmers to 
decide which is the best way to plant 
potatoes ; and the consequence is, that 
they plant both ways, according to 
their customs. Suppose wo plant in 
rows three feet apart, and the hills 
tbe same distance in the rows, itwouid 
seem that if we planted in drills, the 
rows three feet apart, aud the seed 
dropped 18 inches apart, or 12 to 15 
inches, as is often done, that we should 
obtain a much larger yield than on 
the three hill system. Lut such is not 
often the case, unless more manure is 
used in the drills than in the hills. 
The seed planted is about the same in 
both cases.

THE SEED—HOW PREPARED, AC.

I have many times proved that 
small potaloos (not very small) will 
produce as large crops as large ones, 
if the season is fav irahle ; but if an 
early drouth occur, the large potatoes 
afford an nourishment to the young 
plants that small seeds cannot do. 
Bat if the large seed he cut into three 
or fonr pieces, I hero is no difference 
as regards nourishment. It is not, 
however, advisable to select the small 
seed to plant for many years, as by so 
doing with the same variety, and 
grown on the same farm, some de­
terioration as to size of the tubers will 
be the result. A change of seed 
occasionally is advisable. In cutting 
potatoes to plant, it should he done 
lengthwise, so as to divide the cluster 
of eyes on the seed end. Drying the 
cut seed upon the grass for a day or 
two renders it Dss liable to rot when 
planted early in a soil that retains 
water in a cold spell of weather. The 
proper depth to plant is six inches, or 
about that depth as a general rule ; 
but good crops are often grown when 
the seed is covered deeper or shallower, 
owing to the favorableness of the 
season.

HOW TO SAVE LABOR.

As “ time is money,” farmers should 
study how to plant and grow crops 
with the least labor, at the same time 
doing the work well. On clean mellow 
soil potatoes may be advantageously 
planted and cultivated as follows :— 
After plowing and harrowing, mark 
off the rows three feet (two feet and a 
half may often do as well as three) 
with a plow, then drop the seed as you 
want it, if you adopt the drill system. 
A single piece of seed, or a single 
small potato, placed about 15 inches 
apart will give you all the crop that 
the land is capable of producing. Or 
you may plant a little move seed at 18 
or 24 inches apart, and get an equally 
good crop. Cover the seed with a 
one horse plow, running on both sides 
of the rows, ami * leaving eacli drill 
ridged up. Leave the laud thus till 
the potatoes have grown nearly as 
high as 1 ho level ot the land ; and then 
take your harrow, turn its teeth up, 
place a few large stones upon it as a 
weight, give the full length of the 
traces, and then run the reversed

harrow crosswise of the rows, lapping 
enough to make tho groand perfectly 
smuotli ; and if you break off some of 
tho plants no injury will be done. In 
a few days the potatoes will be above 
ground growing finely, and not a weed 
in the field!

AFTER CULTIVATION.

If your land is not productive of 
many weeds, nothing need be done to 
the potatoes till they approach the 
time to blossom, when you should run 
a cultivator between the rows, and as 
close to tiiem as possible, twice in a 
row. You now take a horse hoe, witli 
adjuslible mould boards to suit the 
width of the rows, and run it twice 
between each row, billing up the 
potatoes just enough to cover all the 
weeds among them ; and if t|jo work 
he well done, no further cultivation will 
ho necessary. I advise first running 
a cultivator between the hills to loosen 
tho soil, so that the horse-'uoe shall do 
its work well.

FERTILIZERS TO BE USED.

Stable manure ii good enough of 
itself ; hut phosphate of lime, ashes, 
and all commercial fertilizers contain­
ing considerable potash are good ; but 
not nitrogeneous fertilizers, as guano, 
hen manure, and commercial fertilizers 
containing a large percentage of am­
monia, In preparing a piece of ground 
for mangolds, or carrots, spread tbe 
manure broad cast—a heavy coat, and 
plant to potatoes, keeping tho weeds 
thoroughly subdued, and the next year 
the land will be in excellent condition 
for a root crop.

For tho Colonial Farmer.
New Strawberries.

The year 187(> bas been almost as 
evenlfil in the fruit world, as it has 
been in arts and sciences. We have 
been agreeably surprised at the ap- 
pea ran ce of ono or two varieties of 
strawberries, which in some respects 
excel anything with which we have 
previously lieen acquainted. Some of 
them have given signs of such un­
usual excellence .a* to cause a perfect 
furore among fruit growers in regard 
to them. Beautiful berries indeed 
they were, and tho season of 1877 is 
anxiously awaiting with tho hope that 
the second crop, with belter care, will 
reveal even finer specimens. For the 
benefit of those who have not yet seen 
them I will endeavor to point out a 
few of their excellencies.

Captain Jack.—This can hardly be 
called a military variety, even though 
possessed of such an imposing titlef 
and the only success that it is likely 
to meet in this line, is in putting to 
rout several of the older varieties that 
have hitherto taken the lead. It 
certainly has merits of unusual promi. 
nencc, and tho Goddess Fame seems 
to be bestowing words of praise upon 
it, that would be perfectly overwhelm­
ing to a less worthy subject. I was 
greatly pleased last summer to notice 
tho bountiful way in which Captain 
Jack was repaying the attentions that 
had been bestowed upon him. The 
plants were perfectly loaded down 
with fine looking berries—having 
fully twice the crop of the usually 
productive Wilsons that were growing 
near at hand, this loo, though growing 
on a hot, sandy soil. The berries are 
of a rich, red color, large size, and 
givo promiso of unusnal value for a 
shipping berry. Success to Captain 
Jack. May each year find him doing 
even better than tho preceding one.

Cumberland Triumph.—To say that 
this is a triumph in the art of propo- 
gating strawberries, is hardly giving 
it sufficient praise. The Committee 
at the Centennial Exhibition in Phil­
adelphia last summer, in bringing in 
their report, mentioned it as being 
the finest flavored berry that had been 
exhibited. This refutes the erroneous 
expression that “ The smallest berries 
arc the sweetest,” as these berries are 
frequently what many would call of 
enormous size. Tnis idea that the 
smallest fruits are tbe sweetest and 
best is false, and should ho put an end 
to. The finest and most delicious 
Fall Pippins, Notbern Spy, Harvest 
and other apples, are found among the 
largest and most perfect specimens. 
Because some diminutive strawberries 
are sweeter than the Wilsons, which 
are noted for their acidity, it does nol 
make the rule hold true in reference 
to other strawberries. It is usual ly 
those who are unfamiliar with any 
except tho Wilsons, and possibly one 
or two other kinds, that cling to this 
false whim. If one of those mammoth 
and delicious Cumberland Triumphs 
could only drop from the skies into 
their midst, there would quickly be a 
scattering of those holding this opinion.

Great American.—This is a gift of 
187G that Americans may well be 
proud of. It is perhaps sufficient for 
mo to say that it is probably the! 
largest strawberry that has ever been 
grown. The berries are frequently 
of colossal size —nearly nine inches in 
circumference. Take three or four 
ordinary sized strawberry apples and 
place them upon a saucer. This will

show how they appear, but tho rich 
flavor and delicious quality of tho 
fruit can only be ascertained by 
making a trial of them as opportunity 
offers.

Such are some of the new straw­
berries. It may bo years before finer 
ones will make their appearance. 
They are kinds that will well repay 
any care that may be bestowed upon 
them. A little plot of strawberry 
plants of a rod or two square will give 
a delicious feast for many days in suc­
cession. Considerable care should bo 
taken as to where the plants are ob­
tained from, as spurious plants in 
great numbers will be sent through 
the mails during the coming season. 
The plants will fully verify what I- 
have written in regard to them, and 
oven royalty would gladly assist in 
feasting upon tho berries that they 
will produce.

R H. Haines.
Malden-on-lhe-Hudson, N, Y.

To Prevent Chafing

An exchange, remarking on the 
chafing of the breasts of horses, saj'e:

‘‘The common practice of using 
pads or sheepskin under the collar is 
objectionable especially in warm 
weather, because it accumulates heat 
and makes the breast tender. A bet­
ter way is to take a piece of thick, 
smooth leather, cut it out just tho 
size of the collar, or a little wider, 
and lot it lie flat on the neck and 
shoulders of the horse. This will lie 
still and smoothe on the horse’s neck, 
while the collar itself moves about, 
and so it will prevent chafing. In 
addition to this, lot tho breasts of 
working horses be washed off every 
night with clean water.”

Think of tiie children.—Every 
boy residing in tho country should bo 
taught how to hud, graft and propa­
gate plants from seed and cuttings, as 
well ns receive a few lessons in vege­
table physiology, at .least to
enable him to determine the principal 
organs of production, in order that 
he may know how the different 
varieties of corn become mixed when 
planted near together, as well os 
many other kinds of cultivated plants. 
Five dollars worth of books and a 
course of sixty lessons given in the 
country school house, or elsewhere, 
by some one who knows how to ex­
plain such things in simple, easy- 
understood language, would, in r.ine 
cases out of ten, make a boy believe 
that the farm was, as it is, the Let t 
place in the world for amusing and 
instructive study.—Rural New Yorker.

Setting Flower Cuttings.

A practical florist gives Vnc follow­
ing directions for selling cuttings : 
A healthy plant should be selected, 
and strong-looking woody pieces cut 
off; these, with a blosso n on the end, 
rarely fail. Trim off the largo leaves, 
and put them in water for a few hours 
or a day. Cuttings t fivy (tradestnutia), 
wandering jexv, canary bird flower 
(Iropctolum percyrinum) and oleander, 
should be started in water and kept in 
water, in the shad, until a little root 
appears. Each cutting should have a 
good sized pot. or several cuttings can 
be put in a wooden box. The best soil 
for amateurs to use is half good earth 
and half white sand, will mixed ; 
water well and keep in tho shade, but 
not in the light until the cuttings 
have taken, then give full sun. Trans­
planting geraniums in them, sinking 
the pots in summer, and if the earth 
is not rich they can be watered with 
fertilizers in winter. A five inch pot 
will do for a geranium for a year.

Nijxe Novgorod Fair.—The great mar­
ket of the eastern world has bean held at this 
junction of tho Volga and Olga Hivers, in 
Russia, every summer for hundreds of years. 
Here the nations of Europe and Asia" meet 
with their products for trade. Cossack, 
Chinese, Turk and Persian meet the Gei-man 
and the Greek with every variety of mer­
chandize that mankind employs, "from sap­
phires to grindstones, ten, opium, fur, food, 
tools and fabrics, and last but not least, 
medicines. J. C. Ayer Sc Co.'s celebrated 
remedies from America were displayed in an 
elegant Bazar where the Doctor himself 
might sometimes be seen. They are known 
and taken on steppes of Asia as well ns the 
prairies of the West, and are an effectual nh- 
tidote for the diseases that prevail in tho 
yaourts of the North, as well as the huts and 
cabins of the western continent.—Lincoln 
(Ilk) Times,

Sack ville, N. B., Feb. i.% 1877.
J. II. Robinson, Esq., St. John N. B.

Dear Sir:—Early in October last I took a 
severe cold which settled on my lungs. Af­
ter having a had cough for about six weeks 
l had a very severe attack of bleeding from 
the lungs while on a passage from Queens­
town to Dover. I had daily spells of bleed­
ing for some days until I had lost about two 
gallons of blood, and was so week as to bo 
scarcely able to stand. I put back to Queens­
town, where I received such medical assist­
ances as enabled me to get home.

I saw an advertisement of your Phosplmr- 
ize Cod Liver Oil Emulsion in a paper. I 
immediately sent and got a half dozen bottles; 
after taking which I feel mvelf a well man 
again. Mv weight, which was reduced to 
120 pounds, is now up to its usual standard 
of 152 pounds. Seeing what it has done for 
me I can confidently recommend it to others 
afflicted with lung diseases.

Yours very trulv,
(Signed) Joshua" Harper,

Of the bark “ Mary Lowerwun.”
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STRANGE WORK FOR RATS.

Mr. Editor,—On Wednesday night n 
strong smell of gas was observed in the 
" Albion Hotel,"’ occupied by me as a board­
ing house. In looking for the cause it was 
found that rats had eaten out a space in the 
leaden pipe of about 11 x | inches.

Now, Mr. Editor, Mr. Morris has his Store 
underneath the “ Albion Hotel,” and he 
refused, when requested,' to turn the gas off. 
What I want to know is, if a fire had taken 
place could I get damages from him, and 
should he not be held responsible for ti.e 
damages had any occurred. I ask this in ensv 
anything of the kind should occur again, not 
only to myself but others, so that we may by 
able to look to some quarter for protection.

Had a light been near the leak on the night 
in question, no doubt there would have been 
a serious fire.

Yours, &c.,
H. Y. Hoyt.

ppm i.1'," i'.
IMPORTANT NOTICE.

! burning, piling, planting and harvesting. 
Two orthrreindustriousmen working together 
could, without greatly interfering with their 
ordinary work in town, in three years make 
very considerable cleavings, and put up snug, 
if not very pretentious dwellings and barns ; 
and in this way it would be possible for 
laboring men to establish themselves on 
farms, without exposing their families to all 
the discomforts and privations which have 
hitherto generally attended pioneer life in 
the wilderness of New Brunswick.

The Honorable Frederick P. Robinson died 
at his residence on Friday, the 11th instant, 
at the advanced age «if 01 years and 7 months. 
Although of late years living in retirement, 
he had in former times taken an active part 
in the affairs of the Province. In 1827 Sir 
Howard Douglas procured for him the office 
of Auditor General, and appointed him a 
member of the Executive and Legislative 
Council—then in one. He performed these 
duties for very many years. He also took an

i active part in the Militia and commanded the 
We have spoken solely of laboring men, i l8t York Battalion, 

but our remarks apply with equal force to | The late F. P. Robinson was the fourth 
hundreds of others. The ideas advanced are j eon of Colonel Beverley Robinson, a Loyalist

The death of the lato Mr. Charles 

S. Lugrin renders the immédiat*; 
settlement of all accounts due to tin 
Farmer Office, either for subscripliot 
or otherwise, absolutely imperative 
Our friends will understand that they 
must pay their accounts at once, oi 
legal proceedings will bo taken. The 
Publisher of the Farmer wishes it tv. 

be distinctly understood that ho is not 
in a position to grant any delay. It 
is his intention to improve the Farmer 
in many respects during the ensuing 
summer, but ho requires every dollar 
due him. Hundreds of persons owe 
the establishment small amounts, and 
permit their indebtedness to continue, 
more from inattention than anjT other 
reason. To these the Publisher wishes 
to soy that although the amounts oi 
their respective accounts is small, the 
aggregate is large, and that he cannot 
undertake to present each one of them 
with an account. There is really no 
good reason why every dollar due 
him, except where the parties are dead 
insolvent or absent from the country’, 
should not be remitted within a very 
few day’s. XJnder these circumstances 
those who do not respond promptly 
to this notice must not be offended if 
they are put to costs. It is unpleasant 
to be obliged to make so poremptoiy 
a demand, which the Publisher desire s 
his patrons to understand is rendered 
necessary by an unforeseen emergency.

C|t Colonial Jfarmer,
Fredericton, N. B., May 14, 1877.

Changes come so quickly and so often now- 
B'-dftys tiiat we scarcely notice facta and 
Circumstance?2 even of very great and vén 
general importance. Only » few years have 
pâsseTsitÆè TlïosêrîïïTefÇBTBir îrrttre program 
ef the communities along the St. John river 
«peculated upon the establishment of such a 
system of internal communication that the 
trade centres farthest inland would be only 
e days journey from the sea. It was.thought, 
end very generally expressed, that if this 
could be accomplished, a new era in the trade 
of the whole district would begin, and the 
development of the country’s resources (how 
hackneyed the phrase has become!) proceed 
with unexampled rapidity. As yet the rail­
way extensions in the bands of the energetic 
proprietors of the New Brunswick Railway 
are not entirely completed, but sufficient ha? 
been done to enable persons residing any­
where below Grand Falls to leave home in 
the morning and reach St. John by seven 
-o’clock P. M. of the same day, or leave 
"Caribou, in the heart of Aroostook, one 
morning, and be in Boston the next. Or the 
traveller can leave St. John in the morning, 
remain three hours in Fredericton, take his 
tea at Andover, and be in Caribou or Grand 
Falls quite early in the evening. Time, not 
space, being the great measure of distance in 
-one sense, the districts bordering on the 
Upper St. John have been brought nearer 
the sea.

Those who recommended the settleniftli 
of the fertile lands in Victoria County, and 
In adjacent sections, have heretofore been 
met by the objection that to move to those- 
localities waslike going out of the world, and if 
the objection was a weighty one, now fortunal e- 
ly there is no' longer anything in it. These 
fine agricultural lands here been brought 
dose to the centres of population. This i.- 
the fact which we wish to bring home to 
•the laboring men of this City, and the young 
men in the farming districts all oyar the 
•country. In Fredericton a great many in- : 
«dustrious men find only partial employment. 
Peruaps there is qo actual destitution among 
laborers, but very many of them are unable to 
find work at all seasons of the year, and their 
families are growing up, exposed to all the 
temptations, and profiting very little by the 
ltd vantages of a city life. The ordinary day 
laborer of Fredericton is a steady, industrious, : 
honest going man, who tries to do his best y 
for his employer and himselt. Yet year after; 
year of toil finds him, in most cases, no. 
further advanced in material prosperity. Ii ' 
ten years time the amount of work, which 
he does in town, expended upon a farm would 
place him in a position of independence, and 
accumulate for him a good property ; and a> 
within eight hours railroading, and a fev 
hours walk of Fredericton, lie beautiful hard 
wood ridges, where farms may bo had b> 
actual settlers for the asking, there would 
»eein V» be no obstacle in the way of the 
class we refer to greatly bettering theii 
(position. If one avails himself of the New 
Brunswick Railway, brforo the first nightfall 
he can stand upon the finest farming I »nd in 
Easter^ North America, and begin to make 
* farm. We do not speak with authority, 
but we believe that any persons who actually 
intend to settle upon new land, could make 
verv liberal arrangements with the Railway 
people to l>e carried back and forth over the 
line until they were prepared to move their 
families. We are satisfied that the Company 
are too mucli alive to their own interests tu 
do otherwise. Then what we propose is this. | 
There are very few laboring men in Fred­
ericton who are not idle more or less in the 
twelvemonth. To these we suggest that they , 
select a lot of 100 >r 200 acres, somewhere 
near the N. B. Railway—say within five oi 
ten miles of it, and when they are not em­
ployed here, or when work is l( slack," go and 
make a clearing. One full crop on new lnnd 
always pays tbojexpcuse of; the^cbopping?

not chimerical. They are such as can be 
practically acted upon, and if any persons 
are desirous of putting them in practice, by 
calling upon the editor of this paper they 
can obtain all the information which he has 
respecting the wild lands of Victoria County.

Wo give below an extract from a speech of

who came to Nova Scotia in 1783, from 
thence to Now Brunswick in 1787 and look 
up his residence at the Nashwaaksis, near 
Fredericton. He afterwards by Royal War­
rant, raised and commanded the New 
Brunswick Regiment.

Mayor Fenety has planted a very nice
Mr. Cross, delivered in the British House of double row of maplo trees along tho river 
Commons on tho eighth instant, in which he i bank. There are 100 trees in all. The i ft1

master has forbidden the public to drive 
the bank, and Mr. Fenety has rendered it 
impossible to do so by rows of posts extend­
ing from the macadamized roadway to the 
top of the bank. In a few years this portion 
of the city will be greatly beautified. We 
join with the citizens in applauding the 
Mayor’s public spirit and cheerfully assent to 
the suggestion that Fenety Avenue bo the 
name of the improvement. It is not intend­
ed, we believe, to allow shingles or other 
lumber to be piled on the bank hereafter. 
This is all right in the present state of trade : 
but we hope no obstacles will be thrown in 
the way of tho legitimate use of the river 
at this point for shipping purposes.

defined the policy of the government in the 
present crisis. It has a grand ring about it 
and is worthy of the occasion on which it 
was uttered. Taken in connection with the 
vast preparations being made in Great 
Britain it would seem to imply that the 
British Ministry had determined upon enter­
ing into the conflict now being waged. If, 
is is stated, the Sultan lias proclaimed a holy 
war, it is not impossible that Great Britain 
may have instigated such a course. The con­
flict which Russia has precipitated is only a 
<lep in the policy of aggression which has 
?haracterized that Empire ever since it en­
tered the arena of European politics. Sooner 
or later the Indian Empire would be threat­
ened, if it has not been so already, and sooner 
ir later Great Britain would be compelled to 
interpose. Her Majesty the Queen is Em­
press of ! ndia and ruler of over 15,000,000 
Mahammeltaus who look to the Sultan of 
Turkey as their Spiritual head. Many of 
these arc men of great wealth, and although 
their creed is not pure Islamism they are de­
voted followers of the prophet. They are 
the most troublesome portion of the Indian 
population. With their aid the Sultan, 
backed up by the naval power of Great 
Britain, may not only be able to hold Russia 
in check but may so cripple her resources as 
to remove all danger of aggression from such 
a quarter for many years to come. If it is 
possible for Great Britain to insist upon the 
observance of treaty obligations in Europe 
and protect her Asiatic possessions by the 
whole power of Mahomettanism, Earl Bea- 
consfield’s administration would be covered 
with glory. But we have wandered from our 
object which was to present the extract from 
Mr. Cross’s speech. He says Not to sanction 
oppression or tyranny in any part of the 
world ; to preserve treaty engagements, and 
set an example which, if followed by elimi­
nations, would materially add to the happiness 
of the world ; deeply as we regret war, to 
maintain the strictest neutrality between the 
contending nations; outside the necessities 
of this actual wav, to maintain as they ought 
to maintain, and as any British Government 
would maintain, those interests of England 
which ought to be maintained. We have no 
thought of fear or gain, and before tho face 
of the House of Commons it will be declared, 
and before the face of England, of Europe, 
and of the world, that the Government is 
conscious of the honesty of its own purpose. 
They are conscious of their strength. They 
will not use their strength improperly’, but 
wherever opportunity may offer to stay this 
war, to heal these wretched divisions, to im­
prove the condition of these Christian popula­
tions in any way which will really improve 
them, the Government will give* their service.

A correspondent informs the .Globe of the 
drowning of a young man named Wesley 
Jordan, in the St. John river, near Bear 
Island, on Saturday evening last. Wesley 
Jordan and a young cousin named George 
Jordan, a lad of about twelve years, started 
on a small raft down the river to their homes, 
a distance of several miles. They did not go 
out a short distance before they struck a jam 
of logs lodged against a rock, when the young 
man Wesley, thinking tho raft would be 
ipset and carried under the jam by the force 
of the current, sprang off on the logs ; by the 
shock of the striking raft tho little boy was 
thrown off into the water and carried under 
the outer end of the jam and Wesley was 
horrified to see him drowning before his eyes, 
and utterly regardless of self threw himself 
in and swam to him, catching the lad as he 
was about sinking. Tie supported him quite 
\ distance towards the shore when, beinp 
encumbered with heavy clothing and boots, 
he said to the little boy, I cannot get ashore, 
and almost immediately sank and was drown­
ed. The little boy reached a floating block 
of cedar, and clinging to it drifted down with 
the current nearly half a tyi|e, wkere a raft 
was tied which he reached, and nearly ex­
hausted drew himself out. He got to the 
shore, climbed a steep bank in front of Mr. 
Atherton's house, when his strength utterly 
failed. His cries attracted attention and he 
r2os tflked to the house where Mrs. Atherton 
with kindness and skill nursed him until able 
10 reach When be got to the bank
he could walk no further,, Jb© cord» of his 
neck, back and legs where drawn into fagnghes 
or knots, rendering his limbs stiff and full of 
severe pains and cramps. Up to last night 
the young macs h-d^ had not been found. 
He was a tine youth, full of prçspise, much 
respected iu the community and deeply 
lamented by his parents, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Jordan.

Messrs. Gurrfey ji/jd Norris, who resigned 
their seats in the Commons, baye been re­
elected. Mr. .Anglin is to seek the suffrage.1 
of the Gloucester electors again, and rumor 
has it that Mr. K. F. Bums, M. P. P.t will 
oppose him. We are not desirous of losing 
Mr. Burns from the local arepn. From 
Ottawa come all soils of rumors. Messrs. 
Blake, Cauchon and Smith are to leave the 
Cabinet, Mr. Mackenzie to give up the Public 
Works portfolio and act only ns Premier. 
Mr. Killtmi tc t&}fe a vacant place. One of 
the New Brunswick Senators is tp resign so 
it is said, and if Mr. Anglin is defeated he is 
to go into the Senate. These and other 
rumors find their way from Ottawa ; and 
whether they are true or c$t political changes 
seem imminent. It will be time enough to 
comment on them when they come. In local 
politics the stagnation is complete, the onlv 
thing worth remarking upon being that tho 
Consolidate.d'Statutes are supposed to be law 
since the first of May, and by tfie usual good 
management of the King Government “ you 
cannot tell where to find them.” Tho glorious 
Action that every man is supposed to know 
the law cornea in liapitqj play just now.

Capt. Leigh, of this City, has a duck of 
the comnio.g country breed that is not going 
to let any English duck b^t it in the matter 
of eggs. We were shown an egg laid by it 
that, was3 inches long,6$ ins. in circumference 
one-way, and 7| ice, the other. It weighed 
;ar'Iy 1 ounces.

Gibion is fast rising in importance. Its 
wlmrf is covered with lumber. It is a regular 
point of departure for one steamer, the 
others call and schooners load and unload 
.here. There is quite a contrast between'the 
two sides of the river just at that point. On 
lie ono side all is lift; and activity. On the 

other are deserted wharves and piles of lum* 
her which have long waited for a market.

Mr. Richards, the Agent in this City for 
tho Hartford Fire Insurance Company of 
Hartford, Conn., has just received from the 
Company a fac-similie of the second policy 
issued by them, and is dated February 8th, 
1704, issued to William Imlay, Esq. The 
policy is quite a curiosity in its way, and 
demonstrates how much more man put confi­
dence in man in 1794 than they do in 1877. 
It is neatly framed and may be seen at Mr. 
Richard’s office. We have also received the 
“ One hundred and thirty-fourth Semi-Annual 
Statement ” of this old and reliable Company, 
in which is shown nett assets amounting to 
$3,273,808.88—all were secured. We are 
glad lo learu that the Company is doing a 
remunerative business in the Dominion ; they 
have a large amount deposited at Ottawa.

John B. Gough, the American Orator, will 
lecture (see advt.) in the City Hall, on Mon­
dai-, 21st inst. In noticing the lecture of 
last winter, the Philadelphia Press speaks as 
follows : —

“ Mr. Gough does not belong to the genns 
of speakers who always appear before an 
audience ‘ for the first time ;’ in fact it would 
be a difficult task to find among lecture-goers 
any one who can remember when they first 
saw John B. Gough, while all concur in the 
hope of never seeing him for the last time. 
No matter what subject he treats, his pleas­
ing manner attracts, liisearnestness interests, 
his mimicry entertains, his dramatic power 
fascinates, and his magnetic personality, at 
once charms and bewilders.”

------------ ~ ^ ----------------
The streets are being put in very good 

condition. If the road-master would fix that 
portion of Brunswick Street which lies for a 
rod or two on either side of Regent Street he 
would confer a favor on the residents of the 
neighborhood.

Mr. Chas. A. Sampson has been appointed 
Secretary of the Board of School Trustees. 
We think he will make a good officer.

The remains of the late Mr. E. D. Watts, 
who was killed at the late fire in St. John, 
were brought to this city on Tuesday for 
interment.

We would call attention to the advertise­
ment in another column of J. D. M. Keator, 
Esq., offering an Ayrshire Bull for sale.

Mr. Edward Parent of Temperance vale 
has a ewe that dropped a lamb one day last 
week that weighed 15 pounds.

Trains regularly cross the. Railway Bridge 
over the St. John at Woodstock.

Messrs. Lugrin & Son :
Gents,—I am directed by the Board to 

request you to publish the accompanying 
Address in the Farmer.

Yours, &c.,
Chas. A. Sampson, 

Secretary.
Address of Condolence to Mrs. Lugrin and

family from the Fredericton Board of
School Trustees.
At a meeting of the Board of School 

Trustees held in their Rooms on Saturday, 
the 5th day of May, the following Resolutions 
were unanimously passed :—

ResolvedThat this Rqar# would record 
its deep regret at the loss it has sustained by 
the death of its late Secretary, 0. S. Lugrin, 
Esq. The faithful discharge of his duties 
during his term of office, the zeal and interest 
which be times manifested in carrying 
out the wishes'of "the Board, and tfoe çorrect 
and satisfactory condition of hie financial 
work,—all these demand from this Board a 
strong aid grateful expression of their appro­
bation : apd further,

Besolved—That a mb? qf tftjs JfaspJqtion 
be communicated to Mrs, Lugrin, and that 
we tender to her and her family our prpfoundest 
sympathy for their irreparable lose.”

Signed,
A. F. Randolph, Chas. A. Sampson, 

Chairjffap, Secretary,

SPORTING ITEMS.

The following Crews have entered for t!.e 
Race on the 24th :— ^

Nowlin, Stroke ; Stevens, Street, A* F- 
Gay ton, Bow.

Gay ton, Stroke ; Allen. E., Gunn ; Mc­
Ginnis, Bow.

Wilson, Stroke ; Beckwith, C. W., Me- 
Peake ; Ifcihinson, Bow.

The new boat which is being built by Ross, 
for the St. Ann’s Rowing Club, is expected 
here about the last of the month.

It is reported that the “Hilderbrand Crew ’’ 
intend challenging any Grew in the St. Ann’s 
Club for a race on Dominion Day.

There are two v*»ry good Base Ball Clubs in 
the City, namely, the “ Mutuals ” and the 
Phœnix. It seems very hard that they cannot 
even get a aqw pasture tq play their matches 
in this year.

The Soulanyes carried a heavy freight of 
produce to 9t. John on Friday, most all of 
which came over the N. B. Railway.

Those who live below the city complain of 
the heaps of broken stone in the roadway.

Very large quantities of lumber have already 
come down and the booms are rapidly filling 
up. Pond’s boom guide is said to be working 
very satisfactorily.

The Soulanyes came in collision with a 
wood boat the other day, which was badly 
injured. The steamer’s bow was damaged a 
little.

The Right Rev. Geo. Conroy, D. D., Bishop 
of Ardagb, Ireland, is daily expected in St. 
John cii route for Halifax. He is a special 
delegate to report to Rome on the condition 
of the R. C. Church in Ontario and QuebjC.

Some heavy guns are being mounted on 
the Citadel in Quebec, and a detachment of 
troops is coming to Halifax.

A Chinaman recently lectured in New 
York. He would not admit that his experi­
ence in civilized and Christian America had 
given him very exalted ideas of the refinement 
or social condition of “ outside barbarians.”

Some repairs have been made on our County 
Court House. The changes in the Court 
Room are for the better, but the place has an 
antiquated look still.

The City of Brussels, with the Canadian 
Pilgrims aboard, is three weeks out and no 
tidings of her have been received. Her 
owners think she has broken a shaft and been 
driven out of her coarse.

A late despatch reports her safe arrival; 
but this has been contradicted. Up to this 
time tho truth is uncertain.

A young man named Welsh, who is said 
to have belonged to Prince Edward Island, 
wls drowned at Libbey’s Brook, Little South­
west on Friday last, while steam driving for 
Dan’l McLaughlin, Esq.
|£_0n Saturday last a lad, aged about three 
years, son of Mr. Wm. Hannah, of Kingston 
Kent, met with his death under peculiar 
circumstances. The lad was standing near 
a stove blowing the steam from the mouth of 
a tea-kettle, when he inhaled some of the 
steam and death ensued in a few hours.— 
Advarce.

To Correspondents.—" J. S.,” Canter­
bury Station.—Will reply to your questions 
in our next issue.

Another Ia mberer Killed !—We learn­
ed last evening that a man named Doyle was 
killed on a brow of logs about 7 miles above 
Iudiautown Brook, on the Renous yesterday. 
—Advance.

The Globe says that the tc champion married 
man’’ lives in Carleton. He was married to 
his fifth wife on Saturday night 1 tst ; his 
fourth wife died as late as March last, and he 
has had three wives within a year.

Iloyt’s German Cologne advertised in our 
issue of to-day as being for sale by Davis & 
Dibhlee Druggist, is an excellent article. It 
has attained a popularity that no other per­
fume has ever reached, and is without doubt 
the most popular one of the day. Call and 
get from them a perfume blotting card. It 
will give you an idea of what a beautiful 
perfume it is.

We are pleased to see that John Pickard, 
Esq. M. P. has recovered from his recent 
illness, and is again able to be out.

The Steam ferry Forty-Second was taken 
to St John on Friday morning iu order that 
her hull might be inspected by the proper 
officer. She will return on Sunday morning 
to the city.

Wc would direct attention to Messrs Mac­
Donald & Kedey’s advertisement in our issue 
of to-day. They assure us that their present 
spring importations have been made not 
more exteusive scale than formely.

Some Egg.—Mrs. Jackson, of Muniac, 
showed an egg of an English breed of duck 
which weighed 4 ounces ; it was 7 inches in 
circumference and 3 inches in length.—Tel.

advance of the column up the valley of 
Tschumkson.”

The latest reports as to the attack on Kars 
are to the effect that the Russians were un­
successful.

The Russians on Monday bombarded Mat- 
chin in Dobrupscha for four hours.

The Russians are preparing to close the 
Suling mouth of the Danube to monitors by 
batteries.

Wednesday.

The Times despatch from Vienna says 
news of unsuccessful attempts of Russians to 
carry Kars by coup de main is confirmed by 
Russian bulletin, which speaks even of two 
attempts to storm the citadel. The appre­
hensions entertained at Constantinople about 
the fate of Kars are thus set nt rest. It is 
the supposition that th? Russians will invest 
Kars and proceed with bulk of forces towards 
Erzeroum. Both wings of the army appear 
to be moving to force Mukhtar Pasha to 
withdraw and leave passes open for Russian 
main force.

Oonfiic iig accounts come from Servia. 
While on one hand it is announced that the 
Government has officially declared Servia 
would remain neutral, on the other hand 
news comes of warlike preparation.

The general public emphatically approve 
of Derby's answer. The Times correspondent 
at Paris, also reports the unqualified approval 
on the part of the French public.

The Turks ceased cannonading Kalafat 
on account of the vigorous reply of the 
Roumanians.

Prince Milan has been urged by the Russian 
party here to conclude the convention with 
Russia. The Prince however is undecided.

Ameer of Rashgars telegraphs an emphatic 
denial that he has formed an alliance with 
the Sultan against Russia.

The Roumanian army corps started in the 
direction of Giuvgevo this morning. The 
immediate declaration of Roumanian Inde-

IS YOUR LIFE WORTH 10 CENTS?
Sickness prevails everywhere, and every­

body complains of some disease during their 
life. When sick, the object is to get well ; 
now to say plainly that no person in this 
world that is suffering with Dyspepsia, Liver 
Complaint and its effects, such as Indigestion, 
Costiveness, Sick Headache, Sour Stomach, 
Heart Burn, palpitation of the Heart, De­
pressed Spirits, Biliousness, etc., can take 
Green’s August Flower without getting 
relief and cure. If you doubt this, go to 
your Druggist Davis & Dibblee, opposite City 
Hall, aud get a Sample Bottle for 10 cents and 
try it. Regular size 75 cents. Two doses 
will relieve jou.

FROM THE TROY DAILY TIM ES
Peruvian Syrup is a standard remedy 

for building up and renewing broken-down 
or nervous constitutions. For Dyspepsia, 
Debility, Liver Complaint, Kidney and Blad­
der Diseases or part of the many irregulari­
ties of the various organs of the human 
frame, it is a sovereign remedy. It is a tonic 
without alcohol. This medicine is too well- 
known already to require any commenda­
tions from us. It is only necessary for us to 
sa)r to those who have never given it a trial 
that it will accomplish all that is claimed 
for it. Now is the time to tone up the sys­
tem before the hot mouths of Summer fairly 
set in. Sold by all druggists,

Probably no one preparation has received 
so much praise from its patrons, nor is so de­
serving of commendation as Hall’s TIniv Re­
ne we r ! We but echo the voice of the 
millions who have used it when we pronounce 
it the best If air Dressing m the icorld. 11 
stands unrivalled. Those who are affected 
with diseases of the scalp accompanied with 
itching or irritation, find relief and renewal 
in this invaluable remedy. When the hair is 
inclined to fall off, a moderate use of the 
Renew er will strengthen the roots of the

pendence is expected by the Chamber, which . hair, and preserve it, and if it exhibits a ten- 
meets this evening. The Russian advance dency to turn gray it. will restore the natural 
guard will arrive at Giurgevo this evening. ' color.—Fulton (Mo.) Telegraph.
The Roumanian artillery started for Oltun-

Mr. G. M. Able is at present canvassing 
the City and vicinity for a patent farm gate. 
It is of simple construotion, and appeal's to be 
in every respect a great improvement on the 
ordinary gate used on the farm. Mr. Able 
cap be found at the Queen Hotel, where a 
model of the gate eap be seoii,

A diagram and photogarph of the gate can 
be seen at this office.

A spruce raft loaded with potatoes arrived 
from Grand Falls on Friday. The potatoes 
were of the Early ffrjie variety, were pur­
chased for $1.00 per barrel and delivered 
here at a cost of about 17 cents per barrel.

The “ Forty-Second, ” or the middle ferry, 
has gone lo St. John for inspection aud 
repairs. t

WAR NEWS.

Monday.
An Erzevoum despatch, dated May 2nd, 

says the Russian column, numbering î.2,000 
nieu, operating east of Kars, attempted to 
force Sognarle pass at Varisliane, and was 
repulsed. The Russsans twice aeaulted Kars, 
but were repulsed with heavy lor-s.

Abdulap,'the famous Kurd chief of Varz, 
is about to start with 10,000 Kurds for the 
Russian frontier.

A Constantinople despatch states Mudplas 
Pasha telegraphs, Thursday, that in conse- 
quense of the recent engagement before Kars, 
the Russians were obliged to move back their 
camp. 8,000 Russians are encamped near 
Ardahan, but Ardahan had not yet been at­
tacked. The commandant at Batoum’s tele­
gram on Thursday announces a small success­
ful engagement.

A telegram from Akhalzeh, dated the 2ud, 
sajs five columns of Russians traversed the 
mountains, and effected a junction with the 
bulk of the army near Kars.

Bucharest telegrams say the Roumanian 
Senate on Saturday adopted the address in 
reply to the Princè?a speech, declaring that 
the Senate will never counsel any hazardous 
or dangerous policy, still less any attack on 
Turkey which would be an unpardonable net 
of thoughtlessness, and concluded, “Never­
theless, we will defend our hearths, if attack­
ed,”

The question of Servian neutrality will 
verv shortly be decided.

îhe Turkish Chamber of Deputies have 
voted for a bill proclaiming a state of siege. 
Special Commissioners will examine the bill, 
which will; however, not be enforced imme­
diately.

A despatch from Bucharsit says that some 
Turkish monitors arrived on Friday before 
Oltenitza, and insisted upon the withdrawal 
of tlie Reqm&njaji detachments,

The Grand Duke Nicholas telegraphs from 
Kischeneff as follows ; “The passage of 
Pruth is retarded by the unusually swollen 
condition of the river, All necessary stens. 
however, have been taken that the concentra­
tion of troops will not be interfered with.”

A Ragitia despatch says the Miridite in­
surrection is virtually ended. Sixty Miriditvs 
have been arrested and brought to Scutari.

Political Correspondence publishes a tele­
gram from Bucharest containing the follow­
ing: “The open town of Beni was bom­
barded on Friday, by Turkish monitors, for 
three hours. All tho inhabitants of Reni, 
Ibrail and Oltenitza fled.”

Tuesday.
The Turks, without declaring war, com­

menced a bombardment of Kalafat in Rou- 
maris. The Roumanian batteries replied 
with much spirit.

Lord Derby’s reply to Prince Gortschakoff 
has revived confidence in Constantinople. 
It is believed that Turkey may still look to 
England for support.

It is said that Austria seems determined 
so oppose the entry of Russians into Servia.

Corps of Polish volunteers are being form­
ed at Constantinople.

Concerning the campaign in Asia Minor 
both Turkish and Russian troops are being 
hurried there in vast numbers, the main ob­
ject of the Russians being the investment of 
Erzeroum. The Turks are strongly reinforc­
ing it.

The Times' Vienna correspondent says of 
the military situation in Asia: “A simul­
taneous advance by the carayaii road from 
Bajazid, which touched Erzeroum on the 
left, from Alexandropol, to Kars in the cen­
tre, and on the right towards Batoum, leaves 
little doubt that the object of the Russians is 
Erçerqmn and pot Kara. AH tho lines con­
verge on Erzeroum. The position Mukhtar 
Pasha occupies commands the junction of 
two roads which lead from Kars through the 
passes of Loghaule and Dogh, but unfor­
tunately, égides the Russian centre, which 
is adv&ciug from Kars, there are also indica­
tions of an advance on the left. Now that 
Bajazid is token there seems to he nothing to 
stop this column frqiu moving up to the 
plateau of Imdah, which i» s strung uefeusivo 
position, but lies in the rear jf the position 
occupied by Mukhtar. As regards the oper­
ations of the Russian right wiug, the advance 
on Batomn was probably a feint to mask the

itza, to resist any new attempt on tho part of 
the Turks. At last we have open war be­
tween Roumania and Turkey.

Notwithstanding the Russian promise that 
Turkish ships should have eight days to leave 
Russian waters, ten Turkish ships were seized 
at Kertch one day after the declaration of 
war. Tho Porte has requested England to 
remonstrate at St. Petersburg against the 
act.

Russia is seeking German machinists to 
make Russian navy ready for sea as soon as 
possible. Numbers of American naval officers, 
engineers and machinists have been arriving 
at Hamburg for some time on their way to 
St. Petersburg.

The fact that President MacMahon sent 
Count De Goutant Biron to Metz to welcome 
Eaiperor William is highly appreciated as an 
indication of continuance of good understand­
ing between France and Germany.

In the event of tho English army having 
to proceed to the seat of war, Lieutenant 
General Sir John Linton Simonds will be its 
commander in chief.

Thursday.
Heavy rains have recommenced in Rou- 

mania.
Four steamera arrived at Batoum laden 

with Krupp guns and ammunition.
Several Russian deserters, nearly all Jews, 

were shot at Otssy during the week.
It is said the chief Rabbi at Constantino­

ple has ordered prayers for the success of the 
Turks in all the synagogues of Roumania.

There have been batteries thrown up by 
the Russians opposite Rustchnh, and an at­
tack is considered probable.

It is reported that the Roumanian army is 
to form the right wing of the Russian army.

The majority of the Roumanian Senate is 
still opposed to war."

A vigorous contest is expected to take 
place between Kalafat and Widdin, as the 
Russians purpose to cross there.

A Turkish monitor bombarded Satanow 
for ten hours. The Turkish gunboats seized 
four vessels sailing under the Greek flag on 
the Danube.

The destruction of the Turkish earthworks 
at Getsepet by the Russians is confirmed. 
Behind these works the Turks had been able 
to shelter their gunboats while bombarding 
Ibail.

The Polish leaders resolved to abslaiu from 
exciting trouble with Austria.

A Bucharest despatch says that the Prince 
of Roumania will issue a decree to-day an­
nouncing that he assumes command of the 
Roumanian army, designating the chief of 
staff and commanders of the first corps at 
Grakova and the second at Bucharest and 
Guirgevo, nnd appointing members of the 
staff and commanders of divisions and brigades 
in each corps.

A Vienna despatch says that the rumored 
agitation in Servia is grossly exaggerated. 
Prince Milan and his ministers have formally 
assured Count Andrassy that Servia will not 
disturb the peace.

The Russians attempted to cross the Danube 
at Reni, but the Turkish artillery prevented 
them.

Defense works will be constructed around 
Constantinople.

Moukhtar Pasha is at Bardez, sixty miles 
east of here. The Russian centre is away 
near Kear, and supporting the advance of two 
wings from Bajazid and Ardahan. There has 
been no recent fighting.

A Galatz telegram says that three small 
Russian gunboats were despatched from the 
mouth of the Pruth to Ibrail to-day.

A special from Bucharest, dated Thursday, 
says that the private meeting of Roumanian 
Senators and Delegates last night failed to 
come to any decision. It is said that a pro­
posal for war would be defeated by a majority 
of 40. '

Two Turkish gunboats bombarded Oltenit- 
za four hours to-day. The Roumanians re­
plied. It is reported that they silenced the 
gunboats and ignited Turtukar, on the oppo­
site bank of the Danube. There was no loss 
in Oltenitza,

A Vienna correspondent reports that the 
Turkish bombardment of Ibrail, on Wednes­
day, destroyed some large granaries. Shops 
are closed and the town deserted.

A Special from Constantinople says that at 
the request ef England the Porte has ex­
tended the time for neutral vessels to leave 
Russion ports in the sea of Azof to May 24th.

A Vienna despatch reports that 2000 
Caucasian rebels are under arms in the 
southern provinces of Russia,

A telegram from Odessa reports that the 
Russians are unable to force Soganiq Pass, 
and are waiting for renforcement.

Saturday,
The Sultan has sent an Aide-de-Camp to 

thank Minister Laynrd for Lord Derby’s 
answer to Russia’s note.

The Daily Telegraph publishes an extra, 
which says intelligence has been received 
from Sulina, that on Wednesday the Russians 
attempted to cross the Jlanuho at Reni. They 
thre v a bridge over the river, but were mot 
by the Turkish infantry and artillery, assisted 
by three gunboats. The bridge was broken, 
and a large number of Russians were killed 
and captured. The Russians were completely 
defeated,

A later despatch says the Russians encoun­
tered great dilficuly in the attempt to cross 
the Danube

It is reported in Constantinople that the 
Russians havo not only withdrawn from the 
environs of Kars apd Avdahau, "but also from 
Bayazid nud-Kagbuysman.

A special Ambassador from tho Slab of 
Persia has arrived at St. Petersburg to con­
clude negotiations already commenced by the 
Russian agent at Teheraü. It is proposed to 
frame a convention to epahle Russian troops 
and artillery to march through Persian 
territory.

Further particulars of Thursday’s artillery 
engagement between the Roumanian battery- 
near Oltenitzo aud the Turkish battery in 
front of Turtukai, supported by tWQ monitors, 
state tlmt Turtukai was ignited by shells nnd 
twice displayed two while tings. One monitor 
was seriously damaged. The Turks iu conse­
quence of the conflagration ceased tiring, and 
withdrew their battery during the night.

A despatch from Teheran states that a 
Russian military expedition started from Fort 
Kmsnovadsk, on the east coast of the Caspian, 
fcoing in a south-easterly direction towards 
the country of the Alatal Turcomans, who 
recently tendered their allegiance to Porsia.
It is thought the object of the expedition js 
acquisition of fresh stmlngetical posions.

À liussiau baiu-j hitherto masked by a 
vn’Ûyard, openod fini to-day on tho Turkish 
monitors near Ibvailu. An hour after the 
commencement of the action a shell struck a 
large three-masted iron clad nnd smile her 
with a crew of three hundred and Ilussan 
Bey.

Electricity ! Thomas’ Excelsior Ec- 
lectric Oil!—Worth Ten Times its 
Weight in Gold.—Pain cannot stay where 
it is used. It is the cheapest medicine ever 
made. One dose cures common sore throat. 
One bottle has cured bronchitis. Fifty cents* 
worth cured an old standing cough. It 
positively cures catarrh, asthma nnd croup. 
Fifty cents’ worth has cured crick iu the 
back, and the same quantity lame back of 
eight years’ standing. The following are 
extracts from a few of the many letters that, 
have been received from different parts of 
Canada, which, we think, should be sufficient 
to satisfy the most sceptical : J. Collard, of 
Sparta, Ont. writes, “ Send me G dozen Dr. 
Thomas’ Eclectric Oil, have sold all I had 
from you, and want more now ; its cures are 
truly wonderful.” Wm. McGuire, of Franklin, 
writes, “ I have sold all the agent left, it acts 
like a charm—it was slow at first, but takes 
splendidly now.” II. Cole, of Iona, writes, 
“ Please forward G dozen Thomas’ Eclectric 
Oil, I am nearly out, nothing equals it. It is 
highly recommended by those who have used 
it.” J. Bedford, Thames ville, writes, “ Send 
at once a further supply of Eclectric Oil, I 
have only one bottle left. I never saw mi} thing 
sell so well and give such general satisfaction.” 
J. Thompson, Woodward, writes, “ Send me 
some more Eclectric Oil. I have sold entirely 
out. Nothing takes like it.” Miller & Reid, 
Ulverton, P. Q., write, “ The Eclectric Oil 
is getting a great reputation here, and is 
daily called for. Sena us a further supply 
without delay.” Lemoyne, Gibb & Co., 
Buckingham, P. Q., write, “ Send us one 
gross Eclectric Oil. We find it to take well.”

Sold by all medicine dealers. Price 2octs.
S. N. THOMAS, Phelps, N. Y. 

And NORTHROP & LYMAN, Toronto, 
Ont., Sole Agents for the Dominion.

Note—Fclectnc—Selected and Electrized

DEATHS
At Burnside, Lower Caverhill, on the 4th inst., 

Margaret Brown, aged 84 years.
On Friday, the lltli Inst., Hon. Frederick P. 

Robinson. In the 02nd year of his age.
[Funeral to take place on Monday next, at 3 o’clock, p. M.]
At Stanley, on the 25th of April, Jane, wife of 

J ames Sanson, aged 51 years.
On Tuesday evening, 8th InsL, after a lingering 

Illness of nearly one year which she bore with 
Christian fortitude, Emma G., beloved wife of 
Geo. F. Atherton, aged 39 years.

The Renowned American Orator,
—WILL LECTURE IN THE-

CITY HAI_,,
-ON-
May 31st.

Reduction in Railway Fares

rrUCKF.T3 to Quebec, Montreal, Toronto, 
,1 Ottawa, and all points West, including 

CALIFORNIA, at reduced rates
JOHN IUCH4RDS, 

Railway Ticket Agent, next door to 
May x4 People’s Bank.

Just Received and for Sale Low.

OU TJ ALF Chests first class English Tea, a
Ai\J fl a good bargain to anyone. _

VIVIAN W. TIPPET. 
F’ton, May 14, 1S77. 

G. M. Cossitt& Bro.,
BROOKVILLE, ONT.,

Manufacturers f^p-DW^fs of

B UCKEYE MO WERS,
Acknowledged to be the Standard by which the 
capacity aud worth of all other Machines are 
tested and from which have been derived the 
best Mechanical principles now used in con­
structing other machines, also manufacturers of

c»1

the simplest, easiest operated and best construct- 
Rake in the world. Over fifty first prizes award­
ed this Rake at the lending Exhibitions, Provin­
cial and Local, held in the Dominion since 1874, 
8,000 of those Rakes have been sold In Canada; 
over 500 in New Brunswick, all giving perfect 
satisfaction.

Never a complaint from Farmers of the 
Dumping Apparatus causing delay or 

annoyance in the Field.
Our trade extends throughout the Dominion to 
Europe, and this Spring to South America.

Turning out Implements of which everyone Is 
a good advertisement of the general excellence 
of our work, we offer to the farmers. Mowers and 
Rakes of the best possible construction and real 
merit, warranted to give entire satisfaction, at 
low prices, and to responsible parties, on terms 
of credit so long that the machines will earn their 
cost before paid lor.

For sale at all the principal business centres in 
the Maritime Provinces ; at Fredericton by

R. CHESTNUT Sc SONS.
A full assortment of extra parta for repairs 

will also be kept on sale by our agents. When 
an agency is once In a District It Is never given 
up and repairs will always be obtainable.
D. W. JOHNSTON, General Agent,

G. M. COSSITT & BRO.,
P, O. Address, care Kerr <fcThorne, St. John, N. B* 

May 14, 1877.

Per Maud & Bessie
FROM BOSTON.

IQ^rt BARS best Refined lion, 151 
It) IO bundles round best refined Iron,

55 Bundles Tire Steel,
137 Packages of assorted Goods,
25 Ba: s Round Tap Steel.
20 Rolls Rubber and enameled Cloth, 

Just received by
R. CHESTNUT & SONS. 

F’ton, May 14, 1877.

Plow Points.
PLOW Points suitable for Connell Brothers 

Plows, made in Woodstock, Carleton Co., 
to be had at

May 14 R. CHESTNUT * SONS.

Monday,

—SUBJECT

‘PECULIAR PEOPLE,”
Admission to all parts ol Hall 40 cants.
Doors open at 7.15 p, m. Lecture commences at 8.

H. C. CREED,
Chairman, 

F’ton, April 30, 1877.
G. E. COULTHARD,

Sec-Uom.

Land Plaster.
THE Albert Manufacturing Co.’a Land Plas­

ter, at
May 14 GEO. GILMAN’S. ,

MISS LUGRIN RWILL receive a limited number of Pupils for the Pianoforte.
Terms made known on application.
F’ton May 14. 1877.

Hoyt's German Cologne. 

THE NEW PERFUME.

ONLY Thirty-five pent# a bottle. Try it
D.............

May 14,1877.
lAVIti <6 DIBBLEE, 

Druggists, opp. the City Hall, 
Sole Agents.

NEW
Pianos and Cabinet Organs.
) 7i Octavo New Pianos ; 2 Cabinet Organs, 
1 (new,) from manufactory of Horace Watters 
• Sons, New York, to arrive next week at

HARDWARE!
From the Manufacturer.

•J /~1ASES Hardware consisting of Meat 
** v_y Cutters, Door Buttons. Screw Pulleys, 

Petroleum Faucets, Harness Hooks.
Boot Jacks, Tobacco Cutters,
Foot Scrapers, Barn Door Hangers,
Plate Castors, Socket Castors,
2 large Jack Screws, 2 Vices.
3 Blacksmith’s Drills,

Hat and Coat Rooks.
H Z R. EVERETT

Cut Nails and Horse Nails
Received and tn Stock.

?7/Y KEGS Cut Nails, 1 Coil Lead Pipe, 16 
• Cases assorted Hardware containing 

Pocket and Table Cutlery, Pad Locks, Cap- 
hoard Locks, Chest Locks Brass Till Locks, 
Brass Box Locks, Brass Hinges, Powder Flasks, 
Shot Bags, Scissors, Files, Brass Screws, 
Carpenters’ Pencils, Cupboard Catches, Lamp 
Hooks, Spoke Shaves, Tassel Hooks, Brass 
Escutcheons. Brass Chair Nails, Rack Pullies, 
Cupboard Hooks, Brass Hooks and Eyes, Chain 
Dog Collars, Brass Flush Bolts, Fish Hooks 
Garden Trowels, Halter Chains, Whip Lashes’ 
Brass Door Buttons on plates, Clout Nails 
Tower Bolts, Shoe Thread, l ton ~ 
boxes Clinch Nails. Pntty, 15 

Z. R. EVERETT.May 14

screwsT screwsT
Direct from the Manufacturer.

IZ^IASBS containing 727 gross of the 
American Screws, known ail over the 

continent as the best manufacturer.
Maf Z. R. EVERETT.

IS eFk^ ^reambu^ator8* Just
LEMONT’S Variety Store.May 14

Coal Depot.
THE subscriber w ill be prepared to furnish 

during the summer a superior article of 
SOFT COAL, at $6.00 per Chaldron, delivered.

Also, Anthracite Coal, $gg, Nut nnd 
Chestnut sizes, at lowest market rates.

JOHN RICHARDS, 
Ofllce next door to People’s Bank.May 14.

”e TroiiMe,
PERSONS visiting, Shediac. Summerside, 

Charlottetown, Halifax, or any other 
point in Nova Scotia or Prince Edward island, 

should purchase their Ticket before leaving, 
from

JOHN EICAHRDS,
Agent Intercolonial Railway, Office next 

door to Pcople’e Bank.
F'ton, Mey 14.

MONEY.

PERSONS having Money to Loan can find 
secure investments with interest at 8 per 

cent, per annum.
Apply to

JOHN RICHARDS, 
Office next door to People’s Bank. 

F’ton, May 14

Travelers
CAN do the right thing for their families by 

purchasing an Accident l ickct, insuring 
$4,000 for 25 cents. Daily, Weekly, Monthly or 

Yearly Tickets issued by
JOHN RICHARDS, 

Railway Ticket Agent, next doo r to 
May 11 People's Bank.

RAILWAY TICKETS TO
Boston &New York

at ReduaoU Rates.

May 14
JOHN RICHARDS, 

Railway Ticket Agent, next door to 
People's Bank.

$2,000 to Loan on Real 
Estate in this City.

Apply to
May U W. WILSON.

Roofing Pitch.
DRY and Tarred Paper and Roofing Felt 

and Carpet Felt, 10, bhli. Roodng Pitch, 
30 Rolls Tarred Paper. 16 Rolls Dry Sheathing 

Paper, 15 Rolls Roofing Felt, 8 Rolls Carpet 
Felt, for putting under Carpets, 2 barrels 
American Coal Tar, 3 barrels Wilmington Tar. 

May 14_____________ Z. R. EVERETT.

Flour Store.
NOWIN STOCK,

800 Bbls, Flour and Meal.
TO ARRIVE:

300 Barrels MEAL,
ALSO ON HANQi

A lew tasks Porto Rico Molasses, « good article 
in English Tea, Herring. 5oda So«xT 
&M«-'uheS in CaSC’ ot 12i nndMgrnM. 8 ’ 

11__________ VIVIAN W. ,TIPPKT.

S. O W EN,
Queen Street, Fredericton.

A
Begs to Inform his friends generally tliat'hc has 

Just returned from the United Stiles:, niter pur­
chasing a great many cheap lines of Goods, anù 
this being his last year in business, nnd having a 
very large Stock, ho Is bound to sell lower

Than any oilier House in the City’.

For Cash !
And that is my Motto to all I .Vo Credit !

75 CASES OF GOODS -

English & American,
Will make special prices for lots to 

Store Keepers and Pedlars.

Golden Fleece.

The subscriber has received per 
steamera a large stock of

lale

EARTHINGS
-IN-

Brussels, Tapestry.

WOOL CkRPETS
in 2 and 3 ply,

RUGS TO MATCH.
DRESS GOODS

in all the latent styles,

Curtain Damas/cs and Repps, 
Lace Curtains,
Lnghsh a,id Americart, Prir. Ac.

An immense stock of

WALL PAPERS,
Gilt Tapers from 

Tint Papers
40 cents up, 
warranted to wash.

John McDonald.
Fredericton, May 7, 1677,

SAM. OWEN.
Fredericton, April 3), 1877.

New Brunswick Railway
SUMMER ARRANGEMENT.

Direct, connection made, at Bred er ici * v;âh 
Trains of Fredericton Railway to and from St. 
John, and at Woodstock with Trains <>- Xen- 
Brunswick and Canada Railway lo and from 
St. Stephen, St. Andrews, Bangor, Portland, 
Boston.

O,N and after MONDAY, May "'h, 1877 
' Trains will run as follows:—

4 20 n m î'xp/,?ss ,rraiD Ieavc* Caribou ‘t.OU 111. for Woodstock (due 9.50 a. m ) 
and Gibson (due 11.60 x m.) connecting 
at Woodstock with the N. B. & C. Railway 
Train, which leaves nt 10.00 a. m for St. 
Stephen, St. Amdrews. Bangor, Portland 
and Boston, and at Fredericton with the 
Train for St. John, which leaves at 3 00 
p. m.

7 30 fl. m ExPrcss Train ,9avci Wood-1 .uu in. stock, connecting at Wood- 
stock Junction with tho Train for Gibson 
(Due 11.50 a. m )

2 40 n m Express Train leaves Gibson
1111 (connecting with Fredericton 

Radway Train from St. John) for Wood­
stock (due 7.10 p.m.) and Caribou (due 
10.30 p. m )

A OO n m Express Train leaves Wood- 
vF.vv/ r* iX1' stock for Caribou, immediate­

ly after the arrival of the N. B. & C. Rail - 
way Train, making direct connection 
from St. Stephen, St. Andrews, Bangor; 
Portland and Boston, due in Caribou 
10 30 p. m.

5 20 fl. m Mixe(i Tram leaves Caribou .OU <X. Ill Monday, Wedn4*lay, and Fri­
day, for Gibson (due 4.10 p. m.) ann 
Woodstock (due 1.30 p. m.)

ft OO fl m Mixed Train leaves Gibsouy O.UU a. m. on Tuesday. Thnrsd-y ami 
Saturday for Woodstock, due 1.30 p. m. 
and Caribou, due 6.45 p. h.

10 30a in M'*«i Train leaves Wood- 
J.U.OAT a HI. stock, connecting nt Wood- 

stock Junction, on Monday, WeJnesd iv 
and Friday, with the Mixed Train from 
Caribou to Gibson, and on Tuesday. 
Thursday, and Saturday, with the mixeil 
train from Gibson to Caribou.

Gibson, May 7,1S77.
T. HOBEN, Supt.

Mowing & Reaping 
Maclaines

AND HORSE RAKES.

THE Bubserther bogs to inform the farmers' nr 
New Brunswick that he has been n^biled

Sole Agent
for the Province for the

Eagle Mowing and Reaping 
Machine Company,

for the sale of their Improved Engle Mower ami Those Machines have EmSSd ir, The 
- rovlnoe for the last four years and havo clven every satisfaction. e °uen

Orders received from Agricultural Soeietipy-ÏM wm «B-»SME»

Extra Parts
Improved Eagle Mower and Rcai>er. and th? Young Eagle, on hand. 1 Parties 

wanting extra parts for either machine will 
please send their orders for these Darts^ earl v . 
May, giving the number of piece required or if 
it has no number, by bringing the brokem wlib them. The subscriber has also for sale^thi# 
H^nR?1keWfôLer,S *Mel1ck Co! CentonnL‘,1 

K 0,1 1 a,ld lnsPect ourMowe' 
for*thecomlngseason!re makln= roue purchase

F’ton, April 3U, 1877. Z' ^ EvERETT.

SAINT MARY’S

BTomm.
SEEDS.

Garden and
Field Seeds.

WINSLOW TILLEY,
Drnggrist,

Salut Mary’s Ferry, oppk F >4™ nt nMay 7, 1877.-1 mo. ’tou, N. B

IMPORTANT
N O T ftCE.

Potatoes fr.ave Fallen,
but the sot 1crlber Btul buya

EARI.y rose,
'■~B i: —AT—

ÜEMUNEB ATIVE | p RICES.
F’ton, May? , i877.-2w. °E°' °1LMAN-

AYRSHIRE BUEL
ïTor Sale.

fid,
I salved March 2-ird. is7(! got hvU “Glrvan” (28) N. B. Herd Book, outef Bvl a 

zr~l x „ B. Herd Book. He Is hands-, uo andfrom good milking stock. L 111
Address,

J. P. M. KEATOll.
May 7,1877. Nangew:.,,!:, K ('.

CHILDREN’S CARRIAGES,

2 3 end 4 Wheel, up to $4-3.00 each, all
7 qualities'and prices.

Live Geese and Poultry Feathc-s.
Mattrasses, all sizes, 3 kinds.
Bird Cages. Bird Cages.
Framed Pictures and Chromos.
May7, 1877LKMONT’S VAlUETY stOHK.

Harvey Grass Seed..
HA«RmwX,?£i3„s norther:*
----RED CLOVER, cheap at
May 7, 1877.—2w. GILMAN’S.

Furniture, Furniture in Variety.

VA,ni°yS7rindn‘° ‘‘rriVC 1,T Maud 4 Seen.
and Trelitt. Our present stock comprises 

an tne lines kept m a tirât class Vnrnit^Kiorc 
and we are determined to sell onr iPods as 
tome to83 thCy Can 60 S0W Ncilr Orunswieit,
ZmsiTS8 varibty sto“-

elias shepard;
Commission Merchant. <t'c.,

Corner of Queen and Westmoreland 
Streets, Fredericton, N. B.

May 7,1877.

City of Fredericton Debentures 
Wanted. i »s

Apply to
May 14 JOH N RICHARDS,

è



POOR COPY

What the People say

HALS BOOK STORE
Is a progressive Institution.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a Scientific Headquarters

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a Poetical Effusion.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a Biblical Museum.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a fashionable Emporium.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a novel affair.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a Sabbath School Fountain.

HAUL’S BOOK STORE
Is a Musical World.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is an Instrumental calamity.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
■s* Is a paper Workshop.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is a world of News.

HALL’S BOOK STORE
Is multum in parvo.

K’tor, April 30, HOT.

SEEDS !
WILEY'S DRUG STORE.

, The subscriber has received this day per 
^Steamer “ Dorian,” from London, a full 
supply of

Garden,
Field,

& Flower
Seeds.

sfr JOHN M. WILEY,
Druggist,

Corner Queen St. and Wilmot’s Alley,
Next above Hall’s Bookstore.

F’ton, Avril 9, 1877.

Just Received from Oshawa, 
Ontario.

4nOZ. Manure t'orks, 3 dot. Spading 
I.f Forks, 9 doz Hoes, 2 dot. Patent 
Hoes, 2 doz. Cast Steel Gj rden Bakes, 2 doz. 

Mallerble Garden Rakes 10 doz Hay Foiks, 
16 doz. Scythes, 10 doz. Scythe Snatbs* 12 doz- 
Fork Handles, 2 doz. Manure Vork Handle*. 
1 doz. Turnip Hoes, 1 doz Dutch floC9> 1 doz 
Bush Scythes, for sale low by

F’ton, Apri.30, 18,7. J^S S. NEILL.

A GREAT OFFER
rîor8’6. T&*rd Tiraes dispose of 100 PIaNOl X * 

,ntlw and secon<l-haud of first-cli. ** 
™^t\DCt u,d 1115 WATERS’ at lower prices fo * 

oi Instalments or to let until paid for than
sniTA^0^ ttSST*1* WATERS’ «RAND 
SQUARE and UPRIGHT PIANOS <$• ORGANS JSSfMDING THEI^EW WUV*EMRAand 
BOUDOIR) are the BEST MADE. 7 Octave 
RtJînri Js,}"8 do not used a year. “ 2"

* 4 St°P* S-V. 7 Ships $08. 810 Stops $88. 12 Stops $100 cash, not. 
r nn »ar yeaJ’mlV P££feet °rrier and warranted.pnCAT^.an.d travelling agents want­
ed. Illustrated Catalogues Mailed. A liberal 
discount to Teachers, Ministers. Churches, etc. 
2bo&iSLaa,r„nt balf Price. HORACE WATERS 

Manufacturers mid Dealers, io East 
14th St, Union Square. N. Y.

P-ffES'W

SPRING & SUMMER

Dry Goods,
—AT—

L. O O AN’S.

DRESS GOODS,
IN GREAT VARIETY.

Sutx OmïtreOas»
commencing at 50 cents.

RATELASSE O THS,
from $1.45 and up.

Scotch and Canadian 1 weeds,

BOYS CLOTHING,
in Suits, with Short and Long Pants.

Gloves and Hosiery.

Silk Scarfs, Corsets, Laces, &c., &c.

New Carpetings,
in Brussels, Tapestry, Wool & Dutch.

HEARTH RUGS
and

Floor Oil Cloths.

LACE CURTAINS
AND

T . a mb requins,

GILT CORNICES,
and every discription of

CURTAIN MATERIAL.
TABLE LINEN, 

TOWELLINGS,
& NAPKINS.

Grey and White
Cottons and

Sheetings,

English & American Prints,

and every discription of

STAPLE AND FANCY

DR r GOODS.
th;oMAS LOGAN

Fredericton, April 23,1877. *

i’DOMD

EXHIBITION 1877.

Now ready for E xhibition our -entire importation o^V-

HEW AND MUMBLE EflOiX
EVERY DEPARTMENT REPLETE WITH

FIRST CLASS GOODS.

Au Inspection will prove the prices * right.’

& KEDEY,
FREDERICTON,

Take great pleasure in announcing the 
o pening show of a large portion of their

Immense
Importations

—for TUB-

SPRING & SUMMER TRADE,

-OF-

1 8 T 7,

consisting of a large lot of

DRESS GOODS
an inspection of which is most cordially 

invited —this department being 
managed by the proprietors.

MILLIHERY. 

Hats in all the New Shapes 

FLOWERS, FEATHERS,

together with all the requisites required 
in that department, which is under 

the superision of an

EXPERIENCED LADY.

Shawls, Mantles-,

a grand variety of

Staple Goods,
all of which are open for 

inspection.

CLOTHING A SPECIALITY.

McDonald & Kedey.
Frepericton, May 14,1877.

FACTS FOR THE PEOPLE ! 

Now is the Time.

Come and see what ready Money will do !

REMOVAL NOTICE.

THE undersigned have removed their Offices 
from Queen Street to their Brick Building 

on St. John Street, opposite the Crown Land 
Office.

FRASER. WETMOUE & WINSLOW. 
F’lon, May 7, 1877.

JUST RECEIVED
BY »\\h FROM NEW YORK.

DRESS GOODS,

Silks, Ribbon ,

VELVETS, ICES,
in,. Woolen,

-AND-

Custom Tailoring
—AND-

Clothing Department.

NEW COATINGS,
NEW TROUSERINGS.

COTTON 6.003)8.

SUNS'HADES,
>

GloVeé,* Corsets, &c.,

^elline rt goods,

Feathers, Flo. wers, Hats, &c.

NEW VESTINGS

in all the newest and best make of 
goods.

Gentlemen may rely on getting 
porfeefrfitting garments, thoroughly made 
and best trimmings only used.ana best trimmings oniy useu.

Imported Heady Made Clothing
Millinery or dm ' 8olicited' “V"* che*aP’

oerson Hats, Caps, 4" Furnishing Goods.
executed by a corapetriilt 1

P. jttePEAME.
‘F’ton April 30, 1877;—3tw

t"g>OXES Fairtiv and Gaunter Scales ;
rt 6 Set Light Waggon Wheels;

12 Dozen New Style Field Ho-s ;
R. CHESTNUT & SONS. 

7.May

CUMBEh 'KAXD SUPERPHOSPHATE
tymberland Superphosphate15 t°^ **h-For Si.

This fertilizer needs 
Wherever used it has proved 
tory that it speaks for itself. 

May 7.

Q. T. WHBLPLEY. 
n# recommendation, 

highly satisfic-

UNPRECEDENTED BARGAINS IN

BOOT S AND SHOES.
Prices to Accomodate Everybody ! Examine onr Goods and be con­

vinced ! Our prices are based upon Cash payment. We have 
but one price ! Judges or not all buy alike. All goods 

sold as advertised ! No deception practised !
Our boast: Workmanship, durability and 

cheapness. Nothing like the stock was 
ever before shown in this city. We 

positively pay CASH for every­
thing, both at home and abroad.

We keep those goods best 
suited to the pnrp „ in­

tended, and not those 
on which we can 

make the most 
money.

We have made Extroardinary Preparations for an Immense

SPRING BUSINESS,
and onr shelves are literally groaning with the great quantities of 
goods they contain. Those who do not visit our establishment, who 
do not examine our Goods, who do not ask onr prices, and who are 
not posted on the inducements which we offer will certainly miss

THo Greatest Opportunity
ever offered the people of Fredericton and vicinity to secure substan­

tial bargains in elegant and perfect fitting

BOOTS and SHOES.
One call will convince all. The old cusiom is to reduce the price at the 
“ tail end” of the season, when most all wants are supplied. We will 
however break the rule and give our patrons and everybody else a 
chance to get bargains when really wanted.

READ OUR CATALOGUE OF PRIG'S.
Ladies’ Corded Slippers, only - 25 cts.
Ladies’ Carpet Slippers, only........................................ 40 “
Ladies’ Serge Gore Slipperrs, only ....
Ladies’ best Gore Slippers, qnly .....
Ladies’ Leather Slippers, as low as . - -
Ladies best Leather sewed Slippers, Leather lined and bound,
Ladies’ Kid Slippers, Kid lined, only 
Ladies best Kid Slippers, Kid lined, large fancy Bow, only 
Ladies’ Kid Button Walking Shoes, only 
Ladies’ Kid Newport Walking Shoe, only - .
Ladies’ Serge Elastic Side Boots, only 
Ladies’ Serge Leather Foxed Laced Boots, only 
Ladies’ strong Leather Boots, pegged, only 
Ladies' Grain Leather Boots, pegged, only ■
Ladies’ Grain Leather Boots, sewed, only 
Ladies’ best Grain, sewed Button_Boots, only 
Ladies’ Serge Lace Boots, - 
Infants’ Leather Shoes,
Infants’ Slippers and Ankle Ties - 10 cts., and upwards

Childrens and Misses goods proportionally low.
Men’s Carpet Slippers, only - - - - $0 50
Men’s Leather Slippers, sewed, only - - - 0 75
Men’s Elastic Side Boxed Toe Bools, only - - . 1 35
Men’s Calf Long Boots, only - - $2 50 and 3 00
Men’s best Calf Long Boots, pegged, Calf back, only - 3 50

For Sale or to Rent.
11HAT well known business stand at Smith’s 

. Corner, Bright, York County, comprising a 
commodious Store. Out Building and Burn, and 

about two acres of Land, under good cultivation 
Possession given immediately.

Apply to A. F. Randolph, Ksq., Fredericton, 
N. B.. or the subscriber.

T. W*. SMITH.
Douglas, April 30, 1877.—3w.

The Promise !
THERE shall be See 1 Time and Harvest 

while Time remains. As we see the flowers 
come forth in all their varied beauty and love­

liness intermingled with the green that carpets 
the earth in spring time. So man should go 
forth in Faith, Hope, and Trust, sowing and 
planting the seed that he may reap.

Ely Perkins
Begs to say this is not the winter of our dis­
content. He has for the people

50 Bushels Grass Seed,
Northern Red Clover,

5DU Bushels Oats.
F’ton, April 31,1877.

Nails. Nails.

50 •* 
65 !‘ 
30 » 
75 “ 
75 “ 

$1 00 
1 00 
1 00 
0 60

$1.25 and 1 50 
■ - 85

$1.00, $110 and 1 25 
$1.25 and 1 50 

r $1.75 and 2 00 
60 cts , 75cts, $1.00 and upwards 

25 cts., and upwards

JUST received and in stock, 100 Kegs Cut 
Nails. Fcr sale low l»v

JAMES S. NEILL.
F’ton, April 30,1877.

Notice.

THE Central Fire Insurance Company of New 
Brunswick have declared a dividend, on 

amount of capital paid in, of six per cent, for 
li_lr year ending on 1st April instant, payable to 
the shareholder, at the company's office, on or 
after the first day ot May next™

By order of tbe Board.
_ WM. Me BEAT H,
F’ton A pril 1’G, 1S77. Hu ere tary

School Teacher Wanted.

APRIL 9, 1877.

u T

Few Spring Goods
NOW OPENING AT THE

ALBION HOUSE, F’TON.,
AND

Aticcond-Class Male T.- teller wanted in Dis- !
trict No. 7; town of Grand Falls. None but ! 

a person of good and sober habits need apply. I 
Hefrenccs as to ability and morals required, " To 
enter upon the duties first of May, if possible. 

Apply to
CHAS. McCLU^KEY,

Secretary to Trustees. 
Grand Falls, April 26, IS77.—3w

Wanted !
£800, and $-5,000 on Real Estate 
security. Interest 8 per cent, per 

annum, payable semi-annually. Security un­
questionable. Aoply to

JOHN RICHARDS .
F’ton, April 30,1877.

LOANS OF10 _
jm -f-* for a gentleman of

1 Worcester, Mass., have just paid Interest 
voluntarily in advance. Fair sample of all 
my loans. Hereafter the first years in­
terest (10 per eejit. net) paid when loan is 

made. Interest semi-annual. Improved secu­
rity. Land alone worth 4 to 10 times the loan. 
Long residence. Best of references. Send stamp 
for particulars. D. 8. 1Î. JOHNSON, Negotiator 
of Mortgage Loans, St. Baal, Minnesota.
Œf*/* 11 week In your own town. Terms and S’> 
OTO outfit free. H. IIALLLTT A Co., Port­
land, Maine.
O F\ Extra Fine Mixed Girds, with name. 10 
4it/ ct-:., post-p ‘ ' | “ ' ~ j-paid. L. JONES & CO., Nas?

i.n

2 00
1 50
2 50 
1 25

75 cts , and 1 00 
$1.50, $1.75 and 2 00 

$1,00 and 1 25

Insolvent Act of 1869 
1875.

and

In the matter of Valentine A. Harding an 
Insolvent.

NOTICE Is hereby given tbatjln pursuance oi 
the power vested in me ns Assignee ol the 

above named Insolvent, and by order of the 
Inspectors, I will otter at Public Auction on 
Thursday, the twelfth day of July next, at twelve 
o’clock noon, in front of the Court House, In 
the City of Fredericton, all the right, title and 
Interest, property, claim and demand, either at 
Law or In Equity of Valentine A. liai-ding, both 
land and premises situated on Regen t Street, In 
the City of Fredericton, and known as the Hard­
ing Hotel property, and formerly occupied by 
Insolvent, together with all the Buildings and 
improvements thereon, and appurtenance to 
the same belonging.

For terms and particulars apply to VJie under­
signed, or to J. A. & W. Van Wart, Bols, to 
Assignee.

Dated at Fredericton, in the County oi York, 
this fifth day of May, A. D„ 1877.

CHARLES S. INGRAHAM, Assl5r.ee. 
May 7, 1877.—td.

Farm for sale.
«Ma filHE subscriber will sell his Farm, 
ajeaBi JL situated within 2 miles of the 
«UÉÎ village of Stanley, containing 100 

acres of land. There is a house and 
barn «to the place.

Full partiouk rs on pppllcatlon to 
April 26, 1876. Z. R. EVERETT.

SALT
At Ely Perkins !
1 « HAGS LIVERPOOL SALT for 
LIU rt sale CHEAP.
F’ton. April 30, 1877.

Peace & Plenty.
FLOUR, PORK, MEAL,

TEA, TOBACCO, &C„
—AT—

JAMES HODGE’S

3ut cash e u nr 0 vr e rt n

..! Who do not believe m paying two or three prices for goods-who
want the woi dh of their money, and not help pay bills of delinquents nor
have their neighbors buy au article 2o to 40 per cent, less than them- 
selves, or those who buy one thing cheap and pay double the value 
for the next purchase.

Customers who look' at the value of goods and buy where they 
buy the cheapest will ai ways go to

JAMES PHELAN’S
NEW MODEL WHOLESALE & RETAIL

MODEL WARE HOUSE.
309
100
200
200

bbls. White Pigeon, 100 bbls. Bridal Ro.ce> 
“ Howland’s Peacemaker,
“ Spring Wheat,
“ Favorite Western Flour, good for 

Bakers, 50 hbh. Winter Hil!,
“ Faultless, 50 bbls. Patent Process 

No 1,
“ Howland’s Choice, 150 bbls. Oatmeal, 
“ Corn Meal,

boxes English Breakfast Tea, 
caddies Tea for private families, 
boxes American Tea,

“ Raisins, good Layers, 
ha.f boves Raisins,
caddies Navy Tobacco, smoking and chew­

ing, different grades, 
boxes Charter Oak Tobacco,

“ Best Black Pepper, 
bbls. Best White Beans,
Kegs Soda, 25 sacks Rice, 490 bags Salt, 
bags Butter Salt, 25 bbls. Mess Pork, 
halt bbls. Split Bay Herring,

“ Labrador llemag, 
bills. Bay Herring, 
half barrels Q toddy River Herring, 
qlt. Best Plate Codfish, 
bbls. Scotch Refined Sugar, 
boxes Coil’s Best Soap, 
casks Bar Dadoes Molasses.

TO BE SOLD LOW FOR CASH. 
F’ton, April 30, 1877.

Men’s strong Canadian Long Boots, only 
Men's Buckle, Box Toe Leather Boots, only 
Men’s Buckle, Box Toe, Boston style Boots, only 
Men’s fall Stock Brogans, no split Leather, only 
Boy's full stock Brogans, no split Leather, only 
Boy’s Long Boots, only ...
Youths Copper Tipped Long Boots, only ,
Children’s Leather, Copper Tipped Lace Boots, 8s to 13s only 50, 60 

and 75 cents,

We have a great many other kinds and styles which our limited 
space forbids us enumerating.

Bring this List With You,
it will enable us the more readily to give you the goods you call for, 

and will further avoid all possible misunderstanding.

We do not try to bait an intelligent community with prices on a few 
cheap and shoddy articles as is customa.y, but give you prices on 
leading line» of Staple' Goods, goods with which you are all more or 
less ftmilar.

Remember—Our entire stock is paid for. We most emphatically 
assist* that we do not owe a single dollar on the same.

we lo business to suit ourselves and our customers. We can (should 
fe^ ^ tie posed), give our goods away and it would concern no one but

ourselves.
Each and .every article above enumerated is the actual wholesale 

price', by the case lot, less the discount for Cash which 
v js our profit. In view of the closeness of our 

margin—we cannot and we will 
not give, credit.

Hearing Restored.
Groat Invention by ono who was deaf for 2) 

years. Send stamp <or particulars. Address 
•I NO. GAR MORE, Lock-box 915, Covington, Ky.
0 t £ é^^77 a W,'ok to Agents. $10 Outfit Free 

H cp 1 i P. <>. VICKERY, Auguste Maine 
a day at home. Agent •• wanted. OutfiTan 
terms tree. THUE <fcCAugusta M .-in$12

QC FAN Cl CARDS, no two alike, with name,
Z.O lOe. postpaid. NASSAU CARD C<J., 
Nassau, N. Y. *

Our Branch Store, St. Mary’s Ferry. 

BSZLLBB & EDGECOMBE
Arc now daily nee’ring their Spring ImporSaiions.of

Staple & Fancy Dry Goods,
Purchased direct from the best markets in Europe, thus enabling us to offer prices- 

as low as any other house in the trade,

WHOIjHSSAIj C$3 R TAIL.
Already open for inspection, a large lot of CARPETS, choice patterns, in

UNIONS, all Wools, TAPESTRY and BRUSSELS,
ALSO, A FULL LINE OF

HEMPS, NEW DRESS GOODS,
FLOWERS, FEATHERS, STRAW HATS

and SUNDOWNS, PRINTS, BLACK GOODS, &c.
Balance of Stock by following Anchor Line Steamships and Mail Steamers.

Our Stock this Season will be unusually large and well selected, embracing all 
the novelties ol the Foreign and American Markets.

nVUILLilBIEfc <5g HUDŒHlOOûhÆBJî:.
Fredericton, April 9, 1877.

PREMIUM SILVERWARE.
A 2S32T OF

SILVER SPOONS
âWâYi 

TO EVERY SUBSCRIBER FREE.

Base Burning

BOILEHS !
For heating «lwellings, green houses, <*e., by 

HOT WATER. CtlAy. R. ELLI-%
________ Centre, cor. Hester, New York.
$5 T0 S ’’O ^-t,ay nt !1ome- Samples worthf $ > free. Stinson <t Co., Portland,

/w z\ WHITE BBISTOL VISITING CARDS,
L \ with your name tmely printed, for25ot«., 
' il I Samples 8e stamp. No postals. 1000 f/vfagents Wanted. Address A. W. 

KINNEY, Yarmouth, N. S.
jh]Q OUTFIT FREE. Men and women, hoys
uM O and girls make §8 to §11 a day at home. 
Business light and honorable. Positively we 
send §18 outfit, and particulars tree. KNOWLESi 
& MAXIM, Wayne, Maine.
TJELIABLE TU31.VIP SEED. — GROWN 
H FROM SELECTED BULKS. 
mr RENNIE’S PRIZE purple top SWEDE 
at 30 cents per pound (postage prepaid). The 
stock is large and highly red mmonded. WIL­
LIAM RENNIE (S -edsman), Torvnfo, Canada.

GARDEN SEEDS.
—1877—

THE suhscrii'er has received cx Steamer 
“ Dorion,” from London, his usual 

supply of

Garden, Field, and Flower

iBIETEÏiDSy.,
This stock has been carefully selected and 

comprises all of the move popular varieties, and 
may be depended upon to prove true to their 
Kinds. It also comprises

Gerznaa Flower Seeds,
in the original package? embracing:

Double Portolacea,
“ Zinnia,
“ Stocks (in varieties),
“ German Asters,
“ Petunias,

Phlox Druinmondi,
Pansies (in great varie &c., &c.

These packages contain the choice class of 
Flower Seeds, and as the colors of eaçu variety 
are all distinct, the lover of Fiorticulture is 
able to obtain a much finer result than is possi­
ble in any other way. Also :

Feather Grass (plain and in colors, 
Everlastings, (in bundles),
Dried Boquets, &c., &c.

For sale in bulk or paesages, with a liberal 
discount to traders.

O’ Catalogues on the counter.

GEO. C. HUNT, JR.,
Druggist, 4c., Queen Street, Frcderie:on, N. 1’, 

April. 2:k IS77.

QUEEN STREET,
SecoD d Door above People’s Bank, and opposite “ Farmer Office,” 

Frede; icton, N.B.

rir i'iAN TA ^TRATVGER^*—To prevent any mistakes and to make sure thatyo ’fright pi Je l®k for our name over the door, on windows and on
top of building.

A SAKS
To Country Dealers and Lumbermen.

-o-----

^r^thatIh^ia'8ne<* f’°?'d ÏS*e^lines*of?eggèdlGoirf^for'Su?8^*nld*"B^i's*wea^ 

* thu,t,lle 18 minuf ‘Ctmg (stap le line, o Feg? These goods will surpass
and wouirt respectfully solict au ?"“™da _nv“ here in the Dominion, and will be 
the best ot those grades manufactured anywne , , c ,, h„vfird.guaranteed free from all defects and irregularities, and sold cheap to cash buyers.

ïaiïies plaelan

Fredericton, Apri( 9, 1877.

1877.1

SPRING STOCK !
ç\n /CRATES Meakin’s White Gran'te, 
£ l \^j Lustre Band, Fancy China and 
Common Ware, 100 dozen Plaisted’t? Stone­
ware, Butter Pots, 'Cream Jars, Jugs, Garden 
Vases, &e. A very large assortirez of Parlor, 
Dining Ruom, Chamber and Kitchen Furniture, 
Picture Mouldings, Looking Glasses, Glassware, 
Window Glass, Tab'e Cutlery. Albatta Spoons, 
Silverware, Childrens* Carriages, Wcodenwave, 
and Fancy Goods

A new stock of Me Vs, Boy’s, and Chi drens’ 
Fashionable Hats, English Leather Bags and 
Satchels.

JAMES G. McNALLY.
O’ Kerosene Oil 30 cents per gallon.

F’ton, April 23, 1877.

The Old Reliable EAtiLE GOLD AND S1LTHR PLATING fO., of Clerlnnnfi.O., will furnish I 
•very sebscriber of tbis paper a I’RKMIL'M $1..;0 SKI OF EXTKA PLATKD S1LVKK | 
SPOONS, on conditiiiDB namoii in Coupon.

Vnt out this t'oupqii, and semi to flic- Ila&Je Gold ziml Silver 
Plating <’o. lor redemption.

PREMIUM rniipnw of this Coupon, together willi Sevenfy-
I H ^ 111 IU If I yUUrUlii hive Cents to pay for express or mailing charges, 

Ave will send fkek, an elegant
84.50 SET OF EXTRA PLATED SILVER SPOONS,

With your InitinlN neatly engraved on same. (Retail price, §4.00.) This 
Coupon is good only ninety days from the (intv of this paper.

All Silverware warranted. Address nil orders to
Eagle Gold and Sütc r l’latlng Co.. 177 West Fourth St., Cincinnati. O.

Seed Wheat.
1 A "K >USHELS Seed Wheat, for sale at 
1U <5 ELY PERKINS.

Collin Mountings.
JTT.ST Opened, ( ne case best plated Coffin 

Mountings, jn Plates, of great variety 
Hand'cs, Studs, Screw Caps, Black qnd White 

Fringe, iimp, Âc.
Pintes neatly engraved on short notice, on 

the premises.
S. F. SHUTE,

Watchmaker, Jeweler, and Engraver, 
F’ton, April 23, 1877.

Ayrslilres
The Bills’ Herd, Prelinysburg, P. Q.
ITiOR SALE, choice animals bred with special 
|J reference to milking qualities. Catalogue 
furnished on application to

April V, 1877.
N. Ü WHITNEY, 

Montreal, P. Q.

DIVES mi.
JUST RECEIVING,

Matelassie Cloths,
-WITH-

BRAIDS and BUTTONS

TO MATCH.

ALSO:

6} BLACK CASHMKRE,

-FOR-

DRESSES.

•--1' ' li'jJ'" V1 J ' J
•» :-.ù;în; •;;n.

o:,i x x
SOLID W?>-L< 0J

Vi? JO '"7 \vi A.e t__ •
V FteH.:h. *• - .. . vU\ w. DUVK. '• . . ;

War. r«»i» l:. giret Wo : ....

. Siiitr r-.,q-e you mv/ Hi;* aJvorii-c»Bc:it
or Ajony A-C.nt’Tra™. N

JUAN WELSH, •* Araheres L N. S.
March 12, la77.

FARM FOR SALE.
rnHE subscriber offers for sale fho 

J&&Sr£&& J. va UHble Karm containing 5o0 
acres, 4J ol wliich are Inlervalè. re-

W iH1 cently owned ai d occaoied by Oliver 
A Akeiley, situate in the Parish of 

f "™l" Wicklmm, County of Queen’s, and 
[muting on tne Washedcmoak Lake, and with 
highway road on three sides. It will lie sold in 
one lot or in two or t'aree to suit purchaser^ A 
large part of t he purchase money may remain 
on mortfiiigp. Tills is one of the most desirable 
faims in the county.

c. T , . . THOMAS MAIN.SL John, April 19, l>77.itf

BRUSHES
Just Received :

WHITE Wash Brush as, Paint Brushes.
Phoi Bru h -s, Varnish Brushes. Win­

dow Brushes, Flat Paint Brushes, Biaek Ix;ad 
Brushes, Painter»’ Dusters, French Sash Tools, 
F.ac Artists' Brushes, Velvet Whisks Velvet 
Brooms.

April 23
For sale cheap.

Z. It EVE11ETT.

$800 and $1,000
To 11 an on Freehold Property in this City. 

Apply to
April 16, 1877 JOHN RICHARDS.

Keep Cool Everybody !

ice. iceTTce. ice.
310 TO.X.S O.Y BAND.

THE snhsorlber is now prepared to s. rvc tliose 
wishing Ice during the ensuing sumnii-r 

mmtns at reasonable rate», In nnv quantity 
requiml, by the season, month or -lav. Will 
make it a speciality to attend to Pic-uics. 
Bazaars, <tc„ Ac. Refrigerators supplied on 
shortest notice.

Orders left at the stores of Messrs. Alex. Bur- 
Cbl!l, or f. H. F. Randolph, will be promptly 
attended to.

April 16, i877. GEO. MORECltOFT,

SEEDS ! 
SEEDS !

DEVER BROTHERS.
Fredericton April 16, 1S77.

Cheap Sale of

Books, Stationery,
FANCY COOPS, &C.

rriHE subscriber intending making a change in 
1 Ins present business the first of May, w.d 

until thvn sell the whole of his stock of Books, 
.Stationery, Fancy Got»l y An., at

20 Per Cent. Loss thin his 
former Low Price,

Tiie stock is worthy of inspe-lhm. Parties wl ■!’- 
leg any tiling will do well to give ns u call.

]i~e Jirvj fJia finest and h nidïo n.'St sto -li o

Fancy Papers and Envelopes
in the Lower Provinces and at New York prices 

JAS. L. m:VlvRLY,
Bookseller and Siatioi’cr.

1 8J7 7 .
Seeds. Seeds.
Wri have nvvlv .1 advlr;s lim! ourSe<' !.< wore 

shipped from London, March luth, and i!.* Ii 
arrival i- daily o\|v« te.1 ourSvds are again 

imiiorte-l from I ho celebrated house of 1 ,
Dm mat.- & Boa le, which gave such goo. I satisfac­
tion last year.

As we are the largest importers and seed Mer­
chants In the City, we are in a position to sell 
lower than any other DIBBriEK.

Druggists and Reed Merchants, Upp. City Hall, 
March 26, 1877,

We have Just received our usual Spring supply of

GARDEN,
FIELD, &

FLOWER
Seeds.

Imported direct from the largest and most 
reliable Seed Homes in London,

and as they arc bought for cash, we are prepared 
to

S E r. Tj CHEAPER
Than any orher House in th i Trade. A so

American Danvers Yellow,
ONION SEEP.

For sale wholesale nr. l retail hy
u;:o. ii. dams £ ou.,

Druggists and Sec-tmcn,
Com r Queen and Keg u if Sts 

Sole proprietors r-f the true and on v genuine 
DAVIo B.XLSAML) COUGH MIXL’DRR,

“ CASTORINE HAIIlîMIXÏvRE. 
APERIENT PILLS.

F’ton, April 9, 1877.

notice.
. rx parties indebted to the subscriber are 
A r« sixctmily requested to call and pay their 

hills Indore the first of May. All hills not paid 
before tlvn will he placed in the hands of our 
•lUr.'iifV for eollection, t’oine i*ny no.

! -ion. April Ui, 1ST’. JAS. Ï-. BEVERLY.

Customs Department.

Brushes. SSruslies.
Just received from Boston and St. John :

O i dARRR Brushes, ns follows:—Paint, Varnish, 
f\ 1 ; Paste, Sash Tools, White Wash, Horse, 
Dandy Scrub, Shoe, Black Lead.

For sale by
JAMES S. NEILL.

F’ton, April 16, 1877.

Ottawa, April 10, 1877.
A UTHORTZ! ID Discount ou Ame 
A. until further notice, 6 per c

April 9
t. JOHNS'

C< mi mUsionetfof Customs

ME XL. MEAL.
A FEW barrels Corn Meal suitable for Feed. 

Cm. For sale very low.
VIVIAN W. TIPPET. 

F’ton, April 9, 1877. ^ „„

t
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Stltti gt*vg.

A Nervous Hero.
How He Trapped A Burglar.

(Concluded.)
(Mi HAD nothing particular to sen'’» 
.Jit but I was truly glad to hear of my 
1|| brother, and after dinner we sat 

talking of him for a long time. Mr. 
Gordon was a most agreeable companion? 
so well informed and conversable, that 
the time slipped by most pleasantly, and 
it was quite late when it first occured to 
me to propose retiring to bed. It was 
only then that I thought of telling him of 
our chances that our rest might ba di»* 
agreeably disturbed ; but once having got 
upon the subject, I unburdened myself 
pretty freely. That my house would 
escape I confess 1 felt more than doubtful ; 
and I detailed, with one exception, my 
various modes of defence, the revolver, 
the cutlass, and last, not least—Rover.

‘ Pray, let me be Rover’s substitute for 
to night,' said Mr. Gordon. ‘ I am a 
particularly light sleeper, and 1 don’t 
think a mouse would stir without waking 
me. Why don’t you send away your 
valuables ?’ he continued. ‘ You should 
have them deposited in the bank at 
Lowton.’

‘ It certainly would not be a bad plan,’ 
I agreed ; ‘ at present it would be rather" 
a blow to be robbed.’

the center of the table by which Mr. 
Gordon was sitting. His hand was lying 
listlessly upon it, and f Dr the first time I 
observed the peculiar size of it, and the 
long, lithe fingers—i*ony and thin, except 
at the tips and joints, which were of 
extraordinary proportions. A powerful 
hand—a clasping, clutching looking hand 
—not a pleasant one to encounter in 
anger. 1 could fancy —here I indulged 
in a terrifying reverie ; but I checked my­
self ; I called myself a fool. A man of 
my time of life, giving way to such 
absurdities : it was degrading. I banished 
them as well as I cou’d ; but the light from 
the lamp still fell so directly upon that 
hand that I was glad when the announce­
ment of dinner caused a thorough in­
terruption to my musings. We did not 
sit up so late that evening—neither seem­
ed disposed to do so : and at about 10.30 
I found myself safely shut up in my bed­
room, preparing for rest. What prompted 
me, I do not know—it certainly was not 
according to my usual custom—but it 
occurred to me to take out and examine 
my revolver.

There it was lying in its case, but did 
my eyes deceive me, or was I dreaming ? 
The cartriges were gone ! the pistoi was 
empty. 1 was transfixed a few seconds ; 
a cold thrill ran down my back bone. I 
could not doubt who had done it ; and as 
in case with a drowning man, before whose 
eyes they say, during which semi con­
sciousness remains, a life-time of events 
flashes by, so did a thousand suspicious

< 1 should think so,’ replied Mr. Gordon. ; circumstances connected with my brother’s 
‘ But do you mean to say you would shoot ! friend flit through my brain. I had been

and murdered me many times over, but 
not too many to be trapped and caught 
in the neatest and simplest manner by 
the triumphant constables, who. without 
a seconds hesitation, suirounded the 
astonished burglars before they had time 
to realize the situation ; foremost amongst 
them I recognized my brother’s friend 
Thomas Gordon, my agreeable visitor 1

Resistance was useless ; they had left 
their arms behind them, more than one 
murderous-looking weapon being found 
in the dining room. Besides which, my 
little stratagem—devised out of very fear 
had so far succeeded. I had purposely 
every night left out a couplo of bottles of 
drugged wine, which the unvt elcome 
visitors had unsuspectingly disposed of, 
and which in a short time began to tell 
visibly upon them ; so they were easily 
secured, to the delight of the neighbor­
hood and to the great credit and renown 
of myself, for I was supposed to have 
signalized myself most brilliantly in the 
affair.

Gifford Ransford’s butler identified the 
ciderant Tom Gordon, alias Joe Billings^ 
as his assailant; and the other two, also 
well known characters, were aiso convict­
ed.

One member of my establishment was 
missing on the morning afler the seizure, 
and that was Mary, our new maid-servant, 
through whose agency, doubtless, Mr. 
Gordon had carried his personation of my 
brother’s friend into execution.

a man in cold blood if you saw him 
your house?’

‘ Undoubtedly,’ 1 replied.
‘ Or run him through the body with 

your cutlass ?’ laughed my companion.
‘ Or run him through the body with my 

cutlass,’ 1 answered, with an immense 
tone of unhesitating valor and courage— 
‘justas cooly as I take my breakfast.’

‘ You are a brave man,’ observed Mr. 
Gordon. f 1 would rather be robbed than 
commit murder.’

‘ Would you?’ I responded, my courage 
rising, with the unwonted accusation of 
bravery. ‘ I wouldn’t.’ 1 felt an arrant 
imposter as I spoke,as I knew well enough 
in my heart that my sentiments had been 
most falsely expounded, and that I fully 
endorsed the opinion he had expressed 
in preferring to be loyally robbed rather 
than imbrue my hands with the blood of 
a fellow-creature; however, the weapon a 
gave me a feeling of security, though 1 
had often wondered, if it came to the 
scratch, what use I could possibly ma ke 
of them.

‘ 1 should be inclined to trust to a good 
thick stick,’ he replied : ‘you may rely 
upon my co-operation as far as that goes* 
By the bye,’ he continued, ‘I am not su re 
that I ever saw a cutlass. It has a pirati­
cal sound about it ; I should like to have 
a good look at it/

Of course I gl idly acceded,to his request ; 
and another hour or more was spent in 
my dressing-room examining the weapons 
and talking over various matters concern­
ing them. The cutlass, a long, keen 
blade 1 steel, was handled very carefully 
by Mr. Gordon, and the revolver also came 
in for a very searching inspection.

‘You are a bold man,’ he said, as he re­
placed it in its case, ‘ to keep loaded fire­
arms in your house ; it has often led to 
serious accidents.’

‘ To tell you the truth,’ I said, ‘ these 
are the last cartridges I possess. I have 
ordered some more but they haven't come 
yet.’

At last we parted for the night ; but 
before doing so, I confided the cutlas* to 
my friend, retamig the pistol myself, so 
that in the event of anything occuring, we 
were both fully prepared.

However, nothing happened to disturb 
us. We met at breakfast, and mutually 
laughed over my unnecessary precautions.

A most pleasant day followed. I found 
Mr. Gordon a more than ordinarily enter­
taining companion. He had evidently 
travelled a great deal, and possessed a 
fund of general information which he 
quite understood how to make the most 
use of it. I pressed him to extend his 
visit a few days, at all events until my 
wife returned, and he seemed nothing 
loth. So two days sped agreeably away ; 
and on the morning of the third, I happen­
ed to be sitting in the library, when, to 
my astonishment, 1 heard *i smothered 
sound of voices in the drawing-room, as 
if in whispered conversation. I was just 
going to get up to see from whom the 
sounds proceeded, when Mr.. Gordon ap­
peared in the doorway. It might have 
been fancy—it was treated then by me 
as such—but I did imagine he started and 
looked somewhat disconcerted for a very 
brief moment ; the next he was himself 
again.

41 have been looking over your daugh­
ter’s musie books,’ he said. ‘Is she a 
very accomplished musician ?’

4 She sings a good deal,’ I replied, ‘ and 
is very fond of it; but I can’t say she is 
very accomplished. She takes after 
Arthur in her love of music.’

4 Ah 1 indeed, responded Mr. Gordon.
4 Does he still carry about his flute I 

asked.
‘No; I don’t think so,’ he answered, 

rather dubiously.
‘By the bye,’ I said presently, ‘did you 

notice ttie new photograph we have of 
him in the drawing-room? He sent it to 
us six months ago.’

‘No; I didn't observe it,’ he replied.
The photograph which was hanging 

the wall with others, was a most life-like 
representation of Arthur ; it was absolute­
ly impossible for any one who had once 
seen him to to mistake it ; nevertheless? 
to my surprise, Mr. Gordon directed his 
gaze towards another photograph. 
Whether his quick instinct, or my invol­
untary correction of the mistake by a 
motion of my hand toward the real picture 
helped him to a rectification of his error 
I could not tell. The little incident 
passed by ; the photograph was duly ad­
mired and pronounced a capital portrait ; 
and we passed on to other topics. But 
an impression had been made upon my 
mind which I could neither resist nor 
dismiss ; nevertheless, it was there— an 
intangible something—a doubt, nay al, 
most a dread of my visitor.

J would not press Mr. Gordon to stay ; 
I did not feel so cordial to him ; and 1 
was growing more and more uncomfortable 
at what my wife would thint^of my having 
done so at all. How glad I would be to 
see them all back again. The time had 
never dragged so wearily as on the third 
day of Mr. Gordon’s visit. I don’t think 
I have mentioned that it was in the month 
of October all these things happened -, the 
days were shoi tening, and on this particular 
one darkness had come on more than 
usually fast; it was raining, too, so we—my 
guest and I—set in the library carrying 
on a rather vapid conversation. 4t last 
the servant appeared, bringing in a lamp, 
which, with its shade on, she placed near

deceived; he was, without doubt, what, 
almost confessed to mysolf, I had been 
thinking he was all day—an imposter and 
scoundrel, who meant not only to rob my 
house, but to murder me if I attempted 
the faintest resistance.

That he was one of the gang going about,
I also suspected ; and, if that supposition 
was correct, doubtless he had more accom­
plice who would come to assist him in his 
depredations. It was not a pleasant 
position for a man to be in, however brave 
he might be, and for mo it was simply 
terrific.

It would be madness to go to his room 
and confront him ; such a course would 
only precipitate matters; I must act 
promptly ; whatever 1» resolved to do 
must be done, and done quickly.

I resolved, after a short period of 
deliberation, to lose not a moment in 
leaving that house, and slipping round to 
the stable; to saddle my horse and gallop 
to Lowton for assistance. I had not un­
dressed, so no time was lost in making 
my exit from my bedroom, the door of 
which I locked, and also closed and locked 
the dressing room door which led into 
the bedroom, leaving the door to it, which 
opened on the landing, unlocked, s i that 
if my suspicions were correct—and 1 
doubted less and less that they were so— 
the seizure of plate would suffice to keep 
intruders occupied, and prevent them 
from so soon discovering my absence.

At last I opened the window, which was 
not very far from the ground, and drop­
ping gently down, cautiously crept round 
to the back-yard. I feared Rover might 
betray me ; but as I got close to his ken­
nel I was astonished to hear no move­
ment.

‘ Rover 1’ l said softly, ‘ good dog 
Rover, old fellow !’

But no answering sound greeted me ; 
all was silent.

‘ Rover !’ I repeated, ‘ Rover.’ bending 
down and thrusting my hand into the 
kennel, in my anxiety for my favorite, 
almost forgetting my possible danger.

I felt the familiar head and rough coat. 
but it was a lifeless body that lay so 
motionless under my anxious touch. 
Rover was dead ! A cold dew broke out 
all over me. I was speechless with rage, 
grief and indignation. But there was no 
time to indulge in such feelings.

To gain the stables and slip the saddle 
on my horse was the work of a moment 
only ; and favoured by the noise of the 
raging elements, I led him out with the 
certainty that no one in the house could 
hear what was going on. Then I mounted^ 
and set off at a hard gallop for Lowton.
1 did not take long to explain my errand, 
which I did by simply stating that I had 
suspicions something was meditated, from 
the combined facts of Rover’s death and 
the drawn cartridges.

It did not require any persuasion to 
get a couple of stalwart policemen to 
accompany me back—they were so anxious 
to succeed in capturing the thieves that 
not a chance was thrown away. Accord­
ingly, leaving my horse at Lowton, the 
two policemen, myself, and a third con­
stable driving, started off' after a short 
delay, in a small carriage, which we left 
by itself, tying the pony to a gateway, 
about a quarter of a mile before reaching 
my place. Havinç first taken a ladder 
from the stable, we groped our way to 
the front of the house, and as we got’there 
1 touched one of my companions lightly 
on the arm, and in a whisper directed his 
attention to the dining room window 
Through the chinks of the shutters we 
could see plainly that a light was burning. 
Losing not another instant, I clambered 
up to my half opened window, followed 
quickly by the policemen, and there we 
stood, hardly breathing, to listen. Every­
thing was just as I had left it. They had 
not missed me yet ; probably the dressing- 
room had not been visited, but that would 
follow immediately, for hardly had we 
been five minutes in the house before a 
noise, slight in itself, but still sharp and 
unmistakable, warned us that somebody 
was ascending the staircase—stealthy foot­
steps, voices muffled, but distinctly voices 
—and presently the dining-room door was 
softly opened, and we could distinguish a 
word here and there of a whispered con­
sultation, then came a slight metalic 
sound, and a crack as if something had 
given way. a jingle of silver—probably my 
grandmother's teapot, our most precious 
heirloom—and then the hurried crinkling 
of paper.

Still the inspector moved not. I myself 
was becoming quite rigid with nervous 
excitement. I had fancied the police 
would have rushed in upon them ; but no; 
there he stood gr&sping his baton, im - 
moveable, as I could see l y the expiring 
light of the tire, which I had fortunately 
chanced to replenish just before my dis­
covery of the drawn cartridges.

What was he waiting for p It was soon 
explained to me ; they had not all come 
up stairs. More footsteps, more voices, 
and then a hand was laid on the handle of 
my bed-room door, with no great regard 
to the continuance of my slumbers.

Locked ! and an oath, not necessary to 
record, here followed. Then came the 
sound of something vainly inserted in the 
keyhole, and then- - that falling—there 
was a united crash against what was really 
a fragile doorway, and the next instant 
what seemed to me a crowd of ruffians, 
came trooping in. There were really but 
three men—quite enough to have robbed

PEAÜffi

BUSINESS CARDS. 
W. WILSON,

Attorney-At-Law Conveyancer.
• OFFICE :

Next above Nealis's Dry Goods Store, 
QUEEN STRBEr.

BECKWITH & SEELY,
<Uorneys.et.Lnir, Notaries I n bile Ac.,

Office in
CITY HALL, FREDERICTON.

Attend at Oromocto and Fredericton Junc- 
•on, alternate Saturdays.
Accounts Collected, and Loans Ncgoti-
F’ton, November 16, 1871.

J. CARLETON ALLEN,
BARRISTER & ATTORNEY-AT-LÜW,

OFFICE—Haihcway’s Building,
ORNER QUE*
A R EG N T ST.wrnebqubkn fKEDEBlCrO».

Professional Co-partnership

THE undersigned bave this day entered into a 
professional Co-partnership as Barristers 

and Attorneys, under the name and style of
B.itsfoid & Liigrin,

OFFICE—Over Electric Telet,rajfh Office 
Queen Street, Fredericton.

F’ton, 30th October, A. D. 1874.
GEO. BOTS FORD. CHAS. Fl. LUGRIN

No. 4 Bulfinch St., Boston,
(Opposite Revere IKonse.)

The Science of Life;
Or, KELF-I*RESERVATION.

More than one Million Copies Sold, 
Gold Medal Awarded to tho Author by 

the “ National Medical Association,” 
March 31st, 1*70 

JUST published by the PEABODY MEDICAL 
*J INSTITUTE, a new edition of the celebrated 
medical work entitled the “ SCIENCE OF 
LIFE; or, SELF-PRESERVATION." It treats 
upon Manhood, how lost, how regained, and 
how perpetuated, cause and cure of Exhausted 
Vitality, Im potency, Premature Decline in Man. 
Spcrmaiorrhcm, or Semial Losses (nocturnal and 
diurnal), Nur.vous and Physical Debility, Hy­
pochondria, Gloomy Forebodings, Mental De­
pression, Loss of Energy, Haggard countenance, 
Confusion of Mind and fx>ss of Memory, Impure 
State of the Blood, and all diseases arising from 
tho Errors of Youth or the indiscretions or ex­
cesses of mature years.

It tells you all about the Morale of Gonerative 
Physiology, the Physiology of Marriage, of Wed- 

;k and Offspring, Physieial Contrasts, True 
Morality, Empiricism, Perversion of Marriage, 
Conjugal Precept and Friendly Counsel, Physi­
cal Inflrmitj-, Its Causes and Cure, Relations 
Between the Sexes Proofs of the Expansions of 
Vice, The Miseries of Imprudence, Ancient ig­
norance and Errors, Means of Cure, Cure of body 
and Mind. True Principles of Treatment, Ad­
dress to Patients and Invalid Readers, The 
Author’s Principles. The price of this book is only $1.00.

This Book also contains More Than 
Fifty Prescriptions for the above named 
and other diseases, each one worth more 
than the price of the book.

Also, another valuable medical work treating 
exclusively on MENTAL AND NERVOUS DIS­
EASES; more than 2>K) royal octavo pages, 
twenty elegant engravings, bound in substantial 
muslin. Price only $200. Barely enough to paj- for printing.

•* The Book ’or young and middle-aged men to 
read Just now, is the Science of Life, or Self Pre­
servation. The Author lias returned from Eu­
rope In excellent health, and is again the Chief 
Consulting Physician of the Peabody Medical 
Institute. No. 4 Bulfinch Street, Boston, Mass.”— 
—Republican Journal.

“The Science of Life is beyond all comparison 
the most extraordinary work on Physiology over 
published.”—Boston Herald.

“ Hope nestled in the bottom of Pandora’s 
box, and hope plumes lier wings anew, since the 
issuing of these valuable works, published by the 
Peabody Medical Institute, which are teaching 
thousands how to avoid the main-lies that sap the citadel ol \\re.n—Philadelphia Enquirer.

“ It should be read by the young, the middle- 
aged and even lhc old."—New York Tribute.

The first and only Medal ever confem-d upon 
any Medical Man In this country, *as a recogni­
tion of skill and professional services, was pre­
sented to the author of these works, Marc h 31st, 
ls76. The presentation was noticed at the time 
>f its occurrence by the Boston Press, and the 
eading journals throughout the country. This 
magnificlent Medal is of solid gold, set with 
more than one hundred India diamonds of rare brillancy.

“ Altogether, In Its execution and the richness 
of Its materials, and size, this is decidedly the 
most noticeable medal ever struck in this coun­
try for any purpose whutaver. it Is well worth 
the inspection of Numismatists. It was fairly 
won and worthily bestowed.’’— Massachusetts 
Ploughman, June 3d, 1878.

%3£j‘ Catalogue sent on receipt of Pc. for postage. 
Either of the above works sent by mall on re­

ceipt of price. Address PEG BOD Y MEDICAL 
INSTITUTE, (or W. H. PARKER, M. IX. Con­
sulting Physician,) No. 4 Bulfinch St., Boston, 
Mass., opp. Revere House.

N. B. The author can be consulted on the 
above named diseases, as well us nil diseases re. 
quiring skill, secrecy and cxi>erlence. Office l-.ourer, 9 a. M. to 6 p. ar.

July 24, 1870.

Ayer’s

Cherry Pectoral
For Diseases of the

Throat and Lungs,

such as Coughs, Colds,

Whooping Cough,

HUGH McMONAGI.P,
Sussex Corner, Kins’s Cou ty, 

NEW BRUNSWICK.
feeder of Ayrshire Cattle, and Lei -ester Sheer cpl S 1871

SÂKUËxTBirilÏNG
Hampton Village King’s Co.. N, B 

Breeder of Ayrshire 
and Manufacturer of Leather.

J. L. TÜRNËF-
AUCTIOXEE H ,

Conveyancing and Collecting Agent.

BILLS PROMPTLY COLLEÇTED,
«ttILBX STREET, FREDERICTON.

May 8, 1876.

EDWAMD C’A DWA LIA DEB,
Organist Christ Church Cathedra. 

teacher op the
Organ, Pianoforte, Cabinet Organ 

and Vocal Music.
Pianos and Organs Tuned and repaired. 
Agent for the best Reed Organs.
B. N. FRESHMAN*! BROs",

Advertising Agents,
186 XT. Fourth JSt., CINCINNATI, O.,

Are authorized to contract for ad­
vertising in this paper. 

Estimates furnished tree. Send for a Circular

[ANKFUL for past patronage, con Inuest nirivo I dteenne in Ul mrl *« . o».j —111 —* _^jV Î.-UU llluesi Igive Lessons in Singing, and will give o-ntlnna An tl.o PlnnA

Beek, Chai lotte St
structions on the Plano." 

For terms apply to Mrs.

mn
irue
F’Um.'OcL (5r 187a

VV. F. COLEMAN, M. D., M. R. C. S. ENG.

FORMERLY Surgeon to Toronto Eye and Ear Intirmnrj\
^Practice limited to diseases of the Eye and

Office : 32 Germain Street 
Corner North Market street, 

r • St, J uin, u b—10 to 12, and 2 to 5. p rll 23 ,1877.

Bronchitis,

and Consumption.

The reputation it has attained, in consequence of 
the marvellous cures it has produced during the 
last half century, is a sufficient assurance to the 
public that it will continue to realize the happiest 
results that can be desired. In almost every 
section of country there arc persons, publicly 
known ,who have been restored from alarming and 
even desperate diseases of the lungs, by its use. 
All who have tried it,acknowledge its superiority ; 
and where its virtues are known, no one hesitates 
as to what medicine to employ to relieve the dis­
tress and suffering peculiar to pulmonary affec­
tions. Cherry Pectoral always affords in­
stant relief, and performs rapid cures of the 
milder varieties of bronchial disorder, as well as 
the more formidable diseases of the lungs.

As a safeguard to children, amid the distress­
ing diseases which beset the Throat and Chest of 
Childhood, it is invaluable ; for, by its timely use, 
multitudes are rescued and restored to health.

This medicine gains friends at every trial, as 
the cures it is constantly producing are too re­
markable to be forgotten. No family should he 
without it, and those who have once used it 
never will.

Eminent Physicians throughout the country 
prescribe it, and Clergymen often recommend it 
from their knowledge of its effects.

PREPARED BY

Dr. J.C. AYER & CO., Lowell, Mass.,
Practical and Analytical Chemists.

SOLD BY ALL DRUGGISTS EVERYWHERE 
A. CHIP MAS SMITH, Wholesale Agent, 
Samt John N. B.

WAVERLY HOUSE
FREDERICTON.
IiHIS well known hotel has been Improved on, 

and t.lie premises enlarged. The Stables are 
the best In the city. Prices away down.
Parties bringing their own Hay and Oats, 

can have free stabling provided Lney get Meals at the house,
JOHN B. GRIEVE.*,

. F’ton, Jan. 29, 1877. Proprietor.

RUBBERS
Just received at

LOTTIMBR'S Shoe Store.

A LARGE let of Rubbers for Gentleman 
Ladies', and Mieses wear, just received 

A. LOTTIMER.
F’ton, April 9, 1877.

P p A Y * C fyrup of Red Spruce Crum, 
Uiml J in addition to its great 
efficacy, has a pleasant and agreeable 
taste. Children readily take it, and it is 
a certain cure for or- CVDI1D ft 17 
dinary Coughs or 3 I HU A UJT 
Colds. It has a remarkable power in re­
lieving BRONCHITIS, is the best remedy
urn QDDlirr for asthma,ilLv drilULL cures SORE 
THROAT and HOARSENESS, and is in­
valuable in the lasst stage of Consumption. 
Beware of substitutes and ft IT IU| 
imitations,—and take only U U III ■ 
GRAYS SYRUP of RED SPRUCE GUM.
^April 9, 1877.

To Let.
fTlHE shop In Dr. Brown’s Building, at present 
JL occupied by the subscriber.

Possession given first of May.
J°ton, feb. 19,1£77. TB.

To Rent.
mORE.VT from the first ,1-iy of May next, two 
-L Dwelling Houses, one situated on the corner 
of George and Northumberland Street, the other 
next to It on Northumberland. Enquire of 
t’ton, Feb. 5, 1877. GEO. CREIGHTON.

Land For Sale-.

THAT Valuable Lot of Land and Farm con­
taining 2J0 acres or thereabouts situate near 

Lake George, In the Pariah of Prince Wililam, 
County of York, granted to George West, and by 
him conveyed to the late John Davis.

For terms and p:irt>ulars, apply to
GEO. H. DAVIS A CO., 

F’ton, April 9, 1877. Druggists,

For Sale !
Possession given 1 st of Mag next.

A LL that valuable lot of land In the City of 
l\. Fredericton, fronting 49 fret on George Street 
and running back towards Charlotte Street 165 
feet, and being the same premises now occupied 
by Mrs. Murphy, and situate next below Capt.

SEEDS !
Choice Selected,

Field, Flower, Tree, Grass. Herb, 
Vegetable and Honey Plants, 
Garden and Apiarian, implements 

and Supplies, Agricultural 
Books, Ac., Ac.

Onr New Descriptive Catalogue, sent nos tag paid, Address carefully,
C. F. LANE’S,

N. W. Apiary and Seed Warehouse, Kush- konong, Wis.
January 29, 1877.—ly

Dr. William Grays* Specific Medicines

iiJl
Th> great English Remedy 

Is especially recommended 
as an unfailing cure for 
Nominal WeaJcnrss, Sperma­
torrhea, Impotnicy, and all 

- —diseases that, follow as a so-, 
liofore.^B.06 of Self Abuse, ns 7xm•o/ Memory. Universal Ixtsxi- After. 
tude, Pain in the Buck, Dimness of Vision, Prema­
ture Old Age, and many other di: eases that lead 
to Insanity oj Consumption and a Premature Grave, 
all of which r.sa rule are first caused by devi­
ating from the paths of nature and over indul­
gence-

The Specific Medicine Is the result of a life 
study and many years of experience in treating 
these special diseases. Pamphlet free by mail.

The Specific Medicine is sold by all Druggists 
at $l per package, or six packages for $5, or will 
be sent by mail on receipt of the monev, by ad 
dressidg WILLIAM GRAY A CO., Windsor. Out,

Sold In Fredericton by all Druggists. 
Nortnrop & Lyman, Toronto, and Kerry, Watson 
& Co., Montreal, Wholesale Agents.

Leigh. Apply to 
-RASER, ‘FRA 

April 2, 1877. WETMORE, <fc WINSLOW,
Barristers.

MRS. BEEK

LONG’S HOTEL,
Comer of King and York Streets,

'll HE Subscriber having leased thv ab ive well 
t known premises, begs to intimate that he is 

now prepared to receive and accommodate tran­
sient and permanent boarders.

The house has been recently painted, papered, 
and cleaned throughout, and every room newly 
furnished. He will spare no pains to make 
Ling's Hotel a home to all who may be pleased 
to visit it.

TERMS $1 00 per day.
The best Stabling in the City, with an experi­

enced Hostler always in attendance.
GEO. HUME, Proprietor. 

Fredericton, May 22.

THE EXCHANGE.
■ Un-' HOTEL, situated on the Eastern side of 
V Q V3U Street, near Westmorland Street, Is 
ow fitted up in First-UInss Style, and affords 
xcelleut accommodation to both t ransient and lermanent boarders.
The proprietor will spare r.o pains In making 

his a first-rate Boarding House, and trusts by 
lT mpt attention to the comforts and con- 
1 ei.icnce of the travelling public to merit a fair 
fare of public patronage.
An excellent Stable, with careful nostlera, will 

■js found in connection with the Hotel.
WILLIAM HAW THORNE.

BIBLE SOCIETY
DEPOSITORY,

AT

Hall’s Rook Store, 
h EDE R1C TO N

’IIKE Society now have a very full stock ol 
1 * f ales and Testaments, which are disposed 
>i at ' e usual low prices. No one need be with-

Tl s. hall,
Torrens’ Building.

SAINT MARY’S 
DRUG STORE !

St. Marys Ferry, Opp. Fredericton.
cnrcfnllyPhysicians Prescriptions 

Prepared.

Drugs, Patent Medicines, Dyes, Toilet Articles, 
Perfumer}-, Brushes, Stationery, School 

Books, Ac, constantly on hand, 
j ly 3, ’7(S. WTNSLOW TI LLEY.

CARDING MACHINES.
Tne subscribers are now manufacturing Card­

ing Machines in tho latest and most approved 
style and workmanship.

Double and single Frames, 4 workers and 4 
stri imers to each Cylinder, Iron Arches Ac. Aiso 
Wool Pickers, all suitable for country work. 
Supply Machine Cards, Crank plats Cleaners, Ac.

AII orders punctually attended to. Address W. 
A J. Morice, Sackville, County of W estmorlano 
N B., or Messrs James Harris A Co., SI. John N. B. 

Feb. 5. ; W. A J. MORICE.

DR, ÛHMW8
Sarsaparilla

FOF. THE BLOOD 
CURES 

SYPHILIS,

A Highly Concexthatt.d 
Extiiacp OF

BEL JAMAICA
SARSAPARILLA

DOt'BI.E IODZDF.R
Fpnct?. forbids the giving 

more testimony in this 
place.in fan-roftiitôgreat 
me i c:uc I- net c ne cer­
tificate. however.from an 
eminent mu’ wo” hr.own 
Pliyyc'afi 1 Le Lr. Eosecv 
cf Montreal, cutfyier.t to 
e ta.b!i:h ils mjiericrily 
ever the ir-memos m!x- 
lures Called B!r,«.<i['i:ri!'ers 
offered by DrugiriaG and 
others ?
T. C. STtATTOM. E.=n.

Montent!, Fob. 1 t.. D"5. 
I carnet but regard tho 

formula frem which Dr. 
Channing’sSarsaparilla is
Eropared, as ere cf tho 
est doss i bio com hi r a t - r.s 
to Con.-titato an cCVctunl 

remedy, fer tho c ro of 
Blood Impr.ritus.,bo turns 
my experier,.'!? h;*s pc r.o 
with this remedv. I c:;a 
testify to its treat value 
in the treatment of all 
Strumous and Cachectic 
affections, as 
Enlargements, and a v. ido 
range cf skin affections j 
as a reliable preparation 
for general use ns a llaod 
purifier, I kiv-w of none 
equal to it. Combining ns it 
does, all tho imputed vir­
tues of Sarsapar.ila, and 
Ecvcrai other valuable 
remedies, with the 
extraord nary alterative 
properties of the “ Double 
Iodides, ” and of none 
that can be more 
highly recommended as 
safe, certain and reliable, 
and 1 havo every confi­
dence, that such a remedy 
for general mo, taking the 
place of the many worth­
less nostrums of tho day, 
will bo a great boon to 
suffering humanity, and 
its use will be attended 
with the most satisfactory 
results. It should be in­
valuable to persons beyond 
the reach of medical ad­
vice, and* will, no doubt, 
become popular with Me­
dical men throughout tho country.

Respectfully yours,
W E. BESSEY, M.D. 

|8 Beaver Hall Square, 
^Yrn'TDfMChnnninB 6 Sarsaparilla is put up

SCROFULA,

SALT-RHEUM.

ALL
SKIN-DISEASES,

TUMORS,

ENLARGEMENT 
OF THE 

LIVER AND 
SPLEEN,

RHEUMATIC
AFFECTIONS,

DISEASES 
OF THE 

KIDNEYS, 
BLADDER 

AND
URINARY
ORGANS,

LEUCORRHŒA,

CATARRH,

AND ALL 
DISEASES 

RESULTING 
FROM A 

DEPRAVED 
AND 

IMPURE 
CONDITION 

OF THE 
BLOOD.

in l.irgo bottles, with the name blown in the r ass. and retail, ,t il.oo per brute, cr Six 
Hot,,ea for l ive Dollar*, beltl by Hrucsista 
generally end most reentry Httres. lie titre, end nric for Dr. Channii.g’ri fcar.'iipariiki. ::iid 
|11:0,.?° other. If not readily obtained in yc.ur Ifieality, address tho General Agent*.

Perry Davis b, Son & Lawrence
377 St. Paul Street, Montreal.

For Sale in F’ton.
rpHREE valuable building Late, sltnate-on the 
JL South side of Shore Street. Also, a corner 
lot on Northumberland and George Streets.— 
Also, several lots on Charlotte Street, near the 
Exhibition, and a very valuable property on the 
Maryland It-rad. Also, a piece of land on the 
Brick Kiln Road, the “ Willow Field ” so called.

Apply to
FETER HAINING,

April 2, : 877. County Court House.

LADIES I LADIES I
NEW AND FASHIONABLE

STATIONERY
Just Received for the Ladies.

Silver Threads Papeterie.
Gabrielle “
Little Corporal - “
Little Dot “
Drummer Boy “
Weeping Willow, mourning.

The latest and prettiest yet, fur sale cheap at
J. L. BEVERLY’S.

F’ton, April 2, 1877.

Ladies Fur Caps, $1.00 to $11.00
Woo.en Shawls, 1.75 to 8.00
Woolen Gloves, .20 to .49
Woolen Hose, .25 to .50
Promenade Scarfs, 1.00 to 1.75
Crossovers .50 to 1.00
Breakfast Shawls, .60 to 1.60
Winceys, .8 to .28
Mantle Cloths 1.60 to 4.00

Hoods, Shirts, and Dress Goods in
variety and at all prices at

OWEN SHAttKEY’S.

Mens’ Overcoats, $6.00 to $12.00
Reefers, 4.00 to 12.00
Boys’ Reefers, 3.50 to 5.00
Overcoats, 4.00 to 5 00
F ar Caps )
Mens’ & Boys, | 1.06 to 12.00
Fur Gauntlets, 2.50 to 3.00
Kid 1.00 to 1.40
Kid Mitts, lined, 1.00 to 1.15
Gloves, 1.00 to 1.25
Fur and Felt Hats, 1.00 to 3.50

TO Asa Soles, of the Parish of Sain 
Mary’s, in the County of York, Mechanic 
and all others whom it may concern.

Notice Is hereby given that by virtue of a power 
of Sale contained In a certain Assignment ol 
Lease by way of mortgage, bearing date the 
second day of January, A. D. 1875, and made be­
tween tlie said Asa Soles of the one part and 
Martha Rutter and Henry Rutter, Executrix and 
Executor of Thomas Rutter, deceased, of the 
other part, registered lu Book C 3, pages 510, 511, 
512, 518 and dldof York County Recotds, there 
will for the purpose of satisfying the monies se­
cured by the said mortgage, default having been 
made In the payment thereof, be sold at Public 
Auction at the Weigh Scales In front of the 
County Court House, in Queen’s Ward, in the 
City of Fredericton, on Friday, the 25th day of 
May next, (A. D. 1877,) at twelve o’clock, noon, 
the lands and premises described in the said mortgage as follows.*—

All that certain piece or parcel of laud, situate, 
lying aud being in the Parish of Saint Mary’s, 
aforesaid known or described as follows :— 

Beginning on the South-west side of the River 
leading to Nashwaak Bridge, at a stake standing 
in the most easterly angle of Lot No. 1 ; thence 
running north 39 o, west 90 feet to a stake, thence 
southerly at right angles thereto 58 feet 3 Inches 
to a stake, thence south 89o, east 110 feet to a 
stake standing on the South-west side of the 
above mentioned road, thence north 170 west 
along said river to the place of beginning, being 
known as Lot No. 2, in the plan. Together with 
all and singular the buildings, Improvements, 
privileges and appurtenances to the said pre­
mises belonging or in any way appertaining. 
l^Datcd this seventeenth day of March, A, D.

MARTHA RUTTER, Executrix, 
HENRY RUTTER, Executor, 

Gregory & Blair. Sols, lor Executors.
Of the last Will and Testament of Tnomas Rutter, 

deceased.

Money to Loan.
REAL ESTATE.

Apply to
FRASER WETMORE <fc WINSLOW.

To Rent.
Bosses sion given lsi of May.

THE House on St. John Street, at present oc 
cupied by Mrs. Gunn. Also tho House on 

Regent Street, known as the ‘ Lawrence House. 
Also the House on King Street, adjoining the one 
occupied by the subscriber.

March 19. ARTHUR LIMERICK.

Wanted..
1 T>USHELS of Case Knife and Califor- 
E V nia Beans. Will pay market price.

DAVIS & DIBBLES, 
PnrooisTS & Seedsmen, 

Opposite City Hall, Fredericton. 
March 18, 1877.

Furs Falling.
RAW FURS fell 30 per cent, at the Hud­

son Bay Sale this month in Loudon. 
VTOTWITHSTANDING this we will pay fair 
il prices for any Fisher, Sable, Otter, Beaver, 
Mink. Fox, Lucifee or Muskrat brought to us. 
We keep buying.

IÆMONT & SONS,
March 19. Lemont’s Variety Store.

NOTICE.

THE party who borrowed the Book entitled, 
“Life in the Far West,” from the subscriber 

will oblige him by returning tbe same at once.
J. FRED. RICHARDS. 

F’ton, March 5, 1877.— pd.

“YOU WANT A LADY”
to make yon happy ! The “ I.ADY” is the 
finest largo, extra early. WHITE «RAPE 
known; Ripens middle of August. Hardy, heal­
thy, productive, and everywhere reliable. 
Nine years tested, and approved by the best 
Horticulturists In the Union. Strong one year 
plants $1.59 single ; $15 doz.; $100 per 100. 2-years 
plants, $2 single ; $20doz. ; $1.50 per 100, tire-paid, 
by mail or express. Circulars ami price-list ol 
OO varieties of Grapes free.

geo. W. CAMPBELL, Dele ware, Ohio. March 5, 1877.

MOLASSES.

Ladies Fur Caps, &c.

Toge her with Pants, Vests, Drawers, Scarfs 
Collors and Braces, at prices to suit the times.

OWEN SHARKEY.

WANTED.
WE WANT reliable, energetic canvassing 

agents in every town in the Dominion for
the new “ Illustrated History of the Dominion of 
Canada.” This work is truly magnifiaient, con­
taining over 2,000 double column quarto pages, 
and over 300 superb full page engravings. The 
work is published in Parts, on a plan which in­
sures its welcome to every English reading 
family. To energetic young men or ladies, who 
are willing to work, we will guarantee a perman­
ent position for two years, and good pay ! Don’t 
fail to write for our private terms, sample pages, 
etc. This Is a grand opportunity lor school 
teachers to make more than double their salaries 
without interfering with their professional duties. 
The work is being manufactured at a cost of over 
$20,900 for the literary, artistic and mechanical 
work of .producing tho plates, by the old well- 
known, reliable Lovell Printing and Publishing 
Co., of Montreal. All letters from agents must be 
addressed to the Publishers general agents, as 
follows :

Il A ZEN B. B IGNE Y * PO-,
28 and 40 tit. Francis Xavier Street, 

681, Montreal, que.

MANHOOD :
How Lost, How Restored !
a Just- published, a now edition of Dr 

Cnlverwcll’s Celebrated Essay on 
the radical cure (without medicine) of 

Spermetorrhœa or Seminal Weakness, Involun­
tary Seminal Losses, lmpotency, Mental and 
Physical Incapacity, Impediments to Marriage, 
etc. ; also* Consumption, Epilepsv and Fits, in­
duced by sell-indulgence or sexual extravagance, 
etc.

Price, in a sealed envelope, only G cents. 
The celebrated author, in this admirable Essay, 

clearly demonstrates, from a thirty years’ suc­
cessful practice, that the alarming consequences 
of self-abuse may he radically cured without the 
dangerous use of Internal medicine, or the appli 
cation of the knife : pointing out a mode of cure 
at once simple, certain and effectual, by means 
of which every sufferer, no matter what his con­
dition maybe, may cure himself cheaply, pri­vately and radically,

ftgh This Lecture should be in the hands of 
every youth and every man in the land.

Rent, under seal, In a plain envelope, to any 
address, postpaid, on receipt of six cents, or two 
postage stamps.

Address,
THE CULVERWELL MEDICAL CO.,
51 Ann Street, New York—P.O. Box 4658.

Flour Flour
FLOUR.

1,000
IN STORE :

BARRELS, Flour and Meal. For 
9 Sale at lowest market rates. 

VIVIAN W. TIPPET.

Farm for Sale.

ÛÂTÂIRH.
FiveYear;’ Sickness Cured by Four Bottles 

of Constitultinal Catarrh Remedy. 
Pain in Shoulders, Bae't and Lungs, an 

Dronings in Throat Disappear.
FT. AltllAXIl, P. Q„ Sort 18, 1876. 

Mtt.T. j. n n a RTiixf,
Dear Sir. — hrhig désirons that others mnyknon 

something of the merits of your CONSTITirriONAl 
Cat.until pimf.vv, I wish to inform yon whnt h 
has done for me. I ::m twenty-nine ye;:; -r old; had 
been ont * f health for shunt five years. I lmc 
employ, 1 three or four different doctors, and tried 
various medieinvs, without receiving any perm» 
lient ha ne (it, but continued rather to «now worn» 
until last fall, when I bad become so bail as to b« 
unable to do an hour’s work at a time lied severe 
eoroness. and pain under the shoulder Maries and 
through the shoulders, with v< y lame bay!;, and i 
feeling in my light lung as ihnnyh there was # 
■weight bearing it down, with continual dropping 
in the throat and down upon the lungs. Such wai 
my condition when I commenced to lake your 
tanh.Remedy, one hot tie of which eased my paini 
and pave me an improved apnetitc, and after Ink 
1ng tour bottles I was restored to I ealth so as tn 
bo able to endure bard and continued labor, such 
as chopping and clearing land, al which I have 
been engaged the past season. My recovery I at 
tribute solely, with God's blessing, to the use ol 
your Catarrh Remedy.

Vnms truly TTENRY SNIDER 
**rioo 61 per bottle ; lor sale by all Druggists,

Can’t be made by every agent every 
month in tho business we furnish, 
but those willing to work can easily 
earn a dozen dollars a day right in 
their own localities. Have no room 

to explain bore. Business pleasant and honor­
able. Women, and boys and girls do as well as 
men. We will lurnlsh yon a complete Outfit 
tree. The business pays bettor than anything 
else. Wn will bear expense ot starting you. 
Particulars free. Write and see. Farmers anti 
mechanics, their sons and daughters, and all 
classes in need of paying work at home, should 
write to ns and learn all about the work at once. 
Now is the time. Don’t delay. Address True 
Æ Co., Augusta, Maine. 703.

New Brunswick

SCHOOL BOOKS

F

A HISTORY OF CANADA.
IROM its earliest settlement by the French 

to tho consummation of Coniederat Ion, by
Andrew archer, prescribed by the the Board 
of Education for Now Brunswick, Illustrated by 
maps and plans, 12 mo., 470 pages. Price 75c.

This valuable book will be found to meet a 
long experienced want both as a School Book 
and as a "oncise and reliable History of Canadd 
for the general reader.

For Sale by

J. & A. McMillan,
BOOKSELLERS, STATIONERS, <tc.

St. John, N. B.

IQP*Price 75c.

For Sale by all Booksellers In New Brunswick

11;
■ BBd'

ANHOOB
RESTORED.

Victims <’f youthful Imprudence, who have tried in vain every km.wn remedy, will learn of a simple inscription. FitEK, for the speedy euro u?*r.ei. i-us debility, -irematnre decay, lost, manhood, und ull Jifiordera brought on by excesses. Any druggist has the itigret’lencs. Address 
>SON : CO., 86 Nawwnu SI., N.A.

GA.IdID

From the old Stand.
«Taokson Adams9

Cabinet Maker, Upholsterer, § Undertaker,

WOULD take tills opportunity of expressing 
to Ills numerous friends and customers 

bis thanks for the ve*y liberal patroniz > bes­
towed on him during ‘the number of years pîîst, 
and would assure them that lie wifi abate no 
efforts on his part to merit a continuance of their

Having enlarged his establishment he will 
keep constantly on hand a large assortment of

r¥Bsa$raais.
CABINET MAKING carried on in all its 

branches.
Matrasses made to order, and Ot.i> Mat­

rasses made over.
Picture Framing and repairing of all kinds 

attended to.
Undertaking.

In this department I keep on hand Caskets, 
Coffins, Robes, Shrouds, Trimmings, and every­
thing in connection thcrewhn.

Orders from the City or Country, night or day, 
attended to.

Funerals promptly attended to.
Shop aud residence near tiuecn St„ opposite 

County Court House.
F’ton, Sept. 18, 187(5.

CIONTAINING about 90 acres ; 20 being Wood 
j land, the remainder under high cultivation 
Dwelling House, nearly new, and situate upon a 

commanding eminehce, containg 9 rooms, com-
Slctely finished throughout. Large Barn and 

ut-Houses in perfect repair. Three large un­
failing springs, furnish a constant supply ol 

pure water all the year round.
Neighborhood first-class. From the house a 

view Is had of sunwssing beanty ten miles down 
the River Saint John, and seventy miles into 
the State ot Maine. In full view anil easy reach 
of the Narrow Guage an l N. ». and Cumula Rail­
ways. Situate In Jacksonville, 5 miles from • 
Woodstock. Perfect title guaranteed. With t he 
Farm will be sold, if desired, Farming Imple­
ments, Cows, Sheep, Horses, Wagon-, Carts, 
Harness s, Sleighs, and in fact everything noces sary to carry on the Farm.

Full information as to terms and price may 
bo obtained from Hamilton Emery. Esq., at 
Jacksonville, or

JOSEPH 0. RIRTEEN,
at the Sash Factory, Fredericton.Oct. 2,1870.

Would be exchanged for Suitable Real Estate, in or very near Fredericton.

340jASICS choice Barbadocs Molssaes, for 
_ > sale low by

5 1877. G. T. WHELPLEY.

Professional Co Partnei'ship.

A Professional Co-Partnkksiiip has this 
day boen entered into between the under­

signed Barristers at Law, ufider the name and 
style of RAINSFORD A BLACK.

Dated at Fredericton, this 13th day of February,
HENRY B. RAINSFORD, JR.
juhn black.

feb. 26, 1877.

4 Style-MAN-Style.’
A. B. West, Genio 0. Scott, and John I. 

Mitchell’s

NEW YORK FASHIONS
FOR

Spring and Summer of 1877,
Received this day at

SCULLY § COLLINS,
Tailoring Establishment, next above 8. F. 

8 hute's Esq.,
Feb. 19, 1877.

Dissolution Notice.
rilHE co-partnership lierctofoee existing be- 
JL tween the undersighed, under the name and 
style of Lug kin a Son, has been this day dis­
solved by mutual consenti The Printing and 
Pub'ishing business of the late firm will, be 
carried on under the name aud stvlc as hereto­
fore. by Mr. Geo. K. Lugrin, to whom all debts 
due to the late firm must be paid, and by whom 
the debts of the late firm will he discharged.

Fredericton, September 1st, A. IX 1876.
CHAS. S. LUGRIN, 

GEO. K. LUGRIN.

FORSjâlÆ.
mHE subscriber offers for sale Ills property in 
JL Kingsclear known as the “ Odell property,” 
situate 2 miles from Fredericton and comprising 
about thirty acres. Also his Island property, 
situate opposite. The above property cuts about 
30 tons or bay-. The Islands are annually increas- 
cing In value and at a small ost can be made to 
nt double tbe amount of grass cthey do at present. 
This property is admirably adapted fora gentle­
man’s residence, commanding as it does fine 
views of tho River and surrounding country.

Apply to
HENRY B. RAINSFORD, 

005 or CHARLES C. TaBOR.

■ —Mi», ib
r W.TIT ISE CURED BY 

Smilfs, Washes, or Local Appli-S Ciitimis Thousands of casus, g 
, ai-me of forty years standing, R 
^ have been entirely cud by Uic j 

3rc. t 'crsti.cUccfl Catarrh r.atacdy. E For Sale by all Diuggists. r
__Send Stamp for Treatise on Cat-
J. It. HAIlI)l.\n. Brockville, Ont.

FREDERICTON

Papeterie Depot,
IS at

JAMES L. BEVERLY’S,
704. Coy’s Block.

Manchester House.

1877. SPRING 1877.

JF’olt XXfVtS,

JUST opened, a splendid assort m-. ■ ■ [ Gent’s
and Youths latest style

AMERICAN FELT HAT&
which for quality and price cannot be exj 

You are respectfully Invited to «rtîaiid In-

SIMON NEALIS.
rHAY PRESS*. ACORESS FCR CIRCULA* 

*_P.K.OEDûRICKSiCO

ELOCUTIONIST'S JOURNAL gvesl
choicest standard and new pieces for pro­

fessional and amateur readers and speakers, 
School exhibition, and some for very little speak­
ers; also Interesting articles on appropriate 
subjects. Just the thing wanted. Large size, 
J.0 cts, of any newsdealer or by mail. JESSE 
HANEY tfc CO., 119 Nassau St., New York

3

To the Working Class.—We are now pre­
pared to furnish all classes with constant em­
ployment at home, the whole of the time, or for 
their spare moments. Business new, light and 
profitable. Persons of either sex easily earn 
rom 50 cents to $5 per evening, and a propor­

tional sum by devoting their whole time to the 
business. Boys and girls earn nearly as much as 
men. That all who see this notice may send 
their address, and test the business we make this 
unparelled otter: To such as are not well satisfied 
we will send one dollar to pay for the trouble ol 
writing. Full particulars, samples worth several 
dollars to commence work on, and a copy ot 
Home and Fireside, one of the largest and best 
Illustrated Publications, all sent free by mall. 
Reader, If you want permanent, profitable work, 
address, George Stinson A Co, Portland, Maine, 

feb. 19,1877.

CENTRAL
FIRE INSURANCE

COMPANY CF
New Brunswick,

(ESTABLISHED IN I83G.)

OFFICE :—Their Brick Building 
QUEEN STREET, *

NEAR COUNTY COURT HOUSE,
Insurance affected as reasonable as any 

other good company.
S. D. McPIIERSON, President. 
WM. McBEATH, Secretary. 

Fredericton, July 10,1870.

A. ANDERSON* 
Glasgow House.

SUMMER_187t>.

HAVING now completely finished tho 
repairs and fitting up of my shop from 

•the effect-s of the Fire, and having purchased 
almost an entirely new stock of

Dry Goods and Clothing,
on the very best terms. I am now in a posi­
tion to offer to my customers and the public 
generally very decided brrgttins in the fol­

lowing goods,
Dress Stuffs, in Fancy checks and plaids, 

Japanese Silks, Lustres, Alpaccas in all 
shades, Batiste's, Muslins, Cambric's, 

Shawls, Mantles, Prints, Flannels, 
Shirtings, Grey & White Cot­

tons, Hollands, Jeans, Par- 
sols, Umbrellas, Os- 

naburghs, Towtdl- 
ing, Sheeting,

Ticking,

with a general description of Goods usually 
found in a Dry Goods Est a rl ish m f. nt .

I alsq beg to inform tlm Public that I have 
fitted up Rooms over my shop for the pur­
pose of carrying1 on the

Tailoring Business, 
in all its branches and have secured tho ser­
vices of Mr. E. Seery, whose abiliÇes as a 
Cutter are so long and favorably known in 
Fredericton and adjoining country, and have 
purchased from best markets a line assort­
ment of superfine Black and Blue Broadcloths, 
Fancy mixed and Basket Coatings, West of 
England, Scotch and Canadian Tweeds, in all 
the leading styles and colors.

A good assortment of first class Trimmers 
always on hand. Garments for Weddings 
and Funerals made up in from 12 to 24 hours. 
My cutter having great experience in cutting 
Clergymen's Garments and which will be 
made up in superior style and to whom a 
liberal discount will be made.

Always on hand a full line, of Gents Shirts, 
[made to order if required.] Braces, Trunks, 
Neck Ties of all kinds, Ilats, daps, Socks, 
Shirt Collars, &c., &c.

A. ANDERSON.
P. S.—Every Garment made here a per­

fect Fit and the latest styles guanteed.
A. A.

Corner of Queen and Carle ton Streets. 
F’ton, June 19, 1876.

WONDERFUL SUCCESS ! 25,000 of the

CENTENNIAL EXPOSITION
DESCRIBED AND ILLUSTRATED

Sold in 6» days. It being the only complete 
low-priced work (only 82.50), treating of the 
entire history, grand buildings, wonder­
ful exhibits, cariosities, etc.; illustrated,
and 81 cheaper than any other; everybody 
wants it. One new agent cleared 8350 in 4 
weeks. 3.000agents wanted. Freights paid to 
Canada. Send quickly for proof of above, 
opinions of officials, clergy, and press, sample 
pages, full description, and extra terms. 
HUBBARD BROS,, Publishers Springfield,

lînn B<ware ol falsely claimed official 
A/aU UOUand worthless books. Send for 
proof. 705.

THE WEBSTER.
Web eg leave to inform our customers and the 

public generally that we have opened a
BRANCH OiUCE.
on Phœnix Square, Fredericton, opposite Olty 
Hall, where we have on hand a large stock ol

Sewing Machines
of different kinds, namely •—Webster, Wheeler 
ifc Wilson, Family Singer, Raymond Singer, 
XVanzer, dec., or we will furnish any Sewing 
Machine required. Machines In price from $10 to $75, sold on easy terms.

Wc would call particular attention to the Im­
proved Webster Machine which has become-the 
popular machine of the day, being a marvel ol 
mechanical simplicity. We have sold thirteen 
hundred (1300) In little better than a year, in Nova Scotia. ’

Old machines taken In exchange for new Sew­
ing machines. Findings. Needles, Oil, Ac., con­
stantly on hand ; Sewing Machines repaired ; 
also Agents for Bickford and Branson Knitting 
acalh nCS* 1>artlcs rcq«iridg will please give us

MILLER BROTHERS,
General Agents,

Dec V3 Phoenix Square. Fton.

RAILWAYS.
Speed, Safety and Comfort I Travel 

by Bail.

Fredericton Railway !

Picture Frames.
JUST RECEIVED a Large Assorment of

MOULD 144 CS,
—SUITABLE FOR—

Framing Chromos, Mottoes, 
Pictures, Texts, &c.

Which will be made up better and cheaper 
than at any other place at

ADA MS’
«■luccn St., near County Court House, F’ton 

December 4, 1870.

V/' lTEl "W tuplinfj
âr~lTî.’T».-FJ<r '^ sj? Ltrur .

SUMMER ARRANGEMENT.

SLY TEA INS 15AIL Y. JR

ON and after TUESDAY, the 1st of Mav.
and until further notice, TRAINS will 

run as follows:—
7 90 A M Through Express Train leaves 
4 ü. iu. Fredericton for St. John, and 

intermediate points without' change of 
cars. Arriving m St. John, 10.30 a m. 

Q Qfl A M Express Train leaves Frcd- 
a. eiicron for Fredericton Junc­
tion, where immediate connection is 
made with Express Train for Harvey, 
McAdam, St. Stephen. St. Andrews, 
Houlton, Woodstock, Bangor. Danville 
Junction, Portland, Boston and ail p jints 
West.

ft À M ExPrcss Train leaves St John tx. itx. for Fredericton making con­
nection at Gibson witk Rivcre Du Loup 
Train for NortlAmpton, Woodstock, 
Hartlaml, Flore/ceville, Maniac and 
Fort Fairville. /

Q OO T* TUT Bxj?ress Train leaves Fre*I- 
°eVU r* 1Vle erifton for St. John after 

arrival Tram N. B. R. f om Fort Fair- 
ville, Maniac, Florcncwillc, liar;Ford 
and Woodstock.

4 I 0 P TVf ®xPresS Train leaves Fretl- 
A.* ’ ericton Junction f>r ‘-Fred­
ericton after making connection with 
Train for the West.

11/5 P A/f Through Express Train leaves 
±u . St. Juhn for Fredericton. N<> 

change Cars on Through Train. Return 
Tickers to St. John fjr three dollars. 
Buy your Tickets via Fredericton Rail­
way and you will save monev.

THOS. TEMPLE,
President.

FRED. B. EDGECOMBE,
„ Supt.
Fredericton, April 30th, 1877.

THE COLONIAL FARMER
PUBLISHED EVERY MONDAY 

OFFICE,—Courser’s Building opposite the Peo­
ple's Bulk, Queen Street, Frederick »n, N. B. 

Subscription Price $1.00,—ïxavariably ia 
Advance.

*,* Sascribers whose number opp isitc their 
names on tho printed addresses is lesi than tho 
number of tha paper on the right han 1 side will 
understand that their subscriptions have cx-

RATES OF ADVER1SING.
One inch of space, 1st insertion $1.00
Each additional insertion, ^ V 50

Advertisements for three, six, and Vvelve 
months can be arranged for on applies tioaat the 
office. J]

The number of times an advcrtismc.it ^ to bo 
inserted should be distinctly stated When this 
is not attended to, it will be contiuuîd until or­
dered out.

Advertisers will please hand in their favors no 
later than Friday morning in each week

Printing of all Descriptions executed at
the office of the FARMER in the best manner 
and at moderate rates.

O* Lawyers' and Magistrates' Blanks con - 
stantly on hand.

Orders by mail promptly attendent j.
GEO. P. ROWELL & Co., 40 Park Row 

and S. HI. PETTENGILL & Go., 37 P*ik 
Row, are our only authorized Advertising 
Agents in New York.


