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FROM THE PAPERS.

The owner of the Churchman, the 
paper that exhibits so much bitterness 
toward the Methodists, is the proprietor 
of one of the New York theatres.

The Old Testament Revisers have 
completed their seventy-second session, 
and carried their second revision as far 
as Jeremiah ix.

A correspondent of the St. Louis 
Christian Advocate thinks, in view of the 
many preachers who go up to Confer­
ence with deficient salaries, that “ our 
missionaries in foreign fields are not the 
only martyrs for Goa's heritage.

The Universities of Cambridge and 
Oxford, England, are supporting mis­
sionaries in Blast Africa, who teach the 
naked natives all the rites and ceremo­
nies of extreme ritualism, often with 
most grotesque effect.—Religious Herald.

Dr. Scudder says missions pay finan­
cially, as an old wheel-wright found, 
who gave one dollar to missions in the 
Sandwich Islands, feeling as if he had 
dropped it into the sea, but was amazed 
to receive not long after an order for 
twenty carts at $90 each.

There is a great attempt now-a-days 
to put down plain people with what is 
called “scholarship,” and “the most 
recent research,” and the like, but tin 
who enter upon this sort at work with 
their noses in the air, ought to be very 
careful that they know what they are 
about.—Central Presbgterian.

The Signal says : “In the death of 
Dr. J. ti. Holland temperance has lost 
one of its staunchest supporters. 
Ainoqg all our literary men, not one 
has taken a more decided stand for 
temperance than he. From none has 
the Signal quoted more frequently. 
Some of his temperance utterances have 
become household words throughout the 
nation. ” >*■

M. Renan now thinks Christianity 
really began with Isaiah—in other words, 
that that prophet, seven and a half cen­
turies before Christ, taught that there 
was something beyond the mere forms 
of the old Jewish sacrifices. Renan 
states in his “Marcus Aurelius,” which 

just issued from the press, that he 
now take up the history of the 

Jewish church in an earlier period than 
that of Christ.

Jesus of Nazareth were frequently more 
like those of the docter of a London 
hospital seeing his patient than those of 
an ordinary clergyman.’" Dr. Liddon 
instanced seventeen cases of cures by 
our Lord which might have presented 
themselveé for treatment at a modern 
hospital.

M. Chalamet, the French Under Sec­
retary for Education and Worship, in a 
recent address,commented on the oppo­
sition of the Clericals to the Girls’ Sec­
ondary Education Law. Woman, he 
said, gained a preponderant influence in 
the family and in modem society, and 
she was in many cases governed by the 
Clerical spirit. To extricate her from 
this her education must be altered. 
Girls must be well taught, so that their 
ideas and those of their husbands might 
not conflict.

To a Methodist deputation which re- 
cent’y waited upon the Council of Ed­
ucation, Mr. Mundella, Vice-President, 
said among other things : “ You know 
your own admission with respect to the 
number of children in Standards I. and 
II. over ten years of age in schools. 
Yours are the best schools of the count­
ry, and take the largest grant. But the 
admission is a deplorable one when you 
say that twenty per cept of the child­
ren of ten years of ag® are still in stan­
dards which they ought to have passed 
out of.”

stances. No spirit ration will be allow­
ed to seamen under twenty; and warrant 
officers, men, and boys may receive in 
lieu of spirits cocoa, chocolate, or sugar.

A rise in the price of teapots may be 
now looked for since Mr. Oscar Wilde, 
the æsthete, is actually on tfte eve of 
sailing to this country, and is likely to 
adorn our lecture platforms and to 
breathe his own spirit of devotion to 
lilies and old China into our too sucepti- 
ble population. If Mr. Wilde's appear­
ance in this country is to increase the 
mania for bric-a -brac, to make our recep­
tion rooms and living rooms any more 
like museums than they are now, it will 
certainly be a national calamity. We 
are already in that condition in which 
the Frenchmen described the English as 
being when he said that they did not 
gesture in conversation, because in 
their houses they could not move with­
out breaking something. —Christian 
Union.

ret /®$t missionaries. The young peo­
ple' i aese schools are all well instruct­
ed i k îe Scriptures as well as in secular 
things.

SIERRA LEONE.

I The history of Sierra Leone has been 
one of great interest and Christianity 
has had no more notable triumph in
Africa than it has achieved in this colo- . , , . ,.... 1. T But he was a man who discharged faith-ny. A hundred years ago Sierra Leone , j • ,
was a great slave depot. Slaves were

dismissed from his office. Monod, 
notwithstanding, preached his sermon, 
and the authorities made their com­
plaint. The prefect demanded the two 
sermons of the accused, and Monod 
sent them to him. The prefect was a 
Catholic codnt—Count de Gasparin. 
He came home at evening to his wife 
and found the sermons. He never liked 
sermons, especially evangelical sermons.

is iu 
will

The Evangelical Protestant Union is 
an association of English Evangelicals, 
whose purpose it is to oppose all ten 
dencies to deprive the Church of its 
Protestant name and character. It has 
just held its third annual meeting. One 
of the speakers warned the Union of 
the danger of replacing the black gown 
with the surplice. The change invari­
ably prepared the way for the introduc­
tion of Ritualism.

Among the speakers at the late annu­
al Conference of the Dakota Indian 
Congregational churches was a chief 
■named Gray Cloud. He was sentenced 
to be hanged for his part in the out­
break of 1862, but was pardoned by 
President Lincoln, and is now one of 
the most active Christian ministers in 
that region. These churches have a 
membership of 800, with 10 pastors. 
Their contributions average nearly a 
■dollar a month from each individual.

While it concedes that a mischievous 
boy can exasperate a teacher beyond en­
durance, The Rochester Herald persists 
in opposing corporal punishment.
“ Every person,” it justly says, “ upon 
adopting a profession, assumes all of 
the annoyances and hardships belong­
ing to its highest and wisest practice. ” 
Therefore, a teacher must be prepared 
to accept the trouble of governing 
Properly without the whip.—N. Y. 
Tribune.

When a brother writes that he can’t 
7 but a fraition of the subscription to 

Church paper the coming year, we 
usually send his letter to liia pastor. 
And when the answer comes : “ Broth - 
er Skinflint is a prosperous Inan ; got 
®°ney at interest ; owes nothing,” we 
tiways continue the paper, even at a 
nominal price, and so help to give the 
devil a tussel for old Skinflint's miserly 
•oui. We hate to be beaten by Satan.

Ri hnond Adv,
. Canon Liddon’s words in St. Paul’s 
m connection with the late Intemation-

Medical Congress, were admirably 
“The labors,” he said, “ e»

Mrs. Woods, wife of the Rev. J. L. 
Woods, of Passage West, has been do­
ing a graceful act of kindness in a quiet 
and unostentatious fashion to many 
Irish Methodist ministers. She has 
presented most of them with some 
valuable works, the selection of which 
she offered to them from a lengthy and 
attractive list, out of which three were 
to be selected. Such works as Geikie’s 
“ life of Christ, ” “ Hours with the 
Bible,” Cremer’s “ Biblico-Theological 
Lexicon, ” and Pope’s “ Compendium 
of Theology,” were amongst the num-

- ” * - - "M. ■ -
Do the Welsh appreciate education t

Yes, they do. Take an instance. Two 
poor boys in the county of Carnarvon, 
who had to werk at the quarry for their 
living at an early age, agreed one even­
ing that they would both become grad­
uates and professors. They used to sit 
up late at night for years, and half- 
starved themselves to buy books, and 
they, after long years of patient labour 
and suffering, have now attained their 
object. One is a professor at a Scotch 
college, and the other a graduate and 
prizeman of Cambridge. — London 
Methodist.

Dr. Prime of the New York Observer 
gives this prime ministerial qualification: 
—“ I was visiting a great planter in 
Kentucky, near Lexington, while at­
tending the Presbyterian Assembly. 
He wanted me to see a couple of colts 
six weeks old, and when they were 
brought out I said, “ Morgan colts. ” i 
“ Why, ” he exclaimed, “ do you } 
know a Morgan colt when you see it ?”
“ Certainly, ” said I, “or an Eclipse 
colt.” “Well done,” said he, “ I never 
saw a minister that knew a Morgan 
horse, or any other at sight. Why, sir, 
you can have a call to any church in 
Kentucky !” *

Counsel with Rome has never brought

f rofit to England in dealing with its 
rish difficulties. The priesthood in 

that country are welcome to either horn 
of the dilemma. Either they could 
have pacified Ireland or they could not. 
If they could, but would not, then they 
are utterly unworthy of our trust, either 
as ministers of religion or as subjects of 
the Crown. If they would, but could 
not, then they are as well able to deal 
with the difficulty now as they would 
be if by some treaty, secret or open, 
they were handed over to the power of 
the Bishop of Rome.—Methodist Recor­
der.

If the younger men of Methodism, 
working in the village Sunday-schools 
and societies of all branches of Metho­
dism, will only inquire for themselves 
who Wesley was, how his character was 
formed, what were the features of the 
age in which he lived, how the move­
ment associated with his name developed 
and grew, how he was led to make pro­
vision for its independent self-govern­
ing, self-extending influence in the 
United States of America, and its per­
manent self-governed life in our own 
land, we are sure they will be strong 
and of good courage, and be bold to sus­
tain the old banner to new victories.— 
Loudon Methodist.

By a fleet circular recently issued the 
English Admiralty have cancelled the 
existing regulations relating to the spirit 
ration in the navy. The issue of that 
ration is discontinued to all officers ex­
cept warrant officers, a sum equivalent 
to the saving effected being paid into 
the mess funds. On special occasions 
and under careful report a spirit ration 
may be issued to officers detached on 
particular service, if the mess stores are 
not available; but spirits will be ' 
on payment under no other

MISSION WORK.

Bishop Bowman, now visiting the 
missions of the Methodist Episcopal 
Church in China and Japan, describes 
the way in which the messengers of the 
churches prosecute their work in a 
Chinese city :

At Peking we have two street chapels 
and one domestic chapel, as they call it. 
The street chapels are located in the 
business part of the city, one in the 
Tartar and one in the Chinese city. In 
these, public services are held nearly 
every day during the week, and contin­
uing several hours each day. Usually 
the little chapels are filled with hearers. 
These stay sometimes long enough to 
hear one sermon or address. More fre­
quently, however, they stop for a few 
minutes and then pass on, while others 
take their ptocee. Occasionally two or 
or three will tarry for private conversa­
tion. In this way, in the course of a 
year, many persons hear something of 
the gospel. A few get to be quite reg­
ular hearers, and in the end become 
Christians. The immediate results, how­
ever, of this branch of the work have 
not been so gratifying as would at first 
be supposed, and as is always desired. 
After careful inquiry among our own 
missionaries, and others, I could not 

! hear of many in the city who had been 
converted through the chapel service. 
But in many cases the opening of work 
out through the country could be traced 
to the preaching in these street chapels. 
Strangers coming to the capital on busi­
ness or pleasure have dropped into the 

i chapels and they have carried home with 
; them some of the new and strange 
truths, thought and talked about them 
until they and others became interested 
to know more of this religion. Then 
have followed calls for the missionary, 
and in the end the establishing of the 
church in a new place. Several very 
interesting cases of this kind have oc­
curred in Peking. On Sabbath these 
chapels are used more particularly for 
the native members and the Sunday 
school. This “domestic chapel” is lo­
cated on the grounds where the foreign 
missionaries live, and where the schools 
are situated, and is used as our churches 
are at home. Here the prayer-meeting, 
class-meeting, Sunday-school, and pub­
lic services are held for the missionaries' 
families, and for the native members in 
the schools and living in the neighbor­
hood. Of course this was the centre of 
interest during conference week, and 
the services in connection with the «in­
ference were exceedingly pleasant.

At Peking we have a boarding-school 
for girls, second to none in the city. It 
is under the supervision of Miss Cush­
man, assisted by Miss Sears. It has 
forty young girls in attendance, gather­
ed in from different parts of the

the circulating medium, and it was at 
the peril of his life that a white man 
landed among the savages, who commit­
ted Most horrid acts, destroying crews 
and plundering cargoes and doing 
Satiefs work generally. The nucleus 
of the present colony was formed by a 
free settlement of Negroes, who seemed 
to have no home or vocation in England. 
Early in the present century the Church 
Society began to send out missionaries 
for the benefit of the colonists and the 
sureeunding heathen. In 1808 Sierra 
Leoee became a crown colony and was 
made» settlement for released slaves. 
Thé present population, therefore, is of 
a singularly mixed character, embracing 
natives of all parts of Africa. It is 
said that sixty languages are spoken in 
thq streets of Freetown, but the various 
tribes have become so thoroughly fused 
that the general harmony is scarcely or 
never broken by tribal riots, which were 
frequent enough sonu years ago. The 
missionaries, chiefly representing the 
Church and Wesleyan societies, had, as. 
may be imagined, a wonderfully difficult 
field. The climate was of the most 
deadly character, ÿhè rainfall is no 

160 inches a year, or more than 
•"wot a month, and the dampness, 
combined with the intense heat and 
noxious exhalations, were terribly des­
tructive of life. Of eighty seven mis­
sionaries and catechists sent out by the 
Church Society in forty years, thirty- 
five died and the Wesley,ins also suffer­
ed terribly, but a wonderful work has 
been wrought. According to the gov­
ernment census of April of last year, 
there are 18,860 members of the Church 
of England ; 17,090 Methodists,"exclu­
sive of 2717 in Lady Huntingdon’s Con­
nection ; and 400 Baptists. There are 
but very few white men in the colony f 
which, with its dependencies, has a 
total population of upwards of 60,000, 
of whom 35,430 are classified as “ Lib­
erated Africans or their descendants.” 
These Christian communities are very 
largely self-supporting. The native 
Christians connected with the Church 
Society maintain an independent organ­
ization, which is doing some missionary 
work and receives only a few hundred 
dollars from the parent society. The 
commissioner of the census says : “It 
would be difficult to point to a town or 
country which contains so many chur­
ches, chapels, preaching places, or meet­
ing houses as Sierra Leone, and Free­
town in particular. ” In the colony and 
its dependencies the pagan population, 
including Timmanees, Mandingoes, 
Foulahs. Soosoos, Mendia, and Kroomen 
numbers about 16,000. The travel from 
interior countries to Freetown is very 
laige and the trade quite extensive, so 
that good opportunities are furnished of 
reaching the heathen tribes surround­
ing the colony.—N. Y. Independent.

fully the duties of his office. It was 
necessary that the sermons should be 
read. He came to his wife with the 
manuscripts in his hand, complaining curved spine and trembling limbs, lean-

leaf, ' and is shrivelled and dessicated 
by the cold blast of years, you begin to 
see its real hatefulness. The Devil's 
young people are often attractive : his 
old folks are miserable hags, their in­
ward devilishness beginning to show 
itself by many infallible signs. Tho 
natural spirits flag ; the vigor of health 
yields ; outward supports give way, and 
a man is more and more obliged to fall 
back on himself and God. Hoar-headed 
sin finds itself without supports in vir­
tue or in God. You have never reall 
known sin till you have seen it with. V

CONVERSION OF COUNT GAS­
PARIN.

Adolph Monod, one of the most gift­
ed and faithful evangelical ministers of 
the present century, preached Christ 
crucified and his free grace, te his church 
in Lyons, France. One Lord’s day,

that he would have to give up the whole 
evering to this irksome and protracted 
labor. She offered, as her husband's 
worthy helpmeet, to read the sermons 
with him, «ÿ> that the task might seem 

, to him less tedious. They began. They 
read the first. With every page they 

! grew more interested. They forgot 
that it was evening and night. That 
which was at first an official duty, be­
came a service of the heart. They 
finished the first, and eagerly grasped 
the second. And what was the result ? 
As a magistrate—as a prefect—Gasparin 
was forced to deprive Monod of his 
place, because all the authorities de­
manded it. But he and his wife became 
evangelical Christiana—yea, living, joy­
ful and happy believers in Christ. They 
found that night “ the pearl of great 
price, ” and it has remained in the 
family. Their son, Count Agenor de 
Gasparin, has long been the head and 
pillar of the evangelical party in France 
—Moravian,

THE TRUE REVIVAL POWER.

The Holy Spirit is, indeed, a unifor- 
831 presence. So is electricity. Yet it 
» nnfelt. It is not manifest. But 
bring the surcharged cloud into con­

i' tact with a suitable conductor, and 
then the vivid fl.vdi of sheeted fire and 

i the deep roar of heaven’s artillery will 
i symbolize the omnipotence of the Divine 
j Presence. The wandering disciple in- 
I quired of the Saviour, “ How is it that 
thou wilt manifest thyself unto us, and 
not unto the world?” He knew thn^ 
God was present—every where present

■ —but the mysterious manifestation, 
such as the world could not comprehend

( perplexed and puzzled him. But on
■ the day of Pentecost, when the holy 
fire not only tipped his brow and touch­
ed his tongue, but filled Ms heart, the 
mystery was solved. That same revela­
tion may come to our hearts, if we only 
have faith to believe in God. Faith is 
the conductor that reaches up to the 
clouds, surcharged with divine mercy. 
Along its wires there comes, streaming 
down into the believing heart, wave 
after wave of the Divine manifestation, 
filling the soul with unspeakable joy. 
Along its wires there comes, streaming 
down into the believing Church, flood 
after flood of revival power, quickening 
all its energies, causing it to glow with 
the Divine Presence, and making it 
victorious in pushing forward the con­
quests of Christ over the souls of men.
—Bishop D. W. Clark.

ing upon a staff, the eye grown din», 
the face furrowed, the voice faint and 
husky. Decrepit sin is horrible. In the. 
very period when help is most needed, 
it finds its supports cut away and all ita 
vain hopes collapse and vanish like 
“the unsubstantial fabric of a dream.” 
The sin that was so full of promise re­
turns to plague the sinner. Truthfully 
has one said, “ The devil has no hap­
py old men."—N. E. Methixiist.

NEVER WASTED.
No true work since the world began 

was ever wasted ; no true life since the 
world began has ever failed. Oh ! un­
derstand tLose two perverted words, 
and measv.re them by the eternal, not 
by the "earthly standard. What the 
world bas regarded as the bittereet fail­
ure often been in the eight of heav­
en the moat magnificent success. When 
the. cap, painted with devils, was placed 

the bruV pf John Huas, and he sank 
dying amid the embers of the flame— 
was that a failure ? When Francis Xav­
ier died, cold and lonely on the bleak 
and desolateYbore «r à heathen land- ~ 
was that a failure ? When the frail, 
worn body of the Apostle of the Gen­
tiles was dragged by a hook from the 
arena, and the white sand scattered over 

I the crimson life-blood of the victim 
^om the dense amphitheatre despised
as Some obscure and P.’ameless Jew— was 
that a failure ?

A hit when, after thirty obscure, toil­
some, unrecorded years in the shop of 

i the village carpenter, One came forth 
ho be pre-eminently the man of sorrows, 
to w ander from cily to city in homeless 
labors, an<1 to expire in lonely agony 
upon tin’’ ahameful cross—was that a 
failure ? |Nay, my brethren, it was the 
death of Hire ’ wlm tived that we might 
follow His foots teP»—k waa tho ,ife> il 
was the death of .the Son of Ood.—
W. Farrar.

HOAR HEADED SIN.

two provinces, most of whom are from preaching from the text, “ God so loved
Christian families and are themselves 
members of the church. Some of these 
gir^s are earnestly preparing themselves 
for work, either as wives of some of the 
native assistants, or as teachers, or Bible 
readers and laborers among the women. 
We have also at Peking a small day- 
school for boys, and a boarding and 
training school for boys. In the latter 
are several promising young men who 
are preparing themselves to go out as 
teachers and preachers. They are un­
der the care of Bro. Lowry, assisted by 
such of the ladies of the mission ss have 
time to do some work, and by the other

You never know sin until you know 
its end. In earlier stages it makes a fair 
show, lives easily, often elegantly, and 
is full of large promises for the future. 
Its devotee is not in trouble as other 
men ; the world smiles on him, good 
fortune attends his steps and one is al­
most led to doubt whether God has not 
forgotten his own and gone over to the 
side of wrong. David, when harried 
and driven into corners by his enemies, 
saw him, flourishing in abundance, far-

the world, that he gave his only-begotten ing sumptuously every day, hale, full of 
Son that whosoever believeth on him 
should not perish, but have everlasting 
life, he spoke of the person of Christ 
as the true God-man. He announced, 
at the same time, that the next Sabbath 
he should show how men could be saved 
by faith in this God-man. But the 
authorities of this church were full of 
Catholic and other errors, and opposed 
to a doctrine so truly evangelical.
Hence they informed Monod that if he 
did not omit the sermon he had an­
nounced, they would have him arrested 
and brought before the prefect, and

life and vigor, gleeful, his eyes standing 
out with fatness. It was a trying spec­
tacle ; his foot well nigh slipped, as has 
that of many another man since.

But stop : God has not abdicated, jus­
tice has not left the throne, sin is not to 
be victor. You have seen only the be­
ginning, the

CARELESS LIll™'

I am afraid that the great ma, or*ty of 
men allow their lives, as they do tlu’ir 
beliefs, to go anyhow. They never foi m 
a distinct opinion as to the shape tht-le 
life is to take, and they have never said 
calmly and strongly to themselves,
“ This is the intention which is to rule 
my life.” They plsy the part of the 
sculptor who has no model and no fixed 
idea. There is the marble, and they 
knock a piece out here and there, but 
no man can predict the final result. 
Eating and drinking, working and play­
ing, are the distracted existence so many 
of us are living. What shall we be to­
morrow ? We really cannot tell. It 
will depend upon the people we meet, 
the things that are said to us. We have 
no real rule. If we are tempted to do 
wrong, it ie possible, it is even probable, 
that we may do it, unless it is some very 
bad thing quite out of our way. It is 
not impossible we may say that which 
is untrue ; that for our own gain we 
may deceive this person, and attack 
with anger that. If opportunity befalls 
us, we mayyield to intemperance,or lake 
the dark road of impurity. We may be 
good-natured, or fly off into fiery jus­
sion. We may help some one who in in 
trouble, or strike a blow by word or act 
at a rival or an enemy. We do not 
know what we shall do, because we hare 
no plan, no decision. Instead of our
lives being like some well-ordered state, 

bright side. You have ( they are more like mob-anarc’ y, 'wist- 
in its youth and vigor, ed and whirled by the last breath andonly seen sin

clothed in purple and fine linen. The and the last appeal—a shapeless jumble 
fair appearance is all outside, a sem- of gix>d, bad and indifferent. Is not 
blance, a vain show. That youth is des- this a disgraceful state of things, which 
tined to fade and pass away. And when ought to make sensible men hang down 
sin goes down into “the sere, yellow their heads with shame !—Page Robe ils.
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OUR HOME CIRCLE. ^

AT THE DOOR OF THE TEAR. 
The corridors of Tisse

Are foil of doors—the portals of closed yeors ,w! enter them no moreftboogh bitter tears 
Beat herd against them, and we Wr t'V 
Of lost dreams, d.rge-hke, in behind tbs » 

At Memory's opening.

But one door stands ajar—
The New Year's ; while a *old%u‘X». . '
Holds it half-shut. Thees^rfootd.U)*
Th*t nrMiM to it* threshold • mighty oar »

h°p*. ^«rAround it wait and crowd.

It shuts back the unknown,
And dare w.
rromidkmm.’uf.w^ng brises blown ? 
We whose large aspirations limmed and shrank We whose i-rge^ ^ icrcll wl, Uauk.

We pause beside the door.
Thr rear, O God, how shall we enter in ?
How shall we thence Thy hidden treasures win . 
Shall we return in beggary, as before,
W hen Thou art nearat hand,with infinite wealtn, 

Wisdom, and heavy health ?

The footsteps of a child
Sound close beside us. Listen ! He will sneak. 
His birthday belle hare hardly rung a week, 
Yet has He trod the world’s press undefiled. 
-Come with Me!” hear Him through His smil­

ing say, „
“Behold, I am the way !

Against the door His face 
Shines as the sun. Hie touch is a command ; 
The years unfold before hie baby baud .
The beauty of His presence fills all space,
•• Enter through Me,” He saith, “ nor wander

more ; , , „
For lo! I am the door.

And all doors openeth He,
The New-born Christ, the Lord of the New Year, 
The threshold of our locked hearts atandethnear ; 
And while He gives us back love’s rusted Key, 
Our future on us with His eyes has smiled, 

Even as a little child.

THE HIDDEN CLOCK.
FOB T1IK NEW YEAR.

One lovely summer evening I 
was walking with a friend down a 
quiet street, when our attention was 
arrested by what we thought a cu­
rious sight. The day bad been 
very hot, and most of the houses 
that wo passed had the windows 
wide open to admit the air, which 
was now beginning to be pleasantly 
cool. In one house the lower sash 
was thrown up, and, as we walked 
by, we could see the pendulum of a 
clock that was on the wall, but the 
blind drawn over the upper part of 
the window hid the face from our 
sight.

‘‘How singular that pendulum 
looks!” I said; “it is swinging 
away as if it were all alone, and 
were just going backwards and for­
wards to amuse itself.”

“ Yes,” said my friend ; “ it is 
strange to watch that moving thing 
without seeing the other part of the 
clock. Do you know what it makes 
me think of ?”

“ Of what ?” I asked.
“ Well,” said my companion, 

“ somehow that pendulum, which 
wo see while the clock is hidden, 
seems very much like our life on 
earth : slowly, regularly passing 
from us a day at a time. Each day 
seems like one tick of the clock, 
and ecch New Year like the strik 
ing of another hour. Now, as I 
look at that pendulum, there are 
some things that I know about the 
clock, and others that I cannot tell. 
I know there is a clock on the wall, 
and that, at some time, it has been 
set going, and that at another de­
finite period it will stop. I know 
too that the clock did not set itself 
going, and without its permission 
every hour brings it nearer to the 
point when the weights will run 
down, and it caçnot help stopping. 
But I cannot say how many times 
it has yet to tick. It may bo that 
for several hours longer the pendu­
lum will swing backwards and for­
wards, or, perhaps, the weights are 
nearly run down, and it has only a 
few move minutes to remain in mo­
tion.

“ And I know just about as much 
and as little a» to the duration of my 
own life. I was “ set going," so to 
speak, without any consent or con­
trol of my own ; I shall not be asked 
when I have had enough of life. 
We talk about time passing more 
swiftly as we grow older, and so it 
seems to do, though, in many cases 
the longer people live the harder it 
is for them to realize that they are 
coming nearer to the point when 
time shall be no longer. Yet we 
cannot really lessen the speed, or 
arrest the flight of our days. Some­
times we wish very much that they 
would pass quickly. Look at that 
sailor-boy, who is coming home 
from his first voyage. He hopes in 
a few days to be in port, and soon to 
meet his friends. How he wishes 
that the vessel would sail more 
swiftly, and the days fly more quick­
ly, till he reaches his home! But 
“ time and tide” do not hasten, 
more than they wait for any one. 
Look at him again after a few 
weeks are over, and his holiday on 
shore is nearly spent. In a few 
days he must join his ship; he 
would give a good deal now to keep 
back the days from rushing on at 
such a rate ; but he is just as un­
able to stop them now as he was to 
quicken their speed when ho long­
ed for the day to conic that he 
should be free.

“ Is there not something very 
solemn in the thought of the days 
that come and go so swiftly and si- , 
lently without asking our leave, 
and all the more so because such 
tremendous consequences depend 
upon the manner in which we em­
ploy them ?”

The pendulum has ticked away 
many hours and days since that 
summer evening. The clock may 
be worn out now ; but the lesson ot 
that hidden clock has not been for­
gotten by either of us. Tbe great 
clock of Time is nearer run down 
than it was then.

It is about to strike the hour for 
the beginning ot another year ; and 
I should like to ask you, my friend, 
just to slop and think what you are 
doing with your days—those little 
portions of time that are given us 
so regularly, and seem to slip from 
us almost before we can call them 
our own. Have you ever consider­
ed what is the best investment for 
them?

Do you say?—“ I am much too 
busy to trouble about such things. 
I get up long before it is light ; I 
work like a horse in a mill all day 
long ; then in the evening I am too 
tired to do anything, and go to bed 
with a splitting headache, which 
won’t let a man think if he wants 
to, which I don’t. We must get 
through life somehow# and then 
there’s an end of it. And as to 
what's to come after, it’s no use to 
trouble about it ; I shall get on as 
well as most people.”

Talk like that is often heard, but 
there are times when one is almost 
forced to think whether one will or 
no ; and we are come to such a 
time just now. You don’t notice the 
clock as it ticks quietly on, but 
when it strikes then you can’t help 
looking up and noticing what hour 
it has reached. And so the days of 
tbe year have passed quickly away. 
Perhaps one has been so much like 
another that yon have not noticed 
their rapid flight ; but now at the 
commencement of a New Year, the 
most careless of us feel serious. 1 
don’t know where the last night of 
the Old Year finds you—not asleep 
I dare say; for somehow, few of 
us feel inclined to go early to bed 
on this particular night. Perhaps 
sitting at home by the fire ; or it 
may be di inking the Old Year out 
and tbe New One in ; or it is possi­
ble that just for a change you may 
have sauntered into the House of 
God, as many do on the last night 
of the year, as if to compound with 
God for all the other nights on sin 
bestowed. Just as some people 
think that, even if they spend all 
their lives in sin, it will bo right at 
last if they can only get a minister, 
or some good person to come and 
pray by their death-bed. But wher­
ever you are, 1 know you have been 
thinking—not very seriously per­
haps, but you have sent some stray 
thoughts back over the past, and 
forward to meet the future ; and we 
want you, just now, to ask yourself, 
“ Why was this life given me ? and 
how am I using it ?”

One bright New Year’s morning 
a young lady paused in her country 
walk and entered a cottage where 
a good old woman lived. “ A Hap­
py New Year to you, Mrs.----- 1”
was her cheery greeting. “ The 
same to you,” was the hearty re­
sponse ; “ and I would like to say, 
Spend it to the Lord.” This was 
quite anew idea to the young lady ; 
the words kept coming up in her 
mind, till she began to wish to sharp 
the life that her poor old friend enjoy­
ed ; n life that could not be useless, 
because it was given to One who 
employ's the least and the weakest ; 
and better still, she sought till she 
found the way to live that life. What 
is the way ? Do you really wish to 
know ? Then wake up, and be in 
earnest, and come very humbly to 
God, asking him to help you. Ask 
Him, too, to forgive you for all the 
years you have squandered in idle­
ness, or spent in open rebellion 
against Him, and for Chiist's sake 
to receive you, and *‘ create in” you 
a ‘‘clean heart.” Then, if you thus 
put God in the centre of your life, so 
that His glory is the mainspring of 
your actions, you will not feel un. 
easy about the flight of time ; for—
“ It matter» little et wlist bout of the day 

the righteous fall atleep.
Death cannot come to him untimely who is fit 

to die.”

THEY WOULD NOT SAVE 
HIM.

The Hon. W. E. Dodge, in an 
address before a meeting of the 
Evangelical Alliance held recently 
in Liverpool, England, said :— My 
summer residence is on our beauti­
ful Hudson River, lined for fifty 
miles from our city by the most 
noble dwellings ot our wealthy 
citizens. In one of these elegant 
mansions was tbe home ot one of 
our principal lawyers in New York. 
His wife was a lovely, highly edu­
cated lady, but for a number of 
years there was this dark cloud of

intemperance hanging over that 
residence. There was scarcely 
anyone seen about the dwelling 
during the summer; but one day 
the wife came to my door and asked 
to see me privately. She then 
opened her heart to me (1 had cot 
time to go into the whole of it), to 
the effect that her husband had 
periodical fits, during which he ]eft 
his home and business in New 
York, and spent two or three weeks 
in a state of constant beastly drunk­
enness, till she bei self had given up 
all society. She saw that he was 
going down step by step, and could 
not live long, and she begJSd that 
I would come and speak to him, 
and see if something could not be 
done to save him. I knewjthat he 
was a proud, high-spirit® man, 
and asked God to help me. I went 
to him, and as kindly as I knew 
how I opened tbe whole case to him, 
and set before him the dangers that 
were impending, and what must 
inevitably be the consequence unless 
he changed. The result was a 
solemn promise on bis part that he 
would abstain entirely, and that be 
would unite with our national tem-

ferance society. Two days after 
is father, one of the most eminent 

lawyers in America, and his broth­
er, whose name is a household word 
not only in America but over Eng­
land, came into my private office, 
and with tears in their eyes took 
my hand and thanked me for what 
I had done for the brother and eon. 
I said, “ He has promised the day 
after to-morrow to meet me by ap­
pointment at our National Tempe­
rance Society Office and sign the 
pledge. I want you to come with 
him, and they thanked me and 
promised to come. The morning 
arrived, and they came into one 
of our private rooms, and the father 
again repeated his grateful acknow­
ledgments for what I had done. I 
turned to him and said, “This is a 
very solemn hour. It is the turn­
ing point in your son’s life. He 
has come here to sign the total ab­
stinence pledge, and I want you— 
the father—and you—the brother 
—to sign the pledge with him.” 
This tall, aged man, raised himself 
to his full height and said, “I do 
not think, Mr. Dodge, that is neces­
sary. I do not think there is any 
necessity for that at all.” Tha 
brother said the same. I took them 
aside and said, “ I did have hope of 
saving this brother and son, but 
unless you are willing to malço the 
sacrifice yourselves and join 'with 
him I shall have but little hope 
of success.” They declined. I took 
up the pledge and read it, and the 
brother whom I wished to reform 
said, “ I can’t sign that Mr, Dodge. 
I àm willing to sign a pledge that 
I will never touch another drop of 
intoxicating drink myself, but I 
can’t say I will remove it from my 
table. I have friends—my brother, 
and lather, and others—and I don’t 
want to deprive them of their pri 
vilege for my sako.” I said, “My 
friend, after fifty years’ experience 
I tell you your only hope is in ba­
nishing it from your house for ever.” 
The result was ho signed a com­
promise pledge. I wont home and 
said to my wife, “ That poor man 
is gone. I thought he was saved, 
but he is gone. Neither the father 
nor the brother is prepared to make 
any sacrifice for him, and he does 
not understand the philosophy of 
the matter sufficiently to say that 
he will banish it from his own 
table.” The result was that some 
six months after, as we attended a 
great entertainment at the house of 
the brother, I saw this same young 
man bring to that wife who came 
to my house the glass of wine, and 
she took it in her hand. As 1 pass­
ed she said, “ See that, Mr. Dodge.” 
“ Yes, I see it.” In less than tbi‘ee 
months from that day that poor 
man died of delirium tremens.— 
AUiane News.

OLD STYLE—NEW STYLE.
The exact length of a year ie 

365^ days, lacking about 11 minutes. 
In correcting the calendar, nearly 
two thousand years ago, Julius 
Cœsar reckoned it at exactly 365 
days, and made every fourth year 
consist of 366 days. This is an ex­
cess of 45 minutes in four years ; 
and this error being discovered, 
Pope Gregory XlII. ordained 
another correction to take place in 
1582. He ordered that the dates 
should be altered so that the fixed 
feasts of the church should take the 
dates they would have had if there 
had been no error from the time of 
the Council of Niccea, a. d. 1325. 
The error amounted to ten days, so 
Christmas day, 1582, was célébrât- 
ed on tbe 15th of December, but it 
was called as before, the 25th, i. e., 
ten days were omitted. England 
did not adopt this change until 
1752 ; it was ordered that the third 
day of February should be called 
the fou teenth, thus omitting eleven 
days. Washington was born Feb. 
11, 1732, U. S. ; to adjust it to new 
style, his birthday is put on the

22nd, for the day that would have 
been’ the 11th of February would 
that year and thereatter be called
the 22nd. .

Another change was also made in 
Britain and other colonies with the 
new style. The beginning of the 
year was changed from the 25th of 
March to the first of January, so 
that 1751 lost its January, February 
and 24 days ot March, and they 
were counted as the first part of the 
year 1752, new style, or the last 
part of 1751, old style, and so with 
any date previous to March 25th, if 
given in new style and old style, the 
year will differ.

Russia has not yet made the 
change, and now the error is 1-- 
days, so that they in Russia cele­
brate Christmas 12 days after the 
other European countries.

THE OLDEST CITY IN THE 
WORLD.

Damascus is the oldest city in 
the world. Tyre and Sidon have 
crumbled on the shore. Baal bee is 
a rum ; Palmyra is buried in a 
desert: Nineveh and Babylon have 
disappeared from the Tigris and 
the Euphrates. Damascus remains 
what it was before the days of 
Abraham—a centre of trade and 
travêl—an isle of verdure in the 
midst of an oasis ; “ a presidential 
capital,” with martial and sacred 
associations extending through 
thirty centuries. It was near 
Damascus that Saul of Tarsus saw 
the brightness of the sun ; the street 
which is called Strait, in which it 
is said “ he prayed, ” still runs 
through the city. The caravan 
comes and goes as it did one thou­
sand years ago ; there are still the 
sheik, the ass, and the water-wheel: 
the merchants of the Euphrates and 
Mediterranean still occupy the 
streets “with the multitudes of their 
wares.” The city which Moham­
med surveyed from a neighboring 
height, and was afraid to enter “be­
cause it was given to have but one 
paradise, and for bis part be was 
resolved not to have it in this world, 
is to-day what Julian calls “ Eye of 
tbe East,” as it was in the time of 
Isaiah, “ The Head of Syria. ” 
From Damascus came the damson, 
our blue plum, and the delicious 
apricot of Portugal called damasco; 
damask, our beautiful fabric of cot­
ton and silk, with vines and flowers 
raised upon a smooth, bright ground 
the damask rose introduced into 
England in the time of Henry VIII.; 
the Damascus blade so famous the 
world over for its keen edge and 
wonderful elasticity, the secret of 
whose manufacture was lost when 
Tamerlane carried tbe artist into 
Persia ; and that beautiful art of 
inlaying wood and steel with gold 
and silver, a kind of mosaic engrav­
ing and sculpture united—called 
damaskeening-—with which boxes, 
bureaus and swords are ornament­
ed. It is still a wity of flowers and 
bright waters ; tbe streams of 
Lebanon and the “ silk of gold 
murmur and sparkle in the wilder­
ness of the Syrian gardens.

AS A SCHOOLMASTER.
The experience of tbe late Dr. J. 

G. Holland as superintendent of 
schools at Vicksburg is thus re­
counted by Edward Egglestou 
in the December Century -.—

“At the end of tbe tedious river 
voyage, he found that the public 
schools which he had been called to 
superintend had not yet been organ­
ized, and that, beyond a department 
for girls, they had no existence. 
Dr. Holland was warned that dis­
cipline was out of the question— 
that, if he exacted obedience, he 
would be put out by the larger toys. 
There ensued a stern fight for su­
premacy between him and bis re­
bellious pupils, in which bis quick 
decision of character gave him the 
mastery. Even at a later day than 
this, such a thing us the shooting 
of a schoolmaster for whipping a 
boy was not unknown in the South­
west, and it is a wonder that Dr. 
Holland escaped violence. Nothing 
but his superior quickness and un­
faltering courage saved him. Once, 
the larger boys resolved on revenge. 
One who bad suffered a sharp pun­
ishment at his hands provided him­
self with a club, and, backed by a 
crowd of burly, overgrown school­
fellows, waited to attack the teach­
er on his way to the post-office. 
Seeing the crowd, and knowing its 
meaning, Doctor Holland fixed his 
steady dark eyes on tbe one who 
held the club, clenched his fists, and 
walked straight through the very 
midst of the «roup, which melted 
slowly away at the approach of the 
terrible master. When the rebels 
bad dispersed, the teacher found the 
prints of his nails in tbe palms of 
his hands. Though he staid in 
Vicksburg but fifteen months, ho 
wrought a revolution in its educa­
tional system. In less than a year 
from his com ng, the private schools 
were all given up, except one which 
derived its support from out-of- 
town pupils. i'he schools were

graded, and were taught in one 
building under his supervision.

THE REMEDY.
The Rev. Dr. Howard Crosby 

gives, in the Sunday Afternoon, ad­
vice to mothers about the training 
of their daughters. He says that 
the idea of use 1 essuess as a fashion­
able necessity for a young woman is 
wrong. “The boys, after leaving 

' school or college, saturaily gravi­
tate to commerce, law, medicine, 
science or divinity ; but the girls 
at a like period begin to play the 
fine lady, spending their days in 
petty idleness. The only question 
that seems to be asked is, “ How 
can I best amuse myself?” Dr. 
Crosby’s remedy for this evil is 
regular daily tasks for girls, either 

| of household or charitable work, or 
of self-improvement. Ho thinks 
that young women trained in that 
way are more likely to get good 
husbands than those who devote 
themselves to folly. He adds :

“Perhaps you have a notion that 
if your daughter is out of ‘society’ 
she might as well be in Sahara or 
Kamschatka, and you have brought 
yourself to believe that the only 
‘society’ on earth is that which is 
distinguished by white kid gloves 
and ‘germans.’ Did you ever sober­
ly think of the possibility of life 
outside of the charmed circle? It 
is humbly believed by some that 
men and women, both old and young 
who have had brains and hearts, 
have managed to enjoy life without 
initiation into the mysteries of fash­
ion. Some have dared to think 
that true refinement is best culti vat- 
ed in a less artificial atmosphere. ”

THE TEAR HAS GONE.

The year
Hae gone, and with it many a glorious throng 
Of happy dreams. Its mark is on each brow, 
Ite rhadows in each heart. In its swift coarse 
It wared its scepter o’er the beautiful,
And they are not. It laid its pallid baud 
Upsn the atioog man, and the haughty foraa 
Is fallen, and the flashing eye is dim.
It trod the hall of revelry, where thronged 
The bright and. joyous, and the tearful wail 
Of stricken one* is heard where erst the song 
And reckless shout resounded. It passed o’er 
The battle-plain where sword sud spear and 

shield
Flashed in the light of midday, and the strength 
Of serried hosts i* shivered, and the grass 
Green from tbe soil of carnage, waves above 
The crushed and moldering skeleton. It earns 
And faded like a wi eatb of mist at eve ;
Yet ere it melted in the viewless air 
It heralded its millions to their home 
In the dim lano of dreams.

George I), Prentice.

OUR YOUNG FOLKS.

A STRANGE NEW YEAR'S 
DAY.

A strange New Year’s Day, in­
deed, it was for Charlie King. He 
bad never spent one like it before, 
and was sincerely hoping he would 
never spend another like it as long 
as he lived.

This is the way it came about:
Charlie King lived in a pleasant 

country town,not far from tne great
city of P----- . His parents were not
rich, but were in good circumstan­
ces, and Charlie, with his two bro­
thers and a sister, bad a very 
cheery and comfortable home. One 
would think, looking in upon this 
family of a winter’s evening, when 
all were gathered round a table full 
of papers and books, aud bright 
with the light of a studeut-lamp, 
that nothing was wanting to make 
their life delightful. If there was 
anybody in tbe world that ought to 
have been contented, that person 
was Charlie King.

But Charlie was not contented. 
He had somehow got hold of a book 
of adventures on the sea, and his 
imagination had been so inflamed 
by this book, that home seemed dry 
and tame, and he could think of 
nothing with pleasure but the life 
of a sailor. All the books he could 
find in tbe library, or borrow from 
bis friends, which treated of the sea 
he devoured with an ever-growing 
interest. He even dreamed at night 
of the sailor’s life, and in his sleep 
was tilled with longing to taste its 
freedom and joy.

Perhaps if he had spoken to his

fa rents on the subject, they might 
ave consented to his trying ocean 

life for a while, and might have 
secured some pleasant situation for 
him. But he was afraid that they 
would only laugh at him, and so 
determined that he would quietly 
slip off and find a place for himselt. 
One autumn morning he put this 
resolution into effect. The thought 
of the pain he would give his mo­
ther, whom be tenderly loved, had 
long held him back ; but now even 
this was swallowed up, and he 
made his way as quickly as he 
could to the wharves of the great 
city, near by, where he knew a half 
dozen ships*were preparing to sail.

As Providence would have it— 
for God meant to teach this boy a 
needed though hard lesson—Charlie 
found a place on a ship bound for 
the East Indies. Tne night after 
his engagement the ship started on 
her course. Charlie ru.io the next

morning sore from the hard bed o 
which he had slept, and trouble!) 
with remorseful thoughts. Still th 
movement of the ship was so 
sant, and the breeze so fresh, that 
he soon forgot his discomforts and 
began thoroughly to enjoy himself 
But a change soon took pine** 
When the bay was reached, and thé 
deep swell ot the sea caught the 
ship in its arms, and rocked it n„ 
and down, Charlie found himself 
growing deathly sick.

Oh, how sick he was ! For three 
days he could scarcely lift up j. 
head. And how the older sail 
ors made sport of him! The can! 
tain was kind enough, but he had 
employed Charlie to work, and he 
could not allow him to be idle • •* 
sick as he was, he had to do what 
he could. And this made him home­
sick. When faint and leeble he 
crawled to his berth, there was’ no 
gentle mother’s hand to be laid on 
his head, no delicate meala to tempt 
hid appetite. Often in these brst 
days would the poor boy fall 
on his hard bed, weeping over hu 
folly and longing for home.

And so the days went on. Char- 
lie grew stronger and more accoe- 
tomed to the sea. Ho could even 
enjoy standing on the spars ai 
they danced up aud down, and 
could climb to the mast-head ’ with­
out the least dizziness. But he was 
far from happy. The life of a sail- 
or had lost all its romance for him. 
To wash pots and kettles for 
the cook, to make the captain’s 
bed and sweep the decks, and pall 
until his shoulders ached, at ths 
ropep, made up a very different ex- 
perience from what he bad imagin­
ed in his pleasant country home. 
In short, the life of a sailor was 
found by Charlie King to be hard, 
dry and commonplace. If he could 
have had with him some of those 
favorite authors who had tempted 
him to leave friends and homej he 
would have felt inclined to pitch 
them into the sea.

And now at last the New Year’i 
Day had come. In the King house­
hold much had always been «Mt 
of the holidays. There wore Christ­
mas presents for every member of 
the family, and on New Year’s Day 
a grand turkey dinner, with plum- 
pudding for desert. This year there 
were no Christmas presents for 
Charlie, and no New Year’s dinner, 
beyond the pork and hard bread 
which he had to eat every day. And 
then it was not cold weather, each 
as he had always known on New 
Year’s Day. They were now fkrto 
the south, and Charlie found it more 
comfortable to go without shoes, 
and with as little clothing as possi­
ble. How strange it all seemed to 
him ! In the afternoon lie sat down 
and thought of the dear ones far 
away. rretty soon be found that 
the tears would come, and, afraid 
that the sailors would see him, he 
crept up to the main-top. There, 
with his arm around the mast, he 
stood looking longingly toward 
home, and thinking ot the family 
circle gathered there. As he look­
ed it seemed lo him that he could 
almost see them. Then he lifted 
up his heart in prayer. “ O God," 
he said, “ keep my dear father and 
mother, and Joe and Frank and 
Emma. And, oh, do forgive and 
keep me, and bring me safe to 
them once more.”

God heard this prayer. The next 
fall, nearly a year after Charlie had 
run away, the good ship on which 
ho was employed turned in at the 
capes, and went sailing up the riv­
er. The boy could scarcely contain 
himself. At Calcutta he had writ­
ten home to his people, telling them 
all about what ho had done, and im­
ploring their forgiveness. He had 
not heard from them, but he felt 
sure they would receive him back 
again to their hearts. So when the 
vessel ran into its place at the 
wharf, ho scanned with eager inter­
est the faces of the people who 
stood waiting. Nor did he look in 
vain. There, near the laD<**D£ 
place, were his own dear father and 
mother, looking a little older and 
thinner than when he went away, 
but with the light of expectancy 
and hope beaming from their eye*. 
In » moment he had leaped over 
the ship’s rail, and was at their 
side.

“ Mother,” said Charlie, as they 
sat talking,the pext Now Year’s, 1 
was very wrong for me to runaway 
as I did, and 1 was a groat fool wt 
doing so. Yet good has coroeoa 
of the evil. Last New \ ear s Da/j 
far from you, and full of sorrow an 
longing, I offered my first P|,)er 
to God. He showed me my ««JJ 
ness, and then forgave me and h L 

It was a 
in more senses 

then he b«J 
been with me and blessed me. an ( 
have been trying to live for him- 

bov," replied Mr*- 
ways are not 2Vr 

wavs, i.cc a- thank him 
makes even our lollies and --ins 

of bringing us to H,mSC

me with peace. 
Year’s day to me 
than one ; for since

K iti:
My dear

* ( ; i » i -
Let il-

means

13

J ESÜS

l.-I
turning
ing J ,b 
ced H 
tbe ve 
hiui. 
preache 
denoun 
men iut 
hearing 
But th
pardm 
found 
first, US 
rative
18-23.

“ Th
day,” ot 
fully at 
now daj 
God is I 
Mat the 
Jcingdod 
Luke bj 
of the 
course, 
beli> ve 
Iwmi.aij 
dor to i 
wtich 
ished tl 
to tllO 
on his lj 
region 
and vit 
•bore, 
had opt 
citemet 
SOi'lhed 
23-25]. 
tour it 
his test j 
■ion prd 
Luke 4

2.-3
previouJ 
some 
avowed 
having 
siahshif 
and oocf 
to persj 
That caj 
engaf 
men. 
thouji 
ceived 
give up I 
would n< 
—some 
The Ma 
came tol 
gaged a(|

Why 
euch hud 
The que^ 
Wats-in 
fruit of 
tist. 2. 
kuowledj 
power v 
the goe 
be a 
tlety, b 
power o

ht

dev

3.— 
Jesus 
tumty 
to tak 
the ey 
accoui 
place 
at Na 
was te 
ernaui 
presse 
he spe 
du ced 
[Matt, 
ject ns 
tonish 
foundl 
as tin 
•ing au 
no big 
scribe 
the au 
and s 
with 
sense ; 
ritf f 
Testai 
anthoi 
■taten 

-Lord.’ 
to the 
olarat 
and tt
Script 
ily Is 
which 
varie t, 
healed 
thou 
of sn< 
ings 
prove 
eases 
appea 
his oi 
thoril 
The j 
of tea 
ly to
vinitj 
Son t

In 
ed of 
the i 
spoke 
ished 
attenl 
was i 
was tl 
were i 
aoter 
being 
promt 
ity an 
Thou 
title ii 
Dan. I 
as •• t!
-refers

clej

an

ha

art



the hard bed on 
»pt, and troubled 
i«ught*. Still the 
hb,P w»a BO plea.

80 lrc*h, that 
discomforts and 
to enjoy himself 

'0°n took place* 
8 reached, and the 

sea caught the 
and rocked it uD 

10 found himself 
tick.
s was ! For throe
reely lift up his
k the older sail- 

h>m! The can- 
“gh, but he hfi 
to work, and he 
m to be idle ; bo 
« had to do what

THE WESLEYAN,FBIDAY, DECEMBER 30, 1881.

i made h 
nt and 
th, theiv 
ind to be 
i to meals 
i’ten in 
>or boy 
seeping , 
for home, 
i went

lie 
■n the 
and

and
:o

kettles for 
— the captain’s 
» decks, and pull 
rs ached, at the 

different ex- 
had imagin­

ai home- 
leeble, he 

was no 
laid on 
to tempt 

these first 
tall asleep 

r over hi*

on. Char- 
aud more accos-

could even 
i spars as 
down, andu, »nu

mast-head with-
ness.
The

But he was 
life of a sail------— a Ban-

romance for him.

very 
at he
nt country home.
1 f\T O anil/v» __9 Of
King 
lace, 
dm 
rho 
ds

» sailor was 
to be hard, 
If he could 

some of those 
had tempted 

and home, he^ uvuiOj ilO
inclined to pitch

the New Year’s 
n the King house- 
ways been made 
here wore Chris t- 

every member of 
New Year’s Day 

inner, with plum- 
t. This year there 
uas presents for 
ew \ ear’s dinner, 
and hard bread 

it every day. And 
old weather, such 

known on New 
y were now far to 
irlie found it more 
<o without shoes, 
clothing as possi- 
fo it all seemed to 
noon he sat down 
lo dear ones far 
oon he found that 
ome, and, afraid 
>uld see him, he 
ain-top. There, 
ind the mast, he 
ngingly toward 

ug of the family 
ere. As he look- 
m that he could 

Then he lifted 
ayer. “ O God,” 

dear father and 
and Frank and 

, do forgive and 
ing me safe to

*er. The next 
;r Charlie had 
hip on which 
icd in at the 
ng up the riv- 
ircely contain 
i he had writ- 
1, telling them 
done, and im- 
css. Ho had 
, but he felt 
ve him back 
So when the 
place at the 

h eager inter- 
peoplo who 

did he look in 
the landing- 

ear father and 
tie older and 

5 went away,
af expectancy
>m their eyes.
I leaped over 
was at their

irl ie. as they 
ow Year’s, “it 
e to run away 
groat fool for 
has come out 

,v Year’s Day, 
of sorrow and 

,* first prayer 
mo my sinful- 

. me arid filled 
was a ^ ew 

i more senses 
then he h»s 

-sed me, and I 
livTo for him.
replied 
are not SMr 
him that he

■s and sins the 
tu Jliniscu»

THE SUNDAY SCHOOL.

JANUARY 1.

Jesus in Galilee. — Mark 1 :
14-28.

p__It is noteworthy that Jeans re­
turning from the wilderness, and find- 
;Dg J ,bn in prison, went and coalmen 
ced His ministry in the dominion of 
tbe very man who had imprisoned 
jÿm# It is not said of John that be 
preached the gospel. To arouse, to 
cU-nounce, to warn, in order to bring 
men into a suitable frame of mind for 
hearing tbe gospel, was his mission. 
But the gospel—the glad tidings of 
pardon and peace and liberty was 
fouud on the lips of Jesus from the 
first, as is evident from St. Lake’s nar­
rative of the same tour. Luke 4 : 
18-23.

» The time is fulfilled.” “ That 
day,” ot which Isaiah had written so 
fully and gloriously, [Isa. 12 :] had 
pow dawned. “ And the kingdom of 
God is at hand.” It is only in St. 
Jlattbcw we have tbe expression, the 
kingdom of heaven. St. Mark and at. 
Luke both always use the other form 
of tbe phrase : but tbe meaning is, of 
course, the aime. “ Repent ye and 
beli. ve the gospel.” A gospel to be be­
lieved,and a repentance necessary in or- 
fier to true belief—such was the doctrine 
wtich Jesus taught. In this he furn­
ished the key note for all his servants 
to the end of time. With this message 
on his lips, Jesus went through all the 
region of Galilee, visiting all the cities 
and villages, preaching by the sea­
shore, on tbe mountains, wherever he 
bad oppoitunity, and producing an ex­
citement which ie most giaphically de­
scribed by St. Matthew [chap. 4 : 
33-25]. St. Luke’s account of this 
tour is also very striking, especially in 
his testimony of the favorable impres­
sion produced. He was glorified ef all. 
Luke 4 : 15.

3.—We find in the gospels that while 
Jesus taught wherever be had oppor­
tunity, it was his habit on the Sabbath 
to take part in the regular services of 
the synagogues. St. Luke gives an 
account of an incident which took 
place during hie tour in the synagogue 
at Nazareth [Luke 4 : 16-30]. He 
was teaching in the synagogue at Cap­
ernaum,and the people were much im­
pressed with the authority with which 
he spoke. The same feeling was pro­
duced by the Sermon on the Mount 
[Matt. 7 : 28, 29]. It was not the sub­
ject matter of his discourses which as­
tonished them—though they were pro­
foundly impressed with that—so much 
as the fact that he spoke as one hav­
ing authority in himself, recognizing 
no higher authority than his own. The 
scribes were accustomed to appeal to 
the authority of this and that Rabbi, 
and so encumbeied their discourses 
with * authorities ” in the technical 
sense as to take sway all real autho­
rity from their teaching. The Old 
Testament prophets spoke with Divine 
authority, but they prefaced their 
statements with, “ Thus aaith the 
Lord.” But Jesus, in giving utterance 
to the strangest and most startling de­
clarations, truths new to hie bearers, 
and the most novel expositions of the 
Scriptures, prefaced them with, “Ver­
ily /say unto you.” In the miracles 
which he wrought in such number and 
variety in Capernaum at this time, he 
healed as he had taught, “ I will ; be 
thou clean 1” The convincing power 
of such miracles following such teach­
ings must have been vary great. He 
proved by healing all manner of dis­
eases and casting out devils without 
appealing to any higher authority than 
his own, that he possessed all the au­
thority he had assumed as a Teacher. 
The purpose of this authoritative mode 
of teaching and healing was not simp­
ly to prove his Messiahship, but hie di­
vinity. He spoke and acted as the 
Son of God.

In the synagogue was a man possess­
ed of an unclean spirit, who, through 
the influence of the demon within, 
spoke words as soon as Jesus bad fin­
ished his discourse, which arrested the 
sttention of all present. The voice 
was that of tbe man, but the speaker 
was the evil spirit. The words uttered 
were a recognition of the divine char­
acter of Jesus, and a protest against 
being disturbed. They were evidently 
prompted by craven fear of his author­
ity and power. “ 1 know Thee who 
Thou art, the Holy One of God.” The 
title is taken from the Old Testament. 
Dan, 9 : 24. The Messiah is spoken of 
as “ the most Holy,” and the passage 
■refers to his coming in terms which led

to his advent being dreaded by Satan. 
It was a remarkable testimony from 
such a source, and must have produced 
a startling effect. Seeing that it was 
so true a recognition of hie claims, 
why did Jesus rebuke the devil and 
command him to be silent? Because 
he was unwilling to receive any such 
testimony from so impure a source. It 
was probably a subtle design of the 
f ather of lies to get his servants to 
speak the truth for once in order to 
bring about that very re-mit which fol­
lowed from these incidents, viz , the 
suggestion of tbe Pharisees of collus­
ion with the devil. Matt. 12: 24 — 
Abridged from S. S. Mag.

2.—5t. John gives an account of a 
previous interview, which shows that 
some of them bad already become 
avowed disciples of Jesus. But after 
having become convinced of Hie Mes­
siahship, they returned to their homes 
and occupations, waiting to be called 
to personal attendance and service. 
That call now came while they were 
engaged in their occupation of fisher­
men. Let us note this. They had not 
thought it right because they had re­
ceived a designation to higher work to 
give up their oidinary duties. Some 
would have despised their former work 
—some would have waited idly about. 
The Master’s call to higher service 
came to these men when they were en­
gaged about their ordinary business.

Why did our Lord choose men of 
such humble station as his apostles ? 
The question is thus answered by R. 
Watson : 1. Tbey were pious men, the 
fruit of the ministry of John the Bap­
tist. 2. That it might in future be ac­
knowledged that the excellency of the 
power was of God, not of man. That 
the gospel might appear to all not to 
be a device of human genius and sub­
tlety, but * tbe wisdom of God and the 
power of God.’

INFORMATION.

“ Iwdiobstion ”—You have tried 
everything for it and found no help. 
We are no doctors, but can offer a 
prescription that has cured very many 
and it might cure you as well ; it will 
cost but a quarter dollar, and can be 
had at any Druggists—Ask for Perry 
Davis’ Pain-Killer.

Consumption.—Many say that this 
disease cannot be cured, but the pro­
prietors of Allen’s Lung Balsam will 
satisfy any one that is has been .cured 
in very many cases of tbe worst descrip­
tion. They have hundreds of testi­
monials from thankful individual» who 
willingly admit it has saved their lives.

Nzubaigia—This scourge, being a 
purely nervous affection, can only be 
alleviated or eradicated through a 
thorough purification of the blood and 
secretions. It and all kindred ail­
ments are completely overpowered by 
Herrick's Sugab Coated Vegeta­
ble Pills, which never tail to afford 
reliei.

Cas-s in which the heart is weak and 
irregular in action, are soon restored 
to health and regularity by Fellows’ 
Syi up of Hypophoaphites. As persons 
whose heart’s action is feeble are most 
susceptible to the influence of cold, it 
is in the advent of tbe cold season its 
use is especially advised.

LITTLE THINGS.

It is a small matter to take the horses 
across the field for their water ; it 
seems to cost nothing, yet if a farmer’s 
time, or that of his hired man, is worth 
anything it costs a great deal in the 
course of a year. It is a small matter 
to chop each day’s wood upon the day 
it is used, and thus have it all fresh ; 
but fifteen minutes in harvest time is 
worth more than in January—besides, 
there are vastly more economical 
methods of making fire-wood than with 
an axe. It is a very little matter to 
tighten a loom nut, but it sometimes 
costs life and limb not to do it. A 
pear tree here and a peach tree there 
cost so little that one is inclined to 
think they are of no account, but when 
the fruit is ripe they are appreciated. 
A single step from one room to ano­
ther is “only one step,"but the thought 
of a stairway made out of these during 
a lifetime, is enough to almost make a 
woman’s back ache. Look well to the 
details, that the little things are right, 
for it pays in the end.—American Agri­
culturist.

USEFUL HINTS.

If you do not wish to nse a whole 
pumpkin or squash at once , and it is 
likely to rot, cut it in rings, slice thin, 
and dry them by the fire as you would 
apples. Then soak over night before 
stewing. It is not quite as nice ae the 
fresh ,but makes excellent pies if you 
are particulrr about the seasoning.

An inventive genius filled a small 
tarletan sack with a spoonful of cay­
enne pepper and tacked it over a rat- 
hole. When the rat bounced ont hie 
eyes were peppered by the sifting from 
the shaken sack. He squealed like a 
pig and escaped. The rats migrated.

In carving a turkey the breast 
should be uppermost ; place the fork 
in the breast ; and take off the wings 
and legs without turning the turkey ; 
then cut out the merry thought ; cut 
slices from tbe breast, take out the 
collar-bone, cut off the side pieces, cut 
the carcass in two, and divide the 
joints of the legs.

There is no animal on the farm that 
will pay so well to pt-t as the cow, un­
less it be her heifer calf. She should 
be the queen of the yard, and of the 
farm, too. Every member of the fam­
ily should have a loving pat and a 
gentle word for her. Shoot every dog 
that makes her i un a step, and dis­
charge (1 liked to have said brain) the 
hired man that ever kicks or scolds 
her.

A great deal of money may be saved 
in a year by taking care of things ; by 
not letting the tea-kettle boil dry, and 
by taking thought about all things. 
For instance when you buy a broom, 
instead of leaving it standing in a cor­
ner of the kitchen, and so making it 
one-sided, bore a hole in the handle, tie 
a stout cord in it; and bang it up when 
you are through using it, or screw a 
staple in tbe top of the handle to hang 
it up by ; the broom will last twice as 
long.

“ Vick’s Magazine,” one of the best 
horticultural authorities in the country, 
recommends coffee-grounds as a plant 
manure. A lady of tian Francisco late­
ly received some plants from Mexico, 
and with the plants came the advice to 
fertilize them with waste coffee and 
coffeo-gronnde. This was done, and 
the results were so satifactory that the 
same treatment was tried on roses, and 
the effect was a healthy and vigorous 
growth, and more and better flowers, 
and of richer colors.

It is about time that the people of 
the United Slates—especially the farm­
ers—got it into their heads that farm­
ing is one of the most impoi tant and 
noble of all the trades or professions. 
Every farmer that believes this will 
agree with ns that brain work is needed 
as much as main strength to make a 
successful farm. We want thinking 
farmers as well as working farmers. 
Now we ask every farmer who reads 
this paragraph to resolve to spend as 
much of bis leisure time this winter as 
he can in reading and thinking, in or­
der to learn how he can make a better 
farm ont of hie property next summer 
than he did in the past summer.

An Irishman called at a drug store 
to get a buttle of Johnson's Anodyne 
Liniment for tbe Rheumatism : the I 
druggist asked him in what part of the : 
body it troubled him must. “ Be me | 
honor said he I have it in every houl and 
corner of me."

For loss of cud, born ail, red water 
in cows, loss of appetite, rot, or mur­
rain in sheep : thick wind, broken wind 
and roaring,and for all obstructions 
of the kidneys in horses use Sheridan's 
Cavalry Condition Powders. Don’t 
buy a large pack ot worthless powder.

A Case of Hydbothobax Cubed— 
From Dr. J, S. Humphrey, of Durand, 
Wis.— ‘ It is now over nineteen years 
ago that my attention was directed to 
your highly valuable Pebuvian Sybup 
which at that time was, I believe, the 
means of saving the health, and prob­
ably the life, of a young lady who was 
said by her physician to have symptoms 
of hydrothorax (dropsy of tbe chest) 
from which disease her brother hid 
lately died. 8be married at the age 
of nineteen, and for a long time had 
been unable to ascend a flignt, of stairs 
without stopping to take breath once 
or twice during the ascent, or indeed 
to take any active exercise without dis­
tress. She took the Pebuvian Sybup 
for six weeks, when all the before-men­
tioned symptoms disappeared and have 
not since returned- This case occur- 
red in Potsdam, N. Y., in 1860." Sold 
by all druggists

Gathbbzd ob Bboken Bbxasts.—
Mrs. M. J. Johnson, De Lisle Street, 

Montreal, who is ore of the most suc­
cessful sick nurses and mid-wives, says 
Graham’s Pain Eradicator is the best 
remedy she has ever found for Gather­
ed Breaete, and if used in time is a 
certain preventative, and advises all 
ladies under such circumstances to 
have a bottle on hand. One 25 cent 
bottle, in such cases, would prevent 
heavy doctor bills, as well as a tedious 
and very painful disease. dec 232in

OPINIONS DIFFER.
; THE OPINIONS of men differ on various 

thing». Now take, for instance, their opinion 
of FELL-IWS’ LEEMIXG’S ESSENCE 
(the great remedy for Lame Horse»). One man 
say* that it cored a Spann that had been on 
his horses for a number of years ; another one 
informs ns that he had a Lor-e that had a 
Ringbone, and be took him to town thinking 
thst be would dispose of nim for whatever price 
he would bring ; but m.-eliugahicudou hi.way 
he was t>e suaded to trv as a last reso;t a bottle 
ot FELLOWS LKKMÎNGS ESSENCE. Be- 
fore th ■ bo;tie Was half used the Ringbone had 
nearly disappeared, and after a while liis neigh­
bors did not know it was the same horse. We 
could keep ou telling the various opinions ot 
different men in all parts of Vaua ia as to ths 

i great ‘knees effected by this great remedy. 
\ Some would tell you of Sprains cured ; others 
| of curbs removed. You Would also find them 
1 telling you of cures of Swellings, S l ots and 

Stiff Joints. Horses that were not worth their 
keep ttbuld be sold for bund.els of dollais after 
using FELLOWS’ L LEM I NO’S ESSENCE. 
You would find that opinions would not differ 
about you getting the genuine article. F EL-
T.ovw i i’i’tii vfi’u L’Cwi.’Vi'k'

MACDONALD & CO.,
3XT. S.

STEAM WATER ENGINEERS,

LOW’S LKEMlXti’S ESSENCE is the only-
reliable article in tbe market.

EVERY BOTTLE OF

FELLOWS’ LEEMINCS’ ESSENCE HAS A HORSE 
ON THE OUTSIDE WRAPPER.

PRICE 60 CENTS.
obrtzfxoatbb. 

SPAVIN CURED.
Si. Johx, N. B., January 6th, 1980.

Deax Sirs ;
In regard to your favor of a few days ago, I 

would say^-About one year agp a horse owned 
by me contracted a large Bone Spaviu, for the 
cure of «rilich I tried a number of the liuiineuts 
and lotions advertised to curt the same, with­
out any effect, and he became, very lame. A 
friend of mine recommended me to try FEL­
LOWS’ LEEMINU’S ESSENCE.

I acted upon hie advice, and now I am happy 
to say tbe lameness has ceased and the Spavin 
disappeared. I now consider him entirely 
cured, and would cheerfully recommend Frl- 
lows’ Lrimiho’s Lbsenck as the best remedy 
in the market for all the lameness that horses 
are subject to.

Yours truly, Thomas F. Fry.

RINGBONE CURED.
March 8th, 1880.

The Invioobating, Fattening 
and Nutbitivk properties of Robin­
son's Phosphorited Emulsion of Cod 
Liver Oil with Lacto-Phosphate of Lime 
are such as would indicate its sufficien­
cy to “ sustain the body in the perfor­
mance of its various functions,” with 
the aid of but little solid food. Hence 
its superior remedial worth in the 
“ Wasting Diseases of Childhood,”— 
the “ Wasting Away,” in those of Con­
sumptive tendency,”— in Consumption 
itself, as well as in General Debility, 
and all cases of Prostration and Ema­
ciation. Prepared solely by Hanning- 
ton Bros., Pharmaceutical Chemists, 
St. John, N,B., and for sale by Drug­
gists and General Dealers. Price $1 
per bottle ; six bottles for $5. dec lm

Close Confinement in poorly ven­
tilated work rooms, and want of proper 
exercise, are often unavoidable, bat 
tend to produce Dyspepsia, want of 
energy, and loss of appetite. In Rich 
cases Hanington’s Quinine Wine and 
Iron is the best medicine to nse.

•8T Fob Biliousness, Costiveness, 
and all troubles arising from a disor- 
ered state of the Stomach or Liver, 
Use “ Shanty” Bitters.

QTAftkb an Attack of Feveb, 
Measles, Diphtheria, or any wasting 
disease, Hanington’s Quinine Wine 
and Ibon is the best medicine to take. 
It gives lasting strength. dec lm

mothbbs! mothebs ! mothers !
Are yon disturbed at night and broken 
of vour rest by a sick child suffering 
and crying with the excruciating pain 
of cutting teeth P If so, go at once 
and get a bottle ef MRS. WINS­
LOW’S SOOTHING SYRUP. It 
will relieve the poor little sufferer im­
mediately—depend upon it; there ia 
no mistake about it. There is not a 
mother on earth who has ever need it, 
who will not tell you at once that it 
will regulate the bowels, and give rest 
to the mother, and relief and health 
to the child, operating like magic. It 
is perfectly safe to use in all cases, and 
pleasant to the taste, and ie the pre­
scription of one of the oldest and best 
female physicians and nurses in the j 
United States. Sold everywhere at 25 
cents a bottle. jan 28—ly

Auousta, Me,
Da a* Sirs:

I have had occasion to use Fellows’ Leem- 
ing’e Essibck on a horse so lame from Ring- 
bens that I could not use him. I have been 
using it about three weeks, and find it does all 
you claim for it, as the lameness is gone and 
the enlargement has almost disappeared. I 
firmly believe a few day. more will make an 
entire cure. Respectfully yours,

James T. Parker.

SPAVINS CURED.
, River Hirbbrt, N. 8., June 19th, 1880. 

Messrs. T. B. Barker A Sobs :
Dear Sirs.—I have used Fellows’ Libm- 

iae’s Essebcb for Spavins and found it a per­
fect succès. It is a sure remedy if used in time.

Yours truly, T. W. FORREST.

Da. H. H. HORNER’S

ANTI-BILIOUS PILLS!
PURELY VEGETABLE. -

These Pills are not offeied to the public as a 
novelty or a universal panacea for “ all the ills 
which flesh is heir to they have bean exten­
sively Used, and til. ir virtues are well kuowu 
to many who will be glad to learn that the 

! proprietor has made arrangements to continue 
j the manufacture on a scale etjual to the uicfeas- 
I ing demand. The Pills arc all made under his 
j personal supervision, and can the efore be re­

lied upon as being equal to those w hich have 
I given so much satisfaction to all who have 

used them. The oft-repeated assertions that in 
j bilious disorders and the various diseases of 
| the Liver, there is no remedy but by the use 
| of Mercury, in Blue Pills er some other form, 

have been proved false by ample testimony 
fvon. those who have used these purely Vegetab c 
Pills. It is true, however, to remedy a derange­
ment of the bilious secretion you must have 
something to act directly and powerfully at 
times upon the Liver ; but it is not true that 
Mercury is the only agent capable of producing 
this specification. The simple combination vt 
Vegetable principles in these Pills produces 
the same positive action upon the Liver as 
Colomel. and will correct the derangement of 
that organ just as surely, without i be n»k of 
any unpleasant or injurious consequences ; at 
the same time they have an alte. atlve and 
tonic effect, which is the secret of their groat 
superiority.

The circumstances under which the formula 
for these Pills came into the possession of the 
Proprietor, some years ago, were peculiar, and 
induced him to prepare from time to time such 
quantities as would enable him to supply the 
wants of hit friends ; but owing to the astonish- 
ing.resulta produced by their use, the demand 
has increased so rapidly that he is compelled to 
manufacture on a much larger scale than was 
contemplated, and the unsought testimony 
from various quarters of tbe great efficacy and 
uniformly gratifying results experienced in 
cases of bilious affections and other disorders 
arising from derangement of the biliary organs, 
proves beyond all doubt that these Pilla are 
capable of effecting the most surprising cures 
on record, and ought to be available by all who 
suffer in any way from derangement of the 
functions of ths Liver.

DIRECTIONS.
When a cathartic is required, take three Pilla 

at night and one in the morU'DK » *or many 
persona two Pills will be snfficisn, tor a dose, 
As an alterative, one Pill should be taL"en. ercry 
night until tbe desired effect ia produced

None genuine except bearing tbe 
of the Proprietor.

OF

WORK

Importers of Cast and Wrought Iron Pipe, with Fittings, Engineers*
Supplies and Machinery.

Manufacturers of all kinds of Engineers’ Plumbers’ and Steam Fitters'

BRASS GOODS
AND THE HEAVIER CLASSES

BRASS A1TD COPPER
ALSO

VESSELS’ FASTENINGS AND FITTINGS.
Public Buildings, Residences and Factories supplied with

Warming Apparatus and Plumbing Fixtures,
With all the Modern Improvements, fitted by Engineers thoroughly 

acquaintec with our climate.

SOLE AGENTS FOR THE SALE AND APPLICATION OF

WARREN’S FELT ROOFING
And Roofing Materials in and for the Province of Nova Scotia.

Nos. 162 to 172 also 306 Barrington Street, Halifax.

1881 - FALL - 1881

SMITH BROTHERS
WHOLESALE

25 Duke Street. - Halifax, .3.

OUR IMPORTATIONS FOR THE PRESENT SEASON
ARE NEW COMPLETE,' %

AND WE OFFER TO THE TRADE THE CONTENTS OF OYER

700 CASES AND BALES

STAPLES FANCY DRYGOODS
Purchased principally from Manufacturers direct ia 

FRANCE, GRRAT BRITAIN, UNITED STATES AND 
CANADA.

CANADIAN PACIFIC RAILWAY.
EMORY’S BAR TO PORT MOODY.

NOTICE TO CONTBACTOBS.

Tender for Work in British Columbia.

SEALED TENDERS will be received by the 
undersigned up to NOON on WEI NKS- 

DAY, the 1st day of FEBRUARY next, in a 
lump sura, for the construction of that portion 
of the road between Port Moody and the West- 
end of Contract 60, near Emory’s Bar, a dis­
tance of about 85 miles.

Specifications, conditions of contract and 
forms of tender may be obtained on application 
at the Canadian Pacific Railway Office, in New 
Westminster, and at the Chief Engineer’s Of­
fice at Ottawa, after the 1st January next, at 
which time plans and profiles will be open for 
inspection at the latter office.

This timely notice is given with a view to 
giving Contractors an opportunity of visiting 
and examining the ground during the fine sea­
son and before the winter sets in.

Mr. Marcus Smith, who is in charge at the 
office at New Westminster, is instructed to give 
Contractors all the information in his power.

No tender will be entertained unless on oae 
of the printed forms, addressed to F. Braun, 
Esq., Sec. Dept, of Railways and Canals, and 
marked “ Tender for C. P. R.”

F. BRAUN,
Secretary.

Dept, of Railways and Canals,
Ottawa, Oct. 24th, 1881. nov 4 Hi

M. A. DAVIDSON,
MERCHANT TAILOR,

117 SBANVILLE ST., - Halifax, N-S.

HAS secured the services of a first class 
CUTLER, Mr. McKay, who for many 

years was a partner in the firm of M. Mcllreith 
& Co., and who guarantees a perfect fit to cus­
tomers without their being put to the trouble of 
trying on.

sept. 23—1 y

and their HEIRS shouls 
all send for sample

Valuable Truths.

BK8T AND COMFORT FOB THE SUFFER­
ING.

„Bbown’s Household Panacza” 
haa no equal for relieving pain, both 
internal and external. It cures Pain 
m the Side, Back or Bowels, Sore 
Throat, Rheumatism, Toothache, Lum­
bago and any kind of a Pain or Ache. 
“ It will moat surely quicken the 
Blood and Heal, as its acting power 
is wonderful." “ Brown’s Household

If you are sufforing from poor health, or lan­
guishing on a bed of sickness, take chetr, for 
iOLDEN ELIXIR will cure you.

If you are simply ailing, if you feel weak 
and dispirited, without clearly knowing why, 
GOLDEN ELIXIR will revive you.

If you are a minister and have overtaxed 
yourself with pastoral duties, or a mother, 
worn out with care and work, GOLDEN ELIX­
IR will restore you.

If you are a man of business or laborer, 
weakened by the strain of your everyday duties 
or a man of letters toiling over your midaight 
work, GOLDEN ELIXIR will strengthen you.

If you are suffering from over-eating or drink­
ing, or any dissipation or indiscretion, or are 
young aid growing too fast, as is often tbe case, 
GOLDEN ELIXIR will relieve )ou.

If you are in the workshop, on the farm, at 
the desk, anywhere, and feel that your system is

EX-SOLDIERS ,or samp,. cop,
signature . pf that wonderful paper, THE WORLD AND 

flOLi'DSK published at Washington, D.C. It 
contains titv.™ of the War, Camp Life, Scene, 
from the Battlefield- and a thousand things of 
interest to otif rwintry's defenders. It is the 
great soldiers’ paper. It Cdbtditi? all the LaWi 
and Instructions h biting to Pensions and 
Bountvs for soldiers snd their heirs. Every cx- 
soldier should enrol hisnswennderthe WORLD 
AND SOLDIER banner at once. Eight pages, 
forty columns, weekly. $1 a year. Sample 
free. Address WORLD AND SOLDIER 
Box 688 Washington, D.C.

Panacea," be.ng acknowledged the 1 overtaxed, or needs cleansing, toning or stimn-
great Pain Reliever, and of double the 
strength of any other Elixir or Lini­
ment in the world, should be in every 
family handy for nee when wanted, 
“ ae it really » the best remedy i® the 
world for Crampe in the Stomach, and 
Pains and Aches of all kin*.” an“ 18 
for sale by all Druggist» at & ®®nt* * 
bottle. jan 38-ly

latiag, without ihtoxicatisg, GOLDEN 
ELIXIR is what you need.

If yon have a painful, dangerous cough, 
caused by derangement of tbe Liver, often 
taken for and called Consumption, GOLDEN 
ELIXIR will speedily cure you.

No form of medicine is so elective, eaey, 
handy and safe to use a* in the liquid form, 
and GOLDEN ELIXIR is the purett, safest, 
cheapest and best of all. Tiy it.

ifivJ

V

BUCKEYE BELL FOUNDRY.
of Pure Copper snd Tin for Cherche#. 

ftchvoU, Firs Alarm*,Farms, etc. FUU3T 
WARRANTED* Catalogue sent Free.
VANDUZEN A TIFT, Cia«iaa«tirO.

JUST PUBLISHED.

BELCHERS’ ALMANAC,
1882.

THE TRADE SUPPLIED.

METHODIST BOOK-BOOM
HALIFAX, N, 8.

CHRISTMAS MUSIC»
CHRIST THE LORD.

Just out. Cintata for Christmas, by W. 
Williams. For Mixed Voices. Easy and at­
tractive music. Choirs and Hosieries ran easily 
learn it for a Xmas performance. 8') cents. 

SEND FOR LIST OF CHRISTMAS 
CAROLS.

BEAUTIES of SACRED SONG.
Gilt edition |3.; Cloth $2.60; Boards $2. A 

noble present for those who love tbe best. 68 
of the most successful songs of the day, by 40 
famous composers.

RHYMES AND TUNES
Charming collection of Household songs, 

lullabies and Kindergarten lays. ($1.50.)
GEMS OF ENGLISH SONG.
$2. bds.; $8 60 cl.; $3. gilt. The new snd 

most favorite collection.
NORWAY MUSIC ALBUM.
$2 60. Poitn snd music of the Vikings of 

the North. Wild and beautiful.

FRANZ’ ALBUM OF SONG.
$2. bds ; $2 40 cl.; $3. gilt. Frsnx's own edi­

tion of his famous German songs.
CHRISTMAS CANTATA.

(80 cts.) By Gcttxxsox. 17 good Choru.e* 
Quartets, Solos, etc. Sacred words and spirited 
DOiir,

01IVIB DITSON * CO., Boston
CH.Ditsoh A O., J. £. Ditsom A Co.’

843 Broadway 1228 Chestnut St
Nsw York. _____________ Philadei.

fC C OnP€r^sY at home. Samples worth t5ff « 
DU 10 «bZU* CUh Portland, Me.

-DEAF
Artificial Ear Drums

lt narromi the rubixu
perform tbe work of (be Hatenl Drews. 

Always In position, bet IsrMbl. ae Mfern. 
All Conversation and even wblepeis beard dis­
tinctly. We redw te tbos. astog taie. Mend for 
descriptive circular with testimonial». Address,- r.x.

Dr. Peck’s

Z. F.X. FICZ â 00., W« Breedway. Sew Verb.

HEAR YE DEAF!
rrem whispers, dBH

_ riar tig
I with themIf. Af ammmmjmmU, and r >

at aid. Descriptive Circular fre 
Je Car. ith â Rate bis.. Ciaoaaau. u

12c. “A Violet from Mother’s tirav uii. 
other populer Songs, wonls and m ..i_. 

entire, only He. PATTEN A CO., .'•! li.ir 
St., X.Y. *
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PREMIU
FOR THE

“WESLEYAN,”

Special Offer.
WE offer •« a premium for the Wbsleyae 

for 1882, a moat interesting and excell­
ent book entitled

KESTLETON MAGNA.
A STORY OF

YORKSHIRE METHODISM,
BY REV. J JACKSON WRAY.

This is a book of more than 300 pages and 
sells readily at $1.00,

It will be sent roer paid to any subscriber 
for 1882—old ok a«w—for 30 carra.

This offer is strictly limited to subscribers for 
the WtaLETAB.

N. B.—$2.30 will secure the Wesletae from 
this date until the end of 1882—and the pre­
mium book, which to All but sub.cribers soils 
st $1.0 This is giving the paper for thirteen 
months, for $1 JO

In all cases the money for Premium and Sub­
scription must accompany the order. Push 
the canvass.

8. F. HVESTIS,

THE WESLEYAN
FRIDAY. DECEMBER 30, 1881.

DEPARTING.

When Christmas has put its bright 
seal upon the year we prepare to num­
ber it with the ages of the pT-et. Youth 
and beauty stretch out the hand to greet 
the coming year ; business men pre­
pare their announcements of chaining 
partnerships and pursuits ; the preach­
er goes to his study to formulate coun­
sels fitting to the new departure, and 
even the sexton, whose bell, during the 
reign of the old year, has sounded forth 
lessons of life’s brevity, more impres­
sive than many from preachers’ lips, is 
waiting at once to sound the knell of 
that year’s departure and to announce 
the arrival of its successor.

Let us not too hastily dismiss the old 
year. It is going, but lips now ruddy 
and tongues now chatty may never de­
clare it “ gone.” That mystic word 
may be used in relation to many who 
shall only see a coming year in some 
such fashion as Moses saw the promised 
land from a summit of Mount Nebo. 
Counsels for the old year are therefore 
yet opportune. It may be, indeed, that 
new plans and purposes cherished may 
have served to remind us how many 
good resolutions have been made and— 
forgotten. What then ? Shall these be 
transferred to the coming year ? Some 
of them may be—perhaps must be. 
But other purposes—and among these 
are the most important—cannot with 
safety be placed for a day on the list of 
“ deferred business, ” “I will lend you 
a book ” was the reply of a too free- 
and-easy pastor to an inquirer who had 
asked of him the way of salvation. ” 
“ But what if I should die before I can 
read it,” was the suggestive answer. 
In like manner he should ask who is 
postponing the settlement of questions 
relating to eternity to Sunday next, or 
even to the watch-night service of the 
Saturday evening, “ What if I should 
die before the appointed time shall 
come ?” From Him who oilers salvation 
and eternal glory, these highest bless­
ings may be definitely accepted at once. 
This best work has often been done un­
der high pressure. When moments are 
numbered we often make the best of 
them. We are spending serious mo­
ments. Let us use them with Divine 
help to do undone work. < lut of the 
great deeps that wrap us around voices 
seem to say “ Behold I come quickly.” 
“ Whatsoever thy hand tindeth to do, do 
it with thy might.”

should go forth with no vague hope that 
some time his prayer may be answered, 
hut with the conviction, so finely 
put into words by good Paul Gerhardt,

If what I wish is good,
Aud suits the will divine,

Bv earth and hell in vain withstood,
I know it shall be mine.

Noble resolutions are being written 
on the fair blank page of 1882. But if 
prayerless they shall be powerless, and 
the confidence reposed in them will 
prove but a snare and a delusion. Per­
formance does not follow promise as a 
matter of course ; hence “ hell may be 
paved with good resolutions."

Strength and wisdom will be needed 
by the Christian through the coming 
year. No year has ever approached 
with a clearer demand for pure lives, 
public honesty, business integrity, a 
determination to place all our public 
schemes of business or of education 

! upon the basis of that righteousness 
which exalts a nation. The very wave 
of prosperity which is flowing towards 
us makes it the more necessary that the 
Christian should ever keep within hail­
ing distance of heaven.

The man who starts well in the new 
year will bless others. Avoiding for his 
own part ‘'the parched places in the 
wilderness, the unit land not inhabited,” 
ho will make others see the bright spots 
in this much-abused world ; and car­
rying out his Master's purposes, will | 
pliure them to brighter worlds, or if 
before its close the Master beckoll J)im 
away, the day of the departure will be I 
the beginning of the grand Sabbatic 
year. Never was there a deeper mean­
ing to a Christian worker in Punshoa's 
later words—“ the rapture of living ”— 
than to-day ; never, on the other hand, 
has there been more music in the voice 
from heaven which still repeats,—
“ Blessed are the dead which die in the 
Lord.”

Great Head of the Church will find for 
his great work women second t j none in 
their devotion, qualifications and suc­
cess. Let it not be forgotten that the 
lady whose successful treatment of the 
wife of the Chinese viceroy has led to 
the establishment of a large hospital for 
Chinese female patients, and has called 
attention everywhere to the value of 
female missionaries, is a native of Can­
ada, though sent out under the auspices 
of the Methodist Episcopal Church of 
the United States.

minds crave, and they will get it. It is 
I too often the parents' fault that they 

get poison where they seek food.”

LITERARY DANGER

WOMANS WORK FOR WOMAN.

Those esteemed ladies who have been 
appointed K> lead their Methodist sis­
ters in the Canadian Dominion in “ ex­
pecting great things” and in “ accom­
plishing great things” in behalf of their 
heathen sisters are to be ranked among 
those whose toil begins at the third 
hour of the day. Others have entered 
the field before them and have gathered 
sheaves, thereby at once showing them 
the path and beckoning them on to 
equal effort and like success.

Both as an helper at home and as 
an agent abroad woman has long played 
an important part in the mission work 
of English Methodism, though her 
share in the toil and success has been- 
less definitely marked than by our Ame­
rican Methodist neighbors. If, how­
ever, we may judge from recent an­
nouncements, it is probable that in future 
the sphere of woman’s work in behalf of 
woman will be more definitely outlined 
by our English brethren. That it 
should be so Is but a natural result of 
the conviction everywhere gaining 
ground that the great force of heathen­
ism in the East is in its complete con­
trol and seclusion of woman, who must 
therefore be reached, if at all, by de­
voted and self-denying missionaries 
of her own sex. Loss affected by a 
certain sort of conservatism the Metho­
dist women of America have entered 
upon their work with a degree of self- 
assertion which has already enabled 
them to send a rapidly increasing num­
ber of educated agents to India, China, 
and Japan, whose success in zenana 
visiting, educational work, and medical 
attendance upon their own sex, has been 
most readily îeported by the Bishops of 
the Church on their successive visits.

In missionary and temperance efforts 
woman has been both blessed and made 
a blessing. In the service of God and 
in behalf of the lost, at home and abroad,

COMING.
Before next week’s mail can convey 

the usual greetings to our readers, the 
great majority of them—we dare not 
say all—will have crossed the threshold 
of a new year. Youth will be full of 
gladness, while maturer age will prompt 
many to peer with dim eyes into its 
misty recesses. Let us not err at the 
first step. Let us look up, not down. 
“ On the first day of the year,” said the 
ancient law-giver, V shalt thou set up 
thy tabernacle.” On the first day of 
the year should the child of God see 
that the anchor of his hope is really cast 
“ within the vail.” Ere it closes all 
doubt and indistinctness should be re­
moved. Sabbath stillness, and the ac­
customed Covenant service may help 
some weak, discouraged soul, to whom 
the ordinary festivities of the day 
might prove a temptation. On that 
day the man who prays should get the 

close grip.” From the mercy-seat he

hitherto undeveloped energies are find
ing exercise, and she is rising without gossips will do that only too well,

Too much care cannot be taken in re­
ference to the literature passing into 
the hands of our youth. A shop window 
may display such trashy illustrated pa­
pers as to render a visit from the police 
quite as necessary as if “ best Cognac ” 
or “ real Old Tom ” were advertised 
there, with other abominations behind 
them. The young man who enters upon 
the sale of books and papers has before 
him the temptation to become a greater 
panderer to evil than he who avails 
himself of a grocer’s license to sell 
liquor. Few can imagine the evil that 
may be done—the ever-growing evil— 
by an unhallowed book or paper. One 
of the three lads recently sent to the 
Arkansas penitentiary for seventy yea rs 
for train-robbing, said during the trial, 
“ We read about the James’ boys in the 
papers and books, and saw how easy it 
was to rob trains and get away, and de­
cided to rob a train. ” One of the three, 
a young man of engaging manner* and 
appearance, and of more than ordinary 
intelligence, died six weeks since in the 
penitentiary from home-sickness. From 
his entrance into the prison, he appear­
ed to be heart-broken, and all efforts to 
relieve him failed. The prison physician 
conld find no physical disease about him 
and the evidence of a settled despair 
was unmistakable. A similar cause for 
crime was alleged by several Cana­
dian youths who, a few months 
since, fitted out a boat for piracy 
on the lakes, and by two boys 
in Illinois who wrecked a train.

Of the first of these cases a St. Louis 
paper says : “ In the seasons of delirium 
which preceded his death this young 
man kept repeating portions of chap­
ters of trashy novels, in which acts of dar­
ing and knives and revolvers figured free­
ly. They were not merely occasional ut - 
teranees, but formed a continuous narra­
tive, which fully occupied bis delirious 
moments. His mind was possessed of 
this miserable stuff to the exclusion 
of everything else. It certainly does 
not savor of clap-trap to connect the 
crime for which the dead man was con­
victed with the influence of the literary 
poison he had soaked himself with. It 
is a fair inference to conclude that there 
was an intimate relation between the 
two ; that it was a clear case of cause an d 
effect. If he had been a man of dulled 
emotional perceptions, or an habitual 
criminal; the force of the connection 

1 would be lost, but the single crime fits 
i so well upon the appropriate preparation 
that it may j ustly be placed there. ”

Were we confident that we could gain 
their eye we should urge upon all who 
have to cater for the mental tastes of the 
public the necessity of care. A sailor 
while on trial for life confessed that he 
had been led into a career of crime 
through the reading of an article upon 

; “ noted pirates ” that appeared in a 
magazine which is ordered through most 
respectable agents and bears the imprint 
of well-known British publishers. We 
are not sure that some of our own secu­
lar journals have not of late occasionally 
tried how near the edge of the bank 
they could drive without positively go­
ing over. It is by no means necessary 
that the people of any community should 
be made familiar through the press with 

1 the details of every scandal which may 
take place in their neighborhood ; local

As a

CALVINISM AND THE IIEA- 
TII Els.

One has only to glance at the earlier 
volumes of Wesley’s Arminian Magaz­
ine to learn how much more modest the 
adherents of the Calvinistic creed have 
become in their statements of doctrine. 
In the pulpit of Surrey Chapel, where 
Rowland Hill, Wesley’s Calvinistic an­
tagonist, used to make such startling 
assertions, the writer heard one of his 
most gifted successors, Newman Hall, 
say, in reference to the often-asserted 
difference between a general and a spec­
ial “ call,” that he “ would rather be 
an infidel than believe that.” Our glance 
was instinctively turned towards the 
tablet in the rear of the pulpit, bearing 
Rowland Hill’s name, but it was silent. 
Wesley and he have clearer light ere 
this. Not more marked, however, is 
the change in the declaration from 
many other pulpits of the Gospel mes­
sage. Occasionally we are treated to a 
statement of the Five Points ” or a 
part at least of them, but only in such a 
way as to remind us that the ground is 
still held, as does the military sentry on 
one day in each year when he disputes 
our passage across the lands of the War 
Department, by way of asserting con­
tinued proprietorship.

Those remarks have reference only to 
Goipel work at home ; the N. Y. Inde­
pendent makes some statements respect­
ing the silence of Calvinistic ministers 
abroad which have been read with sur­
prise, almost prompting the question 
whether a sort of mental reservation 
may not be practised in more quarters 
than one:

When Dr. Legge, of the London Mis­
sionary Society, had been Working for 
some time in Hong Kong And had got 
a number of converts it seemed to be 
time to have the Westminster Catechism 
translated, and he got the help of his 
preacher and teacher to put it into Chi­
nese. The work proceeded very nicely 
until they came to Qu. 20th, the answer 
of which is :

‘•God, having out of his mere good 
pleasure, from all eternity selected some 
to everlasting life, did enter into a 
covenant of grace to deliver them out 
of the estate of sin and misery and to 
bring them into an estate ot salvation 
by a Redeemer. ” j

The preacher began it, hut threw down 
his pen, with the words : “ I can’t trans­
late that” “ Why not ?” asked Mr. 
Legge. *• Because,” said he, “ we 
have been preaching that anybody might 
come and be saved, and this says that 
only these can who have been elected.
I can’t translate this.” In telling the 
story, Dr. Legge concludes by saying :
“I put the Catechism upon a shelf and 
there it stays. When Dr. Burns, the 
distinguished Free Church of Scotland 
missionary to China was once askei :
* ’ What do you do with Calvinism in 
China ?” he replied : “I don’t say any­
thing about it. The Chinese don’t need 
it.” And we believe he was a genuine 
Calvinist as well as a grand evangelist.

as a part of his New Year s message :—- 
“Let me tell you that I never saw a 
New Year begun over a bottle of liquor 
that turned out well. And I never saw 
the husbands and the sons perfectly 
free from habits of drink when the wife 
or the mother is accustomed to set out 
the glass. And another thing I have 
seen, and that is, an army of tipplers 
who got their first glass from the hands 
of a lady ! You have no moral right to 
tempt another woman's husband or be­
loved boy to ruin. Our heavenly Father 
has given you enough good things for 
your hospitable boards without bottling 
up damnation for your guests. ”

were a little surprised by llie 
of the contribution. \\ e can 
pose that the good Lord 1
the heart of our Nov 
“ set the hall rollin. 
ly hope that !

re?Pt,on

Some of our contemporaries are com­
plaining that Nova Scotia has not now 
as formerly any Bureau of Vital Statis­
tics. No regular registration of births, 
marriages and deaths has taken place 
since 1877. In the meantime a con­
siderable sum is being paid in the way 
of pensions to those formerly engaged 
in this work. The importance of correct 
vital statistics can scarcely be overrated. 
The welfare of individuals may be pro­
moted to a very large extent by facts of 
this kind carefully preserved, and the 
public weal may be aided by the publi­
cation of such facts as our statistics 
would seem to sustain. The British 
colonies in America have been much in­
debted in the past to the healthy charac­
ter given to them in various parts of 
Britain through the comparison of the 
annual deaih-rate among the British 
troops stationed here with that of those 
quartered in the various garrisons 
throughout the world. Steps should be 
taken to re-establish the Bureau.

•Votia brut he 
and we earner ns example inav

many others M-Ivnd a helping h.La* 
Hie Mission work, in lY,rt s d- 

District is entirely among t|lp t'™?*0» 
The bands are seat ered along a v„d!4nt- 
tent of coast line, and it is imnere! n' 
y necessary for the chairman tun,?' 

long and frequent voyages u„ .nri ?•* 
the coast, up the rivers, and 
deep inlets that penetrate the "o’JÎ! 
for great distances. Hitherto th* 
ages have been made in one „f T 
large canoes of the country a travel which involve. ^ J**

The prospect of successful work in 
the United States is unusually cheer­
ing. Says the N. Y. Methodist : *• We 
have not in any former recent year no­
ticed so many reports of revivals as are 
coming in this autumn. The fires are 
burning brightly in isolated churches

risk. Something better and 
needed, and it would be a tine thin, u 
Bro. Crosby could take with him wLf 
he returns to Simpson, sufficient t 
purchase a suitable boat. 10

A small steam vessel would be of ; 
mense service. Not only would it 1™" 
able the chairman to visit all the 
tered tribes on the coast, but alsot 
extend his journeys to the Hydah. 
Queen Charlotte's Islands, some seven? 
or eighty miles off the coast. 
times it could be utilized in freight^ 
supplies to the various Mission station? 
thus greatly lessening the cost and in 
conveying building material to any point 
where it might he advisable to erect 
school houses or churches. ^

If sufficient cannot tie secured to dot 
chase a small steamer, the next best sr 
rangement will be the purchase of a 
good sized sail boat, though the great 
violence of the winds, and the sudden 
ness with which they rise, makes sail
ing in those latitudes very dangerous 
We are scarcely prepared at present to" 
say wjiat the dost would be in either 
case ; but we will make further enquire 
and jwrhaps return to the subject next

THE LADIES ACADEMY.

The Mount Allison Institutions at 
Sack ville, N, B. have just closed a vere 
successful term. The following is con­
densed from the Sack ville papers, in re­
gard to the terminal exhibition of tire 
Ladies’ Academy. As many SaokviUe 
citizens as could find room, were present 
at Lingley Hall. A better natured or 
better gratified audience, never appear- 

. , . ed anywhere. The Mount Allien
all over the land. We anticipate a ( young ladies never appeared to better 
general awakening. It ie certain to fol- advantage. The gloom and darknere of 
low plain, earnest, pointed and practi- the outside worM was charmingly coo- 

cal preaching aimed at the conversion 
of sinners. Suffer us to caution some 
against using up a month in effort to 
warm a cold church. Tiring congrega­
tions out in that way seldom bears fruit.
Strike home at the conscience of the 
sinner ; his cry for salvation will rouse 
the church more than a month of your 
exhortation.

Willis.

protest or hindrance to a position of in­
fluence to which certain “ strong-mind­
ed ” women and extremists of both 
sexes have sought in vain by various 
plausible theories to elevate her. We 
are convinced that the officers and mem­
bers of the Committee of the lately 
formed Woman’s Missionary Society of 
the Methodist Church of Canada can do 
an important work for their sisters at 
home, and for their less favored sisters 
abroad, by an earnest effort in the early 
months of 1882 to form branches of 
the Society in all the cities, towns 
and villages of the Dominion where 
such an organization may be sus­
tained. Many workers can be found 
whose happiness and health would be 
benetitted by their service at home ; 
many women, even, in humble circum­
stances, of whom to-day the Church— 
not at all to their benefit—asks nothing, 
would gladly contribute to the funds of 
the Woman's Foreign Missionary Soci­
ety ; and who can doubt that among the 
daughters of Canadian Methodists the

rule, nothing should go into their columns 
that would lead a father to regret that 
he had taken a copy of the evening 
paper from his pocket and placed it 
upon his table.

We have no disposition to disparage 
the secular press. On the contrary we 
attach to it a high value. We mark its 
success, its publication of religious 
items or of Sunday-school lessons, 
with pleasure, but this does not 
prevent us from agreeing fully with 
the N. Y. Methodist when it says : 
“ The truth is, a religious paper is 
a necessity for decent housekeep­
ing, and probably worth many times 
more than its cost in its influence 
upon other expenditure,” or from en­
dorsing the remarks of the same jour­
nal in relation to the corrupting liter­
ature of the day : “ This, at least is 
true ; no parents ought to complain of 
the men who furnish his children with 
demoralizing readiag, so long as he him­
self fails to provide them with good 
reading. Something the active young

The January number of the Mission­
ary Outlook is already on our table. Its 
appearance is attractive ; its matter ex­
cellent. In one lively paragraph the 
editor says :

Wesley defined an enthusiast as one 
who expects the end without using 
the means. The end we expect is the 
universal sympathy and co-operation 
of our people in missionary work ; the 
means we use are one or two sermons 
and a Missionary meeting in the course 
of a year. This is trying to build a py­
ramid small end downwards. We must 
construct a broader base if we expect to 
succeed. A missionary prayer-meet­
ing once a month, and a rousing 
missionary scrim n once a quarter, 
would be a great help—to the preacher 
as well as the people. Then supple­
ment this by scattering Missionary in­
formation broadcast. “ Keep it before 
the people. ”

And in another, having referred to 
those who have hitherto done nothing :

Will Missionary collectors kindly 
make a note of this, and when canvass­
ing their respective districts see that 
every one gets a call. There are a vast 
number of dead-heads in the Metho­
dist Church, and it would be a great 
blessing to themselves and to the 
Church if they could be brought into 
line. Giving to God’s cause is a re­
ligious duty, as sacred as prayer or 
praise, and no one can prosper spiritual­
ly who neglects it.

A wide circulation of the Outlook would 
soon rouse slumberers in our churches, 
and prompt all to active effort.

A little pamphlet, entitled—Three 
Hundred Topics for Prayer Meetings, for 
1882, is published by the International 
Committee of the Y. M. C. A., for the 
use of “Pastors^ Association Secretaries 
and others active in Christian work. ” 
One topic is given for each day, Sun­
days excepted. This little pamphlet, 
costing only five cents a copy, is calcu­
lated to assist all such workers. Many 
a pastor, going out to spend an after­
noon in pastoral visitation, might glance 
at the topic and the Scripture lesson 
connected with it, and during his walk 
group around these some precious prac­
tical thoughts for his evening prayer­
meeting. It can be ordered from R. 
C. Morse, cor. 23rd St. and 4th Ave., 
New York.

trested by the splendor, freshness sad 
light within. The following was the

PROGRAMME :
1. —Devotional Etbrcises.
2. —Music Jubel Overture.............(IF«4*r)

Misses \ Dodoe Bishop,
? Kennedy and

3—3ecitatI0N—Christmas Carol.
..............................Miss E. Shietob.

4. —Essay—Subject : Memories............. .
.....................................................Miss J. Pierce.

5. —Music—Chorus Hail Smiling Morn
.................................................... Sinoino Class.

6. —Recitation—Shakespeare......... .
..................Misses Willis and Momies.

7. —Essay—The Poets Laureate............
...................................................Mis* Cols.

8-^MusiC—The 24th Psalm...................
.................................... Miss C. Thompson.

9.—Recitation—Kenan's Last Charge. 
.................................................... Miss Weldon.

10. —Essay—Is life worth Living?........
.........................................................Miss Flinn.

11. —Recitation—The Last- Hymn....
.............. ..................................... Miss Bishop.

12. —Music—Great Fantasia of Nonna..
..............Miss Pickard and Prof Cnanz

13. —Discussion........................................
..............Misses Taylor and Johnson

14. —Music—Vocal Duet : 1 would that
my Love.............................................

15. —...Misses Bishop aud Grkbnfisld
16. —Addresses.
17. —Music—Chorus Good-night............

............................................Sinoino Class.

The Northioestern Advocate occasion­
ally schools its correspondents. This 
is one of its latest lessons : “ Some
correspondents say, ‘I want you to print 
this item just as I send it.’ If you 
please, we will do no such thing—in 
every instance. We will give the facts 
as stated, if it is possible to ascertain 
them from the letter. A moment’s 
thought will show that we must edit our 
news, and if wc make an error now and 
then, it is in cases where readers would 
be misled if we print ‘ just as sent. ’ ”

Mr. D. McGregor, 145, Hollis Street, 
has commenced the publication of the 
Maritime Literary Review, the January 
number of which is on our table. His 
intention ie to furnish in its columns 
from month to month a review of the 
best books and periodicals. His enter­
prise deserves encouragement.

One marks at the recurrence of fes­
tive seasons the progress of Temperance 
principles. Many a Christian woman 
now wonders how she could ever have 
been so blind as to devote a part of the 
first day in each year to tempting her 
callers to become topers. Is any Meth­
odist lady placed in a position where 
she shrinks from doing right in this 
matter ? We commend to her thought­
ful perusal the words which Theodore 
Cuyler puts into the lips of St. Nicholas

HOW DID HE KNOWf

On Thanksgiving Day an unknown 
friend at Truro placed on the collection 
plate the sum of five dollars “for a Mis­
sion Boat at Port Simpson.” This sum 
was st once forwarded to the Conference 

! Treasurer, who had never heard that a 
mission boat was needed at Port Simp­
son, but who, nevertheless, sent on the 
money to Dr. Sutherland, the Mission­
ary Secretary. From the Otitloedc we 
learn that the message borne to our 

I Truro friend by some bird ot the air 
quite correct. Dr. Sutherlandwas

says :—
We have known for some time 

such a boat is very much needed
that
but

as no appeal for help had been made we drill in elocution.

Every number in this ample and well 
arranged programme was performed. 
The instrumental music was executed 
with spirit and accuracy. Prof. Crans 

I must have been highly gratified at the 
I enthusiasm displayed over the musical 
selections. The singing class was large 

I and the choruses were better than usual, 
which is high commendation. All the 
solos and duetts on the programme 
were well received, as they deserved to 
be. The literary portion of the exer­
cises was varied ; the essays were care­
fully prepared and well read ; that of 
Miss Pearce on “ Memories ” showed 
originality and the matter was well con­
ceived. Miss Cole, on the “I’oets 
Laureate,” was erudite, and Miss Flinn, 
on “ Is Life Worth Living," philosophi­
cal. Miss Taylor and Miss Johnson de­
bated a burning question : which is the 
more destructive, overwork or 
worry. The discussion was energetic 
and sharp ; the arguments on both sides 

, were clear and well presented. The 
recitations were of a high order. Miss 
E. Shenton made a good impression ill 
the “ Christmas Carol.” Misses Willis 
and Mounce put a good deal of spirit 
and feeling in their selections from 
Shakespeare. Special mention is due to 
the rendition of that most difficult selec- 

! tion, “ Henry Fourth’s Appeal to 
Sleep. ” Facile princeps among the re­
citers was Miss Bishop's number, “ The 

j Last Hymn.” A hearty encore drowned 
i the voice of Dr. Kennedy, who tried to 
. announce the next piece. The audience 
| refused to be conciliated by Mi*
! Bishop's prettiest bow, nothing lee* 
would do than a repetition of the piece. 
The French dialogue was good- Tne 
audience took as much interest in its* 
if they understood every word. Tne 
actor» were as natural as though they 
were speaking in their own mother 
tongue.

The Principal, Dr. Kennedy, reported- 
that there had been an attendance of <6, 
and that 29 ot these were in the hnt 
rank. Everything had gone well ; hard 
work had been done, and most gratify­
ing results shown by the examinations.

Complimentary remarks were made 
by the Rev. Jonathan Borden and the 
Rev. Job Shenton. Rev. Dr. Pickard 
also made a short address compliment- 

I ing Miss Wilson on the results of her

Allfl
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jfEEK OF PRAYER,—1882. 
The Executive Committee of the Ev- 

j^jelical Alliance recommends the fol-
^Tprogramme for the several days 
^ the annual Week of Prayer

4,-jav, Jan. 1.— Subject for dis- 
. “ Renewed Consecration.” 

livÜav, Jan. 2.—Thanksgiving for 
Aeblessüigs, temporal and spiritual, of 
the pest year, and prayer for their con-

Jan- 5.—Humiliation and 
confession on account of individual, so- 
-i»l sad national sins. i

Wednesday, Jan, 4.—Prayer for the f 
bliweitt of God on His Church and His
^Tkirsday, Jaii. 5.—Prayer for the 

and all agencies for Christian
IBSBÙng

preach­
ed in the afternoon of the same day 
and also on Monday morning. The 
congregations throughout Sunday were 
all good, especially in the af ternoon, 
when the church and vestry were both 
full. It would be folly in me to either 
eulogize, discriminate, or to epitomize : 
all these brethren sustained their well- 
earned reputation. Tb.y universal com­
ment was, “ we have had a good day.”

Visitors were loud, in their praises of 
both style and fini ah of church. A re­
port in a local paper says, “ the Point 
de Bute people^ may justly have a par­
donable pride in their church.” Thus 
through tiie blessing of God, what 
at first seemed an almost impossi­
ble undertaking has been completed, 
and we now have in this pretty village, 
a most comfortable and well furnished 
’parsonage and beautiful church contig­
uous to each other.

The Trustees and Building Commit­
tee have been untiring in tneir labors 
and zeal in this work, the ladies too,

! (without whom often very little would 
j be accomplished) of the church and con-

pjning. , i gregation have rendered efficient aid.
Friday, Jan. 6.—Prayer fvr the urn- , rp0 aj] w^0 fiave labored with us we ten­

dered prevalence of peace and right- j der our sincere thanks.

^Saturday, Jan. 7.—Prayer for Chris­
ta Missions, the outpouring of the 
Holv Spirit, and the conversion of the 
world.

|n this city the special morning meet­
ings of the Week of Prayer will be held 
in the Y. M. C. A. Hall, beginning at 
9.30. All evening meetings, with the 
texeqption of those of Wednesday, will 
-tske place in Brunswick Street and St. 
Matthew’s churches.

Advise your neighbors to decide, as 
one good resolution for the New Year, 
to take the Wesleyan.

A GOLDEN WEDDING.
On Thursday last quite an interest­

ing event occurred in the family of 
our esteemed 'townsman, Heman Gard­
ner, Esq. On that day Mr. and Mrs. 
Gardner celebrated their Golden Wed­
ding. Notwithstanding unfavorable 
weather, during the evening a large 
number of friends of the family assem­
bled at the family residence and by 
their presence and otherwise evinced 
their high appreciation of the venera­
ble couple. A cordial welcome was ex­
tended to each and all, and the hospi­
talities of the household were generous 
and munificent. Mr. Gardner has been 
well known in Yarmouth for over half 
a century, and has maintained a charac­
ter above reproach, whilst he lias been 
foremost in advocacy of those ir rests 
material and moral, intimately associat- 

-ed with the well-being of the commu­
nity.

I11 addresses delivered by the Revs. 
I. Sutcliffe and W. H. Heartz, Joseph 
Rogers, Esq., and Capt. Moses, appro­
priate references were made to Mr. and 
Mrs. Gardner’s eventful life, to their 
labors in connection with the temper­
ance cause and religion, and to the 
high regard in which they are held by 
the community. Rev. Mr. Heartz, as 
pastor of Providence church, read a re­
solution passed recently by the officials 
■of that church, viz. :—

“ The members of Providence Chnrch 
quarterly meeting having been inform­
ed that our esteemed Bro., Heman 
Gardner, will during this month of De­
cember, celebrate the 50th year of his 
married’life,desire to put on record their 
high appreciation of the many Chris­
tian qualities of our beloved brother 
and to extend to Mr. Gardner and his 
estimable wife our warm congratula­
tions in connection witli the conspicu­
ous event in their history.”

To this resolution Mr. Gardner deliv­
ered a suitable reply, in which touch­
ing references were made to the past, 
and in grateful terms he marked his 
own and Mrs. Gardner’s appreciation of 
the kindness of assembled friends and 
others.

The evening passed most pleasantly, 
and we heartily congratulate our wor­
thy friend and Ins esteemed companion 
on their half a century of married life. 
— 1 anumith lierail.

POINT DE RI TE. X. R.
The new church recently opened 

(Dec. IStli at Point de Bute is a very 
fine structure for a country place. It 
h Gothic in style, with tower in middle 
of end of building ; the vestry is on the 
side of the church, is connected with it 
by folding doors and arches, and can at 
any time be utilized for any overflow of 
■congregation. When thus used it pre- 
'sentsthe appearance of a transept of the 
•church.

Tlie inside finish is of ash, with wal­
nut trimmings, much of the asb being 
•very fine. The seating capacity -*f the 
«hunch is 260,and vest ry 150, so that on 
extraordinary occasions we can accom­
modate 400 persons with comfort It 
is heated by a furnace and well light­
ed by four handsome chandeliers and 
two pulpit lamps. The furnishing

Now, may the God of all our mer­
cies come down, and receive the offer­
ing and crown the whole with the bap­
tism of fire. G. W. Fisher.

Point de Bute, Dec. 21, 1881.

LADY PHYSICIANS.
Miss Thorne, hon. secretary of the 

London School of Medical Women sends 
to the London Times an extract of a 
letter, dated Oct. 14th, from a gentle­
man travelling in the north of China :

“ While at Tieu-tsin I called on Miss 
Howaid, m. D., the lady doctor who so 
successfully treated Lady Li, the wife of 
the viceroy Li Hung-Chang. I found 
her exceedingly pleasant, and she invit­
ed me to be present at the opening of 
her Hospital for Female Patients on the 
8th inst. This was a grand affair. Li 
Hnng-Chang, attended by many man­
darins,came to take part in the ceremony. 
The Hon. A. Angell, the American 
Minister, who was passing through Tien­
tsin on his way home was asked *o say 
a few words on the occasion. It was a 
curious coincidence that he had been 
president of the University in America 
where Miss Howard had studied, and 
he himself had signed her diploma. 
This made it exceedingly interesting to 
him, and he did not fail to allude to it 
in his speech. Ladies did not take part 
in the ceremony, but Miss Howard 
came into the reception-room, and by 
an efficient interpreter expressed to Li 
Hung-Chang her thanks for the support 
he and Lady Li were giving to her un­
dertaking. Li stood while Miss How­
ard was there. She then retired to her 
own apartments, and Dr. Mackenzie, of 
the London Mission did the honors of 
the reception. After we had walked 
round, we returned and partook of tea, 
coffee, cakes, Ac., and shortly after­
wards Li retired also, and an interest­
ing ceremony came to an end. ”

MISSIONS AND TRADE.
The Methodist people arc always glad 

to hear of Fiji. It is, perhaps, our 
most fruitful mission field. Now that 
it belongs to one of the Australian Con­
ferences we hear but little of its spirit­
ual progress. This is to be regretted. 
However, Fiji il now a British colony ; 
and we hear of its material prosperity. 
The following facts were taken from of­
ficial information which has been sent 
to Earl Kimberley. The revenue of 
the country has increased from £10,000 
in 1875 to £80,000 in 1880. The na­
tives are learning systematic agricul­
ture. Tho total value of the produce 
has increased. In 1876 it was £80,000; 
in 1880 it was £170,000. The soil and 
climate ar# well adapted to the growth 
of cotton, but owing to the state of the 
maiket this branch of industry has not 
been much extended. Copra the dried 
kernel of 
fee art 
and export.
11,, less than 8.000 tons of sugar will bc 
exported. The shipping returns also in­
dicate substantial progress. In lrbO, 
<s.'> vessels visited the colony, the total 
tonnage of which was 15,671 tons. In 
1MSU tlie number of vessels went up to 
157, and the tonnage to 32,233 tons. 
Within the four years named tlie white 
population has increased by about o00. 
The value of the imports from British 
possessions to Fiji has risen from £01,- 
411 in 1876 to £180,452 iu 1880. All 
this is the indirect fruit of missions. 
And these remarkable results have been 
accomplished almost within a genera­
tion.—London Methodist.

if the cocoanut), sugar and c<-f- 
the chief articles of production 

export. It is expected that in 1882 
of

A QUESTION.
What shall be done with the dead of 

the metropolis i The outlying towns, 
near enough at hand to be convenient­
ly reached by funerals, object to the 
establishment of mine cemeteries, and 
reluctantly assent to the enlargement of 
old ones. Newtown, which lies just 
east of Brooklyn, and is in large part 
a burial ground, is new taking steps to 
defeat the carrying out of a plan kr a 
Hebrew cemetery within its borderscomplete ; all the pews are cushioned and Hebrew cemetery wi * , , '*» til. mW «eKd. Tb. platform i. j **£■»,'ft* “V*- iTlSS.''l

covered with a rich tapestry carpet, and 
is supplied with two elegant pulpit 
chairs, the gift of two ladies, Mrs. Mc­
Queen, and Miss McLeod of Newark, 
t. S. Mrs. Moore, of Moncton, gave 
the handsome walnut communion table 
and lamps for the pulpit. Miss R. 
Trueman, Mrs. Wm. Avard, Bristol, 
Mrs. Sharp, and Mrs. Mm. Robinson, 
Moncton, gave the chandeliers. The 
entire cost is not less three thousand 
dollars, the whole of which is provided
for.

The opening services were of great 
interest. Two former pastors,the Rev. C.

nerals" will have to use the railroads to 
reach a region where space can be found 
for the narrow houses of the dead with­
out intruding upon the privileges ef the 
liv ing. Meantime, it seems appropriate 
to ask what has become of the Cremation 
Society organized in New, York ay ear ago. 
It is possible that public opinion may be 
more favorable to its objects than its 
members suppose. The test would be 
to erect a proper crematory in the city 
and provide a dignified, substantial fire­
proof building for funeral services and 
for the permanent preservation of ciue- 
ary urns.

The American Agriculturist for Jan­
uary is an excellent number of a peri­
odical which should find its way into 
every farmer's home. How many times 
over it would pay for itself in a single 
year no one ean tell. |

The covers of the Wesleyan Methodist 
Magazine, and other monthly publica­
tions of the English Wesleyan Confer­
ence Office for December, show “ Con­
tents” which ment consideration from 
Methodist readers everywhere. Of the 
Magazine we have frequently spoken in 
high terms. Besides this oldest of reli­
gious monthlies, there is the Christian 
Miscellany, The Sunday-school Maga­
zine, Early Days and Our Boys and Girls. 
We recommend these to our friends who 
are about giving orders for their reading 
for 1882. The Methodist Temperance 
Magazine, too, well deserves notice.

Coals and Colliers, or How we get the 
Fuel for our Fires, is one of the latest 
publications of T. Woolmer, London. 
Sarah J. Fitzgerald, whose pjn gave us 
“ The Lancasters and their Friends” has 
written this second book, not merely to 
instruct and amuse, but with the higher 
aim of strengthening the bond of union 
between employers and the employed 
and of securing for the men who each 
day descend into the darkness and dan­
ger the sympathy and prayers of Chris­
tian men. It will be a profitable book 
for our Sunday-school libraries. The 
pen of the authoress should not be allow­
ed to rust. Her readers are in­
debted to her for both pleasure and 
pretit.

The Pictorial Commentary on the Gos­
pel according to St. Mark, is published 
by the American Sunday-School Union, 
Philadelphia. The Rev. Edwin W. 
Rice is its editor. As a gentleman of 
large experience in Sunday-school 
work, it may be presumed that he has 
been able to put special emphasis upon 
those points deserving careful attention 
from the teacher, who finds the whole 
series of International Lessons for the 
coining year to be taken from St. 
Mark’s Gospel As a complete com­
mentary upon that Gospel, it will be of 
permanent use when the International 
Lessons are leading students of God’s 
Word into other parts of its wide field. 
Illustrations and maps increase its 
worth as a work of reference.

The numbers of the Living Age for 
the weeks ending December 17th and 
24th, respectively, contain : The Last 
Great Dream of the Crusade, Nineteenth 
Century ; The Decadence of French­
women, Blackwood ; An Athenian Arch­
bishop of the Dark Ages, Fraser : Span­
ish Proverbs, St. James Gazette ; Monos 
Island, Trinidad, Nature ; Fifty Years 
Ago, St. James Gazette ; Country Life in 
Italy, Temple Bar; German Student 
Life, Fraser ; Henry Martyn, Church 
Quarterly ; The Growth and Distribu­
tion of our National Wealth, Economist; 
Thg “ Eccentricities” of the Rich, Spec­
tator ; Dr. Ward on the Divine Pre- 
Movement, Spectator ; The Story of a 
Railway Journey, Temple Bar ; What 
Came of It, Argosy ; The Rev. Jeremi­
ah Thorn, Fraser ; and the usual choice 
poetry.

The next volume begins in January. 
The subscription price (88.00) is low ; 
while for 810.50 the publishers offer to 
send any one of the American 84.00 
monthlies or weeklies with The Living 
Age fur a year, both postpaid. Littell 
& Co., Boston, are the publishers.

Messrs. W. J. Gage & Co., Toronto, 
are justly proud of their new series of 
English Readers, which form a part of 
their excellent Educational Series. The 
two Primers and four Readers are 
bound in strong and attractive form, 
and are rendered interesting by illustra­
tions of a high order. On the more im­
portant subject of their contents it may 
lie said that the editor, Professor Meik- 
lejohn, of tfl£ University of St. An­
drews, an experienced educationist, 
has given his work all possible care. 
The selections in the more advanced 
books are new and varied, chosen from 
history, science, travel, poetry, etc., 
and are calculated to make them of in­
terest even to those whose schooldays 
are over. Hints on the treatment to be 
used in case of accident are wisely giv­
en, and papers and incidents descriptive 
of the evils of intemperance are placed 
before the youthful reader to be inwov­
en with his mental make-up at the most 
suitable period in life. Several articles 
on Canada and Canadians give the 
Readers value in the Dominion. Teach­
ers who may have an opportunity of 
seeing them will not hesitate, we are 
persuaded, to speak of them with ap­
proval

METHODIST NOTES.

Special services at Blanche, in the 
Port La Tour circuit, have led to the 
restoration of wanderers and the conver­
sion of sinners.

Seventy dollars, obtained by a Christ­
mas tree, are to be used in furnishing 
the parsonage at River Philip. The 
pastor received Christmas greetings from 
williamsdale in the shape of a superior 
for cap.

The Sunday-school anniversary of 
the Exmouth St Church, St John, 
held on Sunday last The sermon was 
preachec by the pastor, Rev. H. Mc­
Keown. On Monday each member of 
the infant class received a present from 
the Christmas tree.

On Sunday last the new hymn-book 
was first used in our church at Frederic- 
tion. Aylesford, Lunenburg, Provi­
dence Church—Yarmouth, St. John 8 
Nfld, and Truro, are other places where 
it is being adopted. Delay haa ”en 
caused by the impossibility of meeting 
the immense demand.

Unfavorable weather on two success­
ive evenings prevented the ladies in 
charge of the Tea and Sociable at Sheet 
Harbor from achieving the success their 
earnest efforts deserved. More than 
$50 however were collected, and their 
pastor was encouraged by the harmon­
ious and faithful manner in which they 
worked.

In a brief note dated Hamilton, Dec. 
21st, Rev A. W. Nicolson says: “ Our 
new c hurch is to be opened next week. 
The pews—just double the number in 
the old chnrch—are already all taken, 
except six or seven, and applications 
still come in. The day of opening— 
Thursday, 29th—will be a great day. 
People have engaged steamers from St 
Georges, Port Royal, Sx. Will have 
nine ministers, all being well ”

Several missionary meeting* have re - 
cently been held in the Carbonear Dis­
trict, Nfld. Remarkably tine weather 
was greatly in their favor, permitting 
large audiences to be present. In all 
cases advance was reported in contribu­
tions—in more than one place twice and 

( even three times the amount of last 
year's returns were promised. “ Man­
chesterian” writes to the Harbor Grace 
Standard that he expects the Carbonear 
District will this year contribute not 
leas than $200 more than the previous 
year to the funds of the Missionary So­
ciety.

“8. R. A.” writes from Cornwall 
P. E. L, that the missionary meetings' 
on that circuit were well-attended, and 
speaks in high terms of the aid render­
ed by the deputation,—Messrs. Berrie 
and Steel. Lady collectors are at once 
to begin their work.” On another topic 
the writer says : “ One dollar each
from every member of our Societies, at 
the close of the Week of Prayer, in be­
half of our Domestic missions as an En­
dowment Fund, would bring down the 
blessing of God, and gladness to the 
hearts of hundreds of poorly-paid minis­
ters of Jesus Christ. ”—Rev. J. C. Ber­
rie recently delivered a clear and prac­
tical lecture at Cornwall on “ Habit : 
its formation, power and résulta. ” The 
proceeds were used in adding to the 
comfort of the parsonage parlor.

ABHOAD.
The revival columns in the English 

and American papers bring g>od tidings.
The Wesleyan converts in North Cey­

lon contributed last year an average 
of three dollare per member.

The Board of Education of the Metho­
dist Episcopal Church have appropria­
ted $10,000 for the support of poor col­
lege students.

Mr, J. M. Bennett, of Philadelphia, 
has given nine acres and a building in 
that city fur a Methodist orphanage. 
The ladies have in treasury about $20- 
000 to be used in inaugurating the work.

Evangelistic sendees held at Rhyl, 
Wales, in November in the English 
chapel were followed with blessed results. 
Several conversions are reported and a 
general revival of the work -of God in 
the hearts of the members.

Gov. Lowry, of Mississippi, is a work­
ing Methodist. So also is Lieut.-Gov. 
Shands, who was a delegate to the North 
Mississippi Conference, and was, by 
that body, elected a delegate to the 
next General Conference.

It is estimated, that the Irish Wesley­
an Methodists, between 1853 and 1877, 
have lost by emigration 11,859 out of 
21,000 members. Most of these went 
to the United States. There is a fitness 
in the deputation from the Irish Con­
ference, now in that country, asking aid 
to sustain Methodism in Ireland.

The English Wesleyan Hymn-book 
and New Supplement has been translat­
ed into Tamil—the vernacular of the 
northern part of Ceylon. Every hymn 
in the book has been translated by one 
or other of the missionaries, and the 
whole printed in the native type at our 
mission press in Batticaloa.

Since her return from Europe, Mrs. 
Willing, who was sent by the ladies of 
the Woman’s Foreign Missionary Society 
upon a tour of inspection through the 
Italian cities, has prepared a lecture up­
on “ Our Italian Missions.” The 
branch, of which she is corresponding 
secretary, is to send a lady to Italy 
this year in addition to its other appro­
priations. She hopes by this lecture to 
arouse sufficient added interest in Italy 
to raise the necessary amount. — Western 
Advocate.

The California Advocate of Nor. 30 
has an extended editorial upon the suc­
cessful labors of Rev. Thomas Harrison 
in San Francisco. Over five hundred 
persons have been at the altar as peni­
tents under his labors. D’r. Jewell, 
alone, at the Howard St. Church, has 
already received over a hundred on pro­
bation. Dr. Crary says “ convictions 
on account of sin have been deep and 
pungent. ” Many of the conversions, 
he affirms, have been perfectly clear, 
and the persons “ are now rejoicing in 
God.”

When the English Methodists com­
menced their “ Thanksgiving ” Fund, 
Mr. S. Je veils, of Birmingham, offered 
£1,000. He further promised the sum 
of £9,000, to be devoted to the establish­
ment of an Orphanage in the neighbour­
hood of Birmin g ham, on condition that 
the Committee of the “ Thanksgiving ” 
Fund would add a sum of £10,000 to it 
bringing up the total to £19,000. This 
offer was immediately accepted by the 
Committee. After some delay through 
the heavy financial embarrassment ef 
Wesleyan institutions, the Conference 
Committee of the Children's Home and 
Orphanage met a few weeks ago in 
London, and instructed the local 
Birmingham committee to proceed at 
once with certain parts of the scheme. 
Land lias been purchased. This institu­
tion is to be known as the Princess 
Alice Orphanage.

GLEANINGS ETC.1I _______  _________
I Mr. Ketchum estimates the cost of 
the Chignecto Ship Railway at $8,500,-
000.

The Merchants Bank of P. E. I., has 
declared a dividend of three and a half 
>er cent.

The sexton of the Exmouth Street 
Methodist Church, St. John, N. B., 
ra Monday was presented with 835 by 
Hr. T. Bell on behalf of the second Bi­
ale class and other friends.

The Miller Patent Flanger Company 
of Fredericton, are to introduce their 
ocomotive flanger on the principal 

roads of the United States and Can­
ada. ;

The church and fire bells of Charlotte- | 
x>wn were rung on the arrival of the 
iteamer Prince Edward on the 20th 
nst. The steamer had experienced ter­
rific weather.

In September last, John Mac Arthur, 
of West River, Lot 65,P. E. I., lost two 
children by diphtheria. About a fort­
night ago the dreadful disease reappeared 

id carried off three more of his child-

A despatch from Bathurst states that 
ether silver mine has been discover- 

in Gloucester, about twelve miles 
from the Nigadoo and Gloucester silver 
mines.

The San Francisco News Letter says 
that the distance from China and Ja­
pan via the Pacific Railroad to Liver­
pool will be a thousand miles shorter 
than by any railway starting from San 
Francisco.

A. W. Oliver has been arrested in 
Fredericton on a charge of bigamy. He 
is a carpenter, 46 years of age, and it is 
alleged has a wife and several children 
in Massachusetts. He was married in 
November last to a young lady in Fred­
ericton.

Arthur N. Chambers was crushed to 
death between two cars at RMhmond 
on Saturday afternoon. The vefdiçt of 
the coroner’s jury implies ‘"thatthe ar­
rangement ot the cars was not made 
“ consistently with safety to men work­
ing on the wharf. ”

Seventy-three young ladies and gen­
tlemen are now attending the Halifax 
Business College under the manage­
ment of Messrs. Frazee andJWhiston. 
On Friday evening last each of these 
gentlemen was presented by the pupils 
with a handsome silver ice pitcher and 
mug, accompanying addresses.

Some surprise has been caused by the 
sudden departure of ex-Mayor Ray of 
St. John. He writes from Boston that 
in consequence of the embarrassment of 
his private business affairs he could not 
stay in St. John. The St. John papers 
say that it is understood that the funds 
of the Board of Water Commissioners, 
of which he was chairman, are all right 
as far as he is concerned.

The death of Dr. G. J. Parish took 
place at Yarmouth on the 10th inst., of 
paralysis of tho brain. The Herald 
says, “ In every sphere of public and 
private life, he was distinguished by 
conscientiousness and integrity, and 
was deservedly held in the very highest 
esteem, not only on account of his per­
sonal character, but for his general in­
terest in matters appertaining to the 
public welfare.'”

NEWFOUNDLAND.
The schooner Young Brothers is re­

ported lost with all hands on the way 
from St John's to Codroy. Another 
schooner was lost near Oderin with all 
hands.

Theschr. Emilienne, of Charlottetown, 
was lost at St Jaques’ Point, Fortune 
Bay, on the 2nd inst. Half an hour 
after the seven persons on board had 
been drawn up by the residents to the 
top of the cliff the vessel slipped off the 
rocks and sank out of sight.

A dividend of eight per cent upon the 
paid-up capital stock of the Union Bank 
of Newfoundland has been declared for 
the half year ending Nov. 30tli.

ABROAD.

Twenty-seven English cities and bor­
oughs have had total abstainers as may­
ors during the past year.

A Florentine bank cashier, 70 years 
of age, is a defaulter to the am rant of 
200,UUO lires.

A Chinaman has been appointed to a 
position on the Philadelphia police force 
much to the disgust of the ward politic­
ians.

A German editor has been sentenced 
to four weeks’ imprisonment for refer­
ring to Prince Bismarck’s attitude on 
the anti-Semitic agitation.

The intelligence of the massacre of 
200 young girls by the King of Ashan- 
tee has been confirmed by the report of 
a native of that country who had come 
down to the Gold Coast

The collection of music composed by 
the late Prince Consort is about to be 
published in London by permission of 
his widow. The Queen will receive a 
royalty on the publication

The steamerWest Point, while dis­
charging at West Point, on Y'ork River, 
Richmond, Va., was nearly blown to 
pieces by explosion of kerosene. Nine­
teen persons were killed.

An old and prominent citizen of Ter­
re Haute, I nd., died suddenly on 
Christmas morning in the Congregation­
al church, of which he was one of the 
founders. The organ voluntary, “ I 
know that my Redeemer liveth,” was 
Ik-ing played, when he gave a sudden 
gasp, and before assistance could be of­
fered eat dead in his seat.

In the Guiteau trial on Tuesday, Dr. 
McDonald, Superintendent of the In­
sane Asylum, Ward’s Island, X.Y., sta­
ted his belief that the prisoner was 1 Per­
fectly sane.

The Florida orange crop this vear is 
larger than ever, and the quality super­
ior. The Palatka Journal says that the 
number of oranges will reach nearly 
84.000,000, of which all but 5,000,000 
will be shipped out of the State.

The new five-cent Garfield postage- 
stamp is pronounced by postal officers 
to be the handsomest ever issued. It 
is a vignette of a three-quarter face, 
surrounded by a light and elegant bead- 
work oval. The likeness is {peculiarly 
striking.

Silk culture in Louisiana has of late 
become a thriving industry and prom­
ises an abundant production. The mul­
berry trees have escaped injury by 
frost, and the silk worms are increasing 
in quality and numbers handsomely

A1 though the Baroness Burdett-Coutts 
resigned property in dispute in order to 
avoid litigation, she is allowed by her 
sister two-fifths of the income from 
the bank fund for life. Her income, 
however, is reduced by £75,000 a year.

An alarming revolution is reported 
from Hayti. President Salomon, with 
a strong force, landed at Saint Marc 
and quelled the rising there, after 150 
men were killed on both sides. The 
Government House was sacked and 
other houses burned.

It is said that 5,000 Babylonian tab­
lets (many of them in an excellent state 
of preservation), discovered by Mr. 
Rassam in the mounds of Abu-Habba, 
are on their way to the British Muse­
um. Abu-Habba is the site of Sippara, 
the Sepharva<m of the Old Testament.

Sixteen hundred miles of submarine 
cable, for the Central and South Amer­
ican Telegraph Company, have been 
shipped from London It is expected 
that the United States and Mexico will 
be m direct telegraphic communication 
with Peru and Brazil in June next.

A traveller can now go by rail from 
New York to the border of Mexico. It 
will not be long before the journey can 
be extended to the ancient city of the 
Montezumaa. The distance from Lar­
edo to the City of Mexico is 700 miles, 
and the road is now being built.

The immigration from Germany in 
1882 promises to become more colossal 
than m 1881. Fourteen thousand tick­
ets have already been taken for trans­
portation by vessels leaving Bremen for 
America in the spring. An almost equal 
number of emigrants will leave Ham­
burg.

The cultivation of tea is making ex­
traordinary progress in India. During 
the six months ending Oct. 31st nearly 
27,000,000 pounds were shipped to 
England from the port of Calcutta 
alone. Tea grown in Ceylon is also of 
excellent flavor, but the local demand 
is so great that only a very small quan­
tity is exported.

The Chicago Inter-tXcean says that 
small pox is reported from every quar­
ter of that city, and that there are hun­
dreds of centers of contagion ; it urges 
as the only means of safety, that every 
mai>, woman and child should be fas­
cinated at once. Virulent small-pox 
has broken out in East New York, a 
suburb of Brooklyn. Black diphtheria 
is killing many people in Bloomingdale, 
N. J.

Last week, Frederick A. Palmer, the 
city auditor of Newark, N. J., surren­
dered himself up to the warden of the 
county jail and was locked up, after 
confessing that he had embezzled $126,- 
000 of the city’s money. The confession 
caused much surprise, as Palmer has 
had a good reputation. Others are be­
lieved to be implicated.

During the celebration of high mass 
in a church at Warsaw, on Sunday, a 
man Was seized while picking pockets. 
To effect his escape he cried “ Fire !” 
A great panic seized the congregation. 
The culprit is a Jew. Very serious riot­
ing took place. Most of the Jewish 
liquor shops and many Jewish houses 
were sacked. The deaths so fur from 
the panic in the church number forty. 
Sixty others, mostly women, are wound­
ed.

James Gordon Bennett's yacht, sent 
by him to the Northern seas, whs crush­
ed in the ice, June 11th. The crew 
embarked in three boat*. One with 
eleven men, Engineer Melville com­
manding, reached the mouth of the 
Lena, September 19. Subsequently 
another, with Capt. Delos*, Dr. Am­
bler and twelve men reached the Lena 
in a pitiable condition. The third has 
not been heard from. Bennett thinks 
there will be no further news from the 
.party themselves in less than three 
months, as the telegraph wire does not 
extend beyond Irkutsk.

Miss Reynolds, of the Ladies’ Land 
League, charged with aiding and abet­
ting conspiracy to prevent payment of 
rent, has been bound over to keep the 
peace for six months. In default of 
finding bail she will go to jail for one
month.----- £10,000 have been raised for
the relief of distressed Irish ladies, and
£7,000 for the defence of property.-----
The Dublin Gazette contains a proclama- 

, tion placing the city and county of Dub­
lin and nine other counties under the
Arms’ Act.----- The Pall Mall Gazette
believes it to be substantially true that 
the Government has divided the dis­
turbed localities of Ireland into five or 
six districts, each of which is to be un­
der a superior sort of magistrate, who 
will be able to act without previous su­
perior sanction, and have entire control 
of troops and police, with a view, to 
prompt action in the event of disturb­
ance.
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POETRY.

WHAT TIKE IS IT.

Wbat tirai it it ?
Time to de well—

Time to live better—
Give up that grades—

Answer that letter—
Speak that kind word to sweet*» a sorrow,
Do that good deed you would leave till to­

morrow ;
Time to try hard

In that new situation;
Time to build up on 

A solid foundation.
Giving np needlessly changing and drifting ;
Leaving the quicksands that ever are shifting.

What time is it ?
Time to be tbriftv ;

Farmers take warning—
Plow in the springtime - 

Sow in the morning—
-ring rain is coming, zephys are blowing ; 
leaven will attend to the qnickenii g and grow- 

ing.
Time to count cost—

Lessen expenses—
Time to look well 

To the gates and the fences ;
Making and mending as good workers should ;
Shutting out evil and keeping the good.

What time is it P
Time to be earnest,

Laying up treasure ;
Tims to he thoughtful,

Choosing true pleasure ;
Loving stern justice—of truth being fond ;
Making your word just as good as your bond.

Time to be happy,
Doing your best—

Tims to be trustful,
Leaving the rest,

Knowing in whatever country or clime,
Ne’er can we tall back one minute of time.

Liverpool Kail.

CORRESPONDENCE.

DECEMBER.
December is crowded, above other 

months, with mingled thought, serious, 
joyous, sublime, reflective and antici- 
pative. The stem realities of winter 
nave come. The absence from the 
grove of the warbling throng, and the 
weird-like music of the Northern blast, 
betoken the speedy death of the year. 
The gloom of darkness |stealthily en­
croaches upon the cheerful daylight. 
The sun looks upon ns obliquely from 
the distant south, and bis rays seem 
to have lost their power. The stars, 
as brilliant as ever, more frequently 
greet onr vision. The carpet of the 
earth has changed its color and tex­
ture. How beautiful the snow I It 
■peaks of cleanliness and purity di­
vine. Is it possible'tbat onr moral na­
ture, so deeply stained by sin, can be 
made " whiter than snow.”

Bat what in December brings joy­
ous thought ? Ask the little ones, 
Christmas to them is full of joy. No 
other mouth of the year has so many 
pleasing 'anticipations. As it was 
years ago, when “ the Great Mediator” 
was expected ; so be it now, since He 
has come “ scattering hie gifts on men 
below.” Let us teach our children, by 
our little gifts to them, to think of, 
and highly value God's great gift to 
us.

The interest that gathers and cul­
minates around this commemorative 
period is a constant and pleasing tes­
timony in favor of Christianity. Whe­
ther Dec. 25, was or was not the very 
day on which the Saviour was born, 
18el years ago, is of no consequence, 
since we are sure that the event did 
take place. The fact will never be 
doubted, until good reasons can be 
shewn that the world ought never to 
have had a Christ mas-day. Like the 
Sabbath it will stand, and be observed 
ao long as the Church of Christ remains 
on earth. From this date the obliquity 
of the sun’s rays becomes less, till in 
a few months his “ director ray,” floods 
our hemisphere with all the glories of 
spring. This fact suggests much re­
specting the rising of the “ Sun of 
Righteousness” to bless.

“ The dark world with heavenly light.”
Brilliant rays from the excellent glory 
are now illuminating our world. This 
subject lends a charm, and throws 
around the month a fascination which 
will never fail to arrest human atten­
tion. The subject has not become 
stale by 1881 repetitions. Every year 
it seems to bring nearer the inn, the 
stable, the plains, the shepherds, the 
angels, the song, and the wondrous 
Babe of Bethlehem.

What sacred memeriee cluster here,
December, latest of the year 1

I do not wonder, in view of the ad­
vent of the Son of God, that the holi­
days are fraught with social festivities 
and mental joyousnees. He came to 
make the world happy. Alas 1 that 
innocent recreation and spiritual ex­
hilaration should be turned into wild 
delight and sensuous revelry. Fallen 
human nature is prone to turn good 
into- evil, blessings into curses. Too 
often materials for repentance greatly 
accumulate during the holiday season.

December silently suggests much 
respecting the close of life on earth. 
That period, to each of us, will be of 
thrilling interest. The watch-night of 
life is at hand. Soon will the last look 
be taken, the last farewell spoken, the 
last kiss given, the last tear shed, and 
the last prayer uttered. A Christmas 
interview with Christ is a good pre­
paration to meet him above. Even a 
look upon the infant Jesus enabled 
those who had seen Him to return 
home “ glorifying and praising God.”

G. O. H.
Dec. 15.1881.

of the past, and while so doing, there 
were memories many and precious that 
c»me back to our hearts of devoted 
and faithful ministers of Christ, many 
of whom are “ beyond the river.” The 
first of that olden-time memory was 

, Rev. W. Wilson. The next the gifted 
I and saintly Webb, who, to our child 
! eyes, always seemed to have heaven in 
i bis face. Tben J. B Strong, and next 

in order T. H Davies.—a man wb) 
communed with God, and who by bis 

i eye of faith had glimpses of that land 
of which it is said, “ Eye bath not 
seen.” Once more the itinerant wheel 
turns round, and this time we welcome 
God’s messenger in the person of the 
venerated, loving William Croscombe. 
Other honored names we remember, 
but the years bear us onward to 
the time when Revs. R. Smith and J. 
H. Starr came to us with warm 
b. arts and eloquent words, and whose 
names bave been, and still are, h'be­
hold words. Our grateful hearts 
would pay a tribute to the memory 
of the men whi.se uncomplaining, self- 
sacrificing, consistent lives taught us 
to love so ardently our beloved Metho­
dism. We remember their loving 
counsel, their earnest prayers for our 
welfare, but in all those years, and 
while constantly making my father’s 
house their home, we never remember 
of bearing a remark from one of them 
that would lead us to doubt the infal­
libility of the Stationing Committee. 
Such a thing as ministerial wire-pul­
ling was a thing unheard of. The 
fair or unfair apportionment of the 
mission grant must have been a forbid­
den subject. And *s to the Children s 
Fund, well, if we thought of that at all 
we must have expected the children 
lived by faith as their fathers were 
supposed to do. If the ancient fat h­
ers had grievances like to the brethren 
of the present day they wisely ponder­
ed them in their own hearts instead of 
putting weapons into the hands of 
the enemy. In those early years of 
our life we do not remember of placing 
more than ordinary importance upon 
the Shorter Catechism or the Apostles 
Creed^ but we had an unwritten code, 
upon which we did place implicit con­
fidence, the first article of which was 
that the ministers sent to our circuit 
were the beet men in the Conference, 
and the second article was, that all that 
went to make np a perfect character 
was to be found embodied in our min­
ister. And looking back with the ex­
perience that the years have given us, 
we do not feel that our faith was mis­
placed, for truly they were the living 
epistles of the doctrines they preached.

P. 8. For Rev. J. H- Starr’s informa­
tion we would say, that the house he 
so often honored with his presence and 
prayers h*s been for some years a thing 
of the past (not however the log house 
around which the vine of his memory 
has entwined) and for the very good 
reason that a log house never was there. 
Our romantic tendencies might lead us 
to wish to claim this relic of antiquity 
as ours, but even at the risk of throw­
ing away our last chance as belonging 
to one of the old families, we will have 
to relinquish our claim to so distin­
guished an heirloom.

M. J.

MEMORIAL NOTICES.

THE HEW HOKE.
They are gathering ie another home—

Silently gathering one by oae ;
The circle is largei there than here,

And still they are geiag, oae by one.
We hinder and hold them with clinging hands, 

With hands that can scarcely let them go ; 
But from our clasp into viewless air 

They must vaiish from eur sight, aid go.

We follow their footsteps to this new heme,
Froe dear ones here to loved ones there ; 

There are longiag looks, a sigh, a smile,
As as near the heme of loved ones there.

BLOIS.

sqr.

“ YE OLDEN TIMES.”
Lulled in the countless chambers of the 

brain,
Our thoughts are linked by many a hidden 

chain,
Awake but one, aid eh ! what myriads 

rise !”
Such was our experience while read­

ing in your paper the letter from Rev. 
J. H. Starr. As we perused it we 
found ourselves living over the years

MABSDEN

Died on Tuesday, Nov, 15., in the 
22nd year of his age, of consumption, 
Marsden, 3rd son of H. Blois, Èi 
The Gore.

The deceased was a young man of 
unimpeachable character, and had a 
large circle of friends. At a teacher 
for several terms he won the respect of 
all with whom he associated. He had, 
previous to his illness, studied for two 
terms at the Medical College, Halifax, 
where by his kindly disposition and 
studious habits he made for himself 
many warm friends among the Faculty 
and others.

In Dec., 1880, the fatal disease man­
ifested itself in hemorrhage of the lungs, 
and from that time he seemed to realize 
that hie days were numbered. Then 
he had not experienced a change of 
heart, but through the faithful teach­
ing of Bro Day, my predecessor, who 
visited him regularly, he was led fully 
to accept of Christ as his own Saviour 
and to realize the joy and peace which 
God so graciously gives to those who 
accept of salvation by faith. He glori­
fied God in the furnace of affliction by 
a sweet spirit of resignation, never 
murmuring once during his illness. 
On coming to the circuit last July I 
formed his acquaintance and felt it a 
great privilege to visit him. He was 
cheerful and happy, talking calmly 
and inteligently of death, looking for- 
wai d with joyous anticipation to the 
time of his departure, and longing to 
be with Christ. Several times he spoke 
with regret at not serving God when 
in health, but was overjoyed that God 
had accepted of him. One day while 
talking of God’s love, he said “ Isn’t 
it wonderful, God thus loving me.” 
His eyes filled with tears of joy.

The Sabbath before death, being 
very low—just on the border land— 
while in prayer with the family and 
lifting up our hearts especially on his 
b-half, his face lighted up with a smile, 
end, faintly speaking my name, he 
reached out his poor emaciated hand 
and said, I’m nearly home” and bid

nntil Tuesday evening and, appearing 
to revive a little, turned to hie father 
and said “ I’ll soon be with Jesus,” 
when bis bead dropped and without a 
groan or straggle he fell asleep m 
Jesus, and, we trust, realized that God 
“ giveto bis beloved sleep.”

A large number gathered at the 
funeral to pay their last marks of re­
spect to one whose “sun went down 
while it was yet day.” We endeavour­
ed to improve the occasion by speak­
ing from the triumphant utterance of 
St. Paul, “ Tiiauks be unto God which 
giveth us the victory through our 
Lord Jesus Christ.”

J. W. Shephkbdson.

heney p. bridges, Esq.

of Sheffield, Sun bury Co. died in the 
Lord Doc. 6th, 1881, in the 61st year of 
his age.

Ourdepai ted brother was well known 
to many readers of the WEsLEYAN, 
and the notice of his death will recall 
many memories of earlier days. Many 
who associated with him in other years 
are now living at a distance, and a 
short tribute to the memory of one who 
was known so well and respected so 
much will be looked for by them.

Of his active life we need say but 
little. As a Christian gentleman be 
was held in the highest esteem in the 
community in which be lived. Hie 
sterling integrity and high moral char­
acter can be best expressed by the 
scripture term “ uprightness.’’ He 
was an upright man.” In all his busi­
ness transactions the golden rule of 
doing unto others as ye would that 
others should do unto you,” which in 
the present day is so often forgotten 
by those from whom we would expect 
better things, seemed to become the 
principle which always guided him. 
But, he did not depend on these things 
for salvation. His hope was founded 
entirely on Christ. Those hymns 
which were most expressive of praise 
to the Saviour he loved the best to sing. 
The New Testament Scriptures were his 
delight. Hie experience as a Christian 
was, love to Chnst.

Although for sometime past hie 
health had been failing his end was not 
looked for so soon. His death, sadden 
and unexpected as it was, produced a 
deep sensation throughout the whole 
neighborhood. On the Sabbath pre­
vious to his death he conducted wor­
ship as usual with his family, bet feel­
ing somewhat indisposed, he passed 
the day quietly at home. Little did 
anyone suppose it was his last Sabbath 
on earth. On Monday as he was dress­
ing be fell fainting. Soon afterward 
he became unconscious, and gradually 
sank away until about midnight of 
Tuesday he was no more. With his 
bereaved and sorrowing widow and 
family there is great sympathy. We 
mourn their loss. To say we miss him 
much would be saying little. His ab­
sence from the service of our church 
the Sabbath morning after his death, 
made such a deep impression on the 
minds of those present that it was 
sometimes with difficulty the service 
proceeded. He had been so regular in 
bis attendance, so ready always to take 
an active part in the absence of the 
pastor, and his d-ath so uniouSed for, 
that it seemed almost impossible that 
we should bear his voice and see his 
face no more. Truly the memory 
of the just is blessed*” But while his 
name is no longer called in the service 
of the earthly sanctuary, we believe it 
is joined to the “general assembly and 
Church of the firstborn which is enroll­
ed in Heaven,” What is the honor 
earth can give, beside an earnest 
active Christian life !

Robibt Crisp.

MB. BOBEBT PABKEB.

The subject of this notice was a 
native of Queen’s County, Ireland, but 
came to this country over half a cen­
tury ago. After having spent some 
time on the Miramiohi he came further 
north and settled on the Restigonche. 
Hie sympathies have always been with 
the Methodist Church, of which for 
many years previous to his death he 
was a consistent member. During the 
infancy of our cause here, Bro. Barker 
was one of its principal supporters, and 
up to the time of hie departure he aid­
ed us with hie counsel and means. In 
the latter part of October last he 
contracted a cold which settled 
on hie lungs, and in spite of every 
effort to restore him terminated in hie 
death, on the 21st nit.,at the advanced 
age of 76 years.

From the commencement of hie ill­
ness, Bro. Parker entertained no hope 
of recovery, and frequently asserted 
that he would not linger to see the 
close of November. Through all his 
sufferings he murmured not, but 
calmly awaited the hour whyi the suf­
ferings of earth would terminate, and 
he could enter upon the joy of heaven. 
While in conversation with him, short­
ly before his death, he informed me 
that his feet were upon the sure foun­
dation, and bis. hope of heaven was 
bright.

He has left a sorrowing wife, a large 
family and a number of friends, to 
mourn the loss of a loving husband, a 
kind father and a loyal citizen, Bro. 
Parker will be much missed by ’the 
Church as well as by his family and 
the community, but our loss is ^vifl 
gain. Much sympathy is expressed 
for Sia ter Parker, who after a onion of 
fifty years has sustained the loss of her 
partner in life. The separation will 
only be short. Glorious will the meet­
ing be when on the “ Sweet Eden 
Shore they will meet no more to part.

Cyrus J. Wills. 
Campbellton, N. B,

WILLIAM FOOT.
At Foot’s Cove, Burin, Nov. 22nd 

1881, William Foot departed this life, 
in the sixty-fifth year of his age. He 
had suffered fiom feeble health for 
some years past, and was apparently 
no worse than usual on the morning of 
his death ; indeed he felt himself suf­
ficiently well to accompany his son to 
the fishing ground, about a mile from 
the house. While there be was seized 
with paralysis. Medical assistance 
was called, but too late to be of any 
service ; in three hours he passed away.

He has been a member of the Metho­
dist Church over thirty years, having 
been converted to God during the Rev. 
John Brewster’s minis try on this cir­
cuit. As a Christian he was unassum­
ing, upright and consistent ; as a Me­
thodist he was warmly attached to our 
Church order and means of grace. Tne 
class-meeting especially was prized by 
him to the last. He loved the cause of 
God and supported it to the measure 
of his ability ; one of hie last acts was 
to give a d -nation for the new parson­
age to be erected here.

A sermon was preached at bis funer­
al from 2 Tim. 6: 7- 8, and the presence 
of a large congregation gave pleasing 
evidence of the high esteem in which 
he was held by the co mmnnity.

W. Kendall.
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“ Tommy,” said a mother to her 
seven year old boy, “you must not in- 
terrapt me when I am talking with 
ladies. You must wall till we stop, 
and then you may talk.” “ But you 
never stop,” retorted the boy.

Lord Ellenborough once said to a 
barrister, upon his asking in the midst 
of a boring harangue: “Is it the plea­
sure oi the Court that I should proceed 
with my statement ?” “ Pleasure, Mr.
------, has been out of the question lor
a long time, but you may proceed. ”

The physician wears out more rapid - 
ly than almost any other professional 
man. From a table of statistics, re­
cently published in England, it appears 
that out ol every one thousand medical 
men six hundred die before reaching 
their sixty-second year.

That dilapidated old house alongside 
of the church looks as it it might be 
bought tor a small sum. If purchased 
and repaired it would do tor a parson­
age. Ah! it is already the parsonage ! 
Then, if thoroughly repaired, it would 
be a good parsonage.

A prominent English hatter makes 
the discouraging statement that hatters 
believe the sise of men’s heads have 
undergone a decrease within the last 
thirty or forty years. At any rate, he 
says, more small hats and Sewer large 
ones are sold now than at that time.

Afinely-dres-ed lady slipped and felt 
near the post office yesterday, and the 
gentleman who assisted her to her feel 
inquired, “Did you break any boecs, 
madam?” “No, I guess not.” she re­
plied, “ but I am just as mad as if I 
had broken a dozen ol ’em !”

The Troy Times says : “A Saratoga 
Sunday school teacher asked her pupH s 
yesterday if they could not bring in 
some new scholars. One of them 
promptly replied, “ I can,’ and then, 
with hesitation, added, ‘but he is a 
Democrat.’ ”

When Phineas Rice was a member 
of the General Conference, a memorial 
was presented asking for a rule against 
the use of tobacco. Mr. Rice rose, and 
moved that it be referred to the Com­
mittee on Slavery, which was gravely 
and, so far as the words were concern­
ed, not inappropriately done.

The publisher of 44 Bradshaw," the 
famous English railway guide, was a 
Mr. Adams, who died in London a 
month ago. He was a modest, retiring 
man, and tew people knew that he was 
a diligent student of Schopenhauer, and 
that when he left Fleet Street his even­
ings were devoted to the study of 
German philosophy.

What a deal of inconvenience and 
loss to others is occasioned by the man 
who does not perform his engagements! 
A case came under our notice this 
week in which forty individuals were 
delayed ia the commencement of their 
daily labor, and other damage caused, 
just by the omission on the part of one 
person to keep an appointment. Why 
allow considerations ot self-interest, or 
any other, to lead us away from the 
fulfilment of a pledged word ?— H. 0. 
Standard.

DICTIONARY OF ENGLISH LITER.! 
TUBE ; a comprehensive guide to Eng­
lish Authors and their Works. Bv \V. 
Davenport Adams. 25

A HAND BOOK OF THE ENGLISH 
LANGUAGE. By R G Latham, m i>., 
r.K.s i 75

SOCIALISM ; Lectures by Joseph Cook .50 
LABOUR; Lectures by Joseph Cook .50 
CURIOSITIES OF THE BIBLE, with 

Bluekboard or Slate Illustrations, Bible 
Studies, Concert Exercise», Etc., and an 
Introduction by Rev. J. H. Vincent, d.d.

1.75
BIBLICAL MLSEUM, \ ol. 10, containing 

Daniel, and the Minor Prophets 1.60
THE FUTURE L.FE ; a Defence of the

Orthodox View. By the most eminent 
American Scholars. x.10

AN INQUIRY INTO THE SCRIPTURE 
Doctrine concerning the duration of Fu­
ture Punishment. By Matthew Horberv, 
b.d. Reprinted from the edition of 1744

1.20
THE CONSTITUTION AND POLITY OF 

Wesleyan Methodises ; being a Digest of 
its Laws and Institutions, brought down 
to the Conference of 1880. By Rev. 
Henry W. Williams, i> d 1.10

PASSAGES FROM THE DIARY OF AN 
Early Methodist. By the late Richard 
Rowe 1 20

THE CLOUDS OF THE BIBLE. By 
Alexander Wallace, D.rx. 85

THE MODEL LIFE, and other discourses, 
By Alexander Wallace, d.d. 85

ELIJAH THE PROPHET. By Rev. Wm 
M, Taylor d d. 85

HEROES OF FAITH, as delineated in He­
brews. By Rev John Guthrie, ma dd 65 

ADAM, NOAH, and ABRAHAM; Readings 
in the book of Genesis. By Rev. Joseph 
Parker, dd. 00

ISAAC, JACOB, and JOSEPH. By Marcus 
Dods, d d. 1.10

THE LIFE OF DAVID as reflected in his 
Psalms. By Alexander MacLarcn.DDl.10

Cabinet of Biography.
GREAT SCHOLARS.—Buchanan, Bently, 

Poyson, Parr, and others. By H. J. 
Nidholl. 75

GREAT NOVELISTS —Scott, Thackeray 
Dickens, Lytton. By J. Crabb Watt. To 

GREAT ORATORS-—Burke, Fox, Sheridan 
Pitt. By H, J, Nicholl. 75

MASTERS IN HISTORY —Gibbon, G rote, 
Macaulay, Motley, By Bev, Peter 
Anton. 75

THOMAS CARLYLE.—By Henry James 
Nicholl 75

Do paper cover 30

Cassell’s Cheap Library.
HISTORY OF THE FREE TRADE MOVE- 

ment in England, By Augustus

THESCOTTISH COVENANTERS. By 
Jas. Taylor, D D 30

BOSWELL & JOHNSTON: THEIROOM- 
panions and Contemporaries. By J. T. 
Waller, ll d. 30

THE REV. ROWLAND HILL, PREACH- 
er and Wit By Edward W. Broome. 30 

DOMESTIC FOLK-LORE. By T. F, T.
Dyer, ma 30

THE STORY OF THE ENGLISH JACO 
bins. Edward Smith, F s s. 30

JOHN WESLEY. By Rev. R. Green. 30

D RYSALTERs
HALIFAX, x. s.

Warehouse and Counting-roc».

COR. DUKE & ...smns
Steam Mill and Stores 

TOBIN'S WHABF.

AVERY’S

BALSAMIC SYRUP
Can be 'confidently recomm.uvl«x „ 1tiy recommended

efficacious remedy 
This]

* » en. 
"tot

Mon- 
31 

By

pleasant and
coughs, colds, etc., etc. mis prep*™*. ^ 
pounded Iront the prescription of IW i"* 
has been in use for over 30 years 
unvary ing success. Convinced by w 
thorough a trial, of its great supmoh v^T 
various nostrums so persistently advmLi 
bave determined to pat it more pronZÆ 
before the public. Once known it i. 
used as the e,*fl

FAMILY C0ÜBH MEDIC®
being more palatable as well as more 
than any of the advertised COUGH RFWt 
DIES, and both better and cheaper H»«.n— 
commonly dispensed by Druggists.

Price, 25 Cents Per Bettis
Of Druggists and general dealers throothotf 
the Provinces. 8 ^

BBOWN&WEBB
PROPRIETORS.

HENRY W. 0. B0AK,
Barris.er and Attorney-at-Law, 

Solicitor, Notary Public, Etc. 
Office : Queen Buildings

177 Hollis Street,
- TU.jâ.

COLLECTIONS made in all parts ot the 
Dominion, the United States, and England.

Solicitor at Halifax of the American Law 
Association. Ug 12 ly

Thelwell thought it very unfair to in­
fluence a child’s mind by inculcating 
any opinions before it should come to 
years of discretion and be able to choose 
ior itself. 41 shewed him my gar­
den,’ said Coleridge, 4 and told him it 
was my botanical garden.’ 1 Hownv _ ___
so ?’ said he. 4 It is covered with weeds.’ 
“ ‘ O,’ I replied, 4 that is because it has 
not come t* its age of discretion and 
choice. The weeds, yon see, have 
taken the liberty to grow, and I thought 
it unfair to prejudice the soil toward 
roses and strawberries.’

Here is a sweet bit of consolation for 
those newspaper mea who are constant­
ly accused of misrepresentation : Tho­
mas Bradley of the Sydney Legislature 
found fault with the newspaper report­
ers on the ground that they did not give 
the speeches accurately. Therefore 
they took great pains to report his re­
marks verbatim. The following is the 
passage : “The reporters ought not to 
—the reporters ought not to be the ones 
to judge ot what is important—not I to 
say what should be left out—bub—the 
member can only judge of what is im- I 
portant. As I—as my speeches—as the ! 
reports—as what I say is reported 
sometimes, no one—nobody can under- | 
stand irom the reports—what it is— 
what I mean.”

.............. ..............ijr .UIB, ana bld . ^better to say, “ This one thing
H.W «4.SS aAî.’ïbSX*’

AGENTS WANTED for the Best and Fastest 
M Selling Pictoria Books and Bibles. Prices 
reduced 33 per cent. National Publishing 
Co.. Phils., Pa. jan 21—ly

CORNER GRANVILLE & SACKVILLB 
STREETS.

NOVA SCOTIA

Made Paper Bap Manalactorj
The Cheapest in the* Market.

SEND * OR PRICE LIST.

ALSO

BOOK BINDING
IN ALL ITS BRANCHES.

G. A T. PHILLIPS.

B0BBBT WALLACE,
194 UPPER WATER STREET.

IMPORTS* AMD DSA1SB IN

WATCHES, CLOCKS & JEWELRY,
Of which he has a great variety and will sell 

at LOWEST CASH PRICES.
REPAIRING AND CLEANING WATCHES

executed on the premises by experienced work* 
men. All work guaranteed.

AGENCY FOR 
The Genuine Will lame Singer d New William 

SEWING MACHINES. 
Bead the Record of Sepfr. Trophies.

At Toron)» Permanent Exhibition, open to 
the world, Sept. 14, 1881, » first class medal 
was awarded. The only prize given for Family 
Sewing Machines.

At Montreal Permanent Exhibition, open to 
the worLA a Fir»t Claes Medal and two Diplo­
mas were awarded. The only prizes gi sen for 
Sewing Machines, Sept. 31st, 1881.

At Kingston, Ont., Agricultural and. Indus­
trial Fair, Sept. 22nd, 1881, a First Prize was 
awarded. The only prise given to Sewing Mac­
hines.

At Halifax Dominion Exhibition, Sept. 26th, 
1881, a Diploma for best Sewing Muehiues for 
maau/acturing were awarded. The only prizes 
given for Family aid Manufacturing Sewing 
Machines.

KNÂBË
PIANOFORTES

UNEQUALLED IN
’one, Touch, Workmanship <6Durability

Noe. 204 aiul 206*$Aist Baltimore Sti Baltimore. 
No. 112 Fifth Avenue New York.

Universal Pills
(SUGAR 00ÀTEZX)

Are composed of the beet Alterative, LaxaSw 
and Cathartic Medicines, combined in a Mi*, 
tific and skilful manner, according te thsaetioa 
of the diflbrent drugs upon the aiflbrwt petti 
of the alimentary canal and other ergnm.

The proprietors claim for these pills a ■apri­
ority over very- many others of a similar m. 
are, because in them a number of wall knsn 

a ad standard medicines of the pkmsaeepeil 
are so combined and in such p repartions, thri 
although their action begins in the itnmaik. # 
by no means ends there, but extends to the 
liver, pancreas, lacteal glands, Ac., so that ob­
structions in any Of these will generally k 
overcome by their proper use and thns peeper 
iSgestion and healthy blood produced.

They are not a quack medicine in say wan, 
unless science and skill are quackery, for adm- 
tage has been taken in their prepetition of thl 
learning and experience of eminent phyticiaat 
and pharmaceutists.

PREPARED BT

BROWN & WEBB
AND SOLD BY

Druggists and Medicine Dealer! 
Generally.

PRICE, 25 CENTS PER BOX.
BROWN 6 WEBB’S

CRAMP » PAIR COR!
No 44 Painkiller,” however boldly advertised 

surpasses this Standard Preparation for Us 
relief of the class of symptoms for which sock 
remedies are so much need.

For CRAMPS and PAINS in 
the STOMACH, BOWELS or 
SIDE; SORE THROAT,

RHEUMATISM,
LUMBAGO,

SCIATICA, 
NEURALGIA, 

CHILBLAINS, 
FROST BITES, 

CHOLERA, 
DIÀRRHŒA,

Ac., Ac#

relief and frequent cure. It* 
scient, and anodyne qoahtit»

It ia an unfailin
stimulant, rubel ___
adapt it to a large class of disorders, and 
it a. most valuable

Family Medicine
PREPARED BY

BRO WN& WEBB
AND SOLD BY

Druggists and Medicine Dealers

PRICE, 25 CENTS PER BOTTLE
BBOWN 4 WEBB’S

FLAVORING
EXTRACTS

Are unequal leu for strength and purity rf 
flavor by any imported braid. They are inade 
from the purest and choicest materials, with do 
inferior or factitious admixture, and need 
only a trial to show their great superiority to 
the flavors commonly sold in the shops.

PRICE, 25 CENTS PER BOTTLE.

M your Grocer for Thm;

ÿsnufaci

MACHINER]

PttMic

Steam
HOT

Cast

puMr|
SOI

Fate:

FUR|

A. 8TI
HALII

The Ohea$ 
the

We always k^ 
ASSORTED i

FABLOB
we make a flp< 
Beet Styles on I

CHEAP]
SPRING

Of all kinds In In 
AND RETAIL.

HXADQUJ
In this Hne 

market.

WHOI

EDDY’S
A Full Stock! 

If you want 
WARK ol any I 
our Stock an<l | 

Orders or enq| 
prompt and <

A. STI
101 £ 1US 
34, 36 A

July 20.

GLA1
Gusto:

MannÊ
CLOTHS&|

’ 11 Jacob

Good Black 
to order...I 

Serviceable, a I 
made to «re 

Very Fine, do| 
A very 

which we i 
order at *4.7».
march 11—ly

JU

method!
A

T
adapted to
COMPILEI

Small quarto, 
cloth, boar!

«u , «I
■ample copy 

Address

WILL]
Methodist Book! 

<8 A 8U Kl
c]

Montreal Iiook-
3

S.
Methodist Book

i

93



THE WESLEYAN, FRIDAY, DECEMBER 30, 1881.

& WEBB
Wished 1824.) °

esale

.gists
merchants

AND

alters
'-'X, X. s.

■nd Counting-room-

‘ HOLLIS STREETS
and Stores

S WHARF.

ERY’S .

KlC SYRUP
recommended lg .

r'ious remedy for ™°*'
e,°- Tbis Preparation ^ 

frescription of Dr A»!, 
over 80 years, tad ihtL’ 
Conn need by so loos tad

ts Sreat -upenorityioth. 
persistently advertised «

knom,°nreupr^

m MEDIGDU
as well as more efficacious 
ertised COUGH REkreî 
-ami cheaper than the»

F Druggists.

nts Per Bottle
enefal dealers thronghoat

tf&WEBB
tIETORS.

sal Fills
COATED.)

heat Alterative. Laxative
nes. combined in a i
er, according to the action 
i upon the different parts 
.1 and other organs.
m for these pills s su peri* 

others of a similar na. 
a number of well known 

es of the pharmacopesia 
l such proportions, that 
begins in the stomach, it 
1ère, but extends to the 
glands, Ac., so that oh* 
these will generally be 

>er use and thus proper 
'blood produced.

medicine in any sense, 
are quackery, for ad ran- 
their prepat ation of the 
of eminent physicians

RED BT

& WEBB
>LD BY

Medicine Dealers 
rally.

ITS PER BOX.
I WEBB’S

>AIN CURE
er boldly advertised 
Preparation for the 
oms for which inch

nd PAINS in 
BOWELS or 
EtOAT,
2UMATISM,

GrIA,
AI NS,
? BITES,
LERA,
ARR/BTflgA,

Ac.. &c>
id frequent cure. _ Its 
ad anodyne quality* 

disorders, and make

Æedicine
D BY

WEBB
D BY

edicine Dealers

PER BOTTLE.
WEBB’S

NG
RACTS

gth and purity of 
isd. They are made 
»t materials, with no 
Imixture, and need 
great superiority to 
in the shops.

PER BOTTLE.

rfor Them |

dongard BROS,
213 HOLLIS STREET, HALIFAX, N.S.

MACHINISTS, steam and hot water engineers.
COPPERSMITHS, PLUMBERS, Etc.

Manufacturers of all kinds of Brass and Copper Work
for Engineers', Plumbers’, and Vessels Use.

TUB

ALSO

UCHWERY FOR _ _ _ , MINES, FACTORIES, STEAM PRINTING
OFFICES, ETC., MADE AND FITTED UP.

pullic Buildings, Mmiclies, Factories and Residences
SUPPLIED WITH

Steam and Hot Water Heating Apparatus.
hot AIR FURNACES & PLUMBING FIXTURES.

IMPORTERS OF

Cast and Wrought Iron Pipes and Fittings,

PUMPS, SHEET LEAD, LEAD PIPE, Etc., Etc.
SOLE PROPRIE FOBS AND MANUFACTURE ’

Patent Improved Hot Water Boiler.
FOR WARMING BUILDINGS.

FURNITURE!
A. STEPHEN & SON,

HALI 3PA.3 3ST. s.

the Cheapest First-class House in 
the Lower Provinces.

We always keep the LARGEST AND BEST- 
ASSORTED STOCK to be found anywhere.

PABLOB k CHAMBER SETTS
we make a Specialty of. All the Latest and 
Best Styles on hand and made to order.

CHEAP FURNITURE,
SPRING BEDS AND BEDDING

of all kinds in immense variety, WHOLESALE 
AMD RETAIL.

HEATQUABTZBfr' FOB BROOMS.
In this line we have the best vaine In the 

market.

WHOLESALE AGENTS FOR

! EDDY’S WOODENWAREI
A Full Stock of Every Line always on hand. 

If yon want FURNITURE OR WOODEN 
WARE ol anv kind, don’t buy till you inspect 
our Stock and get our prices.

Orders or enquiries by mail will receive our 
prompt and careful attention.

A. STEPHEN AND SON,
101 £ 103 BARRINGTON STREET, 
SI SG & S3 B RINCE STREET,

July 29.

CLAYTON & SONS, 
Custom Tailoring

Manufacturing Clothiers,
IMPORTERS OF

CLOTHS & TAILORS’
11 Jacob St., - - Halifax, N.S.

Good Black Broadcloth Suit, made
to order........................................... $22 76

Serviceable, all Wool, Tweed Suit,
made to order......................... . 16 00

Very Fine, do., do., made to order...- 17 76 
A very large assortment of roods from 

which we make our Celebrated Troweers to 
order at $4.76.

CLAYTON A SONS.
earth 11—ly

JUST ISSUED

METHODIST TUBE-BOOL
A COLLECTION OF

TUNES
ADAPTED TO THE METHODIST HYMN-TOOL

COMPILED BY A COMMITTEE,

Stntll quarto, 300 pages, strongly bound in 
cloth, boards, net price per single copy 

$1 ; per dozen, $10.
Sample copy mailed, post free, on receipt of $1 

Address

WILLIAM BRIGGS,
Methodist Book Room & Publishing House,

"» & 80 King street East, Tobosto, Out.

C. W. COATES,
Montreal Book-Room,

3 BifUiy Street, MosTBBiX, Que.

S. F. IIUKSTIS,
Methodist Book-Boom, ‘ '

111 (iianville St.,Halifax, X.S

WILLIAM CROWE
IMPORTER Of

ANDALUSIAN,
SHETLAND.

MERINO,
WELSH,

FLEECY, and

BERLIN WOOLS
----- AND-----

SCOTCH Y AMTS.
Fillosell, Floss, Embroidering Silk, Linen Flos. 
Silk, Mohair, Worsted and Cotton Braids; 
Stamped Strips, Yokes and Toilet Sets ; Ceu- 
va», Cloth, Velvet and Kid Slippers ; Fancy 
Work of all kinds, with Materials ; Work 
Boxe* ; Jewel Cases, Glove and Handkerchief 
Sets ; Cardboard Mottoes ; White, Black, 
Colored, and Gold and Silver Cardboard ; 
Fancy Baskets ;
Bracket Saw Frames ; Sorrento, 

Fleetwood and Dexter Foot Saws ; 
Walnut, Holly, Rosewood, 

etc., for Amateur Fret 
Sawyers.

133 BARRHHTOIf STREET,
DEALER IN

Sewincr Machines
ALL KINDS OF

MACHINE NEEDLES
SENT BY MAIL TO ANY PART 

OF THE PROVINCES.

AGENCY FOR

Mme. Demorest’s Patterns ol 
Ladies’ and Children’s 

tiarments.
CATALOGUES
OF WHICH WILL BE MAILED FREE.

WILLIAM CROWE,
133 Barrington Street,

HALIFAX, IT. S.
march A 1880—ly

CLINTON H. 1ENEELY BELL CO.,
successes to

ME NEELY A KIMBERLY,
BELL FOUNDERS,

______ r, 3WJUW yto:
Manufacture a superiorquantity of BRLLjj. 
Special attention given te CHUBC HBKLLS. 

Illustrated Catalogues sent fres.

Boston hair store,
—Established 1873.—

BARRINGTON ST.. HALIFAX, N.S.
MANUFACTURERS OF

REAL HAIR GOODS.

METHODIST BOOK ROOM,
141 «BANVILLE STREET, HALIFAX, N.S.

REVIEWS.

HAIR SWITCHES
FROM

ONE DOLLAR TO TEN DOLLARS.

The London Quarterly. 
Theological Quarterly..

.$6 66 
.. 250

Methodist Quarterly (New York)......... 3 00
Homiletic Quarterly.................................  2 30

MAGAZINES.

LINEN AND MOHAIR BBAILS.

Wool Puffs & Jute Switches.

Wholesale and Retail.
AGENTS POR

BUTTERICK’S PATTERNS
The most reliable and most popular patterns 

in the World

NEW PATTEBNS EVSEY MONTH.
Catalogues free on receipt of Stamps to pay 

postage.

AND PATTERNS MAILED ANYWHERE
on receipt of price.

BERLIN WOOL
only seven cents per dozen.

OPPOSITE ST. PAUL’S CHURCH.
Halifax, N.S.

R. J. SWEET,
Importer A Wholesale Dealer

OFFERS FOB BALE TBBT SUPERIOR

Homiletic Monthly................................   50
Canadian Methodist Magazine, a beauti­

fully illustrated monthly, edited by the 
Rev W H Withrow

English Methodist Magazine....................
Harper’s Magazine...................................
Century Magazine.............................
Sunday at Home................................... *
Leisure Hour.........................   1^5
Boy’s Own Paper (Monthly Parts) .... 1 <5

2 00 
1 75 
4 00 
4 00

Girl’s Own Paper.....................................
Chambers’ Journal..................................
Good Words..............................................
Golden Hours...........................................
The Quiver...............................................
Little Folks...............................................
C.hatterbox-.............- ......
Christian Miscellany and Family Visitor 
S S Magazine and "Journal of Christian 

Education

1 75
2 40 
1 75 
1 75 
1 75 
1 75

90
65

65

MONTHLY ILLUSTRATED PAPERS.
N.B.—The following arc the prices when five papers or upwards, of one or different 

kinds, are sent to one address including postage paid at Halifax. When less than five pa­
pers are ordered, to one address, six cents additional each per annum will be charged, for 
one paper ten centa additional.

British Workman.....
“ Workwoman.. 

Cottager and Artizan.
Sunshine...................
Early Days 
Child’s ~

cento 
... 28 
.. 28 
... 28 
... 28 
... 28

Companion.......... .. .... ........ 28
• Friend........................................ ...

Family Friend..............................................28

cents.
Sunbeam, semi monthly, single copy......... 15

20 copies and upwirds^each..................12
American Messenger....J.J........................ 20
Good Words.......................................  16
Our Boys and Girls.......................................14
Band of Hope Review................................... 14
Morning Light.............................................. 14
At Home and Abroad........ ............ 14
Children’s Messenger................................. ...
Youth’s Temperance Banner.........................14
Good Cheer.................................................. ..
Old and Young............................................  5

EXTRA FINE IN FLAVOUR

REFINED SUGARS
From Moncton, Montreal, and Glasgow, GB

Very Bright Demerara Molasses

W. W. McLBLLAN, 
Barrister, Attorney-at-Law 

OOHVBYAHOBB, *c., Ac. 
171 Hollla ■*»••*,

HALIFAX, N. 8.

Money collected in all parts ol the Province 
and prompt returns made Instruction» faith­
fullyobserved. )»n 16—ly

MENBELY BELL FOUNDRY
ESTABLISHED 1838.

-------- 1
Bells for all purposes. Warranted satisfac­

tory and durable.
• MENKELY A CO.,

I860 West T N. Y.

70 your name “TJiffirlOe
new sO"lcsi by best rt'sts : fiougnete, Birds, 
Gold Chromos, Lar. capst, Water Scenes, J-c 
—no two alike. A rent’s Complete Sample 
Book, 25cts. Great /ariety Advertising and 
Bevel Edge Cards. Lowest prices to dealers 
and printers. 100 Sam idea fancy Advertis­
ing Curds, 50cts. Address

STEVENS BROS.,
Box 22, Northford,.C

J. ksnuawa,
Cor. Dttki ihd Hollis Sis., Halifax, N.S. 

jan 14—ly

WOODBURY BROS.,
DENTISTS, NEW YORK.

DR. H. WOODBURY
Graduate gf Tkiladelpkia Dental College.

Office over T. F. Conelly’s Book Store
corner of

GEORGE & GRANVILLE ST 
Halifax, N.S.

JOHN M. QELDEET, Jr., LL.B.,
Attorney-at-Law Netary Public, Commis 

sioner Supreme Court, fee. fee.
Has resumed practice on his own account.

No. 42 BEDFORD ROW.
Money collected, ind all the branches of legal 

buaineea carefully attended to.

JOHN WOODS & SOHV
SHIP OWNERS

IMPORTERS OF STEAM AND HOUSE 
HOLD

CONSIGNMENTS CAREFULLY ATTEND- 
TED TO.

WATER ST., EAST. 
ST. JOHN’S, NEWFOUNDL’D

JOBS WOODS JR B WOODS

RMANUFACTURERS AND IMPORTERS 
* or

GENTS AND YOUTHS’
FINE HATS 6 FURS. 

STR4W HITS
For Men and Boys, in leading styles.

Clerical Hats.
Silk Hats made to Order.

Orders from the Country promptly attended ts 
—per Express— C. O. D.

98 King Street, THORNE BROS.,
St John, N.B. Hatters and Furrier».

I.&F. BURPEE&Co,
IRON,

STEEL,
TIN PLATE,

AND

GENERAL METAL MERCHANTS,

Children’]
Family F 
Friendly Visitor.
Infant’s Magazine........................ • ..........28
Pleasant Honrs, semi-monthly, single copy 30

less than 20 copies................................ 26
20 copies and upwards........................... 22

THE SUNDAY SCHOOL BANNER.
Which Is an 8vo. 32 page Monthly, edited by the Rev. W. H. Withrow. It contains Notes 
and Illustrations on the International Sunday School Lessons, Infant Class and Black Board 
Lessons, Music, Articles on Sunda> School Work and many other hints and helps for Sup­
erintendents and Teaehers. Price, single copy per year, 65 cento ; Six copies and upwards 60

THE BEREAN LESSON LEAF.
For Scholars, monthly, 4 pp.. containing Lessons for a month, with Subject, Topic, Golden 
Teit, Home Readings, Parallel Passages, Outline and questions. Price per year in parcels 
oi ten or more, five and a half cento each.

THE CANADIAN SCHOLAR’S QUARTERLY.
This new help will contain, in addition te the Lesson, three Hymns for each Sunday, select­

ed from the new Hymn Book, and a Map Price in parcels of 10 or more, 8 cento per year.
sgfAIl orders te secure attention muet be accompanied by a P. O. Order, pagakle te the un­

dersigned, or by Cask in Registered tetter, to the amount of the Subscription price of the 
articles ordered.

The names of parties and of the Town or Poet OSes, County and Province to which the 
parcels are to be sent should in all cases be vary plainly written.

Orders for renewal, as well as for New Subscribers, should be sent in at once or at the 
latest by the end of November, in order to secure the first numbers in rood season. Sub­
scriptions, however, will be received at any time, and the periodicals will be sent as soon 
as possible thereafter.

AIDS TO THE STUDY OF THE INTERNATIONAL LESSONS.

Notes on the International Lessons for 1882,
WITH HINTS AND TALKS TO TEACHERS.

Bt Rev J H Vincent, d d, and Rev J L Hürlbut, m a

ILLUSTRATED WITH MORE THAN ONE HUNDRED ENGRAVINGS.
Bible Lessons in both Old & New Versions. 8 vo. Cloth Illustrated................... 41.26

THE . LESSON BOOKS FOR 1882.
Bt Rev J H Vincent, d d, and Rev J L Hürlbut, m a. 

ELEGANTLY ILLUSTRATED WITH CUTS AND MAPS.

THREE GRADES.

No. 1 Senior Classes.................................  15c I No. 3 Beginners’ Classes........................... 16c
No. 2 Intermediate Classes....................... 15c | Interleaved Edition.................. ................ 35c

THE GOSPEL OF MARK
FROM THE TEACHERS EDITION OF THE REVISED NEW TESTAMENT.

It will have the marginal references printed at length as a Commentary on the Text in 
Biblb Languages. It will contain in the margins the “ Readings and Renderings pre­
ferred by the American Committee,” which are printed in the Appendix of the English 
edition ; also the marginal notes and alternate readings of the Oxford edition, printed as 
foot-notes on each page. .... . „Mark’s Celebrated Bird b-Etb Map of Palestine, showing the hills, valleys, etc., 
and one or two other excellent mane, will be bound in this edition.

. The List of Lessons for 1882, wire the Golden Texts, will be given ; together with

General Coiisaoi Hercbants,
Price in Manilla 8vo. 15 cents ; Boards 50 cents.

TBS
NEW, VIGOROUS, PRACTICAL.

10XB8 WINDOW GLASS 4 Ton. PUT IT too Dozen SHOVELS 
M Casks PAINT OIL KM Bbie. WHIT1XO

Nov 25 ly
ST. JOHN, X.B.

MANCHESTER, ROBERTSON
- AND ALLISON,
IMPOKTKRS OF

DRY GOODS
AND

MILLINERY
OF EVERY DESCRIPTION

WHOLlSaL a,, d RETi L.

MANUFACTURERS OF SHILTS
OF ALL KINDS, AN

LABIES UNDERCLOTHING.

27 and 29 KING STREET,
SAINT JOHN, N.B.

ANDERSON, BILLING ft Co.,
Beg to inform their Friends and the Trade 
generally, that their

British,
Continental,

American,
and Domestic Dry Goods,

18 NOW COMPLETE.
WAREHOUSES:

111 & 113 GRANVILLE ST,
HALIFAX, N.S.

WILLIAM F. PICKERING
MERCHANT

TAILOR
PRIO HI :

Suits to Obdib........ 114.00 to $32.00
Pants................................. $400 to #6.00
Pants and Vests....... $6.00 to $12.00
OviacoATs................................ $10.00 to $25.00
Bums.......................................$8.00 to $18.00
Ulstnbs......................................$12.60 to $26.00

Call and Examine,
AND COMPARE PRICES AND 

QUALITY OP GOODS, BEFORE 
LEAVING YOUR ORDERS 

ELSEWHERE.

Perfect Satisfaction Guaranteed 
IN ALL CASES.

ADDRESS :

193 Brunswick 6 .eat
(FOOT OF COOSWELL BT.)

HALIFAX, N.S.
Jan 7—ly

A Critical, Exegctical and Homiletical Treatment of the 8 8 Lesson» for 1882 for the use 
of Teachers, Pastors and Parente.

BY REV D C HUGHES.
Editor of the International Sunday-School Lesson Department of the “ Preacher and

Homiletic Monthly. **

PRICE—Paper 60c. : Cloth Boards $1.

THE COMMENTARY FOR SCHOOLS
“ L
EDITED BY BISHOP ELLICOTT,

the GOSPEL ACCORDING TO ST. MARK.
by bbv. B. H. PLÜMPTRE, d. d.

With Colored Map - ..................................... Price $1.00.

fâlu^mportations I

CLARKE, KERR & THORNE,
Respectfully invite attention te their Week of Mnrdsmre, Cnttlery. Paints, Fancy Good», 

etc-, now Received and Offered for Sale at Lowest Market late»,

FALL & WINTER GOODS
OOMSKAir * Co.,

Have just received from Christy A Co., and 
Bennett, of London, and Blair A Co., of
Glasgow,

A FINE ASSORTMENT OF

Gents’, Youths’ A Boys’ Hats,
Latest Styles, and all prices, in Soft and 

Stiff Fet, Tweed, Ac.
ALSO

Also a large and well assorted

STOCK OF FUR,
(From London and Montreal)

FOR
Ladies, Gents, and Children,
Including Ladies Mantles liaed with Grey 
Squirrel—Grey and White and other Furs. 
Ladies Fur Jacket, in South Sea Seal, Baltic 
Seal and Astrachaa. Also Lediea Fine South 
Sea Seal Setu, Fur Trimmings, Etc., etc
TRUNKS, VALISES, UMBRELLAS, Ac.

WHOLESALE AND RETAIL

143 Granville.St, Halifax.
ept 16 ( f ^3Y April 8. 1 yr

ill

ples.lv

»
______________ lot
ehaage the blood lr

’ make New 1
Blood, and srtii —_____.___
the eottrneratpu In three iranths. Any pwver 

Itakel pilleeehnlghtfromlloll

2 000 Bc_ _ _ _ _ _ _  _ _ _ _ _ _ _ft Cues VARNISH, Noble ft Hoare’e and other makes » To»» ORINDSTONES 
SO Case. ZINC SO Caw. TUBULAR LANTERNS 16 Tone ROPE 
10 Ton.Brandram’* WHITE LEAD 600 PUTS and BAKE PANS 
S Caaka FILES 300 Dozen AXES 30 Caw’s ALLE tiRKASk 

800 Kegs BLASTING POWDER 500 Bags SHOT 100 Kegs SPORTING POWDER 
200 Dozen BROOMS 25 Cases SPORTING POWDER 50 1>. zen COAL SCUTTLES 
10Tone CABLE CHAINS 10 Larks CHAIN TRACES IV D >zen COAL SHOVELS 
25 Cases COTTON CARD 10Casks Table andF<<-ket KNIVES 100 REVOLV LKS 
8 Cases CARTRIDGES ROSIN PITCH TURPENTINE, Ac.

10 Casks and Cases FRENCH KANCV GOODS
11 Casks sml Caws AMERICAN FAN* V GOODS
15 Cases and Casks GERMAN FANCY GOODS V. C.i«"= V»T PLATED WARE 
09 Packages American SHELF^I.xRDWARE 52 I’a< k ./• - l..-gli*li SIIEI.E IIARDVV ARE

GIVE US A GALL BEFORE PURCHASING, AND INSPECT Ol;; vARIETV Of VALUABLE GOODS.
Cli^-KBEE, ÜJBILEI <Sr THORiVI

42 and44 Prince William Street, St. Jolm, X. B.

who will twee i pit* —-
may be TStlarri te sound health. I f such a thiaj 
bejXMclble. Beat by mail for • letter stamp*.
»Zs. JOBNMOM * CO* > Jfcm.

fermertp Jessgee, Me.

•TACriVZ AGENTS. r~*»w*. "**«"*« ■**
TESTIMONY

OF a «r Herbert w (srrl*, D.®.
THE ç-
A fir*i.S Arr*. *f R,i4ei.r.« A1V'-n-, *a*
frATa II,-terr. S i.— « .«•'« ’>' —- p" l - '
pa ran# ht of Mwmtn Knvirlr*. /te - hw ,n#n "S'’J ■ ,4*
**d lA 'ds*a CUr„ Afail r ** '**- > ‘
nr ne 8uit4 f to -.y* Times. < >ur 1 »i*«- "■ ■* *,e , , 2

aM ’Tl’ilihi. Sei t Re,;.,(Ug , Jmmt in
J,c, >;.,C6i:f>T <f CO..
nriTTV’C *7 «tnp*. 10 set reedsBe A ‘I l.b.o»;, gjo. Pianos C’-25 up. 

Ft Ïvr?r' !!‘7v iri'lu - rnr nt* rea-lv. ” "r 
rail ou BE A try, WAsunriiTOU, SJ. d 9 ly

nnk in y out own town. T. rœ‘£*5nîi» Vi 
free. Addrws B. BLaiajkt A Co.» PortiRBé M*?W6

77

68^376

616



THE WESLEYAN, FRIDAY, DECEMBER 30, 1881,

RECEIPTS for ' WESLEYAN
Rev J W ShephertUon for Mrs Cole 2,

H H Biois 8 i “
Rev J Wier for John Beck * V°,
Rev J K Betts for Mrs T A Coates ; Ot)
Rev R 8 C' isp for Wm l.awson 00
Rev J M Fisher for Benj. Mack 1 00
Rev John Prince for Isaac Beharre! 2,

Wm Ripley 3rd 1 3 00
Rev K McArthur for J W Allis' n 2, V\

M Forrest 1, John A Hurvie 4, Dan 
Mosher 2, Nicholas Mosher 2, Mrs 
David Thompson 2 10 uu

Rev J K King for A Smith 2, Coke Spen-
cer 2, H B Leeman 2, Louisa M ^ ^
R pXeodill 2, Geo W Beohner 2, William 

Passmore 2, Margaret Dolein .n \V m C un-
fehVSv^5enndV.r UeoVv Ma.ler 2, 

£müel R^leerJanie. Cove 1 Mrs Howar.l 
Stevens »0cts. Henry Cove I. Joli > S. 1 or slim r 
« Miss Bacon 2, Geo Clark i, KufUs \N ils m 2, 
ïrV l ll ii • Richard Dibhli.2, K W Ran- da" r^ R lincken 1. Geo A l’crlev 2 

TWENTY THREE NEW 8L BSC RI B E R>.

PREACHERS’ PUN HALIFAX «NO
DARTMOUTH.

SUNDAY, JANUARY 1st., 1882. 
11a.m. BRUNSWICK ST. 7p.m.
Rev R Brecken Rev W G Lane
11a.m. GRAFTON ST. 7p.m.
Rev J E Donkin Rev J J Teasdale
Ua.m. KAYE ST. 7p.m.
Rev W Glane Rev XI P Doane
17 a m. CHARLES ST. 7p m
Rev W II Evans Rev R Brecken
11a.m. COBOURG ROAD. 7 p.m.
Rev J J Teasdale Rev J E DoB*tin
11 am. DARTMOUTH. 7 pm.
Rev H P Doane Rev W II Evans
BEECH STREET S p.m. instead of usual hour

Mr. A. A. is 1J8B

married

At the residence of the bride’s father, on the 
21st ult., by the Bev. Robert 8 Crisp, Kate S., deugbtU J Mr. K. N. Briggs, Lakeville, Sun- 
bugy Co., N.B., to Mr. J. Chipman Simmons, 
of the same place.

At the Maure, Dalhonsie, N.B., ou the 27th 
Dee by the father of the bride, Geo. H. Camp­
bell,Esq., Ticket Agent C. P. R, Winnipeg, 
to Mary daughter of Rev. Alei. Russell.

At Williamstown, on the 20th Dec., by the 
Rev E Mills, Miss Arrianna M„ daughter of 
Thomas Lindsay, Esq., and Win. H. Carvell, 
son of Capt. Slawson Carvell, of Lakeville, Car- 
leton Co., N.B.

Ia the Methedist Church, Middletoa, Wilmot, 
by Rev. R. Smith, Dec. tlet.. Mr. Charles No­
ble Phillips to Carrie B. Cbeeley, eldest daugh­
ter of Mr. W*. Chesley, of Middleton.

On the 26th alt., by Rev. R. B. Hemlaw, 
in the Methodist Church, Muagrave Tewn, Hex- 
ekieh, ion of John Old ford, Esq., to Lizzie, 
daughter of Mr. Wm. Matthews, all of Mas- 
grave Town, Nfld.

On the 23rd ult., at the residence of Charles 
R. Clarke, Eeq., Sammerside, P.K.I., by the 
Rev. T. J. Deinatadt, Rev. W. Edward John­
son, of Bideford, to Miss Eliza Hayes,of Sam­
merside.

On the 21st inst., at the residence of the 
bride’s father, by Rev. R. W. Weddell, Robert 
H. Jennings, of New Bandon, to Mary L., 
eldest daughter of Henry Bnttimer, Esq,, of 
Salpon Beach, Gloucester Co , N.B.

At the Parsonage, Lunenburg, on the 16th 
inst., by the Rev. A. S. Tuttle, Mr. Baruerd 
Spindler to C'a «tendra, daughter of Mr. John 
Culp, all of Peltz South.

At the residence of the bride’s father, Dec. 
21st., by the Rev. J. W. Shepherdion, Mr. John 
Shaw Mason to Mary Elizabeth, daaghter of 
Joeiah Custance, Esq., of Upper riawdou, 
Hants Co.

On the 14th inst., by Rev. Wm. Tippett, 
George Ledwick, of Jersey, Great Britain, to 
Miss Eliza Murley, of Charlottetown.

At Sackville, Dec. 21st., by Rev. Dr. Pickard, 
Mr. Charles Doo, of Second Westcock Hill, to 
Miss Josephine Chase, of Wood point.

At St. Stephen, Dec. 16th., by Rev. Ilowaid 
Sprague, Thomas E. Atcheson to Maria E. 
price, both of St. Stephen.

On the 22nd inst., by Rev. J. A. Rogers, Mr 
James H. Treen, ot Oxford, to Miss Althea L 
Ward, of Amherst.

DIED
At Caledonia, on the 21st ult., Amy Peck, 

relict of the late Ebenezer Wilber, aged 74 
years. The deceased was for many years a 
worthy member of the Methodist Church, and 
for “ her to die was gam.”

On the 10th inst., at Tidnish. N.8., of con­
sumption, Etta M., aged 20 years, daughter of 
the fate James Goodwin,

On Monday, 26th inst., after a lingering ill­
ness, Augusta Theresa, aged 17 years, daughter 
of Thomas K. Knight, Esq., of Halifax.

At Campbellton, Nor. 21st., Mr. Robert Par­
ker, aged 76 yeais.

At Bathurst, on the 16th iast., Mr. Samuel 
Gammon, at the edranced age of 82 years.

After a few deys illness, on the 19th Dec., at 
En Held, Jane Ann, widow of the late John 
Todd, in her 82nd year. Deceased was a con- 
swtent member of the Methodist.Charch for 

over 60 years.
At Enfield, after one week’s illness, Prances 

Maud, only daaghtor of Charles Todd, in her 
6th year.

a
8>

Diam of Bell, Weight trith Yoke 
and Frame.

Cost of 
Bell and

Bantingt
(IIII AHD PKICSS.

So 6 * 'fc.'u 230 lbs
No 61-3 27in 840 lbi
No 7 loin 490 lbs
No 8 I4ln 710 lbs
No 9 38in 983 lbs

MOUNT ALLISON ACADEMY,
FOB YOUNG LADIES,

SACKVILLE, N.B.
AFFORDS in Literary, Musical and Fine Art 
Studies, choice advantages. The twentv- 
eighth Academic Year opens JANUARY 6th, 
18*1. Catalogues or application.

B00TS, SHOES, 
RUBBERS, SLIPPERS, OVERS.

ARGYLB
BOOT AND SHOE STORE.

We beg to make known to oar City and 
Country friends, also the public generally.

ont
HOLIDAY ANNOUNCEMENT
Christmas Presents!

New Year’s Giftsi
Our stock is the largest and best assorted 

we have ever held. We also claim our prices 
compare favorably with any other house in 

1 the trade.
I Do you w ant a nice pair of

Men's Fancy Slippers,
as a present for your husband, ^brother, or 
some other person’s brother ; Give us a call 
and see what we can do for you.

Do you want sôme

Ladles’ Nice Fancy Slippers,
Skating Boots, or Fancy Overs,

for your sisters, or some other person’s sister. 
CALL AT BOREHAM’S.

Do yon want a nice warm pair of

Felt House Boots or Slippers
for some poor or aged person who would 
appreciate your kindness at this holiday 
season.

GIVE BOREHAM A CALL.
Do you want a nice
SLIPPER OR FARCY BOOT FOR THE BABY?
Wc have the largest and best stock in the 

city.
Do yon want to give your little girl a 

present which will cause her eves to expand 
and which excited so much curiosity during 
the Exhibition, call and see eur splendid as­
sortment of

Doll’s Boots and Shoes.
which we are now about opening.

In conclusion we advise all who wish good 
value for their money to call and see us, as 
we trust by courteous attention to the wants 
of our customers to please all.

E. BOREHAM.
P. 8. Bank of Prince Edward Island notes 

taken at their face in exchange for goods, no 
increase in price. We give 6 per. cent dis­
count for cash in lots of $4.00 and upwards. 
This of course does not include Prince Edward 
Island money, for which we give goods nett., 
no discount. B» B-

dec 30
Dj KENNEDY, d.d.

Principal.

Salesmen Wanted.
To begin work at once on sales for Spring 1882 

for the
FONTHILL NURSERIES,

(The Largest in Canada).
Morris, Stone & Wellington,

PROPRIETORS,
TORONTO.

We pav good salaries and give steady em­
ployment to successful men. Do not apply un­
less you can give your whole time to the busi­
ness. Name this paper. References required. 
Address,

STONE & WELLINGTON,
P. O. Box 1646, Montreal.

J. W. BEALL, Managvr.

THE CANADIAN

METHODIST MAGAZINE
FOR 1882.

The following announce incut of Contents for 
1882 is the best thut we have ever yet made :

“Life in a Parsonage;”
OR LIGHTS AND SHADOWS OP THE ITINERAN­
CY" a story of Canadian Life, by the Editor.

“ Missionary Heroes,”
A series of biographical sketches by the Editor.

The substance of many volumes will be con­
densed into twelve articles of special impor­
tance to young people.

“ Loiterings in Europe,”
A series of sketches of travel, by the Bev. C. 
S. Eby, b. A., Missionary of the Methodist 
Church of Canada la Japan.

These papers are written in Mr. Eby’s gra­
phic and racy ttyle, and several of them will 
be handsomely illustrated.

“The Stately Homes of Eng­
land.”

A series of splendid engravings, with descrip­
tions of some of the most famous Castles and 
Baronial Halls of Old England.

“ Picturesque Canada,”
With pictures of the ST. LAWRENCE, QUE­
BEC, THUNDER CAPE and NORTH SHORE 
OF LAKE SUPERIOR.

“ Foreign Scenes,”
MBDIÆVAL ART AND ARCHITECTURE, 
BIBLE LANDS, THE LAND OF THE NILE, 
ITALIAN PICTURES, SEASIDE PICTURES, 
and other subfects, handsomely illustrated.

“Pioneer Missionaries,”
BY DR. CARROLL.

With other Life Sketches by various writers.

“Wrecked;”
A Tsle of Adventures en Sable Island, by a 
Canadian Lady. And many other valuable 
papers will appear.

THE DEPARTMENT OP 
THE HIGHER LIFE, RELIUIOU8 INTELLI­
GENCE, CURRENT TOPICS, BSOK NO­
TICES, Ac., will be kept up with Increased 
efficiency.

A $1.20 PREMIUM BOOK,

“ PAUL MECCITTS DELUSION,”
BY THE REV. JACKSON WRAY, 

Author of “ Nestieton Magna,”
Will be sent to any SUBSCRIBER OLD OB 
NEW, for 30 cents extra.

HARPER’S and the CENTURY, (late Scrib­
ner's) MAGAZINE will be clubbed with the 
Methodist Magazine fer #3 Instead of ft the 
regular price, and WIDE AWAKE, an 80 page 
Monthly Illustrated Journal, for fiM instead 
of fiM the regular price.

PRICE OP METHODIST MAGAZINE
fi a year; #1 for six months; single numbers. 

20 cents.
Address

S. F. HUESTFS,
MethodietfBook Beom, Halifax, N.S

FORSYTH, 
SUTCLIFFE, & Co.-
wholesale DRUGGISTS

SPICE IMPORTER AND CE,1£it\L OZtlEl

FIRST PRIZE FOR GROUND SPICES,
PEPPER, CLOVES, GINGER,

ALLSPICE, CASSIA, Etc.
Was awarded to ns at the Dominion Exhibition lately held at Halifax.

Wo take this opportunity to state that tHte above prize was awarded 
for BEST ASSORTMENT ct Ground Spices, and wo beg to refer our 
friends for PROOF of PURITY to the “ Blue Books” for 1776, '77, "78, 
and ’79, where they will find our Spices invariably pronounced by 
unalyist to be PURE. Our friends will note on examining these books 
that OURS ARE THE ONLY SPICES that are thus marked IN 
EVERY INSTANCE. We have only ONE QUALITY, and that 
STRICTLY PURE.

For the convenience of Retailors these Spices, besides being sold in 
bulk, are put up in neat Jib and 2 oz. packages, for which is charged 
extra only the cost sf same.

ASK YOUR GROCER FOR

FORSYTH, SUTCLIFFE & CO’S SPICES,
ATJi ONE QUALITY—LOOSE OR IN PACKAGES.

PURE FLAVORING ESSENCES
LEMON,

ALMOND,
VANILLA,

Etc., Etc., Etc.

We make above all of one quality—the finest possible oils and materials 
are used in all ; but for the convenience of Retailers different sized 
bottles of one uniform quality are put up to suit the purses of all who 
wish first class and pure articles of food.

Kept by all First-class Family Grocers throughout
the country.

ASK YOUR GROCER FOR FORSYTH, SUTCLIFFE & Co s
ESSENCES.

NEW RICH BLOODf
PARDON’S PURGATIVE PILLS make 

New Rich Blood, and will Completely change 
the blood in the entire syitem in three months. 
Any person who will take 1 pill each niglt from 
1 to 12 weeks may be restored to sound health, 
if such a thing be possible. Sold everywhere, 
sent by mail for eight letter stamps.

I. S. JOHNSON A CO.,
Boston, Mass., formerly Bangor, Me.

MAKE HENS LAY!
An English Veterinary Surgeon and Chem­

ist now travelling in this country, says that 
mof.t of the Horse and Cattle Powders sold here 
are worthless trash. He says that Shtridan’a 
Condition Powders are absolutely pure ini im­
mensely valuable. Nothing on earth will make 
hens lay jlike Sheridan’s Condition Pewders. 
Dose, one teaspoonful to one pint food. Sold 
everywhere, or sent by mail for eight letter 
stamps.

I. 8. JOHNSON A CO.,
Boston, Mass-, formerly Bangor, Me.

$72AWEM. Slîadsy »thome>ââttymade. Cotti) Outfit frtt. AddressTeue à Co.. Augusts. Me

DIPHTHERIA I
JOHNSON’S ANODYNE LINIMENT will 

positively prevent this terrible disease, and will 
positively cure nine cases out of ten. Informa­
tion that will save many lives, sent free by mail 
Don’t delay a moment. Prevention is better 
than cure. —~

I. S. JOHNSON A Co., Boston, Maas, 
formerly Bangor, Me.

I was given up by the Doctors 
bat am nearly eared by

Gates’ Medicine.
BramomLL Mixes, August 3rd, 1881.

0. Gates’ Son A Co —
Your preparations riven to the public as a 

cure for Asthma and Consumption may be con­
sidered reliable in my experience. My neigh­
bors can also aay the same of me. They had 
ne hope whatever, and advised my wife to 
spend no more money on me. thinking it was 
no use, as I had been given up by the doctors: 
but I thought I would try your medicines, and 
consider that it is by their use only that I am 
living and maintaining my family by my own 
work. The doctors advised me not to take it, 
because, they said, when the cough stopped I 
would not live 34 hours; but I am alive, 
thanks to GATES’ MEDICINES, and am 
doing better than 1 hare been for a great many

KENNETH MoGILVARY.
The above statement was sworn to ae correct 

in every particular, by the above named Ken. 
oeth McGilvary, before me, At Spring Hill, 
this 4 th day of August, 1881.

R. DRUMMOND, JJ>.
SOLD AT WHOLESALE BY 

BROWN A WEBB, 
FORSYTH, SUTCLIFFE & Co

AND
JOHN K. BENT,

HALIFAX,
And XT DRUGGISTS 4tDEALERS THROUH 

OUT THE MARITIME PROVINCES.

.I.p-Hif npnSMti IS. Lons* U * «I4UJ
THE REMEDY FOR CURING

COHSÜMPTIOH, C0DQH3,
COLDS, ASTHMA, OEOCF,

All Diseases of the Threat, lings and 
Falmenary Organs.

XT ITS FAITHFUL USX
CONSUMPTION HAS BEEN CURED

When other Remedies and Physicians hare 
failed to eflbet a cure.

Recommended by Pktsiciaxs. Mnnsmi axi 
Numbs. In met by everybody who has 

Siren it a good, triaL It never fad* to bring relief.
As an EXPECTORANT it has as Equal;

It U hsnalem to the Morn Delicate Child.
P mmtmtna see OPIUM in any Form.

NEWEST ARTICLES
IN

WOOL GOODS !
OPERA SHAWLS, OPERA TIES> 

FISCHUES, SCARFS, 
CLOUDS, TIES,

WOOL VESTS, PETTICOATS, 
MITTS,

CUFFS AND GAITERS.

HANDSOME FUR LINED CLOAKS
FROM $11.

—<T -A. O IC ZE3 T S—
all the Newest Shapes

FROM $7.
A FULL LINE OF HOSIERY 

AND UNDERWEAR,
In Cashmere, Lambs Wool, Merino 

and Silk.
Christmas Novelties, Etc.

6. H. SMITH & Go.,
155 GRANVILLE ST.

W. L. LOWELL
BANKERS & BROKERS.

Railroad, Bauk Stocks, Bonds, and all Negotiable 8«N»mni*
Bought and Sold.

Dealers in UNITED STATES, CANADIAN, and STEELING rrm, 
UNCURBENT MONIES, &c.

COLLECTIONS made ou all ACCESSIBLE POINTS. '
ORDERS for the purchase and yile of STOCKS, Aç., in MONTRE IT vr» 

BOSTON, executed Peompilv by Telegraph. " •’ YORg^

T the mine.
Are in receipt of Daily Quotations of the Leaping Stocks in the »hore

which are ou fyle iu our Office tor the ix formation 
Order* and Correspondence solicited.

165 HOLLIS STREET.

FIRE AH) LIFE INSURANCE
p i

lowest
We are at all times p-epared to accept ri>ks against Eire on all classes of n 
st rates in the following well known long established and reliable Corn pan ie« r°*>W^ * 
Detached Dwellings and contents insured for ONE or THREE years "

ÆTNA --- - ----------  -------------

Incorporated 1819.
HARTFORD

Batablislied.

INSURANCE COMPANY,
HARTFORD, CONN.,

Losses pa in 62 years over $51,000,000.
FIRE INSURANCE COMPANY

HARTFORD, CONN., * *
1784. Zioaaea paid — 
824,000/500.

NORTH BRITISH AND MERCANTILE INSURANCE COMpin
LONDON AND EDINBURGH. ESTABLISHED 180».

The NORTH BRITISH also effects Life Insurance on the most opproved dUb. . > . 
favorable rates. ____ andd**
j y W. L. LOWELL & CO. Agents. 165 Hollis 8tmt

GRAND

SUCCESS

DOMINION EXHIBITION, 1881.
SPECIAL AND ONLY AWARDS

TWO DIPLOMAS OF HONOUR TO W. H. JOHNSON FIR 
PIANOS AND ORGAN!

FULL GRAND ° KNABE” PLANO
Onlv Grand ever imported to Halifax. Our Stock is such that it would take Pris 
PRIC^MAN U^AC-TCRED°RGANS embrecing ever>thinff fr°“ medium to the

Over 60 Gold and Silver Medals
have been awarded to the “ KNABE” PIANO all over the World. Now is tha

a superior Instrument.

ka-n ah-ba.
PIANOS. “ Knabe,” Webor, Whcelock, Dominion.

ORGANS. Bell and Domini»,
W. H. JOHNSON,

123 HOLLIS STREET, HALIFAX,. NA

RE-OPENING OF THE

BRITISH WOOLLEN TTAT.L.

vS. F. HU1 
I. WATSlI

VOL Xj

B. P. BLISS,
HAS TIIE PLEASURE OF ANNOUNCING TO THE CITIZENS OF HALIFAX,

THAT 1IE WILL OPEN

A VERY LARGE STOCK OF

English, American, Foreign and Canadian,

DRY GOODS!
Personally selected in the best markets, and bought on the most -advantageous. terms. IU 
titosk U the matt complete for detail Trade, that has Hier been imported inthit cOf| aad ia^SO- 
tion will satisfy of this fact.

The Terms—POSITIVELY CASH IN ALL.CASES—will ensure to pxchaeera
the lullcst value.

LADIES DEPARTMENT, GENERAL DEPARTMENT,
164 Granville St 152 Gsaavilie fit

SACKVILLE ACADEMY,
REV. CHARLES H. PAISLEY, M.A_ Principal.

The SECOND TERM of this highly soecessftil InstltatlN
will (D.f*.) commence

JANUARY 5th., 1882.
THE COURSE OF STUDY IS ARRANGED WITH A VIEW TO A THOROUGH

ENGLISH AND CLASSICAL EDUCATION.
Special faciUiits are afforded also foç instruction in

FRENCH; MUSIC, both Vocal and Instrumental';
BOQK-BBZmro ; Penmanship and the erdinary ferme ef Commercial transaction

For Calendar containing terms, d-c., apply to Principal. i--.

OFFICE.-
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