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" Sec. 6. Any property owned under any contract or by
any combination, or pursuant to any conspiracy (and being
the subject thereof) mentioned In section one of this act.
and being In the course of transporUtlon from one SUte
to another, or to a foreign country, shall be forfeited to
the United States, and may be seHed and condemned by
i:ke proceedings as those provided by law for their forfei-
ture, seizure, and condemnation of property Imported Into
the United States contrary to law."—Edmunds.

" Sec. 7. Any person who shall be Injured In his busi-
ness or property by any other person or corporation by
reason of anything forbidden or declared to be unlawful
by this Act may sue therefor In any circuit court of the
United SUtes In the district in which the defendant resides
or Is found, without respect to the amount In controversy,
and shall recover threefold the damages by him sustained,
and the costs of suit, including a reasonable attorneys
fee."—Hoar, rewrUten from Sena.or Bherman'a oHffinal
draft.

" Sec. 8. That the word ' person ' or ' persons,' wherever
used In this Act, shall be deemad to Include corporations
and associations existing under or authorized by the laws
of either the United Stotes, the laws of any of the Terri-
tories, the laws of any State, or the laws of any foreign
country."—Ingalls.

THE END.


