
Eagles prevail over Tigers

TAE KW0N-DÛ Dalhousie second to one
by Sandy Smith

From the first day of 
training camp onward, John 
Kibyuk provided the lion’s 
share of the leadership for the 
Dalhousie hockey Tigers. This 
past weekend was no different 
as the performance given by 
Kibyuk was symbolic not only 
of the Tigers’ playoff with the 
Blues Eagles, but of the entire 
Tigers’ season.

Kibyuk had already scored 
the first two goals in the 
Friday night 4-3 loss when he 
was slashed in front of the 
Moncton goal. The blow to his 
arm was so severe that first 
suspicions were that the arm 
had been broken. Kibyuk was, 
however, lucky enough not to 
sustain a fracture in his arm. 
The team captain's right arm 
was, nevertheless, very swol­
len and had to be heavily 
taped. Despite the injury, 
Kibyuk played his normal 
game killing pen^^es, playing 
the power play, and taking a 
regular shift. No complaints, 
he just kept doing the job he 
felt he had to do.

Just as Kibyuk put his 
injury behind him, so did the 
Tigers put Friday’s heartbreak­
ing 4-3 loss behind them. The 
game was a tough one for the 
Tigers to lose as they had led 
3-1 after the first.period on 
goals by Kibyuk (two) and 
Rick McCallum. A strong 
second period by the home 
squad tied the score at three, 
following forty minutes, and 
set the stage for Francois 
Bessette's winning goal at 
12:26 of the third period. The 
Tigers applied tremendous 
pressure following Bessette’s 
goal, but failed to score the 
elusive tying goal despite the 
fact that they had chances to 
do so as late as 19:57 of the 
final period. The loss was a 
difficult one to take, but the

KOREAN ART OF SELF DEFENCE Tigers have proved their ma­
turity all year long by bearing 
down to win eleven of fourteen 
post-Christmas games to 
prove to those of us who were 
somewhat skeptical of their 
claims to be a team worthy of 
recognition as one of the best 
in the AUAA, that they were 
right.

Having put the loss behind 
them, the Tigers opened Sat­
urday's encounter with the 
same enthusiasm as Friday 
night’s game. They skated 
stride for stride with the 
Moncton team in each of the 
opening periods and dom­
inated both. The score Satur­
day night after the first twenty 
minutes was, however, only 
2-2. Kibyuk again opened the 
score, this time with a slap­
shot, and Shawn MacDonald 
scored a pretty short-handed 
breakaway goal.

After falling behind 3-2, the 
Tigers appeared ready to beat 
their second period jinx when 
McCallum tied the score not 
long before Ken Johnston 
gave Dal a 4-3 lead. The lead 
was, however, a short lived 
one as the Blue Eagles 
stormed back to score three 
goals in four minutes and 
leave the second period lead­
ing 6-4.

This score was a fairer 
indication of the play than the 
final 8-4 score. The Tigers 
were not at all humbled by the 
Moncton team, nor were they 
humbled by any team in the 
long, and rather amazing, 
season they had this year.

Their dismal first half of the 
year and dramatic leap from 
last to second place in their 
division is now well known by 
followers of the team, and in 
retrospect, the weekend's re­
sults reflected an ending to 
the season that was a most

appropriate one. Despite the 
tremendous second half the 
Tigers enjoyed, they managed 
to beat the Blue Eagles only 
once in five tries. The Monc­
ton squad seemed to have the 
little bit of extra depth that the 
Tigers lacked, they had that 
something extra needed to 
win the close games. The 
games were, however, indeed 
close, and the experience 
gained by this year's Tigers 
can only help when the close 
games come around next 
year.

The Tigers can truly say that 
they were clearly the second 
best team in the AUAA, and 
they weren't all that far behind 
the first place Eagles.

1 ‘SELF-CONFIDENCE 
i ‘SELF-DEFENCE 

1 ‘WEIGHT CONTROL 
i ‘LADIES FIGURE

CONTROL 
‘SELF CONTROL*

fr­
ôlasses:
Mon. to Fri. 12:30 - 2pm 

and 5:00 - 10pm 
Sat & Sun 1:00-3:00

*SPECIAL INSTRUCTION FOR WOMEN

MASTER: KWANG KIM-6th Degree Black Belt
(INTERNATIONAL TAE KWON-DO INSTRUCTOR)

PHONE 423-8401

TIGER TALES—With defence- 
man Don Woodworth out for 
the year with a broken collar­
bone, defenceman Walter

AFTER HOURS 
CALL 443-5789

Kontak filled in outstandingly 
for the Tigers. Kontak is the 
first to acknowledge he is not 
the swiftest guy on the 
blades

KWANG KIM INSTITUTE OF TAE KWON-DO
1582 Granville Street , HALIFAX, N. S.

but played in a 
manner typical of the Tigers 
by knowing his limitations 
and making sure not to exceed 
them. Kontak was particularly " 
“heady" during play in his 
own end clearing the puck . .
The rest of the defensive 
corps also played well, indeed 
Ken Johnston was spurred 
by his unpopularity with the 
crowd, while Gary Ryan and 
Paul Leek each logged great 
amounts of ice time as well 
and played their steadiest . . .
The difference between the 
teams in this past weekend's 
championship seemed to be 
the lack of scoring from 
than one Dal 
Kibyuk and Rick McCallum 
had five of the seven Tiger 
goals. The more balanced 
Moncton attack prevailed in 
the end.
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w CURLING —If the car rental 
agency is right, Dalhousie 
curlers tried harder than any­
one to win the Atlantic Uni­
versity Athletic Association 
(AUAA) men’s, women’s, and 
mixed curling titles. All three 
Dal teams finished second in 
their respective divisions.

The Dalhousie women were 
tied with the host Moncton 
rink with a 6-1 record but lost 
in a play-off, 8-0, to the 
Hubtowners.

The Dal men were tied with 
the University of New Bruns­
wick, Saint John campus at 
5-2. Both trailed UNB-Fred- 
ericton.

The mixed team had a 3-1 
mark, second only to Mem­
orial.

GYMNASTICS-The men
finished sixth among the sixth 
teams competing at the Cana­
dian Interuniversity Athletic 
Union (CIAU) championships 
in Calgary.

Steve Banks’ tenth place 
finish on the parallel bars 
helped him finish in seven­
teenth place overall, the best 
performance by a Dalhousie

athlete.
Atlantic champion Shawn 

Healey was injured after four 
events, putting off for this 
year any hopes of a medal for 
the Dal veteran. Doug Polak 
was the most improved per­
former for the Tigers.

WRESTLING —Dalhousie’s 
few wrestlers finished their 
season rather successfully tak­
ing three medals at the AUAA 
finals at Mount Allison Uni­
versity.

Team coach Greg Wilson, a 
Masters Physical Education 
student from Ottawa, won a 
gold medal in the 167 lb. 
weight class, and Wilson 
finished the season with an 
impressive undefeated season 
against Atlantic competition.

Peter Coulthard took the 
silver medal in the 126 lb. 
class. Coulthard is a native of 
Montreal and presently in his 
second year of law studies 
here.

Local lad Tim Matheson, a 
third year commerce student, 
was the third medal winner. 
He took the bronze medal in 
the 158 lb. division.
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RAQUETBALL —Bill Taylor 
took the Dalhousie Club cham­
pionship this past weekend at 
Dalplex. Taylor, from Edmon­
ton, is a post-grad student 
doing work in family medi­
cine.

Friday • Saturday • Sunday 
March 20,21,22 SQUASH — Former Dalhousie 

tennis team member Joanne 
Beckwith did something 'be­
yond her wildest dreams' this 
past weekend finishing in 
second place in the York 
University hosted Can-Am In­
vitational Squash tournament.

Beckwith, a fourth year 
biology student, represented 
the Dalhousie Squash Club in 
the tourney. She scored wins 
over the U of T, Waterloo, and 
McGill representatives before 
losing to Alicia McConnell of 
Brooklyn, N.Y. in the final.

Games Beginning 9:00 a.m.
Opening Ceremonies Friday8:45 p.m. 
Championship Game Sunday 1:30 p.m. W4

Tickets for all games will be 
sold an hour before each session 
at the Dalplex.
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Wilson was the only Tiger to 
place at the CIAU champion­
ships in Thunder Bay, at 
Lakehead University. Wilson 
finished fourth in his 167 lb. 
class.

$1.00-$3.00 
per session 
(3 games)

Dalplex
Dalhousie University, Halifax, N.S.


