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not go far enough, and leave room aiso
for doubt when read with similar clauses
in the Law ReformnAct. We should like
the rule to be that ail issues of fact should
be tried by a Judgc, the exception being
only in cases of libel and siander, and in
cases where, upon applications made before
trial, the Court or Judgc sa-w fit to direct
the issues to be tried by a jury. If the
trial by jury in civil cases were thus dis-
penscd with therewould be no occasion for
section 20, but while trial by jury exists
there ought tQ be sorne means of keeping
juries within their proper sphere. The
theory of our mode of trial at Nisi Prinis
is that the jury determine the facts, the
Judge declaring the law. But those fami-
liar with procédure know how difficuit it
is to confine juries to their sole duties,
how eften they go heyond themn and
usurp the functions of the Judge. They
niay or iuay not accept the law as laid
down by the iBencli, and there is always a
difficulty, unless the jury will answer
questions put to them, which, they may
refuse to do as the law stands, and insist
on findiug a gencral verdict. In actions
for nîalicious arrest, false imprisoument,
and actions by and against corporations,
&c., the cvii is very marked. The 20th
section is apparently designed to remedy
this by requîrilg the jury to gîve a special
verdict. Our impression is that it will
be better to provide that distinct ques-
tions shouid be framed beforehand and
submitted to the jury, something sinailar
to the plan in the Indian Code of Pro-
cedure. No doubt under section 20 the
Judge could at Nisi Prius frame and sub-
mit to the jury questions in determination
of the issues, and require the jury to an-
swer thena, but this in complicated cases
is not elways an easy task, and it would
seeni aiuch better to have them. prepared
deliberatelq before-hand. Strong opinions
have been expressed as to the propriety of
this change both pro and con. We shail
refer to these confiicting vie.ws on a
future occasioni.

The 21 st section is calculated to save
an unnecessary waste of judicial strength
and the avoidance of delay.

The clauses fot the examination of
parties, &c., we do not stay to examine iii
détail, but recognize their great value,
and similar powers have worked well in
Chancery procedure.

The 36th and subséquent sections for
assisting a party to obtain the fruit of his
judgmcnt or decee, may remove Som@
difficulties that now exist, and as pro-
visions in aid will be found valuable in
plain cases where therc is no contest.
It is not, wc apprehend, intendod by
this section, nor would it ha wie that
judges should, in ail cases brouglit hefore
thera under it, suminarily dispose of those
nlany doubtful. and difficuit questions
which arise wbcre sales are impeached on
the ground of a fraudulent initent to
defeat credîtors. 1It very frequerîtly hep-
pans, and notably so in this class of cases,
that the truth cannot be reached Nvithout
having the witnesses and parties brought
face to face with each other and subjectcd
to a vcry searching cross examination.
Wlîllst, therefore, this section will ha
useful in cases where the fraud is se
palpable as not to icave any roona for
douht, and whcrc there are ne other coin-
plieating circumstances, it is net likely
that judgcs 'wili very freely exercise the
large powers proposed to ha, given to
them. We presume there would ha au
appeal froru any décision undaer this sec,
tion as in other cases, but it would ho
well to provide that on an appeal a direc-
tion, iiglit bc given for the trial oft fle
disputed point on an issue or hy bill
under section 38.

Whan the Bill goes into committea thec
language of ail these clauses will no0
doubt ba carafully examined and any
necessary alterations and additions made,

The 45th section will prevent County
Court cases being carried eut of the Court
îrn c' thebv are instîtuted, often te the
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