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est faetum-that is, that she did flot know that she was signing
a guaranty. The other branch of the mae presented more diffi-
culty, chiefly because the evidence at the trial was so ill-direeted
Wo the material cireuinstances. Lt was plain, however, that the
guaranty signcd by the defendant was for debts to be ineurred
only. No other material f act was plainly proved: see Morreli v.
('owan (1877), 7 (Ch. D). 151. When the' guaranty was given, a
note for the amount of it wus tahen f£rom the debtors, and the
ainount of that note was placed to the credit of their overdrawn
acount, overdrawn to an amouint greater than the amount of the
guaranty and note, which was $2,500; and 80 at first sight; it
would appear f hat the guara.nty had been misapplied: but there
was Rome evidenee f rom which it xnight be surmised thst the
guaranty was treated as ereating an addîtionaI credit upon the
security of whieh money was, subsequently advanced whieh would
bc covered by it. This, of course, ouglit to have been plainly
rroved. if a fact. by the plaintiffs; and they were blaînable for the
unsatisfaetory state of the evidence upon the point. In this un-
satisfactory state of the evidenee, the proper course was tW
refer the case to a local officer to ascertain and state what sum,
if any. is really due upon the guaranty, reserving further direc-
tions and ail questions of future costs. There was not enough
evidence to prove a merger of the debt guaranteed in the mort-
gages taken-or otherwise any discharge of the guarantor. The
appellant should have her general ýcosts of the appeal.

The other members of the Court agreed in the result. LiEN-
Nox and MA&sTE.-, JJ., each giving written rosons.

Appeal allowed in part.
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