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they could get employment and supply
themselves ivith their needs.

This couid be done cheaper than
by rniiitary force, and, see how much
more hurianeiy.

This, 1 believe, is aur Heavenly
Father's plan, and would bring about
a more friendly condition of socîety
than to use rniiitary force, which can-
flot insure that harmony in society
that the first plan proposes.

"'My ways are flot your ways, says
the Lord, one shall chase a thousand,
.and twa put ten thousand ta fiight."

Now, the first plan is God's plan,
the latter, by military force, is man's,
and the law of man's making, which
neveu made anything perfect.

"'rherefore, cease from your evil
ways, saith the Lord, and I will be
unta you a God, and yau shall be unta
me a people, and jay, and gladness,
shahl fill the whole earth."

7 mo). 9 th, 1894. ANON"YMOUS.

THE KINGDOM 0F (HEAVEN)
GOD.

"The Kingdom of (heaven) God is
within you,' according ta Luke 17 -2 1
verse, also 2oth verse, " it cometh flot
with observation," or as in the margin,
tgwith outward show." That is, as I
understand, it cometh flot with out-
ward observance. " Neither shail îhey
say, Lo here 'or, la there ! for be-
hold, the kinzdom of Gcd is within (or
in the margin among> you," St. Luke,

17:21 verse, and St. Matthew, 13
chap., 3 1-32 verses, "The ki igdomn of
heaven is like a grain of mustard seed
which a mnan (or any one) took, and
sowed in his or her field ;" which in-
deed is the least of ail seeds ; but when
it is grown, it is the greatest among
herbs, and becorneth a tree, sa that
the birds ot the air corne and lodge ini
the branches thereof. 'bis implies a
state of growth. Read' the whole of
the 13 th chap. of St. Matthew, 38th
verse, "The field is the world (of man-
kind>l the gaad seed are the children
.of the*kingdam'; but the tares aie the

children of the wicked one; and it
seems that Jacob (see Gen., 28 chap.,
17 v.) found the house of God, and
the gate of heaven was established be-
fore the birth of Jesus of Nazareth."
From which I iinfer that ail gaod peo-
pIe, from the founidation of the world,
who have lived correctly and doue
rightly, so as ta please aur common or
universal Father, have entered inta it.
But it is a state of growth, and cam.
pared ta a seed put into the ground,
which is ta be cultivated that it may
corne to full maturity, so that the full
benefit of it rnay be received, which
bas ta be done whilst in this state of
being, for the night of death cometh
wvhen fia one can work, and " there is
fia repentance in the grave," but
tgwhere a tree falleth sa it lieth." Then
lýow important it is while tirne, healhh
and opportunity offer that we cultivate
this good seed, for we have the priv-
ilege of choosing ta cultivate il or flot,
and ta encourage its growth if we will.
CcChoose ye this day vzhomn ye wil
serve." See no compulsion about it.
Will we be sa unwise as ta choose the
evil or that which is nat good ? I
think not. Well, we want ta cultivate
that which is goad, please instruct us
how ta cultivai e this good plant. Well,
1 wilI, as far as I know, but more
depends upan yoursz-Ives eventually
than upon others. Vou know we are
ahl created with a good spirit and a bad
one. The first one is the good small
seed, smail at first ; the other the bad
seed. The first is the spirit of kind-
ness and love, which is aur heavenly
Father's lawv, and is the Christ power
or spirit by -which if we are led wll
cause aur actions ta be in harmnony
with is wili, and conseqtuently save us
from sinning and g.ve us a hope of
glory. The other spirit is camnaI, sen-
suai and called devilish. The first
keeps the carnaI nature in subjection -
the second gratifies it, which is emnity
ta God or a heavenly state, which must
be commeuced and carried an whilst
in this state of being. How many of
us are nourishing this goad seed?
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