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fically against the then prevailing humoral pathology by
insisting that the blood itself is not the proper and original
cause of dyscrasia, as tauglt even by Rokitansky, but that
instead these dyscrasim, have their origin rather in a disturbed
inetabolism, the toxic products of which are merely carried in
the blood. His laborious study of inany phases of blood
changes comprises the basis of our present accurate conception
of the pathology of the circulatory medium. Bis study of
inflammation, in the descrii tion of which he insisted that dis-
turbed function should be added to heat, pain, redness and
swelling, as one of the cardinal indicia of the phenoniena,
gave an accurate conception of the actual changes. Bis
elaborate investigations of the nervous systei resulted iii he
promulgation of doctrines whose parentage in the works of
Brown and Haller is recognizable. His work on tumors. a
distinct application of the cellular doctrine, stands to-day as the
fundanental classic of the subject. His investigation of tuber-
culosis resulted first in his classification of the disease into
neoplastic and inf;inmatory forms, but latterly lie recognized
the bacilliary forms. It would be impossible, however, as I have
before stated, to give even an accurate resmé of this extensive
philosophy, the application of wvhich to the entire phenomena
of disease must stand as his crowning achievement. 16 is
interesting to hear him recount, as lie did in a lecture delivert (d
in London during the last years of his life, the general sum-
marization of his work in the statement that ' the law of con-
tinuity of animal development is, therefore, identical with the
law of heredity, and this I was now able to apply to the whole
field of pathological new formation.' And it was especially
interesting, in view of the ideas against which he had to con-
tend, to hear hlm add with pardonable exultation: " I blocked
forever the last loophole of the opponents, the doctrine of
specifie pathological cells from which ty)es and ancestors were
not forthcoming in normal life." The doctrines vhich he had
thus established, and to which he thuis alluded, became early ini
their history the actuating principles of the "Berlin School,"
which sooner or later embraced the names of Leydon, Von
Rechlinghausen, Colinheiin. Waldeyer, Hoppe-Seyler, Kulhne,
Rindfleisch, Klebbs, Liebrich Frederie, in Germany: Felix
Simon, i England, and conspicuously, W. H. Welch in the
United States. The principles taught by this school are, by
common coisent, those nupon which moder surgery and rational
therapy alike are placed.

The position tlat must bc accorded to this doctrine in the
light of further revelation of fundanental law cannot be fore-
told. Nothing could be further from the purpose of Virchow
himself, than the assumption that his doctr'ine was the ail-triu th.


