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- am driving United tentesShoe Merger Complete |fë=

Boston, Mass., May 17—The merger] I 
of the International Shoe Company of II jt 
St Louis and the W. G. MoKlwalno II 
Company of this city, shoe manufac- | ■ 
tarera, wee announced today. It | 
brings together companies whose com­
bined sales aggregated 1130,000,000 
last year. A Joint capital of >40,900,- 
000 is said to be involved, merging, ot 
which is to be effected by exchange 
of securities without public financing.
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Comeback of Frontenac Brew­
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Bond Market Still Dull.
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Winnipeg, Mao.. May 17 —The .lea 

tore of the local wheat market today 
was the break in the cash premium 
which lost ground sharply over night. 
The demand was poor and at the same 
time offerings were extremely tight 
owing to the decline in both cash and 
future*. In the future market May, 
after the lower opening, fell steadily 
until a low of >1.78 1-8 was reached, 
and dosed with a loss of 6 1-8 cent 
from the previous close. July reoov 
ered its early loss and closed 3*8 cent 
higher, while October gained 1-2.

There was little change in the coaree 
grain situation Wheat, Clone: May 
1.6b 1-8; July, 1.48; October, 1.23 1*3.

Oats, May. 42 5-8; July, 43 6-8; Oc­
tober. 44 6-8.

Cash prices: Wheat, No. 1 north 
era, 1.79 3-8; No. 2 northern 1.77 1-8; 
No. 3 northern, l 72 5-8; No. 4, 1.57; 
No. 5, 1.48; No. 6, 1.33; track Man! 
toba, Saskatchewan and Albert* 1.79.

CHICAGO
Chicago, May 17—Close:
Wheat—May. 1.46*; July, 1.16*.
Corn—July, 60*; September, 63*.
Oats—July, 38*; September, 38%.
Pork—May, 16.80; July. 14.80.
Lard—July, 8.55; September, 8.87.
Rib#—July, sSo; September, 10.07.
” TORONTO.
Toronto, May 17 -Manitoba wheat, 

No. 1 Northern 1.79 3-8; No. 2, 1.77 1-8; 
No. 8, 1.726-8; No. 4 wheat 1.67. 
Manitoba oats, No. 2 cw 43 1-8; No. 3, 
cw 39 6-8; extra No. 1 feed 39 6-8; No. 
1 feed 37 5-8; No. 2 feed 36 5-8. Manl 
toba barley, No. 2 cw 77; No. 4 cw 72; 
rejected 60 3-4; feed 53 34. All of the 
above in store Port William. Ameri­
can corn. No. 2 yellow 73 elf bay ports. 
Canadian corn, feed nominal. Barley. 
Ontario malting 6f> to 79, outside. On­
tario wheat. No. 2. 1.60 to 1.60 f.o.b. 
shipping points, according to freights; 
No. 2 spring 1.40 to 1.46; No. 2, goose 
wheat nominal. Ontario çats, No. 2 
white, nominal 42 to 44. according to 
freight outside. Peas, No. 2, 1.30 to 
1.36, according to freight. Buckwheat, 
No. 2 nominal. Rye. No. 2. 1.35 to
1.40. • Ontario flour, 90 per cent patent 
37.00 bulk seaboard ; 90 per cent pa­
tent nominal in jute bags Montreal 
and Toronto.

Manitoba flour, track Toronto, caah 
Prices: First patents. $10.20; second 
patent $10.00. Mill feed, car loads, de­
livered Montreal freights, bag includ­
ed: Bran, per ton $25 to $23; shorts 
Per ton $26 to >31; feed flour 2.10 to
2.40. Hay, No. l per ton baled, track 
Toronto >21 to >23; straw >12 per ton 
car lots.
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Strops, ll has been found 
more easy for Brasil to place loans 1» 
Groat Britain then the «titled atetee, 
he staled.

Montreal. May 17 —Breweries again, 
continued the active feature ot the 
days trading on the local stock ex 
change today with Bron»ton furnish­
ing the next largest number of trans­
actions. Both were strong, the form 
er adding 1 7-8 points at 56 74, and 
the latter a point at 37 1-2.

Bell Telephone was more active 
than usual and sold down 2 points to 
104 1-2. Over 2,000 rights* were trad 
od in at 50 to 40, a drop 
The market as a whole ’ 
few issues, such as Steamship stocks, 
Ontario Steel and Tackett's Tobacco, 
Asbestos and Sugar being weaker 
features. Tucketts was down 2 points 
at 40; Ontario Steel 7 at 60; and the 
others showed fractional declines.

Penman's The Beat.
A small lot of Penman's made the 

day s best gain, one of 2 1-2 pointa 
at 85: Textile moved up 2 points to 
130; Cement gained 1 1-2 points to 
53 1-2: Dominion Glass preferred and 
• Xxminion Steel gained a point at 
82 and 37.

The papers outside those mentioned 
were not active bat were steady as 
were also the utilities.

The bond list was less active and 
was inclined weaker with, however, 
few changes of importance. Total 
sales: iLirted 11,029; rights 2.166; 
bonds $215.300

J. M. Robinson & Sons Ltd,Special to The Standard.
(Montreal. May 17.—The Undated 

Market was again rather active with 
a sharp riee in Frontenac Brewer lea 
the feature, says Balfour White and 

This stuck, which was offered 
down as low as 40 during the last 
month, sold at 55 and closed 64 1-2 to 
56, New Riordon Common opened at 
4 1-4 and sold down to 3 1-2, closing 
3 1-2 bid no stock offered. The Pre­
ferred which opened at 30 74 bid, of­
fered at 31, sold at 29. and closed with 
stock offered at 29 no bid. This stock 
is being watched with interest as the 
future market trend of it depends on 
whether the Company are 
raise the $5.000,000. for which they are 
at present appealing to their present 

North American Pulp

Announcement is mads that the 
Howard Smith Paper Mille, Limited, 
has decided to extend until June 2 
the offer of exchange of six per cent 
bonds due 1942 of the Toronto Paper 
Manufacturing Company. Ltd.. The 
company offers to the holders of these 
six per cent bonds a like amount of 7 
per cent 20 year first refunding mort­
gage bonds of the Howard Smith Pa­
per Mill, Limited.

A. „ tit. John—Moncton—Fredericton,
“PROFESSIONALS” IN

THEIR ELEMENT
f

Go.
Better Situation in Upper 

Silesia Has Effect Upon 
Money Market.

-Orrai Britain, Fran» and Belgium 
Bat their mosey Into foreign enter 
priera, and «Main net only a ratura w 
the Investment, hut secure large or 
«an (or materials and supPUra ot all 
khris. Urns developing «hair (eradgo 
trade," the speaker raid, alter point­
ing rat that the Investments ot eem 
petiton ot 0» United Staten in Bra- 
nuira enderpd.ee greatly exceeds the 

Invested by United State.

of 10 points, 
was strong, a

I

I Nobody Knows! !
until they get our list of invest-1 

ment offerings what excellent1 
opportunities are awaiting the 
investor.

May we advise you?

New York. May 17.—Today's opera 
tkms in the stock market were per­
functory and dull. Dealings were 
lighter in volume and narrower of 
scope thru in any full session of sever 
al week-s. The listless movement was 
accompanied by conflicting advances 
and declines which evidently derived 
their sole impulse from the profes 
stonal element. Meagre public par 
tlcipatlon seemed restricted to the 
selling side of the account.

News and other developments deal 
Ing with market values were of the 
tame familiar tenor. Some rails suf 
.'ered additional moderate losses as 
a result of pessimistic views uttered 
by transportation officials and believ­
ed to foreshadow more dividend re­
adjustments. Similar conditions ap­
plied with equal or greater force to 
many steels, equipments, motors and 
ather Issues of no definite description, 
some of which were said to be feel 
ing more actuel y the depression in 
their respective lines of industry

Call Money Shorts.

Although call money held at 7 per 
cent., shorts were driven in before 
the close by purchases of local trac 
tion issues, as well as gas issues, cop 
pers and shippings Final prices in 
most Instances were considerably 
above the lowest levels. Sales 
amounted to 575.000 shares.

Continuance of the holiday period 
abroad detracted from act! 
foreign exchange, but advices receiv 
ed by well informed banking interests 
indicated an amicable settlement of 
the Silesian controversy. Kxoept for 
the Dutch rate, all important interna 
tional remittances were iirm'to strong

Foreign issues were the most con 
spicuous features of the bond market 
Chilean 8’s reacted on dissolution ot 
the underwriting syndicate and Mexi 
can's lost ground with French muni 
cipals. Domestic bonds were steady, 
although the Liberty group showed 
further irregularity. Total sales, par 
value, aggregated $10,750,000.

New Issue
able to

iTrustee Investment 
Tax Exempt

City of 
Monoton

6% BONDS 6%
Price 100 and 

Interest.

Ï erajuu
traira» Interests.shareholders 

■was steady at around 3 1-2, and sold 
at 3 34, closing 3 1-2 bid no stock of­
fered; the last sale taking place at 
4 Whalen Pulp sold at 10, and the 
Preferred is «till offered at 37 1-2 
with no bid in the Market. Dryden 
sold at 16. and is now offered at 15 
with no bid.

Rapid Decline
In Rail Profit!

W. f. MAHON & CO. Ste^y Increase in Operating 
(jests is Reason for the 
Changed Conditions.

101 Prk.ee Wm. St. 
St John, N. B.

Cuban Sugar Lost

Cuban-Canadian Sugar Prof erred 
again lost two points and eold at 15, 
and the Common sold between 4 and 

Laurentide Power opened at 66 
bid, and closed 67 bid with no offer­
ings. Montreal Oil is unchanged of­
fered at 40 cents with no transactions. 
Souther Canada Power Preferred 
again sold at 76, with the Common 
offered at 22, Montreal Tram Power 
sold at 10 3-4 and 11, and is now quot­
ed 10 1-2 to 11. Ames Holden Tire 
Common sold at 22, and Canadian Cir 
Notes at 77 1-2. Argonaut Gold sold 
at 40 cents, and Is offered there with 
no bid in the Market. Famous Play­
ers Preferred wiyi 50 per cent, bonus 
Common, which was offered at 80 last 
week, is now 80 bid with no sto.'.k 
offered. Oockehutt Plow Preferred 
loet a point, being offered at 58 with­
out a buyer in the market.

Marconi Advancing.
British Empire Steel Common is 

quoted 8 1-2 to 9. and the Preferred 
36 bid. Loews Montreal Common sold 
at 35, and there seems to be a good 
demand for Loews Metropolitan Com­
mon between 4 34 and 5. Loews Ot­
tawa Common again sold at 5, and the 
Preferred Is 66 bid with no Stock offer­
ed. Marconi of Canada advanced 6 
cents, and is now 1.15 bid with no 
stock offered. There have been no 
offerings of this stock for several 
months. Winnipeg Electric Preferred 
was bid up to 78. and sold between 
77 and 79 with quite active trading. 
Western Grocers Preferred is 62 1-2 
bid with no stock offered.

Home Bank sold at 98, and le now 
offered there, and Sterling loet 2 1-2 
points now being offered at 1133. Mon­
treal CBty and District is 166 bid with 
no stock offered.

f 177 Hollis St 
Halifax, N. S.

Washington, May 17.—Continuing 
his testimony today before the Sen 
ate Inter-State commence commlssior 
on the United States railroad situa 
tion, Daniel Willard, president of tht 
Baltimore and Ohio railway company 
read into the record a table to show 
that since IMS there had been t 
steady increase in the ratio of operat 
ing expenses to net retenues. Tht 
return on property values, he said, a 
the same time has declined from at 
average of approximately five pei 
oent up to 1917, to 32 hundredth# o 
one per cent In 1990 and to one hun 
dredth of one per cant In February 
1921.

"NotwHhetanding there had been i 
constant but alight decrease in the rati 
per ton on traffic handled, and < 
gradual Increase In prices of comme 
dltk and in rates ot pey,M Mr. Wil 
lard said, “there was no abnorma 
change in net revenue.”

TR. G. M. M. MOVEMENTS.

Montreal, May 17 —The Canadlai 
government merchant marine freighl 
er Canadien Beaver will be the firs 
atfamer to leave thie port fdr Vat 
couver, via the Panama OanaL

On arrival at Vancouver the Cat 
edian Beaver will enter the ooaetln, 
service between Vancouver and 8a: 
Francisoo which win be Inagurate 
Shortly, it was announced here todaj

Two other boats will be employe 
in thie service.

C. G. M. M. officials declared toda 
thst the government fleet, whlc 
numbers fifty-five rfhlpe, is basic 
now then at any time. Only on 
Ship, the Canadian Recruit, is laid uj 
end she is in Halifax undergoing n
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MONTREAL SALES

Yielding 6 p.c.MONTREAL SALES McDougall & cowansBid
Maturing May let, 1941. 
Denominations $500 and 

$1,000.

Orders may be telegraph­
ed or telephoned at our 
expense. .

3714
Brazilian L H and P. . 30%
Brora ptoo ......................... 37*
Canada Cur .............
Canada C*r Pfd. ..
Canada Cement . . .
Canada Cement Pfd 
C-anada Cotton ....
Detroit United .........
1 k>m Bridge .............
Dorn Canne re ...........
Dom 1 ron Com.........
Dom Tex Com.........
Ixiurentide Paper Co.. 92% 
MacDonald Com ....
Mt L H and Power. .
Ogilvies ........................
Penman's Limited ..
Quebec Railway ...
Riordon .
Shaw W and P Co.........10S
Spanish River Com.... 72%
Spanish River Pfd......... 79*
Steel Co Can Com.... 58 
Tonon-to Rails 
W tyagams* k .

Abitibi 37*
30*
37*

Members Montreal Stock Exchange.
j 58 Prince William Street, SL John, N. B.

Branch Offices: Ottawa, Toronto, Winnipeg, Halifax, 
St. John, Quebec.

HEAD OFFICE, MONTREAL 
Older» executed on all Exchangee.

2914 30
57
53 53*
89
70
80* 82
75* .9
23
36* 37

130

EASTERN SECURITIES 
COMPANY, LIMITED

93
18* 20
85

. .201
9896

27* 
.... 23*

27*
23* RAGE & JONES /

», SHIP BROKERS AND ,
James MacMurray,

Managing Director. 
St. John, N. B. f: «80 STEAMSHIP AGENTS

MOBILE, ALA., U. S. A.
Cable Address—-“Pajonee. Mobile." Ail Leading Codas Used.

Halifax. N. S. •2'70 71
68

:Morning
Steamships Com—50 at 26*.
Steamships Pfd—45 at 57*.
Brazilian—50 at 30*. 46 at 30*., 10 

at 30*.
< iuiada Oem Com—25 at 63*. 75 at 

53*.
Canada Cem Bond»- 1.000 at 92*.
Dom Iron Com—d25 at 36*, 60 at 

36*. 65 at 37.
Shawinigan—115 at 108.
Montreal Power—2 at 86*, 50 at 

80*, 104' at 85.
Abitibi—130 at 37. 50 at 37*, 100 at 

37*. 20 at 37*. 25 at 37*.
Bell Telephone—15 at 106*. 4 at 

106*. 77 at 106, 15 at 105*, 25 at 
105*.

Canada Car Com—10 at 30.
Canada Car Pfd—6 at 57.
Gen Electric—70 at 109*
laurentide Pulp—150 at 92'».
Smelting—20 at 17.
Riordon—145 at 24.
Illinois Com—200 at 20
Quebec Railway—70 at 27*.
Atlantic Sugar Com—25 at 31*.
Brewerred Com—220. at 56. 225 at 

56*, 465 ttt 56*. 625 at 56*. 130 at 
56*. TOO at 57. 225 at 56*. 185 at 6#- 
%. 26 at 56%, 60 at 56%, 610 at 5.. 60 
at 56*, 60 at 56%. 35 at 56%.

Tuckette—50 at 40.
Brompton—94*5 at 37. 125 at 37*. 75 

at 37%. 225 at 37*. 225 at 37
1922 Victory Loan—99.
1937 Victory Loan—99.35, 99.40.
1923 Victory Loan—98.15, 98.2a.
1933 Victory Loan—97.35.
1924 Victory Loan—96.85.
1934 Victory Loan—95, 95,15.

N. Y. QUOTATIONS

Mi DougaD & Cowans)
High Low Close 
l-'U* J25% 126* 

42* 43* 42* 42%
42% 43

Am Car I'd y . I 25% 
Am Smell

42% 43
105--8 105* 106%

Anaconda 
Am Tele ... 105* 
Atchison .... 81 * 
Am Can .
Am Woollen

3tBond Market Dull.30* 50* 30*
.6* -6%
..V*

40* 40* 40%
88* 87* 88*
63* 62* 63*
79* 78* 78*

ii4* m 114* 
42 41* 41%
6S% 66 * 67%
14% 14

50*

Since the Quebec Commission have taken over 
our complete stock and Warehouses in 

Montreal we have established 
ourselves at

76*
bu% The Unltiked Bond Market continues 

Public Utility Bonds In the
61Beth Steel 

Balt and O C 40% 
Baldwin Loco. 88*
Chee and O. . . 62% 
Crucible Steel 79*
Can Pacific ..114 
Cent lxeath . 11
Chandler .
Brie Com .
Lien Motors 
Gt North Pfd ..TO* 
Gooder Rub 59* 
Inter Paper . 72*
Mex Petrol .1+9*
NT NH dnd H 19 
North Pacific. 73* 
Pennsylvania 
leading Com 7 5 
Republic SU . 59*
St Paul
South i*acific. 76*
Studebaker 
Stromber 
Un Pac
U S SU Com. 83%
U S Rub Com. 73V2 
Willy® Ovl’d .8% »
West Electric. 47*
sterling .........399%
V Y Fund . . 11% P.c.

dull.
past week have been in demand. Mon­
treal Tram and Power 6 1-2 per cent. 
1924 are 100 1-4 bid with Bonds offer­
ed at 100 1-2. Cedar Rapids Bonds 
are quoted 88 to 89. Southern Can­
ada Power's ere. offered at 88. In the 
Municipal group City of Montreal 6 
per cent. Bonds due 1922 «till main­
tain the price of 107, and the 6 s 1923 
are quoted 106 1-2 to 107 1-2. $100
pipces of both these ieauee sold at 104 
this week. In the InAistrial section, 
Eastern Car 6’s 1952 were in demand, 
and also Canada Cement's.
Scotia Steel and Coal 6 per cent. 1969 
eold at 72 1-2; Abitibi Power and Pa­
per 6's 1940 are offered freely at 88 
with no demand. Steel Company of 
Canada 6’e 1940 are offered freely 
•round 92 to 93 1-2. Little trading 
took .place In the last week, but 
strength was maintained In most oI 
the Securities in this market.

THROUGH RAIL SERVId 
TO PACIFIC COAST

Canadian National Railways Offs 
Most Direct Connections With Fast 

Through Trains from Montreal.
68%
14*
12%

14

7U* 69* 69*
59% 29* 39% 
75% 71 71

150% 148% 148% 
19* 10 19
73* 71* 72%
351 h 35% 34%
72 72 .2*
59* 57% >»X*
28* 28 28% 
77 76* 77
82% <9% 81%
39 38* 38*s

120* 120 120* 
83% 82% 83*
74* 7*3* ,3%

8% 8

The finest train service to the Pi 
Eks Coast is afforded by the Cam 
m National-Grand Trunk “Coat 

Limited" now leaving at 9.6r
p. m. dally from Bonaventure Statioi 
Montreal

The route of this finely equippe 
all steel train to the coast la via O 
tawa, North Bay, Cochrane, and vi 
the Transcontinental to Winnipeg an 
by Grand Trunk Pacific to Saskatoo 
and Edmonton and via Canadian Ni 
tional Railways to Vancouver—to 
finest ot seen to routes through U> 
Rockies and over the smoothest roa<

Nova
35*

295 Queen Street
OTTAWA

28*

79* 
•g ... 38 
Com ..119*

Unlisted transactions reported by 
Montreal Stock Exchange are as fol­
lows: Laurentide Power 10 at 67; 
Cosgrove Brewery 100 at 10, 300 at 
10, 200 at 10; Whalen 3 at 9 1-2; Dry­
den 60 at 14 7-8; New Riordon, 20 at 
3 7-8, » at 4; New Riordon pfd 2 at 
25 60 at 25, 40 at 25. British Empire 
pfd B 1-2 at 36; British Empire com 
mon 150 at 9. 210 at 8 1-2, 610 at
8 1-2, 410 at 8 1-2, 210 at 8 1-2.

bed.
From Maritÿne Province poim 

there is connection by Ocean Limite 
With the Continental Limited daQ. 
and by the Maritime Express daily « 
cept Sunday. The Maritime arrlrli 
in Montreal at 7.40 p. m. affords to 
most direct connection, but passe 
gers by the Ocean Limited will fiai 
the advantage of a day spent in Mon 
rest The Maritime arriving at Lev 
at 1.60 p. m. affords connection wii 
train No. 11 leaving Quebec daily ft 
Cochrane at 5.00 p. m. This tra: 
makes connection at Cochrane wit 
toe Continental Limited, so it will I 
sesythere is really a choice of tv 
dWnct routes.

Tnere is also the through service 
the Pacific coast by train leavti 
Toronto daily at HUH) p. m. via Su 
bury, Port Arthur, Fort Wil Ham aj 
Winnipeg. Connection for this is ma< 
by the Ocean Limited to Montrai 
and the Grand Trunk In tarnation 
Limited to Toronto.

Particulars of these epISndld ri 
services to the West will be explain 
by all G. N. R. Tldket Agents, aj 
folders and illustrated matter may 1 
obtained by application to any of tl 
City Ticket Offices or by writing t 
General Passenger Department, Mos

Afternoon
Steamships Pfd—1 at 58, 10 at 56*. 
Brazilian—25 at 30*.
Ontario Steel—25 at 69.
Dom Iron Com—25 at 37. -
Shawinigan—46 at 108 
Montreal Power—25 at 85.
Abitibi—50 at 37%.
Bell Telephone—11 at 105*, 39 it 

105, léô at 104*, 25 at 105%.
Bell Rts—275 at 45, 295 at 40. 
Laurentide Pulp—186 at 93. 
Riordon—25 at 22%.
Wayagamack—26 at 66.
Atlantic Sugar Com—15 at 31*. 
Breweries Com—310 at 56%, 140 at

Cotton
Low Close 
12.38 12 57

U'.iil

Hig'J 
. . . .12.58 
...13.06 12.9» 

....13.63 15.56 1 if.o
. .14.9') 13.90 13.97

May ...........
July ............
October .... 
December .

t- -1

and are prepared to fill orders from New Brunswick 
from our Ottawa establishment.MONTREAL PRODUCE 66%. 6 at 67, 15 at 56%, 25 at 56%.

Brompton—70 at 37*. 25 at 87%, 
25 at 37%, 75 at 37*.

Dom Bridge—-10 at 77.
Canada Converters—6 at 65.

Montreal, May 17.—Oats, Canadian 
Western, No. 2. 66 to 68 1-2; Oats, Can­
adian Weet-rn No. 3, 63 to 53 1-2.

Floor, Man. Spring wheat patente, 
firsts. 10.60.

Rolled oats, bag 90 lbs 3.00.
Bran, 29.26.
Shorts. 31.26.
Hay. No. 2 per ton, car lots, 23.00 

to 24.00.
Cheese, finest easterns, 161-2.
Better, choicest creamery 27* to 

371-2.
Eggs, fresh, 34.
Potatoes, per bag, car lets, 66 to 70.

I
►Canada Cotton Pfd—10 »t 74.

Catalogue and Prices Sent on Application.
Call At Any Th

We will be very glad to inform you fully as to how 
this institution can serve you as your agent in caring 
for your estate for the benefit of those you leave be­
hind. or in administering your business affairs when age 
or infirmity rob you of activity.

Wm. e. McIntyre, limitedTURPENTINE AND ROSIN. 
Savannah. May 17.—Turpentine

.’Inn 61; sales 131; receipts 40C: ship­
ments 139; stock 7,198. Rosin firm; 
sales 716; receipts 1,677; shipments 
4S6; stock 76,729.

295 Queen Street, Ottawa •A >

Mstnuraml Pel» sad Paper «■»»•'
fur

ot nm.7WM steer* eat
write eter detention of Internet, t 
araeteUra. eto, aad deb* bsrieee EraSTrite. lee.ee a «redit balen
■ate », w» of HM.0SS, oi
rrotte aie» are |2.ooi,vn era 
UablUUee are y.UU»fr

tendon. Mar 17—Crise. Calcutta 
£17 lie. Linseed oil Ms. 6<L 

on ttt. Petroleum, American
THE EASTERN TRUST COMPANY

3t John. N. B

\sr
•fined 2s 6 l-4d. Spirits 3s 4 14d.
Purpeatine spirits 99s. Rosin, Am­
ericas strained 17s, type O Ids. Tal- <vjrsur. Australian, Ms. «d.
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