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During the period of the Âmerican war,
there was very great distress in the dis-
tricts of Engiand In whicli the cotton menu-
factories were situated, and in wbich that
branch of industry was being carried. on.
But there was also profound sorrow, at the
same Urne, ln the royal household. The
people of Lancashire were suffering greatly
In consequence of lack of empioymrent, and
fromn the distress wbicb their failure to ob-
tain work produced; but tbey also knew that
there was distress in tbe palace, for the
Queen was, at the same time, deploring the
loas of Her Royal Consort, who had been
very dear to her, and In whose society she
had enjoyed great happiness, and tbey knew
weli that ber afflictions were even greater
than their own.

Her Majesty's efforts, during the whole
period of ber reign, were aiways directed
towards the preservation of peace, consis-
tent witb the just rights and tbe bonour of
the great empire of wbicb she was the bead.
Her great Influence, ber good senne, and
ber patience, were aiways turned to account
for the preservation of peace, and the pre-
vention "of the horrors Incident to war.
During the civil war In tbe neighbouring re-
public, our neigbbours were not unfrequent-
ly mistaken In their views as to the rigbts
aud duties o! otber states, nder the cir-
cumstances, and were not always reasonable
In their demande. Doctrines wbich were
at one Urne recognized by tbem as well
settled principles of International law, were
tbrown aside wben tbey Interfered witb the
lnterests o! the moment When war arose
between two sections o! the republlc, tbose
wbo were In charge of the affairs of the
north were disposed to maintain that there
was no wax, althougb tbey Insisted upon
exercising the rlghts wbich belong to a
beligerent, and wblcb, unless war existed,
tbey couid not dlaim. Her Majesty aud
ber advisers were most slxitons that notb-
Ing sbould be done Inconsistent with the
duties that pertained to the United Kingdom
as a neutral state. Where blockades were
established, and where a right of searcb
arose, their desire was that these sbould be
respected, and that nothing should be done
to wbich the president and his advisers
could reasonabiy take exception. But the
proclamation o! the Queen wbicb was In-
tended to secure from British subjects pro-
per . respect for the dlaim to belligerent

rights on the part o! the north, was con'-
plained of, as If It were an unfriendly act,
con! erring upon the revoiutionary govern-
meut, powers which otherwise they could
not claim. It was flot unnatural that those
upon wbom the active duties of adminis-
tration devolved, should be Irritated at this
unreasonable course; but Her Majesty's
great patience, snd her great toleration for
those wbo were placed Iu circumstances that
were entireiy novel to them, and wbo were
greatly annoyed by unlooked for divisions
and conflicta amonget their own people, did
not a little towards preserving the peace,
and maintaining, on the whoie, a condition
of mutual good-will, between the goveru-
meute of tbe two great Anglo-Saxon States.

During Her Majesty's reign, British
autbority was extended and consolida-
ted ln India. Wben the Sepoy rebelion
arose, the deeds of barbarity that were con'-
mitted by those who led that rebellous
movemeut, excited the deepest horror, and
the fiercest resentment In the mlnds of the
people in every other part of the empire ;
and there was a demand for vengeance
upon those who had perpetrated the most
sbocking crueities known In modern war-
fare; and Her Majesty alone, o! ail those
havxug the supreme direction of affaire, pre-
served her self-control, and ber desire, by
bumane meaus, to win back tuose who had
gone so far aatray, and by ber moderation,
she did much to secure the affections of
those wbo, It was supposed, were iu sym-
patby witb that movement. It was pro-
posed on that occasion to proclaim the Act
of August, 1858. and tbe principles upon
wbich India was thereafter to be governed.
A draft of tbat proclamation was prepared,
under the direction of Lord Derby, aud was
trausmitted to the Queen, wbo was then on
a vIsit to the continent. Her Majesty was
of the opinion that it was not conceived In
tbe splrit or clotbed In tbe lauguage appro-
priate to a state paper of great Importance,
and s0 ber objections were written out In
detail for the consideration of Lord Derby.
She lnformed His Lordsbip: 1 The Queen
would be glad, If Lord Derby would write
it out himself, In bis excellent lauguage,
beariug In mind that It la a female nover-
eign wbo speaks to more than. 100,000,000 of
eastern people, on assuming tbe direct gov-
ernment over tbem, and after a bloody civil
war, giving tbem pledges which ber future


