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corne conhing to the hands of the present executors until the
trust estate should bc paid the moneys found due by the Dom-
inion Trust Company on capital account; (3) that the order
varied the report on grounds flot taken by the liquidator in the
notice of appeal or raised by him on the argument, and violated
established equitable ruies govemning the administration of
estates and of equitable set-off and the accounting of defaulting
executors; (4) that no.commission or costs should be allowed
the liquidator or the Dominion Trust Company until full pay-
ment had been made to the estate of ail moncys found- in their
hands; and (5) that the Dominion Trust Company should bie in
no0 better or different position regarding accountability te the
trust estate by reason of their being a corporation, and no in-
dividual executor would, on being discharged from his office,
be gîven a charge on income until hie had paid ovcr ail capital
in bis hands.

The cross-appeal. of the liquidator was on thc following
grounds: (1) that no set-off should have býeen allowed of the
moneys held by the Dominion Trust Company as trustees for
Helen Beck and Doris Beck, as against the amounts advanced
by the Dominion Trust Company as cxccutors of the will of
Geoffrey Strange Beck 10 Helen and Doris on account of ineomne,
for the reason that no set-off in law could arise, because the
trusts and the parties to the trusts were dîfferent, the dehts
wcre not mutual debts, and did not arise in the samne riglit; (2)
that the application of the moneys received by the executors on
account of income to the payment of taxes and the annuîty to
Mrs. Beck should not have been disturbed, and tbe exeentors
should not have been directed to pay these sums out of capital.

The appeal and eross-appeal were heard by FALCO"RIDEaîx

C.J.K.B., RIDDELL, LATCEORD, and KELL-Y, JJ.
H. T. Beek, for the appellants in the main appeal and for,

Helen Beck.
E. C. Cattanacli, for the Officiai Guardian, representing

Doris Beck, an infant.
N. W. Rowell, K.C., and D. B. Sinclair, for the liquidator,

respondent.

RIDDELL, J., delivering the judgment of the Court, after
stating the facts, said that, whatever the hand whieh paid the.
money of the two daughters, il was paid for the two executors

and trustees, the Dominion Trust Company and Mr. Dennaistoun,


