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ox, 9 young bulls, 23 sheep, 4 heifers,
and 5 geats.

-If proof were needed that THIE
MISSIONAxtY REVIEW Wî' THIE WORLD)
is read and highly estenied, the sane
-would lie found abundantly in the fact
that it is so extensivehy quoted. For
example, the April Ulturc7e et ILmoa
and .Abroad reproduces (with due ac-
knoivled,-nient) not less tissu 12 items.

WOMAN'S WORK.

-This la thse queer way t1îey do in
Egypt: '«A woman outside wiso knew
the dochor called hlm to corne snd sce a
sicis clîild. We went into a dans room,
ivith no window sud only a tiny door;
as soon as I got accustonied to the dark-
ness, 1 asked where tise child ws
'l tise oven,> was the reply. I turned
to the large mud oven sud- stretched
out niy land te feel for lier. To my
horror 1 fouud the oven wnas liot, snd
the -woman calmly told mc that they
had been baking in it that day, and
that there was fire underneatis 1 Wc
exclaimed, but they said, as if it -were
thse most naturai thing in tise -wond for
people to live Ia hot ovens, that there
were two children ia there, and tisat
tisat was wliere they lived, and would
nlot corne out as it was so warmn iu-
side I"-T7e Gean>-.

-And this statenient from, thse saine
soure welI sets forth a phase of life in
thse Orient. A missiouary writes fron
tise laud of tise Nle : teI often ask the
women il they ever pray. Mfost of
them, lugh at the idea, aud say, ' We
pray 1 We do not kuow how to pray ;
ouly thse meu pray. Do you pray?'
Whou 1 say, ' Yes,' they say, ' Truly,
truly, lsow wonderful 1 Teaci us to
pray.'"il

-Tsmougli tise efforts of tise flev.
Sheldon Jackson, Uic first of thse 9 Pres-
byterian missions iu Alaska was cstab-
]lshed at Fort Wrangel ln 1877. Mrs.
A. R. McFar]and, upon five days' no-
tice, accepted this post, -where she was
williug te reniain alone-the only -%vhite
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woman in th- country, 'where thero
wcre few white people-anid heroically
servcd Christ as a minister, toaclier,
magistrate, nurse, and undertaker.

-Every way worthy to stand With
that of Mrs. Mary *R Schauffier, latejy
deceased, i8 the name of 'biss Jane S.
'WilJiamson, also recently called f rom
labor to reward, at the age of more
thian ninety-two years. Minnesota ws
the scene of lier missiouary service,
which, began in 1843. She was in ae.
tive work teaching the Indiaus at Lac
qui Parle and Raposia (now West St.
Paul) and Ycllow 3Nedicine for nineteen
years, until the massacre of 1862. At
Kaposia the mission houtse was more
than once assaulted by drunken Indifins
with clubs and knives. From YVellow
Medicine the missionaries fied for their
lives nt the time of the mas-ccre.
"Aunt Jane" with lier brother and his

wife were the lat white people to flee,
going alone hours a!tcr the rest bsd
fled.

-Dr. Mary Pierson Eddy, of Sidon,
in the Star in tue East, gives this nc.
count of lierseif : teA ycar ago, afte
receiving the first license ho practise
medicine and surgery ever accorded
to a woman in the Turkish Empire, 1
returned to Syria from Constaninople
to begin a new departure in missiojary
medical work. My aim being to meach,
the womcn of non.Christian sects
mainly, I decided upon itinerating hall
the year arnong the villages in the
mouritains, the other hlli among the
cies along thse coast. The number o!
our patients is limited on]y by my
strength. Monday, Wednesday, and
Friday I receive pay patients. Satur.
days and Wednesday, any one 'Who
brings a sealed paper tcstifying to har
poverty 18 treated frec. My chinies
average 40 dalhy, about 200 now pi.
tients every weez". The sad part o! ny
work la that I cannot gi vo more time to
ecd place I visit, for each lins features
of special need or peculiar interet
Thse other saddenlng spectacle i5 Lhe
many Nlio have to lie sent away. Tlsey


