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RURAL DEANERY dF BEDFORD.-The report

received from the varions parishes at the last
Ruri-Decanal meeting shows -That of ail the
parishes in the Deanery there is only o0NE whichî
receives aid from the Mission Fund, and the
Deanery as a whole, by free-will offerings from
the various parishes, contributes a larger sum to
the Mission Fund than it receives from it. This
is not a matter to boast of, but it is one that
may be mentioned with thankfulness.

Canon Mussen made a thoughtful speech lu
which ho pointed out certain of the difficulties
and weakness of the proposed " Quebec plan ";
lack of time, however, prevented a full consid-
eration of this important question, or a decision
therein. A very profitable discussion took
place upon the subject of Womans' work in the
Church; appreciative remarks were made by
Archdeacon Lindsay, Rev. G. Forsey, Canon
Davidson, Rev. Mr. Allan, Mr. l. D. Moore.
Dr. Gibson and others.

Mr. Forsey reported an increase of $1,000 to
the Endowment of Trinity Church, Cowans-
ville, and Mr. Constantine an increase of $100
te the Endowmant Fund of St. James' Church,
Stanbridge East-this is the boquest referred to
in our last.

Rev. Mi-. Forsey proposed, and Canon Robin-
son seconded a vote of thanks to the Rector
and Ladies of the parish of Dunham for their
" considerate efforts to promotc the comfort of
the Clergy and Laity attending the meeting,
and for the bountiful repast served at the close
of the moruing session." This concluded the
business, and the Bonediction was pronounced.

DIOCESE OF ONTARIO.

BAY OF QUINTE.-The last meeting of the
Bay of Quinte Clerical Association, which took
place in Napanee, was in -ail respects highly
successful. Thora was an unusually large at-
tendance of the membors from th district,
which oxtends from Kingston to Trenton, the
chief interest on this occasion arising from the
presence of the Provost o' Trinity Collage, on
the invitation of the Aredoacon. The Union
met in the school-room of St. Mary Magdalene's
Church on Tuesday. and that day was devoted
chiefly to a discussion of the prospects and de-
volopment of the University, of which the Pro-
vost is the Principal. It is well known that
snee tha arrival of so distinguished a scholar
aud divine as Dr-. B3ody, anc ai the most omi-
rent cf young Cambridge Fellows, thora bus
been new life and vigor infused into Trinity
Collage, and both students and funds bave
steadily inc-eased. He is evidcntly one of those
mon who can inspire enthusiasm into th mids
of others, and this couutry is fortunate in hav-
iug the bonefit of his leadership lu the import-
ant natter of higher education.

On Tuesday evening, the 7th inst., thoro was
full choral service in th Churlh, and those who
wore absent nissed a spiritual and intellectual
treat in the two addresses delivered by the Pro-
vost and by the Rev. J. W. Burke, Rector of
Bellevillo. It would b difficult te exaggeratc
the interest elicited by the Speakers in the ta
pics solected, both being handled by master
minds witli rare power and eloquence. The
Provost's subjeoct was " The Devotional chare-
ter of the Church's Matins and Evesong," and
the spiritual connection of one part with une-
thor, and bis words and thoughts wera as well
adapted for the clorgy as the laity present.
They seemed to throw fresh ad beautiful light
on tie familar fornis of devotion, which too
often ar forms and nothing aise. Mr. Burke
w-ith native eloquence enforced the importance
of Iho use of ftli Prayer Book in public oices,
and tIe benefit of becomiug botter acquainted
with its con'ents. Now and then lis humer
provoked a smile, as when ha said "Don't be
afraid of a ghost hiding in any dark corner of
the Prayer Book," referring to the visitation o
the sick, and the absolution pronounced. Ho
sbowed how in ail bar services the Church in-
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tended publicity-a common joining of as many
of ber children as possible in every rite, whether
Baptism, or Churchiug of Women, the Visita-
tion of the Sick, or the Burial of the Dead. Al
that was uttered by both speakers met, we need
scarcely say, with the warm commendation of
the large body of the Clergy present, who re-
gretted that more of their lay friands were not
in Church to be similarly edified.

On Wednesday maorning thre was an early
celebration of the Holy Communion, the Arc-
deacon and the Provost officiating. At 10 a.m.,
the Litany was sung by the Rev. W. Roberts,
Mus. B., the Archdeacon presiding at the organ.
The latter, we may stats, sang the service effee-
tively on both evenings in Church. On Wed-
nesday evening, with no organ accompaniment
whatever, the congregation heartily Sung Can-
ticles and hymns with great success, supported
by bis reverend brethren and a few choir mem-
bers. On this evening, Dr. Body was the only
speaker, continuing his subject, and enforcing
the duty of making worship rest on and start
from Christ and not from Self. He showed the
evils of the -latter, and how all gifts, and devo-
tions and efforts for God would be hallowed
and ennobled by the motive of offering them
froim the single desire to promote the Glory of
God. At the conclusion of the service, the
Archdeacon expressed his gratification at the
pleasant and profitable meeting of the Union in
Napanee, and thanked cordially the friends who
so kindly extended their hospitality to the vis-
iting clergy. We omitted to state that the af-
ternoon was devoted to the discussion, opened
by the Archdoacon, on Hebrew viii., 1-6, in
which ail mombers of the Union took a part,
and which was continued to 6 p.m. A very
cordial vote of thanks was unanimously given
to the Provost for his attendance and all his
valuable uddrcsses.

Tho next meetinrg of the Union has been fixed
to take place at Picton, in the month of Sep-
tomber, on invitation of the Rector, Rev. E.
Loucks.

The Cler;y present ut this meeting were the
Archdeacon of Kingston, the Provost of Trinity
Colloge, Rev. Messrs. Burke, Loucks, Baker,
Stanton, Fornori, Serson, Elliott, Prime, Cooke,
D. F. Bogort, Roberts, Harris, Bennett, Smythe,
Armstrong, Scantlebury, Anderson, Forster
Atkinson.

KINasOrN.-The Annual Meeting of the Wo-
mon's Auxilliary to the Domestic and Foreign
Missionary Society, closed on the 9th inst.

Thc following officers were clected fa: the
ensuing yeßr:

Presidont, Mrs. Tilton, Ottawa; 1st. Vice
President, Mrs. Grant Powell, Ottawa ; 2nd.
Vice Presidcnt, Mrs. Buxton Snith, Kingston;
Corresponding Secretary,Miss.Yeilding Ottawa;
-Recording, Sec.Mi-s. McLeod Moore, Prescott
Treasurer, Mrs. R. V. Rogers, Kingston;

Mrs. Lcwin, of Prescott, read the report of
the rosolution cormitteo. It oxpressed grati-
tude to God for the great success of the society;
thanks to the rctiring officers for their untiring
zeal and davotion ; to the ladies of Kingston for
their kind hospitality;to the rector ofS.Gearge's
cathedral for his able sorion, preached to
the dolegates; to the Synod for the use of the
meeting room; to Mesdames Moore and Roth-
well for their excellent papers ; and to the rail-
way authorities for the cheap fares which they
had gnanted to the ladies.

Addresses on mission work were made by
_Messrs. Carey, McMorine and Joues, and the
conferance was closed.

The next meeting will ho held in Prescott, in
Jun, 1888.

Tho Lord Bishop of Niagara, lield confirma-
tion hore on the 10th inst. In the afternoon at
St. Marks,Barriefiold, whero there were 22 can-
didates, and in the ovening at St. James' with
33 candidates. The attending clergy wore Revs.
Messrs. Carey, Cartwright, Jonos, Smith,Cooke,
IMeorine, Spencer, Prime and Burnes.
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on the evening of the 9th mest., the Rer. I.
Gongh Brick, f Arthabaska, N. W. T.,address-
ed a large meeting in the Synod Hall, he gave
an excellent account of his work among the In-
dians. He aise preached on the 12th inst., in
S. names Churcl in the morning, and in St
George's Cathedral in the evening.

On the 14th, St. James branch of the Ohurch
of England Temperance Society held their clos-
ivg meeting for the summer, there was a good
attendance, songs, readings and recitations,
were given besides addresses by Revs. A. W.
Cooke and I. G. Brick. This branuh has bden
particularJy successful in their work.

The Rev.B.B. Smith, ofSt. Georges Cathedral
bas gone to England on a three monthe' vaca-
tion.

DIOCESE OF TORONTO.

TEE SYNo.-The annual meeting of the

Synod cf the Diocese of Toronto began with

service at the Cathedral and administration of

IHoly Communion at 10 o'clock. on 14th June.
The baciness Session commenced at 11.30, when

after the opening prayer and the usual rou-
tine work regarding delegates' certificates, the
Bishop delivered his annualaddress. He refer-
red to the deaths of the Rev. Canon Morgan, of
-Barric, anc Rev. John McGreary, Hastings.
Daring the year there had been 9 removals and
8 additions in the clergy of the diocese. There
were now 143 clergymen-115 engaged in paro-
chiai work, 14 in tuition, etc., and 14 ret ired.
Thora had been 17 ordinations and 256 confir-
mations. There had been. admitted 1,234 candi-
dates to full conmmunion, of whom 454 are
males and 750 fer.. Three Churches have been
conseourated, St. Geo- e's, Menomenee; St.
Luke's, Creemore, and St. Barnabas, Toronto.
lo had preached 116 sermons, administered
Holy Communion 31 times and baptieed 8
infante.

The average attendance at morning,afternoon
and evening services-was 16,à39 5,019 and 16,-
478 respectively. The average attendance in the
city churches vas 8,400 in the morning, 8,600
in the evening, against 7,300 and 7,600 respect-
ively in 1885. (Applause.) In the country
the average attendance bas been 9,281 in the
morning and 9,239 in the evoning. Thora had
been hold altogether 19,830 services on Sundays
and 6,288 on week days. There had been 11,
739 communicants, in Toronto there being
4,869 against 4,591 at the last return. This
was not mel uding eports from St. James'eatbe-
dral and St. Tboa cbureb, whieh lad not
been sent in. There had been a decline in the
number of baptis-ms, the total number being
2,901, against 3,129. He admonishod the Cergy
that tbey should e ta it that mhis impertftnt
sacrament was not neglected.Therewas a decl
in the number of marriages from 787 to 765,
and an increase of deaths by 1, thare being 700
this year, against 699. The sunday school sta-
tistics made a very satisfactory showing. There
wore 160 schools, against 149 of the previous
return; 1,630 toachers, against 1,464, and
17,231 echolars, gainst 15,204. There wero
109 libraries containing 24,277 volumes, and
the returns from 98 schools showed voluntary
contributions to the extent of $7,298, which
h.ad beon principally devoted to loreign mis-
sions.

The Clerical Stipend Fund amounted to
860,924, against $59.952 of the previous return ;
parochial objecta, $91,621 against $83,622-.
(applause).-and extra parochial objects $28,
826, against.$ 2 3 ,780, or a sum total of volun-
tary contributions amounting to $181,771,15
boing $10,580 more than '1885 and $25,657 more
than the previous year. Thora have been six
new Churches built and two others were in
corse of erection. These had a total cost of
$20,000 and would seat 2,000 persons. Some
nine or ton misaons were being established in
the outskirts of Toronto, and they were buy-
ing up lands for sites. There was some talk of


