
2. While entering, within, or leaving tie territory of one Party', its Iaws and
regulations relating ta the admission to or departure froin its territor>' of
passengers, crew or cargo on aircraft (including regulations relating to entry,
clearance, aviation securit>', immigration, passports, customs and quarantine or,
in the case of mail, postal regulations) shail be cornplied with by, or on behaîf
of, such passengers, crew or cargo of the ather Party's airlines.

3. In the application of its customs, immigration, quarantine and similar
regulations, neither Party' shall give prefèence ta its own or an>' other airline
over an airline of the other Party engaged ini sirnilar international air
transportation.

ARTICLE 13

Safety

1. Eacb Party' shail recognize as valid, for the purpose of operating the air
transportation provided for in this Agreement, certificatas of airworthiness,
cartiticatas of cornpetency, and licenses issued or validated b>'th daother Party'
and still in force, provided that tha requiraments for suc certificates, or licenses
at least equal the minimum standards that ina> be establisbed pursuant to tha
Convention. Eiach Part>' ma>', however, refuse ta racogniza as valid for the
purposa of fiight above its own territor>', cartificates of competency and licenses
granted to or validated for its own nationals b>' tha other Part>'.

2. Eidier Part>' or dia aeronautical audiorities of éither Part>' may requast tachnical
discussions concerning dia safet>' standards maintained and administerad b>' the
other Party' relating to aeronautical facilities, aircrews, aircraft, and operation of
the dasignated airlinas. If, following such tachnical discussions, ana Part>' finds
that dia ailier Part>' does not effactivel>' maintain and administer safet>'
standards and raquiraments i diesa areas that at least equal the minimum
standards that oea> ha established pursuant to dia Convention, dia other Part>'
shail ha notified of such flndings and dia stops considered necessar>' to conform.
with these minimum standards, and dia other Part>' shall take apprupriate
corrective action. Each Party' reservas tha right ini accordance widi Article 4 to
withhold, revoka, or limit dia operating anthorization or technical permission of
an airline or airlines designatcd b>' dia othar Part>' i dia avent dia other Part>'
does not take such appropriata corrective action widiin a reasonable time.


