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tirc thing, inquired their lordsbips.
"Why rn y Lord," replied the gen-

t1enain, Il in the first place, ira the go-
ticral rush which you will see to the
public ordinaries, do not strive for the
head of the tables, but quietly' take
theC scats nearest the door. Whien-,
ever you address thc landierd of a,
c.ountry tavera, address liim as 'OGe-
neral.' Everv eldcrly gentleman
ivitlî whom you hold conversation
shc'uld be addressed as i'J<lg'cr,' or
' Squirec;' and be very careful in ad-
dressing every coachiman as 'Colonel!'
Attend to these things, my Lord, and
you mnay depend upon it, you wvill get
along smoothly enougli."

The hint wias adopted, at least ira
part. The young noblemea usually
travelled under the plain cognemnen
of the iMcssrs. Browns, ai-d have by
their o'wn unassuming deportmênt
been everywhere treated with the ut-
inost attention, and have x'eturnied de-
lighted withi a visit which they say
shall fot bc the last to tlue United
States.--.LN. Y. Corn. Adv.

SUBLIME MATITEMATICAL CALCULA-
TIONS.

What a noisy creature would a
inan bc wcrc his voice in proportion
to his weighit, as loud as that of a Io-
ust! A tocust can bc heard at the

distance of 1-16 of a mile. The gol-
den wren is said te weigrh but hialf ai
ounce; se thaï, a mniddling sized man
would weigh clown not short of 4000
of them; and it must be strange if a
golden wren would flot outweigh four
of our locusts. Supposing, therefere,
that a«. common man weighs as much
as 16,000 of our lecusts, and that the
note of a locust cani be hieard 1-16 of
a mile, a inan of cemmon dimensions,
pretty sound in wind and linib, oughit
te be able te inake himself distinctly
heard at the distance of 16,000 miles ;

and when hie snczed, "1 bis lieuse
oughit to fail about bis cars!"'

,Upp)osing a flea to weigh i g.rai,t
whichi is more than its actual wcigh
and Ie jump Il 1-2 yards, a common
man of 150 pounds, with jumping
powers ina proportion, could jump
12,800 miles, or about the distance
from New York te Cochin China.-
Aristophanes, represents Socrates arad
his disciples, ais deeply eragaged ira
calculations of this kind, around a ta-
ble on whiuh they are waxing a flea's
legs te sec what xveighit it xviii carry
in proportion to its size, but hie does
net aninotince the resuit etf their expe-
riments. Wc are therefore happy in
being able te s uppiy, in some degree,
se serious an amuisson.-N. Y. >Sun.

ORIGIN OF THiE FOX FAMILY.
The ennaobled fat-iiy cf the Foxes

ewe their risc te the merits of their
ancester, Sir Stephen Fox, xvho, ai-
though originaily Il a poor boy ira the
choir cf Salisbury cathedral," a fact 1
believe neot ailuded te, in any peerage,
yet by his abiiity and inteýrity, and
under the auspices cf King Charles IL
became evencitualiy Paymaster cf the
Army, and a Lord Commissioner cf
the Treasury. H1e died ira 1716, pos-
sessed of immense riches, the fruits cf
a life cf probity and perseverance.-
The niearti cf Sir Stephen Fox is
entitled te higli veneration for bis hav-
ing been the projector oaf that noble
insditution, the Chelsea Hlospital. He
was ancester te the present Earl cf
lichester, who possesses not a greater
honor than that cf being descended
fromn se excellent a character. The
celebrated Charles James Fox xvas
iikewise a descendant cf Sir Stephien,'
as is aise the present Lord Heolland.-
Fi-on the Marquis Charnperro& de
Haitirkin's Réeardies.
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