
alnadln

J lAe

VOL 
XX.No i.

Ï,''"0

JUNE
Nineteen
Nineteen

Canadian Bureau
for the

Advancement of Music
is your organization. It exists
for your benefit. It is active
in creating and stimulating
public interest in music. It
stands for more music and
better music in the hoes and
in th, schools, in the churches
and in the clubs, in the parks
and in the public halls, in the
factories and in the stores.
With labor demanding and re.
ceiving more time for recrea-
(ion the responsibility and the
opportunity of the Music In-
dustries to supply the means
of music increases. This
Bureau is the association
through which all branches of
the Music Trades co-operate
in making Canada a musical
nation. The Bureau is en.
titled to your active and inan-
cial support. Are you giving
it? Address the Bureau at
66-68 West Dundas Street,
Toronto.
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