
THE ONTARIO WREKLY NOTES.

a jury at Toronto. KELLY, J., in a written judgment, said ti
the plaintiff was to succeed, there should be the clearest evi
Of a certain and deéfinite contract deliberately made by t
ceased: Waker v. Boughner (1889), 18 O.R. 448, at p. 454.
Plaintiff's allegation that the improvemients ho now sought
pensation for were made at the request of bis father was negi
by evÎdence whîcli the learned .Judge was coinpelled to a&
Upon the whole dlaim, ini respect of any obligation of tb
ceased, the plaintiff failed. The plaintiff sought Vo charg
defendants, the executors, with work done and material sul
since the decease of their testator, but there was nothing to
that they were hiable therefor, Action dismissed with eosts.
PhelaZ, for the plaintiff. M. K. Cowan, K.C., for the defeni
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ýTuW- Accotent - Release - Sale of Properties of
Ese-Iierest-Coss.1-An action against a truste. fi
account, tried without a jury at Hamilton. LENNOX, J.,
written judgment, said that, without deciding that the rE
or document referred Vo as a release, executed by the plaintif
bis mother on the 6th October, 1899, waa bindîng Vo ail inteut
purposes, h. was of opinion that there was not enougli shei
justify hum or the. Local Master at London, Vo whomn c
questions were referred, ini ignoring the amount ($18,14
ackziowledged and stated by that instrument as being pro
accouiited for by the dlefeudant. The. Master reportedt that
wore some amail properties of the estate yet Vo be *dispos
Nothng was shewn to satisfy the learned Judge that the defe
was niot legally ompellable to execute completely the tru,
uldertook; but this was not insisted upon; and the rights 4
parties could b. secured i aiother way. The plaintiff sha'
ceed, i a way involving no unneoessary expense, Vo procure
for the. purohase of these properties, at the prices Nalready
taiued by the. Master as reasonable, or at about these pricei
hitiier prices if they cau be obtained; and the defendant ar
plaintif! and otb.r nc8ayparties, if any, if they cau b
cured to do s0, shail joi in the. conveyances, with liberty rei
to Vhe plaintiff or defedaut to apply Vo the Court for a f
order if ay difficu1ty aiiould arise. Exclusive of these prop
the. total amount Vo b. accoiuted for by the. defendaut 1
plaintiff is $21,.43.02, aud he bas acoounted for 820.Cl


