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DRý W. F. 13AB13, of London, formerly, of Fullarton, lias entered
into partnership with Dr. J. McWilliarn, of Thamesford.

Dii. CRAW1roRD, Niagara Falls, lias taken into partniership Dr.
H-orace H-. Elliott, late house surgeon ini Toronto Hospital.

DR. R. M. CUMBE RLAND, ivho graditated at Toronto this spring,
wvil1 assist Dr. Harper, of Alliston, Ont., during flie summiner.

.DR. G. A. WOODRUFF, of Winnipeg, formerly of Middleville,
lias passed his exams in inedicine in Manitoba University.

DR. D. J. MCKAY, of Ingersoil, Ont., left on Wednesday for
Maddock, Northî Dakota, wvhere hie wvill continue lus practice.

DR. J. P. KE NNE DY) of Wingham, has been appointed associate
Coroner for the County of Huron by the Ontario Government.

DR\. CARLAW, of Coiborne, left a few days ago for Chuicago,
where lie will pursue a post-graduate course in medicine and
surgery.

DR. W. J. PATTE RSON, late of Norwvood, hias joined the ranks
of Barrie's niedical muen, having taken the office of the late Dr.
Vivian.

DR. J. A. DUNCAN, wvho lias been engaged at his profession at
Church's Ferry, Northî Dakota, for some tnontlîs, lias returned to
Elora.

DR. GUNNE, of Dauphin, Man., lias rnoved to Rat Portage,
(now Kenora), wvhere he wvill join his brother, Dr. Wni. Gunne, in
practice there.

DR. WiM,. H. IVE, Wvho lias been practising rnedicine in Chat-
hanm for some years, lias gone to Kansas City, Mo., wvhere he will
in future reside.

DR. S. McCCM.,LUiýr, Thornbury.. Ont., hias gone to New York,
where hie intends to spend some weeks in a post-graduate course in
the New York hospitals.

DR. AMBROSE STANTON, son of Thomas Stanton, of Ponty-
pool, hias been chosen Senior H-ouse Surgeon to Sir Patrick Manson,
at Greenwich Hospital, one of the most desirable posts in Old
London.
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