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Nikita: stylish sexy French thriller
by Almeida Quim

La Femme Nikila 
directed by Luc Besson 
Alliance ML. 
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La Femme Nikila is the latest feature 
Irom Frenchman Luc Besson. 
Although I have not seen his other 
works, which include the interna­
tionally successful Le Dernier Corn- 
par. the cult hit Subway, and Le 
Grand Bleu. I was extremely 
impressed by his film making talent 
in La Femme Nikita.

La Femme Nikila is a stylish, sexy, 
French thriller. Like the heroine 
Nikita herself, the Him is explosive 
and violent. The visuals and the style 
of Him are sophisticated and sleek, 
and it has a glossy French avant- 
garde look to it.
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When we first see Nikita herself, 
she is a seedy underworld junkie in 
need of a ‘fix'. When her
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underworld friends get blown away 
by the police in a failed attempt to 
steal drugs, Nikita seeks revenge by 
blowing away a few cops with her 
deadly aim. After she gets arrested 
and sentenced for murder, she is 
declared dead by the authorities.
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> mr-1She is then approached by an 
agent from an underground 
government agency (played with 
‘007' coolness by Tcheky Karyo). 
who would like to use her excep­
tional talent for killing people for the
government’s ow n expions. Alter Beautiful and dangerous Nikita (Anne Parillard) leads a double life In the stylish thriller La Femme Nlklte.
much resistance. Nikita realizes she 
has no choice but to obey the author­
ities. The alternative is imprison­
ment or death.
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control of the government agency 
she realizes her life is a living hell.

my. thinking she works late nights at 
the hospital when she goes on her 

and attempts to struggle for control assassination assignments. Their 
of her life. love for each other represents the

struggle of good over evil in the 
To offset all the violence and movie, 

coldness in the movie, a counter plot 
is introduced in which Nikita falls in 
love with a gentle and likeable man 
(played by Jean-Hugues Anglade).
He is totally blind to her secret iden­

tité ending.was unsatisfactory, as the 
story is not properly resolved and the 
audience is left wondering about the 
fate of Nikita.

Anne Parillard is stunning and 
seductive in her pot rayai of Nikita. 
She plays the character with razor 
edge volatility while also giving her a 
tender vulnerability and sexiness 
which makes Nikita so appealing.

Overall, if you are looking for 
something that will dazzle your 
senses, with lots of style and fast- 
paced action, you should not miss 
this movie.

Nikita is soon programmed and 
groomed into a sexy feminine killing 
machine for the government’s 
underworld activities. Although she 
is allowed to live on her own, Nik­
ita’s life becomes a nightmare as she 
eannot escape the manipulation and

I also did not like the excessive 
exploitation of violence in the movie, 
especially the gruesome scenes at the 
end. The worst is the scene in which 
acid is poured over several convuls­
ing undead bodies in a bathtub.

While the movie is slick and well- 
done. it nevertheless has its flaws. 
The movie is not a four-star master­
piece. but it comes close to it. I felt
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rides into Toronto I i
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, . . ’ Director Luc Besson {Subway, Le Dernier Comat, and Le Grand 

Bleu) films a scene for La Femme Nikita from an interesting 
perspective.


