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BILL RAY NEW SRC PREXY
Council Decide on 
Pennant Contest

After edging out Fred Clark 
in a closely contested election, in­
coming S.R.C.
Ray, Wednesday evening, was 
given his first opportunity to 
demonstrate his ability as chair-

I 1

President, Bill
m

The meeting was called to or­
der by retiring President Gordie 
McAllister, who after thanking 
the council for their good work 
done for him, turned the meet­
ing over to Mr. Ray. New mem­
bers of the council were intro­
duced and the fact that the name 
of absent fresh rep. Andy Long 
had been omitted in a recent list 
published in the Brunswickan 
was noted.

Inspired by a request for a 
U.N.B. pennant from the Univer­
sity of Alberta the council de­
cided to hold a pennant contest. 
Designs for an official U.N.B. 
pennant are to be submitted to 
Ron Pearsall, chairman of the ap­
plication’s committee of the 
S.R.C. on or before Friday, No­
vember 15th, 1957.

Entrants mtist be U.N.B, stu­
dents and all entries mast be f 1 
full colour on 18"x27" paper, A 
cash prize of $10 will be award­
ed die winning entry.

The considerable damage sus­
tained by the Forestry building 
during “Paul Bunyan raids” is 
to be paid for by the students, 
either by a flat fine levied on all 
students or by contributions by 
those involved.

Efforts to secure the gym for 
the purpose of a Sock dance Sat­
urday evening having met with 
no success, the dance will be held 
in Mem. Hall, it was reported.

It was decided that Mount A. 
students would pây 60c for tick­
ets admitting them to the football 
game and dance.

A motion by Mr. Pearsall that 
the St. John Ambulance Society 
be given a donation by the S.R.C. 
on the occasion of their annual 
drive to be determined on a basis 
of 10c per student, resulted in 
concern being expressed lest an 
undesirable precedent be set.
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Bill Ray (far right) SRC presidential candidate, sets students a good example as he casts a ballot while (left to right) Vivian Grant, George 
Bastin and Basil Lowery look on. ,

BOMBERS TO MEET 
MOUNTIES SATURDAY

UNB Students 
Go To The Polls ATTENTION

SENIORS!Bill Ray was elected new 
S.R.C. President on Wednesday, 
as U.N.B. students went to the 
polls to select S.R.C. officer* for 
the new year.

Running in the presidential 
race were BiU Ray, who won with 
a margin of eleven votes defeat­
ing his only opponent Fred Clark 
323 to 312 votes. Counting two 
spoiled ballots 637 votes were 
cast representing 67.1% of the 
student body.

Miss Pat Crozier was elected 
to the post of Secretary-Treasurer 
of the Senior class with 85% of 
the das* voting. Freddie Critch- 
ley becomes new sophomore rep­
resentative and William Lewis 
was elected President of the 
Freshman class, Mike O’Connor 
acted as returning officer.

Tomorrow the University of 
New Brunswick Red Bombers 
will meet the high-flying Mount 
Allison University Moon ties, in 
what promises to be THE home- 
game of the current season. A 
capacity crowd is expected to be 
on hand at Fredericton’s College 

. Field to witness a renewal of that 
rilvalry between the two schools 
which originated with the old 

' English Rugby contests and has 
been carried on with the entrance 
of Mount Allison into the 
NBCFU last year. Kickoff time 
for this regular league game is 
2.00 p.m. '

Upwards of 200 Mount A stu­
dents will arrive in the city by 
train around 12.30 p.m. on Sat­
urday. A parade will form up at 
the station and will consist of 
students of both universities, uni­
versity bands and cheer leaders.
The parade will proceed from the 
station down York Street to King 
Street, King to Regent Street, up 
Regent Street to the Student 
Centre.

For tile afternoon game special

space will be allotted in the 
bleachers to the visiting student*. 
At half-time the city girls will 
demonstrate their gridiron skill 
against the Maggie Jean football 
squad.

On Saturday night a dance for 
students of both universities will 
be held in the Memorial hall be­
ginning at 9 or 9.30 p.m. Ad­
mission will be 35c per person. 
Music will be furnished by the 
Collegians. The train is expect­
ed to leave around midnight.

There will be a meeting spon­
sored by the Business Adminis­
tration Club, to bé held in the 
Oak Room of the Student’s Cen­
ter on Monday, November 4th at 
7JO p.m. A panel, consisting 
of Prof. Maher, Prof. Red din, 
Plot Whalen and Mr. Tunis will 
answer questions on the subject 
“Getting a Job”. This will in­
clude the interview, the letter of 
application as well as the job 
resumé, and openings in the Civil 
Service. There will be a period 
open to questions after each topic 
is discussed.

NFCUS Insurance
Mr. Frank W. Howell, Mari­

time Manager of the Canadian 
Premier Life Insurance Com­
pany, will be on the campus No­
vember 6 and 7. The purpose 
of his visit will be to consult any 
student who wishes to learn any­
thing about the NFCUS Life In­
surance plan, and its new de­
velopment, the NFCUS Life plan 
for first year students.

Any student wishing further 
information on this subject be­
fore the arrival of Mr. Howell, 
may contact Herbert Shepherd or 
Bob Sutherland at the Lady 
Beaverbrook Residence.

Letter from President
I would like to express my 

thanks to the students of UNB 
for the faith they have shown me 
in the recent Presidential Elec­
tion. Also to several students 
who gave of their time to help 
before the election, I am grateful.

As president, I shall do my 
best to lead your council in a 
manner which will do honor both 
to you, the student body, and to 
the University community.

William Ray, President.

NOTICE!APOLOGIA

When this edition went to 
press “Paul Bunyan” was still in 
his place. Due to unforseen van­
dalism it was decided to remove 
him, but references to him had 
already been printed. Ed.

BUSINESS ADMINISTRA­
TION CLUB WILL REIM­
BURSE MOUNT A TRAIN 
TICKETS AT THE S.R.C. OF­
FICE TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 
5TH 12-1 JO P.M.
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