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I ama worried by the apparent tendency toward dele-
gating responsibilities from the Canadian Pension
Commission and the Veterans' Appeal Board to depart-
mental ministers. This is a dangerous precedent, be-
cause if adjudication duties corne under the auspices of
the bureaucrats, responsibility and accountabiity are i
danger.

I arn also concernied with the response of govemnment
resolutions arising from veterans conventions, whicli is
either too slow or lacking altogetlier. Some areas of
urgent priority to veterans are the elirnination of delays
i addressing pension applications. I know it lias come a

long way, and it lias a lot farther to go, of course.

The ineligibiity of widows to benefit from pension
increases assessed after their spouse's deatli, tlie pay-
ment of proportionate rather than full pensions to
widows, payments to serving members of the forces
titrougli sustained disabilities whicli restrict promotion,
transfer and review of the basis of disability pension
rates, iequity of the War Veterans' Allowance Act
which must be corrected is a requirement that veterans
or their widows must be a resident i Canada when
applying. Before the allowance can be paid outside of
Canada, the recipient rnust liave a contiuous total of 12
rnonths residency i Canada.

This may seern quite ail right at tlie outset. Many
people, some of tliem wlio did not return home from
overseas after the war, live i the United States or other
places. They would benefit greatly because these people
are flot the people who are buying shares i Air Canada
or Petro-Canada. These people are living far below the
poverty line, and it would seera only fair that the
veterans or their widows who cannot return to Canada
be eligible for this allowance.

'Me War Veterans' Ailowance Program is itended to
meet the basic needs of veterans. In order to maintain a
reasonable quality of life, some additional icome from
casual earnings, iterest on savigs and rentals are
exernpted from calculatig icome. However, the last
icrease i the casual earnings exemption was i 1985

when it went from $100 to $140.

Government Orders

Veterans' associations believe that an exemption of at
least $50 per year is more realistic and that increases
should be at least equal to the Consumer Price Index
gain since 1985.

I cannot stress enough how important and how urgent
these matters are for our veterans and their dependents.
They must be addressed now, not in a matter of years.

Another matter which has been raised by the veterans
and others across the country is recognition of the
contribution made by merchant searnen during Canada's
war effort durig the two world wars and Korea.

While merchant seamen were not memibers of the
Armed Forces, they played a crucial role in the war
effort. Without the merchant navy, our forces would
have been deprived of vital supplies of food, weapons,
anununition, vehicles, fuel and other essential items
which were necessary to ensure our victoiy.

We have the cold statistics of men killed and ships lost
to rernind us that although the merchant seamen were
not members of the Royal Canadian Navy, they ran the
same risks and too often paid the samne price.

Tliey did it for the samne reason. They did it to defend
their country and its values. They cleserve the samne
recognition and the saine support that we give veterans
of the forces.

Since 1941, the Goverrment of Canada lias recognized
the equality of service and sacrifice of the merchant navy
by awarding the Silver Cross to the widows and the
mothers of those merchant seamen wlio gave their lives
in war.

It seems strange to me that we recognize the equality
of service and sacrifice with this medal, but we do not
recognize the equality of service when it comes to
granting equal benefits to those merchant seamen who
retumned. 'lb put it bluntly, if a merchant seaman was
killed, lie was a hero. If lie returned, he was a forgotten
civilian.

In 1962, ini response to pressure from the Canadian
Legion and the Mercliant Navy Association, the Cana-
dian governiment made an effort to recognize the service
of these people by passing Part Xl of the Civiliant War
Pensions and Ailowances Act, whicli granted tliem the
equivalent of war veterans ailowance. Ini view of titis, it
was not too mucli to expect that when the government
extended wliat is now cailed the veterans independence
prograin, or VIP, to the recipients of the war veterans
ailowance, the merchant seamen would be eligible for
VIP but tliey are not.
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