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manager's office. She was later seen 
dandng the Lambada with Tim "Lion 
of" Judah, much to the consternation 
of Kwameister, who was singing a

after which he broke into a drunken 
rendition of Bob Marle/s "No Woman 
No Cry." The band promptly paraded 
back on stage for their final set

Caribbean Night virtuoso 
singer Poindexter "Father" Noel at­
tempted to join the band onstage for 
his best-known song "Amour." Gui­
tar player Ras Baba burst into laughter 
at the sight of Noel, obviously remem­
bering the heartwarming rendition of 
the song at Caribbean Night, which 
tugged at his heart strings as a member 
of the World's Most Hastily As­
sembled Band.

he recent Student Union Ban 
quet,held at the glamorous SUB 
Ballroom, wasan evening filled 

with food, wine and music. SU Presi­
dent Payne Carson basked in the mo­
ment: "This is an evening I have 
dreamed about since I was 13, laying 
in my bed at night, although the dream 
usually involved Farrah Fawcett Ma­
jors and two bottles of suntan lotion." 
He was later seen looking for "On a 
Whim" Doyle, smelling suspiciously 
of Bain De Soleil.
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Trenchcoat-wearing private 
eyes, hired by stone-faced Dean of 
Students "Can'tTake A Brick" Austin, 
patrolled the crowd looking for evi­
dence. It seems a harmless prankster 
got Brick's back up against the wall, 
and now Brick was looking to fit the 
prankster with a pair of cement shoes.

Whim Doyle and Payne Car- 
son returned to buy everyone within 
sight drinks; their bar tab quickly rose 
to $200. Later the honoraria of two 
Bruns editors were cut back by the 
same amount
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slow, spiritual reggae number he wrote 
called "He Screams For Ice Cream."

UNB President James Downer 
joining in the festivities after the ban­
quet, obviously still embanased at re­
ceiving his award, darted through the 
crowd looking for his companion so 
that he could demonstrate the reasons 
he had won a previous athletic ability 
award. "After I retire?," he was heard 
replying to roving Bruns reporter A1 
Farter; "I don't know, I'll probably 
join Boo-Berry Davies in Montserrat 
where I hear he bought a penthouse."

fmymc Cmccm- cjcytc kckmtd, yea weiccl/ac kim, we're uU

Reggae band Ujamaa provided 
music for the festivities, and they were 
seen in the prestigious College Hill 
Social Club throughout the dinner; 
manager Tim "Lion of" Judah was 
spotted attempting to pry loose some 
back pay owed them by cheapskate 
club owner Matt "Got You By The 
Little" Hair-ris. Lead singer Kwameis­
ter was seen with a bevy of starlets 
including Bruns staffers Lynne Wan- 
nahicky?, Mel Hawkeye, Jaded Mock- 
ler, and Jennifer Dunkin-Donuts.
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Downer left 
quickly when 
told by Bruns 
photo editor At 
S. Tare that the 
only penthouse 
Boo-Berry had 
bought was a 
magazine.

Band longhair Mike "Sax 
Larue" was sighted moping about 
looking for a quiet spot to watch 
Quincy, his female companion Sal­
monella in tow. Other band longhair 
Ras Baba was loudly proclaiming to 
anyone who might listen that the 
Kwameister had promised he could 
sing into a microphone during the 
evening's performance.

One of the Brunswickan man­
aging editors, Lynne Wannahicky?, 
rarely seen at the dub, was sitting by 
the door with her string of compan­
ions, furtively glandng toward thedub
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1%Later in 
the evening, af­
ter a few too- 
many drinks,
Tim "Lion of"
Judah loudly bragged from the stage Joe King is a freelance reporter based in 
during one of the band's breaks, "Yah! GreenwichVillage. HemovedtoFreder- 
I'm as Jamaican as the Kwameisteri", icton for unmentionable career reasons
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