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the arflloLred train to complete demorai-
ization! Being splenclidly served, ýthc
machine guns operated by Capt. Leamiy
rnowed thern down as a reaper cuts tlhe
corn, whilst the soldiers under Capts.
Munro and Swinford leaping from the
train on either side immediately took
cover, adding the strengthi of 500 rifles
to those already surrouncling the Jap-
aniese colunin. Revengeful, and mad
xvith rage at the wanton and rnerciless
destruction of Victoria, every man was
eager to attack the enemny andi corne to
a hancl-to-hand conflict; but Gen. Mc-
Donald's orders had been ernphatic that,
eno single iBritish life was to be sacri-

ficed unnecessarily," andl each man real-
ize(l that tliis wvas but the first of many
engagements, as also, that the surprise
ý,vas so complete that deatli or surrencler
wvas their only alternative.

0f the Canadians harclly a man liad
ever fired a gun at bis felloxv-man; with
few exceptions, none iaci even seen the
mnimic warfare of a shamn fighit or miii-
tary manoeuvres, and the f ew disciplined
men amongst them were entirely insuffi-
cient to admit of truc niilitary tactics,
but the lessons given themn had been well
studied, andi acting upon them no mnan
recklessly exposed himiself to the fire
with which the japanese survivors endea-
vourC(I to locate the attackers.

It wvas no longer a fight, it was a
carnage! the air rang with Banzai!
Banzai! as the stubborn foe desperately
atteml)ted to, rake headway until rank
after rankc la), heaped one on the other
as they fell before the never-ceasing, vol-
ley issuing from the fiat car ahead of
thern. For nearly an hour the slaughiter
continued, when a japanese bugle
sounded ; wh ite hancikerchiefs wvere
hoisteci on bayonets, andi Colonel Toki
with Capts. Noguchi andi Loyen, surren-
dered as prisoners of war to Colonels
Todcl and Shields. The British loss was
small in killeci, though many were
wounlecl; but of the enemy less than
two thousand survived, whîlst miost of
those bore wounds shewing the terrible
ordeal throughi which they had passed.
Amiongst the dead were Generals Hart
andi Yatsubuchi, with scorces of offl-
cers of lower rank.
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