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of Ajax is miade up in W. Virginia of an earlier appearing Wdlirslii and a
later 7elamonide.v; the subsequent broods as iii New York. That in the
high north there is a single brood-the spring formi Lacia atone. That in
California (tihtil ive have further knowledgc) the carly spring brood is
absent and the summer broods are made Up of Pseueda;gio/us with occa-
sional smaller (neglecta> and occasional more lieavily marked (Piatsis.)
individuals. On this hypôthesis, Lucia is a boreal and colline forni of
violacea, and the sumrncr broods of the species are absent ini the extfee
north, or, further south, consist of larger (Pscidargioliis) and smal]er
(neglecta) individuals, according to conditions more or less favorable to
growth.

0f course tlîis lîypothcesis is based principally upon mny personal
knowvledge of the sequence of formis in New England, and may prove
altogether wvrong. I believe, howéver, that it is worthi considering. If it
appear complicated, it need only be said that there is complication some-
where. And furtherniore, while Mr. Edwvards in NV. Virginia raised
violaceci in the spring froi progeny of Pçeit(ar,çiolits which ivent into
chrysalis the aieuimn previous, Mr. Abbot iii Georgia years ago raised
Psemdargiolus <or what hie callcd Ai:t-io/ils) in MUarci fromn caterl)illars
which ivent into chrysailis the last of lipril of the preceding year. The
spring brood, therefore, is probably mnade up, in the south at least, of
butterfiies which existed as caterpilliars at various tinies during the whole
of the previous year. This is precisely wvhat Edwvards lias admirably
proved of Ajax-; and if it be a constant phienomenon in Cyaniris, then it
is likely to be equally true at the northi, aiîd the probable occurrence of
dimiorphisni in the first brood at the northi (Lucia-violacea) would be
siiar to the saine phienonieion in Ajax at the south ( W'fais/zii-2'e/a;onides)
and the two features niay yet be proved to have a logical connection.

It inay also be added that it is extremiely uncommion for two such
closely allied species as neglecta and Lulcia, living iii the saine district, to
differ as niuch as it lias been supposed they do, in the number of their
broods, Lucia appearing in New~ England but once, «Ic&lca twice a year';
indeed only one instance among New" England butterlies occurs to nme,
and that is sonîewhiat doubtful. I refer to Limnocliores Rziimas and L.
MAana/aae/ua, the former of wvhich is double brooded, and .the latter, as
far as I know; single brooded ; the data, iii the latter case, hiowever, are

*Tho second brood appears to be invariably less abundjant tlinu the first.


