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More Hopeful Fee 
burg—Bismark’e 
Menelék Withd;

'i British and Colon: 
quakes in Ital 

and the

London, March 3ll 
enue returns offer a 1 
tion of the prosperity 
of the effect of the d| 
rated by Sir William 
as chancellor of thm 
late Liberal govern ml

Receipts were £1(1 
increase of £7,2t)U,cl 
last year, and be ini 
than Sir William vl 
timated in the budgJ 
totals are £97,788.1 
above Sir William II 
Thus the surplus fori 
to over £4,000,000. J

Near Jaguey Chicol 
gents have banged a I 
ant named Ensebio I 
Pavia has been engae 
gent band under Lam 
the Cantaibria plan! 
Matanzas. The insl 
killed and wounded,I 
exploring engine aftl 
retired.

An order issued byj 
ister of Public Insl 
published, admitting! 
Austria of women I 
medical diplomas.

President Kruger hi 
tish agent at Prétorial 
will be placed in thm 
desiring to be enroll! 
Rhodesia. Colonial 9 
Iain’s latest dispatch® 
government have al 
It is alleged that they 
timatum to the Tran® 
tions pending betweel 
ments. I

A despatch from Cel 
Times says : “ The Fl 
attempts to infuriate I 
England on account ® 
tion have failed.” Al 
the Times says : 11 Tm 
Suakim district is cril 
forces are small anl 
sirable that* Indian tl 
lieve the anxiety.” I 
Times from : Constant 
en ce to the effect! I 
United '• States a 
against the ex pul si® 
from Asia Minor says! 
note that the Sultan 1 
counteract the a lull 
schemers sought to I 
ordering the expulsiol 
were guilty of distl 
order.”

The Cape Town coil 
Times fully confirms I 
ceived here of the grl 
tion in Africa.

M. Sarrien has heel 
Minister of the Inter] 
the same position I 
cabinet of 1886 and in 
of 1887.

Confirmation has I 
Wady Haifa of the n| 
that Osman Digna wij 
threatening Sinkat, I 
little over fifty miles I 
dervishes are advaul 
force and an attack il

The Paris correspoi 
News says: ‘‘Beliid 
senate’s resentment I 
Bourgeois. He is a 
manufactured the cal 
senate during Preside] 
South France. The] 
the country to bj 
sia has waxed cold] 
cal-socialist govern id 
This may be true, in-] 
Czar only entered in] 
liance after President] 
to govern with reactil 
is understood that Baj 
French ambassador i] 
vised the Senators to] 
de Courcel denies ti] 
that he has res:gned] 
that M. Bourgeois waj 
to take office, but I 
clined to do so.”

London, April 1.—1 
erriment has telegra] 
Whyte, its consul-gd 
that if Great Britain] 
in the protection of tl 
dren in Matabelelai 
government is will* 
burghers to go there I

Prince Bismarck j 
at Friederichsrube aj 
ing and found displaj 
birthday presents. I 
ately greeted by C] 
marck and by his da 
ess Rantzaue. Afta 
had congratulated thl 
closely examined hisl 
Lan bach, who appd 
upon Prince Bismard 
a good morning. M 
was a collection of 1 
gascar, sent by Eud 
those who were the J 
ing their congratulai 
marck to-day were Gj 
dersee and a députa 
berttadt cuirassiers.

A Cairo dispatch I 
missioners Of the Cai 
debt to-day naid fl 
£300,000 for the Ni id

Sir Hercules Robii 
of Cape Town, has aj 
ing of a body of fl 
Hafeking in Cape Cd 
of the Transvaal for! 
These men will be d 
perial officers instead
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