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Supply

There are 458 emergency shelter units that have been com­
mitted under the project haven initiative. Under the second 
phase of the family violence initiative, again a part of the social 
housing objectives of the Government of Canada, and the next 
step program, 150 self-contained units and 100 emergency 
shelter units are planned with a budget of $20.6 million.

Through our moneys under the RRAP, the $100 million, and 
the amount of money we would provide for Quebec, we are 
trying to make an arrangement whereby we would lessen the 
administrative nightmares which are associated with the deliv­
ery of the housing in order to have the one level of government 
deliver that, of course maintaining a federal presence and 
maintaining some degree of credibility for the Government of 
Canada as we make expenditures in that great province, but 
lessening the administration and getting more money to the 
people who are really in need.

During the upcoming months Canada Mortgage and Housing 
will be discussing with its counterparts in the family violence 
initiative new opportunities for Canada Mortgage and Housing 
participation in a possible third phase to the family violence 
initiative. I want to assure hon. members in my final sentence that we as 

a national government are seized with the issue of social 
housing. We are attempting through a number of vehicles with 
our provincial counterparts to provide the best value at the best 
price for Canadians across the country.

This assistance goes a long way to providing much needed 
shelter for women and children. The federal government is also 
committed to improving housing for seniors and persons with 
disabilities. As part of the national strategy for the integration of 
persons with disabilities, Canada Mortgage and Housing has 
been administering a $10 million two-year demonstration pro­
gram called home adaptations for seniors’ independence, or 
HASI, to help older seniors make their homes more liveable.

The Deputy Speaker: Before going to questions and com­
ments the hon. minister being a seasoned member will know the 
question of parliamentary language, a four-letter word starting 
with h and rhyming with “bell”. The eyebrow of one of his own 
members went up when the minister used the word. I see in 
Beauchesne’s sixth edition, page 147, that that phrase in context 
has been found to be unparliamentary in the past. I wonder if the 
minister would perhaps reflect on it.

In the few moments that I have left—I am sure there will be a 
number of questions that hon. members will want to raise—I 
want to say two final things. One is with regard to housing for 
aboriginals on reserves and housing for aboriginals off reserves 
across the country. My colleague, the Minister of Indian Affairs 
and Northern Development, and I have been working jointly on 
these issues and we hope to be able to put a paper before our 
cabinet colleagues to address some of these serious situations.

Mr. Dingwall: Mr. Speaker, I will accept your intervention, 
but I hope the Speaker will do the honourable thing post 6.30 
this evening and read the “blues” and ascertain that the word 
which he anticipated and thought that I had said was not what he 
has referred to but was a word which is called h-e-c-k, which is 
different from what he had said.• (1610)

However, if the hon. Speaker is not mistaken, I wish to 
withdraw any reference to that particular word. I would hope 
that if the Speaker has made a mistake he will come back to the 
House in due course.

I want to assure the House and hon. members that it is 
certainly a priority for me and it is certainly a priority for the 
Minister of Indian Affairs and Northern Development that we 
will want to pursue this with vigour and creativity. I have spoken 
to a number of aboriginal groups which have come to me, and I 
want to underline this, with some very creative and innovative 
ways in which they as individuals can take control of their own 
destiny and provide the kinds of quality housing that they need.

The Deputy Speaker: Getting back to the substance of the 
debate, questions or comments.

[Translation]
Finally, with regard to the province of Quebec, la belle 

province, I have had several discussions with the minister 
responsible for housing in the province of Quebec whom I am 
sure all members, particularly members opposite, would want to 
congratulate in terms of the new responsibilities he has achieved 
in the recent cabinet shuffle, including those of housing.

Mrs. Christiane Gagnon (Québec): Mr. Speaker, since the 
member is showing an interest for our belle province, 1 would 
like to give him a few statistics regarding social housing funding 
in Quebec. I wonder if he is aware of the fact that, from 1986 all 
the way up to 1993, there have been some significant discrepan­
cies in the level of federal funding to various provinces in 
Canada, including Ontario.I am now embarking upon a program with my provincial 

colleague in the province of Quebec, and possibly elsewhere in 
the country as well, in terms of how we as governments can get 
better value for our dollar. The province of Quebec has ear­
marked moneys for housing under the renovation sector. It is a 
very exciting, good and solid program.

Quebec received between 10 and 13 per cent less from the 
federal government. That is why it is now calling for an 
improvement in the level of government expenditures. We say 
expenditures, but what we are really talking about are job


