
least two years’ standing who shall have presented a satis- 
factory thesis (the title of which must have been previously 
approved by the Head of the Department concerned and by 
the Committee on Graduate Studies), shall have passed a 
special examination for the Degree, and shall have per­
formed such other exercises as may be prescribed to that 
end,—the whole to the satisfaction of the Committee on 
Graduate Studies, and also of any other examiners whom 
the Corporation may associate with that Committee,—shall 
be entitled to the Degree of Master of Science.

'g.—Bachelors of Science in Agriculture of at least one 
year’s standing who, after graduation, shall have taken for 
one year a graduate course of study in the Faculty of Agri­
culture of the University, previously submitted to and ap­
proved by the Committee on Graduate Studies, shall have 
passed an examination at the end of the year, shall have 
presented a satisfactory thesis (the title of which must have 
been previously approved by the Head of the Department 
concerned and by the Committee on Graduate Studies) and 
shall have performed such other exercises as may be pre­
scribed to that end ; or Bachelors of Science in Agriculture 
of at least two years’ standing who shall have presented a 
satisfactory thesis (the title of which must have been pre­
viously approved by the Head of the Department concerned 
and by the Committee on Graduate Studies), shall have 
passed a special examination for the Degree, and shall have 
performed such other exercises as may be prescribed to that 
end,—the whole to the satisfaction of the Committee on 
Graduate Studies, and also of any other examiners whom 
the Corporation may associate with that Committee,—shall 
be entitled to the Degree of [Master of Science in Agricul­
ture].*

-s;

C
io.—Students who shall have satisfactorily completed 

the regular course of study in the Dental Department of the 
Faculty of Medicine, shall have passed the prescribed exam- 9»

* The exact title of this Degree has not yet been determined, and 
it is possible that some slight changes may be made in the requirements.
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