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trod upon, and then starting- 11P, to aligcht: again a few yards
ahead. It 15 a most abundant spe.i~ breeding plentifully.

They seemi to prefer a bush country, left free from anderbrush
after the lire bas mun through. Over this kind of ground the air
would seemn to be full of these birds of an evening, and their
loud booming noise is heard on every hand.

P tsin togh the-se woods, I have often started t-hebid
off their eggs, whicb are laid on the bare ground wvithout any
attempt of a nest, flot even a holloiv scraped for thern to lay in;
the eggs were always two in numbe,-r and aval in formi. The
birds did mlot trouble themselves niuch as ta, wbat becanie of
their property, niaking no nzuise and get ting out of the way as
quicly as possible.

£gialiiis vocifera (KiUldeer).-Tbis bird is very numerous
fromn eaily spring until well on in the autumn, 1 bave~ hunted
carefuily over the ground where the birds were plentiful but did
not succeed in finding a nest; this must be owing- to the féniale
not remaining on ber eggs, but flyin- to ineet one a longm.way
off. They are very noisy, and all the birds wtithi.n hearing w,.ii
gather and add their protest to what tbey are pleased to consickr
intrusion on their haunts.

A set of five eggs was brought -tao nie near the end of june,
they were quite fresb, and of a dut!, creaniy-wbite color, spotted
heavily with brouin; in shape much pyritormn and appear large
for the size of the bird. 1 did flot examnine the nest from wbicli
they were talc-en, so, cannet givc any description of situation or
niateriai.

These birds niay aimost lie crnsidered noctural in ibeir habits,
thev are certainly noisiest in the dusk of the et'cning, and if the
night is mot altcgetber dark, they may be heard and seen at a
pretty late bour. Tbcy seeni ta prefer the snc-iety of man, bieing
most abundaut about the towyn, and a ver few scattered pairs
being seen far out on the prairie-.
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