
THE CONQUEST OF THE POLE 143
a feat beyond the power of man. Nansen and 
his companion got as far as latitude 86° 13', a 
long way north of all previous records. By 
sheer pluck and endurance they managed to 
make their way southward again. They spent 
the winter on an Arctic island in a hut of stone 
and snow, and in June of the next year (1896) 
at last reached Franz Joseph Land, where they 
fell in with a British expedition. They reached 
Norway in time to hear the welcome news that 
the From, after a third winter in the ice, had 
drifted into open sea again and had just come 
safely into port.

Equally glorious, but profoundly tragic, was 
the splendid attempt of Professor Andrée to 
reach the Pole in a balloon, which followed on 
the heels of Nansen’s enterprise. Andrée, who 
was a professor in the Technical School at 
Stockholm, had been for some years interested 
in the rising science of aerial navigation. He 
judged that by this means a way might be 
found to the Pole where all else failed. By the 
generous aid of the king of Sweden, Baron 
Dickson and others, he had a balloon con­
structed in Paris which represented the very 
latest progress towards the mastery of the air, 
in the days before the aeroplane and the light­
weight motor had opened a new chapter in


