
High Schoot Departmnclit.

1. The Hligh School Mastcrs say, "in the
fnrmer" (the sevcral optional groups) ' wc
would suggcst that the cxaminatibn e Icss
mathcmatical and more practical in their
chatracter."

Byi "mathematical " questins I suppose
arc meant those in vhich rcsult s have to bc
calculatcd ; whilc "practical" questions arc
Ilitse in which A knowlcdge of principles
experimentally cstablishcd, with the evidence
on which the principles rest, is rcquircd.

A rcfcrencc to the last cxamination papers
will show that the questions are by nu nicans
cxccssivcly natienatical. In the Chem:stry
papcr, So marks out ofa total i1 oarc nllowcd
for questinns exclusivcly practical. In thc
Natural Philosophy paper, 68 marks (indccd
on a fair juldgment I might say 75) out of a
total of i toarc allowcd for practical or non-
mathcmatical questions. It is absolutely ne-
cessary that some questions involving calcu-
lation shoula bc set, otherwise therc could be
no assurance that the pupils understand low
to apply the principles in which thcy are in-
structcd. I dcsirc to add (what the High
School Masters arc perhaps. not aware of)
that the questions on whiclh their pupils most
gcncrally fail arc not the mathematical. but
the practical. If the questions werc made
less mathematical than at the rccent examin-
ation, I arn afraid that the rcsult would bc
utter (lisaster to the candidatcs.

2. The Iigh School Masters say: "In
view of the fact that the ;rading of the High
Schools and the distribution of a large por-
tion of the Legislative grant is decided ac-
cordin; to the restilts of inspection, it is, in
the opinion of the H. S. Section, dcsirablc
that thc Hl. S. Inspectors should be enabled
to devote a greater amount of tine to the
work of inspection at their semi.annual
visits." The H-ligh Schoni Inspectors instruct
me to reply as follows :-They arc sensible of
the importance of devoting as much time to
tle inspection of the Iigh Schools as is ne-
cessary, not only for the equitabl. ditribu-
tion of that portion of the grant which is
divided on the results of inspection, but for
bencfiting the schools in every way to the
utmost possible extent. As regards the dis-
tribution of the grant they are satisfied that
no school lias suffered! injustice from the
amount of time devoted to its inspection;
they will be glad, hnwever, to ncet the
wishes of the High Sr.hool Masters by mak-
ing their visits in future as lengthened as cir-
cumstances may permit.

3. 'he Iigh School Ma>wrs say: "That
the English History presented should be con-
fined to some particular period instead of
extending, as at present, frot Julius CSsar
to the present tîme." The Iigh School
Inspectors think it would be unwise to depart

fron the systen nnw observcd for tho follow-
ing among other reasons :-

(a.) Teachers holding Provincial life cer-
tificates arc expected, and with reason, to
know the leading crents at least of the his-
tory of England and Rone. ib.) Onç of the
most valuable lcssons to be dcrived frôm his-
tory is historical troprtion, or the relative
importance of historical cvcnts ; another is
the causes of the progress of nation., in civili-
zation and constitutional self.covernment,
and tlie stcps of national decadence; another
hi 'lie ltherary growth and the distinguishing
cliaracter of onc petiod as related to others.
None of these. the Inspectors think, can bc
obtained by tae study of an isolatcr epoch.
(c.) For a special period to he studied judici-
ously or to advantage its relations to the lire-
ceding age should be known beforc.hand,
hence such a system of History-teaching
belongs more properly to an advanced stage
in the studcnt's progrcss; besides, a more
detailed examination of a period is neccssary
than is convenient in a Iigh School. (d.)
The truc remedy is for the teachers to im-
provc their methods.

4. With regard to the "systeni of nota-
tion" which the High School Nasters say
"should be more fully recognizcd in the
assignmcnt of subjects for examination to
menbers of Central Committce," the Minis-
ter vill readilv undcrstand that some mcm-
bers of the Committce are spceially fittcdi to
examine on some subjects, and others on
othcrs, and it is desirable Liat the schools of
the country should have the benefit of the
special attainmcnts of the several members.

I have the honour, etc.,
(Signed) G. P. YOUNG.

To the Hon. the Alinister of Education.

-IN thismonth's issue we can only brieily dis-
cuss the questions brought up by the foregoing
correspondence. We invite in the meantime
from the High School Masters an expression
of opinion on the points submitted for their
consideration. The course pursued by the
Minister, as indicated in his letter, will be
productive of great satisfaction- to the pro-
fession, and we trust that in the interest of
good sound healthy education the Intermedi-
ate itself nay soon be numbered among the
things of the past. It is a well-known fact

, that the High School Masters without, so far
as the- public are aware, a single exception,
are unanimous in their estimate of the effect
on education of the Intermediate examina-
tion. In many respects the old system of
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