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palaces, its splendid opulence and
gorgeous pageantry; its tinkling
caravans anci vast and silett soli-
tudes of the rnysteriolis deserts;
the fallen fanes and ruined palaces
and solemn sphinxes of that won-
derland ?

With stili deeper emotion wvill
the devout or philosophic traveller
v'isit those ancient reahnis " where
every step is o'er a nation's dust,"
and every sound awakes an echo
of the past. To himi the whole
region is steeped in the very spirit
of poetry, and consecrated by bial-
lowed or historic recollections. As
lie stands amid the ruins of Baal-
bec or Palmyra, of .Luxor or
Karnac, or of "bhundred-grated
Tiiebes,"-those gravestones ZDover
a nation's tomib,-tbe evanescence
of earthly power and splendour
w~iIl impress bis mmnd.

The worship of Apis and Isis, of
Oruis and O)siris, of Baal and

Ashtaroth, lias passed awvay; but
the very ruins of their temples, by
the illustrations of the minute fui-
filment of aincient prophecy de-
clare, that though heaven and
earth shall pass away, one jot or
tittie of God's Word shall neyer
pass tili ail shall be fulfilled.

The exploration of the ruins of
Nineveh and Babylon affords a
striking commentary upon Holy
Scripture, illumining with brilliant
sicliglits many of its obscure and
difficuit passages. The appalling,
desolation, the utter and irretriev-
able ruin of those sites of ancient
and populous empires, are a su 'b-
lime and emphatic vindication of
Divine prophecy, that refutes and
confounds the cavillings of the
gainsayer or the infidel. For
miles on miles the far-extending
plain beaves wvith many a cruin-
bling mnoun d, towering- at tines
like g creat natural eminences
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