
was obliged, in the facé of the polite: congrega-
tion,-who were staring at. herall the: time, to turn
back; andleave the ch'urcli. It is true the sexton,
who was at'first:at the other end of the church,
followed her, and she returned with him, and
was byrhim then shewn into a pew. How truly
characteristie this is of the. antisocial, selfish, anxd
aristocratical (though that is a very bad word to
illustrate purse-pride) feelings that so much pre-
vail in Montreal, every one here who. knows
what the real world is can jùdge. It is a genuine
picture of that repùlsive disposition-.which I. am
endeavouring to combat, wherever it'apjears, and
which reduces our»would-he great folks far below
the estimation in which they might.otherwise le.
gitimately stand.; 1 should be inclinéd to say a
little toe here -on the anti-religious .system. of sel-
ling and letti'ng out pews in place of worship.
Its being -a practice generally adopted in, the
episcopal churches: at home, as well as in many
dissenting religious establishrnents, is no vindica-
tion, nor aiy apology -fot transgressing the con-
mands of our Lord " Make, not my father's house,
an house of merchandize." - But here again :the
znonster Mammon is fortified in one ofhis'strong
holds, and I fear .it will re4uire a better-'ioneer,,.
than myself to sap his toddeeply flied eâtrench:
ment. L. L M.

For sale at ames Brown's,,St. François Xavier
Street, Lay's two sheet Map of Lower Canada,
pice 10s. .lain or 12s. 6d. coloured.

Dr. Holmes's .chemical, lectures comnence,.Ihe
second Wednesday in January, at'7 o!clock, to .ç
continued %veekly. One guinea and.a ial£theceptse
or one dollar eacht Zecture. .Fi.t lecture grats.


