
426 T'he .fessenger o/t/he Sacred Heai-t.

full juvenile ardor, beamned in their countenances, and
whom the saine faith bad led froni so many distant lands
to venerate thue mortal reniaisus of St. Aloysius andi the
august Chair of Peter, lie to]d theni of bis extreine solici-
tude to preserve college students froni the perfidious*
snares which the eneniies of religion were setting for
theni, especially that of a Gcdless.systeni of education,by
which it was intenîded to bring about an entire separation
frons tle Catholic Churdli, and haud theni over de&nce-
less to, the slavery of vice and of secret societies He
enlargeà on the blessiiugs of a Catholic education. To
behold these blessings imaged as ini a mnirror, tbey bad
only to considerthe exainple ofAloysius. "It wasowing
to, the Church and religious influences that hie Nvas able,
amid the corruption of tuorals, to preserve the integrity
of his purity to sudl a degree as to be more like an angel
than a mi. It was due to religion that, anliclst the
luxury and dissipation of his father's bouse, lie exce]led
in tue austerest virtues, as tîsou-gh lie lived iii a solitude;
that, trauipling on al 1earthly advantages, lie -%vas led by
the grace of God to renoutnce a prisucedoin ; that, reach-
ing bis twenty-fourth year, hie becanie a suodel of clîarity
and teligious perfection ; that at last lie attained sudh a
higli degree of heavenly glory as to niakze the lioly virgin,
Magdalen of Pazzi, b-elieve hie scarcely had au equai in
heaven. W\e pray to, God 'with earnestness that hie niay
preserve in you this mind and these dispositions.

cg With the Churcli the Roman Pontiff- is intinuately
vnited. The true church could ixot e-xist witliout hi.,
Hience, respect and love for the Church is inseparable
froni respect and love for the Pope. Yan know that on
account of the evils of the times tuie present condition of
the Roman Pontiff is au unworthy and intolerable one.
Qing to the fickleness of the political situation, free
"ecess to, our person nxay at any moment be prevented.


