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Oral Questions
ROLE 0F CANADIAN MJNISTERS

Hon. Donald J. Johnston (Saint-Henri-Westmount): This
seems to be a trip of photos as usual, rather than business as
usual, for the Prime Minister. Let us hope that the Minister of
Finance and the Secretary of State for External Affairs are
carrying on serious discussions on behaif of the interests ai
Canadians. How wil we know? WilI the Deputy Prime Minis-
ter confirm that the office of the Prime Minister has in fact
muzzled these two Ministers by refusing to permit them ta
take their press spokesmen, their press assistants, ta Bonn?

a (1120)

Hon. Erik Nielsen (Deputy Prime Minister and Minister of
National Defence): Mr. Speaker, at times when 1 was sitting
aver there and the Hon. Member, as a former Minister, was
sitting over here, 1 reflected an his contributions during Ques-
tion Periad and in debate, and thought that there was an han-
ourable guy wha should really be in the Tory Party, but 1 am
now beginning ta have doubts about that when he mnakes that
sort ai unkind and untrue representatian.

The Prime Minister is in Europe admirably discharging his
responsibilities at the Bonn Economic Summit, as are the
Secretary ai State for External Affairs and the Minister ai
Finance. Rather than the critical attitude being adapted by the
Hon. Member, 1 think he should be acting in the best interests
ai Canada and urging an the Prime Minister and his twa
Ministers in their very laudabie task.

OVERFISHING BY WEST GERMAN FLEET

Hon. Donald J. Johnston (Saint-Henri-Westmount): Mr.
Speaker, i can reciprocate and say that 1 have great respect for
the Han. Member, and always had.

Mr. Axworthy: But we do not want him aver here; don't go
toa far.

Mr. Johnston: That is why 1 suggest that deep in his heart
he really does nat believe what he is saying to us today but
feels constrained by this place ta do sa.

Let me point out ta the Deputy Prime Minister that the
Prime Minister himself is steering clear, or his handlers are
steering him clear, ai aIl cantroversial issues during this trip.

Yesterday the Minister ai Fisheries and Oceans, wham 1 see
in his place taday, characterized the problem of overfishing off
the East Coast ai Canada by West German vessels as, and 1
quote, "a shocking and seriaus situation". 1 am sure the
Deputy Prime Minister agrees, but why doesn't the Prime
Minister ai Canada seize this unique apportunity ta raise this
issue with Chancellor Kohi at the Economic Summnit? Or is
this issue, something that affects the Iivelihaods ai tens ai
thausands ai Canadians. toc, cantroversial ta, raise in the forum
ai an ecanamic summit?

Hon. Erik Nielsen (Deputy Prime Minister and Minister of
National Defence): Mr. Speaker, again speculation. How in

the warld does the Hon. Member know what the Prime
Minister is raising with Chancellor Kohl?

Some Hon. Members: Teil us.

Mr. Nielsen: How does he know that it is not being raised
by the Prime Minister? How does the Hon. Member expect
me ta tell him, instant by instant, what is being discussed over
there?

1 am certain that hie will be discussing, as wiIl the Minister
ai Finance and the Secretary of State for External Affairs, aIl
those matters which are important and in the Canadian inter-
est. They wilI take every appartunity in Bonn ta affect those
bilateral discussions. It behooves the Hon. Member ili, and it
is certainly not in the country's interest, for him ta be making
the suggestions which he is making. Instead ai daing that he
shauld be applauding the efforts which are being made by the
Prime Minister and others in that graup.

Anyone who knows the Prime Minister knows very well that
he is nat handled like one ai his predecessors in office was
handled and muzzled in 1980.

INTERESTS 0F NEWFOUNDLAND FISHERMEN

Hon. William Rompkey (Grand Falls-White Bay-Labra-
dor): Mr. Speaker, 1 want ta follow on the line ai questianing
begun by the Hon. Member for Saint-Henri-Westmount, by
saying ta the Deputy Prime Minister that the Prime Minister
is naw in the very country which is raping the resource mast
important ta Newfoundland. It is simply not good enough ta
say that they do nat know what the Prime Minister is doing in
West Germany. We want more than smiles. Newfoundlanders
want ta knaw that the Prime Minister is aver there fighting for
them. 1 want an assurance that while the Prime Minister is in
West Germany he wiil make sure that he raises this issue,
fights on behaîf ai us, and stops the draining ai the lifeblaod ai
aur ecanamy.

Hon. Erik Nielsen (Deputy Prime Minister and Minister of
National Defence): Mr. Speaker, 1 assure the Hon. Member
that hie can remave ail doubts instantly with respect ta the
ability and the determination ai the Prime Minister of Canada
ta fight for Canada's interest wherever hie goes in the world,
and nat just as the Bonn Economic Summit.

Some Hon. Members: Hear, hear!

* (1125)

REQUEST FOR MINISTERIAL ASSURANCE

Hon. William Rompkey (Grand Falls-White Bay-Labra-
dor): Mr. Speaker, can the Deputy Prime Minister tell us and
the people ai Newfaundland today that the Prime Minister ai
Canada, ai ail Canada, including the fishermen on the East
Coast, while in West Germany wiil raise this matter, will fight
for aur interests and see to it that this draining ai fishing
resaurces on the East Coast, which are the only thing we have
leit, is going ta stop?
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