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Outllne of Canada's energy and invesbment problems

Ini an address to the Traffic Club of
Pittsburgh last month, Energ.y Mini-
ster Alastair Gillespie stressed the
spirit of partnership that existed be-
tween Canada and the United States.
He went on to discuss two subjects of
vital interest and major concern in both
countries - Canada's energy and in-
vestment policies.

Mr. Gillespie explained the energy
Pfoblems existing in Canada. The
eastern provinces depend entirely on
imported oil because Canada does not
have a west-east pipeline delivery
system. Two years ago Canada was a
net exporter of oul but now the country
is a net importer. "It's bad news,"
Mr. Gillespie said, "because it means
we have to import about haîf the oul re-
quirements for our country. And we pay
world prices of about $13 a barrel."

The Minister emphas ized the percent-
age of Canadian resources used in the
United States. "It may also surprise a
few of you to learn with ail the talk
about our resource wealth, that you de-
pend on Canada for just a bit over 3
per cent of your crude oil, less than
5 per cent of your natural gas and about
1 per cent of your electricity. With
coal, you supply us."

In five years, said the Minister, Can-
ada would not have enough oil to sup-
ply its traditional domnestic market. By
the early 1980s there would be short-
ages in domestic supply of natural gas.

The United States has been told that
gas exports may be curtailed next win-
ter but, if this happened, steps would
be taken to curtail Canadian consump-
tion at the saine time.

Mr. Gilles pie outlined the exploration
and development going on in Canada
including the Arctic regions. "Finding
this oil and gas, however, and deliver-
ing it to market present immense tech-
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nical problenis." These problenis will
pose dramatic new challenges. "We've
met challenges before. Canadians be-
lieve that to engineer the difficult re-
quires ingenuity - to engineer the un-
known takes a little longer."

"A first goal to reduce our depend-
ence on imported oil is not unlike the
thrust of your Project Independence.
We too have adopted new measures.
How could we husband our diininishing
supplies? Through new incentives for
mnvestment? Yes. Through conserva-
tion? Through a reduction in exports?
Yes."

Some Canadians had advocated cut-
ting off exports now, hie said, but to
be fair, this was being donc in phased
steps. "These cuts have hurt you.
Make no mistake they have also hurt
us. Our export revenues are declining.
Our oul and gas supplies are declining.
We wîll be forced more and more to turn
to the international market for more and
more oul," said Mr. Gillespie.

This will mean a huge balance-of-
payment deficit which could reach $5
billion a year by 1985.

Turning to Canada's investment poli-
cies the Minister stated that Canada
was the United States' biggest cus-
tomer. In a study released in 1973 in
the petroleum industry, approximately
four-fifths of the non-resident con-
trolled assets are held by U.S. resi-
dents or U.S. resident-controlled cor-
porations. 0f the firns which, have
operations in ahl phases of this indus-
try - from exploration to marketing -

non-resident control is 100 per cent.
This showed that Canada was not

erecting barriers against foreign
capital, although there had been dif-
ferent opinions in the United States
press on this issue. This has caused
Amenicans to have a confused picture
of Canada, stated Mr. Gillespie.

Canada now has its own national
petroleuni company which will provide
competition in a free enterprise system
as well as providing a national pre-
sence for Canada in the oul industry.

Canadian objectives rule out any
comprehensive continental energy deal
but each new project is viewed for a
co-operative and co-ordinated approach
to benefit both nations. The Minister
outlined the possibilîty of oil swaps
between the two nations as one such

project, especially so that the refi-
neries in the northern United States
could continue to receive Canadian
crude oil.

Foreign investment
On foreign investment policy, 59 out of
the 100 largest non-financial corpor-
ations in Canada are foreign owned,
stated the Minister. "We acknowledge
that Canada could not have reached its
present stage~ of development without
much of this foreign investment capital
investment. But we recognize also that
not ail foreign investment has been to
our advantage. .. .that soine foreign in-
vestors are contributing far less to
Canada than might reasonably be ex-
pected. "

The Government questioned this con-
trol in the economy and the Foreign
Investment Revîew Act was an effort
to solve some of these very fundamen-
tai problenis, said Mr. Gillespie.

He stressed that this act was not dis-
criminatory against any source of
capital. "We will continue to welcome
foreign investment so long as it meets
the rest of significant benefit to Can-
ada. "

Canada will need foreign financing
in the future, probably more substan-
tial than in the past. Capital needs
estimated by the Economic Council of
Canada could be $860 billion in the
next ten years.

The Foreign Review Act is said to
be a deterrent in the minds of United
States investors but Canadian produc-
tion costs, high wage settiements, plus
the rate of inflation, might be more of
a deterrent. "I feel confident, however,
that our new price-income controls and
other measures will lessen these dis-
parities and ultimately bring them into
line with current economic realities,"
stated the Minister.

Manitoba selis bonds in U.S.

Premier Ed Schreyer of Manitoba an-
nounced last month the sale of a $125
million provinc ially-guaranteed Mani-
toba Hydro issue in an improved Uni-
ted States bond market.

The 30-year bonds, dated January 15,
1976, which carry a 9.25 percent in-
terest coupon, were sold at $99 per
$100 bond to yield the investor 9.35
per cent.
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