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principle pf the army at Rhode Ifland being
ftrong enough to co-operate, which was by
no means the cafe, and therefore it was alto^

gether inadmiflible. In the next place, fup-
pofing a co-operation, it was by far the moft
arduous and dangerous of the two propofals,
becaufe it required land-carriage for upwards
of fixty miles on the outfet, through a moun-
tainous country, that abounded with danger-
ous defiles. Add to this, that when you
fliould have reached the Connedicut, you
could have had no water-carriage, unlefs the
craft had been carried with you in your prp-
grefs from the Lake ; and when the delays
occafioned by the fliort carrying- places, on
the route to Albany, are confidered, it fhews
that this idea was utterly impradlicable, and
therefore wifely rejefted by adminiftration.
In the original plan, you mention it as the
moft difficult of the two propofals, and yet,
in your f^ate of the expedition, fuggeft that
it was an expedient of precaution, and com-
plain of not being at liberty to avail yourfelf
of it. I venture to affirm, that had the pur-
pofed latitudes been given you, at no one
period of the campaign would you have feri-
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