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The first begins about the 15th of Sep­
tember, ami ends at Christinas ; the se- 
conds ends at Easter, and the third about 
the middle of June.

The teaching is given by a) Titular Pro­
fessors, b) Fellows and c) Tutors. The first 
are, properly speaking. Professors ; they 
only can be members of the University 
Council, and have a debating voice in the 
Council of Faculties. A titular professor 
in one faculty cannot lie appointed titular 
professor in another, but can be a fellow 
or a tutor.

The lectures in the Faculty of Theology, 
of Law and of Medicine are private. Never­
theless any priest can be admitted to the 
lectures on Theology ; the same rule exists 
for lawyers and public notaries with re­
gard to the lectures on Law, and for phy­
sicians and surgeons with regard to the 
lectures on Medicine. In the Faculty of 
Arts, there are public and private lectures; 
the latter are for the students on this 
faculty only.

Once a week, in the private lectures, 
the professor devotes the time of one lec­
ture to examine pupils on the subjects 
studied during the week.

At the end of each term, all the students


