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of this House, that it will ultimately lead
to, a very bad condition of affaira in any
country if it resuits in destroying that re-
spect which we have for the administration
of justice in this country. We expect per-
fect inipartiality. If the giving of publicity
to, the reasons which enabled the Minister

*of Justice, or the Governor in Ceundil, who,
I presume, was largely guided by the ad-
vice of the Minister of Justice, te reach the
conclusion he did, resuits in settling the
minds of the people who entertain improper
views cf the matter, in my judgment, it
wvould not be an unmixed evil if these
papers were given te the world. I can see
very strong grounds for the contention
which the Minister of Justice entertained,
but, on the other hand, At seems te me that
there are equally strong grounds for mak-
ing these papers public se as te disabuse
the publie mind of the impression that
there is anytbing wreng. There is another
thing that I tbink will probably lead te good
resuits; that ia the distinction which the
Minister of Justice bas stated as between
the Gevernor General and the Justice De-
partment, that enly in capital cases must
the Governer General be guided by the ad-
vice of his ceuncil but that in other cases
he may exercise bis ewn judgment. Let
that be knewn and it gees a long way te
satisfy the public mind. If the people are
under the impression that a. wrong conclus-
ion would be reached the responsibility
would be placed on the right shoulders and
the government would be relieved of it as
a result. But, I think if it would accem-
plish ne other end than satisfy the public
mind that the same principles apply and
that the same justice is meted eut te all
regardless cf what their political leanings
are, or what the political leanings of the
lawyer are, or what their religions convic-
tions are, or what their nationality is, it
will do a great deal of good in the country,
because, just se long as everybedy bas re-
spect for the administration of justice and
believes that every eue is treated imparti-
ally there will be a good state of affairs in
the ceuntry, while, if the reverse is the
case, it breeds condtempt for the law and it
makes many men take the law into their
ewn bauds believing that they cannot get
justice from the Justice Department.

Mr. LEWIS. Mr. Speaker, I desire te
agree with the hou. Minister cf Justice
(Mr. Aylesworth) as regards a great many
of his remarks, but I wish te say that there
is a streng feeling in this country that s
man who, because of the crime committed
by him, really deserved te be hung, bas
escaped the gallows. A drunken man who,
while he dees net intend te kili the wemani,
pounds that womau te death; is entitled te
suifer the full punisbment for bis crime.
The Minister cf Justice will agree with me

that, even if ha did net intend te murder
the woman, the Euglish law says that
where a man is cemmitting an unlawful
act he is guilty cf every act which ensues
while he is commnitting that act. If the
evidence adduced in this case only pro-
duced a verdict cf manslaughter, then I
thiuk it is the duty cf the Minister of
Justice and of this House te have the law
changed se that a man who commits the
crime that this man did will be really
punished and hung as this man sheuld have
b S'n.

Sir WILFRID LAURIER. My hon.
friand is aware from the circumatances and
bistory cf the case, that if a guilty man, e
murderer, bas escapad the gallows,. the
blame cannet be brouglit te the door cf the
goverument, but the blame must rest upon
the court. The euly thing which. was doue
by His Excelleucy the Gevernor General in
the case cf this man was simply te give
bim a reprieve. He was te have been ex-
ecuted at a certain date and the date was
pestpoued. Numerous petitieus were pre-
sented te the government in faveur cf this
man asking for a pardon or rather a com-
mutation cf the sentence. The advisers cf
His Excelleucy did net think it possible
that this petitien could be grauted, but as
there was a good reason te knew whether
or net the man had been properly convicted
a reprieve was given and then application
was mada te the court for a new trial. The
court granted *a new trial. New, my hon.
friend says there is reason te believe that
under tha British law, if a man commits a
breach cf the law, such as was committed
in this instance, it follews that it was mur-
der. In the preseut instance this man
committed an effence upen bis wife, he
cemmitted an assanit upon ber, he beat ber
-tbere is ne deubt about that because the
fact is admitted-ande as a censequence cf
that traatment bis wife died. My bon.
friend says it was murder.. I de net kuow
that I would difter from him, but the ceurts
say differently. The courts say it was net
murder. The case was tried again and the
man escaped. Under such circumstauces
dees my hon. friend believe, or is be pre-
pared te say-

Mr. LEWIS. I said that if that did net
coustitute murder it was higb time for the
Minister cf Justice te amend the law se
tbat it would be murder.

Sir WILFRID LAURIER. -Well, we are
discussing now anothar matter. Tbe gev-
erument bas been held te blame, as I gather
frem tba remarks ef tbe bon. mambar for
York (Mr. Wallace) and tbe heu. member
for East Grey (Mr. Spreule), because tbay
granted a reprieve. Dees my bon. friend
(Mr. Sproula) say that tbe geverumeut did
anything wrongP On the contrary, will
net my hon. frieud admit tbat the gevern-


