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PRAYERS

Mr. Quellet for Mr. Lalonde, a Member of the Queen's
Privy Council, laid upon the Table,-Copies of Com-
muniqué issued following the meeting of Federal and
Provincial Ministers of Welfare, held at Ottawa, April
30 and May 1, 1975. (English and French).--Sessional
Paper No. 301-5/51.

The House resumned the debate on the motion of Mr.
Lang, seconded by Mr. Drury,-That Bull C-41, An Act
respecting the stabillzation of net proceeds from the
production and sale of western grain and to amnend cer-
tain statutes in consequence thereof, be now read a
second time and referred to the Standing Committee on
Agriculture.

And debate continuing;

[At 4.00 o'cloclc p.m., PTivate Members' Business was
called pursuant to Standing Order 15(4)]

(Notices of Motions)

Notices of Motions Nos. 2, 15, 19, 20 and 28 baving
been called were allowed to stand at the request of the
governnient.

Mr. Gillies, seconded by Mr. Baker (Grenville-Carle-
ton), moved,-That, in the opinion of this House, the
government should reconsider its decision flot to redeem
the 3 per cent perpetual bonds, issued in 1936, through
a scheme whereby (a) original purchasers would re-
ceive full face value for their bonds (b) ail other hold-
ers would receive payrnent for each bond according to
the market price for the year in which the bond was
purchased (c) that an irnmediate freeze be placed on
the market value of the bonds to prevent speculation.-
(Notice of Motion No. 29).

And debate arising thereon;

The hour for Private Members' Business expired.

Changes in Committee Membership

Notice having been filed with the Clerk of the House
pursuant to, Standing Order 65(4) (b), membership of
Committees was amended as follows:

Mrs. Appoiloni, Mrs. Hoît and Messrs. Béchard and
Loiseile (Saint-Henri) for Mr. Lee, Mrs. Appollomi and
Messrs. Martin and Cafik on the Standing Committee on
Finance, Trade and Economnic Affairs.


