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CHATS WITH YOUNG 
MEN

LOST OPPORTUNITIES
‘‘When I am rich,” he uaed to say 
‘‘A thousand joys I’ll give away :
I’ll walk among the poor I find 
And unto one and all be kind.
To all In need I’ll friendly be 
The day that fortune smiles on me.”
He never guessed that being kind 
Depends upon the heart and mind 
And not upon the purse at all ;
He never knew or understood 
The fellowship of doing good. 
Because he had not much to spare 
He thought it vain to give his share.
Yet many passed him, day by day. 
He might have helped along the 

way
He fancied kindness something 

which
Belongs entirely to the rich.
And so he lived and tolled for gold, 
Unsympathetic, harsh and cold, 
Intending all the time to share 
The burdens that his brothers bear 
When he possessed great wealth, 

and he
Could well afford a friend to be.
His fortune came, but, oh, too late ; 
The poor about him could not wait, 
They never guessed and never knew 
The things that he had meant to do. 
Few knew how much he’d planned 

to give
If God had only let him live.
And when at last his form was cold. 
All that he’d left on earth was gold. 
A kindly name is something which 
A man can earn before he’s rich.

—Edgar A. Gukst

A TALK TO THE YOUNG 
BUSINESS MEN

By xOtto H. Kahn

Take an interest and a due share 
in public affairs. It is not only 
your duty to discharge the responsi­
bilities of citizenship in a self-gov­
erning country, but, even from the 
aspect of mere self-interest, it is 
good insurance to do so. Business 
cannot prosper unless the ship of 
state is run on a steady keel and 
steered with reasonable competence. 
Rock the boat of government and 
you retard, or even endanger, the 
boat of business. Indeed, the mere 
movement of the waters caused by 
the process of rocking is apt to 
upset some of the less sturdy crafts 
of commerce, industry or finance.

That does not mean that you 
should be “stand-patters.” On the 
contrary, seek to find and to sail 
with, the current of progress. To 
be reactionary is to be lacking in 
imagination, in feeling and in judg­
ment. Mankind is bound to move 
forward with or without your aid. 
Don’t short-sightedly attempt the 
vain task of obstructing its march. 
Put your intelligence and experi­
ence to use, as far as you have 
opportunity, towards aiding, with 
sincerity and good will, to guide 
that movement along the right road 
and to prevent it from going astrey 
temporarily. Try to be helpful to 
protect against ignorant or dema­
gogic assault the things which by 
test and trial have been found indis­
pensable and vital for the preserva­
tion of a sound and stable basis of 
society and the American principles 
of government, but help with equal 
willingness to inaugurate and 
realize those things which go to 
eliminate valid grievances, to 
remove grounds for just discontent, 
to advance social justice and to pro­
mote the common welfare.

Meet your fellow-men with confi­
dence, unless you have reason to 
suspect. Deceitful intent does not 
find it easy to stand up before 
frankness, fairness and faith. Don’t 
think that you have got to go 
through business life, or any other 
phase of life, armed to the teeth. 
As a rule, you will find shield, 
breastplate, helmet and so forth, 
needless and hampering weights. 
Skepticism and mistrust, in the case 
of men, are like great standing 
armies in the ease of nations. They 
beget aggression. Confidence begets 
good will and reciprocal disarma­
ment It is neither weakness nor 
credulity. It is a self-respecting 
consciousness of one’s own motives 
and a sane belief in the innate 
rightness of human nature.

To those of you who may attain 
conspicuous success, I would par­
ticularly address an admonitory 
word. The material reward which 
the world accords to business suc­
cess is very large. It is dispropor­
tionately large as compared to the 
material reward bestowed upon 
work and achievement in other lines 
of activity. The reasons why this 
is so, and more or less has been so 
for many centuries, and why, on the 
whole, probably, it pays the world 
to stimulate by liberal compensa­
tion the inteneest utilization of 
business capacities, it would take 
too long to enter in .o and seek to 
elucidate, cm the present occasion.

Suffice it to say that the scale of 
that compensation presupposes 
value returned in commensurate 
service. If the so-called capitalistic 
system of society is to continue—as 
I believe it will and should because 
on the, whole it has done and is 
likely to do more for the progress 
and prosperity of humanity and 
for the greatest good of the great­
est number than any other system I 
know of—it is particularly incum­
bent upon those whom it places in 
positions of business leadership to 
exercise self-restraint and consider­
ation for others in the use of their 
opportunities, to prove themselves 
imbued with a due sense of public 
duty and to exert their abilities not 
merely for their own advantage but 
also—and increasingly so as their 
potency increases—for the benefit of

their fellow-men. Success la not a 
free gift. Like everything else 
really worth having In life, it has 
got to be paid for. If you do not 
assume and discharge responsibili­
ties and duties in a measure com­
mensurate with your success, you 
are, from the civic point of view, a 
defaulter.

Take heed to remember, those of 
you who, by eminent success, may 
raise yourselves beyond your peers, 
that it behooves you to do all you 
can to make your position as little 
“jarring” as possible to that 
immense majority whom fate has 
not singled out for its favors. Try 
always to understand and appreci­
ate, and give due heed to, their 
points of view and their feelings. 
Be patient, helpful, courteous, con­
ciliatory. Avoid ostentation. Abhor 
purse-pride and arrogance.

Beware especially of that insidi­
ous tendency of wealth to chill and 
isolate. Be careful not to let your 
feelings, aspirations and sympathies 
become hardened or narrowed, lest 
you get estranged, and grow apart, 
from your fellow-men. Make it a 
point not only to be approachable, 
but to seek and welcome contact 
with the workaday world so as to 
remain part and parcel of it and to 
maintain your fellowship in It.

I am well aware that to the ears 
of those whose appraisal of business 
and business-men is based upon 
isolated scandals or abuses, or upon 
the violent rantings of agitators 
ignorant of, or wilfully blind to, the 
ethical strides of the past twenty- 
five years, lashing themselves into a 
frenzy to fight over again a battle 
which President Roosevelt fought 
and won once for all, blatantly 
re-echoing old war-cries which have 
become obsolete and irrational—I 
am well aware that to the ears of 
such as these my “message” will 
sound fanciful and incongruous, if 
if not hypocritical. You who have 
heard me will know whether it 
bears the accent of conviction 1 
might have tried to be more orig­
inal, subtle and profound, but then 
I should have been' less truthful. I 
have spoken not as a preacher, but 
as a practical man from practical 
experience. The plain fact is that, 
notwithstanding the complications 
and innovations which we have 
crowded into our lives, the sign­
posts marking the road which leads 
to worth-while success remain very 
much as they have been for ever so 
many years.

I have been in Wall Street for 
years. My son is just about to enter 
business. I greatly desire him to 
succeed. 1 am giving him no “mes­
sage” on his way different from the 
one I have given you.

OUR BOYS AND GIRLS
IF

If thou canst force thy lips to smile, 
When both thine eyes,
Are drowced in tears ;

If thou canst bless thy Maker, while 
The sad rey skies 
Breed heavy fears ;

If thou canst sometimes cause the 
sun
To light a place 
Where no joy dwells ;

If thou canst lead some little one, 
With laughing face,
To fairy dells ;

If thou canst see the light that 
shines
Behind the dark 
Which mocks the day ;

If thou canst ease a heart that 
pines,
One loving mark 
Upon the way ;

If thou canst leave that word un­
said,
Which may afflict 
Thy fellow-man ;

if thou canst say when day is dead, 
“ I have done all 
The good I can

If thou canst teach cold eyes to see 
The message hidden 
In a rose ;

If thou canst hear the melody 
In each unbidden 
Wind that blows—

Then all the wealth, and all the 
laughter
Of all the world are thine ; 

Then happiness will follow after, 
And the sun will shine.

—Stella Maris •

SELF-DISCIPLINE
The very strength and life of all 

self-discipline is order, certainty, 
and decision. Our true safeguard 
against temptation is to be the same 
at all times, in all companies, in all 
places ; not to vary and adapt our­
selves to the humor of others, there­
by adopting their temptations with 
their habits, but to be always and 
everywhere ourselves, and to 
oppose to the temptations oft the 
world the consistency of a matured 
and practical habit of self-control. 
—Cardinal Manning.

HAPPINESS
There is no happiness in the world 

like that of a disposition made 
happy by the happiness of others. 
There is no joy to be compared to it. 
There is no sorrow that is not soft­
ened by it; for it is the balm of 
unselfishness. There is no inherit­
ance a mother can leave her children 
comparable to that which flows 
from the luxury of doing good to 
others. The jewels which wealth 
can buy, the rewards which ambi­
tion can secure, the pleasures of 
art and scenery, the abounding

sense of health, and the exquisite 
enjoyment of mental creations, are 
nothing to this heavenly happiness.

COURTESY TO GOD
Many are discourteous to God. 

The day’s salutation of the morning 
offering is often forgotten or mut­
tered like so much jargon, meaning­
less alike to those who offer it and 
to Him Who receives It. The little 
act of courtesy—the sign of the 
cross—by which we express our 
faith in the mystery of the Trinity 
and show our recognition of Christ’s 
death upon the cross, is often per­
formed as if we were passing a 
secret countersign.

Our posture in prayer may seem 
non-essential to us, but should It be 
so ? There are. rules in society 
which are kept scrupulously. He 
would be an outcast who would 
place hie feet on the table or yawn or 
gape ; and even in the theatre good 
taste is shown by Attention and 
posture. None but the boor would 
rush out in the middle of an act, 
except in case of fire. In fact, that 
is a general atmosphere of courtesy 
in man’s relations with each other. 
But veryVften those who recognize 
the need and value of courtesy In 
the social world are the very ones 
who are chary of extending it to 
God.

Before the altar men will coun­
terfeit a genuflection, bob into their 
seats and assutne a posture which in 
respect of kneeling or sitting can be 
called neither one or the othjr. 
There is no indication that they 
recognize the purpose of their com­
ing. And from their hasty depar­
ture one would imagine they came 
for the anticipatory pleasure of 
getting away quickly. No act of 
theirs could possibly-' be called a 
courtesy to God. It is true, of 
course, that God reads their hearts. 
But it is pleasing to God to receive 
the courtesy shown bv him who 
approaches the altar mindful 
always of the relation between him­
self and his Saviour.

In his genuflection there is the 
respectful attitude of subjection of 
the body—the creature before the 
Creator. In his upright posture at 
prayer there is seen the attentive 
devotion of a son. The few steps to 
the Communion rail may express 
love and gratitude and reverence, 
or else an atrocious carelessness. 
Is there no discourtesy to God in 
the demeanor of him whore arms 
swing like a pendulum ? Is there 
no discourtesy in rushing from the 
Church before Mass ?

The Church is a living exemplar of 
courtesy to God. The essence of 
her liturgy is courtesy. The things 
to be done, must be done in a 
manner befitting the occasion and 
the object of their doing—sim­
plicity, decorum, reverence, piety 
and devotion—all mark the courtesy 
of the Church’s service. Never 
does she forget the relation between 
God and His creatures. Anyone 
who follows the Holy Sacrifice of 
the Mass will readily note the cour­
teous acts which tell the minister 
and the faithful that they are in 
the presence of God. The solemn 
genuflection before the Blessed 
Sacrament, the uplifted acts of 
courtesy to the Divine Presence.

If Catholics would learn the lesson 
daily exemplified in churches, they 
would more readily give courtesy to 
God its proper value. The old 
order would give place to new, and 
God would receive the first fruits of 
a kind heart.—Exchange.

A NEGRO’S FUNERAL
The following very beautiful 

tribute to the Catholic Church, for 
honoring John Butler, an aged and 
penniless negro bootblack, is from 
the pen of K. M. Isherwood of La 
Fayette, Ind., and appeared in his 
paper, the Tippecanoe County 
Democrat. Mr. Isherwood is a 
Protestant ; but one of that class 
of Protestants who do not hesitate 
to express their admiration for the 
good works done by the Catholic 
Church. He is a big, broad-minded 
man who has openly battled the 
bigoted program of the Ku Klux 
Klan and their kind. The Tippe­
canoe County Democrat says : 
“John Butler is dead. John, in his 
best days, was a hostler for the 
Crouch Stock Farm, and as such he 
crossed the Atlantic several times. 
He could speak German fluently. 
He was known to be honest. Old 
age and failing health touched him, 
and for the last few years he has 
been employed at the Reitemier 
barber shop as porter and boot- 
black. John was a negro—dark 
copper-colored, always polite and 
well mannered. He was born in 
slavery, but always had a good 
word in remembrance of his old 
‘Master’ and ‘Missus.’ John died 
last Sunday night penniless. Not 
a relative on earth had he. He was 
of the Catholic faith. His funeral 
was held last Wednesday morning 
at St. Boniface Church. Lawyers, 
bankers and city officials were 
among those who attended the 
funeral servies. There were also 
many of his own race. . . John, 
known to be honest in life, was re­
membered at death. His—this 
negro bootblack’s—was a Christian 
burial—a most honorable one. And 
these people of the Catholic creed, 
the people whose priest and they 
themselves, women and men, who 
would so honor at his death, a 
penniless negro bootblack, as to fall 
on their knees in prayer for the 
keeping of his soul and give him a 
funeral worthy of a king—these are 
the people whom masked men and 
women of another creed would 
drive from their lawful participa­
tion in governmental affairs ; 
whose children they would boycott

from their rightful position In the 
business and professional life of our 
communities ; whom they would 
rob of their schools where their 
children and children’s children 
will be taught the fundamentals of 
the same creed, that took up the 
emaciated body of this negro boot- 
black and gave It honorable Chris­
tian burial. There is a lesson in 
the funeral of this negro bootblack, 
not only for the people of La 
Fayette, but for the acclaimed re­
ligious people of the world. And 
how it does put to rout the entire 
army of King Kleagles, Cyclops and 
all the other flamboyant titles and 
vicious practises of the Klan.”

SEVEN

MAKE SURE YOU GET THE 
RIGHT MEDICINE

People who are suffering from 
constipation, biliousness or sick 
headache are sometimes at a loss to 
know what remedy to take*’ to 
correct these ailments.

Mr. Arthur Couzens of Smith 
Township, Ont., said that he tried 
several doctors and various reme­
dies but got no relief untiLhe was 
advised by a friend to take Dr. 
Norvall’s Stomach and Tonic 
Tablets. When he had finished one 
bottle he felt like a different person 
and takes pleasure in recommend­
ing Dr. Norvall’s Stomach and 
Tonic Tablets to anyone suffering 
from constipation or biliousness.

Mr. H. V. Mercer, Druggist of 
Lindsay, Ont., recommends Dr. 
Norvall’s Stomach and Tonic 
Tablets because he considers he 
owes it to the public to recommend 
what will give the best results.

If your dealer does not keep 
them in stock we will mail them to 
any part of Canada for twenty-five 
cents a bottle or five bottles for one 
dollar.
Address,

The Dr. Norvall Medical Co. Ltd., 
168 Hunter Street, 

Peterborough, Ont.

A SALUTARY 
PRACTICE

Often in spirit one who is 
removed by distance fiom a dear 
friend or a relative, rests in the 
thought of that sacred relation 
which binds them here on earth. 
Little messages of affection flash 
across the space that separates two 
loving hearts, and souls hold com­
munion with one another in moments 
when the noise and distractions of 
the world are stilled.

How much such a message means 
to one who cannot be near the 
object of his affection ! It causes 
the heart to beat more quickly, and 
tears to come unbidden to the eyes.

Far above, in that celestial King­
dom which knows no partings, there 
are those near and dear to us. 
Relatives, friends, yes, but above 
all there are the loving Saviour, 
His Blessed Mother, and the com­
pany of the Saints. They are wait­
ing for the words that come from 
our hearts, directed toward them, 
words that arise from the necessi­
ties of overburdened hearts that 
arise from an overflow of joy or 
happiness or from some dread or 
doubt that assails us.

There is a beautiful intercourse 
carried on between the Blessed in 
Heaven and the faithful on earth. 
The many duties and cares and 
distractions of life interrupt it 
somewhat, but it should not stifle it 
in our lives. Many are the ways of 
seeking and holding communication 
with God and His Saints. They do 
not take much time, most of them, 
nor great effort on our part. But 
they mean so much that they should 
not be neglected for any considera­
tion.

The practice of pious ejaculations 
is one that cannot be too highly 
recommended. Many of these ejac­
ulations, or little aspirations 
directed to God, are highly Indul- 
genced by the various Pontiffs who 
have ruled the Church, and their 
frequent repetition brings a bless­
ing upon those who make use of 
them, here and hereafter.

“ My Jesus mercy !” We read 
the hallowed words on the tomb­
stone of one whom we knew and 
revered in life. They were the 
last words that issued from lips, 
now cold and stiff in death. “ My 
Jesus mercy !” They were the 
solemn words suggested by the 
priest who stood by the bedside of 
the dying Christian with Crucifix in 
hand, and called upon the departing 
soul to lift itself toward the dying 
Redeemer with sentiments of love 
and sorrow.

“ My Jesus mercy !” There were 
countless times during the lifetime 
of that man or that woman when 
the sacred words, wafted to Heaven, 
might have earned a high and holy 
title to degrees of blessedness and 
glory in the life to come. How 
faithful during his or her lifetime 
was the departing soul, to the 
practice of pious ejaculations, or 
loving aspirations directed toward 
God and the Blessed in Heaven.”

On many a tombstone, no doubt, 
these words, "My Jesus Mercy!” 
meant little to the one who lies 
beneath during life. They did not 
represent nearly as much, alas, as 
the title on the cover of some 
popular and trashy novel, or the 
inscription on the billboard outside 
some moving picture house,

Thank God, this is the exception 
with Catholics. Even those who 
fail in .their sacred duties, generally 
cherish a reverence for the sacred 
Passion and death of Christ. Few, 
if any there are, who would trample 
on the Crucifix, even though they

may despair of the mercy of a 
dying God-Man.

But 0,—the thought is very 
solemn—how few there are who 
really hold this secret sweet com­
munication with Heaven and its 
Blessed inhabitants, at least outside 
of the brief momenta spent on 
Sunday at Mass and at morning and 
evening prayer. Association with 
those who are well-bred or of 
gentle birth makes one also' well- 
bred and gentle, we are told. How 
much more, then, does association 
with the Author of all beauty of 
soul and all perfections engender 
beauty and perfection in the one 
who seeks and holds that associa­
tion and intercourse !

“ My Jesus mercy !” In the 
workshop, at the desk, in the 
quietude of the home, on the busy 
street, when the clock strikes or a 
bell tolls its mellow note—any place, 
any time, under any condition this 
or any other sacred ejaculation may 
issue from a loving and faithful 
heart. And then, if we may say so, 
God stoops to listen to the cry of 
His children and angels take up the 
beautiful refrain to chant it about 
the great white Throne.

Let us then be fervent and faith­
ful in using this precious means of 
pleasing God and of sanctifying our 
souls and preparing them for that 
not distant day, when the cry for 
mercy shall have passed into a 
triumphant paean of thanksgiving 
to the Author of all mercies.—The 
Pilot.____________

MARQUETTE LAW DEAN

Milwaukee, Wis , Aug 1.—Gov. 
John J. Blaine has appointed Dean 
Max Schoetz of the Marquette 
University school of law to the 
Wisconsin Committee for Promotion 
of Uniformity of Legislation in the 
United States, according to word 
received here.

State committees are being 
appointed throughout the country 
and definite plans for the uniformity 
movement will get under way at 
the convention of the American Bar 
Association at Detroit in September.

While representing Marquette at 
the Detroit convention, Dean 
Schoetz also will attend the meet­
ing of the national committee.

FACE BROKE OUT 
WITH PIMPLES

- ■ h,
Hard, Red and Large, 

Itched and Burned. 
Cuticura Healed.

“ My face broke out with pimples 
that looked terrible. They were very 
hard, red and large, and they fes­
tered and scaled over. The pimples 
itched and burned something ter­
rible. My face looked terrible and I 
hated to go any place. The trouble 
lasted over a year.

“ I read an advertisement for Cu­
ticura Soap and Ointment and sent 
for a free sample. I purchased 
more, and after using several cakes 
of Soap and a couple of boxes of 
Ointment I was healed.” (Signed) 
Miss Gertrude Wagner, Rt. 5, Brit­
ain Avc., Benton Harbor, Mich., 
Sept. 10, 1923.

Use Cuticura Soap, Ointment and 
Talcum daily and keep your skin 
clear and healthy.
Cample Each Free by Mail. Address Canadian 
Uvpot "Catluura, P. 0. Box 2616, Montreal.'1 
Pnc.-^Sojtp 25c. Ointment 25 and 60s, Talcum25c.

‘Ary our new Shaying Stick.

5-Roomi)A 
ALADDIN CJ

< m WL PAY TMt mriCHT ■ '
You can buy all the 
materials for a Com­
plete home direct from 
the manufacturer and 
• ave Tour profita on 
the plumber, mHlworh,

'

Living room, dining 
room, 2 bedrooms, kit­
chen. bath, t other 
plans, eome with pan- 
tries and dining al­
coves. Get Free Alad­
din Catalog.

Ml
Living room, dining 
room, kitchen, three bed 
rooms, with bath room 
opening Into hall. Cased 
atch between living room J 
and dining room. 3 plans.

II
story and a half seml- 
bungalow, with second 
floor available for two 
bedrooms. Two excel­
lent floor plan arranecmente 
are shown In Free Catalog.

Large living room, din­
ing room, kitchen, three 
bedrooms, clothes clos­
ets, bath. Sc mi-open 
staircase and rear porch.

e m I - bungalow, living 
* . dining room, kit- 

, four bedrooms and 
bath, closets, pantry and 

i grade entrance.

Du tel/' (‘oIoiiIh! for/
wlikr Inside lots or 
narrow eornor lots.
Full celling heights 
entire second floor.
sewing room, columned...................................... i ■ i u
Inset front entrance. Prlees shown above cover 
eash deposit, balance small monthly payments. 
PRICE INCLUDES all lumber cut to fit: high­
est grade Interior woodwork, siding flooring, 
windows, doors, glass, paint, hardware, nails.
1‘nnflltn u/lt I, I ...n, I----- ___
umuuws, uoora, glass, paint, naruware, nails, 
roofing, with complete Instructions and draw­
ings. Freight paid lo your station". Permanent 
Homes—NOT PORTABLE!. Many styles to choose
from Write today lor FREE Monay-8avlng 
Catalog No. F4„

The Canadian Aladdin Co., Limited
208 King St. W., Toronto, Ont.

A
[BAYE*

Proved safe by millions and prescribed by physicians for 
Headache Neuralgia Colds Lumbago
Pain Toothache Neuritis Rheumatism

Accept only “Bayer” package 
which contains proven directions.
Handy “Bayer” boxe, of 12 tablets 
Also bottles of 24 and 100—Drumists

«««s «i

Delicious Summed Dishes '
WITH

BENSONS
PREPARED CORN

The original CORN STARCH 
since I860. Don't accept substitutes.

THE CANADA STARCH CO.,Limited .
,v>7 MONTREAL

"A FRICNO OF TftC FAMILY

ST- I ftWRENSE
^ Underwriters’ Agency

FIRE and AUTOMOBILE 
INSURANCE

Head Office - Toronto

WESTERN FAIR
LONDON - - ONTARIO

SEPTEMBER 12th—19th, 1925
This year the Midway and Grand Stand attractions have been carefully chosen and 
far surpass anything of this nature In previous years.
A real good time, full of fun, pleasure and interest is assured to all.
The Pure Food Shov, Dog Show and other exhibitions are bigger and better than ever.

Entries Close September 3rd

$40,000 in Prizes and Attractions
For further information apply — J. H. 8AVNDKRS. Pres. W. D. JACKSON, Sec.

London, Ontario 3

HENNISTEEI
Made in Canada

“ ■ nrwc,RS "

e for the Employer:
%e secret of a loyal 
organization.
To encourage honesty, 
neatness cleanliness and 
to build good will 
among his employees.

I/or the Employe e :
fhe tangible evidence gf 
a real consideration 

for the workers welfare.

The Dennis Wire and Iron 
Works Co. Limited

We also Manufacture Steel
Garage Waste Paper Desks

Equipment Baskets Tool Boxes
Library Stacks Stools and Chairs Tool Stands

Send for illustrated folder on any of above.

Stained Glass 
Windows

For Commemorating 
Lives and Events are 
Most Satisfactory...

©

Special Designs 
Sent on Request
Estimates cheerfully given

The Hobbs Manniaduring Co.
LIMITED

MONTREAL TORONTO 
LONDON * WINNIPEG

/


