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several times partly destroyed by
fire. In 1711 22,000 persans died
from the plague. In the bom-
bardmnent by the British in i807
aver two thousand buildings were
destroyed or rendered uninhabita-
able, and two thousand persans

killed. It hias a population, not
including its suburbs, Of 313,000.
It is a stately City, abounding in
squares, churches, hospitals and
publie institutions.

The castie or palace of Rosen-
borg, begun in 1604, is an im-

rnense and picturesque building.
It lias long ceased to be a royal
residence, and is dcvoted ta the
chronological collections of the
Danish kings, one or mare rooms
being devoted ta the reign af each.
The aid palace of Cliristiansborg,

destrayed by fire iu 1794, was one
of flic handsomest in Europe.
The Parlianient Building, situated
on an island in the harbour, is tlue
Most Canspicuaus structure in the
City. It is adorned by colossal
bronze statues by Thorwvaldsen.
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