
A.D.1958WEDNESDAY, 13Tai AUGUST

candidate, by constituencies, in the general election of March 31, 1958, as
indicated in the return respecting election expenses submitted by the officiai
agent of each candidate, as required under the provisions of Section 63 of
the Canada Elections Act; and showing also, the names of any candidates, by
constituencies, on whose behaif election expense returns have not been
submitted.

By Mr. Courtemanche, for Mr. Harkness,--Return to an Address, dated
July 21, 1958, to His Excellency the Governor General, (*Notice of Motion
No. 26) for a copy of ail correspondence, telegrams, and other documents
exchanged from, April 1, 1958 to date, between the Federai Government and
the Government of the Province of Prince Edward Island and the Potato
Growers' Association of that province, in connection wîth assistance under
the Agricultural Prices Stabilization Act to the potato growers of Prince
Edward Island.

By Mr. Courtemanche, for Mr. Hees,-Return to an Address, dated July 7,
1958, to His Excellency the Governor General, (*Notice of Motion No. 20) for
a copy of ail correspondence, telegrams and other documents exchanged
between the Federal Government, or any of its departments, and the Govern-
ment of British Columbia or any other organization or person, dealing with
the use of the beam station road at the Terrace Airport by the British
Columbia Provinciai Government or by any other person.

At 6.10 o'clock p.m., Mr. Speaker adjourned the House without question
put, until tomorrow at 11.00 o'clock a.m. pursuant to Special Order made
Monday, August 4, 1958.
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