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the Lodge as long as the 0-reat Archi. B
tect of the Universe is pleased te 1
spare me, and I hope il will be till
aucli time as I have been able to wear
your ruagnificent present into shreds,
fnd then, like the battie flag of a
regiment, it ean be laid asvay as a
memento of better days.

Il The address, sir, that you have
just read is of a different character.
The kindlly words contained therein
are something that cannot be pur-
chased witli gold or silver. It ie un -
like the regalia, as it -i imperishable
and can be handed do...a as the testi-
mony of tLe Grand Lodge through
their comrnittee, that I have at least
endeavored to do my duty as Grand
Master. I find, Right Worshipful
Sir, that you have greatly over-rated
my abilities. I know that I have
corne far short of doing ail that I
miglit have don e. To sorne extent
this may have been causedl from, the
feeling that 1 belonged to an institu-
tion 'whose members were generous,
and where the Divine precept is con-
stantly inculcated, ' to do unto others
as we would wish to be done by.'
:Right Worshipful Sir, accept my cor-
dial thanks, as aiso the brethren as-
sociated with you, in carrying out so
successfully the wishes of the Grand
_Lodge in this matter, and be pleased
to convey to the Grand Lodge at the
proper time =y biearty appreciation
of their kindness and of your own de.
sire to meet my wishes upon this oc-
casion.

"lTo the committee of arrange-
ments charged with the dnty of car- l
rying out the instructions of the
iodges in this city and suburbs I owe
a debt of gratitude I can neyer repay,
ne matter how anxious I niay bc to!
do so, nor how long the time given
me to do it in. The hearty mnanueri
ini which the Masons in this vicinity
have taken hold to countenance and
mnake this presentation a success in
every sense is somothing I ean neyer
forget.

4To al, from the highest to the
lowetit here prelient, aud thioze ab-.

jent, I tender my warmest acknow-
edgments."

Letters were read from M. W. Bro.
Daniel Spry, Barrie, G. M.; «M. W.
Bro. H. Murray, Hamilton, D. G. M.;
Ml. W. Bro. J. A. liende; son, Rings.
ton, P. G. M.; andl others, expresBing
regret for their unavoidable absence
a~nd extending their heurty congrat'i-
Lations to M. W. Bro. Moffat.

A bountiful sapply of refreshments
was thon served, and a brief inter-
mission indulged in, during which
many of the audience partook heartily
of the edibles provided in the old.
fashioned tea meeting, style, and baud-
ed around by attentive 'waiters. Up.
on resuming, the chairman called Up.
on the officers of the Grand Lodge to,
address the audience,

M. W. Bro. Seymour, of St. Cath-
arines, P. G. M., said it had, afford-
ed him sin-lere pleasure to participate
iu the ceremony that had taken place
and had formed the chief feature of
the evening. Having associated for
years with M. W. Bro. Moffat, and
found him a cordial worker and good
exemplar, lie had felt great pleasure at
receiving an invitation to attend this
ceremony. 11e trusted that Bro.
Moffat might long be spared as a
useful and ornamental mêmber as
well. These gatherings hadl associ-
ated with them a great deal calct. -
lated to cernent the ties of the fra-
ternity, and to spread brotherly and
sisterly love, for while they remem-
bered the ministering angels of their
homes they could neyer forget the
ladies. lHe trusted that the occa.
sion whichi brought tliex together
would ,ooii be renewed. It was a
new departure in LondoD, b,- hadl
worked saceessfully elsevhert., ;:s it
afforded brelliren au opportuuity to
pass a pleasant soc' <*1 ý ,

R. W. Bro. J. 'J. î. -:,on, Grand
Secretary, expressed the pleasure he
felt at being present to-night. 11e
alluded to the long connlection of M.
W. Bro. Mioffat with the mystic tie,
and theughit it was righit that the
(JLsud Ludge bhuuld hiouor himi as.


