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WHO PAYS!
This war will have been a total 

waste of time and human lives it vic­
tory for the Allies does not bring 
a better and lees devil-cotitroHed 
world. If the Allied Flags do not 
wave over peoples who feel that their 
sense of justice finds an echo in their 
governments and rulers, the satisfac­
tion of victory will be nothing more 
than the empty victory of a boxing 
contest. The only good that war can 
do is to bring better conditions—if 
it is not to do this it becomes brutal. 
And so it becomes more necessary 

■ than ever that Governments should 
protect the public interest from pri­
vate selfishness. We all have what 
may be called the “business selfish­
ness." We have been brought up with 
it. It has received silent aproval 
from Church and State. It has evol­
ved a code of morals and become law. 
unto itself. If a man makes ten 
thousand dollars on a transaction— 
“Oh! that's business!" Happy and 
strong is the man who can withstand 
temptation of this sort for I verily 
believe that to yield is to fall—it indi­
cates that hardening of the conscience 
has set in. It seems absolutely true 
that we are developing “Business" 
brains—that will be shrewd, cute, 
diplomatic, tactful, quick to see an 
advantage and take it, while all the 
graces of the spirit mentioned in Holy 
Writ are Aiding almost beyond recol­
lection. This is responsible for the 
“gamble” we make of all our re­
sources of food, land and property. 
And this gambling works far greater 
injury than poker or a game of five1 
and forty for a goose, because in it 
we, the people, have to pay the gamb­
ling debts. In the latest, game, with 
wheat on the table, we shall realise 
this when flour will cost us a dollar or 
so more; per barrel. Is card-gamb­
ling wrong? The cherches are em­
phatic—yes! Is wheat gambling 
wrong? I hear but a faint answer 
from the churches. And if this war 
does not bring into full operation a 
National Board of Control and Regu­
lation of Prices, there is bound to be 
trouble—if not social revolutions.

I do not claim that this is the 
panacea of all our ills, but it will 
have a wonderful effect on those who 
know the ache in the back and the 
ache in the heart of those “who la­
bour and are heavy laden.” God alone 
knows what the struggle for exist­
ence caused by the dishonest methods 
of supply ^nd demand, is doing to­
wards wrecking the world on the 
rocks of materialism, atheism and 
sensuality, it takes all our time, all 
our energies to obtain food, clothing 
and shelter, and many have to accept 
the commodities in limited quantities 
and inferior qualities. We are told 
by some people that this is as it 
should be, that otherwise the state of 
society would be far worse. If this 
be so—is it not the most condemn­
ing evidence that our churches, our 
education have after all given us no­
thing that we can lay hold on, and 
that the “supply and demand" theory 
is essential to our life, and education 
the non-essential?

We are too prone to ignore funda­
mentals—it is easier to take things as 
we find them, than to make things as 
they ought to be.

However to return to practical af­
fairs. it seems to me that it would be 
desirable and mutually beneficial to 
merchant and people if a strong 
Board of Control were to enquire in­
to and regulate prices, especially of 

'the necessaries of life.
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not a great deal of money involved 
and I should not think the plumbers 
could reasonably object. There are 
many goods already imported by the. 
Council and- if they imported these 
sewerage and water fittings this loan, 
instead of assisting perhaps 100 peo­
ple, would assist at least 150. Sure­
ly this is desirable?

THE BAILWAY STRIKE.
President Wilson evidently sees 

that the railway workers have a case 
in their demands, and from our know­
ledge of the man, his suggestions in 
regard to the settlement of the trou­
ble have great force. He is not _a 
politician in the ordinary sense of the 
term; he is greater than that, and 
question as we will his policy in con­
nection with the war, he has shown 
traits which mark him an honest, 
justice-loving man and as such, re­
moved from too personal a contact 
with either Labour or Capital, he is 
evidently fitted to be their arbitrator. 
The history of Railroads in the 
United States is not a pleasant one. 
They have exerted a great deal of in­
fluence in law-making, and have been 
extremely clever in law-breaking 
when it suited their ends. The fact 
that the Statute Book contains addi­
tions each year to the compulsion in 
one way or another of Railroads to 
do certain things is in itself a proof 
that, unfettered, they are apt to do 
harm to the Republic.

In this particular case we, as yet, 
do not know all that led up to the 
threatening strike. We do know, 
however. that never in the history of 
the States has there been so much 
money floating around as in these 
years of war. Prices have soared, 
freights have risen, and on good 
risks any amount of money could be 
secured at 3 per cent. I do not know 
if this has caused the Railway Work­
ers to ask for a share of the good 
things going, but it probably has had 
something to do with it.

But apart from this, I see in Presi­
dent Wilson’s suggestion of an 8 hour 
day/something deeper than money 
considerations. We in Newfoundland 
hear often of the way in which Am­
erican bosses work their men. We 
hear of the pride they take in getting 
continuous work, and as much work 
out of their men as they possibly can. 
We do not as a rule treat all our 
workers here in this manner, but we 
can imagine what it must mean to a 
man to work at high pressure for ten 
hours, or even nine hours every day. 
Of course it really means “break­
down” sometime or other. The bal­
ance of the day or rather night left to 
these men finds them unable to enjoy 
any pastime except those of the beer 
saloon and the vaudeville show which 
provide the most excitment. I con­
sider that eight hours continuous 
work at anything is enough for any 
man for a day. If this principle is 
accepted I cannot see what else mat­
ters. It may possibly mean more 
employees but surely it is not im­
practicable. In some factories in St. 
John’s the 10 hour day has given 
place to the 9 hour day with the day’s 
payment the same as a 10 hour day, 
and they find that the same work is 
accomplished as when the 10 hours 
day was in force. The fact that this 
seems to favour the workers is not in 
itself any reason against such reform. 
It makes for better harmony between 
employee and employer, and conse­
quently more faithful and willing 
work is done.

MUNICIPAL ASSISTANCE.
I notice that the Council has ar­

ranged for a loan with which to as­
sist those who cannot afford imme­
diate payment for the expense of put­
ting in sewerage and water con­
nections in their houses. I think the 
Council in such cases as these might 
go farther in cheapening this ex­
pense as much as possible. I should 
consider it an economical move it the 
Council imported all the fittings 
necessary instead of purchasing them 
here. The * (fity has to pay pretty 
heavily for these fittings, and I am 
told that perhaps $30.00 per house 
might be saved in this way. There is

DR. BURKE, Dentist, will re­
sume practice Monday, August 
21st.—augl9,2i

The War feek by Week.

Personal.
By last Sunday’s express, Mr. F. A. 

Mews, lawyer, left town for St. 
George’s where he has been retained 
to defend a mill-owner who has been 
sued for $15,000 damages for trèspass 
on a timber area. Mr. Mews will con 
tinue with the Circuit Court to Pla­
centia as he. has other cases to con­
duct at Harbor Breton and Grand 
Bank and other places along the 
route.

In stock the.following well known.brands: 
GOSSAGE’S WHEEL.
GOSSAGE’S HOUSEWIFE’S FRIEND. 
GOSSAGE’S MAGICAL.
GOSSAGE’S PURIFIED CARBOLIC.

All size boxes in stock.

GEO. M. BARR, Agent

The concerted Allied offensive has 
been worked up to such a pitch that 
nearly every theatre of war demands 
our attention at the same time, but 
the news of chiefest moment comes 
now from one front, now from an­
other. This week it Is the West 
front. Since the simultaneous fall of 
Stanislau and of Gorizia, there had 
been comparative lienee from- tlfe 
Russian and Italian headquarteïs, 
which, however, must by no means be 
taken to denote inactivity. On the 
contrary, we know that events of the 
greatest importance are taking place 
there, and we have hints of more than 
satisfactory progress having been 
made. There is no uncertainty, how­
ever, about matters on the Somme,1 
which are turning more and more to 
our advantage.

Both British and French have re­
gistered Invaluable gains. Most In­
tense fighting over a few miles in the; 
region of Maurepas lias resulted in 
brilliant success for the French, who 
In some of their characteristic dash­
es have pushed their line well for­
ward towards Combles. The opera-., 
tions seem to have the appearance of 
a steady attempt to outflank Guille- 
mont, one of the hardest nuts our 
forces have yet had to crack. The 
French have also gone ahead south 
of the Somme at Belloy-en-Santerre, 
carrying a step further the great en­
circling of Peronne. The latest mes­
sage speaks also of a most important 
gain for the British on the ridges of 
Thiepval. If It is of any extent it 
will certainly be of importance, fdr 
Thiepval has from the first been the 
greatest stumbling block to the Brit­
ish on their way to Bapaume.

There are not wanting signs that 
the enemy’s great defence is begin­
ning to crack before the greater at­
tack. Most eloquent of them is ihe 
diminution; almost absence, of in­
fantry counter-attacks, betokening 
either dwindling forces or demorali­
sation—possibly both. There can be 
no possible doubt that not only the' 
intensity bnt the prolongation of our 
artillery fire has surprised the Ger­
mans, and had a moral effect in addi­
tion to its natural one. The arrival, 
too, of the Allied infantry at the high­
er ground is turning the tables in our 
favour, and the taking of one im­
portant height after another, and the 
holding of it, is a comforting augury 
of a success which may be nearer 
than we think.

From Russia there Is not much to 
report, but there soon will be. The 
Jablonltiza Pass in the Carpathians 
is in our Ally’s hands, but the Inva­
sion of Hungary probably will not be­
gin in earnest until Lemberg falls. 
The Russians seem for the present 
merely to be making doubly sure

By OBSEBYElB. ;

against a possible turning of their 
left flank by General Planger, while 
Letchitaky in the south and Sakhar- 
off ln'tee north press on to Lemberg. 
A richer prize, even than that city 
may faH to théïn if they can succeed 
in cutting off the retreat of Von 

‘Botiimer’s army, which is now de- 
Bnitely retiring. Petfçgrad has been 
silent upon the subject of these opera­
tions, but that is & way which Petro- 
grad has when something important 
Is on foot. A message on Saturday 
spoke of the piercing of the German 
Ikies on the Stokhdd. This may 
mean that--Brusiloff is resuming once 
again his drive against Kovel. The 
reference was-too., brief to give any 
real indication ef what is happening, 
but it is plain that the pressure upon 
both: Lemberg and Kovel is dally in­
creasing.

There has not been much reported 
from the Isonzo either, but the Ital­
ians are pressing their advantage 
vigorously. We shall have plenty of 
news soon from this theatre. Gener­
al Cjidprna has made good his suc­
cess in "the' whd’le district from Gori­
zia south to Monfalcone, and is fair­
ly in possession of the Doberdô Pla­
teau. • It Is probable that his next en­
ergies will be directed to Tolmino, in 
(he north, for possession of that re­
gion will be greatly favourable, if not 
necessary, to the important advance 
npon Trieste. The' Invasion of Istria 
is under way, and we shall now have 
an opportunity of judging how the 
Italians can acquit themselves 
against the Austrians on something 
like equal terms. The fighting from 
now on will be mostly in the open, 
and the Italians will be faced by no 
natural barriers comparably difficult 
with Gorizia. They will be able to 
bring into play a far larger number of 
men and in this way alone add greatly 
to Austria’s increasing embarrass­
ments.

It is even yet too early to say 
whether the slight engagements : re­
ported in the Balkans are the begin­
ning of an advance by the Salonikl 
army or are the sham battles the Bul­
garians claim them to be. It is jnst 
possible that General Sarrail is doing 
nothing more than testing out the 
Bulgarian defences, but we may look 
for fighting in earnest at any moment. 
From a military standpoint, a more 
opportune time could not be chosen 
than the present, but there are un­
doubtedly political factors at work 
that are allowed to take precedènce 
of the military ones. Autumn, how­
ever, is coming on, and we shall be 
much surprised if a general offensive, 
shared by British, French, Serbians 
and Italians, does not take place be­
fore the end of this month.

Ssgm Retmus.
Man IUes on Board—Fishery South of 
Nal* Poor—North to Cltidley Good. 

The s.s. Sagona, Capt. W. Parsons, 
reached port Saturday afternoon from 
the Labrador mail service having got 
as far north as Nain. Weather con­
ditions being favorable, about 130 
ports ot call were made going and 
coming. The Sagona brought a large 
shipment of whale oil from the 
Hawke’s Hr. whaling station, which 
was landed at Job’s Southside prem­
ises, also a small quantity of fish and 
the following passengers: E. G. 
Daley, E. J. Patchetl, W. A. Roeker- 
feller, C. F. Beach, R. Lells, P. H. Cow­
an and wife, E. G. Coyell, W. Swaf- 
field, N. Norris. While on the trip 
south the Sagona met up with the pa­
trol ship Fogota and took on board 
the latter’s ship’s carpenter, Solomon 
Brown, of Spencer Street, who for 
some time was complaining ot inter­
nal trouble. While the man was 
known to be In a weak state of health 
fatal results were not expected, but 
on Friday a sudden change came over 
the sufferer, and shortly after he 
passed away. The passengers speak 
highly ot the big-hearted manner in 
which the captain and crew of the Sa­
gona did everything possible fot the 
deceased during his illness. The' re­
mains were coffined at Hr. Grace and 
brought on here for burial. IV Was 
reported that a drowning acCtierit oc, 
curred at Battéau, where all elderly 
fisherman lost his life by losing his 
footing on board a fishing boat and 
was thrown into the sea; rio further 
particulars were received. The Cach­
alot fishing at Hawke’s Hr.-, had in­
creased her catch by five whales 
since last reported, having landed 38 
fish at that time. Owing to the heavy 
Ice which stretches for miles along 
the coast, the fishery south ot "Nain 
shows no Improvement, While the, 
floaters which have gone ndrtii, home 
below Caipe Chidley are doing Well. 
Capt. Parsons received the following 
report of the fishery north cft Nain 
from Constable Bwyer, who is doing 
Special duty on that part of the coast:

On Aug. 7th there w*e three, 
schooners belonging to Little Bay. Ia- MINABD’S LINIMENT J.ÜMB6B-
lande at Turnavlc. There was plenty of; UK’S FBJRKD.

fish on the bottom but not much do­
ing.

At Long Tickle there were three 
schooners from Herring Neck getting 
all the fish they could handle, one 
having 350 qtls. on board.

At Green Cove plenty fish about but 
not much doing with traps.

At Three Mountains the schooner 
Susy of Littl.e Bay Islands, trapped 45 
barrels on the 5th and 20 barrels on 
the 7th. Several Twillingate schrs. 
here. J

At Mugford Tickle there are eight 
schrs. and five off Churchill. They 
are not doing much, but there is 
plenty of fish about, and a good week’s 
work Is expected. Winsor’s crew 
trapped 45 barrels in one haul on the 
7th.

At Mahar’s Hr., seven schrs. are 
fishing, with prospects good.

At Green Cove there are two schrs. 
both with some fish.

At Cutthroat Island there are forty 
schrs. One trap had forty qtls. on the 
7th. There is a lot of fish about.

From Cutthroat Island south there 
is not" much -doing, except at Beachy, 
where hooking is gdod.

From Hebron to Cutthroat Island 
the vessels will get the fish it the 
weather holds godd, as the bottom Is 
covered with cod, which should soon 
come to land.

At Wolf Islands there are four 
schrs., all well fished, one hailing for 
806 qtls.

Have you ever noticed a bread 
waggon with the dobra wide open and 
the dust and dirt from the street blow­
ing In over the bread? Just stop -mmi 
thtnk of the dirt, and you will always 
ask pour Grocer for Lynch’s Bread 
wrapped and sealed by machinery In a 
dust and -gerat-proof wrapper.—Jyl8,tf

Market Dull.
U> - .A —, ■

The latest report ot the condition ot 
the Opdrtti fish market Is:—

“The market Is- very dull, but upon 
arrival of new cure fish which is now 
expected we look for a better demand. 
The rate Of exchange is 34%d.

ALL BRANP NEW GOODS.
Ladies’ Velvet

Corduroy Skirts.
Smart American Cut, in white and 

coloured. These are all the rage, 
simple trimmings, great service skirts.

Special : $3.30.
Manufacturers Sample Unes,,
Offering Values at 1-3 less than 

Ordinary Prices. ■ ■
SNOW WHITE GARMENTS IN-

“ Horrockses ”

Long Cloth.
Underskirts, Princess Underskirts,

and a Magnificent Lot of

SAMPLE BLOUSES,
In Lawn, Muslin and Silk Hardly two alike.

These are toppers for value Tuesday and Thursday.

In Velvet Corduroy.
Just at the season they’re most wanted, all the leading 

shades represented, and when we say they’re right from New 
York you are assured of the very latest Styles.

Assorted Prices: $5.00, $5.50, $7.06, $8.00.

B

Amusements.
ROSSLEY TROUPE AT 

THEATRE.
BRITISH

To-night the Rossley Lilliputian 
Musical Comedy Co. will open at the 
British Theatre for one week. Thea­
tre goers are all anxious to see the 
first theatrical company who ever 
went on tour from the oldest British 
colony, and whose ability carried them 
through the Provinces for six solid 
months with return engagements 
everywhere. It is a record for any 
company to play in • the Academy of 
Music, New Glasgow, twice in one 
year., and yet the Rossley Co. played 
a return engagement there twieje in 
three months. The girls under the 
training of Mrs. -Rossley, have turned 
out wonderful, their singing and 
dancing now is far ahead of many 
companies with, New York experience. 
Managers of theatres found in this 
clever company a novelty, something 
different to any form of entertain­
ment they ever had. The Rossleÿ Co. 
did not return for want of engage­
ments, but to allow the little ones to 

: see their parents and rest up à bit. 
There is a wide field ot work for 
such a company as the Rossleys.

Keep Wednesday, Aug, 30th, 
open for Garden Party at River­
ton, Waterford Bridge, in aid of 
hospitality for ottr soldiers m 
flte mt Country.—aug!7,tf

«WARD'S LINIMENT USED 
’’HYSIGIAHH.

BY

Cochrane St Church.
The Rev. G. J. Bond, D.D., entered 

npon the work of his new appointment 
at Cochrane Street Methodist Centen­
nial Church yesterday, under most 
favorable circumstances, large and 
appreciative congregations being pre­
sent. The preacher, both morning and 
evening, dwelt on the 1.-3 work and 
labors of the Apostle St. Paul, draw­
ing many striking lessons for one and 
all from the varied • experiences 
through which this great apostle had 
passed. The Rev. Dr. Bond gripped 
his hearers from start to finish and is 
a most fascinating speaker. The Dr. 
visited the Sunday School in the af­
ternoon and was given a hearty re­
ception, being presented by little Miss 
Jean Parsons with an exquisite bou­
quet of choice flowers on behalf of the 
scholars.

Big Freight Ottering.
Owing to the unusually large quan­

tity of freight offering, the Furness 
Liner Tabasco, which arrived here 
Saturday from Halifax, will not get 
away for Liverpool before late Wed­
nesday nighit. Besides a large ship­
ment of Grand Falls jpilp and Paper 
the steamer takes a Imbf fish and oil. 
Her total outward cargo will be an 
equivalent ol 2,060 tons. She also 
takes a largei English mall.

BE READY for the cold wea­
ther. Get in your supply of 
Fati. GAS COKE is an excel­
lent substitute for hard coal. We 
have COKE of best quality, 
made from Pennsylvania Coal, 
which we are selling at $8.50 
per ton at the Gas Works, or 
$9.20 per ton sent home. Send 
in vour order now. ST. JOHN’S 
GXS LIGHT COMPANY.

atrglO.tf

LOADS PIT PROPS. — The S. S. 
Aiel which came here from Genoa 
and Gibraltar, goes to Bonavista to. 
load pit props.

Here and There.
St. Ivel Cheese, small tins, at 

ELLIS’. .
LEN STICK OX FURLOUGH. —The 

soldiers who returned here Saturday 
report that when they were leaving 
the Old Country they saw Len Stick, 
2nd Lieutenant, who was Wounded In 
the big drive. Len was on furlough 
■and recovering from his Injuries.

1
FREE TO ALL SUFFERERS
If you feel‘OUT Of SORTS' ‘kUNDOWN* GOT tbajMLUES1 
SUFFER from KID KEY, BLADDER. NERVOUSDISEASES, 
CHRONIC WEAKNESS,ULCITRS.SKIN ERUPTIONS.PlLES.

lyouraeffifitis
■ -____ __ B&jHffijD’TMi''»
cedars. Sdnd'Staf ap address envek&pp to Dr. LeÇlbkc 
mkd.cd.Havers tockrd.HampstEad London,Eng
TKKRÂprov elthe c No. Price LEADING CHEMISTS

CLEMENTINE HERE.—The barqt. 
Clementine Reached here yesterday. 
She brought a cargo of salt from 
Cadiz to TWitllngate and Wtitn the lat­
ter place came on to this port in bal­
last and will load flàh again 'tor the 
Brazilian market.

As usual, 
Sale we will oi

BOYS’ KHAKI BE] 
PIECE SU]

8 to 16 years. All or 
price....................... :

'to

$;

MISSES’ MUSLIN 
Slightly soiled. Re 

$1.50 and $3.00 to
72c. and $1.E)|

BOYS’ WASH
New clean stock, 65c 

$1.50.
Worth from 80c. B i2.5i
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LONDON, July 31st, 191 j
THE KING OF THE BELGIA> j

Except on such occasions as thej 
nlversary of the establishment [ 
Belgian independence little is lie 
of the activities of King Albert. 
King not only continues to live! 
Belgium in the quarters which he | 
now occupied for so long, but 
rarely leaves Belgian soil for 
purpose. He does not pay visivd 
understand, even to Harve, the 
of the Belgian Government. 
Queen sometimes goes there for btj 
ness purposes, but the King remq 
quietly with his army. In the 
days of the trench warfare he uj 
It his practice to visit his troops j 
tion by section everywhere.

The I

WOMEN WAR WORKERS’ PAK.1
In Parliament Square on July 

people stood sixteen deep to sec 
procession of women war workers, 
ganised by the W.S.P.U. the mili| 
suffrage Society which has for 
period of the war returned to gi 
and has been allowed to assist 
authorities in recruiting woj 
workers for national purposes, 
day was as bright and warm as 
we have had this year. The cn 
was very big, and the procession ni 
interesting. Women marched in 
overalls of shell-making, in the troj 
ers of hay-making, and the yellow u 
form of the explosives workers enj 
plete, even to the respirators, wli| 
must have been uncomfortable w< 
on such a day. The crowd cheei 

. all of them almost as loudly as it 
the Red Cross nurses, whereas 
emblematical figures—Joan of Arc 
the rest—were watched in silen 
Lloyd George and Mr. Churi 
watched the procession from a Wh| 
hall window. Last year, when 
wanted munition workers urgen| 
Lloyd George gave the suffragisti 
subvention towards the cost of a s 
liar parade—a fact which was not 
veiled till afterwards. This time 
Munitions Department was stated 
have paid nothing at all towards 
panses. To do so would have been 
wise because the organisers of 
pageant chose to sprinkle it with b: 
ners calling on Mr. Hughes to retu 
from Australia, and suggesting tl 
the war would not be won till he 
it. The opinion is not uncommon 
London, but It would hardly do 
spend Government money in spre; 
ing it. The bands of the worn; 
workers procession on July 22i 
played tunes long familiar to suffi 
gists, but the processionists persi 
ently sang their own favouritei 
“Tipperary," “Home Fires," “Wait| 
on the Levee," and the very popi 
song about the man who is wrii 
from “Somewhere in France, d| 
mother." The refrain of this Iasi 
very popular In the London stre 
just now. It runs something like tlj 
Somewhere in France, dear mothei 
Somewhere in France to-day;

Cheer up, my dear.
Next time you hear.

I’ll be somewhere In Germany.
But the ever-recurring line in 
tuneless song heard as the munttii 
workers marched by was “Makii

FOOl
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tauli.l


